BOWLES RICE LLP 600 Quarrier Street (25301) Post Office Box 1386 Charleston, West Virginia 25325-1386

Telephone: (304) 347-1100 Facsimile: (304) 343-3058

Julia A. Chincheck Mark B. D'Antoni

Special Counsel for the Debtors and Debtors in Possession

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

In re:

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION, et al.,

Chapter 11 Case No. 12-12900(SCC) (Jointly Administered)

Debtors,1

FIRST FEE STATEMENT OF BOWLES RICE LLP FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICERS AND DISBURSEMENTS FOR THE PERIOD OF **JULY 9, 2012 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2012**

NAME OF APPLICANT: **Bowles Rice LLP**

Special Counsel to the Debtors and ROLE IN THE CASE:

Debtors-in-Possession

The Petition Date (July 9, 2012) through and TIME PERIOD:

Including August 31, 2012

Total Fees Requested: \$214,442.38 **CURRENT APPLICATION:**

80% of Fees Requested: \$171,554.00 Total Expenses Requested: \$ 7,858.16

None PRIOR APPLICATION:

¹ The Debtors are the entities listed on <u>Schedule 1</u> attached hereto. The employer tax identification numbers and addresses for each of the Debtors are set forth in the Debtors' chapter 11 petitions.

- 1. On July 9, 2012 (the "<u>Petition Date</u>"), Patriot Coal Corporation and substantially all of its affiliated subsidiary companies ("<u>Debtors</u>") filed voluntary petitions for Chapter 11 Relief. [ECF No. 1]. Debtors' cases are being jointly administered by order of this Court. [ECF No. 30].
- 2. Prior to the Petition Date, Bowles Rice LLP ("Bowles Rice") rendered substantial legal services to Debtors in a wide range of areas. Debtors have retained Bowles Rice with this Court's authorization by its Order Authorizing the Employment and Retention of Bowles Rice McDavid Graff & Love LLP as Special Counsel for the Debtors Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date [ECF No. 539] (the "Bowles Rice Employment Order") nunc pro tunc from the Petition Date to continue to render professional services in connection with (collectively the "Authorized Representation"):
- (a) to provide advice, representation and preparation of necessary documentation and to make all necessary filings regarding (i) coal and other property acquisitions, financings and other transactions and (ii) regulatory requirements involving coal properties and operations;
- (b) to defend and provide advice, representation and the preparation of necessary documentation regarding various litigation matters, including Federal Black Lung, mining safety matters and bankruptcy matters where the Debtors are creditors of the bankrupt party or parties in interest in the bankruptcy case; and
- (c) to provide advice, representation and the preparation of necessary documentation regarding issues under local and state law relating to corporate and commercial matters.
- Establish Procedures for Interim Monthly Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals [ECF No. 262] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), Bowles Rice, as special counsel to the Debtors, hereby submits its First Statement for Professional Services and Disbursements (the "Fee Statement") for the period from July 10, 2012 through and including August 31, 2012 (the "Fee Statement Period").

- 4. Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit A</u> is a listing of Bowles Rice's professionals and paraprofessionals (collectively the "<u>Bowles Rice Professional(s)</u>") that rendered services for Debtors as authorized by the Bowles Rice Employment Order during the Fee Statement Period. <u>Exhibit A</u> includes, among other things, the total hours billed, hourly rate and total fees for each Bowles Rice Professional, plus a blended hourly rate for each category of Bowles Rice Professional, excluding paralegals.
- 5. Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit B</u> is a schedule summarizing the categories of actual and necessary expenses for which Bowles Rice is seeking reimbursement and the total amount for each such expense category.
- 6. Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit C</u> is a summary of the number of hours and amounts billed by Bowles Rice during the Fee Statement Period for services authorized by the Bowles Rice Employment Order during the Fee Statement Period, organized by project type authorized by said Order. These services include all services that were typically rendered in the ordinary course or were being provided to Debtors before the Petition Date, but only as specifically authorized by the Bowles Rice Employment Order in connection with the Authorized Representation.
- 7. Attached hereto as <u>Exhibit D</u> are the time records of Bowles Rice, which provide the contemporaneous record summaries of the time spent by each Bowles Rice Professional during the Fee Statement Period by project category.
- 8. The undersigned certifying professional hereby certifies and represents (i) that she has read this First Fee Statement; (ii) that to the best of her knowledge, information and belief formed after reasonable inquiry, the fees and disbursements requested herein fall within this Court's guidelines and those of the United States Trustee; (iii) that the fees and disbursements sought herein are billed at rates in accordance with Bowles Rice's customary practices and generally accepted by its clients; and (iv) that in providing reimbursable services, Bowles Rice does not make a profit on the services.

Notice

- Order, the Debtors will serve this Fee Statement, by hand or overnight delivery, on (i) the Debtors, Patriot Coal Corporation, 12312 Olive Boulevard, Suite 400, St. Louis, Missouri, 63141, Attn: Jacquelyn A. Jones, Esq.; (ii) attorneys for the Debtors, Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP, 450 Lexington Avenue, New York, New York 10017, Attn: Marshall S. Huebner, Esq. and Brian M. Resnick, Esq.; (iii) the Office of the United States Trustee for the Southern District of New York, 33 Whitehall Street, 21st Floor, New York, New York 10004, Attn: Elisabetta G. Gasparini, Esq. and Paul K. Schwartzberg, Esq.; (iv) attorneys for the administrative agent for the Debtors' postpetition lenders, (a) Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP, 767 Fifth Avenue, New York, New York 10153, Attn: Marcia Goldstein, Esq. and Joseph Smolinsky, Esq., and (b) Willkie Farr & Gallagher LLP, 787 Seventh Avenue, New York, New York 10019, Attn: Margot B. Schonholtz, Esq. and Ana Alfonso, Esq.; and (v) counsel to the official committee of unsecured creditors, Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP, 1177 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10036, Attn: Adam C. Rogoff, Esq. and Gregory G. Plotko, Esq.
- 10. WHEREFORE, Bowles Rice respectfully requests that the Court grant the relief requested herein and such other and further relief as is just and proper.

DATED: October 22, 2012.

Respectfully submitted,

BOWLES RICE LLP

/s/ Julia A. Chincheck

Julia A. Chincheck (WV Bar No. 718) Mark B. D'Antoni (WV Bar No. 4646) BOWLES RICE LLP

600 Quarrier Street (25301) Post Office Box 1386

Charleston, West Virginia 25325-1386

Telephone: (304) 347-1100 Facsimile: (304) 343-3058

Special Counsel to Debtors and Debtors in Possession

SCHEDULE 1

(Debtor Entities)

- 1. Affinity Mining Company
- 2. Apogee Coal Company, LLC
- 3. Appalachia Mine Services, LLC
- 4. Beaver Dam Coal Company, LLC
- 5. Big Eagle, LLC
- 6. Big Eagle Rail, LLC
- 7. Black Stallion Coal Company, LLC
- 8. Black Walnut Coal Company
- 9. Bluegrass Mine Services, LLC
- 10. Brook Trout Coal, LLC
- 11. Catenary Coal Company, LLC
- 12. Central States Coal Reserves of Kentucky, LLC
- 13. Charles Coal Company, LLC
- 14. Cleaton Coal Company
- 15. Coal Clean LLC
- 16. Coal Properties, LLC
- 17. Coal Reserve Holding Limited Liability Company No. 2
- 18. Colony Bay Coal Company
- 19. Cook Mountain Coal Company, LLC
- 20. Corydon Resources LLC
- 21. Coventry Mining Services, LLC
- 22. Coyote Coal Company LLC
- 23. Cub Branch Coal Company LLC
- 24. Dakota LLC
- 25. Day LLC
- 26. Dixon Mining Company, LLC
- 27. Dodge Hill Holding JV, LLC
- 28. Dodge Hill Mining Company, LLC
- 29. Dodge Hill of Kentucky, LLC
- 30. EACC Camps, Inc.
- 31. Eastern Associated Coal, LLC
- 32. Eastern Coal Company, LLC
- 33. Eastern Royalty, LLC
- 34. Emerald Processing, L.L.C.
- 35. Gateway Eagle Coal Company, LLC
- 36. Grand Eagle Mining, LLC
- 37. Heritage Coal Company LLC
- 38. Highland Mining Company, LLC
- 39. Hillside Mining Company
- 40. Hobet Mining, LLC
- 41. Indian Hill Company LLC
- 42. Infinity Coal Sales, LLC
- 43. Interior Holdings, LLC
- 44. IO Coal LLC
- 45. Jarrell's Branch Coal Company
- 46. Jupiter Holdings LLC
- 47. Kanawha Eagle Coal, LLC
- 48. Kanawha River Ventures I, LLC
- 49. Kanawha River Ventures II, LLC
- 50. Kanawha River Ventures III, LLC

- 51. KE Ventures, LLC
- 52. Little Creek LLC
- 53. Logan Fork Coal Company
- 54. Magnum Coal Company LLC
- 55. Magnum Coal Sales LLC
- 56. Martinka Coal Company, LLC
- 57. Midland Trail Energy LLC
- 58. Midwest Coal Resources II, LLC
- 59. Mountain View Coal Company, LLC
- 60. New Trout Coal Holdings II, LLC
- 61. Newtown Energy, Inc.
- 62. North Page Coal Corp.
- 63. Ohio County Coal Company, LLC
- 64. Panther LLC
- 65. Patriot Beaver Dam Holdings, LLC
- 66. Patriot Coal Company, L.P.
- 67. Patriot Coal Corporation
- 68. Patriot Coal Sales LLC
- 69. Patriot Coal Services LLC
- 70. Patriot Leasing Company LLC
- 71. Patriot Midwest Holdings, LLC
- 72. Patriot Reserve Holdings, LLC
- 73. Patriot Trading LLC
- 74. PCX Enterprises, Inc.
- 75. Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC
- 76. Pond Creek Land Resources, LLC
- 77. Pond Fork Processing LLC
- 78. Remington Holdings LLC
- 79. Remington II LLC
- 80. Remington LLC
- 81. Rivers Edge Mining, Inc.
- 82. Robin Land Company, LLC
- 83. Sentry Mining, LLC
- 84. Snowberry Land Company
- 85. Speed Mining LLC
- 86. Sterling Smokeless Coal Company, LLC
- 87. TC Sales Company, LLC
- 88. The Presidents Energy Company LLC
- 89. Thunderhill Coal LLC
- 90. Trout Coal Holdings, LLC
- 91. Union County Coal Co., LLC
- 92. Viper LLC
- 93. Weatherby Processing LLC
- 94. Wildcat Energy LLC
- 95. Wildcat, LLC
- 96. Will Scarlet Properties LLC
- 97. Winchester LLC
- 98. Winifrede Dock Limited Liability Company
- 99. Yankeetown Dock, LLC

EXHIBIT A

Professionals and Rates

PARTNERS AND GOUNDELSCC	Joc 1452	Filed 10/22/12	2 17.42.33	Main Docum	
NAME OF PARTNER AND COUNSEL	YEAR	Pg 7 of 407 MATTER AREA OF LAW	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TÖTAL FEES
CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	1983 - WV	COMMERCIAL & FINANCIAL	87.00	\$250.00	\$21,750.00
D'ANTONI, MARK B.	1987 - WV	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	135.90	\$235.00	\$31,936.50
DEJARNETT, DAVID A.	1989 - WV	TAX	39.90	\$262.40	\$10,469.76
DOLLISON, CHARLES B.	1990 - WV	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	2.50	\$266.50	\$666.25
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	1981 - WV	MASS & TOXIC TORTS	222.60	\$165.00	\$36,729.00
HOGAN, ROBERT	1992 - WV	MASS & TOXIC TORTS	13.70	\$205.00	\$2,808.50
KELSH, JAMES	1994 - WV	COMMERCIAL & FINANCIAL	0.60	\$225.50	\$135.30
LANE, J. THOMAS	1973 - WV	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	77.20	\$285.00	\$22,002.00
OBLAK, REBECCA	1986 - WV, PA	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	4.60	\$275.00	\$1,265.00
SCHESSLER, MICHAEL J.	1990 - WV, PA	EMPLOYER LEGAL SERVICES	0.50	\$235.00	\$117.50
SIEGRIST, CAMDEN P.	1984 - WV	COMMERCIAL & FINANCIAL	6.30	\$246.00	\$1,549.80
SMITH, SARAH E.	1977 - WV	BUSINESS LITIGATION	86.20	\$165.00	\$14,223.00
TOTAL PARTNERS AND COUNSEL	Lan.		677.00		\$143,652.61

ASSOCIATES

ASSOCIATES	YEAR		TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
NAME OF ASSOCIATE	ADMITTED	MATTER AREA OF LAW		10.007.00.00.00.00.00.00.00.00.00.00.00.0	
BIRCHENOUGH, SARA	2009 - WV	REAL ESTATE	13.20	\$114.80	\$1,515.36
CRISLIP, ANNA	2010 - WV	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	1.40	\$143.50	\$200.90
FREUND, BRITT	2008 - WV, PA	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	23.40	\$180.00	\$4,212.00
ROSE, HERSCHEL	2011 - WV	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT		\$118.90	\$9,714.13
THOMAS, BENJAMIN R.	2005 - WV	COMMERCIAL & FINANCIAL	18.60	\$184.50	\$3,431.70
WILKES, CATHERINE	2011 - WV	TAX	16.00	\$118.90	\$1,902.40
TOTAL ASSOCIATES	2011 ***	1.00	154.30		\$20,976.49

PARALEGAL

FAIGLEGAL	YEAR	TOTAL HOURS	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
NAME OF PARALEGAL	ADMITTED MATTER AREA OF LAW	BILLED		
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	MASS & TOXIC TORTS	179.40	\$70.00	\$12,558.00
HARRISON, KRISTEN	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	0.80	\$100.00	\$80.00
HARRISON, TINA	MASS & TOXIC TORTS	28.60	\$70.00	\$2,002.00
LESTER, SHANNON	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	51.40	\$70.00	\$3,598.00
TAYLOR, DEBRA	MASS & TOXIC TORTS	156.00	\$70.00	\$10,920.00
VANCE, UTE	MASS & TOXIC TORTS	165.20	\$70.00	\$11,564.00
TOTAL PARALEGALS		581.40	•	\$40,722.00

LAW CLERK

	YEAR	TOTAL HOURS	HOURLY	TOTAL
NAME OF LAW CLERK	ADMITTED MATTER AREA OF LAW	BILLED	RATE	FEES
EDWARDS, CHRISTOPHER	ADMINISTRATIVE DEPARTMENT	15.50	\$115.00	\$1,782.50
MARGOLIN, ELIZABETH	ADMINISTRATIVE DEPARTMENT	9.60	\$94.30	\$905.28
TOTAL LAW CLERKS		25.10		\$2,687.78

ADMINISTRATIVE

YEAR	TOTAL HOURS	HOURLY	TOTAL
ADMITTED MATTER AREA OF LAW	BILLED	RATE	FEES
MASS & TOXIC TORTS	56.00	\$70.00	\$3,920.00
MASS & TOXIC TORTS	17.80	\$70.00	\$1,246.00
FNFRGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOP	MENT 9.90	\$125.00	\$1,237.50
	83.70		\$6,403.50
	ADMITTED MATTER AREA OF LAW MASS & TOXIC TORTS MASS & TOXIC TORTS	MASS & TOXIC TORTS 17.80 MASS & TOXIC TORTS 17.80 MASS & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT 9.90	ADMITTED MATTER AREA OF LAW BILLED RATE MASS & TOXIC TORTS 56.00 \$70.00 MASS & TOXIC TORTS 17.80 \$70.00 ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT 9.90 \$125.00

		4 504 50	\$214,442.38
1		1,521.50	\$2 14,442.50 E
	GRAND TOTAL	.,	
	CIVALD TOTAL		

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed TO 22/12 PLENDED RATES 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

	Pa 8	ot 407	
	ATTORNEY BLENDED	TOTAL ATTORNEY	TOTAL ATTORNEY
RANK	RATE	HOURS BILLLED	FEES
PARTNERS AND COUNSEL	\$212.19	677.00	\$143,652.61
ASSOCIATES	\$135.95	154.30	\$20,976.49
LAW CLERK	\$107.08	25.10	\$2,687.78
TOTAL	\$195.37	856.40	\$167,316.88

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document Pg 9 of 407

EXHIBIT B

Expenses

ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES

INCURRED BY BOWLES RICE LLP ON

BEHALF OF THE DEBTORS DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD

CATEGORY OF EXPENSES	AMOUNTS
Medical Records	\$ 2,300.00
Long Distance Phone Calls	\$ 33.39
Travel Expenses	\$ 57.17
Federal Express Corporation	\$ 499.29
Miscellaneous Disbursements	\$ 64.00
United Parcel Service	\$ 12.06
Copies	\$ 160.50
Legal Computer Research Charges	\$ 1,158.61
Postage Charges	\$ 459.00
Long Distance Phone Calls	\$ 272.44
Photocopy Charges	\$ 2,841.70
Total	\$ 7,858.16

EXHIBIT C

Summary by Project Code

12-12<u>90</u>0-scc

SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY BOWLES RICE LLP ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY

DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER #	MATTER DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT 1	2-12
nair I doela				978.70	П	90
Diach Luilg	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00004	LUSK, WALTER F.	2.60)()
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00051	HAMPTON, EUGENE	11.00		ይቦ
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00122	CONAWAY, DORWIN	0:30		·C
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00180	LONG, KENNETH E./FED. BLACK LUNG	2.00		Г
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00333	SIZEMORE, HARRY	5.80		Οo
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00496	RASI, DIONIGI	22.80		C ′
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00510	TOLER, ALVIN L.	0.10		14
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00693	BARR, JUNIOR MCCOY	2.10		52
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00694	BELCHER, TERRY K.	6.20		,
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00751	MILLER, DELVIN	0.20		F
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00791	MORGAN, DON JEAN/FED. BLACK LUNG	0.40		ile
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00835	ELLIS, DANNY R.	3.40		d [,]
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00865	WRISTON, DONALD R.	1.20		10
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00867	FLOYD, THEODORE	17.90		/2:
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00899	WOOTEN, DALLAS D.	4.90		2/1
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00926	OVERTON, JAMES L.	34.05		12
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00937	SHUMATE, DEWANE A.	0.80	\$103.50 \$103.50	
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00961	MATTHEWS, ELGIE LEE	2.50	200.682\$	Fr
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00974	WILLIAMS, RILEY	0.20	of 5	nte
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01005	SMITH, WALTER F.	0.70	40c.96\$	re
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01019	POWELL, DALE E.	1.80	a 706.281\$	Ч
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01026	CARTWRIGHT, THOMAS	3.90		10
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01043	SMITH, JOHN W.	6.20)/2
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01071	MILAM, OMA, JR.	0.40	-	2/
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01089	COOK, ALFRED M.	16.50		12
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01112	RICHARDSON, JAMES G.	4.90		1
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01136	LAMB, ALVIN J.	12.00		7· ₂
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01166	CLAIMANT: MARTIN, RUBERT LEE	4.80	-	42
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01168	LESTER, SHERMAN F., JR.	0.20		.31
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01176	GARDNER, PAUL R.	16.10		3
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01235	WHITTINGTON, RALPH E.	4.20		N
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01254	MASSEY, ROBERT E.	4.00		/la
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01304	CRIHFIELD, LEON S.	3.30		in
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01317	CLINE, CARL H.	0.50		D
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01377	MORGAN, AVERY R.	5.30	00.50/\$ C) (
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01455	BLAIR, VERLIE JR.	6.90		un
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01516	JACKSON, GERALD WAYNE	0.40		nei
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01531	ELKINS, CHARLES L.	6.30		nt
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01540	CRUM, BENNY T.	1.50	00.8916	

12-12900-scc

SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY BOWLES RICE LLP ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY

CLIENT		MATTER DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01545	HOWERTON, ROOSEVELT (DECEASED)	0.80	\$94.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01557	RIDER, BARRY G.	00.9	\$610.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01579	JONES, TOMMY G.	0.20	\$14.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01588	MUSICK, JOHN HENRY	30.20	\$2,855.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01618	HICKS, WALTER THOMAS	27.00	\$2,707.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01621	HUDSON, CHARLES WILLIAM (DECEASED)	0.20	\$14.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01623	BAILEY, VERNON LESSEL	5.40	\$520.50
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01654	EVANS, LAWRENCE T	16.30	\$1,321.50
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01676	LANDON B. LUSK	0.40	\$28.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01708	HARMAN, JOHN R	9.70	\$907.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01737	SMITH, RALPH BENSON	2.90	\$686.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01760	BUSCH, ALLAN E. SR.	5.20	\$459.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01774	BLANKENSHIP, STEVENSON RAY	13.80	\$1,118.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01812	PRINCE, RICKY G.	41.10	\$3,561.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01834	BORING, WILLIAM J.	0.20	\$14.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01854	GIBSON, EDWARD H.	16.40	\$1,845.50
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01858	MILAM, ROY LEE	3.60	D-04.7888
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01879	SAWYERS, GARY P.	14.30	\$1,552.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01885	MORGAN, STEVEN D.	0.20	\$14.00C
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01916	DICKERSON JAMES V. EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL	22.80	\$2,612.50Q
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01928	LEWIS, JEFF DAVID	0.40	400.82
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01945	HARVEY, PAUL EDWARD	0.40	700.744
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01950	MCGUIRE, JOHNNY RAY	0.60	\$42.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01957	ABEL, ROBERT LEE	14.70	\$1,428.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01968	WILLIAMS, JESSE J., JR.	1.90	\$199.50
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01970	HELM, OMAR L. (FEDERAL BLACK LUNG)	16.10	\$2,561.50
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01998	HAGER, GEORGE EDWARD	0.50	\$44.50
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02037	LUSK, RALPH EMERSON	0.10	00.74
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02050	LAFFERTY, MARVIN RAY	2.80	\$300.50
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02062	LUSK, RICKY N.	2.60	\$277.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02101	WILLIAMS, HAROLD LEE	0.20	\$14.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02110	SALISBURY, PAUL B.	6.60	\$576.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02134	HENDERSHOT, WILLIAM EDWARD	0.20	\$14.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02171	JARRELL, GARY W.	16.40	\$2,706.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02187	TANKERSLEY, SAMUEL R.	2.90	\$231.50
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02194	ERWIN, PAUL	9.60	\$805.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02199	RUBY, JOHN W.	11.35	\$1,193.50
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02210	WILLIAMS, JESSE E.	0.20	\$14.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02220	KENNEDY, CLARENCE J.	07.11	\$1,094.50 #000.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02222	WORKIMAN, RONALD	5.60	\$620.00

Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

12-12900-scc

SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY BOWLES RICE LLP ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY

DESCRIPTION

12	\$1,247.50	\$935.50	\$1,071.00			\$322.00 00.225\$			\$203.50 \$203.50			\$1,234.00 See 00 93		\$99.00 \$31£,00		F				_	re 400.864	_	10.		2/1				12:				lai			OCI 00 788)
HOURS	12.80	5.90	13.40	8:60	2.60	4.60	9:9	1.70	5.70	0.40	1.80	14.10	06.7	0.40		9.00	06.1	15.20	2.50	00.7	1.40	4.10	5.10	2.80	8.80	0.70	0.30	3.40	0.20	0.5	0000	0.30 4.60	00:-	4.00	2 5 7	1 1.10	1.20	1.20	0.20	74.0
MATTER DESCRIPTION	CARPENTER, JR., JAMES E.	BLEVINS, OAKLEY T.	HARMON, WILLIE	RANKIN, LOWELL W.	PERSINGER, JR., WILLIAM A.	FULK, JR., RUSSEIL	WILSON, LENNIE L.	MUSICK, HAROLD	HARRIS, JERRY L, SR.	TINCHER, SR., DONALD	FERGUSON, WILLIAM R.	FREETAGE, ALLEN M.	PERMELÍA, DWARFUS D.	WEBBER, JR, JOSEPH	PICKETT, JACK E.	COUCH, ELBERT	THOMAS, ROBERT D.	ENGLAND, DOUGLAS L.	GREENWOOD, LEWIS G.	GUNNOE, KERMIT	CONRAD, NORMAN	DEAVERS, VERNON D.	MCCOY, GEORGE F	SHARPS, ROGER L.	ALDERMAN, ALVIS E.	WILLIAMS, KEITH	TUCKER, RICKEY	JACKSON, JACKIE	BURNS, EDDIE L.	KELLY, JOHN	MILLER, RICHARD	BROWNING, ROGER	WILEY, THOMAS R.	HATFIELD, JAMES (DONNA)	COX, DAVID C.	ROBERTS, SIDNEY E.	CARNES, RALPH (MARJORIE)	RAMSEY, LARRY WAYNE	COOK, DENNIS (SARAH)	BAILEY, DARRELL
MATTER #	P0495.02227	P0495.02235	P0495.02243	P0495.02254	P0495.02257	P0495.02281	P0495.02288	P0495.02292	P0495.02299	P0495.02305	P0495.02319	P0495.02320	P0495.02328	P0495.02329	P0495.02339	P0495.02358	P0495.02403	P0495.02424	P0495.02433	P0495.02445	P0495.02451	P0495.02454	P0495.02465	P0495.02466	P0495.02484	P0495.02487	P0495.02492	P0495.02496	P0495.02499	P0495.02512	P0495.02513	P0495.02514	P0495.02524	P0495.02532	P0495.02533	P0495.02534	P0495.02535	P0495.02537	P0495.02538	P0495.02541
CLIENT	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	FASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	FASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.																																			

SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY BOWLES RICE LLP ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY

12-12 WOONN	\$310.00					\$1,113.25			\$272.00			ile 00:2 \$		10 2388.50	\$290.50	2/1	2 Pg:509\$	\$443.00	\$194.50C1 E	264.50 Of Of	re 400.628\$				\$298.00			7:4			\$2 592 50			1 084 50 U						00.000
HOURS	2.80	3.20	1.80	0.20	10.55	10.95	5.00	1.60	7.50	10.50	0.70	0.10	1.50	4.60	3.20	2.00	6.30	4.70	2.10	10.80	9.40	4.80	4.20	3.90	2.90	3.30	4.10	3.60	2.70	2.30	16.00	130	00.0	2.20	19.70	33.10	9.50	5.00	2.50	7.00
NO																							÷.	:																
MATTER DESCRIPTION	KINCAID, FREDERICK P.	PATTON, WILLIE	HURLEY, GEORGE GRANT	STEVENS, FRED RAY	DAVIS, MALCOLM R.	KEY, ALFORD	GRAHAM, JAMES G.	ELKINS, CURTIS	SNODGRAS, PHILLIP D.1	COYER, WILLIAM T.	HATFIELD, IRVIN F.	MELTON, ROBERT E.	COLLINS, RANDY KEITH	HALL, ALVIN G.	LINVILLE, SHELBY W	SETSER, ALFRED F.	OSBORNE, HOWARD GLEN	HORVWALT, ROBERT D.	ADKINS, LGLEASON	FRANCIS, ROY W.	BILBRO, JAMES N.	BUCKLAND, WILLIAM S.	BURNS, JERRY LEE	SMITH, ARVILLE (BETTY)	PORTER, ALAN (LORI)	HOOD, RAYMOND K.	DANIELS, JIMMY (DEBORAH)	WORKMAN, LEROY E.	SMITH, GARY A.	MILLER, GEORGE E.	SCOLL, HAROLD WILLIAM	FOX, RALPH A.	KINCAID, WILLION	LOUDERMILK, PAUL W.	CKAWFORD, ROBERT E.	MILLER, DAVID (LADONNA)	FRALEY, LEO	BAILEY, JR., ROBERT W.	TURNER, JOSEPH D.	HUDSON, GARY W.
MATTER#	P0495.02542	P0495.02543	P0495.02544	P0495.02546	P0495.02548	P0495.02552	P0495.02555	P0495.02556	P0495.02558	P0495.02560	P0495.02563	P0495.02564	P0495.02565	P0495.02566	P0495.02567	P0495.02568	P0495.02569	P0495.02570	P0495.02571	P0495.02572	P0495.02573	P0495.02574	P0495.02575	P0495.02576	P0495.02577	P0495.02578	P0495.02579	P0495.02580	P0495.02581	P0495.02582	P0495.02583	P5191.00005	P5191.00008	P5191.00009	P5191.00017	P5191.00022	P5191.00030	P5191.00042	P5191.00051	P5191.00053
CLIENT	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION																																						

DESCRIPTION

SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY BOWLES RICE LLP ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY

DESCRIPTION	CLIENT PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	MATTER# P5191.00072 P5191.00096 P5191.00100	MATTER DESCRIPTION AMOS, DENNIS C. DELUNG, RUSSELL LEE ADKINS, HENLEY	HOURS 2.60 0.60 3.30	AMOUNT 15-12 \$ \$277.00 \$ \$42.00 \$-\$cc
Commercial	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION -	P0505.00063 P5523.00001	2012 LOAN TRANSACTION FIRM RETENTION	332.50 263.60 68.90	\$70,249.67 \$53,686.17 \$16,563.50 O
Energy & Real Estate	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL, LLC EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL, LLC PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0493.00003 P0493.10219 P0505.00001 P0505.00065	FEDERAL NO. 2 FRANKLIN M. & ANGELA L. CHISLER; SALE OF MONONGALIA CO. PPTY GENERAL REPRESENTATION SIERRA CLUB MINING AGREEMENT SHEPARD BOONE COAL COMPANY, LLC AND SHONK LAND COMPANY	193.60 0.80 15.40 10.20 150.10	
Litigation	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL, LLC PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0493.00220 P0505.00061	ADV. COBB PANTHER BRANCH COAL COMPANY AND	2.20 0.50 1.70	\$542.50 \$542.50 \$5425.00 \$17.50
Safety and Health	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	E1166.00019 E1166.00058 E1166.00066 E1166.00071	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL, LLC FEDERAL NO. 2 MINE - WEVA 2009-97 HIGHLAND 9 MINE KENT 2009-168 HIGHLAND 9 MINE KENT 2009-168 TOTAL HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED:	14.50 6.10 2.40 3.00 3.00 1,521.50	ntered 10/22/12 17:42:33 of 407 06:2:2:38 \$6.2:0:2:2 \$6.2:2:3 \$6.2:2 \$
					Main Document

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document Pg 17 of 407

EXHIBIT D

Time Records

Bowles Rice LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P5523.00001

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION - BANKRUPTCY C/O JULIA A. CHINCHECK, ESQ. BOWLES RICE MCDAVID GRAFF & LOVE LLP 600 QUARRIER STREET POST OFFICE BOX 1386 CHARLESTON WV 25325-1386

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

1.80 07/10/12 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. CHEPIGA, M. MCGREAL RE: LOCAL COUNSEL ISSUES, QUESTIONS RAISED BY LOCAL CREDITORS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. JONES, M. D'ANTONI RE: SAME (.3); PROVIDE UPDATE TO T. LANE; REVIEW BANKRUPTCY DOCKET AND FILED PLEADINGS (.3); CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEYS RE: BANKRUPTCY FILING (.2). PARTNER: JAC .00 07/11/12 CORRESPONDENCE TO E. POWER (1); REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET (.2); CORRESPONDENCE TO M. D'ANTONI, T. LANE RE: SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. FLETCHER RE: PATRIOT BANKRUPTCY; CORRESPONDENCE TO C. FLETCHER RE: CRITICAL VENDOR MOTION; REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET; CORRESPONDENCE TO M. D'ANTONI RE: ORDER APPROVING DIP FINANCING ON INTERIM BASIS. PARTNER: JAC 07/11/12 REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET (.2); CORRESPONDENCE TO .70 M. D'ANTONI, T. LANE RE: SAME (.2); REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET (.3). PARTNER: JAC 07/11/12 CORRESPONDENCE TO E. POWER (1); REVIEW UPDATED .40 DOCKET (.2); CORRESPONDENCE TO M. D'ANTONI, T. LANE RE: SAME (.1); PARTNER: JAC 07/12/12 REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET (.1); REVIEW INITIAL .30 PETITION (.1); CONFERENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI RE: SAME (.1).

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

PARTNER: JAC

07/16/12	WORKING ON SPECIAL COUNSEL APPOINTMENT FOR PATRIOT PARTNER: MBD	3.00
07/17/12	CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. HAYNES RE: INVOICES (.2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. OBLAK RE: SAME (PATRIOT BANKRUPTCY). (.1) PARTNER: JAC	.30
07/17/12	WORKING ON SPECIAL COUNSEL APPLICATION RE: PATRIOT COAL PARTNER: MBD	2.00
07/18/12	MULTIPLE CONFERENCES OR CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI, T. LANE, C. FLETCHER, ET AL., RE: ISSUES ASSOCIATED WITH PATRIOT BANKRUPTCY (1.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KRAUSE RE: APPLICATION PROCESS, ET AL (.2).; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI RE: SAME (.4); REVIEW INFORMATION FROM R. MARTIN RE: CREDITORS (.2); CORRESPONDENCE TO A. DUFF, ET AL REGARDING CREDITOR LIST TO REVIEW FOR RETENTION APPLICATION; CONFERENCE WITH K. DUIGUID RE: SAME AND BILLING PROCEDURES (1.0). PARTNER: JAC	3.00
07/18/12	WORKING ON SPECIAL COUNSEL APPLICATION FOR PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION PARTNER: MBD	2.00
07/19/12	REVIEW MOTION TO EMPLOY COUNSEL (.2); CORRESPONDENCE TO M. D'ANTONI, ET AL., RE: SAME (.2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM DAVIS POLK RE: NEW LIST OF CONFLICTS (.1). PARTNER: JAC	.50
07/23/12	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. MARTIN RE: REVISED RETENTION MOTION FORM. PARTNER: JAC	.20
07/24/12	REVIEW ATTORNEY AFFIDAVIT FOR FILING WITH BANKRUPTCY COURT (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH W.F. DOBBS RE: SAME (.2); CONFERENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI RE: RETENTION TEMPLATE (.7); CORRESPONDENCE TO M. D'ANTONI RE: SAME (.1). PARTNER: JAC	1.20

07/30/12	REVIEW UPDATED LIST OF CREDITORS TO REVIEW FOR CONFLICTS (.1); CORRESPONDENCE TO/FROM S. KRAUSE RE: RETENTION ISSUES (.2); CORRESPONDENCE TO A. DUFF, K. DUIGUID RE: NEW LIST TO CHECK (.2). PARTNER: JAC	.50
07/30/12	WORKING ON PATRIOT COAL SPECIAL COUNSEL BANKRUPTCY APPLICATION AND AFFIDAVIT PARTNER: MBD	5.00
07/31/12	WORKING ON PATRIOT COAL SPECIAL COUNSEL BANKRUPTCY APPLICATION AND AFFIDAVIT PARTNER: MBD	5.00
08/01/12	MULTIPLE CONFERENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI RE: DECLARATION SUPPORTING FIRM RETENTION. PARTNER: JAC	.50
08/01/12	PREPARE AND ANALYZE ISSUES RELATING TO COUNSEL APPLICATION, COUNSEL DECLARATION AND PROPOSED COURT ORDER PARTNER: MBD	3.00
08/02/12	WORK WITH M. D'ANTONI ON: DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF APPLICATION TO RETAIN FIRM (1.5); CORRESPONDENCE TO J. EAGAN RE: SAME (.5). PARTNER: JAC	1.70
08/02/12	PREPARE AND ANALYZE ISSUES RELATING TO COUNSEL APPLICATION, COUNSEL DECLARATION AND PROPOSED COURT ORDER PARTNER: MBD	2.50
	COMPLETION OF DECLARATION (.2); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO E. POWER RE: ORDINARY COURSE DECLARATION (.2); CORRESPONDENCE TO/FROM S. KRAUSE RE: SAME (.3); REVIEW DECLARATION AND QUESTIONNAIRE (.3); CONFERENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI RE: SAME (.2); CONFERENCE WITH HAYNES RE: INFORMATION NEEDED FROM ACCOUNTING DEPARTMENT FOR SAME (.3). PARTNER: JAC	1.50

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/03/12	PREPARE AND ANALYZE ISSUES RELATING TO COUNSEL APPLICATION, COUNSEL DECLARATION AND PROPOSED COURT ORDER PARTNER: MBD	3.10
08/04/12	PREPARE AND ANALYZE ISSUES RELATING TO COUNSEL APPLICATION, COUNSEL DECLARATION AND PROPOSED COURT ORDER PARTNER: MBD	2.50
08/06/12	WORK ON ORDINARY COURSE COUNSEL DECLARATION AND QUESTIONNAIRE (.7); CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. CARYL RE: STOCK OWNERSHIP (.2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO A. HAYNES RE: AMOUNTS OWING AT FILING (.2); REVIEW RESPONSES FROM INTERNAL EMAIL INQUIRY ON CONFLICTS WITH RETENTION AS SPECIAL COUNSEL FOR DEBTORS (.4); CORRESPONDENCE TO S. KRAUSE RE: UNITED STATES TRUSTEE'S PROJECT CODES (.2); REVIEW CHART OF TIMEKEEPER RATES FOR BOWLES RICE (.2). PARTNER: JAC	1.90
08/06/12	PERFORM DUE DILIGENCE REGARDING SPECIAL COUNSEL APPLICATION PARTNER: MBD	3.00
08/07/12	WORK ON DECLARATION AND QUESTIONNAIRE FOR ORDINARY COURSE APPLICATION (1.2); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. IBRAHIM RE: PROJECT CODES (.3); REVIEW PROJECT CODES (.1); MULTIPLE CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. DUFF, A. HAYNES RE: CONFLICT SEARCHES, OUTSTANDING INVOICES, ET AL (.4).; REVIEW UPDATED INFORMATION FROM A. DUFF, A. HAYNES (.3). PARTNER: JAC	2.30
08/07/12	PERFORM DUE DILIGENCE REGARDING SPECIAL COUNSEL APPLICATION PARTNER: MBD	2.50
08/08/12	CORRESPONDENCE TO/FROM ACCOUNTING RE: NEED FOR BILLING INVOICES, DEADLINES FOR MEETING ORDINARY COURSE RETENTION (.2); ATTORNEYS RE: TIME ENTRY FORMATS (.2); CORRESPONDENCE TO ACCOUNTING ABOUT DEADLINE TO SUBMIT INVOICES FOR BILLING (.2); TWO CONFERENCES WITH	1.00

Payable Upon Receipt

	ACCOUNTING RE: PREPARATION OF, FORMAT FOR INVOICES (.6). PARTNER: JAC	
08/08/12	PERFORM DUE DILIGENCE REGARDING SPECIAL COUNSEL APPLICATION (2.0); PREPARE SPECIAL COUNSEL APPLICATION (1.5) PARTNER: MBD	3.50
08/09/12	CONFERENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI RE: DECLARATIONS FOR FIRM (.4); REVISE QUESTIONNAIRE BASED ON NEW INFORMATION (.4). PARTNER: JAC	.80
08/10/12	CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO E. POWER RE: ORDINARY COURSE COUNSEL DOCUMENTS (.2); CONFERENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI RE: ADDITIONS TO CONFLICT LIST ATTACHED TO ORDINARY COURSE DECLARATION (.3); CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. MARTIN RE: DRAFT APPLICATION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. MARTIN, M. D'ANTONI RE: SAME (.2); MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH P. FRAMPTON RE: HIS BILLS, BILLING FORMAT (.6); REVIEW R. OBLAK BILLS (.2); CORRESPONDENCE TO R. OBLAK RE: REQUIRED BILLING FORMAT (.2); CONFERENCE WITH K. DUIGUID, ET AL., RE: TURN-AROUND TIME ON BILLS (.4). PARTNER: JAC	2.30
08/10/12	PERFORM DUE DILIGENCE REGARDING SPECIAL COUNSEL APPLICATION (.5); PREPARE SPECIAL COUNSEL APPLICATION (3.0); PREPARE DECLARATION (2.0); PREPARE COURT ORDER (1.0) PARTNER: MBD	6.50
08/13/12	FINALIZE SPECIAL COUNSEL APPLICATION, DECLARATION AND PROPOSED ORDER (1.0); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. DERICHEMONT RE: SAME (.2); CONFERENCE WITH M. MONTELEONE, K. DIUGUID RE: FORM OF TIME ENTRY (.2); CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEYS CONDUCTING PATRIOT WORK RE: SAME (.2); CORRESPONDENCE TO E. POWER, ET AL, RE: ORDINARY COURSE RETENTION DOCUMENTS (.2).	1.80

PARTNER: JAC

08/13/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. DERICHEMONT RE: PROJECT CODES, SENDING INVOICES TO DEBTORS (.2). PARTNER: JAC	.20
08/14/12	REVIEW ORDER PROVISIONS IF MONTHLY FEES EXCEED \$50,000 (.2). PARTNER: JAC	.20
08/15/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. KLEIN RE: SPECIAL COUNSEL APPLICATION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI RE: ORDINARY COURSE RETENTION ISSUES (.2). PARTNER: JAC	.40
08/16/12	REVIEW REVISIONS TO PROPOSED DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF RETENTION APPLICATION AND CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. IBRAHIM RE: SAME (.2). PARTNER: JAC	.20
08/17/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI RE: DECLARATION SUPPORTING FIRM RETENTION (.2). PARTNER: JAC	.20
08/23/12	FINALIZE SPECIAL COUNSEL APPLICATION PARTNER: MBD	.50
08/28/12	CONFERENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI RE: RETENTION APPLICATION ISSUES (.2); MULTIPLE CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. KRAUSE RE: SAME (.4); REVISE RETENTION APPLICATION AND CORRESPONDENCE TO R. MARTIN RE: SAME (.3). PARTNER: JAC	.90

Payable Upon Receipt

DESCRIPTION OF EXPENSE ADVANCES

	LEGAL COMPUTER RESEARCH CHARGES POSTAGE CHARGES LONG DISTANCE PHONE CALLS PHOTOCOPY CHARGES Reversal from Void Check Number: 226742	1158.61
	POSTAGE CHARGES	459.00
	LONG DISTANCE PHONE CALLS	272.44
	PHOTOCOPY CHARGES	2841.70
06/29/12	Reversal from Void Check Number: 226742	(100.00)
	Bank ID: 11 Voucher ID: 373197	(200,00)
	Vendor: ST. FRANCIS HOSPITAL	
07/10/12	MEDICAL RECORDS VENDOR: JOHNS HOPKINS	150.00
	RECORDS - ROBERT ABEL	
07/10/12	MEDICAL RECORDS VENDOR: JOHNS HOPKINS	150.00
	RECORDS- JAMES GRAHAM	
07/10/12	MEDICAL RECORDS VENDOR: JOHNS HOPKINS	150.00
	RECORDS-SIDNEY ROBERTS	
07/10/12	MEDICAL RECORDS VENDOR: JOHNS HOPKINS	600.00
	RECORDS-VERLIE BLAIR	
07/10/12	MEDICAL RECORDS VENDOR: JOHNS HOPKINS	600.00
	RECORDS-PHILLIP SNODGRASS	
07/10/12	MEDICAL RECORDS VENDOR: JOHNS HOPKINS	150.00
	RECORDS-JESSE WILLIAMS	
07/10/12	MEDICAL RECORDS VENDOR: JOHNS HOPKINS	600.00
	RECORDS-ROBERT CRAWFORD	
07/11/12	TRAVEL EXPENSES VENDOR: GARY K. JONES	4.44
	INAVED REIMB-DEDIVERIES AND PICK UPS	
	COPIES VENDOR: BOONE COUNTY CLERK COPIES	
07/12/12	FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL	19.91
	EXPRESS CORPORATION EVERETT OSTERLING	
07/12/12	FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL	26.64
	EXPRESS CORPORATION DR DAVID ROSENBERG	
07/17/12	TRAVEL EXPENSES VENDOR: GARY K. JONES	4.44
	TRAVEL REIMB- DELIVERIES	
07/17/12	TRAVEL EXPENSES VENDOR: GARY K. JONES	4.44
	TRAVEL REIMB- DELIVERIES	
07/18/12	FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL	44.00
, ,	EXPRESS CORPORATION BRMGL	
07/19/12	FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL	19.60
/ /-	EXPRESS CORPORATION DR RENN	
07/24/12	TRAVEL EXPENSES VENDOR: GARY K. JONES	0.56
	TRAVEL REIMB- DELIVERIES	

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

07/24/12	FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION DR PAUL WHEELER	21.87
07/27/12	TRAVEL EXPENSES VENDOR: DAVID W. BURDETTE TRAVEL REIMB- DELIVERIES	4.44
07/30/12	FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION EVERETT OSTERLING, MD	15.96
07/30/12	FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION DR PAUL WHEELER	15.27
08/01/12	TRAVEL EXPENSES VENDOR: DAVID W. BURDETTE TRAVEL REIMB- DELIVERIES	4.44
08/01/12	FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION US DEPT LABOR	19.13
08/01/12	FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION EVERETTE OSTERLING, MD	19.91
08/01/12	FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION DR PAUL WHEELER	23.62
08/02/12	FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION DR PAUL WHEELER	15.27
08/06/12	FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION DR ROSENBERG	23.20
08/06/12	TRAVEL EXPENSES VENDOR: DAVID W. BURDETTE TRAVEL REIMB- DELIVERIES	4.44
08/07/12	TRAVEL EXPENSES VENDOR: GARY K. JONES	4.44
08/08/12	TRAVEL REIMB-DELIVERIES FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL	14.99
08/08/12	EXPRESS CORPORATION DR PAUL WHEELER LONG DISTANCE PHONE CALLS VENDOR: GLOBAL	33.39
08/09/12	CROSSING TELECOMMUNICATIONS CONFERENCE CALL TRAVEL EXPENSES VENDOR: GARY K. JONES	4.44
08/09/12	TRAVEL REIMB-DELIVERIES FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL	14.99
08/14/12	EXPRESS CORPORATION DR DAVID ROSENBURG TRAVEL EXPENSES VENDOR: MARK SIMONTON	3.33
	TRAVEL REIMB- DELIVERIES FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION JOSEPH WOLFE	18.46
	FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL	19.56
08/16/12	EXPRESS CORPORATION EVERETT OSTERLING FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL	26.42
08/20/12	EXPRESS CORPORATION OFFICE ADMIN LAW FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL	24.78
	EXPRESS CORPORATION STEPHEN BUSH FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL	21.48
	EXPRESS CORPORATION DR PAUL WHEELER TRAVEL EXPENSES VENDOR: GARY K. JONES TRAVEL REIMB-DELIVERIES	4.44

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/20/12 TRAVEL EXPENSES VENDOR: GARY K. JONES		4.44
TRAVEL REIMB-DELIVERIES 08/21/12 UNITED PARCEL SERVICE - VENDOR: UNITED PARCEL SERVICE DR DAVID ROSENBURG		12.06
08/21/12 VENDOR: COMMONWEALTH OF VIRGINIA STATE CORP. COMM. MB30581 - BIG EAGLE, BIG EAGLE RAIL,		64.00
EMERALD PROCESSING, KANAWHA EAGLE COAL, KE VENTURES		
08/21/12 FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION US DEPT LABOR	ı	16.26
08/23/12 FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION DR DAVID ROSENBERG	1	21.48
08/24/12 TRAVEL EXPENSES VENDOR: DAVID W. BURDETTE		4.44
TRAVEL REIMB- DELIVERIES 08/24/12 TRAVEL EXPENSES VENDOR: DAVID W. BURDETTE		4.44
TRAVEL REIMB- DELIVERIES 08/24/12 TRAVEL EXPENSES VENDOR: DAVID W. BURDETTE		0.00
TRAVEL REIMB- DELIVERIES 08/24/12 FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL	,	14.99
EXPRESS CORPORATION DR PAUL WHEELER 08/24/12 FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL	1	23.13
EXPRESS CORPORATION DR JOSEPH RENN 08/27/12 FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL	1	18.37
EXPRESS CORPORATION REBECCA MARTIN 08/28/12 FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION VENDOR: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION DR DAVID ROSENBERG	1	0.00
TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT		16563.50 7858.16
INVOICE TOTAL	\$	24421.66

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0493.00220

EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL, LLC P. O. BOX 1233 CHARLESTON, WV 25324 ATTN: ELIZABETH POWER

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

.10 07/19/12 TELEPHONE CALL TO WYOMING COUNTY CIRCUIT CLERK TO CONFIRM STATUS OF MATTER. PARTNER: MJS 07/19/12 PREPARE NOTICE OF AUTOMATIC STAY PLEADING TO .30 BE FILED. PARTNER: MJS 07/19/12 TELEPHONE CALL TO E. POWER REGARDING APPARENT .10 ACTIVE STATUS OF CASE AND STAY FINING. PARTNER: MJS 117.50 TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 0.00 TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT 117.50 INVOICE TOTAL ========

Bowles Rice LLI

POST OFFICE BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0493.00003

EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL, LLC P. O. BOX 1233 CHARLESTON, WV 25324 ATTN: ELIZABETH POWER

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/10/12 TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. SHUMAN AND J. EAGAN PARTNER: JTL

.80

TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED \$
TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT

INVOICE TOTAL \$

228.00

228.00

0.00

Bowles Rice LLI

POST OFFICE BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P5191.00005

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION C/O CHARTIS INSURANCE 80 PINE STREET 38TH FLOOR NEW YORK NEW YORK 10005

07/18/12	RECEIPT OF CLMT TO ALJ; REQUEST FOR EXTENSION; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20	
07/23/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
07/26/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE EXTENDING BRIEF DEADLINE AND UPDATING SYSTEM PARALEGAL: D T	.20	
08/13/12	ANALYSIS OF FILE INFORMATION AND VARIOUS EVIDENCE IN PREPARATION FOR ARGUMENT (2.2); BEGINNING TO DRAFT BRIEF (1.2) PARTNER: SES	3.40	
08/14/12	DRAFTING BRIEF PARTNER: SES	4.20	
08/15/12	DRAFTING AND REVISING BRIEF; UPDATING RESEARCH ON RELEVANT ISSUES PARTNER: SES	6.40	
08/16/12	REVISE BRIEF AND ADD SECTION REGARDING DR. ABRAHAMS REPORT AND ANALYSIS PARTNER: PEF	1.50	
	R PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED PENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT	\$	2592.50 0.00
	INVOICE TOTAL	т	2592.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P5191.00008

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION C/O CHARTIS INSURANCE 80 PINE STREET 38TH FLOOR NEW YORK NEW YORK 10005

08/06/12 REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/15/12 TELEPHONE CALL FROM CAMC REGARDING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/29/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT	\$ 91.00 0.00
INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 91.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P5191.00009

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION C/O CHARTIS INSURANCE 80 PINE STREET 38TH FLOOR NEW YORK NEW YORK 10005

	DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES		
07/12/12	RECEIPT OF SSAE; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20	
07/13/12	REVIEW EVIDENCE DEVELOPED BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND COMPARE WITH OTHER INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN CASE MATERIALS; REVIEW EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.50); REVIEW PROPOSED LITIGATION PLAN (.20); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH SPECIAL OBJECTIONS (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.80	
07/13/12	DRAFTING RESPONSE TO THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO THE SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE (.20); DRAFTING COVER LETTER TO THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO THE SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE (.10); DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES PURSUANT TO THE SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE (.10); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, EXAMINATION REPORT AND TEST RESULTS FROM DR. RASMUSSEN AND DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION PLAN (.60)	1.00	
07/13/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
	R PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED PENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT		230.00
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	230.00

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P5191.00017

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION C/O CHARTIS INSURANCE 80 PINE STREET 38TH FLOOR NEW YORK NEW YORK 10005

07/11/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORDS REQUESTS (.20); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM STONE MOUNTAIN HEALTH SERVICES, DR. AMJAD, DR. MILLER AND FROM APPALACHIAN REGIONAL HOSPITAL, WHILE BOOKMARKING ALL RELEVANT RECORDS (.90); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES (.20); DRAFTING REQUESTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAY FILMS (.50) PARALEGAL: UV	1.80
07/12/12	CHECK FOR ANY RESPONSE TO INTERROGATORIES, PROCEDURAL HISTORY OF DISCOVERY (.20); REVIEW ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S REPRESENTATIVE (.20) PARTNER: PEF	.40
07/12/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/13/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
07/16/12	REVIEWING RECEIPT OF READINGS FROM DR. WHEELER'S OFFICE AND VERIFYING CLAIM STATUS PARALEGAL: D T	.20
07/16/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORT FROM DR. WHEELER OF CLAIMANT'S EVIDENTIARY X-RAY FILM AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/25/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CAMC PARALEGAL: KC	.60

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

07/26/12	REVIEWING STATUS OF EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT PURSUANT TO AFFIRMATIVE DEADLINE (.30); REVIEWING CLAIMANT'S EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT (.30); DRAFTING REQUEST TO THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FOR FILM AND DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. WHEELER FOR READING OF FILM (.20); DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL REPORT FROM DR. ZALDIVAR AND CURRENT EVIDENCE AT THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.50) PARALEGAL: D T	1.50
07/30/12	CHECK AND CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM; CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR REPORT (.20); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUESTING PRODUCTION (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/06/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM BECKLEY APPALACHIAN REGIONAL HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/10/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM BECKLEY APPALACHIAN REGIONAL HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/13/12	CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL FOR STATUS ON INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: SL	.20
08/13/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
08/15/12	REVIEW OF MEDICAL STATUS AND PHONE CALL TO APPALACHIAN REGIONAL MEDICAL CENTER FOR X-RAY AND CT'S PARALEGAL: SL	.70
08/15/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND SOCIAL SECURITY RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/16/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
08/17/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/17/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL	.10

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

	PARTNER: PEF	
08/17/12	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/17/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RELEASE PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/17/12	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RELEASE PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/17/12	RECEIPT OF DOL TO DR. WHEELER X-RAY ENCLOSED; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/17/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL(.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/22/12	REVIEW OF CAMC MEDICAL RECORDS FOR UPDATED CT AND X-RAY NEEDED. PARALEGAL: SL	.60
08/22/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM CAMC PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/22/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO CAMC AND BECKLEY APPALACHIAN REGIONAL HOSPITAL REGARDING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/24/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
08/24/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO CAMC AND BECKLEY APPALACHIAN REGIONAL HOSPITAL REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/27/12	RECEIPT OF ONE COMPACT DISC AND RADIOLOGY REPORTS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/27/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO BECKLEY APPALCHAIN REGIONAL HOPSITAL REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/28/12	RECEIPT OF X-RAY FILM, COMPACT DISC, AND	.20

Payable Upon Receipt

RADIOLOGY REPORTS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

PARALEGAL: UV

08/28/12 REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISC RECEIVED

FROM BECKLEY ARH TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS

CONTAINED ON DISC PARALEGAL: UV

TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 1084.50

.30

1084.50

0.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P5191.00022

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION C/O CHARTIS INSURANCE 80 PINE STREET 38TH FLOOR NEW YORK NEW YORK 10005

07/26/12	VERIFYING CLAIM STATUS (.30); DETERMINING STATUS OF CLAIMANT'S ABILITY TO OBTAIN COUNSEL (.30); DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORMS SUBMITTING TESTIMONIES OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND DR. ROSENBERG (.30); DRAFTING REQUEST TO SCHEDULE SUPPLEMENTAL DEPOSITIONS (.20); VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.40) PARALEGAL: D T	1.50
07/26/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
07/27/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
07/30/12	REVIEW DEPOSITION SCHEDULE (.20); REVIEW DR. ROSENBERG AND DR. ZALDIVARPRIOR TESTIMONY AND NEED FOR ADDITIONAL TESTIMONY IN LIGHT OF RECENT DECISION OF JUDGE MORGAN (.60); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE WITH NOTICE OF DR. ROSENBERG DEPOSITION (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE WITH NOTICE OF DR. ZALDIVAR DEPOSITION (.10) PARTNER: PEF	1.00
07/30/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION: UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM PARALEGAL: KC	1.40
07/30/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.40

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/07/12	REVIEW PROPOSED INITIAL EVIDENCE SUMMARY; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE (.3); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/07/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.10
08/07/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM LOGAN GENERAL HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/07/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO LOGAN GENERAL HOSPITAL REGARDING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.10
08/07/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO WIDOW ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/07/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO WIDOW ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/13/12	DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. CAFFREY FOR SUPPLEMENTAL REPORT PARALEGAL: D T	.30
08/13/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND OBTAINING INFORMATION FOR DR. CAFFREY'S REVIEW PARALEGAL: D T	.30
08/13/12	DRAFTING MOTION TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE TO CONTINUE HEARING PARALEGAL: D T	.40
08/13/12	DRAFTING COVER LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/13/12	PROCESS CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. CAFFREY ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/13/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. CAFFREY ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/15/12	REVIEW REVISED DEPOSITION SCHEDULE AND DEADLINES PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/15/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/21/12	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE WHICH MATERIALS TO FORWARD TO DR. ZALDIVAR IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: TMH	1.80
08/21/12	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR ENCLOSING ADDITIONAL MATERIALS FOR REVIEW IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: TMH	.30
08/22/12	REVIEW ADDITIONAL MATERIALS BEING SENT TO PHYSICIAN FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND BEING DEVELOPED PARTNER: PEF	3.00
08/22/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/22/12	RECEIPT OF CONSULTING REPORT FROM DR. CAFFREY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/23/12	REVIEW SUPPLEMENTAL REPORT OF DR. CAFFREY AND COMPARE WITH PREVIOUS REPORT AND ISSUES PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/23/12	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM WELLS FARGO AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/24/12	DIRECT CONTACT WITH DR. CAFFREY TO CLARIFY REPORT PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/24/12	REVIEWING PATHOLOGY REPORT FROM DR. CAFFREY PARALEGAL: D T	.20

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/24/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM FOR DR. CAFFREY'S MEDICAL REPORT PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/27/12	REVIEWING ISSUE OF RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR AND UPDATING SYSTEM PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/27/12	DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR PARALEGAL: D T	.30
08/27/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/28/12	REVIEW REPORTS OF DR. CAFFREY AND INFORMATION RE ATTEMPTS TO EXPLAIN TO DR. CAFFREY THE NEED FOR A REPORT BASED ON PATHOLOGY MATERIALS ONLY PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/28/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DR. CAFFREY PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/28/12	REVIEW PREVIOUS DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR, REPORT OF DR. RANAVAYA, ISSUES, PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.60
08/28/12	CONFERENCE WITH DR. ZALDIVAR PRIOR TO DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/28/12	DEPOSE DR. ZALDIVAR PARTNER: PEF	.80
08/28/12	REVIEW STATUS OF MATERIALS FOR OTHER DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/28/12	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ROSENBERG FOR DEPOSITION AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE IN RECORD PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/28/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/28/12	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE WHICH MATERIALS TO	.60

Payable Upon Receipt

	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	2148.50
	R PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED PENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT	\$	2148.50
08/28/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	. 20	0
08/28/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZADIVAR, COURT REPORTER, AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.30)
08/28/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL FOR DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	. 90)
08/28/12	RECEIPT OF SUPPLEMENTAL REPORT FROM DR. CAFFREY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20)
08/28/12	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE AND INDEX OF DOCUMENTS TO DR. ROSENBERG FOR REVIEW IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: TMH	.40)
	FORWARD TO DR. ROSENBERG IN PREPARATION OF HIS DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: TMH		

=========

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P5191.00030

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION C/O CHARTIS INSURANCE 80 PINE STREET 38TH FLOOR NEW YORK NEW YORK 10005

07/10/12	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CANCER TREATMENT CENTER (.60); CHECK STATUS OF FILMS (.10); REVIEW VARIOUS CT SCAN FILMS AND X-RAYS (.30); CHECK FOR ANY EVIDENCE FROM CLAIMANT; CHECK STATUS OF DEATH CERTIFICATE (.30) PARTNER: PEF	1.30
07/10/12	REVIEW OF CT SCANS PROVIDED BY CANCER TREATMENT CENTER AND COMPARE WITH RECORDS AND REPORTS PARALEGAL: SL	1.30
07/10/12	REVIEWING MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT IN COMPARISON WITH TREATING PHYSICIAN INFORMATION (1.00); STATUS OF FILMS FROM RALEIGH CANCER CENTER (.20) PARALEGAL: D T	1.20
07/11/12	REVIEW INFORMATION RE STATUS OF DEATH CERTIFICATE (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.20
07/11/12	REVIEWING MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH CANCER CENTER AND OBTAINING MATERIAL FOR DR. ZALDIVAR'S REVIEW (1.50); DRAFTING INDEX OF MATERIAL (.50) PARALEGAL: D T	2.00
07/11/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO WYOMING COUNTY CLERK AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/12/12	CONFIRM NEED FOR CONSULTING OPINION; REVIEW INFORMATION RE PHYSICIAN AVAILABILITY, DEPOSITION DATES (.20); REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD (.40); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.70

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

07/12/12	REVIEWING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT FOR COMPLETION OF EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT PARALEGAL: D T	.40
07/12/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM CANCER TREATMENT CENTER OF AMERICA AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS PARALEGAL: UV	1.00
07/12/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
07/12/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.30
07/13/12	REVIEW ADDITIONAL MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CANCER CENTER (.50); DESIGNATE RECORDS FOR SUBMISSION; SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT WITH COPIES OF EVIDENCE BEING SUBMITTED (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.60
07/13/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/16/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING EVIDENCE SUMMARY AND PREHEARING REPORT TO CLAIMANT (.90); DRAFTING COVER LETTER TO CLAIMANT (.10) PARALEGAL: D T	1.00
07/18/12	REVIEW PROPOSED EVIDENCE SUMMARY AND PREHEARING REPORT TO COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN CASE MATERIALS AND RECORD (.40); CONFIRM PROCEDURAL HISTORY (.50); REVIEW ADDITIONAL MEDICAL RECORDS FOR SUBMISSION AS EVIDENCE (.20); SIGN VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT WITH EVIDENCE (.20); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT WITH REQUIRED EVIDENCE SUMMARY (.10) PARTNER: PEF	1.20
07/18/12	PREPARED AND FILED DEATH CERTIFICATE, PATHOLOGY REPORT AND MOTION FOR DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR PARALEGAL: SL	1.50
07/18/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME	.20

ADMINISTRATIVE:	L	В
-----------------	---	---

	ADMINISTRATIVE: LD	
07/19/12	PROCESSING NOTICE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/23/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS (.20); TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. BHAVASAR REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS (.20); DRAFTING REQUEST TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS (.40) PARALEGAL: KC	.80
07/24/12	RECEIPT OF CONSULTING REPORT FROM DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/25/12	REVIEW REPORT OF DR. ZALDIVAR; COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE PARTNER: PEF	.40
07/27/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE FOR ADDITIONAL MATERIAL FOR DR. ZALDIVAR'S REVIEW (.60); DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.10); REVIEWING STATUS OF RESPONSE TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING ISSUES AND UPDATING CLAIM (.10) PARALEGAL: D T	.80
07/27/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL TO SEND TO DR. ZALDIVAR PARALEGAL: KC	.60
07/27/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/30/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS; PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.70
07/30/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION (.30); TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION (.20) PARALEGAL: KC	.50
07/31/12	REVIEW CLAIMANT'S RECORDS FOR TREATMENT IN VARIOUS CANCER CENTERS (.70); DEPOSE DR. ZALDIVAR (1.10) PARTNER: PEF	1.80
07/31/12	CONFERENCE WITH DR. ZALDIVAR RE ISSUES FOR	1.00

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

	DEPOSITION AND RECORDS PARTNER: PEF	
08/02/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DIRECTOR'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/03/12	REVIEWING AND UPDATING CLAIM FOR PENDING HEARING (.7); DRAFTING INDEX OF EMPLOYER'S EXHIBITS AND OBTAINING THREE COPIES OF EXHIBITS (.5); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR OFFICIAL TRANSCRIPT (.2); FOLLOW UP ON STATUS OF TRANSCRIPT (.1) PARALEGAL: D T	1.50
08/06/12	REVIEW OF DISKS FROM CANCER TREATMENT CENTER PARALEGAL: SL	.20
08/06/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF NUMEROUS MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CANCER TREATMENT CENTERS OF AMERICA (2.6); VERIFYING STATUS OF REQUEST FOR TRANSCRIPT (.1) PARALEGAL: D T	2.70
08/07/12	REVIEW MATERIALS FOR HEARING (.7); CHECK STATUS	2.50
	OF EVIDENCE (.3); TRAVEL TO AND ATTEND HEARING IN BECKLEY, WV (1.5) PARTNER: PEF	
08/07/12	REVIEWING AND VERIFYING STATUS OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S TESTIMONY (.3); DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM AND UPDATING CLAIM (.2) PARALEGAL: D T	.50
08/07/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE SOLICITOR REGARDING HEARING AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/08/12	RECEIPT OF DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/13/12	REVIEWING STATUS OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S TRANSCRIPT PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/13/12	SUBMITTING DR. ZALDIVAR'S TRANSCRIPT TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/14/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM BECKLEY ARH AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/15/12 REVIEW HEARING NOTES RE POST HEARING ACTION AND CHECK FOR ANY CONTACT FROM CLAIMANT RE ZALDIVAR DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.20	
08/15/12 DRAFT LETTER TO CLAIMANT RE SUPPLEMENTAL DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.30	
08/15/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
08/27/12 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT RE DEPOSITION AND CASE MATERIALS RE DEADLINES, ACTION NECESSARY RE DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.30	
08/27/12 RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/27/12 TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20	
08/28/12 REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM BECKLEY APPALACHIAN REGIONAL HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: D T	1.70	
08/28/12 RECEIPT OF X-RAY FILM AND RADIOLOGY REPORT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/30/12 TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT REARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20	
TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT	\$ 3381. 0.	00
INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 3381.	

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P5191.00042

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION C/O CHARTIS INSURANCE 80 PINE STREET 38TH FLOOR NEW YORK NEW YORK 10005

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/30/12 TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
REGARDING A DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT
PARALEGAL: UV

TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT

INVOICE TOTAL
\$ 7.00

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P5191.00051

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION C/0 CHARTIS INSURANCE 80 PINE STREET 38TH FLOOR NEW YORK NEW YORK 10005

07/10/12	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS (.30); CHECK STATUS OF RECORD REQUESTS (.10); CHECK FOR ANY EVIDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.20); REVIEW REPORTS IN EVIDENCE (.20); REVIEW JOHNS HOPKINS REPORTS (.10); DIRECT EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT FOR HEARING (.10) PARTNER: PEF	1.00
07/10/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FOR EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT (.50); CHECK STATUS OF RADIOLOGY REPORTS AND FILMS AVAILABLE (.50) PARALEGAL: D T	1.00
07/11/12	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS TO COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE (.20); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.30
07/11/12	DRAFTING LETTER TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL SUBMITTING READING BY DR. WHEELER (.20); DRAFTING EVIDENCE SUMMARY AND PREHEARING REPORT (1.10); DRAFTING LETTER TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL SUBMITTING REPORTS (.20) PARALEGAL: D T	1.50
07/13/12	REVIEIWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL PARALEGAL: KC	.20
07/13/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/18/12	REVISE EVIDENCE SUMMARY AND PREPARED FOR FILING (.70); DRAFTED MOTION TO CANCEL DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR (.30) PARALEGAL: SL	1.00

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

07/19/12	REVIEW REVISED EVIDENCE SUMMARY TO COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN CASE MATERIALS AND RECORD (.40); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE WITH SUMMARY AND PREHEARING REPORT (.10); CONFIRM DEPOSITION STATUS (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE CANCELING DEPOSITION (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.70
07/19/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/19/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/20/12	REVIEWING AND PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV	.10
07/23/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S SUBMISSIONS OF EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/26/12	REVIEWING SUBMISSIONS FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL; REVIEWING PULMONARY STUDY AND CONTACTING ATTORNEY FOR FURTHER EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT PARALEGAL: D T	.30
07/26/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT IF INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE PARALEGAL: KC	.50
07/27/12	REVIEWING STATUS OF RESPONSE TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING ISSUES AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.10
07/30/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITON (.20): TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIAMANT'S COUSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION (.20) PARALEGAL: KC	.40

07/30/12	RECEIPT OF PLAINTIFF'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/01/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIM SUMMARY; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/02/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DIRECTOR'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/03/12	REVIEW EVIDENCE SUMMARY AND PREHEARING REPORT FILED BY PLAINTIFF'S COUNSEL; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE RECEIVED (.2); REVIEW INFORMATION ON ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES RE CANCER CENTER TESTS (.1); DIRECT EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/03/12	REVIEWING OF CLAIM FILE TO PREPARE FOR HEARING (1.5); AND PREPARING DRAFTING REQUEST FOR OFFICIAL TRANSCRIPT (.1); REVIEWING CLAIMANT'S SUBMISSION OF CT SCAN AND PULMONARY FUNCTION STUDY (.3); REVIEWING CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES (.3); TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL; (.2) DRAFTING MOTION TO CONTINUE HEARING (.4); REVIEWING ORDER DENYING MOTION TO CONTINUE (.2) PARALEGAL: D T	3.00
08/03/12	PROCESSING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/06/12	REVIEW ORDER OF JUDGE DENYING MOTION FOR CONTINUANCE AND APPROVING POST HEARING DEVELOPMENT (.3); REVIEW EMAIL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL WITH ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND RELEASE (.1); REVIEW CASE MATERIALS; DIRECT EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT (.2) PARTNER: PEF	.60
08/06/12	REVIEW DRAFT NOTICE TO JUDGE OF ISSUES CONTESTED FOR HEARING AS COMPARED WITH CASE MATERIALS AND SIGN PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/06/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20

08/07/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE SOLICITOR REGARDING HEARING AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/07/12	RECEIPT OF SIGNED MEDICAL RELEASE FROM CLAIMANT AND RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S INTERROGATORIES AND REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS SERVED ON OPERATOR (.1); UPDATING CLAIM FILE (.1) PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/08/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, PREPARE FOR HEARING; TRAVEL TO AND APPEAR AT HEARING IN BECKLEY, WV PARTNER: PEF	5.20
08/09/12	REVIEW AND MEMORIALIZED NOTES FROM HEARING; PLAN POST-HEARING DEVELOPMENT; DIRECT EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/13/12	UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR POST HEARING EVIDENCE PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/13/12	REVIEWING REQUEST FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL FOR ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/15/12	REVIEIWING CORRESPONDENCE FROM DUKE UNIVERSITY HOSPTIAL PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/20/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	1.10
08/20/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/27/12	DRAFTED RESPONSE TO CLAIMANT'S INTERROGATIVES AND REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION PARALEGAL: SL	1.20

Payable Upon Receipt

08/30/12 REVIEWING INVOICE FROM CAMC PARALEGAL: KC

.50

========

TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED \$ 2439.00
TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT 0.00
INVOICE TOTAL \$ 2439.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P5191.00053

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION C/0 CHARTIS INSURANCE 80 PINE STREET 38TH FLOOR NEW YORK NEW YORK 10005

07/24/12	REVIEW SUGGESTION OF BANKRUPTCY; CHECK FOR ANY ACTION BY JUDGE PARTNER: PEF	.30
07/25/12	CONFIRM FILING; REVIEW ELECTRONIC DOCUMENT FROM COURT (.20); EMAIL TO M. SOLOMONS (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.30
07/26/12	VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.20); DRAFTING SECOND REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE (.20) PARALEGAL: UV	.40
07/30/12	REVIEW STATUS OF DEVELOPMENT (.10); REVIEW DISCOVERY AND HISTORY OF DISCOVERY (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL WITH NEW DISCOVERY (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.30
07/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/08/12	RECEIVE MOTION TO CLARIFY THE IMPACT OF BANKRUPTCY ON CASE; UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE PARALEGAL: TMH	.20
08/21/12	REVIEW OF CLAIMANTS ANSWERED INTERROGATORIES. PARALEGAL: SL	.30
08/21/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/24/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PLAINTIFF'S COUNSEL PARTNER: PEF	.20

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/30/12 RECEIVE PLAINTIFFS' MOTION TO REQUIRE DEFENDANT TO CLARIFY BANKRUPTCY PROCEEDINGS PARALEGAL: TMH		.10
08/30/12 UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE PARALEGAL: TMH		.10
TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED	\$	286.50
TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT		0.00
INVOICE TOTAL	\$	286.50
INVOICE TOTAL	~	========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P5191.00072

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION C/O CHARTIS INSURANCE 80 PINE STREET 38TH FLOOR NEW YORK NEW YORK 10005

	INVOICE TOTAL	•	277.00 ========
	INVOICE TOTAL	خ	277.00
	R PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED PENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT	\$	277.00 0.00
08/30/12	RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBIT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV		.10
08/30/12	REVIEW AND PREPARED ELECTRONIC FILE OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS (37-42) FROM DOL PARALEGAL: SL		.70
08/21/12	REVIEW OF CLAIMANTS ANSWERED INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: SL		.20
08/20/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV		.20
07/30/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY (.20); CHECK PAST RESPONSES; SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.10) PARTNER: PEF		.30
07/26/12	VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.30); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE (.10) PARALEGAL: UV		.40
07/18/12	CHECK STATUS OF DEVELOPMENT FOR HEARING PREPARATION (.40); REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, EVIDENCE IN RECORD TO DATE (.10); CHECK STATUS OF DISCOVERY; CHECK STATUS OF RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.10); REVIEW RECORDS RECEIVED TO DATE (.10) PARTNER: PEF		.70

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P5191.00096

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION C/0 CHARTIS INSURANCE 80 PINE STREET 38TH FLOOR NEW YORK NEW YORK 10005

08/16/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/23/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR DENYING BENEFITS AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/23/12	DRAFTING RESPONSE TO AWARD ORDER TO THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND REQUEST HEARING BEFORE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE PARALEGAL: UV	.30
	R PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED PENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT	\$ 42.00
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 42.00
		========

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P5191.00100

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION C/0 CHARTIS INSURANCE 80 PINE STREET 38TH FLOOR NEW YORK NEW YORK 10005

07/25/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/26/12	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR TO PREPARE FOR LITIGATION (.40); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.20); TELEPHONE CALL TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO DETERMINE WHETHER CLAIM HAS BEEN FORWARDED TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE YET (.10); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (.10); DRAFTING SUMMARY SHEET (.10); DRAFTING INTERROGATORIES, MEDICAL RELEASE AND COVER LETTER (.30) PARALEGAL: UV	1.20
07/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/20/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/21/12	REVIEW OF CLAIMANTS ANSWERED INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: SL	.30
08/29/12	RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/30/12	REVIEW AND PREPARED ELECTRONIC FILE OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS FROM DOL PARALEGAL: SL	1.00

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 File 122/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

231.00	\$ RENDERED	SERVICES	ESSIONAL	PROF	FOR	TOTAL
0.00	R ACCOUNT	D FOR YOUR	ADVANCED	ENSES	EXP	TOTAL
231.00	\$ OICE TOTAL	IN				

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0493.10219

EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL, LLC

P. O. BOX 1233

CHARLESTON, WV 25324 ATTN: ELIZABETH POWER

07/30/12	PREPARE CHISLER DEEDS (2.0); LEGAL RESEARCH CONCERNING ISSUES REGARDING SAME (0.9) PARTNER: MBD	:	2.90
07/31/12	WORKING ON CHISLER DEEDS (2.0); WORKING ON ISSUES REGARDING SAME (1.0) PARTNER: MBD	=	3.00
08/01/12	PREPARING RIGHT OF FIRST REFUSAL PARTNER: MBD	4	4.00
08/02/12	PREPARE OPTION TO REPURCHASE (2.5); LEGAL RESEARCH CONCERNING PERPETUITIES ISSUE (1.0) PARTNER: MBD	-	3.50
08/03/12	FINALIZE DEED (1.0); LEGAL RESEARCH CONCERNING PERPETUITIES ISSUE (1.0) PARTNER: MBD	2	2.00
	R PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED	\$	3619.00 0.00
TOTAL EXI	PENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT		0.00
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	3619.00
			========

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0505.00001

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION
P.O. BOX 1233
CHARLESTON, WV 25324-1233
ATTN: ELIZABETH POWER, ESQ.

07/30/12	TELEPHONE CALL WITH J. EAGAN RE: TAX YEAR DATES FOR LEASE REIMBURSEMENT PURPOSES PARTNER: JTL	.40
07/31/12	RESEARCHING TAX CODE ON AD VALOREM TAXES AND OUTLINING OPINION (1.0); TELEPHONE CALL WITH E. POWER RE: AEP CONTRACT (0.30) PARTNER: JTL	1.30
07/31/12	RESEARCHED ISSUE REGARDING TAX YEAR COMPUTATION IN WEST VIRGINIA AS COMPARED TO AN ASSESSMENT YEAR (1.0); DRAFTED LETTER TO JOHN EAGAN WITH SUMMARY OF RESULTS OF RESEARCH (0.60) ASSOCIATE: HHR	1.60
08/01/12	REVIEWING AEP CONTRACT (.3); TELEPHONE CALL WITH E. POWER (.2) PARTNER: JTL	.50
08/01/12	REVIEWED AND EDITED LETTER TO JOHN EAGAN REGARDING TAX ASSESSMENTS ASSOCIATE: HHR	1.40
08/01/12	REVIEWING LETTER EXPLAINING TAX YEAR AND ASSESSMENT YEAR. ASSOCIATE: CAW	.20
08/01/12	REVIEW CONTRACT WITH AEP. SPECIAL COUNSEL: JVK	.10
08/01/12	MEETING WITH TOM LANE (.3); TELEPHONE CALL WITH ELIZABETH POWER (.2) SPECIAL COUNSEL: JVK	.50
08/08/12	EDITED LETTER TO JOHN EAGAN REGARDING TAX YEAR ASSOCIATE: HHR	1.10

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

1.00

TELEPHONE CALL WITH J. EAGAN (.2) PARTNER: JTL		
08/18/12 ANALYZING WATER ENCROACHMENT AND TREATMENT ISSUES PARTNER: JTL	. 8	30
08/21/12 REVIEWING WATER PUMPING ANALYSIS AND DRAFT AGREEMENT ON PERMANENT PUMPING (1.0), CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. EAGAN ON STATUS (.3) PARTNER: JTL	1.3	30
TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT	\$	2157.07
INVOICE TOTAL	\$ ==	2157.07

08/17/12 REVIEWING AND ANALYZING WATER ENCROACHMENT(.8)

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0505.00061

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION 12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400 ST. LOUIS, MO 63141 ATTN: JOSEPH BEAN, ESQ.

07/18/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. POWER RE: LONG BRANCH BANKRUPTCY (0.20); MULTIPLE CORRESPONDENCE WITH E. POWER, ET AL., RE: PURCHASE OF EQUIPMENT FROM LONG BRANCH (0.30). PARTNER: JAC	.50
07/24/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. CAPPELLANTI RE: SALE OF EQUIPMENT (0.20); CORRESPONDENCE TO E. POWER RE: SAME (0.20). PARTNER: JAC	.40
07/24/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. CAPPELLANTI RE: SALE OF EQUIPMENT (0.20); MULTIPLE CORRESPONDENCE TO/FROM E. POWER RE: SAME (0.40). PARTNER: JAC	.60
07/31/12	CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO E. POWER RE: EQUIPMENT PURCHASE. PARTNER: JAC	.20
	R PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED PENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT	\$ 425.00
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 425.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0505.00063

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION 12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400 ST. LOUIS, MO 63141 ATTN: JOSEPH BEAN, ESQ.

07/10/12 REVIEW LOAN DOCUMENTS (4.50); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PATRIOT TEAM (.50). PARTNER: MBD	5.00
07/11/12 CORRESPONDENCE TO E. POWER; REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET. PARTNER: JAC	.20
07/11/12 CORRESPONDENCE TO M. D'ANTONI RE: ORDER APPROVING DIP FINANCING ON INTERIM BASIS. PARTNER: JAC	.10
07/11/12 CORRESPONDENCE TO M. D'ANTONI RE: ORDER APPROVING DIP FINANCING ON INTERIM BASIS. PARTNER: JAC	.10
07/11/12 WORKING ON OBTAINING FLOOD CERTIFICATES (.50), PREPARE OPINION (2.00) PARTNER: MBD	2.50
07/12/12 CONFERENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI RE: CONFERENCE CALL (.20); PARTICIPATE IN TELEPHONE CONFERENCE RE: DIP FINANCING (.50). PARTNER: JAC	.70
07/12/12 PREPARE OPINION (1.00); PREPARE LIEN RELEASES (2.00). PARTNER: MBD	3.00
07/13/12 PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO T. CHIPEWA RE: OPINION. PARTNER: JAC	.40
07/13/12 REVIEW CORPORATE DOCUMENTS IN CONNECTION WITH OPINION. PARTNER: MBD	2.50
07/14/12 REVIEW DRAFT OPINION. PARTNER: JAC	.60

07/14/12	REVIEW FORM OPINION LETTER (.50); DETERMINE NEEDS FOR ISSUING OPINION LETTER FOR VIRGINIA LLCS (.50); DRAFT FIRST DRAFT OF VIRGINIA LLC OPINION LETTER (.50); DETERMINE ACTIVE/INACTIVE STATUS OF EACH LLC ON VA STATE CORPORATION COMMISSION ONLINE DATABASE (1.00). ASSOCIATE: SEB	2.50
07/15/12	REVIEW OF CREDIT DOCUMENTS (.50), REVIEW OF TEMPLATE OPINION (.50); REVISE DRAFT VA OPINION (.50), REVISE OPINION ISSUANCE CHECKLIST (.20); REVIEW OF APPLICABLE LAW (.50). PARTNER: DAD	2.20
07/16/12	REVISE VA OPINION DRAFT (.30); REVISE CLOSING CERTIFICATION (.20). PARTNER: DAD	.50
07/16/12	PREPARE OPINION TO LENDER'S COUNSEL PARTNER: MBD	1.00
07/16/12	EDIT DRAFT OPINION LETTER (.50); EDIT TASK LIST FOR ISSUING OPINION LETTER (.50); DRAFT AND EDIT FORM VA LLC CLOSING CERTIFICATION (.50); ORDER LETTERS OF GOOD STANDING AND CERTIFIED COPIES OF ARTICLES FOR THE VA LLCS FROM THE VA STATE CORPORATION COMMISSION (1.10). ASSOCIATE: SEB	2.60
07/17/12	CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO G. PAK RE: CONFERENCE CALL (.20); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI RE: OPINION STATUS (.10); CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO J. JONES RE: BANKRUPTCY CONTACT (.20). PARTNER: JAC	.50
07/17/12	LEGAL RESEARCH CONCERNING DISSOLUTION ISSUE. PARTNER: MBD	1.00
07/17/12	REVIEWED CORPORATE DOCUMENTS PROVIDED BY NY COUNSEL. ASSOCIATE: HHR	1.20
07/17/12	CORRESPONDENCE WITH ROSALIND RODBURG RE: UCC FILINGS IN VARIOUS COUNTIES PARALEGAL: KEH	.80

07/18/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. PAK, ET AL., TO DISCUSS OPINION FORM ISSUES (.40); REVIEW OF LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY MATERIALS PROVIDED (.60); ANALYZING OPINION ISSUES (.60). PARTNER: JAC	1.60
07/18/12	REVISING VA OPINION PARTNER: DAD	.70
07/18/12	PREPARE UCC TERMINATIONS PARTNER: MBD	2.00
07/18/12	CONFERENCE CALL AND FOLLOW UP REGARDING OPINION LETTER ASSOCIATE: SEB	.70
07/18/12	REVIEW VIRGINIA LLC DOCUMENTS ASSOCIATE: SEB	.80
07/18/12	REVIEWED DOCUMENTS FOR OPINION LETTER. ASSOCIATE: HHR	2.10
07/19/12	ANALYZING OPINION (.50); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. BIRCHENOUGH, M. D'ANTONI RE: PATRIOT NOTES (.10). PARTNER: JAC	.60
07/19/12	REVISING VA OPINION PARTNER: DAD	.70
07/19/12	REVIEW CORPORATE DOCUMENTS RE: OPINION. PARTNER: MBD	4.00
07/19/12	REVIEW VIRGINIA LLC DOCUMENTS (1.50); EDIT OPINION LETTER (.60). ASSOCIATE: SEB	2.10
07/19/12	REVIEWED CORPORATE DOCUMENTS FOR OPINION LETTER. ASSOCIATE: HHR	5.30
07/19/12	DUE DILIGENCE - ENSURING MEADE IS AUTHORIZED TO SIGN ON BEHALF OF SUBSIDIARIES LAW CLERK: EAM	4.50

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

07/20/12	WORK ON OPINION LETTER (1.30); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GORDON RE: OPINIONS (.20); CONFERENCE WITH H. ROSE RE: DOCUMENT REVIEW (.30); CORRESPONDENCE TO DAVIS POLK RE: OPINION DRAFT (.30); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. GORDON (.20) PARTNER: JAC	2.30
07/20/12	REVIEW OF CREDIT DOCUMENTS (.70), REVIEW OF LLC ARTICLES AND OPERATING AGREEMENTS OF VA LLCS (.80); REVIEW OF AUTHORIZING RESOLUTIONS OF VA LLCS (1.00), REVIEW OF APPLICABLE LAW (.50); REVISING VA OPINION (.40); PARTNER: DAD	3.40
07/20/12	PREPARE UCC TERMINATIONS PARTNER: MBD	2.00
07/20/12	REVIEW VIRGINIA LLC AUTHORIZING RESOLUTIONS (2.00); COMPLETE FINAL DRAFT OF OPINION LETTER (.70); ASSOCIATE: SEB	2.70
07/20/12	REVIEWED CORPORATE DOCUMENTS FOR TITLE OPINION ASSOCIATE: HHR	7.30
07/20/12	DUE DILIGENCE - ENSURING MEADE IS AUTHORIZED TO SIGN ON BEHALF OF SUBSIDIARIES LAW CLERK: EAM	5.10
07/23/12	CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. BIRCHENOUGH RE: VIRGINIA OPINION. PARTNER: JAC	.20
07/23/12	REVISING VIRGINIA OPINION PARTNER: DAD	.30
07/23/12	EDIT VIRGINIA LLC OPINION LETTER ASSOCIATE: SEB	1.00
07/23/12	REVIEWED ALL CREDIT DOCUMENTS (1.00); VERIFIED ALL WV SUBSIDIARY AUTHORIZATION (.60); ASSOCIATE: HHR	1.60
07/30/12	WORKING ON OPINION TO LENDER'S COUNSEL PARTNER: MBD	2.00
07/30/12	REVIEWED RESULTS FROM ENTITY SEARCH FOR OPINION LETTER TO DETERMINE WHETHER ALL COMPANIES WERE IN GOOD STANDING IN WV ASSOCIATE: HHR	.80

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

07/31/12	REVIEW AND ANALYZE REQUESTED CHANGES FROM LENDER'S COUNSEL (.40); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI RE: SAME (.20); REVIEW BROOK TROUT ADN OTHER OPERATING AGREEMENTS (.90); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. ARNALDOS RE: OPINION (.20); CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. ARNALDOS RE: OPINION (.20); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GORDON RE: OPINION (.20); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. DEJARNETT RE: VIRGINIA OPINION (.30) PARTNER: JAC	2.20
07/31/12	REVIEW OF COMMENTS ON WV OPINION AS THEY RELATE TO VA OPINION (.50); REVIEW OF VA LLC DOCUMENTS (.50); REVISING VA OPINION (.70); PARTNER: DAD	1.70
07/31/12	REVIEWED PERTINENT DOCUMENTS TO DETERMINE HOW BANKRUPTCY AFFECTED THE OPERATION AND CONTINUATION OF PATRIOT SUBSIDIARY LLCS ASSOCIATE: HHR	1.40
08/01/12	REVIEW OPINION PRIOR TO CONFERENCE CALL (.3); PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL RE: OPINION (.5); CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. ARNALDOS RE: OPINIONS (.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. GORDON RE: SAME (.2). PARTNER: JAC	1.20
08/01/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DAVIS POLK RE: OPINION DRAFT PARTNER: DAD	.50
08/01/12	REVIEW CORPORATE DOCUMENTS AND ANALYZE ISSUES IN CONNECTION WITH OPINION TO LENDERS' COUNSEL (1.5). CONFERENCE CALL RE: OPINION (.5). PARTNER: MBD	2.00
	CORRESPONDENCE TO/FROM A. ARNALDOS RE: OPINIONS. PARTNER: JAC	.20
08/03/12	REVIEW MULTIPLE CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. ARNALDOS, ET AL., RE: OPINION ISSUES (.3); CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO S. GORDON RE: SAME (.4); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM D. FERGUSON RE: PATRIOT OPINIONS (.4). PARTNER: JAC	1.10
08/03/12	REVIEW CORPORATE DOCUMENTS (1.0); ANALYZE ISSUES IN CONNECTION WITH OPINION TO LENDERS' COUNSEL (.5) PARTNER: MBD	1.50

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/06/12	REVIEWING LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY STAUTES PARTNER: CPS	.60
08/06/12	REVIEW REVISED OPINION FROM D. FERGUSON (.5); REVIEW WEST VIRGINIA STATUTES RE: LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANIES (.8); CONFERENCE WITH E. MAXWELL-HOFFMAN RE: SAME (.4); CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO M. IMMERMAN RE: CONFERENCE CALL (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GORDON RE: OPINION (.2). PARTNER: JAC	2.20
08/06/12	CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. IMMERMAN RE: CORPORATE OWNERSHIP ISSUES (.2); CORRESPONDENCE TO D. DEJARNETT, S. BIRCHENAUGH RE: RESOLUTION AND REVISED OPINION FROM D. FERGUSON, ET AL. (.2); MULTIPLE CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. IMMERMAN RE: CONFERENCE CALL (.4). PARTNER: JAC	.80
08/06/12	REVIEW OF VA LAW RE: OPERATING AGREEMENTS (.6), REVIEW OF VA LLC ARTICLES AND OPERATING AGREEMENTS (2.0) PARTNER: DAD	2.60
08/06/12	ANALYZE ISSUES REGARDING OPINION TO LENDERS (1.0); WORKING ON UCC TERMINATIONS RE: FIFTH THIRD (1.0) PARTNER: MBD	2.00
08/06/12	REVIEWED PUBLIC INFORMATION OF SUBSIDIARIES TO DETERMINE WHO IS AUTHORIZED TO SIGN ON THEIR BEHALF ASSOCIATE: HHR	.90
08/06/12	REVIEWING OPERATING AGREEMENT MATTERS (.6); RESEARCH CASE LAW RELATED TO CONTINUATION OF LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY (1.0). ASSOCIATE: BRT	1.60
08/07/12	REVIEWING ISSUES RELATING TO OPERATIONS LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANIES PARTNER: CPS	.30
08/07/12	ANALYZING OPINION, EFFECT OF BANKRUPTCY FILING ON SAME (2.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI, T. CHAPIGA, ET AL., RE: SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. FERGUSON, T. CHAPIGA, ET AL., RE: SAME (.2); CONFERENCES WITH M. D'ANTONI, H. ROSE RE: OPINION ISSUES, COLONY BAY PARTNERSHIP; CORRESPONDENCE TO W. HOFFMAN, S. GORDON, ET AL., RE: CONFERENCE CALL (.1); REVIEW PROVISIONS OF COLONY BAY	3.70

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

PARTNERSHIP AGREEMENT (.1); CORRESPONDENCE TO
W. HOFFMAN, ET AL., RE: COLONY BAY PARTNERSHIP
AGREEMENT (.4); REVIEW WEST VIRGINIA UNIFORM
PARTNERSHIP ACT (.2).
PARTNER: JAC

	PARTNERSHIP ACT (.2). PARTNER: JAC	
08/07/12	REVISING VA OPINION PARTNER: DAD	.50
08/07/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. CHAPIGA, ET AL. PARTNER: MBD	.50
08/07/12	REVIEWED VARIOUS SUBSIDIARY DOCUMENTS TO DETERMINE WHETHER THE AUTHORIZATION TO ENTER INTO CREDIT AGREEMENTS WAS VALIDLY EXECUTED ASSOCIATE: HHR	4.30
08/07/12	CONTINUE RESEARCH AND ANALYSIS REGARDING LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY ISSUES (3.4) ASSOCIATE: BRT	3.40
08/08/12	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO J. JEFFERSON RE: REASONED OPINION OPTION (.2); ANALYZING OPINION ISSUES, POSSIBLE ASSUMPTIONS IN ORDER TO GIVE OPINION (1.0). PARTNER: JAC	1.20
08/08/12	TELECONFERENCE RE: OPINION PARTNER: DAD	.80
08/08/12	EDIT VIRGINIA OPINION LETTER ASSOCIATE: SEB	.80
08/08/12	DRAFTED SUMMARY OF DUE DILIGENCE ASSOCIATE: HHR	3.10
08/09/12	REVISE PROVISIONS OF LOCAL COUNSEL OPINION ON DIP FINANCING (2.5); MULTIPLE CORRESPONDENCE TO/FROM S. GORDON RE: SAME (.5); CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO M. IMMERMANN RE: STATUS OF LOCAL OPINIONS (.3); CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. GORDON RE: STATUS OF LOCAL OPINIONS (.2); CORRESPONDENCE TO/FROM J. JEFFERSON RE: LOCAL COUNSEL OPINIONS (.2); ANALYZING LOCAL OPINION ISSUES (.7) REVISE OPINION (.4); REVISE WAIVER RESOLUTION (.4); CORRESPONDENCE TO J. JEFFERSON RE: REVISED OPINION AND RESOLUTION (.2). PARTNER: JAC	5.20
08/09/12	REVISING OPINION (.5), REVISING RESOLUTION (.5) REVIEW OF VA LAW RE: SAME (.2) PARTNER: DAD	1.20

08/09/12	REVISING OPINION TO INCLUDE ASSUMPTIONS RE: VA LOAN PARTIES PARTNER: DAD	1.50
08/09/12	ADDITIONAL WORK ON OPINION PARTNER: MBD	1.00
08/09/12	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT LANGUAGE FOR LEGAL OPINION. ASSOCIATE: BRT	.60
08/10/12	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. GORDON RE: KENTUCKY LOCAL COUNSEL OPINION (.2); CORRESPONDENCE TO T. CHEPIGA RE: EXECUTION AND DELIVERY OF CREDIT DOCUMENTS (.5); REVIEW OFFICERS CERTIFICATES GIVEN BY PATRIOT COMPANIES (.5); CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI, D. DEJARNETT RE: CONFERENCE WITH T. CHEPIGA RE: OPINION STATUS, OPEN ISSUES (.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH T. CHEPIGA, M. IMMERMAN RE: OFFICERS' CERTIFICATES (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. CHEPIGA, S. GORDON RE: LOCAL COUNSEL OPINIONS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. DEJARNETT RE: REVISION TO OPINION (.2); REVIEW J. BEAN OPINION (.2) PARTNER: JAC	2.50
08/10/12	ADDITIONAL WORK ON OPINION PARTNER: MBD	2.00
08/10/12	DUE DILIGENCE REVIEW ASSOCIATE: HHR	.80
08/13/12	ANALYZE LEASE TERMINATION ISSUES PARTNER: MBD	1.00
08/15/12	ANALYZE OPINION STATUS (.2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO J. JEFFERSON RE: REVISED OPINION (.2); REVIEW REVISED OPINION (.2). PARTNER: JAC	.60
08/15/12	REVIEW OF APPLICABLE LAW PARTNER: DAD	.60
08/16/12	REVIEW PROPOSED REVISIONS TO OPINION (.3); MULTIPLE CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO J. JEFFERSON RE: CONFERENCE CALL TO DISCUSS OPINION REVISIONS (.3); REVIEW WEST VIRGINIA UNIFORM PARTNERSHIP ACT AND COLONY BAY VENTURE AGREEMENT (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GORDON RE: CONFERENCE CALL TO DISCUSS OPINIONS (.2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM D. DEJARNETT RE: CONFERENCE CALL (.1);	3.90

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Pavable Upon Receipt

CORRESPONDENCE TO/FROM T. CHEPIGA RE: REVISED OPINIONS AND UPCOMING CONFERENCE CALL (.2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. GORDON RE: CONFERENCE CALL (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. JEFFERSON, W. HOFFMAN, C. JOHNSON, D. DEJARNETT AND M. D'ANTONI TO REVIEW OPINION REVISIONS (1.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI, D. DEJARNETT RE: OPINION BEING REQUESTED (.3); TWO TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH G. PAK RE: OPINION ISSUES (.3); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. TUCKER RE: OPINION STATUS (.1). PARTNER: JAC

08/16/12	REVIEW OF	APPLICABLE	LAW	(3.0),	REVISING	VA	3.30
	OPINION (.3)					
	PARTNER.	DAD					

- 08/16/12 WORKING ON REVISED OPINION TO LENDERS' COUNSEL 1.00
 PARTNER: MBD
- 08/16/12 REVIEWED DRAFT OF OPINION 1.60
 ASSOCIATE: HHR
- 08/17/12 REVIEWING OPINION AND RELATED ISSUES .50
 PARTNER: CPS
- 08/17/12 CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO G. PAK RE: CONFERENCE 2.80 CALL ON OPINION LETTERS (.2); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM K. VILLARREAL RE: NO EXTENSION ON OPINION DEADLINE (.1); CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO G. PAK RE: CONFERENCE CALL (.2); PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. D'ANTONI, D. DEJARNETT, G. PAK, T. CHEPIGA, J. JEFFERSON, W. HOFFMAN, C. JOHNSON, S. GORDON, ET AL., RE: LOCAL COUNSEL OPINIONS (1.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. PAK, T. CHEPIGA AND M. D'ANTONI RE: OPINION ISSUES (.2); ANALYZING ISSUES TO REVIEW FOR OPINION (.4); CORRESPONDENCE FROM M. IMMERMAN RE: JUPITER HOLDINGS OPERATING AGREEMENT (.1); REVIEW JUPITER HOLDINGS OPERATING AGREEMENT (.1); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. JEFFERSON RE: REVISED OPINION (.1); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM M. IMMERMAN RE: EXTENSION OF TIME TO FINALIZE OPINION (.2). PARTNER: JAC
- 08/17/12 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ALL COUNSEL RE: LOCAL 1.00
 COUNSEL OPINIONS (.2); REVIEW OF REVISED WV
 OPINION (.8).
 PARTNER: DAD

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/17/12	REVIEW OPERATING AGREEMENTS OF DEBTORS (2.0); PARTICIPATION IN CONFERENCE CALL (1.2) PARTNER: MBD	3.20
08/17/12	ANALYZING DIFFERENCE BETWEEN REASONED AND ABSOLUTE OPINIONS ASSOCIATE: CAW	.20
08/19/12	REVIEW OF REVISED OPINION (.3), REVIEW OF APPLICABLE WV AND VA LAW (1.0), REVIEW OF WAIVER RESOLUTIONS (1.0) PARTNER: DAD	2.30
08/19/12	ANALYZING AUTHORITY AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER TO DETERMINE EFFECT OF "REASONED OPINION" AND QUALIFICATIONS. ASSOCIATE: CAW	1.00
08/20/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT AND DAVIS POLK RE: LOCAL COUNSEL OPINIONS AND BROADLY THE EFFECT OF BANKRUPTCY OF MEMBERS OF LLCS (.5); REVIEW OF LAW (.5); PREPARING AMENDMENTS (.9). PARTNER: DAD	1.90
08/20/12	REVISE OPINION TO LENDERS' COUNSEL (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PATRIOT TEAM AND LENDERS' COUNSEL REGARDING OPINION ISSUES (.9); LEGAL RESEARCH CONCERNING LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY ACT ISSUE (3.0); PARTNER: MBD	4.90
08/20/12	REVIEWED AND PREPARED LIST OF DOCUMENTS REVIEWED FOR OPINION LETTER ASSOCIATE: HHR	1.10
08/20/12	ANALYZING AUTHORITY DETERMINING THE EFFECTS OF CLEAN VS. REASONED AND QUALIFIED VS. UNQUALIFIED OPINIONS. ASSOCIATE: CAW	2.20
08/21/12	PREPARING AMENDMENTS (.2), COMMUNICATE WITH FROST BROWN RE: OPINION (.1) PARTNER: DAD	.30
08/21/12	REVISE OPINION TO LENDERS' COUNSEL (1.1); REVIEW OPERATION AGREEMENTS (2.0); REVIEW WEST VIRGINIA LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY ACT (2.1); PARTNER: MBD	5.20
08/21/12	REVIEWING NEED TO DRAFT WAIVER RESOLUTIONS AND OPERATING AGREEMENT AMENDMENTS. ASSOCIATE: CAW	.30

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/22/12	REVISE OPINION TO LENDERS' COUNSEL (1.0); PREPARE WAIVER AND RATIFICATION RESOLUTIONS (3.0); PARTNER: MBD	4.00
08/22/12	DRAFTING AMENDMENTS TO OPERATING AGREEMENT AND WAIVERS ASSOCIATE: CAW	2.40
08/23/12	PREPARE OPERATING AGREEMENT AMENDMENTS FOR WV AND VA LLCS (.8), REVIEW OF LAW (.2) PARTNER: DAD	1.00
08/23/12	REVISE OPINION TO LENDERS' COUNSEL PARTNER: MBD	1.00
08/23/12	ASSISTED WITH OPINION DUE DILIGENCE ASSOCIATE: HHR	.30
08/23/12	DRAFTING AMENDMENTS TO VA LLC OPERATING AGREEMENTS (2.2); DRAFTING FORM AMENDMENT TO WV LLC OPERATING AGREEMENT (.4) RESOLUTION WAIVING DISSOLUTION FOR VA LLCS (.4). ASSOCIATE: CAW	3.00
08/24/12	REVIEWING OPINION LETTER AND RELATED MATERIALS (.5); REVIEWING OPINION ISSUES WITH MARK D'ANTONI (.4) PARTNER: CPS	.90
08/24/12	REVIEW OF LATEST DRAFT OPINION FROM FROST BROWN, REVIEW OF APPLICABLE LAW, REVIEW VA OPINION, PREPARE VA AND WV LLC OPERATING AGREEMENT AMENDMENTS PARTNER: DAD	5.70
08/24/12	REVISE OPINION TO LENDERS' COUNSEL (1.2); PREPARE OPERATING AGREEMENT AMENDMENTS (1.0); REVIEW CREDIT AGREEMENT REGARDING POST-CLOSING OBLIGATIONS (1.3); REVIEW AND ANALYZE STATUTES REGARDING OPERATIONS ISSUE (1.2); PARTNER: MBD	4.70
08/24/12	REVIEWED JUPITER HOLDINGS DOCUMENTS ASSOCIATE: HHR	.40
08/24/12	DRAFTING AMENDMENTS TO OPERATING AGREEMENTS FOR VA LLCS ASSOCIATE: CAW	2.10

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/27/12	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE (2) FROM G. PAK RE: OPINION DEADLINE (.2); REVIEW OPEN OPINION ISSUES (.3); CORRESPONDENCE (2) FROM S. GORDON RE: OPINION FOR KENTUCKY AND REVIEW OPINION (.3); CORRESPONDENCE FROM G. PAK RE: KENTUCKY OPINION (.1); CORRESPONDENCE FROM G. PAK RE: J. JEFFERSON AVAILABILITY (.2). PARTNER: JAC	1.30
08/27/12	REVISING VA OPINION PARTNER: DAD	.60
08/27/12	WORKING ON OPINION ISSUES PARTNER: MBD	3.00
08/27/12	DRAFTED SAMPLE AMENDMENT TO OPERATING AGREEMENTS FOR LLC'S WITH AGREEMENT THAT REFERRED TO ACT FOR DISSOLUTION (1.3) DRAFTED SAMPLE AMENDMENT TO OPERATING AGREEMENTS FOR LLC'S (1.1) ASSOCIATE: HHR	2.40
08/28/12	REVIEWING ISSUES RELATING TO REQUESTED OPINION LETTER. PARTNER: CPS	.20
08/28/12	REVIEW, REVISE DRAFT AMENDMENT TO LLC OPERATING AGREEMENTS (1.0); REVIEW STATUTE RE: WV LLC'S (.2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO G. PAK RE: CONTACT WITH J. JEFFERSON (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. JEFFERSON RE: OPINION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. PAK, M. D'ANTONI RE: SAME (.2). PARTNER: JAC	1.80
08/28/12	WORKING ON OPINION ISSUES (3.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. JEFFERSON RE: OPINION (.2) PARTNER: MBD	3.50
08/28/12	EDITED AMENDMENTS TO OPERATING AGREEMENTS - VERSION 1 (1.0); VERSOIN 2 (.8) ASSOCIATE: HHR	1.80
08/28/12	REVISING AMENDMENT TO COAL CLEAN LLC OPERATING AGREEMENT. ASSOCIATE: CAW	.50
08/29/12	REVIEWING PROPOSED REVISIONS TO OPINION (.6); ANALYZING OPINION ISSUES (1.5); RESEARCHING WEST VIRGINIA LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY ACT (.6). PARTNER: CPS	2.70

08/29/12	REVIEW LATEST DRAFT OF OPINIONS FROM FROST BROWN (2.0); WORK ON REVISIONS TO OPINION (.8). PARTNER: JAC	2.80
08/29/12	REVISING VA OPINION (.5), REVIEW OF APPLICABLE LAW (1.3), PREPARING OPERATING AGREEMENT AMENDMENTS (.5) PARTNER: DAD	2.30
08/29/12	ADDITIONAL WORK ON OPINION ISSUES (1.2); CONFERENCE WITH J. CHINCHECK REGARDING OPINION ISSUES (2.0) PARTNER: MBD	3.20
08/29/12	DRAFTED SIGNATURE PAGES FOR ALL WV LLC'S (1.0); TOOK GENERIC AMENDMENTS TO OPERATING AGREEMENTS AND INDIVIDUALIZED EACH (2.9) ASSOCIATE: HHR	3.90
08/30/12	CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING OPINION LETTER (.5); REVIEWING ISSUES ON OPINION LETTER WITH JULIE CHINCHECK (.2). PARTNER: CPS	.70
08/30/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. JEFFERSON, ET AL., TO DISCUSS ISSUES RELATED TO THE LOCAL COUNSEL OPINIONS (.7); CONFERENCE WITH C. SIEGRIST, M. D'ANTONI, D. DEJARNETT RE: RESULTS OF CALL (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GORDON RE: OPINION ISSUES (.8); CORRESPONDENCE S. GORDON RE: CONFERENCE CALL WITH PATRIOT INHOUSE COUNSEL TO DISCUSS OPINION STATUS (.1); CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. TUCKER RE: SAME (.1); CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. JONES RE: SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. TUCKER, S. GORDON AND M. D'ANTONI RE: SAME (.4); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. TUCKER RE: CALL ON OPINIONS WITH DAVIS POLK (.1); CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. TUCKER RE: STATUS OF OPINION (.1); CORRESPONDENCE (3) FROM G. PAK RE: OPINION ISSUES (.3); CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. GORDON RE: SAME (.2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. JEFFERSON RE: KENTUCKY OPINION ISSUES (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. LAPEGA, G. PAK AND M. D'ANTONI RE: OPINION CALL WITH LENDERS' LOCAL COUNSEL (.3); CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO G. PAK RE: CALL TOMORROW ON LOCAL COUNSEL OPINIONS (.2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. TUCKER RE: SAME (.1); CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. MEAD RE: SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GORDON RE: SAME (.4). PARTNER: JAC	4.70

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/30/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH FROST BROWN ATTYS RE: WV AND VA OPINION (.3); PREPARING WAIVER RESOLUTIONS, RATIFICATIONS AND OPERATING AGREEMENT AMENDMENTS FOR VA LLCS (3.0) PARTNER: DAD	3.30
08/30/12	WORKING ON OPINION ISSUES PARTNER: MBD	4.00
08/30/12	REVIEWED SIGNATURE PAGES (.8); TELEPHONE CALL WITH JEFF TUCKER (.2); REVIEWED NUMBERS OF WV SUBS (.4); EDITED OPERATING AGREEMENTS (1.4) ASSOCIATE: HHR	2.80
08/30/12	REVISING AMENDMENTS TO VA LLC OPERATING AGREEMENTS WITH COMMENTS FROM LENDERS COUNSEL (.8). DRAFTING AND REVISING RESOLUTIONS AMENDING OPERATING AGREEMENTS (2.8) ASSOCIATE: CAW	3.60
08/31/12	REVIEWING CORRESPONDENCE FROM JEFF JEFFERSON (.2); REVIEWING ISSUES ON OPINION LETTER (.2). PARTNER: CPS	.40
08/31/12	REVIEW STATUTE AND LIST ISSUES FOR CONFERENCE CALL (.5); PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. JONES, R. MEAD, J. TUCKER, S. GORDON, T. CHEPIGA, G. PAK, W. WARNER AND M. D'ANTONI RE: OUTSTANDING ISSUES ON LOCAL COUNSEL OPINIONS (.9); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GORDON, M. D'ANTONI RE: INSTRUCTIONS FROM CLIENT (.6); REVIEW WV STATUTES FOR LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANIES (.7); REVIEW BANKRUPTCY CODE RE: PROPERTY OF THE ESTATE AND REVIEW BANKRUPTCY CASES RE: SAME (1.9); DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO W. WARNER, T. CHEPIGA AND G. PAK RE: BANKRUPTCY ISSUE (.5); CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO J. JONES RE: SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. DEJARNETT RE: RESULTS OF CONFERENCE CALL, ISSUES TO RESOLVE (.2); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. JEFFERSON RE: OPINION ISSUE (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. JEFFERSON, W. HOFFMAN RE: OPINION ISSUE (.2); LOCATE AND REVIEW AMENDMENT TO COLONY BAY PARTNERSHIP AGREEMENT (.3); CORRESPONDENCE TO J. JEFFERSON RE: SAME (.2); REVIEW VARIOUS OPERATING AGREEMENTS FOR WV LLC'S (.7); CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO S. GORDON RE: AMENDMENT OF OPERATING AGREEMENTS (.2); PARTNER: JAC	7.20

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/31/12 REVIEW OF VA LAW RE: VERBA (.5); REVIEW OF REVISED LO (.5). PARTNER: DAD	AL OPERATING AGREEMENT OCAL COUNSEL OPINION	1.00
08/31/12 REVIEW WV LOAN RE: VERBAL ISSUE (2.0); REVIEW LIMITED STATUTES (1.5). PARTNER: MBD		3.50
08/31/12 REVIEWED AND ORGANIZED SIGNATE: HHR	GNATURE PAGES	.40
08/31/12 REVIEWING VIRGINIA OPERAT: NEW DRAFT OPINION LETTER ? OF ORAL AGREEMENTS TO VA ((.3). ASSOCIATE: CAW	TO DETERMINE VALIDITY	.50
TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES REI		\$ 53686.17
INVOI	CE TOTAL	\$ 53686.17

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0505.00065

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION 12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400 ST. LOUIS, MO 63141 ATTN: JOSEPH BEAN, ESQ.

08/08/12	CONFERENCE WITH J. EAGAN, D. MCCALLISTER ET AL. (1.0); REVIEWING TERMS OF AGREEMENT WITH SIERRA CLUB (2.0); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING RELEVANT RAMIFICATIONS UNDER LEASES (2.0) PARTNER: JTL	5.00
08/08/12	ANALYZING COAL LEASES ASSOCIATE: BF	3.00
08/08/12	RESEARCH REGARDING POTENTIAL SIERRA CLUB AGREEMENT ASSOCIATE: HHR	2.80
08/08/12	CONFERENCE WITH T. LANE, H. ROSE AND B. FREUND TO DISCUSS LEASE REVIEW; ASSOCIATE: BRT	.90
08/09/12	ANALYZING MINING ISSUES. PARTNER: JTL	6.00
08/09/12	REVIEW POWER POINT PRESENTATION (.5), REVIEW AND REVISE OPINION LETTER (1.0). REVIEW LEASE ISSUES (1.0). PARTNER: CBD	2.50
08/09/12	RESEARCH MINING ISSUES. PARTNER: RLH	4.30
08/09/12	ANALYZING RELEVANT COAL LEASES. ASSOCIATE: BF	4.20
08/09/12	REVIEWED RELEVANT LEASES. ASSOCIATE: HHR	4.50
08/09/12	REVIEW AND ANALYZE RELEVANT LEASES. ASSOCIATE: BRT	2.80
08/10/12	ANALYZING PROPOSED SIERRA CLUB AGREEMENT. PARTNER: JTL	3.00

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/10/12	DRAFTING OPINION LETTER PARTNER: JTL	4.00
08/10/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. LANE RE: EFFECT OF PATRIOT BANKRUPTCY FILING (.2); REVISE LETTER TO A. MCCALLISTER RE: SAME (.4). PARTNER: JAC	.60
08/10/12	CONTINUED RESEARCH (2.0), ANALYSIS (1.0) AND CONCURRENT PREPARATION OF MEMORANDUM (1.8), REGARDING MINING ISSUES (1.0). PARTNER: RLH	4.80
08/10/12	CONDUCTING LEGAL RESEARCH & ANALYSIS REGARDING ENCUMBRANCES; ANALYZING LEASES FOR EXPOSURE TO LIABILITY TO LESSORS ASSOCIATE: BF	7.80
08/10/12	REVIEWED RELEVANT LEASES - 1.2; REVIEWED WPP LEASE - 1.3; REVIEWED KELLY-HATFIELD LEASE - 1.3 ASSOCIATE: HHR	3.80
08/10/12	CONTINUE REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF RELEVANT COAL LEASES. ASSOCIATE: BRT	2.60
08/11/12	REVISING OPINION BASED ON INDIVIDUAL LEASE ANALYSIS. PARTNER: JTL	8.00
08/11/12	REVIEW, CONSIDER AND COMMENT ON DRAFT LETTER REGARDING ISSUES PERTINENT TO PROPOSED AGREEMENT. PARTNER: RLH	.20
08/11/12	REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSED LETTER FROM T. LANE TO PATRIOT REGARDING SIERRA AGREEMENT. ASSOCIATE: BRT	.40
08/12/12	REVISING LETTER TO INCORPORATE ADDITIONAL COMMENT FROM PATRIOT. PARTNER: JTL	4.00

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/12/12	MULTIPLE CORRESPONDENCE WITH T. LANE RE: BANKRUPTCY AND RELATED ISSUES. PARTNER: JAC	.40
08/12/12	RESEARCH REGARDING MINING ISSUES. PARTNER: RLH	2.10
08/13/12	CONFERENCE AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH PATRIOT COUNSEL (.5); SUPPLEMENTING OPINION (3.0); REVIEWING RESEARCH (1.0) PARTNER: JTL	4.50
08/13/12	CONTINUED RESEARCH REGARDING MINING. PARTNER: RLH	2.30
08/13/12	REVIEWING DUE DILIGENCE REPORT FOR ACCURACY ASSOCIATE: BF	.20
08/13/12	REVIEWED DRAFT LETTER. ASSOCIATE: HHR	1.30
08/14/12	CORRESPONDENCE WITH PATRIOT ON SPECIFIC LEASE ISSUES (.4); REVIEWING LEASE AND ANALYZING TERMS (2.0); DRAFTING SUMMARY (1.0) PARTNER: JTL	3.40
08/14/12	REVIEWED RELEVANT LEASE. ASSOCIATE: HHR	1.10
08/14/12	REVIEW LEASE MEMORANDUM DRAFT PREPARED BY T. LANE. ASSOCIATE: BRT	.40
08/15/12	REVIEWING RELEVANT LEASE FOR MINING. PARTNER: JTL	1.50
08/15/12	REVIEWED RELEVANT LEASES. ASSOCIATE: HHR	3.20
08/16/12	TELEPHONE CALL WITH DREW MCCALLISTER (.3); OUTLINING LEASE ISSUES (1.2). PARTNER: JTL	1.50
08/16/12	REVIEWED TERM SHEET AND LEASES ASSOCIATE: HHR	1.10

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/20/12	ASSESS LEASE ISSUE. PARTNER: JTL	1.20
08/21/12	REVIEWING RELEVANT LEASES. PARTNER: JTL	1.00
08/22/12	REVIEWING RELEVANT LEASES. PARTNER: JTL	.00
08/24/12	REVIEWED LEASES FOR OPINION LETTER ASSOCIATE: HHR	.70
08/27/12	DRAFTING LEASE REVIEW CHECKLIST (2.0); REVIEWING LEASE (2.0); REVISING OPINION (2.0) PARTNER: JTL	6.00
08/27/12	LEASE REVIEW ASSOCIATE: HHR	1.90
08/27/12	CONTINUE REVIEW OF RELEVANT LEASE. ASSOCIATE: BRT	1.30
08/28/12	CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. MCCALLISTER (.3); REVIEWING RELEVANT LEASE (4.0); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING LEASE REVIEWS TO INCORPORATE ADDITIONAL ISSUE IN OPINION (2.0); REVISING AND SUPPLEMENTING OPINION (1.0); DRAFTING SCHEDULE FOR OPINION (.8) PARTNER: JTL	8.10
08/28/12	ANALYZING LEASE FILES (4.0); UPDATING LEASE REVIEWS (3.3) ASSOCIATE: BF	7.30
08/28/12	DRAFTED 6 LEASE REVIEW FORMS COMPARING THEM TO DRAFT OPINION LETTER ASSOCIATE: HHR	6.10
08/28/12	COMPLETE LEASE REVIEW CHART. ASSOCIATE: BRT	1.80

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/29/12	REVIEWING SHOUB AND RELEVANT LEASES AND ANALYZING (2.0); CONFERENCE WITH D. MCCALLISTER (.5); DRAFTING NEW PROVISIONS IN OPINION (3.5); REVIEWING GLOBAL SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT(1.5) PARTNER: JTL	•	7.50
08/29/12	REVIEWED OPINION LETTER (.9) AND COMPLETED DRAFTING OF LEASE REVIEW FORMS, INCLUDING REVIEWING RELEVANT LEASE (3.2) ASSOCIATE: HHR	4	4.10
08/29/12	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT OF LETTER. ASSOCIATE: BRT	•	1.70
08/31/12	MAKING PROPOSED EDITS TO OPINION LETTER ASSOCIATE: BF		.90
08/31/12	REVISIONS TO OPINION LETTER ASSOCIATE: HHR	:	1.20
08/31/12	REVISE LETTER REGARDING LEASES AND SIERRA AGREEMENT. ASSOCIATE: BRT	;	1.10
	R PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED PENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT	\$	32555.77 0.00
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	32555.77

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0505.00066

ELIZABETH POWER, ESQ. ASSISTANT GENERAL COUNSEL PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION POST OFFICE BOX 1233 CHARLESTON, WV 25324

08/02/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. EAGON RE: LEASE PARTNER: JAC	.30
08/08/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. WALLER RE: MECHANIC'S LIEN (.2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM/TO E. WALLER RE: SAME (.2). PARTNER: JAC	.40
08/14/12	REVIEW MECHANIC'S LIENS (.2); REVIEW WEST VIRGINIA CODE RE: SAME (.2); CONFERENCE WITH C. HUGHES RE: MECHANIC'S LIEN FORM (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. POWER, J. EAGAN AND E. WALLER RE: SAME (.6); CONFERENCE WITH T. LANE RE: MECHANIC'S LIEN (.4); BEGIN REVIEW OF LEASE (.2). PARTNER: JAC	1.80
08/15/12	QUICK REVIEW OF LEASE (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. LANE RE: LEASE PROVISIONS (.5). PARTNER: JAC	.80
08/15/12	CONFERENCE WITH A. CRISLIP RE: LEASE PROVISIONS (.2); REVIEW LEASES (.3). PARTNER: JAC	.50
08/15/12	REVIEWED LEASE ASSOCIATE: ADC	1.40
08/17/12	REVIEW LEASE PROVISIONS (.3); REVIEW WEST VIRGINIA CODE RE: MECHANIC'S LIENS AND ANNOTATIONS (.2); WORK ON CORRESPONDENCE TO J. EAGAN, E. POWER AND E. WALLER RE: MECHANIC'S LIEN ISSUES (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. D'ANTONI RE: SAME (.2). PARTNER: JAC	1.10

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/17/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. CHINCHECK READING MECHANICS LIEN ISSUES; WORKING ON MECHANICS LIEN ISSUE (2.0) PARTNER: MBD	.20	
08/20/12	ASSESSING AFFECT OF MECHANICS' LIEN. PARTNER: JTL	1.00	
08/20/12	MULTIPLE CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. EAGAN RE: EFFECT OF MECHANIC'S LIEN (.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH T. LANE RE: SAME (.2). PARTNER: JAC	.50	
08/20/12	RESEARCHED ISSUE OF MECHANIC'S LIEN ASSOCIATE: HHR	2.30	
08/22/12	ANALYZING EFFECT OF MECHANICS' LIEN (1.0); TELEPHONE CALL WITH JOHN EAGAN (.4) PARTNER: JTL	1.40	
08/23/12	REVIEWING LEASES (2.0); DRAFTING ANALYSIS FOR J. EAGAN (1.0); TELEPHONE CALL WITH J. EAGAN (.3) PARTNER: JTL	3.30	
08/24/12	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. EAGAN AND R. MCWILLIAMS RE: COAL LEASE PARTNER: JAC	.20	
08/27/12	CORRESPONDENCE AND CONFERENCE ON MECHANICS LIEN ISSUES; TELEPHONE CALL WITH J. EAGAN. PARTNER: JTL	.70	
08/27/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. LANE RE: CONFERENCE WITH J. EAGAN AND K. WALL (NRP) RE: MECHANIC'S LIEN (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. EAGAN RE: FOLLOW-UP ISSUES (.2); TELEPHONE CALL TO OFFICE OF D. KLEIN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. KLEIN RE: PAYMENT OF MECHANIC'S LIEN (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. EAGAN RE: SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. LANE RE: MECHANIC'S LIEN ISSUES (.1). PARTNER: JAC	1.20	
	R PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED PENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT	\$	4045.37
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	4045.37

Bowles Rice LIN

POST OFFICE BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: E1166.00019

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION AND RELATED COMPANIES P. O. BOX 1233 CHARLESTON, WV 25324 ATTN: ERIC WALLER, ESQUIRE

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION FILE NUMBER: E1166.00019

INVOICE NO.: 458235

Aug 9, 2012 PAGE 2

.90

.10

.30

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/12/12 BEGIN DRAFT OF MSHA MONTHLY CASE STATUS
REPORT FOR PATRIOT COAL PER THE REQUEST OF
ATTORNEY OBLAK;
ADMINISTRATIVE: RR

07/16/12 RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM ERIC WALLER,
ESQUIRE WITH REQUEST FOR SPECIFIC BILLING DUE
TO THE REORGANIZATION UNDER BANKRUPTCY OF THE
COMPANY AND DRAFT EMAIL RESPONSE REGARDING SAME;
PARTNER: RJO

07/17/12 RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM ATTORNEY OBLAK
WITH ATTACHED COPY OF EMAIL FROM ERIC WALLER,
ESQUIRE REGARDING REQUEST FOR COPIES OF TWO
INVOICES FOR JULY DUE TO PATRIOT'S CHAPTER 11
BANKRUPTCY PROTECTION FILING WITH DETAILED
INFORMATION REGARDING THE HANDLING OF SAME(.10);
DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO ACCOUNTING REGARDING
REQUEST FOR INFORMATION REGARDING SAME(.10);
RECEIPT AND REVIEW RESPONSE EMAIL FROM MS.
AMBER HAYNES REGARDING SAID REQUEST; DRAFT
AND SEND RESPONSE EMAIL TO MS. HAYNES
REGARDING SAME(.10); ALARM CALENDAR FOR JULY 30TH
REGARDING THE HANDLING OF SAME;
ADMINISTRATIVE: RR

Payable Upon Receipt

STATUS REPORT FOR PATRIOT COAL FOR THE SECOND QUARTER PER ATTORNEY OBLAK; ADMINISTRATIVE: RR

- 07/17/12 RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM MS. SANDRA

 MARTIN REGARDING RECEIPT OF DELINQUENCY

 NOTICE REGARDING CASE NUMBER 85356 DOCKET

 WEVA 2007-233 AND REQUEST FOR COPY OF THE

 FINAL ORDER AND INFORMATION DETAILING

 SETTLEMENT REGARDING SAME(.20); PULL CLOSED FILE

 FROM STORAGE AND REVIEW OF FILE REGARDING

 SAME(.20;

 ADMINISTRATIVE: RR
- 07/17/12 DRAFT, SEND AND PRINT HARD COPY EMAIL TO MS. .30 MARTIN WITH ATTACHED COPY OF EMAIL FORWARDED TO MS. MARTIN ON JUNE 29, 2012 WHICH INCLUDES COPIES OF JUDGE WEISBERGER'S DECISION APPROVING SETTLEMENT AND THE SECRETARY'S JOINT MOTION TO WITHDRAW NOTICES OF CONTEST AND FOR DECISION AND ORDER APPROVING SETTLEMENT, PROPOSED ORDER APPROVING WITHDRAWAL OF NOTICES OF CONTEST AND SETTLEMENT REGARDING THE ABOVE-CAPTIONED CASE NUMBER (I.E., DOCKETS WEVA 2007-233, WEVA 2007-634 AND WEVA 2006-298-R THRU 303-R) WITH OFFER OF ASSISTANCE REGARDING FUTURE HANDLING OF THIS MATTER; ADMINISTRATIVE: RR
- 07/17/12 RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM MS. SANDRA

 MARTIN REGARDING RECEIPT OF DELINQUENCY

 NOTICE REGARDING CASE NUMBER 165287 DOCKET

 KENT 2009-168 AND REQUEST FOR COPY OF ORDER

 APPROVING SETTLEMENT AND INFORMATION

 DETAILING SETTLEMENT REGARDING SAME(.10); REVIEW

 OF FILE REGARDING SAME(.10);

 ADMINISTRATIVE: RR
- 07/17/12 DRAFT, SEND AND PRINT HARD COPY EMAIL TO MS.

 MARTIN REGARDING THE PARTIES HAVE NOT SETTLE

 THIS MATTER AND MATTER IS ON "STAY" BY JUDGE
 FELDMAN(.20); THE PARTIES HAVE REACHED A MUTUAL
 SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT ON ALL OF THE ALLEGED
 VIOLATIONS WITH THE EXCEPTION OF ONE OF THE
 ALLEGED VIOLATIONS BUT TO DATE, NO MOTION HAS
 BEEN FILED WITH JUDGE FELDMAN REGARDING SAME;
 REQUEST AS TO WHETHER THIS DELINQUENCY NOTICE
 COULD BE IN REFERENCE TO ANOTHER DOCKET AND
 OFFER TO RESEARCH THIS MATTER REGARDING SAME(.10)
 ADMINISTRATIVE: RR

Payable Upon Receipt

07/18/12	RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM ACCOUNTING WITH INFORMATION REGARDING THE MSHA MONTHLY CASE STATUS REPORT FOR PATRIOT COAL FOR THE SECOND QUARTER(.90); REVISE AND FINALIZE SAME(.40); ADMINISTRATIVE: RR	1.30	
07/18/12	DRAFT, SEND AND PRINT HARD COPY EMAIL TO ERIC WALLER, ESQUIRE (XC: MS. SANDRA MARTIN) PER ATTORNEY OBLAK WITH ATTACHED COPY OF THE MSHA MONTHLY CASE STATUS REPORT FOR PATRIOT COAL FOR THE SECOND QUARTER; ADMINISTRATIVE: RR	.30	
07/18/12	RESEARCH MSHA'S "DATA RETRIEVAL SYSTEM" REGARDING THE STATUS OF THE ALLEGED VIOLATIONS IN DOCKET KENT 2009-168 CASE NUMBER 165287 PER MS. SANDRA MARTIN'S EMAIL DATED JULY 17TH REGARDING RECEIPT OF DELINQUENCY NOTICE RECEIVED REGARDING THIS MATTER(.30); DRAFT, SEND AND PRINT HARD COPY EMAI TO MS. MARTIN PER ATTORNEY OBLAK REGARDING SAME AND FINDINGS THAT ALL OF THE ALLEGED VIOLATIONS ARE STILL LISTED AS "IN CONTEST" ON MSHA'S WEB SITE REGARDING SAME(.30); ADMINISTRATIVE: RR	.60	
	R PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED PENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT	\$	777.50

INVOICE TOTAL

777.50

========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: E1166.00058

.40

.60

ERIC WALLER, ESQUIRE
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL, LLC
P.O. BOX 1233
202 LAIDLEY TOWER
CHARLESTON, WV 25324

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/12/12 REVIEW OF STATUS SHEET REGARDING RECEIPT OF
JUDGE BULLUCK'S DECISION REGARDING THE TRIAL
HELD IN THIS MATTER ON APRIL 19-20, 2011;
RESEARCH THE FEDERAL MINE SAFETY AND HEALTH
REVIEW COMMISSION WEB SITE REGARDING DECISION
REGARDING SAME TO NO AVAIL(.20); RESEARCH MSHA'S
"DATE RETRIEVAL SYSTEM" REGARDING THE STATUS
OF THE ALLEGED VIOLATIONS IN THIS MATTER
WHICH STILL STATE AS "IN CONTEST(.20);"
ADMINISTRATIVE: RR

07/12/12 DRAFT, SEND AND PRINT HARD COPY EMAIL TO .30
ATTORNEY OBLAK REGARDING STATUS OF SAME AND
REQUEST FOR ANY DIRECTIVES REGARDING THE
FUTURE HANDLING OF SAME(.20); ALARM STATUS SHEET
REGARDING SAME(.10);
ADMINISTRATIVE: RR

07/12/12 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE TO JUDGE BULLUCK'S
OFFICE PER ATTORNEY OBLAK REGARDING THE
STATUS OF JUDGE BULLUCK'S DECISION REGARDING
THE TRIAL HELD IN THIS MATTER ON APRIL 19-20,
2011 IN MORGANTOWN, WEST VIRGINIA AND JUDGE
BULLUCK'S LEGAL ASSISTANT TO DISCUSS THIS
MATTER WITH JUDGE BULLUCK AND CONTACT
PRACTICE MANAGER SUBSEQUENT TO SAME(.10); ALARM
STATUS SHEET REGARDING TELEPHONE CONFERENCE
TO JUDGE BULLUCK'S OFFICE AND ALARM CALENDAR
REGARDING THE FUTURE HANDLING OF SAME(.10); DRAFT,
SEND AND PRINT HARD COPY EMAIL TO ATTORNEY
OBLAK REGARDING TELEPHONE CONFERENCE TO JUDGE
BULLUCK'S OFFICE REGARDING SAME(.40);
ADMINISTRATIVE: RR

Payable Upon Receipt

07/16/12 CONFERENCE WITH MSHA PRACTICE MANAGE REGARDING THE STATUS OF THE HEARING FAIRMONT BEFORE JUDGE BULLUCK REGARMATTER(.10); DIRECTIVES TO CONTACT OFFICE REGARDING SAME; CONFERENCE WE PRACTICE MANAGER REGARDING THE STATE DOCKET PER JUDGE BULLUCK'S ASSISTANE EMAIL TO MR. GARY MCHENRY (XC: ERIESQUIRE) REGARDING THE STATUS OF THE WITH JUDGE BULLUCK IN JUNE 2011(.20) PARTNER: RJO	HELD IN RDING THIS JUDGE BULLUCK'S WITH MSHA PUS OF THE WT(.20); DRAFT IC WALLER, HIS MATTER	.50	
07/17/12 RETURN TELEPHONE CONFERENCE FROM JUDGE BULLUCK'S OFFICE REGARDING THE STATE JUDGE BULLOCK'S DECISION REGARDING THAT WAS HELD IN APRIL 2011 AND JUIDE IS AWARE OF SAME AND WORKING ON SATE AND WILL ISSUE SAID RULING SUBSEQUE COMPLETION OF SAME; ADMINISTRATIVE: RR	TUS OF THE TRIAL DGE BULLUCK ID DECISION	.30	
07/17/12 DRAFT MEMO TO FILE REGARDING TELEPH CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BULLUCK'S OFF REGARDING THE STATUS OF JUDGE BULLU DECISION REGARDING THIS MATTER(.10) AND PRINT HARD COPY EMAIL TO ATTORN WITH ATTACHED COPY OF SAME(.10); AJ SHEET REGARDING SAME AND THE FUTURN REGARDING SAME(.10); ADMINISTRATIVE: RR	FICE UCK'S); DRAFT, SEND NEY OBLAK LARM STATUS	.30	
TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT	\$		375.00
INVOICE TOTAL	\$		375.00

========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: E1166.00066

.20

ERIC WALLER, ESQUIRE
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION
P.O. BOX 1233
CHARLESTON, WV 25324

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/12/12 RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAILS (X3) FROM SOLICITOR .30
MORHOLT REGARDING THE STATUS OF THE
DOCUMENTS(.20); DRAFT EMAIL RESPONSES (X2) TO
SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING SAME(.10);
PARTNER: RJO

07/12/12 REVIEW FILE FOR THE STATUS OF CASE REGARDING
PENDING ISSUES SUCH AS DISCOVERY DUE
(OPERATOR'S AND SECRETARY'S), HEARING AND/OR
DEPOSITIONS PENDING OR SCHEDULED, CONFERENCES
WITH JUDGES/SOLICITORS/ET CETERA SCHEDULED
AND REPORT TO ATTORNEY OBLAK REGARDING SAME
AS WELL AS OTHER DEADLINES INCLUDING SAID
FILE CLAIM(.10); UPDATE STATUS SHEET AND MSHA
STATUS REPORT TO ERIC WALLER, ESQUIRE
REGARDING SAME(.10);
ADMINISTRATIVE: RR

07/25/12 RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM SOLICITOR
MORHOLT WITH ATTACHMENTS REGARDING THE
OPERATOR'S REVISIONS TO THE SECRETARY'S
MOTIONS TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT AND ORDERS
REGARDING THE TWO DOCKETS THAT WERE SETTLED
IN OCTOBER 2011(.10); FAILURE TO OPEN SAID
DOCKETS; RECEIPT AND REVIEW COPY EMAIL FROM
MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT
REQUESTING TO RESEND SAME IN ANOTHER FORMAT
DUE TO FAILURE TO OPEN; DRAFT EMAIL RESPONSE
TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT(.10);
PARTNER: RJO

07/25/12	RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM SOLICITOR MORHOLT WITH ATTACHMENTS REGARDING THE OPERATOR'S REVISIONS TO THE SECRETARY'S MOTIONS TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT AND ORDERS REGARDING THIS MATTER AND FAILURE TO OPEN SAID ATTACHMENTS; DRAFT, SEND AND PRINT HARD COPY EMAIL TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT REQUESTING TO RESEND SAME IN ANOTHER FORMAT DUE TO FAILURE TO OPEN(.10); ADMINISTRATIVE: RR	.10
07/26/12	RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM ATTORNEY OBLAK TO MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER REGARDING THE STATUS OF THE DOCUMENTS FROM SOLICITOR MORHOLT AND TO ALARM FOR ATTORNEY OBLAK TO EXECUTE AND RETURN AS SOON AS POSSIBLE; PARTNER: RJO	.10
07/28/12	REVIEW FILE FOR RECEIPT OF RESPONSE FROM SOLICITOR MORHOLT TO MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER REGARDING THE REQUEST FOR FORMATTING THE PRIOR DOCUMENTS SENT (I.E., MOTIONS TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT AND ORDERS) TO NO AVAIL(.10); DRAFT, SEND AND PRINT HARD COPY EMAIL TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING STATUS OF SAME(.10); PARTNER: RJO	.20
07/28/12	DRAFT, SEND AND PRINT HARD COPY EMAIL TO MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER WITH DIRECTIVES TO FOLLOW UP WITH SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING THE STATUS OF REQUEST FOR THE SECRETARY'S MOTIONS TO APPROVE PARTIAL SETTLEMENT AND ORDERS REGARDING THESE DOCKETS; PARTNER: RJO	.10
08/01/12	REVIEW FILE FOR THE STATUS OF CASE REGARDING PENDING ISSUES SUCH AS DISCOVERY DUE (OPERATOR'S AND SECRETARY'S), HEARING AND/OR DEPOSITIONS SCHEDULED, CONFERENCES WITH JUDGES/SOLICITORS/ET CETERA SCHEDULED AND REPORT TO ATTORNEY OBLAK REGARDING SAME AS WELL AS OTHER DEADLINES INCLUDING SAID FILE CLAIM(.10); UPDATE STATUS SHEET REGARDING SAME(.10); ADMINISTRATIVE: RR	.20

08/03/12	RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM SOLICITOR MORHOLT WITH ATTACHED COPY OF THE SECRETARY'S MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT AND PROPOSED ORDER REGARDING SAME IN WORD FORMAT FOR ATTORNEY OBLAK'S REVIEW AND REVISIONS OF SAME; PRINT HARD COPY OF SAME(.10); DRAFT, SEND AND PRINT HARD COPY RESPONSE EMAIL TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT PER ATTORNEY OBLAK REGARDING THE HANDLING OF SAME(.10); ADMINISTRATIVE: RR	.20
08/07/12	CONFERENCE WITH MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER REGARDING THE EXECUTION OF THE SECRETARY OF LABOR'S MOTIONS FOR PARTIAL SETTLEMENT, SOLICITOR MORHOLT'S EMAIL AND DIRECTIVES REGARDING FUTURE HANDLING OF SAME; PARTNER: RJO	.20
08/08/12	CONFERENCE CALL WITH MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER REGARDING THE FINAL MOTIONS TO APPROVE PARTIAL SETTLEMENT AND SOLICITOR MORHOLT'S LAST EMAIL(.10); DIRECTIVES TO MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER REGARDING SAME(.10); RECEIPT AND REVIEW COPY EMAIL WITH ATTACHMENTS FROM MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT; PARTNER: RJO	.20
08/08/12	DRAFT EMAIL TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING HIS REQUEST TO POTENTIALLY MEET IN WASHINGTON, DC AND TRY TO SETTLE THE LAST ALLEGED VIOLATIONS IN THESE DOCKETS(.10); DRAFT, SEND EMAIL RESPONSE TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT WITH REQUEST FOR DATES HE WILL BE ATTENDING MEETING IN DC(.10); PARTNER: RJO	.20
08/08/12	DRAFT, SEND AND PRINT HARD COPY EMAIL TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT PER ATTORNEY OBLAK WITH ATTACHED COPY OF THE SIGNED PARTIES JOINT MOTION TO APPROVE PARTIAL SETTLEMENT REGARDING THIS MATTER(.20); ALARM STATUS SHEET REGARDING SAME; ADMINISTRATIVE: RR	.20

Payable Upon Receipt

08/09/12	COPY EMAIL FROM MS. VERNITA THOMPSON OF	.20
	SOLICITOR MORHOLT'S OFFICE REGARDING THE	
	FILINGS OF THE PARTIES MOTION TO APPROVE	
	PARTIAL SETTLEMENT TO JUDGE FELDMAN;	
	PARTNER: RJO	

08/22/12 RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM SOLICITOR NEIL .30

MORHOLT WITH DATES THAT HE WILL BE IN

WASHINGTON, DC IN AN ATTEMPT TO GET TOGETHER

AND POTENTIALLY ATTEMPT TO SETTLE THE REMAINING

DOCKET(.10); DRAFT, SEND AND PRINT EMAIL TO

SOLICITOR MORHOLT THAT ATTORNEY OBLAK'S

SCHEDULE IS IN CONFLICT WITH HIS TIME IN DC, ET

CETERA(.10);

PARTNER: RJO

TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT	\$ 675.00 0.00
INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 675.00
	========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: E1166.00071

ERIC WALLER, ESQUIRE
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION
P.O. BOX 1233
CHARLESTON, WV 25324

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/12/12 RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAILS (X3) FROM SOLICITOR .30
MORHOLT REGARDING THE STATUS OF THE
DOCUMENTS(.10); DRAFT EMAIL RESPONSES (X2) TO
SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING SAME(.20);
PARTNER: RJO

07/12/12 REVIEW FILE FOR THE STATUS OF CASE REGARDING
PENDING ISSUES SUCH AS DISCOVERY DUE
(OPERATOR'S AND SECRETARY'S), HEARING AND/OR
DEPOSITIONS PENDING OR SCHEDULED, CONFERENCES
WITH JUDGES/SOLICITORS/ET CETERA SCHEDULED
AND REPORT TO ATTORNEY OBLAK REGARDING SAME
AS WELL AS OTHER DEADLINES INCLUDING SAID
FILE CLAIM(.10); UPDATE STATUS SHEET AND MSHA
STATUS REPORT TO ERIC WALLER, ESQUIRE
REGARDING SAME(.20);
ADMINISTRATIVE: RR

07/25/12 RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM SOLICITOR

MORHOLT WITH ATTACHMENTS REGARDING THE

OPERATOR'S REVISIONS TO THE SECRETARY'S

MOTIONS TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT AND ORDERS

REGARDING THE TWO DOCKETS THAT WERE SETTLED

IN OCTOBER 2011; FAILURE TO OPEN SAID

DOCKETS; RECEIPT AND REVIEW COPY EMAIL FROM

MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT

REQUESTING TO RESEND SAME IN ANOTHER FORMAT

DUE TO FAILURE TO OPEN(.10); DRAFT EMAIL RESPONSE

TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT(.10);

PARTNER: RJO

07/25/12	RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM SOLICITOR MORHOLT WITH ATTACHMENTS REGARDING THE OPERATOR'S REVISIONS TO THE SECRETARY'S MOTIONS TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT AND ORDERS REGARDING THIS MATTER AND FAILURE TO OPEN SAID ATTACHMENTS; DRAFT, SEND AND PRINT HARD COPY EMAIL TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT REQUESTING TO RESEND SAME IN ANOTHER FORMAT DUE TO FAILURE TO OPEN(.10); ADMINISTRATIVE: RR	.10
07/26/12	RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM ATTORNEY OBLAK TO MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER REGARDING THE STATUS OF THE DOCUMENTS FROM SOLICITOR MORHOLT AND TO ALARM FOR ATTORNEY OBLAK TO EXECUTE AND RETURN AS SOON AS POSSIBLE; PARTNER: RJO	.10
07/28/12	REVIEW FILE FOR RECEIPT OF RESPONSE FROM SOLICITOR MORHOLT TO MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER REGARDING THE REQUEST FOR FORMATTING THE PRIOR DOCUMENTS SENT (I.E., MOTIONS TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT AND ORDERS) TO NO AVAIL(.10); DRAFT, SEND AND PRINT HARD COPY EMAIL TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING STATUS OF SAME(.10); PARTNER: RJO	.20
07/28/12	DRAFT, SEND AND PRINT HARD COPY EMAIL TO MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER WITH DIRECTIVES TO FOLLOW UP WITH SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING THE STATUS OF REQUEST FOR THE SECRETARY'S MOTIONS TO APPROVE PARTIAL SETTLEMENT AND ORDERS REGARDING THESE DOCKETS; PARTNER: RJO	.10
08/01/12	REVIEW FILE FOR THE STATUS OF CASE REGARDING PENDING ISSUES SUCH AS DISCOVERY DUE (OPERATOR'S AND SECRETARY'S), HEARING AND/OR DEPOSITIONS SCHEDULED, CONFERENCES WITH JUDGES/SOLICITORS/ET CETERA SCHEDULED AND REPORT TO ATTORNEY OBLAK REGARDING SAME AS WELL AS OTHER DEADLINES INCLUDING SAID FILE CLAIM(.10); UPDATE STATUS SHEET REGARDING SAME(.10); ADMINISTRATIVE: RR	.20

08/03/12	RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM SOLICITOR MORHOLT WITH ATTACHED COPY OF THE SECRETARY'S MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT AND PROPOSED ORDER REGARDING SAME IN WORD FORMAT FOR ATTORNEY OBLAK'S REVIEW AND REVISIONS OF SAME(.10); DRAFT, SEND RESPONSE EMAIL TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT PER ATTORNEY OBLAK REGARDING THE HANDLING OF SAME(.10); ADMINISTRATIVE: RR	.20
08/07/12	CONFERENCE WITH MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER REGARDING THE EXECUTION OF THE SECRETARY OF LABOR'S MOTIONS FOR PARTIAL SETTLEMENT, SOLICITOR MORHOLT'S EMAIL AND DIRECTIVES REGARDING FUTURE HANDLING OF SAME; PARTNER: RJO	.20
08/08/12	CONFERENCE CALL WITH MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER REGARDING THE FINAL MOTIONS TO APPROVE PARTIAL SETTLEMENT AND SOLICITOR MORHOLT'S LAST EMAIL(.10); DIRECTIVES TO MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER REGARDING SAME(.10); RECEIPT AND REVIEW COPY EMAIL WITH ATTACHMENTS FROM MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT; PARTNER: RJO	.20
08/08/12	DRAFT EMAIL TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING HIS REQUEST TO POTENTIALLY MEET IN WASHINGTON, DC AND TRY TO SETTLE THE LAST ALLEGED VIOLATIONS IN THESE DOCKETS(.10); DRAFT, SEND AND PRINT EMAIL RESPONSE TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT WITH REQUEST FOR DATES HE WILL BE ATTENDING MEETING IN DC(.10); PARTNER: RJO	.20
08/08/12	DRAFT, SEND AND PRINT HARD COPY EMAIL TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT PER ATTORNEY OBLAK WITH ATTACHED COPY OF THE SIGNED PARTIES JOINT MOTION TO APPROVE PARTIAL SETTLEMENT REGARDING THIS MATTER(.20); ALARM STATUS SHEET REGARDING SAME; ADMINISTRATIVE: RR	.20

Payable Upon Receipt

08/09/12 COPY EMAIL FROM MS. VERNITA THOMPSON OF SOLICITOR MORHOLT'S OFFICE REGARDING THE FILINGS OF THE PARTIES MOTION TO APPROVE PARTIAL SETTLEMENT TO JUDGE FELDMAN; PARTNER: RJO	.20
08/22/12 RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM SOLICITOR NEIL MORHOLT WITH DATES THAT HE WILL BE IN WASHINGTON, DC IN AN ATTEMPT TO GET TOGETHER AND POTENTIALLY ATTEMPT TO SETTLE THE REMAINING DOCKET(.10); DRAFT, SEND EMAIL TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT THAT SCHEDULE IS IN CONFLICT WITH HIS TIME IN DC, ET CETERA(.20); PARTNER: RJO	.30
TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT	\$ 675.00 0.00
INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 675.00

POST OFFICE BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.00004

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

07/19/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS AND DISCOVERY (.30); CHECK STATUS OF PATHOLOGY SLIDES AND RECORDS (.10); DIRECT EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.50	
07/24/12	PREPARED PACKAGE TO SEND TO DR. OESTERLING FOR REPORT PARALEGAL: SL	.50	
07/30/12	REVIEW PATHOLOGY SLIDES AND COMPARE WITH MEDICAL RECORDS AND PATHOLOGY REPORTS (.30); REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. OESTERLING AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE AND INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS (.40); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. OESTERLING (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.80	
07/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. OESTERLING AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
08/14/12	RECEIPT OF CONSULTING REPORT FROM DR. OESTERLING AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/15/12	REVIEW REPORT FROM DR. OESTERLING, FINDINGS; COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD PARTNER: PEF	.40	
TOTAL FOR	R PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED	\$	343.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.00051

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL, SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

	DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES	
07/12/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS AND FILMS FROM CAMC NEEDED FOR	. 90
	DEVELOPMENT(.60): TELEPHONE CALL TO CAMC REGARDING X-RAYS (.30) PARALEGAL: KC	
07/23/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	1.20
07/26/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL (1.00); DRAFTING REQUEST TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS (.10): UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM (.20) PARALEGAL: KC	1.30
07/26/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CAMC REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/06/12	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR AND PENDING ISSUES; UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.40
08/06/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM CAMC PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/06/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/08/12	REVIEW ISSUES AND EVIDENCE FOR UPCOMING DEADLINES; (.4) DIRECT EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/08/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND RECORDS FOR REVIEW BY CONSULTING PHYSISCIAN (.7) DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. ROSENBERG'S OFFICE FOR CONSULTING OPINION (.3) PARALEGAL: D T	1.00
08/08/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO SCHEDULE DEPOSITION OF DR. ROSENBERG PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/08/12	DRAFTING INDEX OF MATERIAL PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/08/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM FOR DR. OESTERLING'S MEDICAL REPORT PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/08/12	REVIEWING ADDITIONAL DEVELOPMENT PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/08/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CAMC REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/08/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/08/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/09/12	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FOR POSSIBLE SUBMISSION (.3); REVIEW RECORDS BEING SENT TO DR. ROSENBERG; COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN THE RECORD AND CASE MATERIALS (.4); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG (.1); REVIEW REPORT OF DR. OESTERLING; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD (.3); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE (.1) PARTNER: PEF	1.20
08/09/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10

08/09/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/16/12	REVIEW REPORT OF DR. ROSENBERG; COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND MATERIALS REVIEWED, ISSUES; APPROVE FOR SUBMISSION INTO THE RECORD PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/16/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/16/12	REVIEW DRAFT EVIDENCE SUMMARY FOR JUDGE AND PREHEARING REPORT REQUIRED, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND SUBMITTED, ISSUES PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/16/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE WITH REQUIRED REPORTS PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/16/12	CONTACTING DR. ROSENBERG'S OFFICE FOR STATUS OF REPORT PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/16/12	REVIEWING REPORT OF DR. ROSENBERG PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/16/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM SUBMITTING REPORT OF DR. ROSENBERG PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/16/12	UPDATING EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM WITH ADDITIONAL MEDICAL REPORT PURSUANT TO DEADLINE BEFORE THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE PARALEGAL: D T	.30
08/16/12	DISCUSSING CLAIM WITH ATTORNEY FOR COMPLETION OF EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT PARALEGAL: D T	.10

08/16/12 PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/20/12 RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S MOTION FOR CONTINUANCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/24/12 REVIEWING CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING CLAIM REGARDING ISSUES PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/30/12 RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DISTRICT DIRECTOR AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
E	
TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT	\$ 1007.50
INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 1007.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.00122

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL, DISEASE

SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

07/25/12 RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/03/12 REVIEW OF PAUL WHEELER X-RAY READING PARALEGAL: SL	.10	
TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT	\$ 21. 0.	.00
INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 21.	.00 ===

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.00180

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

PARALEGAL: UV

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

	DESCRIPTION OF DEGREE DERVICED	
07/11/12	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD (.20); CONFIRM EVIDENCE FOR SUBMISSION (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.40
07/11/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF X-RAY REREADING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM FROM DR. MEYER (.20); DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. MEYER REQUESTING STATUS (.10) PARALEGAL: UV	.30
07/11/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/12/12	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF B-READER REPORT FROM DR. MEYER (.20); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.10); DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF REBUTTAL EVIDENCE (.20) PARALEGAL: UV	.50
07/13/12	DRAFTING REMINDER NOTICE TO CLAIMANT OF UPCOMING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION (.20); DRAFTING REFERRAL LETTER TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.20); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR READING OF ZALDIVAR FILM (.20); PREPARING REFERRAL PACKET (.70)	1.30

07/16/12	CONFIRM EXAMINATION SCHEDULE (.10); CHECK CONTACT WITH CLAIMANT (.10); REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR FOR OPINION AND COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE OF RECORD (.20); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT RE EXAMINATION (.10); DESIGNATE READER (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER TO REQUEST REPORT (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.80
07/16/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/16/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/17/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ZALDIVAR'S OFFICE REGARDING UPCOMING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION PARALEGAL: UV	.10
07/31/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER FROM WHEELER AND SCOTT; 2 FILMS 7/25/12; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/02/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (.2); DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY (.1) PARALEGAL: UV	.30
08/06/12	DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR ZALDIVAR FORWARDING X-RAY READING BY JOHNS HOPKINS TO HIM FOR COMPLETION OF HIS INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION REPORT PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/09/12	RECEIPT OF ZALDIVAR REPORT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20

TOTAL EXI	PENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 0.00 708.50
TOTAL FOR	PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED	\$ 708.50
08/22/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING REPORTS FROM DR. ZALDIVAR AND DR. SCOTT PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/22/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSIONS OF EVIDENCE OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S REPORT, B-READER REPORT BY DR. SCOTT, AND X-RAY FILM OF 7/25/12 PARALEGAL: UV	.40
08/21/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/21/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/21/12	REVIEW FILM AND CONFIRM COMPLETION OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT WITH FILM PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/21/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH VARIOUS EVIDENCE PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/21/12	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND DEVELOPED TO DATE PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/21/12	REVIEW REPORT OF DR. ZALDIVAR, TEST RESULTS, CONCLUSIONS, AND COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND DEPARTMENT OF LABOR EXAMINATION PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/17/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS BY WHEELER AND SCOTT; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.00333

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

7/11/12 REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

.60

	PARALEGAL: KC	
07/18/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS RE STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.20); CHECK FOR RECEIPT OF DISCOVERY(.10) PARTNER: PEF	.30
07/18/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARTNER: PEF	.20
07/18/12	REVIEW EVIDENCE SUBMITTED BY PLAINTIFF'S COUNSEL IN SUPPORT OF MODIFICATION REQUEST (.20); COMPARE WITH MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED TO DATE (.10); REVIEW EXAMINATION EVIDENCE CONTAINED IN THE RECORD (.20) PARTNER: PEF	.50
07/18/12	DETERMINE ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT NECESSARY PARTNER: PEF	.20
07/23/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
07/30/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CAMC PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/06/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM BECKLEY APPALACHAIN REGIONAL HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: KC	.60
08/10/12	CASE STATUS REVIEW FOR UPCOMING HEARING (0.3).	.30

08/10/12	PHONE CALL TO RAYMOND SMITH ABOUT OUTSTANDING CLAIMANT INTERROGATORIES (0.2) PARALEGAL: SL	.20
08/10/12	DRAFTED 2ND REQUEST FOR INTERROGATORIES (0.5) PARALEGAL: SL	.50
08/13/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. PATEL REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/14/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/15/12	REVIEW INFORMATION FROM TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/15/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/15/12	SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/28/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE PARALEGAL: KC	.50
	R PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED PENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT	\$ 548.50 0.00
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 548.50

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.00496

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

07/12/12	REVIEWING CORRESPONDENCE FROM DIRECTOR AND VERIFYING CLAIM STATUS PARALEGAL: D T	.10
07/23/12	REVIEWING AND PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/15/12	RECEIPT OF BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/17/12	ANALYSIS OF CASE FILE; RELEVANT RESEARCH RELATED TO BRIEF PREPARATION PARTNER: SES	6.10
08/20/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REQUESTING A COPY OF OUR REQUEST FOR ENLARGEMENT OF TIME FOR FILING OF BRIEF PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/20/12	FORWARDING COPY OF OUR ENLARGEMENT REQUEST TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/23/12	PREPARING BRIEF OUTLINE AND FINALIZING REVIEW OF ALL RELEVANT DOCUMENTS AND CASE LAW PARTNER: SES	5.80
08/24/12	DRAFTING BRIEF TO BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD PARTNER: SES	4.60
08/26/12	REVISIONS TO BRIEF; CONFERENCE CONCERNING EVIDENCE IN UNDERLYING CASES PARTNER: SES	2.80

Payable Upon Receipt

08/27/12	REVISE	AND	EDIT	FINAL	BRIEF	on	APPEAL	
	DARTNE) · I	ਸ਼ਹ					

2.80

TOTAL FEES:

\$ 3695.50

========

TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED \$ 3695.50
TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT 0.00
INVOICE TOTAL \$ 3695.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.00510

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/23/12 REVIEWING AND PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND
UPDATING CLAIM
PARALEGAL: UV

TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED \$ 7.00
TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT 0.00
INVOICE TOTAL \$ 7.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.00693

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

CHARLESTON, WEST VIRGINIA

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

______ 07/12/12 CHECK FOR RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR EXHIBITS (.10); .60 REVIEW EVIDENCE DEVELOPED AND EVIDENCE SUBMITTED TO DETERMINE ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT NECESSARY (.40); CHECK FOR ANY OTHER EVIDENCE FROM CLAIMANT (.10) PARTNER: PEF .10 07/20/12 REVIEWING AND PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV .20 08/03/12 RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR EXHIBITS AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV 08/06/12 REVIEWED AND PREPARED ELECTRONIC VERSION OF 1.20 DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS FROM DOL PARALEGAL: SL 204.00 TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 0.00 TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT INVOICE TOTAL 204.00 =========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.00694

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/13/12 REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING MEDICAL RECORDS .60 PARALEGAL: KC .60 07/23/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE PARALEGAL: KC 07/27/12 RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL .20 INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE (.10); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.10) PARALEGAL: UV 08/02/12 REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO .50 SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES (.2) AND REVIEWING CLAIM FILE TO DETERMINE ADDITIONAL RECORDS NEEDED IN DEFENSE OF CLAIM (.3) PARALEGAL: UV 08/16/12 DRAFTING REQUEST TO MEDICAL FACILITIES 1.20 REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC 08/28/12 RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. BARGOUTHI .20 AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV 08/29/12 REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL 1.70 RECORDS FROM DR. BARGOUTHI'S OFFICE PARALEGAL: D T 08/29/12 REVIEIWING FILE MATERIAL REGARDING MEDICAL .40 RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC

08/29/12 REVIEIWING FILE MATERIAL FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/30/12 REVIEWING CORRESPONDENCE FROM BECKLEY APPALACHIAN REGIONAL HOSPITAL REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.30
TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT	\$ 434.00
INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 434.00
	========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.00751

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

\$

14.00

=========

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/11/12 REVIEWING MEDICAL RECORDS CONTAINED IN FILE .20
TO DETERMINE NEED FOR ADDITIONAL RECORDS IN
DEFENSE OF CLAIM
PARALEGAL: UV

TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED \$ 14.00
TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT 0.00
INVOICE TOTAL \$ 14.00

TOTAL FEES:

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.00791

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/10/12 REVIEW EMAILS FROM L. KLAUS AND J. LINDEN RE .30
POSSIBLE APPEAL, ISSUES (.20); EMAIL TO J.
LINDEN RE SAME (.10)
PARTNER: PEF

08/14/12 RECEIPT OF EMPLOYER'S PETITION FOR REVIEW AND .10
UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
PARALEGAL: UV

TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED \$ 56.50
TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT 0.00
INVOICE TOTAL \$ 56.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.00835

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL, SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/11/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE (.10) UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.10) PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/12/12	REVIEW EVIDENCE DEVELOPED TO DATE (.20); REVIEW PATHOLOGY SLIDES AND COMPARE WITH MEDICAL RECORDS AND REPORTS RE SAME (.20); REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. OESTERLING (.20); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. OESTERLING (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.70
07/12/12	DRAFTING CONSULTING REQUEST TO DR. OESTERLING PARALEGAL: UV	.50
07/12/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. OESTERLING AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/01/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF CONSULTING REPORT FROM DR. OESTERLING. UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/06/12	RECEIPT OF CONSULTATION REPORT FROM DR. OESTERLING AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/07/12	REVIEW REPORT OF DR. OESTERLING AND PATHOLOGY FINDINGS AND COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE IN THE RECORD AND PATHOLOGY REPORTS; CONFIRM NEED TO SUBMIT AS EVIDENCE PARTNER: PEF	.40

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT INVOICE TOTAL \$ 361.50	08/08/12 REVIEW EVIDENCE SUBMISSIONS TO DATE (.1); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.20
ADMINISTRATIVE: LB 08/08/12 UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ADMINISTRATIVE: LB 08/13/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTION NEEDED AT EMPLOYER'S DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED \$ 361.50 TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT 0.00 INVOICE TOTAL \$ 361.50		.40
SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ADMINISTRATIVE: LB 08/13/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTION NEEDED AT EMPLOYER'S DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT INVOICE TOTAL \$ 361.50		.10
AND ACTION NEEDED AT EMPLOYER'S DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT INVOICE TOTAL \$ 361.50	SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR	.10
TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT INVOICE TOTAL \$ 361.50	AND ACTION NEEDED AT EMPLOYER'S DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	.20
TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT INVOICE TOTAL \$ 361.50		
		\$ 361.50 0.00
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 361.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.00865

INVOICE: 458238

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,

SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/03/12 REVIEWING, IDENTIFYING AND CATALOGING NEW CTS .20 AND X-RAYS; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH 08/06/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERAIL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS .30 FROM MONTGOMERY GENERAL HOSPTIAL PARALEGAL: KC 08/06/12 TELEPHONE CALL TO CAMC REGARDING X-RAYS .20 PARALEGAL: KC 08/10/12 REVIEIWING FILE MATERAIL FOR RECEIPT OF .50 X-RAYS FROM CAMC PARALEGAL: KC TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 84.00 TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT 0.00 INVOICE TOTAL 84.00 =========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.00867

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL, SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

a room appurage

	DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES	
07/13/12	REVIEW DRAFT ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES, RESPONSES TO REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION AND REQUESTS FOR ADMISSION (.20); COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE AND INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS (.20); EDIT RESPONSES (.30); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.80
07/13/12	DRAFT EMPLOYER'S RESPONSE TO CLAIMANT'S INTERROGATORIES AND REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION AND REQUEST FOR ADMISSIONS. PARALEGAL: SL	.70
07/13/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
07/13/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/26/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO NOTICE OF HEARING (.30); DRAFTING INITIAL EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM LISTING ALL EVIDENCE (1.20); REVIEWING CLAIMANT'S NUMEROUS SUBMISSIONS AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL TREATMENT RECORDS (1.1); REQUESTING DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR (.20) PARALEGAL: D T	2.80
07/27/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. BECKETT REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
07/30/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM NORTON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL REGARDING MEDICAL RECODRS PARALEGAL: KC	.50

08/06/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM NORTON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/07/12	REVIEW PROPOSED INITIAL EVIDENCE SUMMARY; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE (.3); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); CHECK STATUS OF DEVELOPMENT; CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM (.2); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO PLAINTIFF'S COUNSEL (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.70
08/07/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S PRELIMINARY EVIDENCE SUMMARY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/07/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	1.60
08/07/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/07/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/08/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ELBASH REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.10
08/13/12	DRAFTING MOTION TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REQUESTING A CONTINUANCE PARALEGAL: D T	.40
08/13/12	DRAFTING COVER LETTER TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/14/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. BASH AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20

08/14/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/15/12	REVIEW PROJECTED DATES OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT COMPLETION, ACTION NECESSARY, DEADLINES IMPOSED BY JUDGE PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/15/12	REVIEW AND SIGN DRAFT MOTION TO CONTINUE PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/15/12	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISCS FROM CABELL HUNTINGTON HOSPITAL AND FROM NORTON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/15/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO UP&S REGARDING PATHOLOGY PARALEGAL: KC	.10
08/15/12	REVIEIWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/16/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO MEDICAL FACILITY REQUESTING PATHOLOGY AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/17/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS TO FORWARD TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/17/12	RECEIPT OF CLMT'S EXHIBIT 7; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/23/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM NORTH COMMUNITY HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: D T	1.50

08/23/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. STEELE, DR. ALKHANKAN, NORTON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL AND COMPACT DISC FROM WILLIAMSON ARH AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV		
08/27/12	REVIEWING ISSUE OF RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR AND UPDATING SYSTEM PARALEGAL: D T	.10	
08/27/12	DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR PARALEGAL: D T	.30	
08/27/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. STEELE'S OFFICE PARALEGAL: D T	1.30	
08/27/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. ALKHANKAN'S OFFICE PARALEGAL: D T	1.50	
08/27/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
08/28/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CABELL HUNTINGTON HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: D T	.80	
08/29/12	RECEIPT OF ORDER CONTINUING HEARING AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
	R PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED PENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT		1433.50
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	1433.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.00899

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/02/12	REVIEW DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS, CLAIMANT'S EXHIBITS, AND EVIDENCE SUBMITTED INTO THE RECORD OF THE CASE TO DATE, COMPARE WITH ISSUES AND STATUS OF AFFIRMATIVE AND REBUTTAL EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT TO DETERMINE ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE NEEDED FOR HEARING PREPARATION PARTNER: PEF	.80
08/03/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/06/12	REVIEW DRAFT NOTICE TO JUDGE OF ISSUES CONTESTED FOR HEARING AS COMPARED WITH CASE MATERIALS (.2); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/06/12	REVIEWING PROCEDURAL HISTORY AND DRAFTING LETTER REGARDING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR ISSUES; UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.40
08/06/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/07/12	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT AND RECEIPT OF RELEASE FROM EXECUTRIX PARALEGAL: D T	1.00
08/14/12	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT PARALEGAL: D T	.20

08/14/12 DRAFTING MOTION TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE FOR CONTINUANCE OF HEARING TO OBTAIN ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE PARALEGAL: D T	.40
08/14/12 DRAFTING COVER LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/14/12 DISCUSSING CLAIM WITH ATTORNEY PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/14/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/15/12 REVIEW PROCEDURAL HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND NEED FOR CONTINUANCE PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/15/12 REVIEW AND SIGN MOTION FOR CONTINUANCE PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/24/12 REVIEWING CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING CLAIM REGARDING ISSUES PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/30/12 RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DISTRICT DIRECTOR AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/31/12 RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DISTRICT DIRECTOR'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT	\$ 476.00 0.00
INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 476.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.00926

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL, SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

______ .60 07/11/12 CHECK STATUS OF DEPOSITION SCHEDULING, REVIEW DATES AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE SUBMISSION DEADLINES (.40); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE WITH NOTICES OF DEPOSITIONS OF ZALDIVAR AND ROSENBERG (.20) PARTNER: PEF .60 07/11/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL AND DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION (.40); UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM (.20)PARALEGAL: KC 07/11/12 TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING .70 DEPOSITION (.30): DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION (.30) UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM (.10) PARALEGAL: KC 07/11/12 REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING MEDICAL RECORDS .80 PARALEGAL: KC 07/11/12 PROCESSING NOTICES TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW .30 JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB 07/13/12 REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING MEDICAL RECORDS .60 PARALEGAL: KC 07/23/12 REVIEWING AND PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND .10 UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV 07/24/12 REVIEWING STATUS OF EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT 1.25 PURSUANT TO NOTICE OF HEARING AND UPDATING EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM WITH ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE (1.00); CONTACTING DR. ROSENBERG'S OFFICE REGARDING STATUS OF REPORT (.30) PARALEGAL: D T

07/24/12	REVIEWWING FILE MATERIAL (.20):TELEPHONE CALLS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS (.50): UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM (.20) PARALEGAL: KC	.90
07/24/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/25/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
07/30/12	REVIEW ISSUES AND COMPARE WITH RECORD, LIST OF ISSUES COMPILED BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.30); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE RE ISSUES (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.40
07/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/01/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALLS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.80
08/03/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS RE MINER STATUS (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PLAINTIFF'S COUNSEL RE DEATH OF MINER, UPCOMING HEARING, STATUS OF DEATH CERTIFICATE AND RELEASES (.3) PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/03/12	REVIEIWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	1.00
08/07/12	REVIEWING AND UPDATING DRAFT OF EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM FOR PENDING DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE (.4); VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.3); CONTACTING DR. ROSENBERG'S OFFICE FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL REPORT (.3) PARALEGAL: D T	1.00

08/09/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS AND DEADLINE (.1); REVIEW REPORT OF DR. ROSENBERG AND COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE (.2); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1); REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS AND COMPARE WITH RECORDS SUBMITTED (.2); CONFIRM DEPOSITION SCHEDULE (.1); REVIEW X-RAY EVIDENCE; DESIGNATE ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE (.1); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1); REVIEW PROPOSED EVIDENCE SUMMARY AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE (.2); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1) PARTNER: PEF	1.20
08/09/12	REVIEWING EVIDENCE AND DRAFTING EVIDENCE SUMMARY PURSUANT TO AFFIRMATIVE DEADLINE BEFORE THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE PARALEGAL: D T	1.00
08/09/12	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL AND DRAFTING PREHEARING REPORT PARALEGAL: D T	.80
08/09/12	DRAFTING COVER LETTER TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/09/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM FOR DR. SCOTT'S READING PARALEGAL: D T	.30
08/09/12	DISCUSSING CLAIM WITH ATTORNEY FOR COMPLETION OF EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT PARALEGAL: D T	.30
08/09/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/09/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/13/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20

08/14/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/15/12	REVIEW REVISED DEPOSITION SCHEDULE AND DEADLINES PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/15/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE RE DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/15/12	DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/15/12	PROCESSING NOTICE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING NOTICE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/16/12	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE WHICH MATERIALS TO SEND TO DR. ZALDIVAR IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: TMH	2.30
08/16/12	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE AND INDEX TO DR. ZALDIVAR ENCLOSING ADDITIONAL MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: TMH	.40
08/16/12	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM ST. MARY'S HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/17/12	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION, AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND REVIEWED BY OTHER PHYSICIANS PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/17/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR PARTNER: PEF	.10

08/17/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO DEADLINE FOR NEW ISSUES BEFORE THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/20/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S DEATH CERTIFICATE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/20/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO COURT REPORTER AND DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/22/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, REPORT OF DR. ZALDIVAR, OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD, PATHOLOGY REPORT OF DR. OESTERLING, DEATH CERTIFICATE RECEIVED FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL, TO PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.80
08/22/12	TRAVEL TO AND DEPOSE DR. ZALDIVAR PARTNER: PEF	1.30
08/22/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL FOR DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.70
08/23/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM COUNSEL FOR DIRECTOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/24/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REGARDING PENDING HEARING AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/27/12	REVIEW REPORT OF DR. ROSENBERG AND COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE AND ISSUES TO PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.80
08/27/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DR. ROSENBERG TO CONFIRM MATERIALS REVIEWED FOR DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.20

08/27/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING UPCOMING HEARING, EVIDENCE ISSUES AND PROPOSED DEADLINES PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/27/12	DEPOSE DR. ROSENBERG PARTNER: PEF	.70
08/27/12	REVIEW VOICEMAIL MESSAGE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND RELATED INFORMATION FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING STATUS OF MOTION FOR CONTINUANCE AND JUDGE'S REQUIREMENT THAT PARTIES APPEAR FOR HEARING PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/27/12	REVIEIWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL FOR DEPOSITON PARALEGAL: KC	.90
08/27/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG, COURT REPORTER AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/28/12	PREPARED MEDICAL SUMMARY FROM ST. MARY'S FOR HEARING EXHIBITS. PARALEGAL: SL	1.10
08/28/12	PREPARED EXHIBIT PACKET FOR CLAIMANT. PARALEGAL: SL	1.00
08/28/12	DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM LOGAN GENERAL HOSPITAL PURSUANT TO THE NOTICE OF HEARING PARALEGAL: D T	1.20
08/28/12	PREPARING CLAIM FILE EMPLOYER'S EXHIBITS FOR HEARING PARALEGAL: D T	.50
08/29/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, ISSUES, EVIDENCE; PREPARE FOR HEARING PARTNER: PEF	.80
08/29/12	TRAVEL TO AND APPEAR FOR HEARING PARTNER: PEF	3.20

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.00937

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL, SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

103.50

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/12/12 REVIEW FEE PETITION FILED BY CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
(.30); COMPARE WITH CASE MATERIALS AND RECORD
AND PROCEDURAL HISTORY, AND EVIDENCE SUBMITTED
BY CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.20)
PARTNER: PEF

08/15/12 RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER
AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
PARALEGAL: UV

08/22/12 REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW
JUDGE REGARDING FEE PETITION
PARALEGAL: D T

TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED \$

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.00961

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/13/12	REVIEWING TRANSCRIPT FROM HEARING AND VERIFYING STATUS OF CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.20
07/23/12	REVIEWING AND PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/10/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, ISSUES AND EVIDENCE FOR CLOSING ARGUMENT PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/10/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO OFFICE OF CLERK OF JUDGE PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/10/12	DRAFT MOTION TO EXTEND DEADLINES PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/10/12	CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/10/12	TELEPHONE CALLS WITH SETH O'QUINN'S OFFICE CONCERNING REQUEST FOR EXTENSION OF TIME TO FILE CLOSING ARGUMENT PARALEGAL: TMH	.20
08/10/12	PREPARE DRAFT OF MOTION TO EXTEND TIME TO FILE PETITION FOR REVIEW AND SUPPORTING BRIEF PARALEGAL: TMH	.40
08/10/12	PROCESSING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20

Payable Upon Receipt

08/23/12 RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV

.10

TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

\$ 289.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.00974

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL, SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

Sep 1, 2012

EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.

FILE NUMBER: P0495.00974

INVOICE NO.: 458238

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES ______

07/25/12 RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORT FROM DR. MEYER AND .20 UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

PARALEGAL: UV

14.00 TOTAL FEES: \$

14.00 TOTAL FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

> INVOICE TOTAL 14.00

========

PAGE

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01005

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL, SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/20/12 REVIEW EMAIL FROM L. KLAUS (.10); REVIEW CASE .50
MATERIALS AND ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE ORDERS
(.30); EMAIL TO L. KLAUS (.10)
PARTNER: PEF

07/30/12 RECEIPT OF NOTICE OF EMPLOYER'S FILING OF
RESPONDENT'S BRIEF AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC
CLAIM FILE
PARALEGAL: UV

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 96.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01019

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL, SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

	DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES	
07/11/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/25/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/31/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR DENYING BENEFITS AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE (.20); DRAFTING LETTER TO THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.20) PARALEGAL: D T	.40
08/02/12	REVIEW AND SIGN RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/02/12	REVIEW DECISION OF DISTRICT DIRECTOR, INCLUDING EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY U.S. DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.2), COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN CASE MATERIALS, RESPONSE FROM CLAIMANT (.2), REVIEW STATUS OF DISCOVERY AND CASE DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF DECISION(.2) PARTNER: PEF	.60
08/02/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/29/12	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RESPONSE TO PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01026

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/10/12	REVIEWING CONSULTING REPORT RECEIVED FROM DR. ZALDIVAR (.20); DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE (.20) PARALEGAL: UV	.40
07/11/12	REVIEW REPORT OF DR. ZALDIVAR TO COMPARE WITH CASE MATERIALS AND OTHER MEDICAL OPINION IN THE RECORD (.30); CHECK STATUS OF RADIOGRAPHIC EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.50
07/11/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/16/12	DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING STATUS OF REPORT PARALEGAL: UV	.30
07/20/12	REVIEWING AND PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/15/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT CLAIMANT'S DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/23/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CAMC REGARDING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/29/12	REVIEW DECISION OF DISTRICT DIRECTOR AWARDING BENEFITS, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR IN COMPARISON WITH EVIDENCE IN THE RECORD PARTNER: PEF	.50

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 File 122/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

08/29/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/29/12	DRAFTING RESPONSE TO AWARD ORDER TO THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND REQUESTING HEARING BEFORE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE PARALEGAL: UV	.30
08/29/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR DENYING BENEFITS AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/29/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL DEVELOPMENT PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/29/12	DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/30/12	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS AND STATUS OF RECORD DEVELOPMENT PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/30/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR CONTESTING ALL ISSUES AND REQUESTING A DE NOVO HEARING PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 415.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01043

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL, SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/19/12	REVIEW VOICEMAIL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND CASE MATERIALS (.10); CHECK EMAILS FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES (.30); DIRECT STAFF RE ACTION (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.50
07/20/12	PHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT COUNSEL CONCERNING LATE INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: SL	.20
07/23/12	PREPARED RESPONSE TO CLAIMANT'S INTERROGATORIES AND REQUEST FOR DOCUMENTS PARALEGAL: SL	1.30
08/02/12	REVIEWING PLAINTIFFS INTERROGATORIES, REQUESTS, FOR PRODUCTION, AND REQUESTS FOR ADMISSION (.8); REVIEW CLAIM MATERIAL FOR RELEVANT INFORMATION PER RESPONSES AND PRODUCTION (1.5); DRAFTING ANSWERS AND RESPONSES (.7) PARALEGAL: D T	3.00
08/03/12	REVIEW AND EDIT RESPONSES TO INTERROGATORIES AND REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION (.6); REVIEW X-RAY AND CT SCAN FILMS CURRENTLY IN POSSESSION (.3); REVIEW EVIDENCE SUBMITTED AND EXCHANGED TO DATE (.2); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1) PARTNER: PEF	1.20

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 595.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01071

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL, SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/20/12 RECEIPT OF EMPLOYER'S NOTICE OF APPEAL AND .20

UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

PARALEGAL: UV

08/30/12 RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER .20

AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

PARALEGAL: UV

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 28.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01089

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/19/12	PREPARED AND FILED NOTICE OF APPEAL PARALEGAL: SL	.50
07/19/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/20/12	TELEPHONE CALL WITH CLARICE COOK CONCERNING APPEAL TO BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD PARALEGAL: TMH	.10
07/31/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLERK'S OFFICE OF BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/10/12	RECEIPT OF BENEFIT REVIEW BOARD'S NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/13/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DIRECTOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/17/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE OFFICE OF THE SOLICITOR REGARDING NEW COUNSEL PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/17/12	DRAFTING INITIAL SUMMARY SHEET PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/17/12	UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINE FOR BRIEF PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/22/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.10

08/29/12	FILE ANALYSIS IN PREPARATION FOR APPEAL BRIEF PARTNER: SES	2.30
08/30/12	LEGAL RESEARCH CONCERNING APPEAL ISSUES AND CASES PENDING WITH RELATED ISSUES (2.2); REVIEW PRIOR BRIEFS (.7); DRAFTING NEW ARGUMENTS (4.5) PARTNER: SES	7.40
08/31/12	DRAFTING BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF APPEAL (3.0); ADDITIONAL LEGAL RESEARCH (1.2) PARTNER: SES	4.20
08/31/12	RESEARCH AND COMPILING CASE LAW REGARDING PPACA AND OTHER ISSUES PARALEGAL: SL	.80
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 2494.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01112

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,

CHARLESTON, WEST VIRGINIA

SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/27/12 REVIEW NEW CASE MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM .60 UNDERWRITERS, STATUS, PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES; COMPARE WITH PREVIOUS CASE HISTORY PARTNER: PEF 08/28/12 REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM .20 THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR PARALEGAL: UV .10 08/28/12 CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK PARALEGAL: UV 08/28/12 REOPENING CLIENT MATTER .10 PARALEGAL: UV 08/28/12 IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM .30 FILE PARALEGAL: UV .20 08/28/12 DRAFTING CLAIM SUMMARY SHEET PARALEGAL: UV 08/28/12 DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES .10 PARALEGAL: UV 08/28/12 DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT .20 PARALEGAL: UV 08/28/12 DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION .20 PARALEGAL: UV 08/28/12 REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF .50 ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, EXAMINATION REPORT AND TEST RESULTS FROM DR. RASMUSSEN PARALEGAL: UV

Payable Upon Receipt

08/28/12	DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION STRATEGY PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/28/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD X-RAY FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/28/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR REREADING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/29/12	REVIEW PLEADINGS AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH SPECIAL OBJECTIONS PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/29/12	REVIEW PAST DISCOVERY, CURRENT DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/29/12	CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR RE SAME PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/29/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/29/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/29/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/30/12	DRAFT EMAIL TO UNDERWRITERS AND PATRIOT WITH LITIGATION PLAN AND ESTIMATED BUDGET PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/31/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING PRIOR STATE OP CLAIMS PARALEGAL: UV	.30

INVOICE TOTAL

504.50

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01136

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

CHARLESTON, WEST VIRGINIA

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/13/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL FROM WELCH COMMUNITY HOSPITAL REGARDING PATHOLOGY PARALEGAL: KC	.50
07/25/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY PARALEGAL: KC	.50
07/26/12	REVIEWING STATUS OF CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO AFFIRMATIVE DEADLINE BEFORE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.30); DETERMINING STATUS OF REQUEST FOR PATHOLOGY SLIDES AND MEDICAL RECORDS (.10); DRAFTING INITIAL EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM (.10) PARALEGAL: D T	.50
07/26/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY PARALEGAL: KC	.90
08/02/12	REVIEW SITUATION WITH ATTEMPTS TO GET CURRENT RELEASE PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/02/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/02/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO WELCH COMMUNITY HOSPITAL REGARDING PATHOLOGY (.4): DRAFTING REQUEST FOR PATHOLOGY (.2): DRAFTING REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RELEASE (.2) PARALEGAL: KC	.80
08/02/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20

08/03/12	REVIEIWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.70
08/03/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/06/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/08/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM WELCH COMMUNITY HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/08/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM STEVENS CLINIC PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/13/12	REVIEW INFORMATION REGARDING DISCOVERY PROBLEMS, ATTEMPTS TO CONTACT CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE SAME PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/13/12	REVIEW EVIDENCE OF RECORD (.4) CHECK FOR ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FROM PLAINTIFF'S LAWYER IN LIGHT OF UPCOMING HEARING AND DEADLINES (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/13/12	DRAFT EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT PLAN FOR HEARING PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/14/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL FOR STATUS OF RELEASE PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/14/12	REVIEWING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/14/12	REVIEWING DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS FOR RELEVANT INFORMATION PARALEGAL: D T	.40
08/14/12	REVIEWING DEATH CERTIFICATE FOR INFORMATION PERTAINING TO AUTOPSY PARALEGAL: D T	.10

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 File 1729/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

08/14/12	REVIEWING AUTOPSY REPORT FROM DR. DY PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/14/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL REGARDING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/16/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/16/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL REGARDING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.10
08/17/12	REVIEIWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/17/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM WELCH COMMUNITY HOSPITAL REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/20/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. SEIKALI REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/29/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: KC	.60
08/30/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	1.00
08/30/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY PARALEGAL: KC	.60

INVOICE TOTAL

963.50

========

\$

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01166

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

______ 07/26/12 REVIEWING STATUS OF REQUEST FOR AUTOPSY .30 REPORT AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH ADDITIONAL INFORMATION PARALEGAL: D T 08/08/12 REVIEW VOICEMAIL MESSAGES FROM CLAIMANT'S .30 COUNSEL (.1); CHECK STATUS OF DEVELOPMENT(.2) PARTNER: PEF 08/08/12 REVIEWING REPORT FROM DR. OESTERLING .20 PARALEGAL: D T 08/08/12 REVIEWING CLAIM FILE FOR STATUS OF LITIGATION .20 PARALEGAL: D T 08/08/12 CHECK FOR FURTHER EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT .20 PARALEGAL: D T 08/08/12 RECEIPT OF CONSULTING REPORT FROM DR. .20 OESTERLING AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV 08/09/12 REVIEW REPORT OF DR. OESTERLING; COMPARE WITH .40 AUTOPSY REPORT AND OTHER EVIDENCE PARTNER: PEF 08/09/12 TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL .10 PARTNER: PEF .60 08/10/12 TELEPHONE CALL FROM AND CONFERENCE WITH CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE DEADLINES, SUGGESTED MOTION TO JUDGE RE SAME, EVIDENCE TO BE DEVELOPED BY BOTH PARTIES (.5); EMAIL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL WITH DR. OESTERLING REPORT (.1)PARTNER: PEF

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 File 122/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

08/13/12	PHONE CALL TO DR. STEPHEN BUSH REQUESTING A PATHOLOGY REPORT. PARALEGAL: SL	.10	
08/13/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT EXHIBITS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
08/14/12	PHONE CALL TO DR. STEPHEN BUSH REGARDING PATHOLOGY REPORT PARALEGAL: SL	.10	
08/14/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S RELEASE FORMS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
08/15/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
08/16/12	REVIEW PROCEDURAL HISTORY, HISTORY OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT, PROJECTED DATES OF EVIDENCE COMPLETION (.2), AND EDIT REQUEST MOTION TO REMAND (.2) PARTNER: PEF	.40	
08/16/12	PREPARED PACKET TO BE SENT TO DR. BUSH FOR CONSULTING OPINION PARALEGAL: SL	.80	
08/16/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. BUSH (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. BUSH (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
08/22/12	REVIEWING SUBMISSION OF PATHOLOGY REPORT FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARALEGAL: D T	.10	
08/24/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	507.00

========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01168

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/17/12 RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV

.20

INVOICE TOTAL

14.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01176

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

.10 07/23/12 RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV .50 07/24/12 REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.20); UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS (.10); VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.20) PARALEGAL: UV .50 08/01/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM GENESIS HEALTHCARE PARALEGAL: KC 08/03/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM .30 CAMC REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC 08/06/12 REVIEW NOTICE OF HEARING AND STATUS OF CASE .70 DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF HEARING SCHEDULE, EVIDENCE IN RECORD TO DATE, REPORTS OF EXAMINATION, CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE, AND STATUS OF RECORD DEVELOPMENT PARTNER: PEF 08/06/12 REVIEWING AND CATAOGING X-RAYS .50 PARALEGAL: KC .50 08/08/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR X-RAYS RECEIVED FROM MT. CARMEL ST ANNS HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: KC .50 08/09/12 REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC

08/13/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. BUTTERFIELD PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/15/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM MT CARMEL ST. ANNS HOSPITAL REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/20/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM GOOD SAMARITAN MEDICAL CLINIC PARALEGAL: D T	1.00
08/20/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF PRIOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM GOOD SAMARITAN MEDICAL CLINIC PARALEGAL: D T	1.20
08/20/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. BUTTERFIELD'S OFFICE PARALEGAL: D T	.80
08/20/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM MOUNT CARMEL HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: D T	1.50
08/20/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM GENESIS HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/21/12	REVIEW MEDICAL ISSUES AND OPTIONS FOR CONSULTING OPINION FOR HEARING (.20;, DIRECT ADDITIONAL CONSULTING OPINION AND DEPOSITIONS(.20) PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/22/12	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR DEPOSITION OF DR. ROSENBERG PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/22/12	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR DEPOSITION OF DR. RENN PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/22/12	DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. ROSENBERG FOR CONSULTING OPINION PARALEGAL: D T	.40
08/22/12	DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. RENN FOR CONSULTING OPINION PARALEGAL: D T	.40

08/22/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FOR RELEVANT MATERIAL FOR DOCTORS REVIEW PARALEGAL: D T	.40
08/22/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	1.50
08/22/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/22/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/22/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. RENN (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. RENN (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/23/12	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. RENN AND TO DR. ROSENBERG FOR CONSULTING OPINIONS AND COMPARING WITH CASE MATERIALS, ISSUES AND EVIDENCE OF RECORD PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/23/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. RENN AND DR. ROSENBERG PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/27/12	REVIEIWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
08/28/12	REVIEW EMAIL FROM DR. RENN AND DIRECT STAFF RE OBTAINING CONSULTING OPINION PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/29/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/29/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20

08/29/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM MT CARMEL ST. ANNES HOPSITAL REGRIDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/31/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. RENN REGARDING DEPOSITION	.20
	PARALEGAL: KC	
08/31/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. RENN REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
	PARALEGAL: RC	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 1307.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01235

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/16/12	CHECK STATUS OF DEVELOPMENT AND REVIEW CASE MATERIA, DIRECTOR EXHIBITS, AND EVIDENCE SUBMITTED INTO THE RECORD TO DAY (.50); CHECK STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORDS (.20); REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS RELATIVE TO ISSUES (.50) PARTNER: PEF	1.20
07/30/12	RECEIPT OF LETTER; CAMC - NO MEDS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/10/12	DETERMINE EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT NECESSARY PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/13/12	REVIEW OF FILE AND SEVERAL PHONE CALLS AND DRAFT LETTER TO JOHN CLINE REQUESTING AUTOPSY SLIDES BACK. PARALEGAL: SL	.70
08/14/12	PREPARED INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL AUTHORIZATION FOR SPOUSE PARALEGAL: SL	.50
08/14/12	DRAFTED REQUEST FOR CONSULTING OPINION FROM DR. OESTERLING AND PREPARED PACKET TO BE SENT PARALEGAL: SL	.50
08/14/12	RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY SLIDES FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/14/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. OESTERLING (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. OESTERLING (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

08/15/12 CONFIRM AVAILABILITY OF DR. OESTERLING AND

NT/CI

REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. OESTERLING

FOR CONSULTATION, COMPARE WITH MATERIALS

REVIEWED BY OTHER PATHOLOGISTS

PARTNER: PEF

08/15/12 REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR.

.10

.40

OESTERLING PARTNER: PEF

INVOICE TOTAL

474.50

=========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01254

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

1.00

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/13/12 REVIEW OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBIT FROM DOL

PARALEGAL: SL

08/14/12 CONTINUED REVIEW OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS FOR 3.00

DOL

PARALEGAL: SL

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 280.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01304

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL, SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

PARALEGAL: KC

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

	DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES	
08/01/12	RECEIPT OF CLMT'S REQUEST FOR MODIFICATION OF 1-26-11 DENIAL ENCL. RADIOLOGY REPORT; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/08/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD X-RAY FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (.2); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR RE-READING OF X-RAY FILM SUBMITTED BY CLAIMANT (.2) PARALEGAL: UV	.40
08/09/12	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM RAYMOND SMITH RE MODIFICATION AND WITH NEW EVIDENCE (.3); REVIEW CASE MATERIALS AND STATUS; CHECK FOR ANY ACTION BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.2); EMAIL TO J. LINDEN AND UNDERWRITERS RE STATUS (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.60
08/09/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY; SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL; CHECK STATUS OF FILMS PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/09/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/10/12	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/10/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CAMC	.40

08/13/12 CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM, SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUESTING PRODUCTION PARTNER: PEF	.20	
08/13/12 CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR REPORT, SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER PARTNER: PEF	.20	
08/13/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
08/20/12 RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
08/21/12 RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
INVOICE TOTAL	\$	345.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01317

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/01/12 REVIEW PETITION FOR REVIEW AND BRIEF TO BRB
FILED BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
PARTNER: PEF

08/01/12 EMAIL TO GREENBERG TRAURIG RE BRIEFING
PARTNER: PEF

08/01/12 RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR'S PETITION FOR REVIEW;
UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH
INVOICE TOTAL
\$ 63.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01377

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/13/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM ST FRANCIS HOSPITAL REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
07/26/12	REVIEW OF RESEARCH ON NEW 4TH CIRCUIT CASE RELATED TO PREAMBLE LANGUAGE RELIED UPON BY JUDGES (.40); REVISIONS TO BRIEF TO INCORPORATE NEW PRECEDENT (.10); ANALYSIS OF WORK HISTORY DETAIL TO INSURE AFFORDABLE CARE ACT PRESUMPTION APPLIES (.40); FINAL BRIEF REVISIONS (.30) PARTNER: SES	2.10
07/26/12	REVISE AND EDIT ARGUMENTS RELATIVE TO PHYSICIAN OPINIONS AND PREAMBLE TO REGULATIONS IN LIGHT OF RECENT OPINIONS OF JUDGE MORGAN RE SAME PARTNER: PEF	1.40
07/27/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S BRIEF AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/27/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE TO REFLECT FILING OF CLOSING ARGUMENT ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/06/12	RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR'S CLOSING BRIEF AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/09/12	REVIEWING PLEADING FROM THE OFFICE OF THE SOLICITOR AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.20

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 19/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/13/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE DIRECTOR AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/13/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. RANAVAYA AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/16/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. RANAVAYA'S OFFICE PARALEGAL: D T	.30
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 703.50
		=======

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01455

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL, SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012 DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES 07/10/12 PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, .40 HAND DELIVER (.30); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME (.10) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB 07/11/12 RECEIPT OF LTR FROM CLMT ATTORNEY REQUESTING . 20 X-RAY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH 07/11/12 RECEIPT OF CLMT EVIDENCE TO DOL, B-READER .20 THOMAS MILLER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH 07/12/12 REVIEW ADDITIONAL READINGS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS, .50 OTHER X-RAY EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND DESIGNATE EVIDENCE (.30); REVIEW PROBLEMS WITH DISCOVERY (.20)PARTNER: PEF 07/12/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF REREADING 1.30 OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (.20); DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS REOUESTING STATUS OF REPORTS (.10); RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF FAXED REPORTS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.20); DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY (.40); DRAFTING MOTION TO DISMISS CLAIM AS ABANDONED FOR FAILURE TO PROVIDE ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE (.40) PARALEGAL: UV 07/13/12 REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS TO COMPARE .40 WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES AND DESIGNATE EVIDENCE (.30); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE

TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH REPORT OF DR. SCOTT (.10) PARTNER: PEF

07/13/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF REBUTTAL EVIDENCE PARALEGAL: UV	.30
07/13/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/16/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING OUR REQUEST FOR ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE; AND HIS REQUEST FOR DR. ZALDIVAR'S X-RAY FILM; UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/20/12	REVIEWING AND PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV	.10
07/31/12	RECEIPT OF ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/01/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES TO DETERMINE RECORDS NEEDED IN DEFENSE OF CLAIM (.3); INTERNET RESEARCH FOR AREA OF EXPERTISE AND CONTACT INFORMATION OF PHYSICIANS NAMED BY CLAIMANT (.3); DRAFTING MULTIPLE REQUESTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS AND RADIOLOGY FILMS (.4) PARALEGAL: UV	1.00
08/06/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL REGARDING RECORD REQUEST PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/07/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH BOONE MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/13/12	REVIEW UPCOMING DEADLINES AND STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/13/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY PROBLEMS, NEED FOR EXTENSION OR MOTION TO COMPEL PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/13/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTION NEEDED AT EMPLOYER'S DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	.20

PARALEGAL:	UV

	IIIdillioilli. ov	
08/13/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS PARALEGAL: UV	.30
08/13/12	DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/16/12	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/21/12	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/21/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISC FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISC PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/23/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 606.50
		=========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01516

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

.40

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/10/12 PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR,
HAND DELIVER (.30); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM
FILE REGARDING THE SAME (.10)
ADMINISTRATIVE: LB

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 28.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01531

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/13/12	REVIEW PLEADING FROM DOL, EVIDENCE DEVELOPED BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, REPORT OF DR. GAZIANO AND TEST RESULTS, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.4), COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN CASE MATERIALS AND RECORD, ISSUES BEING CONTESTED (.2) PARTNER: PEF	.60
08/14/12	REVIEW STATUS OF DISCOVERY BY UNDERWRITERS, DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/14/12	REVIEW PLEADING, SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/14/12	CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM, SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUESTING PRODUCTION PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/14/12	CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR REVIEW, SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/14/12	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/14/12	CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/14/12	RE-OPENING CLIENT MATTER PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/14/12	IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20

08/14/12	DRAFTING CLAIM SUMMARY SHEET PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/14/12	DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/14/12	DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/14/12	DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/14/12	REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/14/12	REVIEWING EXAMINATION REPORTS BY DR. GAZIANO AND AUTOPSY REPORT FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER PARALEGAL: UV	.30
08/14/12	DRAFTING PROPOSED TASK LIST PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/14/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD X-RAY FILMS TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/14/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR REREADING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/14/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/14/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20

08/16/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND ORGANIZING CASE MATERIALS ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.50
08/17/12	RECEIPT OF DOL TO DR. WHEELER ENCLOSING X-RAY; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/23/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/27/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS FROM PRIOR 1999 CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.30
08/27/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES TO DETERMINE RECORDS NEEDED IN DEFENSE OF CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV	.30
08/28/12	CONFIRM EXAMINATION STATUS AND DEADLINES, PROJECTED DATES OF EVIDENCE COMPLETION PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/28/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/28/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR SCHEDULING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/28/12	DRAFTING NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT AND TRAVELING VOUCHER PARALEGAL: UV	.30
08/28/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/30/12	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM LOGAN GENERAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10

Payable Upon Receipt

INVOICE NO.: 458238

08/30/12 REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISC TO

DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISC

PARALEGAL: UV

08/30/12 REVIEWING 1999 CLAIM FILE AND ANALYZING

MEDICAL RECORDS IN THAT FILE TO DETERMINE

RELEVANCY IN CURRENT

PARALEGAL: UV

INVOICE TOTAL

\$ 564.50

.20

.40

========

Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186 Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01540

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

.50

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/30/12 RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING

	(.10); REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS (.30); VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.20) PARALEGAL: UV	
07/31/12	REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S OFFICE AND ISSUES FOR PENDING HEARING PARALEGAL: D T	.30
08/02/12	REVIEW NOTICE OF HEARING AND COMPARE WITH SCHEDULE, DEADLINES PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/02/12	CHECK STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF NOTICE OF HEARING, INCLUDING CHECKING FOR RECEIPT OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND CHECKING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/15/12	PROCESSING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01545

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/19/12	CHECK STATUS OF CASE AND REVIEW CASE MATERIALS AND DEADLINES (.30); CHECK FOR RECEIPT OF ANY ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE BY CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.40	
08/16/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S REQUEST FOR EXTENSION OF TIME AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/20/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
08/21/12	DOCKETING UPDATING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES PURSUANT TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR EXTENSION ORDER PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	94.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01557

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL, SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/12/12	RECEIPT OF DOL TO DR. MEYER X-RAY ENCLOSED; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/01/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND HISTORY OF DISCOVERY PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/01/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/01/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF REREADING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (.2); DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. MEYER REGARDING STATUS OF REPORT (.1) PARALEGAL: UV	.30
08/01/12	PROCESSING REQUEST TO CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/08/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE (.2); DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. MEYER IN FOLLOW-UP TO STATUS OF REREADING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (.1); DRAFTING MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME AND MOTION TO COMPEL INTERROGATORIES (.3) PARALEGAL: UV	.60
08/10/12	REVIEW PROJECTED DATES FOR COMPLETION OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT AS COMPARED WITH DEADLINES IMPOSED BY DOL PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/10/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10

08/10/12	HAND DELIVERING MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME TO THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/10/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/10/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING HAND DELIVERED CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/13/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORT FROM DR. MEYER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/13/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING REPORT FROM DR. MEYER PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/13/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF MEYER READING AS REBUTTAL EVIDENCE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/13/12	DRAFTING REFERRAL LETTER TO DR. ZALDIVAR PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/13/12	PREPARING REFERRAL PACKET FOR DR. ZALDIVAR'S REVIEW PARALEGAL: UV	.30
08/14/12	REVIEW REPORT FROM UNIVERSITY OF CINCINNATI, COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/14/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/14/12	CONFIRM EXAMINATION SCHEDULE AND REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO PHYSICIAN FOR REVIEW, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS RE WORK HISTORY PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/14/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR PARTNER: PEF	.10

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/14/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/14/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/21/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/29/12	RECEIPT OF ZALDIVAR REPORT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/30/12	REVIEW REPORT OF DR. ZALDIVAR; COMPARE WITH REPORT OF DR. RASMUSSEN AND OTHER EVIDENCE PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/30/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS AND DRAFT RESPONSE TO DENIAL OF EXTENSION REQUEST PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/30/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); HAND DELIVER CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.40
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 610.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01579

OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/19/12 RECEIPT OF CLMT'S RESPONSE TO EMPLOYER

.20

INTERROGATORIES; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM

FILE

ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH

TOTAL FEES:

\$

14.00

INVOICE TOTAL

\$

14.00

========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01588

EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CO.
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/10/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL .70
RECORD AND RADIOLOGY FILM REQUESTS (.10);
REVIEWING AND ANALYZING UPDATED RECORDS
RECEIVED FROM DR. BLAYDES (.30); TELEPHONE CALL
TO DR. FOREHAND, CINCH VALLEY PHYSICIANS INC.,
AND EAST RIVER MEDICAL TO FOLLOW UP ON RECORD
REQUEST (.30)
PARALEGAL: UV

- 07/10/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAY .50
 TO FORWARD TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
 PARALEGAL: KC
- 07/11/12 REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND COMPARE
 WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD (.30); REVIEW
 CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE AND MEDICAL RECORDS, X-RAY
 REPORTS (.30); DESIGNATE EVIDENCE FOR
 SUBMISSION AND FOR CASE IN CHIEF EVIDENCE (.20)
 PARTNER: PEF
- 07/11/12 CONFIRM EVIDENCE SUBMISSIONS AND REVIEW

 SAME(.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S

 COUNSEL WITH TWO EVIDENCE SUBMISSIONS (.10);

 REVIEW STATUS OF FILM AND DEADLINES (.20); SIGN

 CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE AND MOTION TO HOLD THE

 RECORD OPEN (.20)

 PARTNER: PEF
- 07/11/12 REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR HEARING, EVIDENCE,
 ISSUES (.50); DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF DR.
 WHEELER'S READING (.20); REVIEWING SUBMISSIONS
 BY CLAIMANT AND DRAFTING REQUEST FOR FILM
 (.40); DRAFTING MOTION TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE
 LAW JUDGE TO HOLD RECORD OPEN (.40); DRAFTING
 EVIDENCE SUMMARY AND PREHEARING REPORT (1.30);
 DRAFTING LETTER TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.20)
 PARALEGAL: D T

07/11/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/11/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/11/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/12/12	REVIEWING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT FOR COMPLETION OF EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT PARALEGAL: D T	.40
07/12/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
07/13/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAY TO FORWARD TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARALEGAL: KC	.60
07/18/12	REVIEW PROPOSED EVIDENCE SUMMARY AND PREHEARING REPORT AND COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN CASE MATERIALS AND RECORD (.50); CONFIRM PROCEDURAL HISTORY (.20); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL WITH REQUIRED EVIDENCE SUMMARY (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.80
07/18/12	REVISED EVIDENCE SUMMARY AND PREPARED FOR FILING. PARALEGAL: SL	.50
07/18/12	RECEIPT OF MED RECORDS; DR. SEKKARIE; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
07/18/12	RECEIPT OF MED RECORDS; DR. ASHUTOSH; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

07/18/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/19/12	RECEIPT OF CLMT'S PRELIMINARY EVIDENCE SUMMARY; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
07/23/12	REVIEWING STATUS OF REQUEST FOR FILM TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARALEGAL: D T	.10
07/23/12	REVIEWING AND PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV	.10
07/24/12	REVIEWING STATUS OF REQUEST FOR FILM TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND RECIEPT OF FILM (.20); DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. WHEELER FOR READING OF FILM (.20) PARALEGAL: D T	.40
07/24/12	RECEIPT OF X-RAY FILM FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/24/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/25/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAY TO FORWARD TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARALEGAL: KC	.40
07/26/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL PARALEGAL: KC	.20
07/27/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE FOR ADDITIONAL MATERIAL FOR DR. ZALDIVAR'S REVIEW (.70); DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.20); SPEAK WITH DR. ZALDIVAR'S OFFICE (.20); REVIEWING STATUS OF RESPONSE TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING ISSUES AND UPDATING CLAIM (.10) PARALEGAL: D T	1.20

07/27/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL FOR DR. ZALDIVAR PARALEGAL: KC	.70
07/30/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS; PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.90
07/30/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL (.20); TELEPHONE CALL TO CORBIN MEDICAL CENTER REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS (.20) PARALEGAL: KC	.40
07/31/12	CONFERENCE WITH DR. ZALDIVAR RE ISSUES FOR DEPOSITION (.50); DEPOSE DR. ZALDIVAR (.10) PARTNER: PEF	1.50
07/31/12	REVIEWING RESPONSE FROM DR. WHEELER (.10) DRAFTING LETTER SUBMITTING READING (.20); UPDATING EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM WITH ADDITIONAL READING (.20) PARALEGAL: D T	.50
07/31/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL (1.00): TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION (.30) PARALEGAL: KC	1.30
07/31/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER FROM WHEELER, 5-26-12 FILM; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/01/12	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS, COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD (.2); DESIGNATE EVIDENCE (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/01/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/01/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20

08/02/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DIRECTOR'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/02/12	RECEIPT OF MED RECORDS; BLUEFIELD REGIONAL MEDICAL CENTER; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/06/12	REVIEWING STATUS OF CLAIM FILE TO PREPARE FOR HEARING; DRAFTING REQUEST FOR OFFICIAL TRANSCRIPT (.2); REVIEWING CLAIMANT'S SUBMISSION AND DRAFTING INDEX OF MATERIAL (.4); REVIEWING AND PREPARING EMPLOYER'S EXHIBITS FOR ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S REVIEW AND DRAFTING INDEX OF MATERIAL (.6); DRAFTING SUBMISSION FROM FOR DR. ZALDIVAR'S TESTIMONY (.2) PARALEGAL: D T	1.40
08/06/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND RECEIPT OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.30
08/07/12	REVIEW MATERIALS FOR HEARING (.5); CHECK STATUS OF EVIDENCE (.2); TRAVEL TO AND ATTEND HEARING IN BECKLEY, WV (1.8) PARTNER: PEF	2.50
08/07/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE SOLICITOR REGARDING HEARING AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/08/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM PRO 1 THERAPY PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/13/12	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/13/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
08/15/12	REVIEW REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION PARTNER: PEF	.10

Payable Upon Receipt

08/15/12	REVIEW FILM PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/15/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/15/12	DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO JOSEPH WOLFE ENCLOSING REQUESTED X-RAY FILMS PARALEGAL: UV	.30
08/15/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/15/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS TO FORWARD TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/17/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. ASHUTOSH'S OFFICE PARALEGAL: D T	.50
08/17/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. SEKKARIE'S OFFICE PARALEGAL: D T	.70
08/17/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORT OF DR. WHEELER; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/20/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
08/23/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	1.50
08/23/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS	.20
	PARALEGAL: KC	
08/29/12	TELEPHONE CALLS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.30
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 2855.00

=========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01618

EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP. P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,

SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/11/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO DR. ROSENBERG'S DEPOSITION TO DETERMINE IF DEPOSITION TO BE CANCELLED (.40); DISCUSSING CLAIM WITH ATTORNEY (.10) PARALEGAL: D T	.50
07/12/12	REVIEWING CLAIMANT'S SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE SUMMARY FOR NEW EVIDENCE AND VERIFYING STATUS OF EMPLOYER'S EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT (.40); REQUESTING DEPOSITIONS OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND DR. ROSENBERG BE CANCELLED (.10) PARALEGAL: D T	.50
07/13/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR, CLAIAMANT'S COUNSEL AND COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.60
07/16/12	CONFERENCE RE DEPOSITION SCHEDULING PROBLEMS (.10); REVIEW CASE MATERIALS (.20); DIRECT STAFF TO CANCEL DEPOSITIONS (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.40
07/16/12	TELEPHONE CALLS TO DR. ZALDIVAR'S OFFICE, DR. ROSENBERG'S OFFICE, BILLANTI & ASSOCIATES AND JOE WOLFE'S OFFICE TO CANCEL THE DEPOSITIONS OF DRS. ZALDIVAR AND ROSENBERG PARALEGAL: TMH	.50
07/19/12	CHECK FOR ANY ACTION BY CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.20); REVIEW CASE MATERIALS AND TESTIMONY OF WIDOW IN LAST HEARING (.20); REVIEW ISSUES AND EVIDENCE (.20); DIRECT STAFF RE ACTION (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.70
07/19/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM REGIONAL SOLICITOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

07/20/12	PHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT COUNSEL CONCERNING DECISION ON THE RECORD PARALEGAL: SL	.10
07/23/12	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL CONCERNING HEARING (.20); ANALYSIS OF CASE EVIDENCE/STATUS (.90); CORRESPONDENCE WITH JUDGE CONCERNING SUBMISSION ON THE RECORD AND REQUEST FOR EVIDENCE DEADLINE TO SUBMIT ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE (.30) PARTNER: SES	1.40
07/23/12	CONTACTING CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING PENDING HEARING AND OBTAINING INFORMATION FOR ATTORNEY'S REVIEW PARALEGAL: D T	1.00
07/23/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE OFFICE OF THE REGIONAL SOLICITOR REGARDING PENDING HEARING PARALEGAL: D T	.10
07/23/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/24/12	HEARING INFORMATION ANALYSIS (.40); CORRESPONDENCE AND TELEPHONE CALL WITH JUDGE'S CLERK (.20); CORRESPONDENCE PREPARED AND FAXED TO JUDGE (.20); TELEPHONE CALL WITH HEARING OFFICE TO INSURE CORRESPONDENCE RELATED TO SUBMISSION ON THE RECORD WAS DELIVERED TO JUDGE (.10); TELEPHONE CALL FROM JUDGE'S CLERK CONFIRMING DECISION TO SUBMIT CASE ON THE RECORD (.20) PARTNER: SES	1.10
07/24/12	CHECK FOR ANY RESPONSE OF CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE DECISION ON THE RECORD (.10); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.10); DIRECT STAFF RE CALLING CLERK OF JUDGE (.10); REVIEW INFORMATION RE SAME AND ACTION NECESSARY AND HEARING (.40) PARTNER: PEF	.70

07/24/12	DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING ISSUES OF HEARING AND UPDATING CLAIM (.50); NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CALLS TO DIFFERENT FACILITIES TO OBTAIN CONFIRMATION OF RECEIPT OF REQUESTS (1.00) PARALEGAL: D T	1.50
07/24/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
07/24/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/01/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE OF DECISION ON THE RECORD; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/02/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE SETTING CLOSING ARGUMENT DEADLINE AND SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE DEADLINES; UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.50
08/10/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/13/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. RENN REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/14/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/16/12	DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/16/12	DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION OF DR. ROSENBERG PARALEGAL: KC	.50

08/16/12	PROCESSING NOTICE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING NOTICE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/17/12	CHECK STATUS OF DEPOSITION SCHEDULING, DEPOSITION SCHEDULE AND CONFIRM APPROVAL BY CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/17/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/17/12	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE WHICH DOCUMENTS TO SEND TO DR. ROSENBERG IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION TESTIMONY PARALEGAL: TMH	1.60
08/20/12	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE WHICH DOCUMENTS TO SEND TO DR. ROSENBERG IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION TESTIMONY PARALEGAL: TMH	3.50
08/20/12	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE AND INDEX OF DOCUMENTS TO BE SENT TO DR. ROSENBERG IN PREPARATION OF HIS DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: TMH	.40
08/21/12	CONFIRM DEPOSITION SCHEDULE PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/21/12	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ROSENBERG FOR DEPOSITION AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/21/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/22/12	REVIEW ADDITIONAL MATERIALS BEING SENT TO PHYSICIAN FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND BEING DEVELOPED PARTNER: PEF	.40

08/22/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/22/12	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE WHICH RECORDS NEED TO BE SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: TMH	.90
08/22/12	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE AND INDEX TO DR. ZALDIVAR ENCLOSING DOCUMENTS FOR REVIEW IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: TMH	.20
08/22/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.10
08/23/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.10
08/24/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, REPORTS, DEPOSITIONS, ISSUES IN PREPARATION OF DEPOSITION OF DR. ROSENBERG PARTNER: PEF	.70
08/24/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION ISSUES PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/24/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COURT REPORTER RE DEPOSITION AND DEPOSITION EXHIBITS PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/24/12	DEPOSE DR. ROSENBERG PARTNER: PEF	1.00
08/24/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL FOR DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.80
08/24/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG, CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.30

Payable Upon Receipt

08/28/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL FOR DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	1.10	
08/28/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. DR. ZALDIVAR, COURT REPORTER AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.30	
08/31/12	REVIEW PROBLEM WITH DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS, DEADLINES PARTNER: PEF	.20	
08/31/12	CONFIRM CONTACT WITH CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEADLINES AND PROJECTED DATE OF RECEIPT OF EVIDENCE PARTNER: PEF	.20	
08/31/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE PARTNER: PEF	.10	
08/31/12	REVIEWING STATUS OF CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO DEADLINE FOR EVIDENCE PARALEGAL: D T	.20	
08/31/12	DRAFTING MOTION TO EXTEND TIME TO SUBMIT EVIDENCE PARALEGAL: D T	.40	
08/31/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	2707.00

========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01621

PEABODY COAL COMPANY C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL, SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/02/12 RECEIPT OF PEABODY'S REMAND BRIEF; UPDATING .20 ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 14.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01623

EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CO.
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/18/12	REVIEW DEADLINES FOR APPEAL; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS; EMAIL TO J. LINDEN REGARDING APPEAL PARTNER: PEF	.40
07/19/12	EMAILS FROM AND TO J. LINDEN RE APPEAL (.10); CONFIRM DEADLINES AND ACTION NECESSARY(.30); REVIEW DRAFT OF APPEAL(.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD(.10) PARTNER: PEF	.60
07/19/12	PREPARED AND FILED NOTICE OF APPEAL PARALEGAL: SL	.50
07/19/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/27/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL'S FEE PETITION AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/31/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLERK'S OFFICE OF BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS FOR REQUESTED INFORMATION PARTNER: PEF	.20
07/31/12	REVIEW FEE PETITIONS AND RESPONSE (.20); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.30
07/31/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING FEE PETITION (.20); DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.20) PARALEGAL: D T	.40

07/31/12	RECEIPT OF CLMT'S COUNSEL; WE REPRESENT BEFORE THE BRB; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
07/31/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/10/12	RECEIPT OF BENEFIT REVIEW BOARD'S NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/13/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DIRECTOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/17/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE OFFICE OF THE SOLICITOR REGARDING NEW COUNSEL PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/17/12	DRAFTING INITIAL SUMMARY SHEET PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/17/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/17/12	UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINE FOR BRIEF PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/22/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/22/12	CONTACTING ATTORNEY PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/24/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/29/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING FEE PETITION PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/31/12	RESEARCH AND COMPILING CASE LAW REGARDING PPACA AND OTHER ISSUES PARALEGAL: SL	.80

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01654

PEABODY COAL COMPANY C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL, SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/10/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL RELEASE FROM CLAIMANT (.20); DRAFTING SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES, MEDICAL RELEASE AND COVER LETTER (.20) PARALEGAL: UV	.40
07/11/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY (.10); CHECK PROCEDURAL HISTORY OF DISCOVERY (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL WITH SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.30
07/23/12	REVIEIWIG FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. HAUGHT REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
07/25/12	REVIEWING STATUS OF CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO EVIDENTIARY DEADLINE (.10); DRAFTING REQUEST TO SCHEDULE DEPOSITIONS OF DR. ROSENBERG AND DR. ZALDIVAR (.40); VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL DEVELOPMENT (.10) PARALEGAL: D T	.60
07/25/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
07/26/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
07/27/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
07/30/12	REVIEW ISSUES AND COMPARE WITH RECORD, LIST OF	.40

	ISSUES COMPILED BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.30); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE RE ISSUES (.10) PARTNER: PEF	
07/30/12	CONFIRM DEPOSITION DATES (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.20
07/30/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR DEVELOPMENT (.50): TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION (.40): DRAFTING REQUEST FOR DEPOSITION(.20): UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM (.10) PARALEGAL: KC	1.20
07/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/01/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
08/02/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/06/12	REVIEW DEADLINES; CHECK STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT; REVIEW EVIDENCE TO DATE (.3); CHECK FOR ANY EVIDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL; REVIEW DISCOVERY (.2); DIRECT EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.60
08/06/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES ND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20

08/07/12	REVIEWING CLAIM INFORMATION PURSUANT TO DEADLINE BEFORE THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.4); DRAFTING REQUEST TO SCHEDULE DEPOSITION OF DR. ROSENBERG (.3); VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.4); DRAFTING MOTION TO CONTINUE HEARING PURSUANT TO RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWER TO INTERROGATORIES (.4) PARALEGAL: D T	1.50
08/08/12	REVIEW MOTION TO CONTINUE (.1); CONFIRM CONTACT WITH CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE SAME (.1); CHECK STATUS OF CANCER RECORDS (.1); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/08/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/08/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/09/12	DRAFTING REQUSET TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	1.90
08/09/12	TELEPHONE CALLS TO MUTIPLE MEDICAL FACILITIES REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/10/12	TELEPHONE CALLS TO MULTIPLE MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/10/12	CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/13/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/13/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20

08/13/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION: TELEPHONE CALL TO COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/15/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR, CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/16/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM ALLEGHANY MEDICAL SERVICES AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/17/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE CONTINUING HEARING PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/20/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM PRINCETON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/20/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/20/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/22/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH X-RAY DIAGNOSTICS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/23/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM ALLEGHENY MEDICAL SERVICES PARALEGAL: D T	1.20
08/23/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DIRECTOR'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/24/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REGARDING PENDING HEARING AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.10

08/27/12	REVIEWING ISSUE OF PENDING HEARING AND CONFIRMING HEARING CONTINUED PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/29/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. LARSON PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/31/12	REVIEIWING CORRESPONDENCE FROM PRINCETON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.30
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 1321.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01676

EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/23/12 RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER .10 AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV 07/31/12 REVIEWING ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S DECISION .10 AWARDING BENEFITS ON MODIFICATION AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINE FOR APPEAL PARALEGAL: D T .10 08/13/12 RECEIPT OF EMPLOYER'S NOTICE OF APPEAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV 08/17/12 REVIEWING NOTICE OF APPEAL FROM THIRD PARTY .10 PARALEGAL: D T 28.00 \$ INVOICE TOTAL ========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01708

PEABODY COAL COMPANY
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/13/12	REVEWING AND CATAOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
07/23/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
07/24/12	REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.20); UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS (.10); VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT(.10); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATED MEDICAL RELEASE (.30) PARALEGAL: UV	.70
07/25/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/27/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS FROM GOOD SAMARITAN HOSPITAL AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS PARALEGAL: UV	.50
08/06/12	REVIEW NOTICE OF HEARING AND STATUS OF CASE DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF HEARING SCHEDULE, EVIDENCE IN RECORD TO DATE, REPORTS OF EXAMINATION, CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE, AND STATUS OF RECORD DEVELOPMENT PARTNER: PEF	.80
08/06/12	REVIEIWNG FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE PARALEGAL: KC	.50

08/10/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ULRICH REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/17/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OV X-RAYS FROM GENESIS HEALTH CARE PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/20/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
08/21/12	REVIEW EVIDENCE AND DIRECT EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT NECESSARY PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/23/12	REVIEW VARIOUS MEDICAL RECORDS FOR POSSIBLE SUBMISSION INTO RECORD OF CASE PARTNER: PEF	.60
08/23/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM COUNSEL FOR DIRECTOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/24/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REGARDING PENDING HEARING AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/27/12	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE STATUS OF DISCOVERY IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING PARALEGAL: TMH	.60
08/27/12	TELEPHONE CALL WITH CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REQUESTING STATUS OF DISCOVERY RESPONSES PARALEGAL: TMH	.10
08/27/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. ULRICH'S OFFICE PARALEGAL: D T	1.00
08/27/12	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR TESTIMONY OF DR. ROSENBERG PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/27/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM FOR DR. ULRICH'S MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: D T	.20

DOVICS I QCC

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

08/27/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM FOR DR. MUTCHLER'S REPORT PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/27/12	DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. RENN FOR REPORT PARALEGAL: D T	.30
08/28/12	REVIEW RECORDS BEING SUBMITTED AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO PLAINTIFF'S COUNSEL PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/28/12	REVIEW MEDICAL OPINION EVIDENCE PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/28/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/28/12	TELEPHONE CALL WITH CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL CONCERNING STATUS OF DISCOVERY RESPONSES PARALEGAL: TMH	.10
08/28/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSIONS (2) TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSIONS TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.30
08/29/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/29/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM GENESIS HEALTH CARE PARALEGAL: KC	.30

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 907.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01737

PEABODY COAL COMPANY C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL, SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/11/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT CLAIMANT'S DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/12/12	REVIEW EMAIL AND VOICEMAIL MESSAGE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT AND DEADLINES (.30); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.20); EMAIL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.60
07/12/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.20
07/16/12	DRAFTED RESPONSE TO CLAIMANT'S REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENT AND INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: SL	2.80
07/16/12	RECEIPT OF CLMT REQUEST FOR EXTENSION; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
07/19/12	RECEIPT OF DOL; EXTENSION GRANTED FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
07/20/12	DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINE PURSUANT TO RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR EXTENSION ORDER PARALEGAL: UV	.10
07/27/12	REVISIONS TO AND FINALIZING RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS PARTNER: SES	.20

07/27/12	REVIEWING STATUS OF RESPONSE TO THE CLAIMANT'S REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS AND DRAFTING COVER LETTER TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL; UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.90
07/27/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/06/12	DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES PURSUANT TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR EXTENSION ORDER PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/13/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTION NEEDED AT CLAIMANT'S DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/14/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/22/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/23/12	REVIEW DECISION OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS AND COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN CASE MATERIALS AND RECORD PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/23/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REGARDING DECISION PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/23/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR DENYING BENEFITS AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/23/12	DRAFTING RESPONSE TO THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARALEGAL: UV	.30

08/23/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/29/12	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RESPONSE TO PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/31/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S OBJECTION TO AWARD DENIAL ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/31/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR MEDICAL DEVELOPMENT AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 686.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01760

PEABODY COAL COMPANY/PINE RIDGE COAL CO. C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL, SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/13/12	REVIEW DRAFT ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES, RESPONSES TO REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION AND REQUESTS FOR ADMISSION (.30); COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE AND INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS; EDIT RESPONSES (.30); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.70
07/13/12	DRAFT EMPLOYER'S RESPONSE TO CLAIMANT'S INTERROGATORIES AND REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION AND REQUEST FOR ADMISSIONS. PARALEGAL: SL	.70
07/26/12	VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.20); DRAFTING SECOND REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE (.20) PARALEGAL: UV	.40
07/27/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL'S PETITION AND AMENDED PETITION FOR FEES AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/30/12	CONFIRM NO RECEIPT OF DISCOVERY RESPONSES FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.10); REVIEW CASE MATERIALS; REVIEW DISCOVERY (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.30
07/30/12	REVIEWED AND PREPARED DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS FROM DOL FOR ELECTRONIC VIEWING. PARALEGAL: SL	2.00
08/02/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20

08/07/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FORWARDING CLAIM TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/09/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/22/12	REVIEW OF ANSWERED INTERROGATORIES FOR NEW MEDICAL NEEDED. PARALEGAL: SL	.30
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 459.00

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01774

EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP. C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL, SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/12/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR MEDICAL RECORDS DEVELOPMENT (.40); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM THE GREENBRIER CLINIC, DR. FLAIM, DR. CRAFT, AND BOONE MEMORIAL HOSPITAL AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS (1.40) PARALEGAL: UV	1.80
07/12/12	REVIEIWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
07/13/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR PARALEGAL: D T	.40
07/13/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/17/12	REVIEW DEADLINES (.10); REVIEW PROPOSED CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE RE ISSUES FOR DECISION; COMPARE WITH CASE MATERIALS (.20); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.40
07/24/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.80
07/24/12	DRAFTING REQUESTS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS (.80): TELEPHONE CALL TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS (.60): UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM (.20) PARALEGAL: KC	1.60

07/25/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: KC	.60
07/27/12 REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/01/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
08/02/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/06/12 REVIEW ISSUES AND EVIDENCE, REPORTS DEVELOPED BUT NOT SUBMITTED, NEED FOR SUPPLEMENTAL REPORTS (.3), STATUS OF RECORDS REGARDING CANCER, TIME FRAME NECESSARY FOR DEVELOPMENT (.3) PARTNER: PEF	.60
08/06/12 REVIEW NEED FOR CONTINUANCE, INFORMATION RE CONTACT WITH OFFICE OF CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE SAME PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/07/12 REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING MOTION TO CONTINUE TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE PARALEGAL: D T	.70
08/07/12 REVIEIWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT BECKLEY APPALACHAIN REGIONAL HOSPTIAL PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/08/12 CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
08/13/12 RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/14/12 REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/16/12 REVISE AND EDIT MOTION FOR CONTINUANCE OR DECISION ON THE RECORD PARTNER: PEF	.30

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/16/12	PROCESSING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/17/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO DEADLINE FOR NEW ISSUES BEFORE THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/22/12	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE IF THERE ARE ANY OUTSTANDING MEDICAL RECORDS REQUESTS IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING PARALEGAL: TMH	.10
08/22/12	REVIEWING EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND VERIFYING STATUS OF CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/23/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM COUNSEL FOR DIRECTOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/23/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM BOONE MEMORIAL HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/24/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REGARDING PENDING HEARING AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/24/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/24/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS FROM BECKLEY IMAGING PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/27/12	REVIEWING ISSUE OF PENDING HEARING AND CONFIRMING HEARING CONTINUED PARALEGAL: D T	.10

		•	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	1118.00
08/29/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL REGARDING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC		.20
08/29/12	REVIEWING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORDS IN REGARDS TO CLAIMANT'S DEATH PARALEGAL: D T		.50
08/29/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING CANCELLED HEARING PARALEGAL: D T		.10

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01812

EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

.70 07/11/12 REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC 07/12/12 REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS .50 PARALEGAL: KC 07/12/12 TELEPHONE CALLS TO AND FROM DR. WHEELER AND .50 CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITON PARALEGAL: KC .50 07/23/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FORM CAMC REGARDING PATHOLOGY PARALEGAL: KC 07/26/12 TELEPHONE CALLS TO AND FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL .80 AND DR. WHEELER REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC .30 07/27/12 REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL PARALEGAL: KC 07/27/12 TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. WHEELER REGARDING .80 DEPOSITION (.20): TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION (.30): DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION (.20): UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM (.10) PARALEGAL: KC 07/30/12 REVIEW INFORMATION REGARDING DEPOSITION (.10); CHECK CONTRACT WITH CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.10); CONFIRM DATES (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE (.10) PARTNER: PEF

07/30/12	REVIEWING ALL MEDICAL RECORDS FOR SMOKING REFERENCES A ND OTHER RELEVANT INFORMATION PARALEGAL: D T	7.20
07/30/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO CAMC REGARDING PATHOLOGY PARALEGAL: KC	.40
07/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/01/12	REVIEW AND COMPARE PATHOLOGY SLIDES WITH MEDICAL RECORDS AND PATHOLOGY REPORTS PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/01/12	DIRECT EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF PATHOLOGY REPORTS PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/01/12	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. OESTERLING; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE, PATHOLOGY SLIDES AND RECORDS IN CASE MATERIALS PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/01/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. OESTERLING PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/01/12	REVIEW CT SCAN FILMS BEING SENT TO DR. WHEELER AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/01/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/01/12	REVIEWING NUMEROUS MEDICAL RECORDS FOR REFERENCES TO SARCOID AND OBTAINING COPIES (3.2); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR READING OF CT SCANS (.4); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. OESTERLING FOR PATHOLOGY REPORT FOR NEW SLIDES (.4) PARALEGAL: D T	4.00
08/01/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY FROM THOMAS MEMORIAL HOSPITAL AND CAMC PARALEGAL: KC	.70

08/01/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/01/12	PROCESSING REQUEST TO DR. OESTERLING AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/02/12	CONFIRM DEPOSITION DATE AND ARRANGEMENTS PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/02/12	REVIEW AND SIGN NOTICE OF DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/02/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. WHEELER AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION (.4): DRAFTING AMENDED NOTICE OF DEPOSITION: UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM (.2) PARALEGAL: KC	.60
08/02/12	PROCESSING NOTICE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/06/12	REVIEW DRAFT NOTICE TO JUDGE OF ISSUES CONTESTED FOR HEARING AS COMPARED WITH CASE MATERIALS AND SIGN PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/06/12	REVIEW OF X-RAYS RECEIVED FROM THOMAS MEMORIAL PARALEGAL: SL	.20
08/06/12	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR AND PENDING ISSUES; UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.40
08/06/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CAMC PARALEGAL: KC	.30

08/06/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO CAMC REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.10
08/06/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/07/12	REVIEW LETTER FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION SCHEDULE; DIRECT STAFF RE ACTION PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/07/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CAMC REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.10
08/09/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/13/12	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE WHICH MATERIALS NEED TO BE SENT TO DR. WHEELER FOR HIS DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: TMH	1.40
08/13/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EXHIBITS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/14/12	CONTINUE REVIEW OF FILE TO DETERMINE WHAT MATERIALS NEED TO BE SENT TO DR. WHEELER PARALEGAL: TMH	1.70
08/16/12	REVIEW CASE DEVELOPMENT AND EDIT MOTION TO HOLD THE RECORD OPEN PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/16/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/16/12	REVIEW ADDITIONAL REPORT FROM JOHNS HOPKINS, COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE AND DESIGNATE SUBMISSION	.20
	PARTNER: PEF	

08/16/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/16/12	REVISE MOTION TO HOLD RECORD OPEN PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/16/12	CONTACTING DR. WHEELER'S OFFICE TO VERIFY STATUS OF READING OF CT SCANS PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/16/12	DRAFTING MOTION TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE TO HOLD THE RECORD OPEN PARALEGAL: D T	.80
08/16/12	CONTACTING DR. WHEELER'S OFFICE FOR STATUS OF READING PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/16/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM SUBMITTING READING BY DR. WHEELER PARALEGAL: D T	.30
08/16/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/16/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/17/12	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE AND INDEX OF DOCUMENTS TO DR. WHEELER ENCLOSING ADDITIONAL MATERIALS FOR REVIEW IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: TMH	.40
08/17/12	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE WHICH DOCUMENTS TO SEND TO DR. ZALDIVAR IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION TESTIMONY PARALEGAL: TMH	2.30
08/17/12	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE AND INDEX TO DR. ZALDIVAR ENCLOSING DOCUMENTS FOR REVIEW IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: TMH	.50

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/17/12	DRAFTING SUMMARY OF FILMS REFERENCED WITHIN CLAIMANT'S SUBMISSION FROM DR. GAZIANO PARALEGAL: D T	.70
08/17/12	CONFIRMING EACH FILM EITHER PORTABLE OR QUALIFYING PARALEGAL: D T	.50
08/17/12	DISCUSSING CLAIM WITH ATTORNEY PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/17/12	DRAFTING LETTER TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL TO PROVIDE FILMS PARALEGAL: D T	.40
08/20/12	REVIEW PREVIOUS TESTIMONY OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND COMPARE WITH NEW EVIDENCE (.4); REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR FOR DEPOSITION (.3) PARTNER: PEF	.70
08/20/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/20/12	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. WHEELER, COMPARE WITH CASE MATERIALS AND EVIDENCE, CHANGE MATERIALS BEING SENT PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/20/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/20/12	REVIEW X-RAY AND CT SCAN READINGS SUBMITTED BY PLAINTIFF'S LAWYER (.3) AND LIST OF FILMS AVAILABLE FOR REVIEW (.2) PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/20/12	REVIEW AND SIGN REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/20/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL FOR DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.90

08/20/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO COURT REPORTER, CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/20/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/20/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/20/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/21/12	TELEPHONE CALLS WITH DR. ZALDIVAR'S OFFICE, OTIS MANN'S OFFICE AND COURT REPORTER CONCERNING CANCELLATION OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S DEFOSITION PARALEGAL: TMH	.40
08/22/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.10
08/23/12	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. CAFFREY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/23/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.10
08/24/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, REPORTS, DEPOSITIONS IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION OF DR. WHEELER PARTNER: PEF	.80
08/24/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DR. WHEELER CONCERNING DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.30

08/24/12	DEPOSE DR. WHEELER PARTNER: PEF	1	00
08/24/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING CLAIM REGARDING ISSUES PARALEGAL: D T		.20
08/24/12	RECEIPT OF CONSULTING REPORT FROM DR. OESTERLING AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV		.20
08/24/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL FOR DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC		.90
08/27/12	DRAFTING LETTER SUBMITTING REPORT FROM DR. OESTERLING PARALEGAL: D T		.20
08/27/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB		.20
08/30/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DISTRICT DIRECTOR AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV		.10
08/31/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC		.20
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	3561.00 =======

Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01834

EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/31/12 RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL'S FEE PETITIONS
TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND TO ADMINISTRATIVE
LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
PARALEGAL: UV

.20

INVOICE TOTAL

\$ 14.00

B Bowle's Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01854

EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/10/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
07/10/12	RESEARCHING TO DETERMINE IF A PREAMBLE CAN BE CONTROLLING ON A JUDGES DECISION WHEN THE MEDICAL SCIENCE IN THE PREAMBLE IS OUTDATED. LAW CLERK: CLE	2.10
07/11/12	RESERACHING TO DETERMINE IF THERE IS A WAY TO SHOW THAT ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGES MAY NOT RELY ON THE PREAMBLE TO FEDERAL BLACK LUNG LITIGATION WHEN INFORMATION IN THE PREAMBLE IS MEDICALLY OUTDATED. LAW CLERK: CLE	1.30
07/12/12	RESEARCHING TO DETERMINE IF AN ALJ CAN BASE HIS DECISION TO THE PREAMBLE TO THE FEDERAL BLACK LUNG REGULATIONS WHEN SUCH INFORMATION IS MEDICALLY OUTDATED. LAW CLERK: CLE	2.60
07/16/12	RESEARCHING AND DRAFTING A MEMO ON USE OF THE PREAMBLE TO FEDERAL BLACK LUNG REGULATIONS AS A BASIS OF MEDICAL/SCIENTIFIC FACT. LAW CLERK: CLE	6.10
07/17/12	RESEARCHING FOR, DRAFTING, AND EDITING A MEMO ON THE USE OF THE PREAMBLE TO FEDERAL BLACK LUNG REGULATIONS BY AN ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE. LAW CLERK: CLE	3.10

Bewles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

07/20/12 REVIEWING OUR MEMO ON USING THE PREAMBLE OF .30
THE FEDERAL BLACK LUNG REGULATIONS TO ANSWER
QUESTIONS OF FACT.
LAW CLERK: CLE

08/06/12 RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MARK SOLOMON .20
REGARDING APPEAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC
CLAIM FILE
PARALEGAL: UV

08/16/12 RECEIPT OF EMPLOYER'S PETITION FOR REVIEW AND
UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
PARALEGAL: UV

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 1845.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01858

EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/13/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS PURSUANT TO NOTICE (.10); DRAFTING REPLY TO THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR (.10) PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/16/12	CHECK STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT (.10); REVIEW EXHIBITS RECEIVED FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.30); REVIEW DEATH CERTIFICATE AND AUTOPSY EVIDENCE; CHECK STATUS OF SLIDES (.40); CHECK STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORDS RE DEATH (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.90
07/27/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/30/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR MEDICAL DEVELOPMENT (.20); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING WIDOW'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES (.30) PARALEGAL: UV	.50
08/02/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES (.2) REVIEWING CLAIM FILE TO DETERMINE ADDITIONAL RECORDS NEEDED IN DEFENSE OF CLAIM (.2) PARALEGAL: UV	.40
08/02/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
08/08/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR X-RAYS FROM CAMC PARALEGAL: KC	.40

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

08/30/12 REVIEIWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF .40
MEDICAL RECORDS
PARALEGAL: KC

TOTAL EXPENSES ADVANCED FOR YOUR ACCOUNT

O.00

INVOICE TOTAL

\$ 337.50

B Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01879

EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/12/12	REVIEW ORDER OF JUDGE GRANTING MOTION TO COMPEL (.10); REVIEW CASE MATERIALS AND CHECK FOR ANY RESPONSE TO DISCOVERY BY CLAIMANT (.20); CHECK STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT FOR HEARING(.20) PARTNER: PEF	.50
07/12/12	RECEIPT OF ORDER; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
07/16/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE COMPELLING CLAIMANT TO ANSWER TO INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATING CLAIM DEADLINES PARALEGAL: D T	.20
07/25/12	VERIFYING STATUS OF REQUESTS FOR MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT AND CLAIMANT'S RESPONSE TO ORDER TO COMPEL (.60); DRAFTING REQUEST TO SCHEDULE DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR (.20); UPDATING CLAIM FILE (.20) PARALEGAL: D T	1.00
07/25/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: KC	.40
07/26/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.50
07/27/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION (.20): DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION (.30) PARALEGAL: KC	.50

07/30/12	CONFIRM NEED FOR DEPOSITION (.10); REVIEW DATES AVAILABLE (.10); CHECK FOR ANY RESPONSE TO DISCOVERY (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.30
07/30/12	REVIEW NOTICE OF DEPOSITION; CONFIRM TRANSCRIPT ARRANGEMENTS GIVEN DEADLINES (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.20
07/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/06/12	REVIEW DRAFT NOTICE TO JUDGE OF ISSUES CONTESTED FOR HEARING (.1) AS COMPARED WITH CASE MATERIALS AND SIGN (.2) PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/06/12	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR AND PENDING ISSUES; UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.40
08/06/12	CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/06/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/07/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/09/12	CHECK STATUS OF DISCOVERY; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS RE SAME (.2); REVIEW AND EDIT MOTION TO DISMISS (.2); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/09/12	PROCESSING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20

08/14/12	CHECK FOR ANY RESPONSE BY MR. SAWYERS TO MOTION TO DISMISS PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/14/12	DETERMINE EVIDENCE, DEVELOPMENT, AND OTHER ACTION NECESSARY IN THE EVENT THE JUDGE DOES NOT GRANT MOTION TO DISMISS PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/14/12	DISCUSSING CLAIM WITH ATTORNEY REGARDING PENDING DEADLINE AND MOTION TO DISMISS PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/14/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE TO FILE MOTION TO HOLD RECORD OPEN PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/16/12	REVIEW AND EDIT EVIDENCE SUMMARY REQUIRED BY COURT AND PREHEARING REPORT (.3); COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND EVIDENCE BEING DEVELOPED (.2) PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/16/12	CHECK FOR ANY ACTION BY JUDGE ON MOTION TO DISMISS PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/16/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/16/12	REVIEW AND EDIT DRAFT EVIDENCE SUMMARY PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/16/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE WITH REQUIRED REPORTS PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/16/12	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL AND DRAFTING PREHEARING REPORT PARALEGAL: D T	.40
08/16/12	REVIEWING EVIDENCE TO DATE AND DRAFTING EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM PARALEGAL: D T	.40

08/16/12	DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/16/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/21/12	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE WHICH MATERIALS TO FORWARD TO DR. ZALDIVAR IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: TMH	.80
08/21/12	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR ENCLOSING MATERIALS FOR REVIEW IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: TMH	.10
08/22/12	REVIEW ORDER OF JUDGE DENYING MOTION TO DISMISS AND REMANDING THE CASE TO THE DISTRICT DIRECTOR, AND CHECK FOR ANY FURTHER CONTACT FROM CLAIMANT OR INFORMATION REGARDING CLAIMANT'S CURRENT STATUS PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/22/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/24/12	DIRECT CANCELLATION OF DEPOSITIONS IN LIGHT OF REMAND PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/24/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING CLAIM REGARDING ISSUES PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/28/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, REPORT OF DR. ZALDIVAR, REPORT OF DR. RASMUSSEN; PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.70

08/28/12	CONFERENCE WITH DR. ZALDIVAR PRIOR TO DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/28/12	DEPOSE DR. ZALDIVAR PARTNER: PEF	1.00
08/28/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL FOR DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.90
08/28/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR, CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/30/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DISTRICT DIRECTOR AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 1552.00

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01885

EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.
C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES
P.O. BOX 2200
GREENSBURG, PA 15601
ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL,
SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/01/12 RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL

.20

INTERROGATORIES; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM

FILE

ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH

INVOICE TOTAL

\$ 14.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01916

PEABODY COAL COMPANY C/O OLD REPUBLIC COMPANIES P.O. BOX 2200 GREENSBURG, PA 15601 ATTN: CHRISTINE TERRILL, SUPERVISOR OF OCCUPATIONAL DISEASE

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/10/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. ROSENBERG REGARDIGN DEPOSITION (.50): TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM CLAIAMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION (.40): TELEPHONE CALL TO COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION (.30) PARALEGAL: KC	1.20
07/11/12	CONFIRM NEED FOR ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.10); REVIEW PATHOLOGY EVIDENCE; REVIEW REPORT OF DR. CAFFREY IN COMPARISON WITH REPORT OF DR. GREEN (.40); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.70
07/11/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: DRAFTING REQUEST FOR INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE: UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM PARALEGAL: KC	.80
07/11/12	PROCESSING DISCOVERY REQUEST TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/11/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/12/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL DEVELOPMENT (.40); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE (.20) PARALEGAL: UV	.60

07/12/12	REVIEIWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.60
07/12/12	RECEIPT OF CLMT ATTORNEY CONFIRMING DEPOS BY PHONE; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
07/13/12	ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL PARALEGAL: KC	.20
07/13/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/16/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING REQUEST FOR INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: D T	.10
07/16/12	RECEIPT OF CLMT RESPONSE INTERROGATORIES; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
07/17/12	REVIEW NEW DATE FOR DEPOSITION; CHECK CONTACT WITH CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE SAME (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE WITH NOTICE OF DEPOSITION (.10); REVIEW MATERIALS SENT TO DR. ROSENBERG FOR REPORT (.40) PARTNER: PEF	.60
07/25/12	REVIEW OF NEW EVIDENCE SUBMITTED BY CLAIMANT (.30); RESEARCH CONCERNING BIOPSY EVIDENCE AS REPORT (.50); CONFIRMING NUMBER OF CLAIMANT'S MEDICAL REPORTS PREVIOUSLY SUBMITTED TO DETERMINE IF WE CAN OBJECT TO INTRODUCTION (.20); REVIEW OF EVIDENCE IDENTIFIED BY CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL IN TRANSCRIPT FOR REFERENCE TO NEW REPORT (.10) PARTNER: SES	1.10
07/27/12	REVIEW EVIDENCE SUBMITTED BY CLAIMANT TO CONFIRM THE ADMISSION OF TWO AFFIRMATIVE MEDICAL REPORTS PARALEGAL: TMH	.20
07/27/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60

Bewles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/03/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS (.5): TELEPHONE CALLS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REGARDING X-RAYS (.4) PARALEGAL: KC	.90
08/06/12	REVIEW INFORMATION REGARDING CHANGE OF DEPOSITION SCHEDULE; DIRECT STAFF RE ACTION (.1); CONFIRM APPROVAL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL FOR CHANGE (.1); CHECK STATUS OF MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DOCTORS FOR DEPOSITIONS (.1); REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ROSENBERG AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD (.2); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO ROSENBERG (.1); REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO ZALDIVAR (.2); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.90
08/06/12	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR RELEVANT INFORMATION FOR DR. ZALDIVAR AND DR. ROSENBERG'S REVIEW FOR PENDING DEPOSITIONS (.4); DRAFTING LETTERS TO DOCTORS ENCLOSING MATERIAL (.3) PARALEGAL: D T	.70
08/07/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/08/12	REVIEW MATERIALS; PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION (.7); CONFERENCE WITH DR. ZALDIVAR (.3); DEPOSE DR. ZALDIVAR (1.0); REVIEW EMAIL FROM OFFICE OF DR. ROSENBERG RE SCHEDULE (.1) PARTNER: PEF	2.10
08/08/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION: TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/09/12	REVIEW EMAIL FROM STAFF OF DR. ROSENBERG (.1); REVIEW SCHEDULE AND DEADLINES; DIRECT STAFF RE ACTION (.1); CONFIRM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AGREEMENT TO MOVE DEPOSITION (.1); REVIEW ADDITIONAL MATERIALS TO SEND TO DR. ROSENBERG (.3); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.70
08/09/12	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR PULMONARY FUNCTION STUDY PARALEGAL: D T	.50

08/09/12	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR PATHOLOGY REPORT FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARALEGAL: D T	.50
08/09/12	DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. ROSENBERG PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/09/12	CONTACTING DR. ROSENBERG'S OFFICE FOR FACSIMILE NUMBER PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/09/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/09/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/10/12	CONFIRM CONTACT WITH OFFICE OF CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL APPROVING NEW DATE FOR DEPOSITION, AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE RE SAME PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/10/12	MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CALLS TO CALLS TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/10/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.10
08/10/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.10
08/10/12	PROCESSING NOTICE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING NOTICE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/13/12	CHECK PROCEDURAL HISTORY OF DEPOSITIONS AND POST HEARING ORDERS REGARDING EVIDENCE PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/13/12	CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE SCOPE OF DR. ROSENBERG DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.20

08/13/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DR. ROSENBERG RE ISSUES TO BE DISCUSSED IN DEPOSITION, CONFIRMATION OF REVIEW OF ADDITIONAL MATERIALS, DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS, PATHOLOGY REPORTS FOR DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/13/12	DEPOSE DR. ROSENBERG PARTNER: PEF	1.00
08/13/12	REVIEW VARIOUS MEDICAL REPORTS AND TESTIMONY IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.90
08/13/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/14/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/14/12	REVIEW OPPOSITION TO DEPOSITION FILED BY PLAINTIFF'S COUNSEL WITH COURT, COMPARE WITH PROCEDURAL HISTORY PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/14/12	DRAFT RESPONSE TO PLAINTIFF'S OPPOSITION TO DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/14/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLERK OF COURT PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/14/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL FOR DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.80
08/14/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG, CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/14/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/15/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S OBJECTION TO DEPOSITION OF DR. ROSENBERG AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/20/12	REVIEW TRANSCRIPT OF DR. ROSENBERG DEPOSITION FOR SUBMISSION PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/20/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/20/12	REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT OF DR. GEORGE ZALDIVAR FOR SUBMISSION INTO RECORD PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/20/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE WITH DR. ZALDIVAR DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/20/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE SUBMITTING TRANSCRIPT OF DR. ZALDIVAR PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/20/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE SUBMITTING TRANSCRIPT OF DR. ROSENBERG PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/20/12	RECEIPT OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/20/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/20/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 2612.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01928

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/12/12 RECEIPT OF EMPLOYER'S REPLY BRIEF; UPDATING .20

ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH

07/20/12 RECEIPT OF EMPLOYER'S PETITION FOR REVIEW AND .20

BRIEF IN SUPPORT; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM

FILE

ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 28.00

========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01945

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

.20

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/01/12 REVIEW FEE AWARD BY JUDGE; EMAIL PATRIOT RE .20

SAME

PARTNER: PEF

08/01/12 RECEIPT OF ATTORNEY FEE ORDER; UPDATING

ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 47.00

B Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01950

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/11/12 RECEIPT OF ORDER GRANTING PARTIES' REQUEST TO .20 SUBMIT SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEFS OUT OF TIME; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH .20 07/16/12 RECEIPT OF DECISION ON RECONSIDERATION AWARDING BENEFITS; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH 07/30/12 RECEIPT OF EMPLOYER'S NOTICE OF APPEAL AND .20 UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV 42.00 INVOICE TOTAL ========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01957

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

.20 07/10/12 RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS OF X-RAY FILM FROM DR. RENN'S INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV .80 07/10/12 REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC 07/18/12 REVIEW X-RAY EVIDENCE FROM JOHNS HOPKINS; .50 COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE IN THE RECORD (.30); CHECK STATUS OF DR. RENN REPORT (.10); DESIGNATE EVIDENCE FOR REVIEW AND SUBMISSION (.10)PARTNER: PEF .20 07/19/12 CONFIRM STATUS OF REPORT; SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. RENN PARTNER: PEF .20 07/19/12 PREPARED AND MAILED DR. SCOTT'S READING TO DR. RENN FOR REVIEW PARALEGAL: SL .20 07/19/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. RENN AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB 07/23/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHOEN CALL FROM .50 MON GENERAL HOSPITAL REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC 07/25/12 REVIEWING STATUS OF CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING .80 SUBMISSION FORMS SUBMITTING READINGS BY DR. SCOTT (.40); UPDATING INITIAL EVIDENCE SUMMARY WITH READINGS (.20); DRAFTING REQUEST TO SCHEDULE DEPOSITION OF DR. RENN (.20) PARALEGAL: D T

07/25/12	RECEIPT OF INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION REPORT FROM DR. RENN AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/26/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL FROM MON GENERAL HOSPTIAL REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.40
07/30/12	REVIEW ADDITIONAL REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS; COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES; CONFIRM EVIDENCE FOR SUBMISSION (.40); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL WITH TWO REPORTS FROM DR. SCOTT (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.50
07/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/01/12	CONFIRM NEED FOR CONSULTING OPINION AND PHYSICIAN FOR CONSULTING OPINION PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/01/12	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ROSENBERG FOR CONSULTING OPINION; COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD, MEDICAL TREATMENT RECORDS PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/01/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/01/12	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL DEVELOPMENT (.3); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES (.3); DRAFTING REQUESTS FOR UPDATED MEDICAL RECORDS AND RADIOLOGY FILMS FROM MONONGALIA GENERAL HOSPITAL AND CLARKSBURG VA HOSPITAL (.4) PARALEGAL: UV	1.00
08/01/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE PARALEGAL: KC	.40

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/01/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/06/12	REVIEW DRAFT NOTICE TO JUDGE OF ISSUES CONTESTED FOR HEARING AS COMPARED WITH CASE MATERIALS AND SIGN PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/06/12	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR AND PENDING ISSUES; UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.40
08/06/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/07/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM MON GENERAL HOSPITAL REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.10
08/07/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. RENN REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/13/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO MULTIPLE DOCTORS TO SCHEDULE DEPOSITIONS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/13/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.10
08/14/12	REVIEW REPORT OF DR. RENN, TEST RESULTS (.3); COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD, DOL EXAMINATION AND TEST RESULTS, ISSUES (.2); CONFIRM NEED TO SUBMIT INTO RECORD (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.60

08/14/12	REVIEW REPORT OF DR. ROSENBERG; COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD, DR. RENN REPORT AND TEST RESULTS, DOL EXAMINATION AND TEST RESULTS, ISSUES (.4); CONFIRM NEED TO SUBMIT INTO RECORD (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/14/12	REVIEW DRAFT EVIDENCE SUMMARY AND PREHEARING REPORT REQUIRED BY JUDGE; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND EVIDENCE BEING SUBMITTED PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/14/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE WITH EVIDENCE SUMMARY PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/14/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE WITH REPORTS OF DR. RENN AND DR. ROSENBERG (TWO) PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/14/12	REVIEW RECORDS FROM VA HOSPITAL BEING SUBMITTED; COMPARE WITH REPORT OF RECORDS REVIEWED BY CONSULTING PHYSICIANS PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/14/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE WITH MEDICAL RECORD EVIDENCE PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/14/12	DRAFTING LETTER SUBMITTING REPORT BY DR. ROSENBERG PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/14/12	REVIEWING REPORT BY DR. ROSENBERG PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/14/12	REVIEWING REPORT BY DR. RENN PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/14/12	DRAFTING LETTER SUBMITTING REPORT BY DR. ROSENBERG PARALEGAL: D T	.20

08/14/12	UPDATING EVIDENCE SUMMARY WITH SUMMARY OF MEDICAL REPORTS AND MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: D T	.30
08/14/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/14/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSIONS TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.3); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSIONS TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.40
08/20/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S RELEASE FOR TO CONTINUE HEARING AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/22/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REQUESTING CONTINUANCE OF HEARING AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.10
	TAICHLOAL. D I	
08/22/12	DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.50
, ,	DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/22/12	DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL REGARDING DEPOSITIONS	
08/22/12	DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL REGARDING DEPOSITIONS PARALEGAL: KC TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. RENN REGARDING DEPOSITION	.30
08/22/12 08/22/12 08/22/12	DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL REGARDING DEPOSITIONS PARALEGAL: KC TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. RENN REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC TELEPHONE CALL TO COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITIONS	.30

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/22/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.10
08/24/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING CLAIM REGARDING ISSUES PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/27/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS AND 2 COMPACT DISCS FROM LOUIS JOHNSON VAMC AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/30/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DISTRICT DIRECTOR AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/31/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DISTRICT DIRECTOR'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 1428.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01968

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/16/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/20/12	REVIEWING AND PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV	.10
07/31/12	REVIEWING ORDER DENYING BENEFITS FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE (.30); DRAFTING LETTER TO THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.10) PARALEGAL: D T	.40
08/02/12	REVIEW DECISION OF DISTRICT DIRECTOR, INCLUDING EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY U.S. DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, AS COMPARED WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN CASE MATERIALS, RESPONSE FROM CLAIMANT, AND STATUS OF DISCOVERY IN LIGHT OF DECISION PARTNER: PEF	.60
08/02/12	REVIEW AND SIGN RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/02/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/29/12	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RESPONSE TO PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

08/31/12 TELEPHONE CALL FROM CAMC REGARDING MEDICAL

.20

RECORDS

PARALEGAL: KC

INVOICE TOTAL

\$ 199.50

========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01970

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

	DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES		
07/26/12	CLOSING ARGUMENT ANALYSIS AND TRANSCRIPT REVIEW PARTNER: SES	3.20	
07/31/12	ANALYSIS OF CASE ISSUES; REVIEWING TRANSCRIPTS AND RELEVANT DOCUMENTS; RESEARCH CONCERNING DRAFTING OF CLOSING ARGUMENT PARTNER: SES	7.10	
08/01/12	DRAFTING BRIEF PARTNER: SES	4.40	
08/03/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO OFFICE OF JUDGE; TELEPHONE CALL FROM AND CONFERENCE WITH CLERK OF JUDGE PARTNER: PEF	.40	
08/03/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM BLUE WELL CLINIC PARALEGAL: KC	.40	
08/31/12	REVIEIWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM BLUEWELL CLINIC PARALEGAL: KC	.60	
	TMMOTOR TOTAL	Ś	2561.

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 2561.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.01998

JIM LINDEN
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/11/12 CONFIRM RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL .10 EXTENSION REQUEST; REVIEW SAME PARTNER: PEF .20 07/11/12 RECEIPT OF CLMT'S MOTION FOR ONE DAY EXTENSION; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH 07/12/12 RECEIPT OF CLMT'S CLOSING ARGUMENTS IN .20 SUPPORT OF AN AWARD OF BENEFITS; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH INVOICE TOTAL 44.50 _____

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02037

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

INVOICE TOTAL

08/23/12 RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S SUBMISSION OF X-RAY FILM TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING

.10

ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV

\$ 7.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02050

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

CHARLESTON, WEST VIRGINIA

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/01/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT CLAIMANT'S DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/17/12	REVIEW DECISION OF DISTRICT DIRECTOR AWARDING BENEFITS, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY THE DIRECTOR, AND COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN THE RECORD PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/17/12	RECEIPT OF PDO AWARD OF BENEFITS; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/20/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUESTING DE NOVO HEARING PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/20/12	CHECK STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF AWARD OF BENEFITS PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/20/12	REVIEWING DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AWARD ORDER AND UPDATING SYSTEM WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE TO AWARD OF BENEFITS (.20); DRAFTING RESPONSE TO THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND REQUESTING FOR HEARING (.20); VERIFYING MEDICAL DEVELOPMENT PROCESS (.20) PARALEGAL: UV	.60
08/20/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20

08/21/12	REVIEW EMAIL FROM UNDERWRITERS AND CASE MATERIALS PARTNER: PEF	.10	
08/21/12	EMAIL TO UNDERWRITERS PARTNER: PEF	.10	
08/24/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/29/12	REVIEWING CORRESPONDENCE FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REGARDING AWARD OF BENEFITS AND VERIFYING REQUEST FOR HEARING SUBMITTED PARALEGAL: D T	.20	
08/29/12	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RESPONSE TO PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ ====	300.50

B Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02062

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

========

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/12/12	ORGANIZE, REVIEW AND BOOKMARK ELECTRONIC COPY OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS FROM DOL PARALEGAL: SL	1.20	
07/16/12	REVIEW DIRECTOR EXHIBITS, EVIDENCE OF RECORD, ISSUES FOR HEARING DEVELOPMENT (.30); CHECK STATUS OF RECORD DEVELOPMENT AND RECORD REQUESTS (.20); REVIEW RECORDS (.20) PARTNER: PEF	.70	
07/26/12	VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.20); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE (.20) PARALEGAL: UV	.40	
07/30/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND CONFIRM NEED FOR DISCOVERY (.20); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.30	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	277.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02101

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/30/12 RECEIPT OF EMPLOYER'S MOTION FOR

.20

RECONSIDERATION AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM

FILE

PARALEGAL: UV

INVOICE TOTAL

\$ 14.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02110

JIM LINDEN DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC 12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400 ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/10/12 REVIEW PLEADING; REVIEW CASE MAT CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF PARTNER: PEF	
07/10/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CL REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	
07/13/12 3 PHONE CALLS TO MON GENERAL REG OF AUTOPSY SLIDES REQUESTED JUNE PARALEGAL: SL	
07/13/12 REVIEWING CLAIM DEVELOPMENT PURS OF ATTORNEY REGARDING ISSUE OF S PARALEGAL: D T	SUANT TO REQUEST 1.00 SURVIVOR'S CLAIM
07/16/12 REVIEWING STATUS OF RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR GRANTING BENUPLATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	
07/19/12 REVIEW EMAIL FROM UNDERWRITERS (CASE MATERIALS, CONFIRM STATUS (UNDERWRITERS (.10) PARTNER: PEF	
07/30/12 REVIEWED 7-26-2012 FAX FROM MON HOSPITAL REQUESTING PAYMENT FOR CHECKED ON STATUS OF PAYMENT. PARALEGAL: SL	
08/02/12 RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR O AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FI PARALEGAL: UV	
08/03/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECE PARALEGAL: KC	CIPT OF X-RAYS .50

Payable Upon Receipt

.20

.20

08/07/12 REVIEWING LETTERS FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF

08/08/12 TELEPHONE CALL FROM EAST OHIO REGIONAL

LABOR AND UPDATING CLAIM

PARALEGAL: D T

08/08/12	REGARDING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/14/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/15/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, CHECK STATUS OF MINER'S CASE, REVIEW PROCEDURAL HISTORY, CONFIRM ORDER ISSUED WAS SURVIVOR'S CASE ONLY PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/15/12	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR RE STATUS AND ORDERS ISSUED TO DATE PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/22/12	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE WHICH MEDICAL RECORDS ARE NEEDED PARALEGAL: TMH	.20
08/22/12	TELEPHONE CALL WITH MON GENERAL HOSPITAL (PAT) CONCERNING REQUEST FOR AUTOPSY SLIDES PARALEGAL: TMH	.10
08/22/12	E-MAILS TO/FROM UNDERWRITERS REQUESTING STATUS OF PAYMENT TO MON GENERAL HOSPITAL FOR AUTOPSY SLIDES PARALEGAL: TMH	.30
08/22/12	PREPARE MEDICAL RECORDS REQUESTS TO MORGANTOWN PULMONARY ASSOCIATES AND EAST OHIO REGIONAL HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: TMH	.30
08/23/12	TELEPHONE CALL WITH MON GENERAL PATHOLOGY DEPARTMENT CONCERNING PAYMENT OF SLIDES PARALEGAL: TMH	.10
08/27/12	TELEPHONE CALL WITH SOUTHEASTERN OHIO REGIONAL HOSPITAL (NO ADDITIONAL X-RAYS) PARALEGAL: TMH	.10
08/27/12	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE PARALEGAL: TMH	.10

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

08/27/12 RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY SLIDES AND REPORTS FROM .20
MON GENERAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

PARALEGAL: UV

08/29/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF

MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 576.00

.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02134

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/03/12 REVIEWING, IDENTIFYING AND CATALOGING CD, X-RAYS; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH

.20

INVOICE TOTAL

\$ 14.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02171

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/27/12 FILE REVIEW AND RESEARCH RELATED TO BRIEF; 4.40
REVIEW OF TRANSCRIPTS
PARTNER: SES

07/29/12 DRAFTING AND REVISING BRIEF (6.8); FURTHER
RESEARCH RELATED TO COMPLICATED PNEUMOCONIOSIS
(1.1)
PARTNER: SES

07/30/12 FINALIZING BRIEF
PARTNER: SES

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 2706.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02187

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/16/12	REVIEW AND PREPARED ELECTRONIC FILE OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBIT FROM DOL PARALEGAL: SL	.90	
07/26/12	VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.20); DRAFTING SECOND REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE (.20) PARALEGAL: UV	.40	
07/30/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY; COMPARE WITH PREVIOUS DISCOVERY AND RESPONSES (.20); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.30	
07/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
08/13/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: KC	.40	
08/27/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION AND CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/29/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ ====	231.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02194

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/23/12 RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING .10 NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV .70 07/24/12 REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE; UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS (.40); VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.20); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATED MEDICAL RELEASE (.20)PARALEGAL: UV 07/25/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S .20 COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB .30 08/03/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: KC .40 08/13/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE PARALEGAL: KC 08/14/12 REVIEW STATUS OF DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF .50 NOTICE OF HEARING PARTNER: PEF 08/21/12 REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF VOLUMINOUS 3.60 RECORDS FROM DR. HAGGENJOS' OFFICE PARALEGAL: D T 08/22/12 REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE STATUS OF MEDICAL .20 RECORDS REQUESTS IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING PARALEGAL: TMH

Payable Upon Receipt

08/24/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/24/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. HAJJENJOS REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/27/12	REVIEWING AND CATALGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/29/12	REVIEW EXAMINATION REPORTS AND PROCEDURAL HISTORY OF EXAMINATION SCHEDULING PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/29/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM DR. SMADDER PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/30/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM THE DISTRICT DIRECTOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/30/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM COLUMBUS SLEEP COUNSULTANTS REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/31/12	REVISE AND EDIT MOTION TO COMPEL EXAMINATION PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/31/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM DR. SMADDER PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/31/12	PROCESSING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20

INVOICE TOTAL

805.00

========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02199

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

.20

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/12/12 RECEIPT OF ORDER GRANTING REQUEST FOR

	EXTENSION OF TIME TO FILE EVIDENCE AND ORDER EXTENDING TIME FOR SUBMISSION OF BRIEFS; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	
07/18/12	REVIEWED CLAIMANTS SUBMISSIONS OF EXHIBITS 1-4 PARALEGAL: SL	.40
07/23/12	REVIEWING AND PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV	.10
07/27/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ZALDIVAR'S OFFICE (.20); REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR RELEVANT INFORMATION FOR DR. ZALDIVAR'S REVIEW (.40); DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.20) PARALEGAL: D T	. 75
07/27/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL TO SEND TO DR. ZALDIVAR PARALEGAL: KC	.80
07/27/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/31/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING MEDICAL RECORDS (1.5): TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.20): TELEPHONE CALL TO COURT REPORTER (.20): TELEPHONE CALL WITH CLAIAMANT'S COUNSEL (.30) PARALEGAL: KC	2.20
08/01/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, REPORTS, RECORDS, ISSUES, EVIDENCE IN PREPARATION OF DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.80

08/01/12	CONFERENCE WITH DR. ZALDIVAR RE ISSUES FOR DEPOSITION AND CONFIRM MATERIALS REVIEWED FOR DEPOSITION PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/01/12	DEPOSE DR. ZALDIVAR PARTNER: PEF	1.90
08/01/12	EMAIL TO MELISSA REGARDING EXTRA MEDICAL RECORDS THAT MAY NOT HAVE BEEN SENT TO US. PARALEGAL: SL	.20
08/01/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/01/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANZING FILE MATERIAL FOR DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	. 90
08/03/12	PHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG'S OFFICE REGARDING JOHN RUBY PARALEGAL: SL	.10
08/06/12	REVIEW INFORMATION RECEIVED FROM STAFF OF DR. ROSENBERG RE TRACINGS (.1); REVIEW REPORT OF DR. ROSENBERG; EMAIL TO DR. ROSENBERG (.3); REVIEW EMAIL FROM DR. ROSENBERG (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE STAFF OF DR. ROSENBERG (.1); REVIEW PFT RESULTS AND TRACINGS RECEIVED FROM DR. ROSENBERG (.1); CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE WITH EVIDENCE (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.80
08/06/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/06/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/07/12	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR DOCTOR'S NAME FOR PENDING TRANSCRIPT OF DR. ZALDIVAR PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/08/12	RECEIPT OF DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

	STATUS OF TRANSCRIPT; REVIEW RIPT; SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE R: PEF	.30	
AND DRA JUDGE S	ING STATUS OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S TRANSCRIPT AFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW SUBMITTING TESTIMONY; UPDATING CLAIM SAL: DT	.30	
JUDGE	SING SUBMISSION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW	.10	
SUBMISS	NG ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE STRATIVE: LB	.10	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 1 =====	193.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02210

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/27/12 RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

.20

PARALEGAL: UV

INVOICE TOTAL

\$ 14.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02220

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

INVOICE

PARALEGAL: KC

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES 07/23/12 RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING .10 NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV .70 07/24/12 REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.10); UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS (.10); VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT(03); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATED MEDICAL RELEASE (.2) PARALEGAL: UV 07/24/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S .20 COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB .30 07/25/12 REVIEW NEW NOTICE OF HEARING AND REVIEW SCHEDULE PARTNER: PEF .30 07/26/12 DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE INFORMING OF NEW THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR PARALEGAL: UV 07/30/12 REVIEW CORRECTED INFORMATION FOR TPA .30 DESIGNATION AND CORRECTION OF STYLE OF CASE (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE (.10) PARTNER: PEF 08/03/12 RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S .20 COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV 08/07/12 TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. CHENDRAJ REGARDING .20

08/09/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/10/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAY FROM GUERNSEY MEMORIAL PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/13/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/14/12	CHECK STATUS OF DEVELOPMENT FOR HEARING PREPARATION, INCLUDING REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS DEVELOPED TO DATE AND STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD REQUESTS PARTNER: PEF	.60
08/15/12	DIRECT CONTACT WITH GENESIS HEALTHCARE, POSSIBLE FACILITIES/PHYSICIANS FOR ADDITIONAL TESTING, AND OBTAINING OF RECENT CT SCAN FILMS FOR DEVELOPMENT PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/16/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	1.10
08/16/12	REVIEWING FILE MATEIRAL TO DETERMINE MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/17/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND HISTORY OF DISCOVERY PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/17/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/17/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING INITIAL EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM PARALEGAL: D T	.40
08/17/12	REVIEWING MEDICAL REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG PARALEGAL: D T	.20

08/17/12	DRAFTING MEDICAL RECORDS REQUESTS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES PARALEGAL: KC	.90
08/17/12	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RELEASE PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/17/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/21/12	REVIEW MEDICAL ISSUES AND OPTIONS FOR CONSULTING OPINION FOR HEARING, DIRECT ADDITIONAL CONSULTING OPINION AND DEPOSITIONS PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/22/12	REVIEW PREVIOUS RECORDS PRODUCED BY GENESIS HEALTHCARE TO DETERMINE IF CT SCAN AND X-RAYS WERE RECEIVED PARALEGAL: TMH	.10
08/22/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO SCHEDULE DEPOSITION OF DR. ROSENBERG PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/22/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO SCHEDULE DEPOSITION OF DR. RENN PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/22/12	REVIEWING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT TO OBTAIN READINGS OF CT SCANS PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/22/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM FOR DR. ROSENBERG'S MEDICAL REPORT PARALEGAL: D T	.30
08/22/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM FOR DR. WHEELER'S READING PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/23/12	REVIEW REPORT OF DR. ROSENBERG AND COMPARE WITH MEDICAL DATA REVIEWED, ISSUES AND EVIDENCE OF RECORD PARTNER: PEF	.40

Bewles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

08/23/12	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES, MEDICAL REPORTS PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/23/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL WITH ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/23/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSIONS TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSIONS TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.30
08/27/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM GENESIS HEALTHCARE REGARDING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.10
08/27/12	REVIEIWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/29/12	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT REGARDING MEDICAL AUTHORIZATION AND RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/30/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM THE DISTRICT DIRECTOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/31/12	REVIEWING CORRESPONDENCE FROM SOUTHEASTERN OHIO REGIONAL MEDICAL REGARDING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.30

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 1094.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02222

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES ______ 07/10/12 TELEPHONE CALL FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR .10 PURSUANT TO OUR REQUEST FOR SHOW CAUSE PARALEGAL: UV 07/11/12 DOCKETING UPDATED EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES .10 PURSUANT TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER PARALEGAL: UV 07/11/12 RECEIPT OF DOL EXTENSION GRANTED; UPDATING .20 ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH 08/01/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS .70 AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE (.1); DRAFTING CONSULTING REQUEST TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.2); DRAFTING REQUEST TO UNDERWRITERS FOR ADDITIONAL CLAIM FILM DOCUMENTS (.2); PREPARING REFERRAL PACKET FOR DR. ZALDIVAR (.2) PARALEGAL: UV 08/01/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND .20 UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB 08/02/12 CONFIRM STATUS OF CONSULTING REPORT REQUEST .60 (.1); REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS (.5) PARTNER: PEF 08/02/12 REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR .10 PARTNER: PEF 08/07/12 RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND .20

UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

PARALEGAL: UV

08/08/12	CONFERENCE WITH DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING CONSULTING OPINION AND PROJECTED DATE OF COMPLETION PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/08/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ZALDIVAR'S OFFICE THAT HE IS UNABLE TO HAVE REPORT TO US BY THE EVIDENTIARY DEADLINE (.1); DRAFTING MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME (.3) PARALEGAL: UV	.40
08/09/12	CHECK STATUS OF DEADLINES; NOTIFY STAFF OF CONVERSATION WITH DR. ZALDIVAR; DIRECT STAFF RE ACTION PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/10/12	REVIEW PROJECTED DATES FOR COMPLETION OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT AS COMPARED WITH DEADLINES IMPOSED BY DOL PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/10/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/10/12	HAND DELIVERING MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME TO THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/10/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/10/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/14/12	RECEIPT OF CONSULTING REPORT FROM DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/15/12	REVIEW REPORT OF DR. ZALDIVAR; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD, REPORT AND TEST RESULTS OF DR. RASMUSSEN, EVIDENCE ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR; CONFIRM FOR SUBMISSION PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/15/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10

Payable Upon Receipt

08/15/12	REVIEWING CONSULTING REPORT FROM DR. ZALDIVAR PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
08/15/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF ZALDIVAR REPORT FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/15/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
08/21/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM AND CONFERENCE WITH DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.30	
08/21/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS AND STATUS OF DR. ZALDIVAR REPORT IN LIGHT OF CALL FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.20	
08/23/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDERS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
08/23/12	DOCKETING DEADLINES PURSUANT TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDERS PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	620.00

========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02227

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/13/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR PARALEGAL: D T	.40
07/13/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/17/12	REVIEW DEADLINES (.10); REVIEW PROPOSED CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE RE ISSUES FOR DECISION; COMPARE WITH CASE MATERIALS (.20); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.40
07/23/12	REVIEWING STATUS OF CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO NOTICE OF HEARING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINE (1.10); REVIEWING PRIOR EVIDENCE AND STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (1.10); DETERMINING STATUS OF REQUEST FOR PATHOLOGY (.30) PARALEGAL: D T	2.50
07/24/12	DRAFTING REQUESTS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS (.90): TELEPHONE CALL TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS (.70): UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM (.20) PARALEGAL: KC	1.80
08/01/12	CHECK FOR ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE NECESSARY FOR HEARING DEVELOPMENT (.1); CHECK STATUS OF DR. ROSENBERG (.1); DIRECT SCHEDULING DEPOSITION (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.30

08/03/12	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS AND EVIDENCE SUBMITTED TO DATE (.2); DESIGNATE ADDITIONAL RECORDS FOR SUBMISSION (.1); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); REVIEW PROPOSED EVIDENCE SUMMARY AND PREHEARING REPORT FOR JUDGE; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD (.3); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.80
08/03/12	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL PURSUANT TO NOTICE OF HEARING DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE (.6); DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM FOR SUBMISSION OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM SAINT FRANCIS HOSPITAL (.2); UPDATING EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM AND PREHEARING REPORT (.5); DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE SUBMITTING PLEADINGS (.2) PARALEGAL: D T	1.50
08/03/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/03/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/06/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
08/10/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/13/12	REVIEWING DEADLINE FOR NEW ISSUES AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/22/12	CONFIRM HEARING STILL SCHEDULED PER ORDER; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS FOR HEARING PREPARATION INCLUDING ISSUES, EVIDENCE SUBMITTED AND PREHEARING REPORT PARTNER: PEF	.70

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/22/12	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR OFFICIAL TRANSCRIPT PARALEGAL: D T	.10	
08/22/12	PREPARING ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S COPY OF EMPLOYER'S EXHIBITS PARALEGAL: D T	.30	
08/22/12	PREPARING CLAIMANT'S COPY OF EMPLOYER'S EXHIBITS PARALEGAL: D T	.20	
08/23/12	APPEAR FOR AND ATTEND HEARING PARTNER: PEF	1.50	
08/24/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO HEARING PARALEGAL: D T	.10	
08/24/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60	
08/29/12	RECEIPT OF ORDER CONTINUING HEARING AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	.20	
	INVOICE TOTAL	т	1247.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02235

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/10/12	FINALIZING CLOSING ARGUMENT PARTNER: SES	1.80	
07/12/12	REVIEW RECENT CASE LAW REGARDING COMPLICATED PNEUMOCONIOSIS, CT SCANS (.80); REVIEW AND EDIT BRIEF (.70) PARTNER: PEF	1.50	
07/13/12	REVIEW AND EDIT BRIEF (1.9); CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE (.10) PARTNER: PEF	2.00	
07/17/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
07/18/12	REVIEW BRIEF OF PLAINTIFF'S COUNSEL PARTNER: PEF	.20)
07/18/12	RECEIPT OF CLMT'S CLOSING ARGUMENT; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20)
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	935.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02243

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

.70

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PLAINTIFF'S COUNSEL (.20); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE (.10);

07/10/12 REVIEW AND EDIT MOTION TO CONTINUE (.20);

	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND PROCEDURAL HISTORY OF DISCOVERY (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO PLAINTIFF'S COUNSEL (.10). PARTNER: PEF	
07/10/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS TO CONFIRM ISSUES (.20); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE RE SAME (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.30
07/10/12	REVIEWING EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT (.50); CHECK MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.50); REVIEWING PATHOLOGY REPORT FROM LOGAN GENERAL HOSPITAL(.30) PARALEGAL: D T	1.30
07/10/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/11/12	RECEIPT OF CLMT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND AUTHORIZATION; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	. 20
07/12/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.50
07/16/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM DR. PORTERFIELD AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS (.03); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CLAIMANT'S SUPPLEMENTAL ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES (.20); PARALEGAL: UV	.50

07/24/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM MEDICAL EXPRESS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/26/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/27/12	REVIEW ORDER OF JUDGE CONTINUING AND RESCHEDULING HEARING; COMPARE WITH MOTION TO CONTINUE REASONING PARTNER: PEF	.20
07/27/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/31/12	REVIEW STATUS OF DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF CONTINUANCE; DIRECT DEVELOPMENT PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/01/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING UPDATED MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM MEDEXPRESS AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS (.4); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES TO DETERMINE ADDITIONAL RECORDS NEEDED (.4) PARALEGAL: UV	.80
08/01/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/01/12	RECEIPT OF AMENDED NOTICE OF DEPOSITION (RASMUSSEN); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/02/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DIRECTOR'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/02/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL FOR DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.90

08/02/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/03/12	REVIEWING, IDENTIFYING AND CATALOGING NEW CTS AND X-RAY DISK; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/07/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE SOLICITOR REGARDING HEARING AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/10/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/13/12	REVIEW OF MEDICAL STATUS IN PREP FOR HEARING PARALEGAL: SL	.30
08/14/12	REVIEW OF MEDICAL RECORDS STATUS PARALEGAL: SL	.50
08/17/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE SCHEDULING HEARING PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/17/12	SCHEDULING DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE SUBMISSION PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/17/12	SCHEDULING DEADLINE FOR SUBMISSION OF PREHEARING STATEMENT AND EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/17/12	SCHEDULING DEADLINE FOR SUBMISSION OF RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR ISSUE PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/17/12	UPDATING CLAIM FILE WITH HEARING DATE AND CONFIRMING NO CONFLICT PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/22/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. PORTERFIELD AND DR. KARAM AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/22/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.20

		===	=======
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	1071.00
08/27/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S AMENDED NOTICE OF DEPOSITION AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20)
08/27/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. KARAM'S OFFICE PARALEGAL: D T	1.00	
08/23/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING VOLUMINOUS RECORDS FROM DR. PORTERFIELD'S OFFICE PARALEGAL: D T	2.40	ı

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02254

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/12/12 REVIEWING MEDICAL REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG .30 AND VERIFYING STATUS OF CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T 08/03/12 REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS .50 PARALEGAL: KC 08/06/12 REVIEW NOTICE OF HEARING AND STATUS OF CASE .60 DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF HEARING SCHEDULE, EVIDENCE IN RECORD TO DATE, REPORTS OF EXAMINATION, CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE, AND STATUS OF RECORD DEVELOPMENT PARTNER: PEF 08/07/12 REVIEIWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF .40 MEDICAL RECORDS FROM OBLENESS MEMORIAL HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: KC 08/09/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS .70 TO FORWARD TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARALEGAL: KC 08/14/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS .40 PARALEGAL: KC 08/15/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS .50 FROM GENESIS HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: KC 08/16/12 DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM FOR DR. ROSENBERG'S .20 REPORT PARALEGAL: D T 08/16/12 CONTACTING DR. ROSENBERG'S OFFICE TO VERIFY .20 STATUS OF FILM FROM EXAMINATION PARALEGAL: D T

Payable Upon Receipt

08/16/12	DRAFTING INITIAL EVIDENCE SUMMARY LISTING ALL PRIOR EVIDENCE PARALEGAL: D T	.40
08/16/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM FOR DR. SCOTT'S REBUTTAL READING TO CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/16/12	DISCUSSING CLAIM WITH ATTORNEY REGARDING READING PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/17/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY, STATUS OF DISCOVERY AND RELEASE PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/17/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/17/12	REVIEW VARIOUS REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/17/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL WITH ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/17/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/17/12	DRAFTING REQUST TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
08/17/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/20/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM OBLENESS MEMORIAL HOSPTIAL PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/21/12	REVIEW MEDICAL ISSUES AND OPTIONS FOR CONSULTING OPINION FOR HEARING, DIRECT ADDITIONAL CONSULTING OPINION AND DEPOSITIONS PARTNER: PEF	.40

08/22/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/23/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S REQUEST FOR ROSENBERG X-RAY FILM AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/30/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM THE DISTRICT DIRECTOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/30/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM OBLENESS HOSPITAL REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/30/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/30/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.40
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 754.00
		========

Bewles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02257

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/10/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM CAMC REGARDING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
07/12/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO CAMC REGARDING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.30
07/13/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.70
07/25/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: DRAFTING REQUESTS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	1.60
08/02/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS RECEIVED (.8): TELEPHONE CALLS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS (.8) PARALEGAL: KC	1.60
08/02/12	RECEIPT OF MED RECORDS; DR. ATKINS - NO RECORDS FOR THIS TIME FRAME; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/08/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM CAMC PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/09/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO CAMC REGARDING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.10
08/27/12	REVIEWING ISSUE OF PENDING HEARING AND CONFIRMING HEARING CONTINUED PARALEGAL: D T	.10

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

08/28/12 RECEIPT OF X-RAY FILM AND RADIOLOGY REPORT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

.20

PARALEGAL: UV

INVOICE TOTAL

392.00

========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02281

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/23/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
07/25/12	REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.10); UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS (.10); VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.30); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES, MEDICAL RELEASE AND GUARDIAN PAPERS (.20) PARALEGAL: UV	.70
07/25/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/08/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/10/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM FAIRFIELD MEDICAL CENTER PARALEGAL: KC	.60
08/20/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/22/12	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORDS REQUESTS IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING PARALEGAL: TMH	.20
08/24/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM OFFICE OF DIRECTOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20

	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	322.00
00/31/12	REGARDING INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: KC		
08/31/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL	.20	
00/31/12	INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: KC	.10	
00/21/12	PARALEGAL: D T REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF	.40	
08/31/12	REVIEWING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT	.20	
	PARALEGAL: D T		
08/31/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF	.30	
	PARALEGAL: D T		
08/29/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE OFFICE OF THE	.10	
08/28/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60	

B Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02288

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/16/12	CHECK STATUS OF CASE AND CASE DEVELOPMENT (.20); REVIEW CASE MATERIALS (.10); CHECK FOR ANY ACTION BY JUDGE (.10); CHECK FOR ANY ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FROM CLAIMANT; CHECK STATUS OF RECORD DEVELOPMENT AND DISCOVERY (.20) PARTNER: PEF	.60
07/23/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
07/24/12	REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.10); UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS (.10); VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.30); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATED MEDICAL RELEASE (.20) PARALEGAL: UV	.70
07/25/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/09/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO MEDICAL FACILITY REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/10/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM LANCASTER HOSPITAL REGARDING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/14/12	CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/14/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60

08/24/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM OFFICE OF DIRECTOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/24/12	REVIEIWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM RADIOLOGY ASSOCIATES PARALEGAL: KC	.40	
08/29/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE OFFICE OF THE SOLICITOR REGARDING PENDING HEARING PARALEGAL: D T	.10	
08/30/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM LANCASTER HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: KC	.40	
08/31/12	REVIEWING PRIOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: D T	1.00	
08/31/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S REPORT PARALEGAL: D T	.30	
08/31/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL SUBMITTING READING BY DR. WHEELER PARALEGAL: D T	.20	
08/31/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL SUBMITTING READING BY DR. WHEELER PARALEGAL: D T	.20	
08/31/12	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE PARALEGAL: KC	.60	
	INVOICE TOTAL	·	519.00

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02292

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

07/16/12	CHECK STATUS OF CASE AND CASE DEVELOPMENT; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS (.10); CHECK FOR ANY ACTION BY JUDGE(.10); CHECK FOR ANY ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FROM CLAIMANT (.10); CHECK STATUS OF RECORD DEVELOPMENT AND DISCOVERY(.50). PARTNER: PEF	.50	
07/23/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
07/25/12	REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.10); UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS(.10); VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT(.30); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATED MEDICAL RELEASE(.20) PARALEGAL: UV	.70	
07/25/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
08/23/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM COUNSEL FOR DIRECTOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
08/24/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REGARDING PENDING HEARING AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.10	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	166.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02299

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

07/18/12	REVISE AND EDIT MOTION TO COMPEL (.30); CHECK ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE STATUS (.10); CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.50
07/18/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/23/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
07/24/12	REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE(.10); UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS(.10); VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT(.30); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATED MEDICAL RELEASE(.20) PARALEGAL: UV	.70
07/25/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/27/12	REVIEW OF FILE INFORMATION AND GOOGLE MAPS TO ADD EXHIBIT TO MOTION TO COMPEL PARTNER: SES	.20

Payable Upon Receipt

07/27/12	REGARDING DISTANCE FROM DR. ZALDIVAR'S OFFICE(RATIUS MAP (.50); FORWAL	; OBTAINING INFORMATION CLAIMANT'S RESIDENCE TO 20); PER REGULATIONS AND	1.40	
08/01/12	RECEIPT OF CLMT'S MEMOR. EMPLOYER'S MOTION TO CO. ATTEND MEDICAL EXAM; UP: CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH		.20	
08/07/12	EXAMINATION (.2); CHECK	AIMANT'S COUNSEL TO FOR ANY ORDER FROM EL (.1); DIRECT STAFF RE	.40	
08/07/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: KC	FOR RECEIPT OF	.40	
08/15/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGIN PARALEGAL: KC	G X-RAYS	.60	
08/23/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC PARALEGAL: UV	COUNSEL FOR DIRECTOR CLAIM FILE	.10	
08/24/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM T REGARDING PENDING HEARI PARALEGAL: D T	HE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NG AND UPDATING CLAIM	.10	
08/24/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGIN PARALEGAL: KC	G X-RAYS	.40	
08/28/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM BET REGARDING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	HESDA HOSPITAL	.20	
	INV	OICE TOTAL	\$	503.50

========

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02305

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
CHARLESTON, WEST VIRGINIA

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

.20

.20

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/16/12 RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND

UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

PARALEGAL: UV

08/24/12 RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND

UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

PARALEGAL: UV

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 28.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02319

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

.60

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING STATUS OF COUNSEL,

07/13/12 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH REPRESENTATIVE OF

	MATERIALS AND HEARING TRANSCRIPT (.20); EMAIL TO COUNSEL(.10). PARTNER: PEF	
07/13/12	REVIEWING TRANSCRIPT FROM HEARING AND VERIFYING STATUS OF CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.20
	RECEIPT OF NOTICE OF SPECIAL APPEARANCE, CLMT'S MOTION FOR EXTENSION; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
07/27/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/31/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE EXTENDING TIME FRAME FOR FILING OF BRIEF (.20); VERIFYING ORDER RECEIVED AND PROCESSED (.10); ADJUST DEADLINES AND NOTIFY COUNSEL (.30). PARALEGAL: D T	.60

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 183.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02320

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES .50 07/16/12 CHECK STATUS OF CASE AND CASE DEVELOPMENT; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS; CHECK FOR ANY ACTION BY JUDGE; CHECK FOR ANY ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FROM CLAIMANT; CHECK STATUS OF RECORD DEVELOPMENT AND DISCOVERY PARTNER: PEF 07/23/12 RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING .10 NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE+ PARALEGAL: UV 07/24/12 REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE .70 ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE(.10); UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS (.10); VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.30); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATED MEDICAL RELEASE (.20). PARALEGAL: UV 07/24/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT AND .20 UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB 08/06/12 REVIEW NOTICE OF HEARING AND STATUS OF CASE .60 DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF HEARING SCHEDULE, EVIDENCE IN RECORD TO DATE, REPORTS OF EXAMINATION, CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE, AND STATUS OF RECORD DEVELOPMENT PARTNER: PEF 08/08/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF .30 INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: KC 08/08/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF .50 INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: KC

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/13/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/16/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM SOUTH EASTERN OHIO REGIONAL MEDICAL CENTER PARALEGAL: D T	.60
08/16/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. STEVEN DUFF PARALEGAL: D T	.50
08/16/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF RADIOLOGY REPORTS FROM SOUTH EASTERN OHIO REGIONAL MEDICAL CENTER PARALEGAL: D T	.30
08/16/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. CHENDRAJ'S OFFICE PARALEGAL: D T	1.00
08/17/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/21/12	REVIEW MEDICAL ISSUES AND OPTIONS FOR CONSULTING OPINION FOR HEARING, DIRECT ADDITIONAL CONSULTING OPINION AND DEPOSITIONS	.40
	PARTNER: PEF	
08/21/12	REVIEW AND PREPARED DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS FOR DOL IN PREP FOR HEARING PARALEGAL: SL	1.30
08/21/12	DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. ROSENBERG FOR CONSULTING OPINION PARALEGAL: D T	.30
08/21/12	DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. ZALDIVAR FOR CONSULTING OPINION PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/21/12	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR RELEVANT INFORMATION FOR DOCTORS REVIEW AND DRAFTING INDEX OF MATERIAL PARALEGAL: D T	.80
08/21/12	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR RELEVANT INFORMATION PERTAINING TO ADULT DEPENDENT CHILD ISSUE PARALEGAL: D T	.50

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/21/12	REVIEWING CLAIM WITH ATTORNEY PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/21/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO SCHEDULE DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/21/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO SCHEDULE DEPOSITION OF DR. ROSENBERG PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/22/12	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND DR. ROSENBERG FOR CONSULTING OPINIONS AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD FROM ALL PARTIES PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/22/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND DR. ROSENBERG PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/22/12	REVIEW REPORTS OF JOHNS HOPKINS AND CONFIRM EVIDENCE SUBMITTED PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/22/12	REVIEW AND SIGN EVIDENCE SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/22/12	DRAFTING LETTER SUBMITTING READING BY DR. WHEELER PARALEGAL: D T	.30
08/22/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/22/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO CLAIMANT (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/23/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM GENESIS HEALTHCARE PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/27/12	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE STATUS OF DISCOVERY IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING PARALEGAL: TMH	.50

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/27/12	PREPARE LETTER OF TRANSMITTAL TO CLAIMANT, SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND AUTHORIZATION (2ND REQUEST) PARALEGAL: TMH	.30
08/28/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY HISTORY AND SIGN NEW DISCOVERY TO CLAIMANT PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/28/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM GENESIS HEALTHCARE REARDING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/29/12	REVIEWING MEDICAL REPORT BY DR. GEORGE ZALDIVAR PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/29/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM SUBMITTING MEDICAL REPORT BY DR. GEORGE ZALDIVAR PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/29/12	RECEIPT OF ZALDIVAR REPORT UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/29/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/30/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM THE DISTRICT DIRECTOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/31/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 1234.00

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02328

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

07/11/12	REVIEW INFORMATION ABOUT CHANGED DATES OF EXAMINATION (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S REPRESENTATIVE (.10). PARTNER: PEF	.20
07/11/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CLAIMANT'S SUPPLEMENTAL ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES TO DETERMINE ADDITIONAL RECORDS NEEDED IN DEFENSE OF CLAIM (.40); DRAFTING REQUESTS FOR UPDATED MEDICAL RECORDS AND RADIOLOGY FILMS (.60) PARALEGAL: UV	1.00
07/11/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: DRAFTING NOTICE OF INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION: UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM PARALEGAL: KC	.50
07/11/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/18/12	RECEIPT OF MED RECORDS; DR. JEBRAM KARAM, RALEIGH CARDIOLOGY; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
07/20/12	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED; REVIEW CARDIAC TREATMENT; CHECK VARIOUS SMOKING HISTORIES PARTNER: PEF	.60
07/20/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM DR. JEBRAM KARAM AND FROM BEAVER MEDICAL CLINIC; BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS. PARALEGAL: UV	1.00

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

07/20/12	RECEIPT OF MED RECORDS; BEAVER FAMILY CLINIC; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
07/23/12	REVIEWING AND PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/02/12	RECEIPT OF MED RECORDS; UVA HEALTH INFORMATION SERVICES; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/07/12	DRAFTING REFERRAL LETTER TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.3); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR READING OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION X-RAY (.2); PREPARING REFERRAL PACKET (.6) PARALEGAL: UV	1.10
08/07/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/07/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/08/12	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR FOR REPORT; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND SUBMITTED TO DATE (.4); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.1); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.60
08/08/12	TELEPHONE CALL FORM DR. KARAM REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.10
08/16/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM UNIVERSITY OF VIRGINIA HEALTH PARALEGAL: D T	.50
08/21/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/24/12	REVIEWING READINGS FROM DR. WHEELER'S OFFICE AND VERIFYING CLAIM STATUS PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/28/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO PRIOR DEADLINE FOR RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/29/12	RECEIPT OF ZALDIVAR REPORT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/30/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM BECKLEY VA AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 658.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02329

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/16/12 CHECK STATUS OF CASE AND CASE DEVELOPMENT.10);
REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, CHECK FOR ANY ACTION BY
JUDGE (.10); CHECK FOR ANY ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE
FROM CLAIMANT; CHECK STATUS OF RECORD
DEVELOPMENT AND DISCOVERY(.20).
PARTNER: PEF

INVOICE TOTAL

\$ 66.00

.40

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02339

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

07/23/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
07/25/12	REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.10); UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS (.10); VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.30); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATED MEDICAL RELEASE(.20). PARALEGAL: UV	.70
07/25/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/07/12	REVIEIWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
08/15/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/20/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/22/12	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORDS REQUESTS IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING PARALEGAL: TMH	.80
08/22/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE OFFICE OF THE SOLICITOR REGARDING PENDING HEARING AND UPDATING CLAIM	.10

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/27/12	RECEIVE INVOICE FROM RIVERSIDE METHODIST HOSPITAL FOR CD OF FILMS PARALEGAL: TMH	.10
08/27/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM GENESIS HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/27/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM GENESIS HOSPITAL REGARDING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/29/12	TELEPHOEN CALL FROM DR. BRAWNER REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/31/12	RECEIVE AND REVIEW CD FROM GENESIS HEALTHCARE SYSTEMS TO DETERMINE FILMS RECEIVED PARALEGAL: TMH	.20
08/31/12	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE PARALEGAL: TMH	.10
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 315.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02358

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/23/12 RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE HEARING .10 NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV 07/25/12 REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE .70 ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.10); UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS(.10); VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT(.30); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATED MEDICAL RELEASE (.20) PARALEGAL: UV 07/25/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT AND .20 UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB 08/01/12 RECEIPT OF CLMT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL .20 INTERROGATORIES; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH 08/06/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS .50 FROM BETHESDA HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: KC .60 08/09/12 REVIEWING AND CATALOGING XRAYS PARALEGAL: KC .40 08/14/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. ALBIRINI PARALEGAL: KC 08/20/12 RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING .20 NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV

08/23/12 REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORDS REQUESTS IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING PARALEGAL: TMH	.50
08/23/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/24/12 REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REGARDING PENDING HEARING AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/27/12 PREPARE MEDICAL RECORDS/X-RAY REQUEST LETTERS TO DR. ALBIRINI, GENESIS HEALTHCARE SYSTEM, DR. HAGGENHOS AND GENESIS HOME CARE PARALEGAL: TMH	.60
08/27/12 UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE PARALEGAL: TMH	.20
08/28/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.30
INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 350.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02403

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

______ .10 07/23/12 RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV .70 07/25/12 REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.10); UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS (.10); VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.30); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATED MEDICAL RELEASE (.20) PARALEGAL: UV 07/25/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S .20 COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB .20 08/24/12 RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM OFFICE OF DIRECTOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV 08/29/12 REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE OFFICE OF THE .10 SOLICITOR REGARDING PENDING HEARING PARALEGAL: D T

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 91.00

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02424

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

	DAIL. BELL	MIDDIC I, Z
	DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES	
07/10/12	REVIEW READINGS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS (.20); CONFIRM NEED FOR CONSULTING OPINIONS AND DEPOSITIONS (.30). PARTNER: PEF	.50
07/10/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS TO CONFIRM ISSUES (.20); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE RE SAME (.10). PARTNER: PEF	.30
07/10/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FOR EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT NEEDED FOR HEARING (.70); REVIEW ISSUE OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT(.30). PARALEGAL: D T	1.00
07/10/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/11/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM CAMC REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
07/12/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS; REVIEW CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE; REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND TO DR. ROSENBERG; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND OTHER MATERIALS (.50); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG(.10); REVIEW DEPOSITION SCHEDULE AND DEADLINES(.10) PARTNER: PEF	.80
07/12/12	REVIEWING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT FOR COMPLETION OF EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT PARALEGAL: D T	.40

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

07/12/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.40
07/12/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/13/12	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS; COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES; DESIGNATE EVIDENCE (.40); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH REPORTS OF DR. SCOTT (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.50
07/13/12	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING PREHEARING REPORT AND EVIDENCE SUMMARY PURSUANT TO NOTICE OF HEARING (2.3); DRAFTING LETTER TO CLAIMANT(.20) PARALEGAL: D T	2.50
07/13/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.20
07/13/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSIONS TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.30
07/16/12	DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND OF DR. ROSENBERG (.50); DOCKETING DEPOSITION TIMES (.10) PARALEGAL: UV	.60
07/17/12	SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE WITH NOTICE OF DR. ROSENBERG DEPOSITION (.10); CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE WITH NOTICE OF DR. ZALDIVAR DEPOSITION (.10); CHECK MATERIALS SENT TO PHYSICIANS FOR REPORTS (.50) PARTNER: PEF	.70

07/17/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.30
07/18/12	CHECK STATUS OF DEVELOPMENT; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS; DIRECT ACTION REGARDING DEPOSITIONS (.20); REVIEW VOICEMAIL FROM OFFICE OF CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL(.10); REVIEW EVIDENCE AND ISSUES IN LIGHT OF CONTINUANCE REQUEST (.30); TELEPHONE CALL TO OFFICE OF CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL(.20). PARTNER: PEF	.75
07/19/12	CONFIRM INTENT TO CANCEL DEPOSITION; REVIEW DATES (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE RE SAME (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.25
07/19/12	DRAFTED AND FILED MOTION TO CANCEL DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR(.50) PHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.10) REVISED AND SUBMITTED EVIDENCE SUMMARY (.50) PARALEGAL: SL	1.10
07/19/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/20/12	REVIEW REVISED EVIDENCE SUMMARY (.40); COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN CASE MATERIALS CONFIRM NEED TO SUBMIT PENDING RECEIPT OF MOTION TO CONTINUE(.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL(.10) PARTNER: PEF	.60
07/20/12	RECEIPT OF CLMT'S MOTION FOR CONTINUANCE; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
07/23/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

07/24/12	RECEIPT OF CONSULTING REPORT FROM DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/25/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
07/26/12	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT REGARDING ZALDIVAR DEPOSITION AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/27/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/27/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/01/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR, CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.30
08/01/12	REVIEWING AND ORGANZING FILE MATERIAL FOR DEPOSITION PARALEGAL: KC	.60
08/09/12	RECEIPT OF ZALDIVAR REPORT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 1482.00

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02433

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

07/23/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
07/25/12	REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS (.20); VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.30); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE(.20). PARALEGAL: UV	.70
07/25/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/08/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/13/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM MEDICAL FACILITIES PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/20/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/22/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE SOLICITOR REGARDING PENDING HEARING AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/27/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE PARALEGAL: KC	.30

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02445

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

07/25/12	REVIEWING CLAIM TO DETERMINE STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT PURSUANT TO PENDING DEADLINE BEFORE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE PARALEGAL: D T	.30
07/30/12	REVIEW ISSUES AND COMPARE WITH RECORD, LIST OF ISSUES COMPILED BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.30); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE RE ISSUES (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.40
07/30/12	RECEIPT OF CT ANS - RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
07/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/03/12	REVIEWING, IDENTIFYING AND CATALOGING 3 CDS, CTS AND X-RAYS; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.60
08/08/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S SUBMISSIONS OF EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/09/12	REVIEW EVIDENCE AND DEVELOPMENT FOR DEADLINE (.3); CHECK DEPOSITION SCHEDULE; CONFIRM ADDITIONAL TIME NEEDED AND TIMEFRAME FOR EVIDENCE COMPLETION (.1); DIRECT STAFF TO CONTACT CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1); REVIEW DRAFT MOTION TO CONTINUE (.1); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.70
08/09/12	DRAFTING MOTION TO CONTINUE TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.70

Bewies Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

08/09/12	PROCESSING MOTION TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10	
08/10/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. SALON AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/13/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
08/17/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE CONTINUING HEARING AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.10	
08/22/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. SALON AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
08/23/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM COUNSEL FOR DIRECTOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
08/24/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REGARDING PENDING HEARING AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.10	
08/24/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. SALON'S OFFICE PARALEGAL: D T	1.60	
08/27/12	REVIEWING ISSUE OF PENDING HEARING AND CONFIRMING HEARING CONTINUED PARALEGAL: D T	.10	
08/28/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. SALON'S OFFICE PARALEGAL: D T	1.20	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	594.50

========

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02451

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

08/07/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/20/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM CLEVELAND CLINIC PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/31/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 98.00
		========

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02454

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

07/13/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICES AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV		.20
07/16/12	REVIEWING THREE SEPARATE ORDERS FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REGARDING CLAIM STATUS AND APPEAL TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND VERIFYING CLAIM STATUS PARALEGAL: D T		.30
07/23/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV		.20
07/26/12	VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT; UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV		.30
08/16/12	RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV		.20
08/20/12	REVIEW AND PREPARED ELECTRONIC FILE OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS RECEIVED FROM DOL (MINERS CLAIM) PARALEGAL: SL	1	.70
08/21/12	REVIEW AND PREPARED ELECTRONIC FILE OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS OF SURVIVOR'S CLAIM FROM DOL PARALEGAL: SL	1	.20
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	287.00

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186 Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02465

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

07/10/12	REVIEW PLEADING SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10
07/10/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/11/12	REVIEW REQUEST FOR HEARING; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS AND STATUS OF EVIDENCE IN LIGHT OF HEARING REQUEST PARTNER: PEF	.30
07/11/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CLAIMANT'S SUPPLEMENTAL ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES TO DETERMINE ADDITIONAL RECORDS NEEDED IN DEFENSE OF CLAIM (.20); DRAFTING REQUESTS FOR UPDATED MEDICAL RECORDS AND RADIOLOGY FILMS(.40). PARALEGAL: UV	.60
07/12/12	VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT PARALEGAL: D T	.40
07/17/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM THE MANCHIN CLINIC AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE(.10); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING RECORDS AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS(.20) PARALEGAL: UV	.30
07/18/12	RECEIPT OF OPERATOR NOTIFICATION; CLMT NOT ELIGIBLE; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
07/27/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EXHIBIT 1 AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

07/30/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISC RECEIVED FROM MANCHIN CLINIC TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY REPORTS ON DISC; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.30	
07/31/12	REVIEWING SUBMISSION FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL OF X-RAY READING AND CONFIRMING STATUS OF EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT PARALEGAL: D T	.10	
08/02/12	RECEIPT OF CLMT'S EXHIBIT 2; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20	
08/03/12	REVIEW OF CLAIMANTS EXHIBIT 2 OF X-RAY READING BY AFZAL AHMED FOR REBUTTAL. PARALEGAL: SL	.20	
08/24/12	RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/27/12	REVIEW AND PREPARED ELECTRONIC FILE OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBIT FROM DOL PARALEGAL: SL	1.80	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	395.00
		====	======

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02466

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

08/07/12	CHECK STATUS OF DISCOVERY BY UNDERWRITERS PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/07/12	REVIEW MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS, APPLICATION, NOTICE OF CLAIM, WORK HISTORY, PRIOR CASE EVIDENCE AND RESOLUTION PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/07/12	REVIEW PLEADING, SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/07/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY, SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/07/12	REVIEWING NEW FILE RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR TO DETERMINE LITIGATION STATUS (.1); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (.1); REOPENING CLIENT MATTER (.1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (.2); DRAFTING SUMMARY SHEET (.2); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (.2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1) PARALEGAL: UV	1.00
08/07/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/07/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

08/16/12 REVIEW EMAIL MESSAGE FROM MR. SHARPS AND .20
REVIEW CASE MATERIALS RE SAME
PARTNER: PEF

08/17/12 UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND ORGANIZING

.50

CASE MATERIALS
ADMINISTRATIVE: LB

INVOICE TOTAL

\$ 281.50

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02484

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/10/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF .40 MEDICAL RELEASE PARALEGAL: KC 07/12/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM .40 BECKLEY APPALACHAIN REGIONAL HOSPITAL REGARDING INVOICE PARALEGAL: KC 07/25/12 REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND STATUS OF MEDICAL .80 RECORD DEVELOPMENT(.30); DRAFTING INITIAL EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM LISTING CT SCANS(.50). PARALEGAL: D T .50 07/26/12 REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC .40 07/27/12 TELEPHONE CALL FROM BECKLEY APPALACHAIN REGIONAL HOSPITAL REGARDING PATHOLOGY PARALEGAL: KC 07/30/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF .60 PATHOLOGY PARALEGAL: KC .50 08/02/12 REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC 08/13/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS .40 FROM SOUTHERN WV CLINIC PARALEGAL: KC .30 08/15/12 REVIEWING CLAIMANT'S ANSWER TO INTERROGATORIES AND DRAFTING LIST OF RELEVANT FACILITIES PARALEGAL: D T

08/15/12	VERIFYING REQUEST FOR RECORDS FORWARDED TO ALL RELEVANT FACILITIES PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/15/12	REVIEWING VARIOUS MEDICAL RECORDS FOR ARTERIAL BLOOD GAS STUDIES AND PULMONARY FUNCTION STUDIES PARALEGAL: D T	.50
08/15/12	REVIEWING VARIOUS MEDICAL RECORDS FOR REFERENCES TO CT SCANS PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/15/12	DISCUSSING CLAIM WITH ATTORNEY FOR FURTHER EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT PARALEGAL: D T	.40
08/15/12	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50
08/17/12	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF RADIOLOGY REPORTS FROM APPALACHIAN REGIONAL HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: D T	.20
08/17/12	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RECORDS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES PARALEGAL: KC	.20
08/22/12	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE WHICH MEDICAL RECORDS HAVE NOT BEEN RECEIVED BY PROVIDER PARALEGAL: TMH	.20
08/22/12	PREPARE MEDICAL RECORDS REQUEST LETTERS TO NEW RIVER BREATHING CENTER AND SOUTHERN WV CLINIC PARALEGAL: TMH	.30
08/22/12	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REQUESTING UPDATED MEDICAL AUTHORIZATION PARALEGAL: TMH	.10
08/22/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20

		==	=======
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	644.50
	PARALEGAL: KC		
08/31/12	DEPOSITION	, –	
00/21/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. RENN REGARDING	.2	0
	PARALEGAL: KC		
08/31/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION	. 2	0
	PARALEGAL: KC		
00/2//12	MEDICAL RECORDS FROM SOUTHERN WV CLINIC		
08/27/12	REVIEIWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF	. 4	0
	PARALEGAL: KC		
08/23/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OV X-RAYS FROM BECKEY APPALACHAIN REGIONAL HOSPTIAL	.5	U
		_	•
	COUNSEL PARTNER: PEF		
08/23/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S	.1	O .
	PARTNER: PEF		
08/23/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND HISTORY OF DISCOVERY	.20)

Beg 321 of 4 Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02487

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/12/12	CHECK STATUS OF CASE DEVELOPMENT; REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED TO DATE; COMPARE WITH REQUESTS(.30); REVIEW ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND COMPARE WITH RECORDS(.30); DIRECT ADDITIONAL DEVELOPMENT NECESSARY(.10) PARTNER: PEF	.70
07/26/12	VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT(.20); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE(.20). PARALEGAL: UV	.40
07/30/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY TO DATE(.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT(.10) PARTNER: PEF	.20
07/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/20/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 204.50

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02492

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

08/06/12	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE AND RETURNED X-RAY FILM FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/09/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/13/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RETURNING FILM AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.10
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 21.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02496

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

07/10/12	REVIEW PLEADING(.20); COMPARE WITH INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS; CHECK STATUS OF MINER'S CASE TO DETERMINE WHETHER CONSOLIDATION IS POSSIBLE(.20); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUESTING A HEARING(.10) PARTNER: PEF	.50
07/10/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/16/12	REVIEWING STATUS OF RESPONSE TO ORDER DENYING BENEFITS AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: D T	.10
07/20/12	REVIEW RECORDS AND STATUS OF RECORD DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF AWARD AND REQUEST FOR HEARING(.30); REVIEW DISCOVERY; CHECK FOR ANY RESPONSES FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL(.10); DIRECT EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT NECESSARY(.10). PARTNER: PEF	.50
07/26/12	VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT(.10); DRAFTING SECOND REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES, MEDICAL RELEASE, DEATH CERTIFICATE AND EXECUTRIX PAPERS(.30) PARALEGAL: UV	.40
07/27/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICES AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/30/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY; CHECK FOR CONTACT WITH CLAIMANT'S REPRESENTATIVE; SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S REPRESENTATIVE PARTNER: PEF	.20

Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186 Payable Upon Receipt

	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 352.00
08/30/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.60
08/09/12	REVIEIWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: KC	.40
07/31/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND CONFIRMING HEARING REQUESTED PARALEGAL: D T	.10
07/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02499

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/27/12 RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER
AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
PARALEGAL: UV

08/29/12 REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW
JUDGE WITHDRAWING CLAIM
PARALEGAL: D T

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 14.00

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 14.00 ========

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186 Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02512

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/16/12 RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND
UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
PARALEGAL: UV

08/21/12 TELEPHONE CALL TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO
DETERMINE WHETHER CLAIMANT CONTESTED THE
5/9/12 PDO/DENIAL ORDER
PARALEGAL: UV

08/21/12 DRAFTING MEMO TO FILE
PARALEGAL: UV

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 28.00

B Bowlet Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02513

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/19/12 REVIEW DECISION AWARDING BENEFITS ISSUED BY .70 DISTRICT DIRECTOR; REVIEW AND ANALYZE EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD, EXPERT REPORTS, TEST RESULTS AND INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS, ISSUES PARTNER: PEF 07/19/12 CHECK STATUS OF DISCOVERY AND DEVELOPMENT IN .30 LIGHT OF NEED TO APPEAL DECISION PARTNER: PEF 07/19/12 RECEIPT OF MED RECORDS; CLEVELAND CLINIC; .20 UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH 07/19/12 RECEIPT OF PDO; AWARD OF BENEFITS; UPDATING .20 ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH 07/20/12 PREPARED RESPONSE TO DOL AWARD OF BENEFITS .40 PARALEGAL: SL .50 07/24/12 REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM CLEVELAND CLINIC AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS PARALEGAL: UV .20 07/30/12 CHECK RESPONSE TO DECISION; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS TO CONFIRM ALL DATA(.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REOUESTING A HEARING (.10). PARTNER: PEF 07/30/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF .20 LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

08/16/12 RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

.20

UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM

PARALEGAL: UV

08/22/12 REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR

.10

AND VERIFYING CLAIM STATUS

PARALEGAL: D T

INVOICE TOTAL

324.00

========

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02514

JIM LINDEN DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC 12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400 ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES _____

07/19/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS .30 (.10); TELEPHONE CALL TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR; DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY(.20) PARALEGAL: UV

INVOICE TOTAL

21.00 ========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02524

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/06/12	CHECK STATUS OF CASE AND CASE DEVELOPMENT, CONFIRM NO NOTICE OF HEARING RECEIVED TO DATE, CHECK FOR RECEIPT OF ANY ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FROM COUNSEL FOR CLAIMANT (.30); CHECK STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT AND DISCOVERY (.20) PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/17/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/17/12	REVIEW OF INTERROGATORIES STATUS AND PREPARED SUPPLEMENTAL PARALEGAL: SL	.70
08/17/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 178.50

B Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02532

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

07/30/12	REVIEW STATUS OF DISCOVERY; DIRECT STAFF RE CONTACTING CLAIMANT(.20); REVIEW DISCOVERY; SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT(.20) PARTNER: PEF	.40
07/30/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE; REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE; UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS; VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT; DRAFTING REQUEST FOR INTERROGATORIES, MEDICAL RELEASE AND EXECUTRIX PAPERS PARALEGAL: UV	.70
07/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/31/12	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE OFFICE OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S OFFICE REGARDING PENDING HEARING PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/02/12	REVIEW NOTICE OF HEARING AND COMPARE WITH SCHEDULE, DEADLINES PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/02/12	CHECK STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF NOTICE OF HEARING, INCLUDING CHECKING FOR RECEIPT OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND CHECKING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT PARTNER: PEF	.40

Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186 Payable Upon Receipt

08/03/12	RECEIPT OF WIDOW'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/08/12	CATALOGING X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/10/12	CONFIRM NEED FOR ESTATE PAPERS, SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/10/12	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR EXECUTRIX PAPERS PARALEGAL: KC	.40
08/10/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO WIDOW (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO WIDOW (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/13/12	DRAFTING MOTION TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE TO CONTINUE HEARING PARALEGAL: D T	.30
08/13/12	DRAFTING COVER LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/16/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR REGARDING MINER'S AND WIDOW'S CLAIMS PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/16/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS PURSUANT TO TELEPHONE CALL FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/16/12	DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY REGARDING LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/17/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT REGARDING EXECUTRIX PAPERS PARALEGAL: KC	.20

Payable Upon Receipt

08/20/12 RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S DEATH CERTIFICATE AND

.20

UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

PARALEGAL: UV

08/24/12 REVIEWING DEATH CERTIFICATE FROM CLAIMANT'S

.10

WIDOW

PARALEGAL: D T

INVOICE TOTAL

426.50

========

B Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02533

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

.60

EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP. Sep 1, 2012 PAGE 2

FILE NUMBER: P0495.02533 INVOICE NO.: 458238

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/10/12 REVIEW EMAIL FROM UNDERWRITERS(.10); REVIEW .20
CASE MATERIALS; EMAIL TO UNDERWRITERS(.10)
PARTNER: PEF

07/12/12 REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR DENYING BENEFITS AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH

DEADLINE TO RESPOND; DRAFTING LETTER TO THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR

PARALEGAL: D T

07/16/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF .20
LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB

07/17/12 REVIEW EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY .80
DEPARTMENT OF LABOR; COMPARE WITH INFORMATION
AND EVIDENCE IN CASE MATERIALS AND RECORD(.50);

CHECK FOR ANY ACTION BY CLAIMANT(.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR; CHECK STATUS OF DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF

DECISION(.20).
PARTNER: PEF

07/23/12 REVIEWING STATUS OF RESPONSE TO THE .10
DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REGARDING DENIAL OF

BENEFITS
PARALEGAL: D T

08/09/12 CHECK FOR ANY REQUEST FOR HEARING FROM .20

CLAIMANT

PARTNER: PEF

Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02534

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

- 07/10/12 RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS
 OF X-RAY FILM FROM DR. RENN'S INDEPENDENT
 MEDICAL EXAMINATION AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC
 CLAIM FILE; REVIEWING AND ANALYZING
 REPORTS(.20); DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR.
 RENN FORWARDING DR. SCOTT'S B-READER REPORT FOR
 COMPLETION OF HIS INDEPENDENT MEDICAL
 EXAMINATION REPORT(.20)
 PARALEGAL: UV
- 07/12/12 RECEIPT OF IME, DR. RENN; UPDATING ELECTRONIC .20
 CLAIM FILE
 ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH
- 07/13/12 REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS; COMPARE WITH
 OTHER EVIDENCE; DESIGNATE EVIDENCE(.20); SIGN
 CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH DR.
 SCOTT REPORT(.10); REVIEW REPORT OF DR. RENN
 AND COMPARE WITH DOL EVIDENCE(.30); SIGN
 CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR; CONFIRM
 FILING OF X-RAY(.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO
 DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH REQUIRED FILM; REVIEW
 MEDICAL RECORDS FOR SUBMISSION(.10); SIGN
 CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH
 SAME(.10)
 PARTNER: PEF
- 07/13/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS
 AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT RECEIPT OF DR. RENN'S
 REPORT; REVIEWING AND ANALYZING REPORT(.20);
 DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF DR. RENN'S REPORT AND
 DR. SCOTT'S READING OF DR. RENN'S X-RAY
 FILM(.20); REVIEWING MEDICAL RECORDS SUPPORTING
 CLAIMANT'S SMOKING HISTORY(.20); DRAFTING
 SUBMISSIONS OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH
 GENERAL HOSPITAL AND FROM ACCESS HEALTH RURAL
 ACRES(.20); DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO

	DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION X-RAY FILM(2.0) PARALEGAL: UV		
07/13/12	PROCESSING MULTIPLE SUBMISSIONS TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.60	
07/19/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED PURSUANT TO UPCOMING DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
07/23/12	REVIEWING AND PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
08/15/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS PARALEGAL: KC	.50	
08/23/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED PURSUANT TO CLAIMANT'S DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 3.	72.50

B Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02535

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/16/12	RECEIPT OF CLMT'S ATTORNEY REQUESTING EXTENSION; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
07/20/12	REVIEWING AND PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV	.10
07/24/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM JUDGE MORGAN'S OFFICE REGARDING SCHEDULING OF HEARING; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.30
07/26/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR EXTENSION ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/31/12	DOCKETING UPDATED EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES PURSUANT TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR EXTENSION ORDER PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/15/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT CLAIMANT'S DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/23/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10

\$ 84.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02537

JIM LINDEN DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC 12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400 ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	84.00
07/31/12	REVIEWING NOTICE OF APPEAL FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT PARALEGAL: D T	. 1	0
07/25/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S REQUEST FOR HEARING, AND DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.2	0
07/24/12	REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE(.30); UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS; VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT(.20). PARALEGAL: UV	.5	0
07/23/12	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	. 2	0
07/18/12	RECEIPT OF CLMT LETTER REQUESTING ALJ HEARING; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.2	0

0 ========

B Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02538

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

07/17/12	REVIEW DECISION OF DISTRICT DIRECTOR; REVIEW EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR(.30); REVIEW EVIDENCE SUBMITTED TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR(.10); COMPARE DECISION WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS(.20). PARTNER: PEF	.60
07/17/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/18/12	RECEIPT OF TO DOL LETTER TO FORWARD CLAIM TO ALJ; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
07/19/12	REVIEW INFORMATION RE APPEAL BY CLAIMANT(.10); REVIEW CASE MATERIALS; REVIEW STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT, MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT AND DISCOVERY IN LIGHT OF REQUEST FOR HEARING BY CLAIMANT(.50) PARTNER: PEF	.60
07/20/12	PREPARED RESPONSE TO DOL DENIAL OF BENEFITS PARALEGAL: SL	.30
07/27/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/30/12	CHECK RESPONSE TO DECISION(.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR(.10); CONFIRM NO RESPONSE FROM CLAIMANT(.10) PARTNER: PEF	.30
07/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20

07/31/12 REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND CONFIRMING HEARING REQUESTED AND VERIFYING STATUS OF MEDICAL DEVELOPMENT PARALEGAL: D T	.10	
08/10/12 REVIEWED MEDICAL RECORDS FROM FAIRMONT GENERAL HOSPITAL PARALEGAL: SL	1.30	
08/28/12 RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/30/12 REVIEW AND PREPARED ELECTRONIC FILE OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS FROM DOL PARALEGAL: SL	1.00	
INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 50 =====	6.50 ====

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02541

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/30/12 TELEPHONE CALL TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO .10

VERIFY CLAIMANT DID NOT CONTEST THE 4/26/12

DENIAL ORDER

PARALEGAL: UV

08/30/12 DRAFTING E-MAIL RESPONSE TO THIRD PARTY .10
ADMINISTRATOR
PARALEGAL: UV

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 14.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02542

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

07/17/12	REVIEW DECISION OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR; REVIEW EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS PARTNER: PEF	.40
07/17/12	CHECK STATUS OF DISCOVERY AND DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF DECISION PARTNER: PEF	.10
07/17/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/20/12	PREPARED RESPONSE TO DOL DENIAL OF BENEFITS PARALEGAL: SL	.30
07/30/12	CHECK RESPONSE TO DECISION(.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR; CONFIRM NO RESPONSE FROM CLAIMANT(.10) PARTNER: PEF	.20
07/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/02/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND HISTORY OF DISCOVERY PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/02/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/02/12	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL DEVELOPMENT (.3); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE; UPDATING CLAIM FILE (.2) PARALEGAL: UV	.50

Bewlet Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/02/12 PROCESSING REQUEST TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/08/12 RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/10/12 CHECK STATUS; EMAIL UNDERWRITERS PARTNER: PEF	.20
INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 310.00

Bewlet Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02543

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

07/10/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, HAND DELIVER, AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.40
07/11/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/19/12	REVIEWING AND PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/01/12	RECEIPT OF PDO - DENIAL OF BENEFITS; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/02/12	REVIEW DECISION OF DISTRICT DIRECTOR, INCLUDING EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY U.S. DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, AS COMPARED WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN CASE MATERIALS, RESPONSE FROM CLAIMANT (.4); CHECK STATUS OF DISCOVERY AND CASE DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF DECISION (.2) PARTNER: PEF	.60
08/02/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/02/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR DENYING BENEFITS AND DRAFTING LETTER IN RESPONSE; UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE PARALECAL: UV	.40

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02544

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

07/16/12	REVIEW DECISION OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR(.10); REVIEW EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD, PHYSICIAN REPORTS AND TEST RESULTS, AND OTHER INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS(.50) PARTNER: PEF	.60	
07/16/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR DENYING BENEFITS AND UPDATING SYSTEM FOR DEADLINE RESPONSE (.30); DRAFTING LETTER IN RESPONSE TO THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR(.20) PARALEGAL: D T	.50	
07/16/12	RECEIPT OF PDO; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20	
07/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
07/31/12	CHECK RESPONSE TO DECISION(.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR(.10) PARTNER: PEF	.20	
08/28/12	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RESPONSE TO PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	202.00

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02546

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/06/12 RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV

.20

INVOICE TOTAL \$ 14.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02548

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

07/10/12	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS FOR EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT(.30); CHECK STATUS OF RECORD REQUESTS; REVIEW RESPONSES AND RECORDS; CHECK STATUS OF PATHOLOGY REPORTS(.20); REVIEW READINGS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS(.20). PARTNER: PEF	.70
07/10/12	DRAFTED LETTER AND PREPARED DOCUMENTS FOR ZALDIVAR IME REVIEW(1.6) REVIEW FILE AND DRAFT 2ND REQUEST FOR FILMS FROM WOLFE (.30) PARALEGAL: SL	1.90
07/10/12	REVIEWING AND SUMMARIZING MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. CRAFT AND NORTON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL(1.3); REVIEWING CLAIMANT'S ANSWER TO INTERROGATORIES AND VERIFYING STATUS OF REQUEST FOR PATHOLOGY SLIDES(.40); REVIEWING MEDICAL REPORT FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND VERIFYING STATUS OF REQUEST FOR CLAIMANT'S FILM(.50); DETERMINING IF EVALUATION NECESSARY BEFORE PATHOLOGY SLIDES RECEIPT(.30) PARALEGAL: D T	2.50
07/11/12	CONFIRM STATUS OF FILMS FOR READINGS; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS; SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL PARTNER: PEF	.20
07/11/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/13/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY: TELEPHONE CALL TO LOGAN GENERAL REGARDING PATHOLOGY PARALEGAL: KC	.50

Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

07/16/12	RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY SLIDES AND REPORTS FROM LOGAN GENERAL HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/17/12	CONFIRM EXAMINATION SCHEDULE(.10); REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR(.30); REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS AND STATUS OF DEVELOPMENT(.20); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR(.10) PARTNER: PEF	.65
07/17/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ZALDIVAR'S OFFICE REGARDING UPCOMING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION(.20); REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR ACTION NEEDED(.10) PARALEGAL: UV	.30
07/17/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/18/12	REVIEW OF PATHOLOGY REPORT RECEIVED PARALEGAL: SL	.20
07/19/12	REVIEW EMAIL FROM OFFICE OF CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL(.10); REVIEW CASE MATERIALS; DIRECT STAFF RE ACTION(.20) PARTNER: PEF	.30
07/24/12	PREPARED LTR TO DOL REQUESTING 5-4-12 FILM BE SENT TO DR. WHEELER (.20) PREPARED LTR TO DR. WHEELER TO DO READING OF 5-4-12 FILM (.20) PARALEGAL: SL	.40
07/30/12	PROCESSING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/31/12	CONFIRM STATUS OF FILMS; SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUESTING PRODUCTION(.20); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS(.10) PARTNER: PEF	.30
07/31/12	RECEIPT OF ZALDIVAR REPORT; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20

07/31/12 RECEIPT OF B-READER FROM WHEELER; 7-18-12 FILM; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20	
08/06/12 RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/08/12 RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/21/12 RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S REQUEST FOR ZALDIVAR X-RAY FILM AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	. 20	
08/23/12 REVIEW OF LOGAN REGIONAL MEDICAL CENTER CD OF X-RAY FILMS PARALEGAL: SL	.60	
08/30/12 TWO PHONE CONVERSATIONS WITH DR. WHEELER'S OFFICE CONCERNING X-RAY REPORTS PARALEGAL: SL	.20	
INVOICE TOTAL	\$ ===	942.75

Bewilet Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02552

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

07/11/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. HASSON'S OFFICE REGARDING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION REPORT PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/17/12	RECEIPT OF INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION REPORT FROM DR. HASSON AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE; REVIEWING AND ANALYZING REPORT(.30); DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE(.20); DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER TO DETERMINE WHETHER INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION X-RAY HAD BEEN FORWARDED TO HIM(.10); TELEPHONE CALL TO KIRKLAND CLINIC REGARDING X-RAY FILM OF 6/19/12(.20); DRAFTING REQUEST TO UAB HOSPITAL TO PROVIDE THE 6/19/12 INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION X-RAY TO THE EMPLOYER(.20) PARALEGAL: UV	.80
07/18/12	COMPARE HASSON REPORT WITH ISSUES WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES PARTNER: PEF	.50
07/18/12	RECEIPT OF MED RECORDS; PRINCETON BAPTIST HOSPITAL; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
07/18/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/24/12	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM UNIVERSITY OF ALABAMA HOSPITALS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.30

07/31/12	REVIEW DEADLINE AND EVIDENCE; CONFIRM NEED TO SUBMIT REPORT OF DR. HASSON(.20); DIRECT READINGS OF CT SCANS AND X-RAY(.10); REVIEW STATUS OF EXAM FILM(.10); REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FOR POSSIBLE SUBMISSION(.40) PARTNER: PEF	.65
07/31/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO KIRKLAND CLINIC REGARDING REQUEST FOR 6/19/12 X-RAY FILM(.20); TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. JUBAL WATTS REGARDING CERTIFICATE OF B-READING AND CURRICULUM VITAE(.20); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM PRINCETON BAPTIST HOSPITAL AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS(.70); REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR ACTIONS NEEDED PURSUANT TO UPCOMING DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE(.40); DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY(.10) PARALEGAL: UV	1.60
08/01/12	CHECK STATUS OF RECORD DEVELOPMENT (.2); REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM VARIOUS FACILITIES AND DESIGNATE RECORDS FOR SUBMISSION INTO THE RECORD (.5) PARTNER: PEF	.70
08/01/12	REVIEW AND SIGN VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH MEDICAL RECORDS PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/01/12	REVIEW CT SCAN FILMS AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND TO DESIGNATE FILMS FOR CONSULTING REPORTS PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/01/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER REQUESTING REPORTS ON SEVERAL X-RAYS AND CT SCANS PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/01/12	REVIEW PROJECTED DATES OF EVIDENCE COMPLETION, REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS, COMPARE WITH DEADLINES FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.20

08/01/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REGARDING DEADLINES PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/01/12	DRAFTING MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME (.3); DRAFTING SUBMISSIONS OF EVIDENCE OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. MORGAN, WALKER MEDICAL DIAGNOSTICS, AND WALKER BAPTIST HOSPITAL (.8); DRAFTING REQUEST TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY FOR READING OF CT SCANS AND X-RAY FILMS (.2) PARALEGAL: UV	1.30
08/01/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/01/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/02/12	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM UNIVERSITY OF ALABAMA HOSPITAL; REVIEWING COMPACT DISC TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY REPORTS CONTAINED ON DISC; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.30
08/13/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/15/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM WALKER BAPTIST HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/21/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/29/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE PARALEGAL: UV	.20

B Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

08/29/12	DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WATTS REQUESTING COPY OF HIS B-READER CERTIFICATE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/29/12	DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/30/12	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHN HOPKINS RE VARIOUS CT SCANS AND DIGITAL X-RAYS, COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/31/12	REVIEW EVIDENCE SUBMITTED TO DATE AND CONFIRM NEED FOR ADDITIONAL SUBMISSIONS PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/31/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR SUBMITTING EXAMINATION REPORT, CT SCAN READINGS BY DR. WHEELER, DIGITAL X-RAY READINGS BY DR. WHEELER, AND X-RAY READING OF DR. WATTS PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/31/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF CT SCAN READINGS BY DR. WHEELER, X-RAY READING BY DR. WHEELER, AND X-RAY READING BY DR. WATTS PARALEGAL: UV	.60
08/31/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSIONS TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); HAND DELIVER SUBMISSIONS TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.2) UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSIONS TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.40

INVOICE TOTAL

1113.25

=========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02555

JIM LINDEN DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC 12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400 ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

PARALEGAL: UV

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

	DESCRIPTION OF DEGAL SERVICES	
07/11/12	REVIEW CT SCAN FILMS RECEIVED TO DATE, INCLUDING SCAN FROM ONE MONTH AGO (.20); REVIEW MEDICAL EVIDENCE IN RECORD TO DATE (.10); DIRECT STAFF RE EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.40
07/11/12	RECEIPT OF 2 COMPACT DISCS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE (.10); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISC TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISCS (.30); REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RE-READING OF 2007 X-RAY FILM FROM DR. WHEELER (.10); DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER REGARDING STATUS OF REPORT (.10); DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY PARALEGAL: UV	.60
07/12/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.10); REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR ACTIONS NEEDED AT RECEIPT OF REREADINGS OF CLAIMANT'S EVIDENTIARY FILM (.30) PARALEGAL: UV	.40
07/13/12	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS; COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES (.30); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.40
07/13/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/16/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF DR. WHEELER'S READING OF 10/30/07 X-RAY PARALEGAL: UV	.30
7/20/12 H	REVIEWING AND PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM	.10

Bewles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

07/30/12	CHECK STATUS OF ADDITIONAL FILMS; REVIEW CD WITH FILMS; COMPARE WITH MEDICAL RECORDS; CONFIRM NEED FOR REVIEW PARTNER: PEF	.30	
07/30/12	SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER REQUESTING REPORT PARTNER: PEF	.10	
07/30/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE (.20); CATALOGING ALL RADIOLOGY FILMS RECEIVED IN CLAIM (.30); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR RE-READING OF CT SCANS RECEIVED FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER (.10) PARALEGAL: UV	.70	
07/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
08/17/12	RECEIPT OF CHEST CT SCAN REPORT BY DR. WHEELER; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20	
08/21/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR ACTIONS NEEDED AT RECEIPT CT READING BY DR. WHEELER PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/22/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/28/12	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS RE CT SCANS, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES PARTNER: PEF	.30	
08/28/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR'S DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/28/12	DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	492.50 =====

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02556

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

========

08/01/12	RECEIPT OF PDO - DENIAL OF BENEFITS; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20	
08/02/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR DENYING BENEFITS (.2) DRAFTING LETTER IN RESPONSE; UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE (.2) PARALEGAL: UV	.40	
08/03/12	REVIEW DECISION OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS AS COMPARED WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN RECORD REGARDING EMPLOYER, WORK HISTORY, MEDICAL EVIDENCE PARTNER: PEF	.60	
08/03/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10	
08/03/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
08/29/12	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RESPONSE TO PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	178.50

Bewlet Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02558

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

07/10/12	REVIEW INFORMATION REGARDING NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS RE PROCEDURAL HISTORY (.30); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE WITH SECOND ATTEMPT TO NOTIFY OF EXAMINATION (.10); DIRECT STAFF RE ACTION PARTNER: PEF	.40
07/10/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/11/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF X-RAY REREADINGS OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (.20); DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER REQUESTING STATUS (.10) PARALEGAL: UV	.30
07/12/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.20); REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR ACTIONS NEEDED AT RECEIPT OF REREADINGS OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (.20); ATTEMPTED TO CALL CLAIMANT TO ADVICE OF UPCOMING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION SCHEDULED WITH DR. ZALDIVAR (.10) PARALEGAL: UV	.50
07/13/12	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS; COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES; DESIGNATE EVIDENCE; SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH REPORT OF DR. WHEELER (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.40
07/13/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF REBUTTAL EVIDENCE PARALEGAL: UV	.30

Bewles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

07/13/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/16/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT TO INFORM HIM OF 8/8/12 INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION WITH DR. ZALDIVAR; UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/18/12	CHECK STATUS OF EXAMINATION, REVIEW CASE MATERIALS AND CONFIRM DEADLINES AND PROJECTED DEVELOPMENT (.30); DESIGNATE EXPERTS FOR EVIDENCE (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.40
07/20/12	REVIEWING AND PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV	.10
07/30/12	DRAFTING REMINDER NOTICE OF UPCOMING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION TO CLAIMANT (.10); DRAFTING REFERRAL LETTER TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.10); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR READING OF ZALDIVAR FILM (.10); PREPARING REFERRAL PACKET FOR ZALDIVAR INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION (.70) PARALEGAL: UV	1.00
07/31/12	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO PHYSICIAN FOR INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION AND RECORD REVIEW TO COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS AND CONFIRM RADIOLOGIST FOR REVIEW (.70); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (.10); CHECK CONTACT WITH CLAIMANT AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.10) PARTNER: PEF	1.00
07/31/12	RECEIPT OF 2 RADIOLOGY FILMS AND REPORTS FROM NIOSH AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.20); CATALOGING ALL RADIOLOGY FILMS RECEIVED AS OF TODAY (.20) PARALEGAL: UV	.40
07/31/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	. 20

B Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

07/31/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/21/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/21/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING B-READERS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/21/12	DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/22/12	RECEIPT OF ZALDIVAR REPORT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/22/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR ACTIONS NEEDED AT RECEIPT OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S REP ROT (.1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING DR. ZALDIVAR'S REPORT (.1); DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY (.1) PARALEGAL: UV	.30
08/23/12	REVIEW CT SCAN FILMS AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE AND ISSUES PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/23/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/23/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/30/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20

INVOICE TOTAL

772.00

========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02560

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

1.20

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/13/12 DRAFTING REMINDER NOTICE TO CLAIMANT OF

	UPCOMING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION (.10); DRAFTING REFERRAL LETTER TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.10); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR READING OF ZALDIVAR FILM (.10); PREPARING REFERRAL PACKET (.80); DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. MEYER REGARDING STATUS OF REREADING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (.10) PARALEGAL: UV	
07/16/12	CONFIRM EXAMINATION SCHEDULE AND CHECK CONTACT WITH CLAIMANT (.10); REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR FOR OPINION AND COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE OF RECORD (.40); REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS (.20); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.80
07/16/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/16/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/18/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORT FROM DR. MEYER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.10); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING REPORT TO DRAFT SUBMISSION OF REBUTTAL EVIDENCE (.30) PARALEGAL: UV	.40
07/18/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CAMC (.10); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.10) ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20

07/18/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/24/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM HEALTHY HABITS WELLNESS CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/31/12	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORDS (.10); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM HEALTHY HABITS WELLNESS CENTER AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS (.90) PARALEGAL: UV	1.00
07/31/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER FROM WHEELER AND SCOTT; 2 FILMS 7/25/12; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/01/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS (.6); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. TOMAS VIGO (.2) PARALEGAL: UV	.80
08/02/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (.2); DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY (.1) PARALEGAL: UV	.30
08/06/12	DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR ZALDIVAR FORWARDING X-RAY READING BY JOHNS HOPKINS TO HIM FOR COMPLETION OF HIS INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION REPORT PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/09/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ZALDIVAR'S OFFICE REGARDING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION REPORT (.1); RECEIPT OF ZALDIVAR REPORT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1) PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/15/12	REVIEW FAX FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING X-RAY FILM FROM EXAMINATION AND DIRECT STAFF RE NECESSARY ACTION TO RESPOND PARTNER: PEF	.20

Bewies Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/20/12	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE IN THE RECORD AND DEPARTMENT OF LABOR EXAMINATION MATERIALS PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/20/12	CONFIRM EVIDENCE TO BE SUBMITTED AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/21/12	REVIEW EXAMINATION REPORT OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND TEST RESULTS; REVIEW DR. ZALDIVAR'S CRITIQUE OF DR. GALLAI REPORT AND COMPARE WITH GALLAI REPORT AND TEST RESULTS PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/21/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/21/12	REVIEW FILM AND CONFIRM COMPLETION OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT WITH FILM PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/21/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/21/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S REQUEST FOR ZALDIVAR X-RAY FILM AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/21/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING REPORTS FROM DR. ZALDIVAR AND DR. SCOTT PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/21/12	DRAFTING SUBMISSIONS OF EVIDENCE OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S REPORT, B-READER REPORT BY DR. SCOTT, AND X-RAY FILM OF 7/25/12 PARALEGAL: UV	.40

08/21/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSIONS TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.2); HAND DELIVER SUBMISSIONS TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSIONS TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.50	
08/23/12	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM VIGO FAMILY HEALTHCARE REGARDING RECORDS REQUEST SAND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
08/29/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/30/12	REVIEW DECISION OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES PARTNER: PEF	.40	
08/30/12	REVIEW AND SIGN RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.20	
08/30/12	CHECK FOR ANY ACTION BY CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL IN LIGHT OF REQUEST FOR X-RAY AND DECISION OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.20	
08/30/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR DENYING BENEFITS AND DRAFTING LETTER IN RESPONSE PARALEGAL: UV	.30	
08/30/12	UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
08/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 10	20.00

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

ost Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02563

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/16/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/01/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/02/12	RECEIPT OF PDO; WITHDRAWAL OF CLAIM; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/07/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITHDRAWING CLAIM AND UPDATING SYSTEM PARALEGAL: D T	.10
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 49.00
		========

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02564

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/19/12 REVIEWING AND PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND

.10

UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV

INVOICE TOTAL

\$ 7.00 =======

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02565

JIM LINDEN DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC 12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400 ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

========

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/16/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE (.40); DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF REBUTTAL EVIDENCE (.10); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.10) PARALEGAL: UV	.60	
07/17/12	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS TO COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES (.30); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH DR. WHEELER REPORT (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.40	
07/17/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
07/20/12	REVIEWING AND PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
08/22/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT AFFIRMATIVE DEADLINE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	143.00

INVOICE TOTAL

B Bowlet Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02566

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/10/12	DOCKETING UPDATED EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES PURSUANT TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR EXTENSION ORDER PARALEGAL: UV	.10
07/10/12	RECEIPT OF DOL EXTENSION GRANTED; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
07/25/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM MONTGOMERY GENERAL HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE; REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS PARALEGAL: UV	.70
07/26/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORT FROM DR. WHEELER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/01/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/06/12	RECEIPT OF INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION REPORT FROM DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/08/12	REVIEW REPORT OF DR. ZALDIVAR (.2); COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE (.2); REVIEW STATUS OF FILM REQUESTS (.1); REVIEW CT SCAN FILMS AVAILABLE (.1); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.70

08/08/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING DR. ZALDIVAR'S INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION REPORT (.2); REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORDS DEVELOPMENT (.1); TELEPHONE CALLS TO SEVERAL FACILITIES REQUESTING STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORDS (.4); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING RADIOLOGY FILMS RECEIVED TO DATE (.3); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR REREADING OF CT SCAN (.3); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1)	1	.40	
08/08/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM VALLEY HEALTH AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV		.20	
08/08/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER ADMINISTRATIVE: LB		.10	
08/08/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER ADMINISTRATIVE: LB		.10	
08/16/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL DEVELOPMENT PARALEGAL: UV		.10	
08/31/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF CT SCAN READING FROM DR. WHEELER PARALEGAL: UV		.10	
08/31/12	DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER REGARDING STATUS OF RE-READING OF CT SCAN PARALEGAL: UV		.10	
08/31/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORT FROM JOHNS HOPKINS VIA FACSIMILE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV		.20	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	====	388.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02567

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

	DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES	
07/25/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORT FROM DR. MEYER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/30/12	REVIEW STATUS OF DISCOVERY; DIRECT STAFF RE CONTACTING CLAIMANT; REVIEW DISCOVERY (.30); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.40
07/30/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED PURSUANT TO DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE (.20); DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF DR. MEYER'S READING AS REBUTTAL EVIDENCE (.20); DRAFTING SECOND REQUEST FOR DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS (.20) PARALEGAL: UV	.60
07/30/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/31/12	REVIEW REPORT FROM DR. MEYER: COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH EVIDENCE (.10); CHECK STATUS OF OTHER EVIDENCE (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.30
07/31/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/10/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/16/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
08/16/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES TO DETERMINE RECORDS NEEDED IN DEFENSE OF CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV	.30	
08/16/12	INTERNET RESEARCH OF PHYSICIANS NAMED IN CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES FOR AREA OF EXPERTISE AND CONTACT INFORMATION PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
08/22/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED PURSUANT TO UPCOMING DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/24/12	RECEIPT MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. RASMUSSEN AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/31/12	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MULLENS FAMILY HEALTHCARE REGARDING RECORD REQUEST AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	290.50
		=	

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186 Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02568

JIM LINDEN DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC 12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400 ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/10/12	RECEIPT OF DOL TO DR. WHEELER X-RAY ENCLOSED; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	. 2	0
07/26/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE; REVIEWING AND ANALYZING REPORTS (.20); DRAFTING SUBMISSIONS OF AFFIRMATIVE AND OF REBUTTAL EVIDENCE (.20) PARALEGAL: UV	.5	0
07/31/12	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS; COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE; DESIGNATE EVIDENCE (.30); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH REPORTS OF DR. WHEELER AND DR. SCOTT (.20) PARTNER: PEF	. 4	0
07/31/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	. 2	0
08/16/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND ORGANIZING CASE MATERIALS ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.5	50
08/31/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	. 2	20
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	178.0

178.00 ========

INVOICE TOTAL

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02569

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

.20

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/16/12 REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE

	RECEIVED FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARALEGAL: UV	
07/16/12	RECEIPT OF CLMT'S MEDICAL AND EMPLOYMENT INFO; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
07/19/12	REVIEWING AND PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE AND UPDATING CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV	.10
07/20/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S SON REGARDING ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND HIS REQUEST FOR EXTENSION OF TIME; UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.30
07/23/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/31/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER FROM SCOTT; 4/19/11 FILM; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/01/12	REVIEW PROJECTED DATES OF EVIDENCE COMPLETION AND COMPARE WITH DEADLINES PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/01/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10

08/01/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE (.2); REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE FORMS (.1); DRAFTING MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME (.2) PARALEGAL: UV	.50
08/01/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/02/12	RECEIPT OF CLMT'S REQUEST FOR EXTENSION; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/03/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/07/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING REREADINGS OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM RECEIVED FROM JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (.1); DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF REBUTTAL EVIDENCE (.2); DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE (.2) PARALEGAL: UV	.50
08/07/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/07/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10
08/08/12	REVIEW STATUS OF EVIDENCE SUBMISSIONS AND EVIDENCE TO SUBMIT (.2); REVIEW CASE MATERIALS; REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS (.2); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR SUBMITTING EVIDENCE (.1) PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/08/12	PROCESSING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.10

B Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

08/08/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING SUBMISSION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/13/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR EXTENSION ORDERS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/13/12	DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES PURSUANT TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR EXTENSIONS ORDERS PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/16/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND ORGANIZING CASE MATERIALS ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.50
08/17/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS BY WHEELER AND SCOTT; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/21/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM AND CONFERENCE WITH SON OF CLAIMANT PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/21/12	CONFERENCE WITH SON OF CLAIMANT, REVIEW RECORDS BROUGHT BY SON PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/21/12	DIRECT EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM SON PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/21/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S SIGNED MEDICAL RELEASE AND MEDICAL RECORDS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/21/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20

INVOICE TOTAL

602.50

========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02570

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/12/12	REVIEW EMAIL FROM UNDERWRITERS (.10); REVIEW CASE MATERIALS; EDIT LITIGATION PLAN (.20); EMAIL UNDERWRITERS AND J. LINDEN RE LITIGATION PLAN AND BUDGET (.10); CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR EXAMINATION (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/06/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/13/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/15/12	REVIEW PROJECTED DATES OF EVIDENCE COMPLETION, DEADLINES, PROCEDURAL HISTORY OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/15/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/15/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT UPCOMING DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/15/12	DRAFTING MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/15/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CLAIMANT'S ANSWER TO INTERROGATORIES TO DETERMINE RECORDS NEEDED IN DEFENSE OF CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV	.20

08/15/12	INTERNET RESEARCH OF PHYSICIANS NAMED BY CLAIMANT FOR AREA OF EXPERTISE AND CONTACT INFORMATION PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/15/12	PROCESSING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/16/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND ORGANIZING CASE MATERIALS ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.50
08/21/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REGARDING OUR REQUEST TO FORWARD X-RAY FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/21/12	FORWARDING REQUEST TO SEND X-RAY FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PURSUANT TO THEIR REQUEST PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/22/12	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM LUNGS AT WORK REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS REQUEST AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/22/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CORNERSTONE CARE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/23/12	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM MONONGALIA HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/24/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISC TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON COMPACT DISC PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/27/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDERS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20

12-12900-scc Doc 1452 Filed 10/22/12 Entered 10/22/12 17:42:33 Main Document

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/27/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CHEAT LAKE URGENT CARE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/28/12	DOCKETING NEW EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES PURSUANT TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR EXTENSION ORDER PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/29/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL DEVELOPMENT PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/29/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO WEST VIRGINIA UNIVERSITY HOSPITALS REGARDING INVOICE RECEIVED FOR MEDICAL RECORDS AND RADIOLOGY FILMS PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/30/12	REVIEW CT SCAN AND PET SCAN FILMS AVAILABLE, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE AND DIRECT STAFF TO OBTAIN PARTNER: PEF	.30
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 443.00

B Bowlet Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02571

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/17/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/26/12	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.20); DRAFTING SUBMISSIONS OF AFFIRMATIVE AND OF REBUTTAL EVIDENCE (.30) PARALEGAL: UV	.50
07/31/12	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE (.20); CONFIRM EVIDENCE FOR SUBMISSION (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.30
07/31/12	REVIEW SUBMISSIONS AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH REPORT OF DR. SCOTT (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH REPORT OF DR. WHEELER (.10) PARTNER: PEF	.20
07/31/12	PROCESSING EVIDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/16/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND ORGANIZING CASE MATERIALS ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.50
08/22/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT AFFIRMATIVE DEADLINE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20

\$

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02572

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

.80

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/10/12 REVIEW AND EDIT PROPOSED LITIGATION PLAN (.40);
SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AS
NOTICE OF APPEARANCE (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE
TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUESTING PRODUCTION
(.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS
(.10); REVIEW DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE
TO CLAIMANT (.10)
PARTNER: PEF

- 07/10/12 REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD 2.10 PARTY ADMINISTRATOR; IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.40); DRAFTING CLAIM SUMMARY SHEET (.30); DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (.10); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (.20); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (.10); REVIEWING PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, EXAMINATION REPORT AND TEST RESULTS FROM DR. RASMUSSEN (.30); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION PLAN (.40); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD X-RAY FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (.20); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR REREADING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (.20) PARALEGAL: UV
- 07/10/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER AND .20 UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB
- 07/11/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF

 LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

 REGARDING THE SAME

 ADMINISTRATIVE: LB
- 07/11/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT AND .20
 UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE
 SAME
 ADMINISTRATIVE: LB

07/19/12	RECEIPT OF DOL TO DR. WHEELER X-RAY ENCLOSED; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
07/24/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/27/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CLAIMANT'S ANSWER TO INTERROGATORIES TO DETERMINE RECORDS NEEDED IN DEFENSE OF CLAIM (.50); INTERNET RESEARCH TO DETERMINE PHYSICIAN'S AREA OF EXPERTISE AND CONTACT INFORMATION (.40); DRAFTING MULTIPLE REQUESTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS AND RADIOLOGY FILMS (.40); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.20) PARALEGAL: UV	1.50
08/06/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. BARGHOUTI AND FROM DR. SHIMM AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/08/12	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM DR. BARGHOUTI AND DR. SHIMM AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS (.5) PARALEGAL: UV	.60
08/16/12	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM DEPARTMENT OF VETERANS AFFAIRS REGARDING RECORD REQUEST AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/17/12	RECEIPT OF B READER REPORTS BY WHEELER AND SCOTT; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/17/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND ORGANIZING CASE MATERIALS ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.50

08/20/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM PRINCETON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/22/12	REVIEW PROJECTED DATES OF EVIDENCE COMPLETION, DEADLINES, RECORD REQUESTS AND DATE OF RECEIPT OF DISCOVERY RESPONSES PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/22/12	REVIEW AND EDIT GOOD CAUSE ARGUMENT FOR EXTENSION OF DEADLINES PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/22/12	REVIEW CT SCANS AND COMPARE WITH RECORDS AND REPORTS PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/22/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/22/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED PURSUANT TO UPCOMING DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/22/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS PARALEGAL: UV	.40
08/22/12	CATALOGING X-RAYS AND CT SCANS RECEIVED DURING MEDICAL DEVELOPMENT PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/22/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR REREADING OF CT SCAN AND X-RAYS AND CONSULTING REPORT PARALEGAL: UV	.30
08/22/12	DRAFTING MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME PARALEGAL: UV	.30
08/22/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM BECKLEY ARH AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10

		=====	======
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	974.50
08/29/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
08/29/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/29/12	DRAFT RESPONSE TO DENIAL OF EXTENSION REQUEST AND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION RE DOL POLICIES PARTNER: PEF	.40	
08/29/12	REVIEW DENIAL OF EXTENSION REQUEST BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, PROCEDURAL HISTORY AND RELEVANT DATES OF DISCOVERY PARTNER: PEF	.40	
08/22/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	

B Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02573

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

07/10/12 REVIEW PLEADINGS AND EDIT PROPOSED LITIGATION
PLAN (.40); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT
OF LABOR AS NOTICE OF APPEARANCE (.10); SIGN
CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
REQUESTING PRODUCTION (.10); SIGN
CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS(.10); REVIEW
DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
(.20)
PARTNER: PEF

07/10/12 REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD 2.50 PARTY ADMINISTRATOR AND IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.50); DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR REQUESTING ADDITIONAL INFORMATION (.20); DRAFTING CLAIM SUMMARY SHEET (.30); DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (.10); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (.20); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (.20); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, EXAMINATION REPORT AND TEST RESULTS FROM DR. CHAVDA AND DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION PLAN (.60); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD X-RAY FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (.20); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR REREADING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (.20) PARALEGAL: UV

07/11/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT AND .20
UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE
SAME
ADMINISTRATIVE: LB

07/18/12 RECEIPT OF DOL; COPY OF THE FILE; UPDATING .20
ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH

08/06/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/07/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES TO DETERMINE RECORDS NEEDED IN DEFENSE OF CLAIM (.2); INTERNET RESEARCH FOR AREA OF EXPERTISE AND CONTACT INFORMATION OF PHYSICIANS NAMED BY CLAIMANT (.2); DRAFTING MULTIPLE REQUESTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS AND RADIOLOGY FILMS (1.0) PARALEGAL: UV	1.40
08/13/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM OWENSBORO-DAVIESS COUNTY HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/13/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTION NEEDED AT EMPLOYER'S DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/13/12	DRAFTING MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/14/12	REVIEW PROJECTED COMPLETION OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT, STATUS OF RECORD DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF DISCOVERY STATUS, AND NEED FOR ADDITIONAL TIME FROM DOL PARTNER: PEF	.30
08/14/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/14/12	PROCESSING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/15/12	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM OWENSBORO-DAVIESS COUNTY HOSPITAL AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS PARALEGAL: UV	.60
08/15/12	TELEPHONE CALL TO RADIOLOGY DEPARTMENT FROM OWENSBORO MEDICAL HEALTH SYSTEM REGARDING OUR RADIOLOGY FILM REQUEST PARALEGAL: UV	.10

08/16/12	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM COAL MINER'S RESPIRATORY CLINIC REGARDING RECORD REQUEST AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/17/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND ORGANIZING CASE MATERIALS ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.50	
08/20/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM MUHLENBERG COMMUNITY HOSPITAL REGARDING RECORD REQUEST (.1); DRAFTING RENEWED REQUEST TO THEIR FEDERAL BLACK LUNG DEPARTMENT (.2) PARALEGAL: UV	.30	
08/20/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/21/12	REVIEW DENIAL OF EXTENSION REQUEST BY DOL AND COMPARE WITH PROCEDURAL HISTORY IN CASE MATERIALS PARTNER: PEF	.20	
08/21/12	REVISE AND EDIT RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.30	
08/21/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); HAND DELIVER CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.30	
08/22/12	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM ST. THOMAS HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	829.00

B Bowles Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02574

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

- 07/16/12 REVIEW NEW CASE MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM
 UNDERWRITERS, STATUS, ISSUES, EVIDENCE,
 EXAMINATION REPORT AND TEST RESULTS FROM DR.
 RASMUSSEN (.70); CHECK DISCOVERY STATUS (.10)
 PARTNER: PEF
- 07/17/12 REVIEW PROPOSED LITIGATION PLAN TO COMPARE WITH
 EVIDENCE FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND DIRECT
 STAFF RE ACTION (.40); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO
 DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.10); REVIEW DISCOVERY AND
 SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.10);
 DESIGNATE READER; SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO
 DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUESTING PRODUCTION
 (.10); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER FOR
 REPORT (.10)
 PARTNER: PEF
- 07/17/12 REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD 1.70 PARTY ADMINISTRATOR AND IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.40); DRAFTING CLAIM SUMMARY SHEET (.30); DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (.10); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (.10); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (.10); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, EXAMINATION REPORT AND TEST RESULTS FROM DR. RASMUSSEN AND DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION PLAN (.50); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD X-RAY FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (.20); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR REREADING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (.20) PARALEGAL: UV
- 07/17/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT AND
 UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE
 SAME
 ADMINISTRATIVE: LB

.20

Bewlet Rice

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

07/17/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
07/20/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT REGARDING WITHDRAWAL OF CLAIM; UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/23/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10
07/25/12	REVIEW ORDER FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR APPROVING WITHDRAWAL OF CLAIM; CHECK STATUS OF DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF WITHDRAWAL PARTNER: PEF	.30
07/25/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.20
07/31/12	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITHDRAWING CLAIM AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE PARALEGAL: D T	.10
08/17/12	RECEIPT OF B READER REPORT BY WHEELER; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 516.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02575

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

.60

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/02/12 REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR; CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK; OPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER; IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE; DRAFTING CLAIM SUMMARY SHEET (.3); DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (.1); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (.2); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (.2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES; REVIEWING EXAMINATION REPORT AND TEST RESULTS FROM DR. GAZIANO (.4); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION PLAN; DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD X-RAY FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (.2); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR REREADING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (.2); DRAFTING RESPONSE AND SPECIAL OBJECTION TO SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE (.2) PARALEGAL: UV

08/03/12 REVIEW PROPOSED DECISION BY DEPARTMENT OF
LABOR, EVIDENCE DEVELOPED BY DEPARTMENT OF
LABOR, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY
DEPARTMENT OF LABOR RE ISSUES
PARTNER: PEF

08/03/12 REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT .10
OF LABOR WITH SPECIAL OBJECTIONS TO PROPOSED
FINDINGS
PARTNER: PEF

08/03/12 CHECK FOR DISCOVERY BY UNDERWRITERS, REVIEW .20
DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
WITH DISCOVERY
PARTNER: PEF

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386 FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

08/03/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AS NOTICE OF APPEARANCE PARTNER: PEF	.10	
08/03/12	CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM, NEED FOR REBUTTAL READING AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER RE SAME PARTNER: PEF	.20	
08/03/12	REVIEW AND SIGN PRODUCTION REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10	
08/03/12	REVIEW AND APPROVE LITIGATION PLAN FOR EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT BEFORE DISTRICT DIRECTOR OF USDOL PARTNER: PEF	.10	
08/03/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
08/03/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING THE SAME ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
08/10/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
08/17/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND ORGANIZING CASE MATERIALS ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.50	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	427.00

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186 Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02576

JIM LINDEN DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC 12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400 ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/08/12	REVIEWING NEW FILE RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR TO PREPARE FOR LITIGATION (.3); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (.1); OPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER (.1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.3); DRAFTING CLAIM SUMMARY SHEET (.3); DRAFTING OPERATOR'S CONTROVERSION AND COVER LETTER (.3); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (.1); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (.2); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1) PARALEGAL: UV	1.70
08/09/12	REVIEW NOTICE OF CLAIM, APPLICATION, INFORMATION RE DEATH AND WORK HISTORY, ANY INFORMATION RE PRIOR CASES BY MINER PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/09/12	REVIEW PLEADING, SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/09/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY, SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/09/12	CHECK FOR FILING OF OPERATOR RESPONSE AND OPERATOR CONTROVERSION, REVIEW OPERATOR CONTROVERION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE WITH DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/09/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20

Payable Upon Receipt

08/09/12	PROCESSING NOTICE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING NOTICE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
08/17/12	RECEIPT OF CLMT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES WITH DOCUMENTS; UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE ADMINISTRATIVE: SKH	.20
08/21/12	REQUEST OF CLAIMANT FOR RETURN OF DOCUMENTS AND DOCUMENTS BEING RETURNED PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/21/12	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO MRS. SMITH PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/21/12	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR POSSIBLE ACTIONS NEEDED AT RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/21/12	DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT TO RETURN ORIGINAL DEATH CERTIFICATE AND POWER OF ATTORNEY PARALEGAL: UV	.20
08/21/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ 368.00

(

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02577

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/10/12	REVIEW PLEADING, SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/10/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY, SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/10/12	REVIEW MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS, SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE, AUTOPSY EVIDENCE, DEATH CERTIFICATE, ISSUES, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/10/12	CHECK STATUS OF DISCOVERY BY UNDERWRITERS PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/10/12	REVIEW PROPOSED LITIGATION PLAN, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND APPROVE ACTION PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/10/12	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR (.1); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (.1); OPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER (.1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.2); DRAFTING CLAIM SUMMARY SHEET (.2); DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (.1); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (.2); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (.1); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES (.2); REVIEWING DEATH CERTIFICATE AND AUTOPSY REPORT BY DR. DENNIS (.1); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION PLAN (.1) PARALEGAL: UV	1.50

Post Office BOX 1386, CHARLESTON, WV 2532501386

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID # 55-0394186

Payable Upon Receipt

08/10/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1);

.20

.20

UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING

CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1)

ADMINISTRATIVE: LB

08/10/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF

LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF

LABOR (.1)

ADMINISTRATIVE: LB

INVOICE TOTAL

\$ 298.00

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02578

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/10/12	REVIEW PLEADING FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND ATTACHED MEDICAL EVIDENCE, EXAMINATION REPORT AND TEST RESULTS (.2) REVIEW ISSUES, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, AND DECISION (.2) PARTNER: PEF	.40
08/10/12	CHECK FOR ANY DISCOVERY BY UNDERWRITERS PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/10/12	SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/10/12	REVIEW PLEADING, SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/10/12	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR (.2); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (.1); OPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER (.1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.2); DRAFTING CLAIM SUMMARY SHEET (.2); DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (.1); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (.2); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO DETERMINE WHETHER THE CLAIM HAS BEEN FORWARDED TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY (.2) PARALEGAL: UV	1.50
08/10/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20

Payable Upon Receipt

08/10/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
08/13/12	REVIEW OF MEDICAL STATUS PARALEGAL: SL	.20	
08/16/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND ORGANIZING CASE MATERIALS ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.50	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	297.50

========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02579

JIM LINDEN DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC 12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400 ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

	DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES	
08/10/12	REVIEW PLEADING FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND ATTACHED MEDICAL EVIDENCE, DEATH CERTIFICATE, VARIOUS MEDICAL RECORDS, ISSUES, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND PROJECTED DECISION PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/10/12	SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AS NOTICE OF APPEARANCE PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/10/12	SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/10/12	CHECK STATUS OF DISCOVERY BY UNDERWRITERS, INFORMATION REGARDING DEATH, PHYSICIANS AND FACILITIES FOR DEVELOPMENT PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/10/12	REVIEW PROPOSED LITIGATION PLAN, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND APPROVE FOR ACTION PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/10/12	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR (.2); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (.1); OPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER (.1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.2); DRAFTING CLAIM SUMMARY SHEET (.2); DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (.1); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (.2); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (.1); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES (.2); REVIEWING DEATH CERTIFICATE (.1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS (.3); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION PLAN (.1)	1.90

LITIGATION PLAN (.1) PARALEGAL: UV

08/10/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	. 2	20
08/10/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.2	20
08/17/12	UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE AND ORGANIZING CASE MATERIALS ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.!	50
08/20/12	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.:	20
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ =	391.50

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02580

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/13/12	REVIEW PLEADING INCLUDING REVIEW REPORT AND TEST RESULTS FROM DR. GAZIANO, REVIEW EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD; WORK HISTORY AND RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/13/12	REVIEW PLEADING, SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/13/12	REVIEW DISCOVERY, SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/13/12	REVIEW PROPOSED LITIGATION PLAN, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES, AND APPROVE ACTION PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/13/12	CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM, SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUESTING PRODUCTION PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/13/12	CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR REPORT, SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/13/12	CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/13/12	OPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/13/12	IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.30

Payable Upon Receipt

08/13/12	DRAFTING CLAIM SUMMARY SHEET PARALEGAL: UV		20
08/13/12	DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES PARALEGAL: UV	•	10
08/13/12	DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT PARALEGAL: UV	•	20
08/13/12	DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION PARALEGAL: UV		10
08/13/12	REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES PARALEGAL: UV		20
08/13/12	REVIEWING EXAMINATION RECORDS FROM DR. GAZIANO PARALEGAL: UV		30
08/13/12	DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION PLAN PARALEGAL: UV	•	.20
08/13/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD X-RAY FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY PARALEGAL: UV		.10
08/13/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR REREADING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM PARALEGAL: UV	•	.10
08/13/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (.1); PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE SENT (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB		. 40
08/16/12	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV		.10
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	356.50

========

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02581

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

293.50

\$

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES _____ 08/20/12 REVIEWING NEW FILE RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY .20 ADMINISTRATOR FOR INFORMATION TO OPEN NEW CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV .10 08/20/12 CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK PARALEGAL: UV .10 08/20/12 OPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER PARALEGAL: UV .40 08/20/12 IMPORTING NEW CLAIM FILE INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE FROM COMPACT DISC AND E-MAILED DOCUMENTS PARALEGAL: UV 08/20/12 DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION, DISCOVERY .40 DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT, AND CLAIM SUMMARY FORM PARALEGAL: UV 08/20/12 REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS .20 AND DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY PARALEGAL: UV .70 08/21/12 REVIEW EVIDENCE DEVELOPED TO DATE, ISSUES, SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE AND PROPOSED AWARD, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, COMPARED WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND DEVELOPED PARTNER: PEF .20 08/21/12 REVIEW, EDIT AND SIGN NOTICE OF APPEARANCE TO JUDGE PARTNER: PEF .20 08/21/12 REVIEW DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT PARTNER: PEF

INVOICE TOTAL

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02582

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/21/12 REVIEW MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS, .60 STATUS, ISSUES, EVIDENCE DEVELOPED TO DATE, DISCOVERY, PROCEDURAL HISTORY, RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR INFORMATION AND ISSUES PARTNER: PEF 08/22/12 REVIEWING NEW CLAIM RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY .20 ADMINISTRATOR FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND INFORMATION NEEDED FOR OPENING OF CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV .10 08/22/12 CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK PARALEGAL: UV .10 08/22/12 OPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER PARALEGAL: UV .10 08/22/12 DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION PARALEGAL: UV .30 08/22/12 DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT PARALEGAL: UV .20 08/22/12 DRAFTING CLAIM SUMMARY SHEET PARALEGAL: UV .20 08/22/12 DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO PROVIDE SOCIAL SECURITY EARNINGS RECORDS AND FOR A 60 DAY EXTENSION PENDING RECEIPT OF RECORDS TO RESPOND TO LIABILITY ISSUE PARALEGAL: UV 08/22/12 PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF .20 LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB

		:	========
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$	300.50
08/31/12	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT REGARDING INTERROGATORIES PARALEGAL: UV		.10
08/23/12	REVIEW AND SIGN REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF SOCIAL SECURITY RECORDS PARTNER: PEF		.10
08/23/12	REVIEW AND SIGN DISCOVERY TO PLAINTIFF PARTNER: PEF		.20
08/23/12	REVIEW AND SIGN PLEADINGS TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	•	.20
08/22/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	•	.20

Payable Upon Receipt

MATTER ID: P0495.02583

JIM LINDEN
DIRECTOR, RISK MANAGEMENT
PATRIOT COAL SERVICES, LLC
12312 OLIVE BLVD., SUITE 400
ST. LOUIS, MO 63141

DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2012

DESCRIPTION OF LEGAL SERVICES

08/21/12	REVIEW MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS, STATUS, ISSUES, EVIDENCE DEVELOPED TO DATE, DISCOVERY, PROCEDURAL HISTORY, RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR INFORMATION AND ISSUES PARTNER: PEF	.50
08/23/12	REVIEW AND SIGN REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF SOCIAL SECURITY RECORDS PARTNER: PEF	.10
08/23/12	REVIEW AND SIGN DISCOVERY TO PLAINTIFF PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/23/12	REVIEW AND SIGN PLEADINGS TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PARTNER: PEF	.20
08/23/12	REVIEWING NEW CLAIM RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND INFORMATION NEEDED FOR OPENING OF CLAIM PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/23/12	CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/23/12	OPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/23/12	DRAFTING CLAIM SUMMARY SHEET PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/23/12	DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION PARALEGAL: UV	.10
08/23/12	DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT PARALEGAL: UV	.20

Payable Upon Receipt

08/23/12	DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO PROVIDE SOCIAL SECURITY EARNINGS RECORDS AND FOR A 60 DAY EXTENSION PENDING RECEIPT OF RECORDS TO RESPOND TO LIABILITY ISSUE PARALEGAL: UV	.20	
08/23/12	PROCESSING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1); UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.1) ADMINISTRATIVE: LB	.20	
08/30/12	RECEIPT OF NOTICE FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE PARALEGAL: UV	.10	
	INVOICE TOTAL	\$ ====	249.00