

Objection Deadline: November 6, 2012 at 4:00 p.m. (prevailing Eastern Time)

DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP
450 Lexington Avenue
New York, New York 10017
Telephone: (212) 450-4000
Facsimile: (212) 607-7983
Marshall S. Huebner
Damian S. Schaible
Brian M. Resnick
Michelle M. McGreal

*Counsel to the Debtors
and Debtors in Possession*

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK**

In re:

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION, *et al.*,

Debtors.

Chapter 11

Case No. 12-12900 (SCC)

(Jointly Administered)

**MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP FOR
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AND DISBURSEMENTS FOR THE PERIOD OF
SEPTEMBER 1, 2012 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2012**

NAME OF APPLICANT:

Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP

ROLE IN THE CASE:

Counsel to the Debtors

TIME PERIOD:

September 1, 2012 through and including
September 30, 2012

CURRENT APPLICATION¹:

Total Fees Requested: \$2,687,860
80% of Fees Requested: \$2,150,288
Total Expenses Requested: \$58,646.73

¹ These amounts reflect \$86,875.03 in voluntary reductions of fees and expenses, which voluntary reductions are in addition to reductions of \$17,969.02 on account of Southern District of New York and U.S. Trustee guidelines.

1. In accordance with the *Order To Establish Procedures for Interim Monthly Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals* [ECF No. 262] (the “**Interim Compensation Order**”), Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP (“**Davis Polk**”), counsel to the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (collectively, the “**Debtors**”), hereby submits its Monthly Statement for Professional Services and Disbursements (the “**Fee Statement**”) for the period of September 1, 2012 through and including September 30, 2012 (the “**Fee Statement Period**”).

2. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Davis Polk seeks payment of \$2,208,934.73, representing (a) 80% of Davis Polk’s fees for services rendered and (b) 100% of actual and necessary expenses incurred.

3. Attached hereto as Exhibit A is a listing of Davis Polk professionals and paraprofessionals (collectively, the “**Davis Polk Professionals**”), including the hourly rate for each Davis Polk Professional who rendered services to the Debtors in connection with these chapter 11 cases during the Fee Statement Period and the title, aggregate hours worked and the amount of fees billed by each Davis Polk Professional.

4. Attached hereto as Exhibit B is a schedule specifying the categories of actual and necessary expenses for which Davis Polk is seeking reimbursement and the total amount for each such expense category.

5. Attached hereto as Exhibit C is a summary of the number of hours and amounts billed by Davis Polk during the Fee Statement Period, organized by project categories. Such services included:

- Participating in numerous meetings and telephone conferences with the Debtors’ management and employees covering topics

such as the chapter 11 cases generally, interpretation of court orders, determination of the status of claims, contract and lease rejection issues, operational issues and general business issues;

- Advising the Patriot Coal Corporation board of directors regarding fiduciary duty issues, disclosure obligations, business and reorganization issues, the bankruptcy process and its options regarding all of the above;
- Assisting with the Debtors' retention of professionals in the Debtors' chapter 11 cases and in the ordinary course of business;
- Responding to numerous telephone calls and letters from creditors, equity holders and other parties in interest concerning the Debtors' chapter 11 cases, the filing of claims against the Debtors and the rights of creditors under the Bankruptcy Code and conducting associated legal research;
- Research and analysis related to the Debtors' rights and obligations under coal supply agreements and other commercial contracts;
- Researching and analyzing environmental and regulatory issues, including with respect to the U.S. Securities and Exchange Commission, the Financial Industry Regulatory Authority, and the Mine Safety and Health Administration, and advising the Debtors regarding the same;
- Preparation and filing of Exchange Act filings;

- Defending against and developing strategies regarding parties seeking to change venue;
- Attending to post closing matters related to the credit facilities, including negotiating, revising and reviewing deposit account control agreements and opinions;
- Numerous telephone conferences with the lenders, counsel to lenders and other parties in connection with the debtor-in-possession credit facilities;
- Providing advice generally to the Debtors about the credit facilities;
- Assisting the Debtors with and analyzing issues related to the Debtors' negotiations regarding reclamation claims and demands for utility deposits;
- Analyzing and researching issues related to numerous executory contracts and advising the Debtors regarding the assumption, rejection and extending the time to assume or reject the same;
- Defending against and developing strategies with respect to parties filing motions seeking to lift the automatic stay and conducting associated legal research;
- Researching and analyzing labor and retiree issues and developing strategies with respect thereto, including related to sections 1113 and 1114 of the Bankruptcy Code;

- Reviewing certain employee compensation and benefit issues, conducting related legal research and advising the Debtors regarding the same;
- Researching and analyzing tax issues and advising the Debtors regarding the same;
- Participating in numerous telephone conferences with the Office of the U.S. Trustee regarding procedural, case management and other issues;
- Researching and preparing several non-first-day procedural and substantive motions;
- Coordinating with the Creditors' Committee regarding various pleadings and administration of the Debtors' estates generally and responding to comments and concerns of the Creditors' Committee;
- Preparing for, attending and taking part in bankruptcy court hearings;
- Responding to press inquiries; and
- Filing and service of court papers.

6. Attached hereto as Exhibit D are the time records of Davis Polk, which provide a daily summary of the time spent by each Davis Polk Professional during the Fee Statement Period by project category.

Notice

7. Consistent with the procedures described in the Interim Compensation Order, the Debtors will serve this Fee Statement, by hand or overnight delivery, on (i) the Debtors, Patriot Coal Corporation, 12312 Olive Boulevard, Suite 400, St. Louis, Missouri, 63141, Attn: Jacquelyn A. Jones, (ii) the Office of the United States Trustee for the Southern District of New York, 33 Whitehall Street, 21st Floor, New York, New York 10004, Attn: Andrea B. Schwartz and Paul K. Schwartzberg, (iii) attorneys for the administrative agent for the Debtors' postpetition lenders, (a) Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP, 767 Fifth Avenue, New York, New York 10153, Attn: Marcia Goldstein and Joseph Smolinsky, and (b) Willkie Farr & Gallagher LLP, 787 Seventh Avenue, New York, New York 10019, Attn: Margot B. Schonholtz and Ana Alfonso, and (iv) proposed counsel to the official committee of unsecured creditors, Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP, 1177 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10036, Attn: Adam C. Rogoff, Esq. and Gregory G. Plotko, Esq..

8. WHEREFORE, the Debtors respectfully request that the Court grant the relief requested herein and such other and further relief as is just and proper.

Dated: New York, New York
October 22, 2012

By: /s/ Brian M. Resnick

Marshall S. Huebner

Damian S. Schaible

Brian M. Resnick

Michelle M. McGreal

DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP

450 Lexington Avenue

New York, New York 10017

Telephone: (212) 450-4000

Facsimile: (212) 607-7983

*Counsel to the Debtors
and Debtors in Possession*

EXHIBIT A

Professionals and Rates

I.A. Partners/Counsel

NAME OF PARTNER/ COUNSEL	YEAR ADMITTED	DEPARTMENT	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
Partners					
Sarah E. Beshar	1986-NY	Capital Markets	10.7	\$985	\$10,539.50
John H. Butler	1995-NY	Mergers & Acquisitions	22.6	\$985	\$22,261.00
Jeffrey P. Crandall	1983-NY	Executive Compensation and Employee Benefits	1.7	\$985	\$1,674.50
Kathleen Ferrell	1998-NY	Tax	0.9	\$985	\$886.50
Edmond T. FitzGerald	1992-NY	Executive Compensation and Employee Benefits	37.1	\$985	\$36,543.50
Marshall Huebner	1994-NY	Insolvency & Restructuring	176.5	\$985	\$173,852.50
Elliot Moskowitz	2002-NY	Litigation	138.9	\$975	\$135,427.50
Antonio J. Perez- Marques	2003-NY	Litigation	9.3	\$850	\$7,905.00
Brian M. Resnick	2004-NY	Insolvency & Restructuring	185.6	\$850	\$157,760.00
Damian S. Schaible	2002-NY	Insolvency & Restructuring	57.6	\$975	\$56,160.00
Amelia T. R. Starr	1995-NY	Litigation	105.2	\$985	\$103,622.00
Mischa Travers	1998-NY	Corporate	69.9	\$985	\$68,851.50
Waide Warner	1980-NY	Credit	15.2	\$985	\$14,972.00
Counsel					
Hayden S. Baker	2003-NY	Environmental	100.6	\$915	\$92,049.00
Erin K. Cho	1998-NY	Executive Compensation and Employee Benefits	1.0	\$985	\$985.00
Betty M. Huber	1997-NY	Environmental	22.6	\$985	\$22,261.00
Lawrence E. Jacobs	1986-NY	Litigation	1.2	\$915	\$1,098.00
Jonathan D. Martin	2004-NY	Litigation	176.4	\$915	\$161,406.00
James I. McClammy	1998-NY	Litigation: Insolvency & Restructuring	54.5	\$985	\$53,682.50
James P. McIntyre	1978-NY	Real Estate	1.5	\$985	\$1,477.50
David B. Toscano	1993-NY	Litigation: Insolvency & Restructuring	5.2	\$985	\$5,122.00
John T. Wright	1982-NY	Executive Compensation and Employee Benefits	53.0	\$985	\$52,205.00
Total Partners and Counsel			1,247.2		\$1,180,741.50

II.A. Associates

NAME OF ASSOCIATE	YEAR ADMITTED	DEPARTMENT	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
Jessica Agostinho	2011-NY	Executive Compensation and Employee Benefits	21.1	\$575	\$12,132.50
Ron M. Aizen	2006-NY	Executive Compensation and Employee Benefits	50.2	\$795	\$39,909.00
Jeffrey Brenner	2012-NY	Capital Markets	7.5	\$465	\$3,487.50
Patrick W. Blakemore	Admission Pending	Litigation	2.8	\$325	\$910.00
Tenley L. Chepiga	2009-NY	Credit	16.2	\$750	\$12,150.00
Kevin J. Coco	2010-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	182.6	\$675	\$123,255.00
Nicholas J. Dashman	2010-CA	Corporate	16.0	\$575	\$9,200.00
Alexandre de Richemont	2012-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	30.2	\$465	\$14,043.00
Andrew N. DeLaney	2009-NY	Litigation	47.4	\$750	\$35,550.00
Richard Estacio	2010-NY	Litigation	233.7	\$675	\$157,747.50
Joshua Thomas Foust	2009-NY	Litigation	130.0	\$750	\$97,500.00
Elyse Glazer	2010-NY	Litigation	54.7	\$675	\$36,922.50
Kristin Haase	2011-NY	Mergers and Acquisitions	0.8	\$575	\$460.00
Samantha Hait	2011-NJ 2012-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	42.2	\$465	\$19,623.00
Wendi Hoeben	2005-NY	Capital Markets	2.9	\$795	\$2,305.50
Lauren Howard	2010-NY	Litigation	17.4	\$675	\$11,745.00
Alexander Ibrahim	2011-NY	Litigation	9.6	\$575	\$5,520.00
Mhairi Immermann	Admission Pending	Credit	6.0	\$465	\$2,790.00
Melissa C. King	2010-NY	Litigation	15.0	\$675	\$10,125.00
Darren S. Klein	2007-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	119.3	\$795	\$94,843.50
Steven C. Krause	2007-NY 2008-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	25.9	\$795	\$20,590.50
Julia Lapitskaya	2011-NY	Executive Compensation and Employee Benefits	10.2	\$575	\$5,865.00
Angela Libby	Admission Pending	Insolvency and Restructuring	86.3	\$465	\$40,129.50
Jessica. Lutrín	2010-NY	Executive Compensation and Employee Benefits	3.9	\$675	\$2,632.50
Christopher. Lynch	2008-NY	Litigation	29.3	\$795	\$23,293.50
Rebecca L. Martin	2012-NY	Litigation	24.0	\$465	\$11,160.00
Michelle M. McGreal	2007-NJ 2008-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	186.9	\$795	\$148,585.50
Adam Mehes	2011-NY	Litigation	50.9	\$575	\$29,267.50

NAME OF ASSOCIATE	YEAR ADMITTED	DEPARTMENT	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
Dworkin C. Meyer	2006-NY	Credit	36.3	\$795	\$28,858.50
Gerald M. Moody	2010-MA 2010-NY	Litigation	58.1	\$675	\$39,217.50
Gina Y. Pak	2011-NY	Credit	24.5	\$575	\$14,087.50
Christopher Robertson	Admission Pending	Insolvency and Restructuring	32.1	\$465	\$14,926.50
Arie Rubenstein	2007-NY	Litigation	2.9	\$795	\$2,305.50
Eric L. Ruiz	2010-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	2.8	\$675	\$1,890.00
Lara Samet	2008-NJ 2009-NY	Litigation	162.4	\$750	\$121,800.00
Kevin M. Satter	2012-NY	Mergers and Acquisitions	15.6	\$575	\$8,970.00
Steve Sorkin	2010-NY	Real Estate	2.2	\$675	\$1,485.00
Natasha Tsiouris	2011-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	39.1	\$575	\$22,482.50
Amy E. Turner	2009-NY	Environmental	68.7	\$750	\$51,525.00
Kevin VanLandingham	2009-NY	Litigation	28.0	\$750	\$21,000.00
Eli James Vonnegut	2008-NY	Insolvency and Restructuring	17.3	\$795	\$13,753.50
Kahlil Williams	Admission Pending	Litigation	64.0	\$465	\$29,760.00
Bernard Chen Zhu	2008-NY	Litigation	127.7	\$795	\$101,521.50
Total Associates			2,104.7		\$1,445,326.00

Attorney Blended Rates

	ATTORNEY BLENDED RATE	TOTAL ATTORNEY HOURS BILLED	TOTAL ATTORNEY FEES¹
Partners and Counsel	946.7	1247.2	\$1,180,741.50
Associates	686.7	2104.7	\$1,445,326.00
Total	783.4	3,351.9	\$2,626,067.50

¹ These figures reflect voluntary reductions as referenced above.

III.A. Paraprofessionals

NAME OF PARAPROFESSIONAL	DEPARTMENT	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES ²
Julia M. Bedell	Legal Assistant Corporate	6.1	\$325	\$1,982.50
Paulina Brown	Legal Assistant Corporate	5.0	\$205	\$1,025.00
Stephen Chao	Legal Assistant Corporate	2.2	\$205	\$451.00
Caroline Downer	Legal Assistant Corporate	3.3	\$325	\$1,072.50
Jen Eum	Legal Assistant Corporate	37.7	\$325	\$12,252.50
Betsy Feldman	Legal Assistant Corporate	2.5	\$205	\$512.50
Rachel Lange	Legal Assistant Corporate	2.5	\$205	\$512.50
Elliot Law	Legal Assistant Corporate	50.2	\$400	\$20,080.00
Marguerite Melvin	Legal Assistant Corporate	32.5	\$400	\$13,000.00
Katherine Stewart	Legal Assistant Corporate	9.1	\$205	\$1,865.50
Megan Teixeira	Legal Assistant Corporate	8.2	\$325	\$2,665.00
Theresa Volano	Legal Assistant Corporate	46.8	\$400	\$18,720.00
Evan Lane	Managing Attorney's Office	2.0	\$150	\$300.00
Tynslei Spence	Managing Attorney's Office	2.9	\$195	\$565.50
Christopher Wytenus	Managing Attorney's Office	5.2	\$130	\$676.00
Audrey Evans	Research Services	1.8	\$290	\$522.00
Edgar Halford	Research Services	5.0	\$290	\$1,450.00
Total Paraprofessionals		223.0		\$77,652.50

² These figures reflect voluntary reductions as referenced above.

EXHIBIT B

Expenses

ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES
INCURRED BY DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP ON
BEHALF OF THE DEBTORS DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD

CATEGORY OF EXPENSES	AMOUNTS
Computer research	\$37,959.93
Duplication	\$6,516.20
Postage, courier and freight	\$192.89
Outside document retrieval (transcript, PACER, etc.)	\$2,823.53
Court and related fees	\$289.40
Filing, registration, fees & taxes	\$879.00
Travel	\$7,431.03
Miscellaneous disbursements	\$0.00
Meals	\$2,554.75
Total	\$58,646.73

EXHIBIT C

Summary by Project Code

**SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING
THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP
ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY**

PROJECT CATEGORY	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
1.	Asset Dispositions	148.1	\$127,969.50
2.	Automatic Stay / Litigation	1,630.6	\$1,220,170.50
3.	Creditor/EquityHolder/UCC Issues	197.4	\$151,714.00
4.	Davis Polk Retention and Fee Issues	91.5	\$63,106.00
5.	Employee Labor Issues	462.3	\$369,619.00
6.	Executory Contracts	215.8	\$169,375.00
7.	Financing	140.6	\$102,644.00
8.	General Case Administration	275.5	\$161,970.00
9.	Governance Communications	19.0	\$14,395.50
10.	Non-Davis Polk Retention	29.4	\$18,908.50
11.	Non-Working Travel	37.8	\$15,860.00
12.	Plan/Disclosure Statement	4.3	\$2,771.50
13.	Regulatory and Environmental	314.6	\$261,628.50
14.	Securities Class Action	8.0	\$7,728.00
Total Hours and Compensation Requested:		3,574.9	\$2,687,860.00¹

¹ This figure reflects reductions as referenced above.

EXHIBIT D

Time Record

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
ASSET DISPOSITIONS			
Resnick BM	09/02/12	0.4	Review memo and cases regarding certain asset sales issues.
McGreal MM	09/04/12	0.6	Review and revise memo regarding asset sale issues.
Resnick BM	09/04/12	0.2	Review memo and cases regarding asset sales issues.
Klein DS	09/05/12	0.8	Review form purchase agreement.
Krause SC	09/05/12	0.4	Emails regarding asset purchase by Patriot (0.3); call regarding same (0.1).
Travers M	09/06/12	2.5	Prepare for structural reorganization call (1.2); work on summary of liabilities and treatment in asset sale transactions (1.3).
Dashman NJ	09/07/12	0.9	Review collective bargaining memorandum and discuss with M. Travers.
Dashman NJ	09/07/12	2.6	Call with Company and Blackstone regarding asset sale issues and organizational meeting (1.0); research coal supply agreement treatment in asset sale (0.8); discuss asset sale issues with M. Travers and draft preliminary issues list (0.8).
Resnick BM	09/07/12	0.4	Call with M. Travers (0.3); emails regarding same (0.1).
Travers M	09/07/12	4.5	Telephone call with Patriot management team and Blackstone regarding structural reorganization planning (1.3); followup discussion with B. Resnick (0.3); extensive work on liabilities summary (2.5); discuss assets and liabilities with N. Dashman (0.4).
Dashman NJ	09/09/12	6.7	Review and research certain asset sale issues (2.6); review Peabody liability assumption agreements (0.7); draft prospective asset sale entity summary chart (0.9); review senior notes indentures and treatment of guarantors in asset sales (0.4); summarize findings in asset sale issues list (2.1).
Dashman NJ	09/10/12	1.1	Correspond with N. Tsiouris regarding coal supply agreements (0.3); review coal supply agreements and draft MET coal summary sheet (0.8).
McGreal MM	09/10/12	0.4	Teleconference with B. Resnick, M. Travers and N. Dashman regarding asset sale issues.
Resnick BM	09/10/12	1.6	Call with M. Travers in preparation for upcoming meeting (0.4); review documents regarding same (1.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Travers M	09/10/12	6.2	Further work on liabilities summary in preparation for reorganization structural planning meeting (2.7); call with H. Baker, N. Dashman regarding asset sale issues (0.8); call with R. Aizen and N. Dashman regarding asset sale issues (1.1); review materials on multi-employer pension plan and pension benefits (1.6).
Tsiouris N	09/10/12	0.3	Call with N. Dashman regarding assignment provisions of supply agreements.
Dashman NJ	09/11/12	0.5	Correspond with M. Travers regarding potential asset sale plan, coal supply contract assignment provisions and retiree healthcare liabilities.
Meyer DP	09/11/12	1.0	Emails and telephone call with B. Resnick M. Travers (partial) regarding Patriot meeting at Blackstone.
Resnick BM	09/11/12	3.9	Prepare for meeting with client regarding asset sale issues (2.9); call with D. Meyer to prepare for meeting (0.3); call with M. Travers and D. Meyer to prepare for meeting (0.7).
Travers M	09/11/12	6.6	Review materials on assets and liabilities in preparation for structural planning meetings (6.1); call with B. Resnick, D. Meyer regarding analysis of assets and liabilities (0.5)
Libby A	09/12/12	0.5	Search intranet for memos on §365 issues.
Meyer DP	09/12/12	16.4	Review documents for Patriot meeting at Blackstone (0.5); Patriot meeting at Blackstone (12.6); research regarding subleases (3.3).
Resnick BM	09/12/12	13.3	Prepare for meeting with C. Ebentino and others regarding asset sales (0.7); meeting with C. Ebentino and others regarding asset sales (12.6).
Travers M	09/12/12	13.3	Reorg structural planning meetings at Blackstone with C. Ebentino, M. Buschmann, B. Resnick, D. Meyer (12.6); analysis of liabilities in preparation for further structural planning meeting (0.7).
Dashman NJ	09/13/12	0.3	Call with S. Sorkin regarding subleasing.
Meyer DP	09/13/12	4.3	Meeting at Blackstone regarding asset issues (3.7); review Patriot asset and liability charts (0.6).
Resnick BM	09/13/12	5.6	Meeting with C. Ebentino and others regarding asset sale issues.
Travers M	09/13/12	6.3	Structuring reorganization planning meetings at Blackstone (4.2); review organizational and entity charts prepared by Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.3); review liabilities and financial disclosure in Patriot '34 Act filings (1.8).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Meyer DP	09/14/12	1.6	Email correspondence with B. Resnick and Blackstone team regarding asset issues (0.4); draft issues list regarding asset issues (1.0); call with Z. Mitschrich (Blackstone) regarding assets (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/14/12	0.9	Discuss research issues with D. Meyer (0.2); emails regarding asset issues (0.7).
Dashman NJ	09/15/12	0.8	Correspond with B. Resnick and M. Travers regarding lease and asset sale issues.
Resnick BM	09/15/12	1.7	Emails regarding follow-ups from meeting with C. Ebetino.
McGreal MM	09/16/12	1.3	Teleconference with M. Travers, B. Resnick and others regarding multi-employer pension plan issues (1.2); correspondence with B. Resnick and R. Aizen regarding same (0.1).
Meyer DP	09/16/12	1.7	Call with J. Woodrum, A. Aizen, B. Resnick, M. Travers and M. McGreal regarding collective bargaining agreement liabilities (1.2); review emails regarding workforce adjustments and labor liabilities (0.5).
Resnick BM	09/16/12	1.3	Call with J. Woodrum, Blackstone and Davis Polk team regarding labor issues relevant to asset sales (1.2); follow-up call with M. McGreal regarding same (0.1).
Baker HS	09/17/12	2.0	Call with M. Travers and N. Dashman regarding asset sale issues (0.6); asset sales research (1.4).
Resnick BM	09/17/12	3.7	Review Blackstone presentation regarding multiple employee pension plans (0.3); call with M. Travers regarding same (0.2); call with Blackstone and J. Woodrum regarding same (0.5); call with clients and Blackstone regarding asset sale issues (2.0); discuss §365 sublease issue with D. Meyer (0.1); emails regarding same (0.1); meet with T. Graulich regarding same (0.2); call with M. Travers (0.3).
Travers M	09/17/12	5.2	Telephone call with Patriot management team regarding assets and legal issues associated with asset dispositions (2.0); preparation for call with Patriot management team (1.4); review Blackstone multi-employer pension plan analysis (0.4); call with Patriot labor counsel regarding multi-employer pension plan and Blackstone analysis (0.8); emails regarding assignment of postpetition leases (0.3); discuss environmental liabilities with H. Baker (0.3).
Baker HS	09/18/12	2.0	Conference with B. Huber regarding asset sale issues (1.2); review of asset sale information (0.8).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Dashman NJ	09/18/12	0.9	Call with B. Resnick and M. Travers regarding asset sale issues workplan (0.5); correspond with J. Jones regarding document requests (0.4).
Meyer DP	09/18/12	1.1	Call with B. Resnick and M. Travers regarding asset disposition.
Resnick BM	09/18/12	2.4	Call with M. Travers and others regarding potential asset sales (1.0); call with M. Travers (0.2); review research on various issues related to asset dispositions (1.2).
Travers M	09/18/12	2.3	Discuss issues from structural planning meetings with N. Dashman (1.0); call with B. Resnick, D. Meyer regarding next steps regarding asset sale issues (0.7); review data room materials regarding a multi-employer pension plan (0.6).
Baker HS	09/19/12	2.1	Meeting with B. Resnick, B. Huber, M. Travers regarding asset sales (0.8); correspondence regarding same (1.3).
Dashman NJ	09/19/12	0.5	Call with Z. Mitschrich regarding asset disposition issues.
Resnick BM	09/19/12	0.8	Calls with Davis Polk team regarding asset sale issues.
Dashman NJ	09/20/12	1.5	Call with J. Jones regarding asset sale issues (0.5); review real estate leases (1.0).
Resnick BM	09/20/12	0.2	Call with M. Travers regarding diligence.
Travers M	09/20/12	2.7	Analysis of asset sale issues (1.3); call with J. Jones regarding documents relevant to potential asset dispositions (0.6); discuss asset sale issues with N. Dashman (0.3); discuss asset sale issues with B. Resnick (0.2); review materials regarding labor issues (0.3).
Resnick BM	09/21/12	0.2	Call with M. Travers and D. Meyer regarding potential asset dispositions.
Travers M	09/21/12	1.0	Telephone call with B. Resnick regarding documents needed in connection with asset sale issues (0.3); analysis of asset sale issues (0.7).
Baker HS	09/23/12	0.8	Call with M. Huebner, B. Resnick, D. McCallister and R. Verheij regarding asset sales.
Travers M	09/24/12	0.8	Further work regarding analysis of asset sale issues.
Huber BM	09/25/12	1.1	Review Horizon asset purchase agreements.
Huber BM	09/27/12	5.9	Prepare summary of Horizon bankruptcy proceedings.
Total ASSET DISPOSITIONS		148.1	

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
AUTOMATIC STAY\			
LITIGATION			
Estacio R	09/01/12	7.1	Draft agreements to supersede parties' prior agreements (3.3); draft correspondence to J. Martin regarding the same (0.3); analyze venue motion reply briefs (1.6); research regarding the same (1.6); prepare for venue hearing (0.3).
Huebner MS	09/01/12	1.3	Review of multiple new venue filings.
Martin JD	09/01/12	0.8	Review certain coal contracts.
McClammy JI	09/01/12	0.4	Review venue joinders.
Resnick BM	09/01/12	0.8	Review venue reply briefs.
Samet L	09/01/12	2.6	Read and analyze reply submissions of U.S. Trustee, Union, and Sureties (0.6); email to I. Englehardt, C. Ebetino, and others regarding same (0.9); draft email regarding joinders (0.4); prepare for venue hearing (0.7).
Schaible DS	09/01/12	0.8	Emails regarding venue issues and next steps.
Estacio R	09/02/12	2.5	Draft and edit agreements to supersede parties' prior agreements (2.2); draft correspondence to J. Martin regarding the same (0.2); prepare for venue hearing (0.1).
Eum JS	09/02/12	4.5	Compile venue filings, as per R. Estacio.
Martin JD	09/02/12	0.9	Research stay issue in Boone County action (0.7); email to E. Power and others regarding same (0.2).
Moskowitz E	09/02/12	2.3	Review reply briefs and exhibits (1.4); correspondence with M. Huebner and team regarding same (0.9).
Estacio R	09/03/12	6.4	Edit agreements to supersede and replace prior contracts and draft proposed order seeking court approval of the same (4.2); conferences with J. Martin and others regarding same (1.0); correspond with J. Martin and others regarding the same (0.2); draft and edit email to Patriot regarding the same (0.6); schedule conference call regarding the same (0.1); prepare for venue hearing (0.3).
Huebner MS	09/03/12	1.6	Conversation with E. Moskowitz regarding venue (0.5); review of multiple emails and additional pleadings regarding venue matters (1.1).
Martin JD	09/03/12	3.3	Review and comment on draft agreements (1.9); call with A. Starr, R. Estacio and G. Moody regarding certain agreements (1.1); emails with C. Ebetino regarding certain agreements (0.3).
Moody, Jr. GM	09/03/12	0.6	Correspondence with A. Starr and others regarding draft agreement (0.1); call with Amy Starr and others regarding same (0.5).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Moskowitz E	09/03/12	1.4	Call with M. Huebner regarding venue issues (0.5); correspondence with team regarding venue issues and hearing preparation (0.9).
Resnick BM	09/03/12	0.1	Email to K. Constantine regarding venue support.
Samet L	09/03/12	0.7	Prepare for venue hearing (0.4); emails with M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz and R. Estacio regarding same (0.3).
Zhu B	09/03/12	7.0	Prepare revised draft motion for adversary proceeding (3.9); legal research in preparation for same (3.1).
Chao S	09/04/12	2.2	Prepare documents for hearing, as per R. Estacio and J. Eum.
Estacio R	09/04/12	8.8	Conference with J. Martin and R. Mead regarding agreements to supersede and replace prior contracts (0.3); conferences with J. Martin regarding same (0.4); edit the same (2.1); draft correspondence to Patriot regarding prospective new agreements (0.3); review and input Patriot's edits to prospective new agreements (0.3); correspond with M. McGreal regarding court approval of new agreements (0.1); conference with G. Moody regarding the same (0.1); conferences with L. Samet regarding preparation for venue hearing (0.1); conferences with legal assistants regarding the same (0.2); correspond with Managing Attorney's Office regarding scheduling delivery to court of venue filings (0.1); correspond with legal assistant manager regarding staffing case project (0.1); conferences with E. Moskowitz regarding venue filings (0.2); conferences with legal assistant regarding updating the same (0.1); review and update binders prepared for bankruptcy court (0.4); review binder prepared for E. Moskowitz (0.1); conference with E. Moskowitz and L. Samet regarding preparation for venue hearing (0.5); conference with L. Samet regarding the same (0.1); research and draft analysis regarding the same (3.3).
Eum JS	09/04/12	5.0	Compile venue filings for team as per L. Samet (3.0); compile courtesy copies of venue filings as per R. Estacio (2.0).
Huebner MS	09/04/12	2.5	Conversations with D. Schaible, client regarding U.S. Trustee call on venue (0.6); commence review of caselaw for venue hearing (0.9); meeting with Davis Polk litigation team regarding oral argument (1.0).
Lange RL	09/04/12	2.5	Prepare documents for hearing, as per R. Estacio and J. Eum.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin JD	09/04/12	0.8	Review and comment on filing in Boone County action (0.6); update J. Tucker and others regarding override litigation (0.2).
McClammy JI	09/04/12	0.6	Conference with M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz and L. Samet regarding venue hearing preparations.
McGreal MM	09/04/12	0.5	Teleconferences with Chambers regarding logistics of September 11th hearing (0.1); email with E. Moskowitz and L. Samet regarding same (0.1); review cover letter and indices of binders for court (0.1); review joinder log (0.1); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding same (0.1).
Mehes A	09/04/12	6.8	Call with G. Moody (0.3); draft sections of override brief (6.5).
Moody, Jr. GM	09/04/12	11.3	Call with R. Estacio regarding legal research (0.1); correspondence with A. Mehes regarding draft brief (0.4); correspondence with B. Zhu regarding draft brief (0.3); call with A. Mehes regarding same (0.3); conduct legal research for draft declaration (3.2); conduct factual research for draft declaration (2.1); review and revise draft declaration (4.8); circulate revise draft of declaration to team (0.1).
Moskowitz E	09/04/12	2.0	Meet with M. Huebner regarding venue issues (0.4); correspondence with venue team regarding hearing preparation and related issues (1.6).
Resnick BM	09/04/12	0.2	Emails regarding venue strategy.
Samet L	09/04/12	5.8	Draft talking points and redirect examination for venue hearing (2.2); conferences with M. Huebner and others regarding preparation for venue hearing (1.4); revise demonstratives for venue hearing (0.6); conference call with E. Moskowitz and R. Estacio regarding hearing strategy (0.4); correspondence with J. Foust, R. Estacio, and K. Williams regarding same (0.3); oversee preparation of courtesy copies of joinders and reply briefing (0.9).
Schaible DS	09/04/12	1.8	Prepare for and conduct Unsecured Creditors' Committee status call (1.2); meeting regarding venue issues (0.6).
Williams KC	09/04/12	1.8	Collect data on joinder to Debtor's motion opposing transfer.
Zhu B	09/04/12	7.2	Confer with G. Moody and A. Mehes regarding legal research and strategy for summary judgment motion (0.5); prepare revisions to draft motion (4.6); conduct additional legal research in preparation for same (2.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Estacio R	09/05/12	8.6	Legal research regarding venue (0.8); draft correspondence to E. Moskowitz and others regarding the same (0.2); correspond with J. Foust regarding the same (0.2); legal research regarding enforcing automatic stay of newly commenced suit (0.7); draft analysis of regarding the same for J. Martin (0.3); draft venue hearing talking points (6.4).
Eum JS	09/05/12	1.5	Prepare venue filings binder as per L. Samet.
Foust JT	09/05/12	3.7	Legal research related to location of assets for venue analysis.
Huebner MS	09/05/12	3.0	Continuing review of venue case law and pleadings (2.4); emails and conversations with clients, E. Moskowitz regarding venue hearing (0.6).
Klein DS	09/05/12	0.9	Email J. Foust regarding venue research (0.1); coordinate on research and fact gathering related to same (0.8).
Martin JD	09/05/12	4.9	Communications with C. Miller regarding subpoenas to Peabody (0.5); email regarding same to T. Perez, C. Zhu (0.2); analyze discovery issues in adversary proceedings (0.5); plan strategy in Massey proceeding (1.5); communications with E. Power, R. Estacio regarding automatic stay issues (0.4); review newly filed Burns complaint (0.3); review research on stay issues in Burns action (1.0); emails with D. Klein, E. Power, and others regarding Boone County action (0.5).
McGreal MM	09/05/12	0.6	Email E. Moskowitz regarding research on intangible assets (0.1); review memo on venue considerations (0.3); email AlixPartners regarding data on location of joinder parties (0.1); email J. Martin regarding pending litigation schedules (0.1).
Mehes A	09/05/12	3.2	Call with G. Moody regarding override motion on the pleadings (0.5); call with B.C. Zhu and G. Moody regarding override motion on the pleadings (1.1); editing override motion on the pleadings (1.6).
Melvin MM	09/05/12	0.2	Assist J. Foust with venue research.
Moody, Jr. GM	09/05/12	8.3	Review and revise draft brief (2.1); conduct legal research for draft brief (2.9); conduct factual research for draft brief (1.2); call with B. Zhu and A. Mehes regarding draft brief (1.1); circulate revised draft to B. Zhu (0.1); review and provide comments on sections of brief drafted by B. Zhu and A. Mehes (0.9).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Samet L	09/05/12	6.4	Draft talking points for venue hearing (2.8); draft redirect examination for same (1.1); prepare list of rebuttal issues for same (1.2); revise demonstratives for same (0.8); emails with J. Foust, R. Estacio, and K. Williams regarding hearing preparation (0.5).
Schaible DS	09/05/12	1.1	Teleconferences with the U.S. Trustee and the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding venue issues (0.8); coordinate regarding venue issues (0.3).
Schaible DS	09/05/12	0.4	Coordinate regarding claims settlement issues.
Williams KC	09/05/12	1.0	Gather articles and statements from union on venue.
Zhu B	09/05/12	8.7	Confer with G. Moody and A. Mehes regarding revisions to draft summary judgment motion (1.1); prepare correspondence with J. Martin regarding summary judgment motion (0.8); revise draft motion (5.6); review legal research in preparation for summary judgment motion (1.2).
Coco KJ	09/06/12	8.2	Research in preparation for oral argument at venue hearing (3.4); coordinate logistics of venue hearing (0.4); team meeting regarding preparations for venue hearing and oral argument (2.6); docket research regarding venue pleadings (1.8).
Estacio R	09/06/12	15.9	Research and analyze venue case law (0.4); draft and edit talking points and redirect questions regarding the same (1.4); legal research regarding applicability of automatic stay to newly commenced employment law suit (5.3); draft analysis regarding the same for J. Martin (2.4); conference with M. Huebner and others regarding venue hearing preparation (2.7); conferences with L. Samet regarding the same (0.1); research regarding venue issues (2.8); analyze the same for M. Huebner and others (0.8).
Eum JS	09/06/12	1.0	Prepare reference materials for venue hearing as per J. Foust.
Foust JT	09/06/12	8.0	Revise draft 9019 settlement motion (3.6); meeting with M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz, L. Samet and R. Estacio to discuss preparation for venue hearing (1.1); research legal issues related to location of assets for venue purposes (3.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Huebner MS	09/06/12	5.1	Extensive further preparation for venue hearing including annotating multiple pleadings (0.3); conversations with U.S. Trustee regarding venue hearing procedures (0.5); conversations with E. Moskowitz regarding same and numerous other matters (0.8); meet with venue team regarding trial preparation, materials for Court, additional research and demonstrative exhibits (1.1); extensive further work on caselaw and oral argument outline (2.4).
Klein DS	09/06/12	5.2	Call with L. Samet regarding venue research and follow-up regarding same (0.3); meet with venue team regarding reference materials for the venue hearing and other research (1.8); research and analysis related to oral argument on venue (3.1).
Law EC	09/06/12	1.5	Coordinate assembly of Judge's binders for 9/11/2012 hearing (0.7); numerous communications with M. McGreal, T. Volano, M. Melvin and T. Spence regarding same (0.5); communications with M. Melvin and T. Volano regarding preparations for 9/11/2012 hearing (0.3).
Libby A	09/06/12	4.5	Research in connection with venue motions.
Martin JD	09/06/12	4.8	Update call with company and advisers (0.8); prepare for same (0.3); emails with A. Starr, E. Power and others regarding Boone County action (0.9); revise motion papers in Massey proceeding (2.8).
McClammy JI	09/06/12	2.2	Telephone conference with L. Samet regarding venue hearing preparation (0.2); review hearing memos (0.2); email correspondence regarding hearing issues (0.3); review draft talking points (0.7); review hearing transcripts (0.8).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	09/06/12	5.1	Conference with M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz and others regarding preparation for venue hearing (2.6); correspondence with D. Klein, L. Samet and others regarding local rules on DIP financing (0.2); correspondence with L. Samet and AlixPartners regarding data on creditors who filed joinders (0.2); teleconferences with L. Samet, K. Coco and J. Foust regarding venue hearing preparation (0.4); review and comment on hearing preparation action items list (0.1); review and comment on draft venue stipulation with the U.S. Trustee (0.3); correspondence with B. Taylor, K. Haase and others regarding incorporating subsidiaries (0.2); review incorporation documents (0.1); draft timeline of key dates in case and attendees (0.3); draft response to Sureties' assertions regarding asset sale procedures and rejection procedures (0.2); conference with B. Resnick and D. Klein regarding interests of justice caselaw (0.4); correspondence with E. Moskowitz regarding hearing logistics (0.1).
Mehes A	09/06/12	0.3	Call with G. Moody regarding override motion and setoff.
Moody, Jr. GM	09/06/12	2.3	Conduct legal research regarding contract law for draft brief (0.9); correspondence with A. Mehes and B. Zhu regarding same (0.3); review and mark up draft brief (0.8); call with A. Mehes regarding draft brief (0.3).
Moskowitz E	09/06/12	5.7	Team meeting regarding venue preparation and follow-up (2.5); correspondence with counsel and court regarding venue hearing (1.5); review talking points and continue to prepare for hearing (1.7).
Resnick BM	09/06/12	6.0	Call with C. Zhu regarding Massey and other litigations (0.1); email with J. Wagner regarding same (0.1); review McKool Smith 2019 statement (0.1); call with K. Coco regarding same (0.1); emails regarding same (0.1); emails with M. Collins (0.1); meeting with litigation team regarding venue (2.4); research and emails regarding venue hearing preparation (2.5); discuss venue preparation issues with M. McGreal and D. Klein (0.5).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Samet L	09/06/12	16.4	Prepare talking points for venue hearing (9.2); prepare redirect examination for venue hearing (1.5); research for venue hearing (2.2); telephone calls with J. McClammy regarding venue hearing (0.1); conferences with M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz, and others regarding hearing strategy (2.6); edit demonstratives for venue hearing (0.8).
Schaible DS	09/06/12	1.5	Coordinate regarding venue issues (0.9); teleconferences regarding claims settlement issues (0.6).
Volano T	09/06/12	7.5	Emails with J. Foust regarding reference materials for venue hearing (0.2); prepare labels and folders for reference materials (2.6); prepare request to Word Processing regarding same (0.4); print andn organize reference materials for venue hearing (2.8); prepare September 11th hearing binders for Judge Chapman (1.5).
Williams KC	09/06/12	2.1	Research on venue case law (1.0). research on mega-cases in the Southern District of New York (1.1).
Zhu B	09/06/12	1.7	Prepare correspondence with J. Martin regarding summary judgment motion (0.3); review additional legal research in preparation for draft motion (0.8); correspond with G. Moody and A. Mehes regarding same (0.3); review local bankruptcy court rules in preparation for filing summary judgment motion (0.3).
Coco KJ	09/07/12	9.3	Prepare for venue hearing including legal research (1.9); docket research (0.8); emails with clients and Davis Polk team (1.4); coordinate with GCG regarding notices of appearance data (3.4); analysis of post-petition events (1.8).
Estacio R	09/07/12	11.6	Conference with J. McClammy regarding drafting direct and cross examination (0.3); draft same (4.4); correspond with legal assistant regarding compilation of case law (0.1); prepare for venue hearing (2.3); correspond with L. Samet and others regarding the same (0.1); conferences with legal assistant regarding preparing for client visit (0.2); conference with assistant regarding the same (0.2); draft talking points for oral argument (2.1); draft factual stipulation (1.6); conferences with E. Moskowitz regarding the same (0.1); oversee preparation of hearing binders for J. McClammy and E. Moskowitz (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Eum JS	09/07/12	2.5	Research cases relating to Pine Ridge Coal Corp. and Patriot Coal Corp. as per R. Estacio (0.5); compile court filings for same (1.5); compile support materials for venue hearing as per J. Foust (0.5).
Foust JT	09/07/12	9.8	Prepare analysis of signatories to joinders to venue objection (1.7); coordinate printing of hearing materials (1.7); research and prepare venue hearing materials (4.6); review hearing talking points for additional demonstrative materials (1.8).
Huebner MS	09/07/12	8.6	Calls with the U.S. Trustee regarding venue hearing (0.6); review and markup initial draft of oral argument (2.1); meeting with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding venue hearing (1.3); multiple meetings with Davis Polk regarding items needed for venue hearing (0.7); further review of relevant caselaw (3.1); emails and conversations with various joinder parties regarding support and hearing (0.5); calls with B. Stark regarding evidentiary issues (0.3).
Klein DS	09/07/12	5.2	Research and analysis related to venue hearing preparation.
Law EC	09/07/12	2.4	Coordinate and assemble documents and binders for 9/11/2012 hearing (0.8); numerous communications with K. Coco and T. Volano regarding same (0.9); route pleadings (0.5); communications with M. McGreal, K. Satter and A. Mehes regarding same (0.2).
Libby A	09/07/12	4.7	Research in connection with venue motions (4.2); discuss same with K. Coco (0.5).
Martin JD	09/07/12	5.7	Conference with C. Zhu, G. Moody and A. Mehes regarding Massey motion papers (2.3); review answer in Massey proceeding (0.5); communications with B. Resnick, C. Ebetino, and others regarding same (0.4); revise Massey motion papers (2.5).
Martin JD	09/07/12	1.8	Call with F. Huffard, C. Ebetino and others regarding structural reorganization issues (1.5); review research on stay issue in Burns action (0.3).
McClammy JI	09/07/12	5.3	Prepare for upcoming witness preparation (2.6); telephone conferences with E. Moskowitz regarding fact stipulations (0.3); review and revise fact stipulations (0.5); circulate fact stipulations to moving parties (0.1); review hearing materials (1.8).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	09/07/12	2.7	Correspondence with L. Samet regarding venue hearing talking points (0.2); correspondence with J. Jones regarding incorporation of subsidiaries (0.2); correspondence with B. Taylor regarding same (0.1); review Patriot Coal incorporation papers (0.1); email J. Foust regarding §341 meeting (0.1); review and comment on stipulation with the U.S. Trustee (0.7); email R. Estacio regarding incorporation papers (0.1); conferences with D. Klein and K. Coco regarding location of entities that filed notices of appearance (0.4); review and comment on post-petition timeline (0.4); correspondence with K. Coco regarding same (0.2); teleconference with L. Samet and J. Foust regarding hearing preparation (0.2).
Mehes A	09/07/12	3.1	Team meeting regarding override motion strategy with J. Martin, C. Zhu and G. Moody.
Moody, Jr. GM	09/07/12	7.1	Meet with J. Martin and team regarding draft brief (2.6); review answer (0.4); call with C. Black regarding amendment to agreement (0.3); review and revise draft amendment and incorporate comments of various parties (1.6); review and revise draft order, incorporating comments of various parties (1.4); meet with A. Starr regarding same (0.3); calls and emails with A. Starr regarding same (0.5).
Moskowitz E	09/07/12	6.6	Correspondence with team regarding preparation for venue hearing (2.6); draft and edit talking points for hearing (1.4); meet with Kramer Levin regarding strategy (1.4); correspondence with co-counsel regarding hearing (1.2)
Resnick BM	09/07/12	3.0	Review Massey answer (0.2); emails regarding same (0.3); review venue talking points (0.4); emails regarding same (1.8); emails regarding stipulations of fact (0.3).
Samet L	09/07/12	8.9	Conferences with M. Huebner and E. Moskowitz regarding venue talking points (0.4); draft and revise talking points (6.3); research regarding same (0.7); revise demonstratives for venue hearing (0.8); emails and telephone calls with J. Foust, K. Williams and others regarding research assignments (0.5); telephone call with E. Moskowitz regarding hearing preparation (0.2).
Satter KM	09/07/12	3.2	Research regarding venue.
Volano T	09/07/12	11.0	Prepare venue hearing materials for September 11th hearing.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Williams KC	09/07/12	4.7	Reserch for venue hearing (1.3); collect data on joinders filed on behalf of Patriot (1.1); draft supplemental talking points (1.1); legal research on venue issues (1.2).
Zhu B	09/07/12	6.4	Correspond with J. Martin and D. Klein regarding Dayton Power and Light contractual issues (0.4); attend strategy conference with J. Martin and litigation team regarding Massey 12(c) memorandum of law and related legal issues (1.3); analyze Massey answer (1.0); revise draft Massey 12(c) motion (2.6); conduct follow up case law research regarding same (1.1).
Coco KJ	09/08/12	3.6	Research in connection with and prepare for venue hearing.
Estacio R	09/08/12	8.4	Draft venue hearing redirect and cross examination questions (4.6); Conference with J. McClammy regarding editing the same (0.4); edit venue redirect and cross examination questions (3.4).
Klein DS	09/08/12	0.5	Research and analysis related to venue hearing and emails with M. McGreal related to same.
Law EC	09/08/12	1.6	Numerous communications with C. Tricomi (Willkie) regarding draft agendas for 9/11/2012 hearing and blackline of orders (0.5); communications with M. McGreal and K. Coco regarding same (0.2); preparations of logistics for 9/11/2012 hearing (0.5); communications with T. Volano regarding same (0.4).
Martin JD	09/08/12	4.2	Revise Massey proceeding motion papers (1.7); review cases for Massey proceeding (2.5).
McClammy JI	09/08/12	2.5	Review venue hearing materials regarding witness testimony preparations.
McGreal MM	09/08/12	3.3	Review and comment on talking points (2.1); review and comment on stipulation with sureties (0.4); review declarations of ordinary course professionals (0.8).
Moody, Jr. GM	09/08/12	0.2	Correspondence with B. Zhu regarding draft brief.
Resnick BM	09/08/12	0.9	Review venue hearing talking points (0.8); emails regarding same (0.1).
Samet L	09/08/12	1.5	Revise talking points (1.2); correspondence with B. Resnick and M. McGreal regarding same (0.3).
Zhu B	09/08/12	7.0	Revise draft 12(c) brief (4.4); review legal research in preparation for same (1.9); prepare various correspondence with G. Moody and A. Mehes regarding draft brief (0.7).
Coco KJ	09/09/12	0.8	Preparations and emails in connection with venue hearing.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Estacio R	09/09/12	5.9	Edit redirect and cross examination questions (3.2); draft oral argument talking points (1.6); research regarding the same (1.1).
Foust JT	09/09/12	6.2	Oversee compilation of reference materials for venue hearing.
Huebner MS	09/09/12	10.4	Draft oral argument for venue hearing (9.6); calls with E. Moskowitz, others at Davis Polk regarding facts needed for venue hearing and draft stipulation (0.8).
Martin JD	09/09/12	4.0	Revise Massey proceeding motion papers (1.2); review cases for Massey proceeding (2.8).
McClammy JI	09/09/12	4.0	Prepare M. Schroeder to testify (3.1); telephone conference with E. Moskowitz and others regarding fact stipulation (0.2); review and revise fact stipulation (0.4); email correspondence regarding fact stipulation issues (0.3).
McGreal MM	09/09/12	2.9	Review and comment on revised venue hearing talking points (0.8); correspondence with L. Samet regarding same (0.2); review and comment on sureties' stipulation (0.7); correspondence with K. Williams regarding same (0.2); preparation for hearing (0.7); teleconference with counsel to sureties, E. Moskowitz and J. McClammy (0.3).
McGreal MM	09/09/12	0.2	Correspondence with K. Coco and A. Libby regarding hearing agenda.
Mehes A	09/09/12	3.4	Edit override motion on the pleadings.
Moody, Jr. GM	09/09/12	9.9	Review and revise draft executory contracts brief (6.9); conduct factual research in connection with same (0.8); conduct legal research in connection with revising draft brief (1.4); correspondence with B. Zhu and A. Mehes regarding same (0.4); correspondence with A. Starr regarding draft order to assume agreements and procedures for filing (0.3); create blackline of draft order and send to A. Starr (0.1).
Moskowitz E	09/09/12	4.3	Preparation for venue hearing (1.6); correspondence with team regarding venue issues (1.2); review talking points and correspondence with M. Huebner regarding same (1.5).
Resnick BM	09/09/12	0.4	Emails regarding venue hearing preparation.
Samet L	09/09/12	3.4	Revise talking points for venue hearing (2.5); correspondence with E. Moskowitz and others regarding same (0.6); revise research regarding appellate issues (0.3).
Schaible DS	09/09/12	0.6	Review materials and emails regarding venue issues.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Volano T	09/09/12	10.0	Prepare venue hearing materials for September 11th hearing.
Williams KC	09/09/12	6.7	Research regarding proposed stipulations (2.2); research regarding venue issues (3.4); fact gathering for venue hearing (1.1).
Zhu B	09/09/12	8.7	Prepare additional revisions to draft 12(c) brief (5.1); review legal research in preparation for same (2.3); prepare various correspondence with G. Moody and A. Mehes regarding draft brief (0.9).
Coco KJ	09/10/12	9.0	Legal research in connection with motions to transfer venue (7.4); coordinate preparations for venue hearing (0.6); draft agenda (0.3); coordinate updates to case website, emails with GCG regarding same (0.7).
de Richemont P	09/10/12	2.4	Prepare materials for hearing (0.2); coordinate personnel and logistics for hearing (2.2).
DeLaney AN	09/10/12	3.4	Work on responses and objections to Massey document request.
Estacio R	09/10/12	15.7	Review materials compiled for venue hearing witness preparation (1.4); correspond with legal assistant regarding same (0.3); conference with J. McClammy regarding editing redirect and cross examination questions (0.3); edit the same (2.1); venue hearing preparation with client and J. McClammy (1.6); revise fact stipulation regarding venue (1.4); conferences with E. Moskowitz regarding the same (0.1); correspond with J. Martin regarding editing replacement agreements (0.2); correspond with M. McGreal regarding the same (0.3); edit replacement agreements (1.2); research and draft analyses regarding venue hearing arguments (6.8).
Eum JS	09/10/12	5.3	Prepare materials for venue hearing (1.5); assemble materials for witness preparation as per R. Estacio (2.3); compile documents for Hearing on assumption issues as per G. Moody (1.5).
Foust JT	09/10/12	14.7	Prepare summary of S.D.N.Y. cases analyzing interest of justice prong (2.6); prepare additional hearing reference materials based on final version of talking points (3.2); meeting with M. Huebner, L. Samet and R. Estacio to discuss finalizing hearing materials (0.5); prepare supplementary materials for venue hearing oral argument (8.4).
Hait S	09/10/12	5.5	Draft agenda for hearing (4.0); draft notice of no objections (0.7); file agenda and send to GCG (0.8).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Huebner MS	09/10/12	12.4	Intensive preparation for venue hearing and continue to draft oral argument including review of cases and all filed pleadings.
Klein DS	09/10/12	8.6	Research and analysis of numerous issues related to venue hearing (3.7); coordinate on sureties issues with P. Jensen, including numerous emails and phone calls (0.9); emails with R. Mead related to same (0.4); review data related to same (1.6); review precedent DIP agreements related to choice of law and venue provisions (0.7); review and comment on venue stipulation and coordinate with E. Moskowitz on same (0.6); review and comment on reference materials for venue hearing (0.7).
Law EC	09/10/12	4.6	Numerous communications with K. Coco, A. de Richemont, T. Volano and K. Stewart regarding logistics and preparations for 9/11/2012 hearing (1.6); prepare and assemble various documents regarding same (2.3); route pleadings (0.5); communications with C. Tricomi (Willkie) regarding draft agenda for 9/11/2012 hearing (0.2).
Libby A	09/10/12	1.0	Review docket for venue related entries in connection with drafting agenda (0.5); review and edit agenda and discuss same with S. Hait (0.5).
Martin JD	09/10/12	4.2	Revise motion papers in Massey proceeding (2.1); review cases and related research in connection with Massey motion (0.9); emails with client, opposing counsel regarding scheduling in override litigations (1.2).
McClammy JI	09/10/12	12.8	Prepare for preparation of M. Schroeder as witness (4.3); preparation of M. Schroeder to testify (5.4); review and revise fact stipulation (0.4); revise witness preparation outlines (0.8); conference with R. Estacio regarding witness outlines (0.3); review and comment regarding cross-examination outlines (0.5); review talking points (0.6); email correspondence regarding hearing preparation issues (0.5).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	09/10/12	5.8	Review and comment on stipulation (0.2); review and comment on hearing talking points (1.3); correspondence with E. Moskowitz and L. Samet regarding same (0.8); review venue pleadings binders (0.3); correspondence with J. McClammy and R. Estacio regarding points for preparation of witness (0.3); correspondence with D. Klein, S. Hait and others regarding hearing agenda (0.8); review and revise agenda (0.9); correspondence with K. Coco, A. de Richemont and others regarding hearing logistics (0.7); review hearing binders (0.3); correspondence with E. Law regarding same (0.1); arrange for telephonic hearing appearance (0.1).
Mehes A	09/10/12	1.3	Edit override motion on the pleadings.
Moody, Jr. GM	09/10/12	2.2	Review and revise draft order approving assumption of agreements (0.7); calls with A. Starr regarding comments on draft order (0.2); prepare filing of revised draft order (0.4); call with M. McGreal regarding same (0.1); prepare binder for hearing on assumption motion (0.6); send final copies of amendment and assumption motion to various parties (0.2).
Moskowitz E	09/10/12	12.3	Negotiate stipulation with counsel (2.4); prepare for venue hearing (1.6); team meetings regarding venue hearing (1.0); review and edit argument points (2.6); meet with M. Huebner regarding same (1.2); correspondence with counsel regarding venue materials (1.3); meet with M. Schroeder regarding hearing (1.3); related correspondence with team regarding hearing (0.9).
Resnick BM	09/10/12	4.5	Telephone calls regarding venue support (0.1); call with J. Martin regarding override litigation (0.1); emails regarding same (0.2); emails regarding venue hearing preparation and related research (2.3); review hearing speech (1.0); meetings with M. Huebner and litigation team regarding venue hearing preparation (0.5); review research regarding appeal of venue order (0.1); review venue stipulation (0.2).
Samet L	09/10/12	15.3	Draft and edit talking points (9.2); research regarding same (3.5); revise demonstratives (1.1); meeting with M. Huebner and E. Moskowitz regarding venue preparation (0.4); meeting with M. Huebner, J. Foust, and others regarding hearing preparation (0.6); telephone calls and emails with M. McGreal regarding same (0.5).
Schaible DS	09/10/12	1.0	Coordinate regarding venue issues.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Volano T	09/10/12	16.0	Prepare venue hearing materials for September 11th hearing.
Williams KC	09/10/12	7.5	Legal research for venue hearing (2.1); research and draft memo on regarding procedural issues (3.5); compile research on joinder (1.9).
Zhu B	09/10/12	5.3	Conduct legal research regarding override royalties issues (2.1); conference with A. Delaney regarding responses and objections to discovery requests (0.5); analyze discovery requests from defendants in adversary proceeding (1.4); correspond with J. Martin and A. Delaney regarding same (0.5); correspond with R. Martin regarding case background and legal research (0.4); attend conference with J. Martin regarding additional legal research regarding override issues (0.4).
Chepiga TL	09/11/12	1.0	Email with L. Samet and draft response regarding venue issues.
Coco KJ	09/11/12	3.6	Legal and docket research regarding venue motions.
de Richemont P	09/11/12	3.8	Prepare materials for hearing (1.6); coordinate hearing personnel and logistics (2.2).
DeLaney AN	09/11/12	6.1	Draft responses and objections to Massey document request and draft answer.
Estacio R	09/11/12	20.9	Attend venue hearing by teleconference and take notes regarding the same (3.2).; conferences with Patriot personnel regarding hearing preparation (0.6); prepare materials for first day of venue hearing (4.5); attend venue hearing by teleconference and take notes regarding the same (3.2); research regarding venue hearing day two arguments (3.7); conference with M. Huebner and team regarding venue hearing day two preparation (1.6); correspond with J. McClammy regarding witness preparation (0.1); compile factual support for talking points (4.8); edit venue hearing argument to incorporate the same (2.4).
Eum JS	09/11/12	1.2	Prepare demonstrative packets for court hearing as per L. Samet and R. Estacio.
Foust JT	09/11/12	17.4	Prepare and revise reference materials for venue hearing oral argument (7.8); supervise transport and setup of reference materials for venue hearing oral argument (1.2); attend hearing on venue (4.0); team meeting to discuss preparation for next day of venue hearing (1.2); prepare reference materials for venue; Attend hearing on venue (4.0).
Hait S	09/11/12	1.5	Assist with hearing preparation.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Huebner MS	09/11/12	20.3	Final extensive preparation for venue hearing including reviewing comments on presentation from various parties (7.3); review of final materials for hearing (0.3); attend venue hearing (3.8); meet with clients regarding tomorrow's proceeding, argument and testimony (0.3) completely redraft 85 page oral argument to adjust to concerns and questions of judge (7.6); meet with allied parties regarding strategy and division of labor (1.0); attend venue hearing (3.8).
Klein DS	09/11/12	12.2	Research and analysis related to venue hearing and reference materials (4.8); respond to information requests from team at venue hearing and dial into same (3.8); research and analysis after hearing for oral argument tomorrow (3.6).
Law EC	09/11/12	5.9	Revise reference materials for the 9/11/2012 hearing (1.4); numerous communications with A. de Richemont, J. Foust, T. Volano, and K. Stewart to coordinate logistics regarding same (0.8); assemble additional Judge's copy of hearing binder (0.9); communications with M. McGreal and T. Volano regarding same (0.3); assemble additional documents and supplies for 9/12/2012 hearing (1.9); numerous communications with A. de Richemont, K. Coco, and S. Hait regarding logistics for same (0.6).
Martin JD	09/11/12	7.8	Review Hall motion to lift stay (0.4); emails with E. Power and others related to same (0.3); emails with C. Ebetino, opposing counsel, and others regarding scheduling issues in adversary proceedings (0.9); draft Massey motion papers (4.6); review research for Massey motion papers (1.6).
McClammy JI	09/11/12	12.2	Prepare for potential witness testimony (1.3); consideration of evidentiary issues (0.5); prepare M. Schroeder to testify (2.4); attend Court hearing by telephone (3.5); prepare for possible J. Bean testimony (1.7); conference with E. Moskowitz regarding hearing preparations (0.4); email correspondence regarding venue hearing issues (0.4); prepare J. Bean to testify (1.3); conference with E. Moskowitz regarding J. Bean testimony outline (0.2); review cases cited at hearing (0.5).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	09/11/12	6.2	Prepare demonstrative for venue hearing (0.9); correspondence with E. Moskowitz, L. Samet and Graphics Department regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Kramer Levin regarding same (0.3); conference with DIP lenders' counsel, Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel, M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz and others regarding hearing (1.7); conference with M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz, L. Samet and others regarding hearing preparation and (1.4); prepare for continuation of venue hearing (1.7).
McGreal MM	09/11/12	5.1	Teleconference with Chambers regarding hearing (0.1); correspondence with E. Law regarding binder for Judge (0.1); attend omnibus/venue hearing (4.9).
Moskowitz E	09/11/12	16.3	Prepare for venue hearing (3.9); prepare for continuation of venue hearing (8.9); attend venue hearing (3.5).
Perez-Marques AJ	09/11/12	0.7	Prepare for scheduling meet and confer with Royalty Co. counsel.
Resnick BM	09/11/12	1.3	Call with D. Amadeo regarding STB adversary proceeding (0.2); emails regarding venue hearing preparation (0.9); National Union Fire Insurance Co motion for relief from stay (0.2).
Robertson C	09/11/12	0.2	Discuss letter from contract counterparty with B. Resnick.
Samet L	09/11/12	17.4	Draft and edit talking points for venue hearing (7.3); research regarding same (2.2); revise demonstratives (1.2); attend venue hearing (3.5); meeting with common interest group regarding venue issues (1.7); meeting with Davis Polk team regarding hearing strategy (1.5); attend venue hearing (3.5).
Schaible DS	09/11/12	5.6	Attend court and take part in follow-up meetings (5.1); coordinate regarding venue hearing preparation (0.5)
Stewart KS	09/11/12	1.9	Assist with logistics and preparations for 9/11/2012 hearing (0.8); numerous communications with E. Law and A. de Richemont regarding same (1.1).
Volano T	09/11/12	1.5	Prepare venue hearing materials (1.3); label hearing material boxes (0.2).
Williams KC	09/11/12	7.0	Research several questions arising out of venue hearing (2.5); research on Winn-Dixie (0.3); team meeting regarding venue hearing (1.2); research tasks in preparation for venue hearing (3.0).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Zhu B	09/11/12	3.9	Conduct legal research regarding override royalties issues (1.9); attend conference with A. Delaney regarding draft 12(c) motion (0.3); correspond with J. Martin, A. Delaney and A. Mehes regarding override royalty issues in preparation for draft brief (0.8); correspond with E. Glazer regarding master equipment leases (0.4); correspond with J. Martin and A. Delaney regarding responses and objections to discovery requests (0.5).
Chepiga TL	09/12/12	0.3	Emails and calls with M. McGreal and M. Immermann regarding credit documents.
Coco KJ	09/12/12	6.6	Conduct research tasks and other tasks related to venue litigation and hearing (3.7); attend venue hearing by telephone (2.9).
de Richemont P	09/12/12	3.8	Coordinate hearing personnel and Logistics (3.8)
DeLaney AN	09/12/12	5.4	Prepare objections to discovery request.
Estacio R	09/12/12	14.2	Prepare materials for venue hearing (1.1); conferences with L. Samet and others regarding the same (0.2); draft correspondence to E. Moskowitz and J. McClammy regarding oral argument witness preparation (0.1); attend oral argument by teleconference and take notes regarding the same (10.9); research regarding issues raised during venue hearing (1.5); correspond with K. Williams regarding legal research regarding automatic stay dispute (0.2); correspond with M. McGreal regarding the same (0.1); correspond with J. Martin regarding the same (0.1).
Eum JS	09/12/12	2.5	Update demonstratives for court hearing as per L. Samet and R. Estacio.
Evans AR	09/12/12	1.8	Research merger clauses for R Martin.
Foust JT	09/12/12	13.2	Attend hearing on venue.
Huebner MS	09/12/12	16.0	Attend venue hearing including working during breaks (12.6); final reworking of new oral argument for day 2 of venue trial (3.4).
Klein DS	09/12/12	11.2	Late night research and analysis in preparation for hearing (1.1); dial-into venue hearing while fielding research requests from hearing team (8.2); research and analysis related to WV environmental proceeding (1.9).
Law EC	09/12/12	8.6	Route pleadings (0.2); numerous communications regarding pleadings (0.2); assist with venue hearing in Court (1.8); assist with logistics and support for hearing (4.7); numerous communications with M. McGreal, A. de Richemont, L. Samet, K. Stewart, M. Melvin and M. Pilkington regarding same (1.7).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin JD	09/12/12	7.5	Draft Massey motion papers (6.5); conference with A Starr, A Turner and H. Baker regarding lawsuit (0.6); emails with E. Power regarding automatic stay questions (0.4).
Martin RL	09/12/12	6.9	Meeting with B. Zhu regarding Massey adversarial proceeding (0.4); call with B. Zhu regarding Massey adversarial proceeding (0.1); research requirements for rejection and assumption under §365 (2.3); review settlement agreement and exhibits (0.5); research merger and integration clauses under New York and West Virginia law (3.6).
McClammy JI	09/12/12	1.2	Conference with J. Bean and M. Schroeder in advance of Court hearing (0.6); legal research regarding joinder issues (0.6).
McGreal MM	09/12/12	13.9	Review revised talking points (0.4); correspondence with L. Samet and J. Foust regarding hearing preparation (0.2); attend hearing on motion to transfer venue (13.3).
Mehes A	09/12/12	1.5	Edit override motion on the pleadings.
Melvin MM	09/12/12	0.4	Coordinate post-hearing logistics.
Moody, Jr. GM	09/12/12	0.5	Correspondence with B. Zhu and others regarding executory contract draft brief (0.2); call with A. Mehes and B. Zhu regarding mark-up of same by J. Martin (0.3).
Moskowitz E	09/12/12	13.7	Attend and participate in Patriot venue hearing in the Southern District of New York.
Robertson C	09/12/12	6.1	Research regarding obligation to perform under executory contracts (1.8); email to B. Resnick and M. McGreal summarizing same (0.9); follow up emails with company for backup regarding payments made on certain contracts (0.3); emails with B. Resnick regarding same (0.4); draft letter to counterparty regarding same (2.7).
Samet L	09/12/12	14.2	Revise talking points for venue hearing (1.2); research for same (0.4); revise and prepare demonstratives for same (0.4); attend venue hearing and participate in meetings during breaks (12.2).
Schaible DS	09/12/12	7.9	Attend and take part in venue hearing.
Starr AT	09/12/12	0.5	Emails regarding venue hearing.
Stewart KS	09/12/12	0.6	Numerous communications with M. McGreal.
Williams KC	09/12/12	7.2	Research several questions arising out of venue hearing (7.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Zhu B	09/12/12	7.7	Conduct legal research regarding integration and severability issues (3.9); attend various conferences with R. Martin regarding legal research (1.0); attend conference with A. Delaney regarding property law-related research for adversary proceeding (0.5); revise draft rider for 12(c) motion (1.2); prepare various correspondence with T. Perez, J. Martin, and litigation team regarding draft brief (0.8); correspond with J. Martin and A. Delaney regarding responses to discovery requests and deposition notice (0.3).
Coco KJ	09/13/12	3.1	Research in connection with automatic stay and environmental proceedings in West Virginia.
DeLaney AN	09/13/12	4.9	Discussion and research related to possible Patriot claims (0.8); prepare objections to document and discovery requests (4.1).
Estacio R	09/13/12	5.4	Review venue hearing materials (0.1); correspond with legal assistant regarding organizing the same (0.1); conference with B. Resnick regarding automatic stay dispute (0.1); conference with J. Martin regarding the same (0.1); conference call with Patriot regarding the same (0.8); correspond with K. Williams regarding the same (0.1); conference with D. Klein and others regarding the same (0.3); research and draft motion regarding the same (3.8).
Eum JS	09/13/12	0.3	Catalog hearing preparation materials as per R. Estacio.
Huebner MS	09/13/12	3.3	Internal meetings regarding venue preparation and drafting outline for post-trial submissions (3.1); conversations with E. Moskowitz, J. Jones regarding declaration on joinders (0.2).
Klein DS	09/13/12	10.1	Call with clients regarding selenium proceeding and follow-up related to same (0.7); meet with M. Huebner et al regarding same (0.6); follow-up call with clients related to same (0.5); research and analysis, including review of numerous precedents, regarding same and related autostay issues (7.4); late night call with M. Huebner et al regarding same (0.9).
Krause SC	09/13/12	0.5	Call with J. Chincheck regarding asset purchase (0.2); confer with D. Schaible regarding same (0.1); emails regarding same (0.2).
Lynch C	09/13/12	0.9	Meet with A. Starr, A. DeLaney regarding contract-based issues.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin JD	09/13/12	9.2	Communications with C. Panos, M. McGreal regarding scheduling in RoyaltyCo action (0.3); emails with C. Miller regarding subpoena (0.2); emails with D. Amedeo regarding scheduling in STB action (0.2); emails with L. Barefoot, B. Resnick, T. Perez and others regarding scheduling in Massey action (0.6); review Massey draft discovery responses (0.5); revise Massey motion papers (3.5); research for Massey motion (1.1); research Kentucky law regarding the contract severability.
Mehes A	09/13/12	5.8	Edit override motion on the pleadings.
Moody, Jr. GM	09/13/12	0.2	Correspondence with B. Zhu regarding rider for draft executory contract brief.
Moskowitz E	09/13/12	3.3	Meet with M. Huebner regarding venue issues (0.7); correspondence with team regarding follow-up to venue hearing (1.7); correspondence with client regarding hearing follow-up (0.9).
Resnick BM	09/13/12	0.2	Emails regarding override litigations.
Robertson C	09/13/12	1.4	Revise automatic stay violation letter.
Schaible DS	09/13/12	0.7	Emails regarding venue issues.
Spence TM	09/13/12	0.3	Obtain docket sheet and dockets for H. Baker.
Starr AT	09/13/12	3.3	Work on Peabody analysis (1.3); calls to Blackstone regarding same (0.1); meeting with C. Lynch and A. Delaney regarding Peabody analysis (0.6); calls to B. Resnick regarding the same (0.1); calls and emails with R. Estacio regarding a coal agreement analysis (0.8); emails to B. Bennett and C. Ebetino regarding same (0.4).
Williams KC	09/13/12	4.7	Research on automatic stay as applied to debtor seeking relief from court order regarding environmental liabilities.
Zhu B	09/13/12	5.8	Conduct additional legal research regarding Kentucky law on integration and severability issues (2.3); prepare various correspondence to J. Martin, T. Perez and litigation team regarding revisions to draft 12(c) brief (2.2); confer with R. Martin regarding legal research (0.5); confer with A. Mehes regarding revisions to draft brief (0.8).
Coco KJ	09/14/12	3.6	Meeting regarding environmental issues with M. McGreal, D. Klein and others (0.5); research regarding automatic stay (3.1).
de Richemont P	09/14/12	0.1	Review venue hearing transcript.
DeLaney AN	09/14/12	1.2	Research related to possible claims.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Estacio R	09/14/12	8.3	Draft and edit motion regarding automatic stay dispute (6.6); conference with D. Klein and others regarding the same (0.5); correspond with J. Foust and others regarding the same (0.1); correspond with K. Williams regarding the same (0.1); conference with K. Williams regarding the same (0.1); conference with E. Moskowitz regarding drafting post-hearing statement of facts and brief regarding venue dispute (0.7); conference with L. Samet regarding the same (0.2).
Huebner MS	09/14/12	1.8	Commence review and notes on Patriot venue transcript (1.1); calls with other venue parties regarding post trial submissions (0.7).
Klein DS	09/14/12	10.7	Calls with clients regarding selenium proceeding (0.8); call with Creditors Committee regarding same and follow-up (0.6); internal team meeting regarding same (0.8); meet with B. Resnick regarding same and other tasks (0.6); intensive case law research and analysis regarding automatic stay relating to selenium proceeding (7.9).
Krause SC	09/14/12	0.2	Call regarding contract miner.
Lynch C	09/14/12	0.3	Call with A. Starr to M. Buschmann at Blackstone regarding valuation materials in connection with contract-based questions.
Martin JD	09/14/12	6.5	Update call with company and advisers (0.8); prepare for same (0.2); calls and emails with M. Ledwin, E. Power, R. Mead and others regarding Chartis motion to lift stay (0.7); calls and emails with B. Parlin, M. McGreal, C. Ebetino, J. Jones and others regarding scheduling in Tampa action (0.8); review research in connection with issues in adversary proceedings (1.2); revise Massey motion papers (2.8).
Martin RL	09/14/12	2.9	Research corporate veil-piercing and agency law in New York and Kentucky (2.8); call with C. Zhu regarding coal settlement agreement (0.1).
McClammy JI	09/14/12	0.6	Conference with E. Moskowitz regarding hearing venue follow-up (0.2); telephone conference with J. Jones regarding venue joinder matters (0.4).
McGreal MM	09/14/12	0.1	Email B. Zhu regarding draft Massey pleadings.
Mehes A	09/14/12	4.7	Edit override motion.
Moody, Jr. GM	09/14/12	0.1	Correspondence with J. Martin regarding draft executory contract brief.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Moskowitz E	09/14/12	2.4	Meet with venue team to discuss brief and proposed findings (0.7); additional email correspondence with team regarding venue issues (0.9); draft and circulate document retention notice (0.8).
Resnick BM	09/14/12	0.2	Emails regarding Massey and other override litigation.
Robertson C	09/14/12	2.9	Research violations of automatic stay.
Samet L	09/14/12	1.3	Conferences with E. Moskowitz and R. Estacio regarding post-hearing submissions (0.9); correspondence with L. Vucetovic regarding Judge Chapman precedent (0.4).
Williams KC	09/14/12	1.0	Legal research on automatic stay issues.
Zhu B	09/14/12	7.4	Conduct research regarding integration-related issues in preparation for Massey adversary proceeding (2.7); confer with R. Martin regarding research (0.5); correspond with J. Martin and R. Martin regarding summary of same (0.7); revise 12(c) memorandum of law (2.2); prepare various correspondence with A. Mehes and J. Martin regarding same (0.8); correspond with counsel for the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and lenders regarding draft 12(c) memorandum of law (0.5).
Coco KJ	09/15/12	4.0	Draft and revise motion regarding automatic stay (2.9); legal research regarding same (0.5); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6).
Estacio R	09/15/12	1.3	Draft outline of post-hearing brief.
Foust JT	09/15/12	7.1	Research issues related to automatic stay issues (4.8); draft summary of same (2.3).
King MC	09/15/12	7.8	Meeting with M. McGreal regarding automatic stay research (0.4); research regarding same (5.2); email with findings to team regarding same (2.2).
Klein DS	09/15/12	9.7	Research and analysis relating to autostay and selenium proceeding (7.8); draft talking points related to same (1.9).
McGreal MM	09/15/12	6.1	Review precedent lift stay motion (0.4); review and revise selenium lift stay motion (4.3); conference with M. King regarding research on automatic stay (0.4); review automatic stay research (0.6); correspondence with H. Baker, D. Klein and J. Foust regarding same (0.4).
Starr AT	09/15/12	1.1	Review and revise a coal agreement (0.4); emails to C. Ebetino, B. Bennett, J. Martin and R. Estacio regarding same (0.7).
Coco KJ	09/16/12	0.8	Emails regarding selenium issues.
Estacio R	09/16/12	0.9	Draft outline post-hearing brief.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
King MC	09/16/12	7.2	Calls and emails with M. McGreal regarding research project regarding 525 and permit blocking (0.4); research regarding same (6.1); email to team with findings regarding same (1.7).
Klein DS	09/16/12	8.4	Research and analysis relating to autostay and selenium proceeding.
Martin JD	09/16/12	0.8	Review cases for Massey motion.
McGreal MM	09/16/12	7.9	Prepare emergency lift stay motion and motion to shorten notice (4.4); prepare talking points on same for B. Resnick (1.6); revise lift stay motion (0.8); correspondence with B. Resnick, H. Baker and others regarding same (0.6); email lift stay motions to Company, local counsel, the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's counsel and DIP counsel (0.1); legal research regarding lifting automatic stay (0.4).
Moskowitz E	09/16/12	0.6	Email correspondence with team regarding status.
Resnick BM	09/16/12	0.6	Review Massey memorandum of law (0.4); review the U.S. Trustee's objection to Equity Committee (0.2).
DeLaney AN	09/17/12	4.6	Research possible Patriot claims.
Estacio R	09/17/12	1.4	Draft post-hearing brief regarding venue issues.
Lynch C	09/17/12	0.1	Call with A. DeLaney regarding claims research.
Martin JD	09/17/12	4.6	Conference with T. Perez and C. Zhu regarding Massey motion (1.0); email to C. Ebetino, J. Bean and others regarding Massey motion (0.4); revise Massey motion (1.2); emails with C. Zhu and others regarding Massey proceeding (0.5); review STB motion to dismiss (0.8); emails with G. Moody, C. Zhu and others regarding same (0.7).
McGreal MM	09/17/12	1.4	Revise lift stay motions (0.7); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.1); revise talking points for emergency hearing on same (0.6).
Meyer DP	09/17/12	4.3	Research regarding §365 and subleases (0.9); draft email memo regarding assignment and subleases and additional research regarding same (1.4); call with Davis Polk and Blackstone regarding asset disposition (2.0).
Moody, Jr. GM	09/17/12	1.7	Review motion to dismiss executory contract complaint (0.9); correspondence with J. Martin and B. Zhu regarding same (0.2); begin formulating response to same (0.6).
Perez-Marques AJ	09/17/12	5.0	Review 12(c) motion regarding Massey (0.9); conference with J. Martin and B. Zhu regarding Massey 12 (c) motion (4.1).
Resnick BM	09/17/12	0.3	Review STB motion to dismiss.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
DeLaney AN	09/18/12	2.9	Research related to possible Patriot claims.
Estacio R	09/18/12	1.5	Draft outline of post hearing brief.
Huebner MS	09/18/12	0.1	Emails regarding shareholder litigation.
Huebner MS	09/18/12	0.3	Review of United Mine Workers Association videos and statements regarding §1113 and venue issues.
Krause SC	09/18/12	0.5	Call with J. Chincheck regarding asset purchase.
Martin JD	09/18/12	4.2	Analyze STB motion (0.5); communications with STB counsel regarding scheduling (0.2); calls and emails with C. Ebetino, J. Bean, and others regarding STB filing (1.1); revise Massey motion papers (1.4); e-mails with E. Power and others regarding automatic stay issues (0.2); research on automatic stay issues (0.8).
Martin RL	09/18/12	2.4	Call with B. Zhu regarding executory contracts (0.1); research regarding same (2.3).
McClammy JI	09/18/12	0.8	Review opposition briefs and comment (0.4); telephone conference with A. Starr regarding Bridgestone opposition briefs (0.1); email correspondence regarding opposition joinders (0.3).
Mehes A	09/18/12	0.9	Draft notice of motion in override proceedings.
Moody, Jr. GM	09/18/12	6.8	Conduct legal research for response to motion to dismiss complaint regarding executory contracts (2.8); call with B. Zhu regarding draft motion for judgment on pleadings (0.2); call with B. Zhu regarding draft amended complaint regarding executory contracts (0.4); correspondence with J. Martin regarding same (0.2); draft amended complaint regarding executory contracts (1.8); conduct factual research regarding same (1.3); send draft amended complaint to J. Martin for review (0.1).
Resnick BM	09/18/12	1.2	Review STB motion to dismiss (0.2); emails regarding same (0.1); review Massey motion (0.7); calls with A. Perez regarding same (0.2).
Starr AT	09/18/12	0.8	Draft rider for Bridgehouse motion (0.3); emails regarding same to J. Jones, M. Mattingly, E. Moskowitz, J. McClammy and A. Rogoff (0.5).
Williams KC	09/18/12	2.5	Prepare for interviews regarding joinder solicitation (1.5); meeting with J. McClammy regarding same (0.3); oversee preparation of materials for same (0.7).
Zhu B	09/18/12	5.4	Conduct follow up research regarding Massey answer (2.5); correspond with J. Martin and R. Martin regarding same (0.4); revise 12(c) brief (1.7); correspond with D. Klein and AlixPartners regarding adversary proceeding issues (0.4); revise notice of 12(c) motion (0.3); correspond with A. Mehes regarding same (0.1);

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Coco KJ	09/19/12	1.3	Draft motion to extend deadlines to remove actions.
Foust JT	09/19/12	2.0	Research regarding venue submission.
Huebner MS	09/19/12	7.9	Complete review of venue transcript and notes for post trial submissions on same.
Martin JD	09/19/12	5.5	Call with J. Wagner regarding Massey motion (0.2); call with L. Barefoot regarding Massey motion (0.1); email follow-up regarding same (0.2); work on Massey motion papers (3.6); review submission in Boone County action (0.2); email with E. Power regarding same (0.1); communications with G. Moody regarding STB filing (0.3); analysis of strategies in STB action (0.8).
McClammy JI	09/19/12	3.1	Review joinder solicitation materials (0.8); telephone conference with S. Harvey regarding joinder solicitation (0.8); telephone conference with W. Elkins regarding joinder solicitations (0.5); telephone conference with M. Perry regarding joinder solicitations (0.7); conference with K. Williams and L. Samet regarding venue issues (0.3).
McGreal MM	09/19/12	0.6	Legal research regarding debtors lifting the stay.
Mehes A	09/19/12	5.1	Research choice of law (3.2); prepare binder of agreements (0.6); edit override motion on the pleadings (1.3).
Moody, Jr. GM	09/19/12	0.4	Call with J. Martin regarding summary of strategic choices regarding response to motion to dismiss.
Moskowitz E	09/19/12	1.5	Review brief outline and meet with L. Samet regarding same.
Resnick BM	09/19/12	0.2	Emails regarding override litigation strategy.
Samet L	09/19/12	8.6	Draft and edit outline for post-hearing venue submission (4.8); conferences with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.2); research regarding same (0.3); emails with J. Foust regarding research issues (0.3); draft proposed findings of fact (2.1); conferences with J. McClammy and K. Williams regarding joinder submission (0.2); emails and correspondence with Peabody regarding defense of actions during stay (0.4); revise footnote for Bridgehouse motion (0.2); emails to M. Mattingly regarding same (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Zhu B	09/19/12	4.1	Revise Massey 12(c) brief (2.3); conduct follow up legal research regarding same (0.8); correspond with J. Martin and A. Mehes regarding same (0.5); confer with managing attorney's office regarding 12(c) motion ancillary papers (0.3); correspond with counsel to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and lenders regarding Massey filing (0.2).
Estacio R	09/20/12	4.8	Conference with L. Samet regarding post-hearing venue brief (0.2); draft same (4.6).
Eum JS	09/20/12	0.2	Catalog copies of Override Agreement binders for archives as per B. Zhu.
Foust JT	09/20/12	2.2	Research regarding venue submission.
Huebner MS	09/20/12	2.4	Meet with E. Moskowitz and L. Samet regarding venue approach and outline (0.7); review of and multiple emails regarding Peabody litigation letter (0.3); call with CEO and conference call with Mayer Brown, J. Bean regarding Peabody recusal and other issues (1.2); emails regarding ethical wall (0.2).
Martin JD	09/20/12	6.3	Call with A. Starr and E. Waller regarding Peabody letter (0.6); prepare for same (0.3); emails with E. Waller regarding automatic stay issues (0.2); revise Massey motion papers (4.5); emails with C. Ebetino, J. Bean and others regarding same (0.7).
McGreal MM	09/20/12	0.4	Revise West Virginia lift stay motion.
Mehes A	09/20/12	0.2	Edit contracts pleadings.
Moody, Jr. GM	09/20/12	2.8	Draft summary of potential responses to motion to dismiss executory contract complaint (2.3); conduct factual research in connection with same (0.4); send summary to J. Martin for review (0.1).
Moskowitz E	09/20/12	0.9	Meet with L. Samet regarding venue brief and other post-hearing work.
Resnick BM	09/20/12	0.2	Emails regarding override litigation.
Samet L	09/20/12	3.9	Meeting with M. Huebner and E. Moskowitz regarding post-hearing briefing (1.0); emails with J. Foust and others regarding research tasks (0.4); research and analysis regarding venue issues (1.7); telephone calls with S. Schutzenhofer regarding joinder issues (0.3); emails and conferences regarding same (0.5).
Starr AT	09/20/12	1.9	Calls and emails regarding Peabody letter on indemnification with J. Martin, J. Jones, E. Waller and M. Huebner (0.8); analyze potential responses (0.2); calls and emails with equity holders counsel (0.4); revise confidentiality stipulation (0.5).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Toscano DB	09/20/12	1.7	Telephone conference with A. Starr regarding potential claim (0.2); telephone conference with A. Starr, M. Huebner and other counsel regarding potential claim (0.9); draft email message regarding same (0.4); communications regarding potential claim (0.2).
Zhu B	09/20/12	3.1	Revise 12(c) memorandum of law (1.2); correspondence with A. Mehes and J. Martin regarding same (0.4); correspond with counsel for the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and lenders regarding draft 12(c) memorandum of law (0.4); conduct follow up legal research regarding same (1.1).
Zhu B	09/20/12	0.3	Correspond with A. Starr and J. Eum regarding preparation of override agreements.
Coco KJ	09/21/12	2.3	Draft and revise motion to extend deadline to remove actions (1.3); coordinate regarding service of same (0.8); calls and emails with E. Moskowitz regarding Rule 2019 (0.2).
Coco KJ	09/21/12	0.6	Comment on Massey override pleadings.
DeLaney AN	09/21/12	5.7	Research related to possible claims.
Estacio R	09/21/12	8.8	Draft post-hearing brief regarding venue dispute (6.8); conference with A. Starr regarding responding to letter from Peabody regarding automatic stay (0.4); research and draft response to same (1.6).
Eum JS	09/21/12	0.1	Coordinate signed original copy of a motion to reject, as per R. Estacio.
Foust JT	09/21/12	2.8	Research regarding venue submission.
Huebner MS	09/21/12	0.9	Conversation with the U.S. Trustee regarding venue declaration (0.2); internal conversations and emails regarding same (0.3); complete meeting with L. Samet regarding venue approach (0.4).
Martin JD	09/21/12	7.9	Update call with company and advisors (0.7); prepare for same (0.2); finalize and file Massey 12(c) motion (5.2); emails with C. Ebetino, J. Eagan, J. Jones, J. Wagner and others regarding same (0.9); emails with E. Waller regarding automatic stay issues (0.3); analysis of strategy in STB action (0.6).
McClammy JI	09/21/12	0.5	Follow-up regarding joinder solicitation issues.
McGreal MM	09/21/12	0.7	Correspondence with L. Samet regarding post-hearing venue brief (0.1); correspondence with Weil regarding same (0.1); revise West Virginia lift stay motion (0.3); correspondence regarding same with B. Resnick, Jackson Kelly and others (0.2).
Mehes A	09/21/12	2.0	Edit override motion on the pleadings.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Moody, Jr. GM	09/21/12	0.1	Call with B. Zhu regarding motion for judgment on the pleadings regarding executory contract complaint.
Moskowitz E	09/21/12	0.8	Meet with L. Samet regarding venue work (0.4); calls with co-counsel regarding venue briefing (0.4).
Perez-Marques AJ	09/21/12	0.6	Review Massey 12(c) brief.
Resnick BM	09/21/12	0.3	Emails regarding Massey brief.
Samet L	09/21/12	2.4	Meeting with M. Huebner regarding post-hearing submissions (0.4); emails with E. Moskowitz, M. McGreal, and others regarding same (0.9); meeting with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.2); telephone calls with J. Eagan regarding joinder issues (0.7); meeting with J. McClammy and K. Williams regarding same (0.2).
Starr AT	09/21/12	3.7	Revise presentation (0.3); calls and emails with J. Bean, J. Haider, M. Buschman and C. Ebetino regarding the same (0.6); emails with R. Estacio regarding planning for opposition (0.2); emails regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's questions on certain contracts (0.1); calls and emails with B. Bennett, B. Resnick, D. Toscano and A. Delaney regarding potential dispute with coal counterparty (0.9); call with B. Bennett regarding assignability of coal supply contracts (0.5); meet with D. Toscano and A. Delaney regarding same (0.6); review research regarding assignability of contracts (0.5).
Toscano DB	09/21/12	1.0	Telephone conference with A. Starr and A. DeLaney regarding contract issue (0.3); obtain research on relevant issue (0.2); conference with A. Starr and A. DeLaney regarding contract issue (0.5).
Williams KC	09/21/12	1.8	Legal research on venue issues.
Zhu B	09/21/12	5.8	Revise Massey 12(c) motion (3.1); correspond with J. Martin and A. Mehes regarding same (0.9); prepare 12(c) motion papers for filing (1.2); confer with D. Klein, A. Mehes and managing attorney's office regarding filing and service (0.6).
DeLaney AN	09/22/12	2.4	Research possible contract-based claims.
Foust JT	09/22/12	5.2	Follow-up research for venue submission.
McGreal MM	09/22/12	0.6	Research fact issues relating to post-hearing venue brief.
Samet L	09/22/12	2.6	Factual and legal research for post-hearing venue submissions (1.3); draft proposed findings of fact for post-hearing submission (1.3).
Starr AT	09/22/12	0.4	Emails regarding assignability of coal contracts with A. Delaney.
DeLaney AN	09/23/12	2.9	Research into jurisdictional contract issues.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Estacio R	09/23/12	5.4	Research and draft post-hearing brief regarding venue dispute (5.2); analyze venue case law (0.2).
Foust JT	09/23/12	4.2	Follow up research for venue submission.
Moskowitz E	09/23/12	0.6	Correspondence with team regarding venue issues and briefing.
Samet L	09/23/12	10.5	Draft proposed findings of fact for post-hearing venue submission (5.4); research for post-hearing venue brief (2.2); draft post-hearing venue brief (2.9).
Schaible DS	09/23/12	0.4	Emails regarding auto stay issues.
Starr AT	09/23/12	0.9	Emails and calls regarding coal counterparty dispute with A. Delaney, B. Bennett, E. Moskowitz and D. Toscano.
Toscano DB	09/23/12	0.2	Research regarding forum selection clauses.
Williams KC	09/23/12	2.7	Research on artificial impairment and forum non conveniens.
DeLaney AN	09/24/12	3.8	Research related to contract issue (3.3); correspondence with client regarding research on contract issue and discuss same with A. Starr (0.5).
Estacio R	09/24/12	5.9	Draft post-hearing brief regarding venue dispute (3.1); conference with L. Samet and others regarding venue findings of fact (0.9); conference with A. Starr and West Virginia counsel regarding mining permit issues (0.6); draft correspondence to West Virginia counsel regarding the same (0.3); read correspondence from Patriot regarding the same (0.1); conference with A. Starr regarding responding to letter from Peabody regarding indemnification for litigation costs (0.1); research regarding the same (0.5); draft response letter regarding the same (0.3).
Huebner MS	09/24/12	1.9	Review new materials, cases and research findings produced by team for venue brief (1.0); meet with E. Moskowitz, L. Samet regarding same and further development of brief (0.6); emails and internal conversations regarding new class action suit and review summary of same (0.3).
Klein DS	09/24/12	2.1	Call with Kramer Levin regarding selenium liftstay and follow-up on related issues (1.2); research and analysis related to same (0.9).
Martin JD	09/24/12	1.6	Review securities class action complaint (0.8); call with A. Starr regarding same (0.2); conference with C. Zhu regarding RoyaltyCo proceeding (0.2); review RoyaltyCo documents in preparation for motion (0.4).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin JD	09/24/12	6.0	Prepare for pretrial conference in Massey (2.8); review research and authorities on discovery stay (2.7); call with J. Bromley, L. Barefoot, C. Zhu regarding discovery issues in Massey proceeding (0.3); prepare for same (0.2).
McClammy JI	09/24/12	0.3	Follow-up regarding gathering and confirming facts for joinder declaration.
McGreal MM	09/24/12	0.8	Review Kramer Levin's comments to the lift stay motion.
Mehes A	09/24/12	0.3	Oversee creation of and review override briefs for service.
Moody, Jr. GM	09/24/12	1.7	Review motion for judgment on the pleadings in connection with executory contract complaint (1.4); call with A. Mehes regarding same (0.3).
Moskowitz E	09/24/12	6.3	Meet with M. Huebner and L. Samet regarding brief and follow-up (0.6); meet with team regarding findings (0.5); review proposed findings and draft edits and riders (3.6); calls with co-counsel regarding post-hearing submissions (1.2); related correspondence with team (0.4).
Perez-Marques AJ	09/24/12	1.3	Confer with J. Martin regarding Massey issues (0.4); prepare for court conference (0.9).
Resnick BM	09/24/12	0.2	Emails regarding Massey strategy.
Samet L	09/24/12	12.5	Draft and edit post-hearing venue brief (8.2); research for same (3.1); conferences with M. Huebner and E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.7); conferences with E. Moskowitz and R. Estacio regarding draft proposed findings of fact (0.5).
Starr AT	09/24/12	3.6	Review securities complaint (0.8); calls with J. Jones, M. Huebner, W. Taylor and J. Martin regarding the same (1.4); review insurance materials (0.5); emails regarding disclosure query with S. Beshar (0.3); calls with B. Bennett, J. Jones and R. Wuller regarding dispute with coal sales counterparty (0.3); emails regarding legal research regarding with A. Delaney (0.3).
Toscano DB	09/24/12	0.3	Read email message from A. DeLaney and attached cases.
Williams KC	09/24/12	2.9	Review joinder emails from Patriot employees (2.2); review venue hearing transcript (0.7).
Zhu B	09/24/12	1.4	Attend conference with opposing counsel regarding Massey discovery issues (0.5); attend conference with J. Martin regarding same (0.3); correspond with A. Mehes and Davis Polk team regarding service of process for Massey 12(c) papers (0.6).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Zhu B	09/24/12	1.8	Review RoyaltyCo filings in preparation for next steps (1.0); confer with J. Martin regarding RoyaltyCo strategy and next steps (0.5); prepare correspondence with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and lenders regarding Massey 12(c) filing (0.3).
DeLaney AN	09/25/12	0.3	Meet with C. Lynch regarding possible contract-based claims.
Estacio R	09/25/12	0.3	Conference with L. Samet and others regarding post-hearing venue brief (0.2); edit letter regarding autostay issues (0.1).
Huebner MS	09/25/12	0.5	Review and markup of lift stay motion and conversation with B. Resnick regarding same.
Lynch C	09/25/12	0.5	Call with A. DeLaney regarding legal research regarding possible claims (0.3); summarize discussion in email for A. Starr (0.2).
Martin JD	09/25/12	5.1	Prepare for pretrial conference in Massey proceeding (1.3); attend pretrial conference in Massey proceeding (0.5); analysis of strategy in STB proceeding (1.9); emails with C. Ebetino, J. Eagan and others regarding STB proceeding (1.1); emails with E. Waller regarding automatic stay issues (0.3).
McClammy JI	09/25/12	0.9	Telephone conference with K. Toten and K. Williams regarding joinder issues (0.4); telephone conference with D. McAllistar regarding joinder issues (0.3); conference with K. Williams regarding joinder affidavit (0.2).
McGreal MM	09/25/12	2.5	Telephone conference with A. Rogoff and B. Resnick regarding lift stay motion (0.7); telephone conference with M. Huebner and B. Resnick regarding same (0.4); revise lift stay motion (0.6); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.7); email revised lift stay motion to Company, the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's counsel and DIP lenders' counsel (0.1).
Moskowitz E	09/25/12	2.5	Review draft post-hearing brief and provide comments to team regarding same (1.9); correspondence with team regarding venue strategy issues (0.6).
Perez-Marques AJ	09/25/12	1.7	Court conference regarding Massey litigation (1.4); confer regarding STB issues (0.3).
Resnick BM	09/25/12	0.2	Emails regarding override litigation strategy.
Samet L	09/25/12	2.0	Research for post-hearing venue briefing (0.5); conferences with E. Moskowitz and R. Estacio regarding post-hearing brief (0.2); revise same (1.3).
Starr AT	09/25/12	0.8	Revise letter to Peabody regarding indemnities (0.6); emails regarding the same (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Toscano DB	09/25/12	0.3	Conference with E. Glazer regarding expert issues.
Williams KC	09/25/12	2.7	Conference calls with Patriot employees regarding joinder issues (0.6); review joinder emails from Patriot employees (0.8); draft declaration regarding joinder issues (1.3).
Zhu B	09/25/12	6.7	Review and prepare various correspondences with Patriot team and Davis Polk litigation teams regarding various issues regarding STB override-related agreements (1.2); review STB-related agreements and notes in preparation for court filing (1.3); review RoyaltyCo agreements and background notes in preparation for legal brief (2.0); prepare draft RoyaltyCo 12(c) motion (2.2).
DeLaney AN	09/26/12	0.3	Research related to possible Patriot claims.
Estacio R	09/26/12	6.8	Conference with A. Starr and Patriot regarding rejection of a coal supply agreement (0.9); conference with A. Starr regarding response to letter from Peabody Energy (0.2); edit response letter (0.3); correspond with B. Chen regarding contract integration research (0.1); revise proposed findings of fact (5.3).
Lynch C	09/26/12	0.7	Prepare for Equity Committee discovery call (0.2); call with M. Schroeder, J. Jones, A. Starr, L. Howard and others regarding discovery issues in connection with equity committee request (0.5).
Martin JD	09/26/12	2.9	Research for lift-stay motion objection (1.5); revise lift-stay motion objection (1.4).
McClammy JI	09/26/12	1.6	Review and comment regarding draft joinder affidavit (0.6); telephone conference with M. Williams and K. Williams regarding joinder issues (0.3); review proposed findings of fact regarding joinder issues (0.7).
McGreal MM	09/26/12	1.7	Review Kramer Levin comments and Willkie's comments to lift stay motion (0.7); revise lift stay motion (0.8); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/26/12	0.9	Emails with client and D. Schaible, A. Starr and M. Huebner regarding counsel selection and conflicts issues (0.6); review class action law suit complaint (0.3).
Samet L	09/26/12	0.2	Emails with E. Moskowitz and A. Alfonso regarding post-hearing submissions.
Williams KC	09/26/12	4.4	Draft joinder declaration.
Zhu B	09/26/12	5.0	Prepare draft RoyaltyCo 12(c) motion (3.1); conduct legal research in preparation for same (1.9).
DeLaney AN	09/27/12	1.8	Review matters related to STB motion to dismiss.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Estacio R	09/27/12	2.9	Correspond with J. Martin and others regarding treatment of letters of credit in bankruptcy (0.2); correspond with J. McClammy regarding venue proposed findings of fact (0.1); correspond with L. Samet regarding same (0.2); revise the same (2.3); correspond with A. Starr regarding response to letter from Peabody Energy (0.1).
Huebner MS	09/27/12	4.9	Calls and emails with T. Mayer and internally regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's and DIP lenders' comments on lift stay motion (1.7); emails regarding securities class action (0.2); conversation with A. Starr, J. Jones, R. Mead regarding same (0.9); call with Kramer Levin regarding venue briefing and joinder declaration (0.8); review and markup of supplemental Davis Polk declaration (0.2); full turn of draft venue brief and conversation with L. Samet regarding same (1.1).
Martin JD	09/27/12	1.8	Emails with C. Ebetino and others regarding STB action (0.5); research on automatic stay issues (1.3).
McClammy JI	09/27/12	1.7	Review and comment on draft joinder declaration (0.4); revise draft joinder declaration (0.7); review draft findings of fact (0.6).
McGreal MM	09/27/12	1.4	Teleconference with M. Freitag regarding lift stay motion (0.1); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.1); review and comment on Weil's comments to lift stay motion (0.3); correspondence with Weil regarding same (0.1); revise lift stay motion (0.4); correspondence with B. Resnick and H. Baker regarding same (0.2); correspondence with L. Samet regarding post-hearing brief (0.2).
Moody, Jr. GM	09/27/12	0.6	Correspondence with A. Mehes regarding status of executory contract litigation (0.2); call with A. Delaney regarding time for responding to motion to dismiss (0.1); collect and send executory contract materials to A. Delaney (0.2); correspondence with J. Eum regarding creation of binder (0.1).
Moskowitz E	09/27/12	1.2	Review draft brief and affidavit (0.9); call with L. Samet regarding brief and status (0.3).
Resnick BM	09/27/12	0.3	Emails with client and D. Schaible, A. Starr and M. Huebner regarding counsel selection and conflicts issues.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Samet L	09/27/12	14.8	Edit post-hearing venue brief (6.6); research for same (1.5); meeting with M. Huebner regarding same (0.5); review affirmation regarding joinders and emails with J. McClammy regarding same (0.8); revise proposed findings of fact (4.4); telephone call with M. Huebner, T. Mayer, and others regarding venue issues (1.0).
Starr AT	09/27/12	1.1	Calls and emails regarding lift stay motion with J. Martin and R. Estacio (0.5); emails with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's counsel regarding stay issues (0.6).
Williams KC	09/27/12	2.4	Draft and revise sections of joinder declaration.
Zhu B	09/27/12	6.4	Draft RoyaltyCo 12(c) brief (4.7); conduct legal research regarding same (1.5); confer with J. Martin regarding same (0.1); correspond with A. Mehes regarding same (0.1).
Blakemore PW	09/28/12	1.7	Attend meeting with J. Martin and A. DeLaney (0.6); research application of rule 12(b)(7) to override agreements (1.1).
DeLaney AN	09/28/12	1.7	Meet with J. Martin and P. Blakemore regarding reply brief (0.7); read case materials in preparation for reply briefing (1.0).
Estacio R	09/28/12	14.4	Review response to letter from Peabody Energy (0.2); draft analysis of certain contracts for A. Starr and J. Martin regarding contract integration issues (5.2); correspond with J. Martin regarding same (0.1); conferences with M. Huebner and others regarding post-hearing brief and proposed findings of fact (0.8); revise and edit post-hearing brief and proposed findings of fact (5.7); research regarding the same (1.8); conferences with L. Samet regarding the same (0.1); draft summary of contract rejection motion filed regarding a coal supply agreement (0.5).
Eum JS	09/28/12	2.5	Compile documents for STB Override, STB Filings and Massey Filings binders as per G. Moody and A. DeLaney (1.4); compile dollar amounts per claim held in debtors' proposed findings of fact for spreadsheet as per R. Estacio (1.1).
Howard L	09/28/12	0.6	Research issue relating to automatic stay.
Huebner MS	09/28/12	3.5	Full turn of venue brief, findings of fact and declaration and meeting with multiple Davis Polk attorneys regarding same (3.2); multiple emails with supporting parties regarding venue submissions (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Huebner MS	09/28/12	0.8	Conversation with T. Mayer regarding multiple matters including bar date, stay motion and venue issues.
Lynch C	09/28/12	0.5	Correspond with M. McGreal regarding insurance policies (0.2); review research memo regarding automatic stay in related lawsuits (0.3).
Martin JD	09/28/12	6.4	Conference with P. Blakemore and A. Delaney regarding STB litigation (0.8); prepare for same (0.3); prepare summary of litigation for C. Ebetino (1.1); emails with E. Waller regarding automatic stay issues (0.3); emails with R. Estacio and others regarding certain contracts (0.3); emails with S. O' Neal and others regarding scheduling for a rejection motion (0.4); review draft motion papers in adversary proceeding (0.8); revise objection to lift-stay motion (2.4).
McClammy JI	09/28/12	3.1	Revise joinder declaration (1.4); email correspondence regarding venue issues (0.3); telephone conference with J. Jones regarding joinder declaration (0.2); review post-hearing papers (0.9); review M. Huebner revisions to declaration (0.3).
Mehes A	09/28/12	1.6	Summarize override litigation status for client.
Moody, Jr. GM	09/28/12	0.1	Correspondence with A. Delaney regarding executory contract filing deadline.
Moskowitz E	09/28/12	3.2	Review proposed findings, brief and draft declaration (2.5); correspondence with team regarding above and overall status (0.7).
Samet L	09/28/12	3.4	Revise proposed findings of fact (1.0); meeting with M. Huebner and R. Estacio regarding post-venue-hearing brief (0.3); revise same (1.7); telephone calls and emails with R. Estacio regarding same (0.4).
Huebner MS	09/29/12	0.4	Full review and markup of venue brief and emails to co-objectors and internally regarding same.
Martin JD	09/29/12	2.2	Revise objection to lift-stay motion (1.3); research for same (0.9).
Blakemore PW	09/30/12	1.1	Research issues related to necessary parties under rules 19 and 12(b)(7).
Estacio R	09/30/12	2.2	Revise and edit objection to request for relief from automatic stay.
Huebner MS	09/30/12	2.4	Two full review and markups of brief (1.9); emails to clients regarding same (0.2); conversations with J. Jones, L. Samet regarding same (0.3).
Martin JD	09/30/12	1.8	Revise objection to lift-stay motion (1.6); emails with R. Estacio, A. Starr regarding same (0.2)

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Samet L	09/30/12	5.7	Edit post-hearing venue brief (4.5); emails with client and others regarding same (0.4); emails and telephone calls with M. Huebner regarding same (0.2); revise draft proposed findings of fact (0.6).
Total AUTOMATIC STAY\ LITIGATION		1,630.6	
CREDITOR\EQUITYHOLDER \UCC ISSUES			
Schaible DS	09/01/12	0.3	Claims settlement coordination.
Resnick BM	09/02/12	0.1	Emails regarding claim settlement procedures.
Schaible DS	09/02/12	0.2	Coordinate regarding claims settlement issues.
Coco KJ	09/03/12	1.2	Emails with company, AlixPartners and Davis Polk team regarding creditor payments and supplier management committee issues (0.6); emails with company, AlixPartners and Davis Polk team regarding claims settlement procedures motion and order (0.6).
Lynch C	09/03/12	2.5	Legal research regarding opposition to motion for Equity Committee (1.5); draft opposition brief (1.0).
Resnick BM	09/03/12	0.4	Review and revise letter to U.S. Trustee.
Schaible DS	09/03/12	1.0	Emails regarding shareholder issues (0.7); emails and review materials regarding claims settlement issues (0.3).
Baker HS	09/04/12	1.8	Meeting with B. Huber and A. Turner regarding a claim (1.1); review of related documents (0.4); correspondence with D. McCallister regarding selenium proceedings (0.3).
Coco KJ	09/04/12	3.6	Emails with GCG and Davis Polk regarding proof of claim filing and claims register issues (0.7); attend supplier management committee call, follow up regarding same (0.5); edit bar date motion, order and notice (1.1); update call with creditors' committee counsel (0.6); review claims and contracts chart from AlixPartners (0.7).
Huebner MS	09/04/12	0.1	Emails regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee Peabody call.
Klein DS	09/04/12	0.3	Emails with K. Coco regarding counterparty claim (0.2); call with M. McGreal regarding same (0.1).
Lynch C	09/04/12	4.1	Legal research regarding opposition to motion for equity committee (2.0); draft opposition brief (2.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	09/04/12	1.3	Review B. Resnick's comments to letter regarding request to join the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.2); revise same (0.1); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.1); correspondence with U.S. Trustee regarding extension of deadline to submit response (0.1); teleconference with Kramer Levin, D. Schaible and B. Resnick regarding claims settlement procedures and Unsecured Creditors' Committee updates (0.8).
McGreal MM	09/04/12	0.3	Correspondence with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding sending proof of claim forms to union workers (0.2); email client regarding adjourning claims settlement procedures motion (0.1).
Mehes A	09/04/12	0.3	Obtain and review corrected version of the Equity Committee brief.
Moody, Jr. GM	09/04/12	0.1	Correspondence with D. Toscano regarding meeting with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee.
Resnick BM	09/04/12	1.3	Emails regarding letter to U.S. Trustee (0.2); call with Kramer Levin (0.7); meet with D. Klein and M. McGreal regarding claims issues (0.4).
Schaible DS	09/04/12	1.6	Coordinate with U.S. Trustee regarding case issues (0.6); coordinate regarding updates (0.4); coordinate regarding claims objection procedures (0.6).
Starr AT	09/04/12	1.4	Calls regarding Equity Committee motion with A. Mehes and C. Lynch (0.3); emails and calls regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's inquiries on Peabody transaction with B. Bennett, T. Thomas and A. Rogoff (0.7); prepare for a conference call with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.4).
Coco KJ	09/05/12	4.4	Research, draft and revise motion regarding equityholder group (3.6); review comments to bar date motion (0.5); respond to creditor requests (0.3).
Foust JT	09/05/12	1.1	Research precedent §341 meeting transcripts.
Hait S	09/05/12	4.4	Review GCG comments to proof of claim form (0.5); call with D. Klein and Alix Partners regarding reclamation (0.5); draft motion regarding Equity Committee (3.0); meet with K. Coco regarding motion regarding Equity Committee (0.4).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klein DS	09/05/12	1.2	Call with AlixPartners regarding reclamation demands and next steps regarding same (0.4); email W. Elkins regarding critical vendor payments (0.2); call with A. Starr et al regarding equity committee issues and follow-up regarding same (0.3); email J. Jones regarding Schedules extension (0.1); email R. McWilliams regarding postpetition invoices (0.2).
Lynch C	09/05/12	7.4	Legal research regarding opposition to motion for equity committee (3.5); draft opposition brief (3.9).
McGreal MM	09/05/12	1.5	Provide comments to AlixPartners regarding claims and contracts assessment teams (0.2); correspondence with Kramer Levin, DIP lenders' counsel and D. Schaible regarding adjourning claims settlement procedures motion (0.3); email clients regarding rescheduled §341 meeting (0.1); review notice of same (0.1); correspondence with A. Libby regarding same (0.1); correspondence with J. Jones and D. Schaible regarding responding to U.S. Trustee's request for information for §341 meeting (0.1); correspondence with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding sending proofs of claim forms to union members (0.2); teleconference with AlixPartners, D. Klein and S. Hait regarding reclamation demands (0.4).
Mehes A	09/05/12	3.1	Edit Equity Committee opposition brief (2.8); meet with A. Starr (and simultaneous call with others) regarding Equity Committee opposition (0.3).
Starr AT	09/05/12	0.4	Calls and emails regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's inquiries on the Peabody transaction.
Starr AT	09/05/12	0.7	Calls with D. Klein and B. Resnick regarding equity committee motion (0.3); call with A. Mehes and C. Lynch regarding status conference regarding equity committee motion (0.2); call with DIP lenders counsel regarding motion (0.2).
Coco KJ	09/06/12	3.2	Draft motion regarding equityholder group (1.8); prepare for and attend supplier management committee call (0.2); attend weekly update call with clients (0.5); review and comment on bar date motion (0.7).
Foust JT	09/06/12	2.9	Research precedent §341 meeting transcripts.
Hait S	09/06/12	3.2	Draft motion regarding equity committee.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klein DS	09/06/12	0.7	Email D. Goldstein regarding prepetition claim (0.2); call with counterparty attorney regarding postpetition performance and follow-up with clients regarding same (0.3); emails with real estate lessor regarding amounts owed and follow-up with clients regarding same (0.2).
Lynch C	09/06/12	6.9	Legal research in connection with equity committee motion (0.5); draft opposition brief to motion to appoint Equity Committee (4.3); calls, emails with A. Mehes regarding same (1.3); correspond with A. Starr regarding same (0.8).
McGreal MM	09/06/12	1.2	Correspondence with R. McWilliams and counsel to the contract counterparty regarding elevator contract (0.2); conference with B. Resnick regarding same (0.1); review critical vendor request (0.2); correspondence with R. Mead regarding same (0.1); revise response to letter request (0.2); review Kramer Levin's response to letter request (0.2); email J. Bean and J. Jones regarding same (0.1); correspondence regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee diligence request list (0.1).
Mehes A	09/06/12	1.3	Edit Equity Committee opposition.
Resnick BM	09/06/12	0.2	Review the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's letter regarding committee issues (0.1); review Davis Polk's letter regarding committee issues (0.1).
Starr AT	09/06/12	6.7	Conference call with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (1.1); calls with Peabody counsel (1.6); revise order and agreement with Peabody (2.1); calls with M. Huebner, B. Bennett and T. Thomas regarding Peabody issues (0.6); review Patriot equity brief (0.8); calls and emails with equity holders (0.3); calls regarding shareholder inquiry (0.2).
Toscano DB	09/06/12	1.7	Telephone conference with A. Starr regarding call with United Creditors' Committee (0.2); call with United Creditors' Committee (1.3); read email exchange regarding communications with United Creditors' Committee (0.1); read email exchange regarding motion (0.1).
Foust JT	09/07/12	2.2	Prepare summary of Patriot §341 meeting.
Klein DS	09/07/12	0.1	Email with D. Neier regarding claim amounts.
McGreal MM	09/07/12	0.4	Correspondence with B. Resnick regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee diligence request (0.1); revise and finalize response to Unsecured Creditors' Committee's letter request (0.2); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick BM	09/07/12	0.8	Call with A. Starr regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's document request (0.2); emails regarding Equity Committee issues (0.3); review Unsecured Creditors' Committee's diligence request (0.1); call with A. Starr regarding same (0.2).
Ruiz EL	09/07/12	0.3	Emails to D. Klein and A. Libby regarding §341 notice.
Schaible DS	09/07/12	0.4	Review and revise the Unsecured Creditor's Committee letter.
Starr AT	09/07/12	1.6	Calls and emails regarding the Equity Committee motion with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and DIP lenders (0.5); emails to M. Schroeder regarding the same (0.3); review draft opposition to equity committee motion (0.8).
Starr AT	09/08/12	1.9	Calls and emails with C. Black, G. Moody, A. Rogoff and A. Yerramalli regarding revisions to Peabody order.
Resnick BM	09/09/12	0.1	Call with D. Schaible regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee issues.
Schaible DS	09/09/12	0.5	Emails, teleconference and coordinate regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's due diligence issues.
Starr AT	09/09/12	1.5	Calls and emails with C. Black, A. Rogoff and M. Huebner regarding Peabody order (0.9); revise order (0.5); calls to G. Moody regarding same (0.1).
Klein DS	09/10/12	0.9	Call with W. Elkins regarding prepetition vendor claims (0.3); call with clients and vendor regarding prepetition claim (0.6).
Lynch C	09/10/12	0.5	Meet with A. Starr and A. Mehes regarding Equity Committee status conference.
Lynch C	09/10/12	0.4	Prepare background materials for Equity Committee status hearing.
Martin JD	09/10/12	1.1	Call with B. Resnick, J. Jones, and others regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's document request (0.4); review documents regarding same (0.5); emails regarding same with A. Starr and B. Resnick (0.2).
McGreal MM	09/10/12	0.5	Teleconference with the Company, AlixPartners, B. Resnick and J. Martin regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee due diligence requests (0.4); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding reclamation claims (0.1).
Mehes A	09/10/12	0.7	Research discovery issues in connection with equity committee motion (0.3); meeting with A. Starr and C. Lynch regarding steps forward regarding same(0.4).
Resnick BM	09/10/12	0.6	Call with J. Martin regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee diligence issues (0.2); call with S. Mell and J. Jones regarding same (0.4).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	09/10/12	1.1	Prepare for status conference regarding Equity Committee motion (0.7); calls with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and DIP lenders counsel regarding the same (0.4).
Lynch C	09/11/12	0.2	Prepare materials for court hearing.
McGreal MM	09/11/12	0.3	Supplier Management Call with Company and AlixPartners.
Resnick BM	09/11/12	0.5	Meeting with J. Bean regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee diligence request (0.2); emails regarding same (0.1); emails regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee's request (0.1); call with S. Mell regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee diligence request (0.1).
Starr AT	09/11/12	0.6	Emails regarding equity holders motion (0.4); emails with DIP and Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel regarding equity holders request for discovery (0.2).
Coco KJ	09/12/12	1.4	Review agenda for supplier management committee call (0.2); analysis of counterparty critical vendor issues (1.2).
Ruiz EL	09/12/12	0.1	Email regarding utility service.
Starr AT	09/12/12	0.3	Calls and emails equity holder motion (0.2); review equity briefs (0.1).
Coco KJ	09/13/12	1.6	Attend supplier management committee teleconference, prepare for same (0.4); call with GCG regarding bar date issues and comments to website (0.6); call with Jones Day regarding counterparty issues, follow-up regarding same (0.6).
Huebner MS	09/13/12	0.2	Emails regarding request of U.S. Trustee regarding expanding Unsecured Creditors' Committee and review of attached documents.
Ruiz EL	09/13/12	0.5	Call to utility regarding service disruption.
Starr AT	09/13/12	0.6	Review discovery request from equity holders (0.4); calls and emails to Blackstone, J. Jones and M. Schroeder regarding the same (0.2).
Coco KJ	09/14/12	2.4	Weekly update call with Kramer Levin, follow-up regarding same (0.8); review and revise bar date motion (0.4); analysis of claims register and proof of claim issues (0.8); call with S. Hrko regarding lift stay issues (0.3); voicemail to creditor with claims-related questions (0.1).
Howard L	09/14/12	0.1	Review motion filed in support of equity committee formation.
Resnick BM	09/14/12	0.8	Calls with A. Rogoff and T. Mayer regarding various issues.
Schaible DS	09/14/12	1.7	Weekly update call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee and follow-up.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	09/14/12	2.1	Review discovery request from equity holders (0.3); emails to J. Jones and M. Schroeder regarding the same (0.6); emails to U.S. Trustee regarding equity holders motion (0.6); prepare materials for Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.3); calls to DIP counsel regarding equity holders motion (0.3).
Klein DS	09/15/12	1.2	Review and comment on AlixPartners reclamation presentation.
Hait S	09/16/12	2.4	Review Alix Partners list of reclamation demands and email comments.
McGreal MM	09/16/12	0.4	Review Eastern Associated's schedules at the contract counterparty's request (0.2); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.1); correspondence with S. Hait regarding reclamation claims (0.1).
Coco KJ	09/17/12	0.9	Calls with creditors regarding claims issues and lift stay issues.
Hoeben W	09/17/12	0.5	Research corporate governance issues.
Howard L	09/17/12	4.2	Call regarding document request pertaining to equity committee motion (1.0); draft response to equity committee motion document request (2.2); review documents to determine what to produce in response to document request pertaining to equity committee motion; (1.0)
Klein DS	09/17/12	0.1	Email R. McWilliams regarding reclamation claims.
Lynch C	09/17/12	0.5	Call with A. Starr and Patriot Coal regarding equityholders' request for discovery.
McGreal MM	09/17/12	1.3	Review and comment on pension plan confidentiality agreement.
Mehes A	09/17/12	1.7	Research discovery for Equity Committee appointment motions.
Resnick BM	09/17/12	0.1	Emails with Kramer Levin and client regarding information sharing.
Schaible DS	09/17/12	0.5	Emails regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee diligence materials (0.3); emails to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding confidentiality issues (0.2).
Starr AT	09/17/12	1.7	Conference call with J. Jones, B. Bennett, M. Williams and J. Eagan regarding equity holder discovery request (0.6); meet with L. Howard regarding drafting response (0.4); review U.S. Trustee opposition (0.4); review potentially responsive materials (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Coco KJ	09/18/12	2.2	Call with GCG regarding bar date issues, follow-up regarding same (0.6); discuss contract counterparty issues with AlixPartners (0.3); research and contract review regarding same (1.3).
Howard L	09/18/12	2.7	Determine which documents to produce in response to discovery request relating to equity committee motion (1.7); revise letter responding to discovery request (1.0).
Klein DS	09/18/12	0.3	Emails with D. Neier and clients regarding coal royalty claims (0.2); email T. Chepiga regarding sureties and letters of credit (0.1).
Lynch C	09/18/12	1.0	Review draft response to equity holders (0.5); call with A. Starr, L. Howard and A. Mehes regarding response to equity holders (0.3); provide comments on revised draft of response to equity holders (0.2).
Mehes A	09/18/12	0.8	Meeting with A. Starr, C. Lynch, and L. Howard regarding equity committee discovery response (0.4); research discovery issues (0.2); review and comment on discovery response (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/18/12	0.2	Call with T. Tormey regarding strategy.
Starr AT	09/18/12	1.3	Revise letter to equity holders (0.5); meet with C. Lynch, A. Mehes and L. Howard regarding the same (0.4); emails to B. Bennett regarding information request (0.3); emails to equity holders regarding same (0.1).
Starr AT	09/18/12	0.1	Emails with I. Bergmanis regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee issues.
Coco KJ	09/19/12	1.0	Call with R. McWilliams regarding contract counterparty issues (0.3); review documents in connection with same (0.6); conversation with D. Klein regarding same (0.1).
Howard L	09/19/12	4.2	Revise and circulate letter response to document request relating to equity committee motion (2.7); review financial documents to consider what to produce in response to document request relating to equity committee motion (1.5)
Klein DS	09/19/12	0.3	Emails with M. Williams regarding coal royalty claims (0.2); email J. Egan regarding mechanics liens (0.1).
McGreal MM	09/19/12	0.3	Correspondence with Kramer Levin, B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding posting regarding posting schedules and link to GCG website.
Mehes A	09/19/12	0.1	Obtain document for Equity Committee motion.
Melvin MM	09/19/12	0.4	Review various dockets and obtain precedent bridge orders regarding extension of time to remove state court actions for M. McGreal.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick BM	09/19/12	0.4	Call with T. Mayer regarding committee requests (0.2); emails regarding same (0.2).
Schaible DS	09/19/12	0.5	Teleconferences regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee confidentiality.
Starr AT	09/19/12	1.8	Revise equityholders letter (0.6); calls with M. Schroeder, J. Jones, L. Howard and C. Ebetino regarding same (1.1); finalize letter (0.1).
Coco KJ	09/20/12	4.1	Draft, revise and research bar date motion (2.2); emails with Davis Polk team and GCG regarding same (0.4); calls, emails and analysis regarding purchase agreements and vendor issues (0.9); calls with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3); call to West Virginia creditor (0.3).
Howard L	09/20/12	1.0	Draft confidentiality stipulation relating to equity committee motion
Huebner MS	09/20/12	0.5	Conversation with D. Schaible and emails regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee confidentiality issues (0.2); internal conversations regarding bar date motion (0.1); brief participation in Unsecured Creditors' Committee advisor weekly call (0.2).
McGreal MM	09/20/12	1.7	Update call with Kramer Levin, D. Schaible and others (0.5); conferences with M. Huebner, D. Schaible and E. Ruiz re pension plan confidentiality agreement (0.8); review markup of same (0.3); correspondence with M. Huebner and E. Moskowitz re meeting with Kramer Levin on post-hearing brief (0.1).
Mehes A	09/20/12	1.0	Edit confidentiality stipulation.
Resnick BM	09/20/12	0.5	Update call with Kramer Levin (0.2); emails with Kramer Levin and company regarding document requests (0.3).
Ruiz EL	09/20/12	1.3	Review and comment on the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's confidentiality agreement (1.1); meeting with M. McGreal regarding the same (0.2).
Schaible DS	09/20/12	2.6	Prepare for and conduct the Unsecured Creditors' Committee update call (0.8); review materials and teleconference with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding non-disclosure agreement issues (0.9); emails regarding equity issues (0.2); meeting regarding confidentiality and review materials (0.7).
Howard L	09/21/12	1.6	Emails regarding call with shareholders on equity committee issue (0.5); revise confidentiality stipulation relating to equity committee issues (1.1).
Huebner MS	09/21/12	0.2	Conversation with T. Mayer regarding miscellaneous matters including mining convention.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Melvin MM	09/21/12	0.4	Review various dockets and obtain precedent bar date motions and orders for K. Coco's review.
Schaible DS	09/21/12	0.3	Emails regarding claims settlement issues.
Starr AT	09/21/12	0.6	Calls and emails regarding equity holders request for discovery with H. Ray, B. O'Neill and A. Yerramalli (0.3); review research regarding discovery in Equity Committee motions (0.3).
Resnick BM	09/23/12	0.2	Emails with Kramer Levin regarding document sharing.
Coco KJ	09/24/12	6.9	Draft employee claims letter (0.9); review and analyze Kramer Levin comments to claims settlement procedures motion (0.4); revise same in connection with comments (2.0); meeting with Davis Polk team and follow-up regarding same (2.0); review comments to bar date motion and research in connection with same (1.6).
Howard L	09/24/12	0.2	Review documents for possible production to movants in Equity Committee motion.
Huebner MS	09/24/12	0.2	Internal conversations and emails regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee confidentiality issues.
Klein DS	09/24/12	1.2	Call with J. Jones et al regarding mechanics liens and emails related to same (0.5); emails with DIP team regarding same (0.2); emails with E. Waller regarding claim release provisions (0.2); email critical vendor matrix to US Trustee, Committee and DIP Agents (0.3).
Lynch C	09/24/12	2.0	Review discovery materials (0.2); prepare same for production equityholders (0.4); meet and confer call with McKool Smith regarding equityholders' motion (0.5); meet with A. Starr and A. Mehes regarding same (0.3); call with client regarding follow up discovery information (0.3); call with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding discovery information (0.1); review revised confidentiality stipulation, team emails regarding same (0.2).
McGreal MM	09/24/12	0.4	Correspondence with Cole Schotz and Blackstone regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's document request list (0.2); correspondence with R. Mead and B. Resnick regarding surety providers' diligence request and workers' compensation (0.2).
Mehes A	09/24/12	1.7	Calls with A. Starr, C. Lynch, opposing counsel, the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and J. Jones regarding discovery (1.0); edit confidentiality stipulation (0.7).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	09/24/12	1.6	Conference call with the equity holders and the Unsecured Creditors' Committee re discovery (0.6); calls regarding equity holders' document requests with J. Jones and C. Lynch (0.5); emails to DIP lenders regarding schedule for hearing (0.3); revise confidentiality stipulation (0.2).
Coco KJ	09/25/12	2.0	Revise bar date motion, order and related attachments (0.8); review claims settlement procedures issues list and Committee comments (0.8); revise employee claims letter (0.4).
Howard L	09/25/12	1.9	Draft response to correspondence from shareholders relating to Equity Committee motion.
McGreal MM	09/25/12	0.9	Supplier management call with Company and AlixPartners (0.3); teleconference with T. Mayer, M. Huebner and B. Resnick regarding various Unsecured Creditors' Committee issues (0.6).
McGreal MM	09/25/12	1.0	Teleconference with A. Rogoff and B. Resnick regarding claims settlement procedures order (0.6); review and revise claims settlement procedures order (0.4).
Resnick BM	09/25/12	1.2	Call with A. Rogoff and M. McGreal regarding environmental and claims settlement procedures motion.
Resnick BM	09/25/12	0.4	Review bar date letter to employees (0.2); discuss same with M. McGreal (0.2).
Starr AT	09/25/12	3.2	Calls regarding equity discovery requests with J. Jones (0.5); revise letter to equity holders (0.7); emails and calls regarding same to J. Jones, B. O'Neill and L. Howard (1.0); review selenium data (0.4); draft responses to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee diligence query (0.6).
Coco KJ	09/26/12	2.9	Revise bar date motion based on company comments (0.3); revise employee claims letter (0.2); call with company regarding same, follow-up emails regarding same (0.5); review Kramer Levin comments to bar date motion and order (0.5); draft email regarding same (0.4); discuss same with Davis Polk team (0.3); revise bar date filings (0.6).
Howard L	09/26/12	0.6	Call regarding document request relating to shareholder motion
Klein DS	09/26/12	0.1	Communications with Curtis Mallet regarding potential conflict for claimant.
Resnick BM	09/26/12	0.2	Emails regarding advisor confidentiality issues.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	09/26/12	1.8	Conference call regarding discovery requests with M. Schroeder, J. Jones, C. Lynch and L. Howard (0.5); calls and emails regarding discovery requests and analysis with J. Jones, C. Lynch and L. Howard (1.0); revise letter to equityholders counsel (0.3).
Coco KJ	09/27/12	1.9	Call with thhe Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding bar date motion and proofs of claim (0.6); revise bar date motion and related documents and pleadings (1.0); emails with company, Creditors' Committee and lenders' counsel regarding same (0.3).
Howard L	09/27/12	0.3	Emails with shareholders regarding document production relating to the Equity Committee dispute.
Huebner MS	09/27/12	0.5	Conversation with B. Resnick regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments on bar date order (0.3); conversation with K. Hiltz regarding DIP budget (0.2).
Klein DS	09/27/12	0.4	Call with J. Chincheck and emails with clients regarding mechanics lien letter.
Resnick BM	09/27/12	2.0	Emails regarding claims procedures motion (0.1); review and revise bar date motion (0.8); call with D. Klein regarding same (0.2); call with Kramer Levin regarding same (0.5); discuss same with M. Huebner (0.2); call with R. Mead regarding surety issues (0.2).
Schaible DS	09/27/12	0.6	Teleconferences regarding Goodchild and Unsecured Creditors' Committee issues.
Starr AT	09/27/12	0.6	Emails regarding discovery with L. Howard and H. Ray.
Coco KJ	09/28/12	0.7	Call with company and GCG regarding employee claims and bar date letter (0.5); emails with clerk of court regarding bar date motion (0.2).
Hait S	09/28/12	0.6	Update bar date notices and proposed bar date order.
Klein DS	09/28/12	1.0	Discussions with M. McGreal regarding bar date letter and review precedents related to same (0.6); review frequently asked questions related to same (0.4).
Libby A	09/28/12	3.9	Draft and editbar date letter to employees and retirees and associated frequently asked questions.
Resnick BM	09/28/12	0.2	Emails with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and clients regarding diligence.
Resnick BM	09/28/12	0.5	Discuss employee letter with M. McGreal (0.2); discuss Unsecured Creditors' Committee and other issues with M. Huebner (0.3).
Schaible DS	09/28/12	1.2	Coordinate and emails regarding non-disclosure agreement issues (0.7); emails with clients regarding shareholder lawsuit issues (0.5).
McGreal MM	09/30/12	0.1	Email E. Moskowitz regarding proofs of claim.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick BM	09/30/12	0.3	Review bar date letter to employees (0.1); emails with I. Engelhardt regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's diligence (0.1); emails with Kramer Levin regarding same (0.1)
Total		197.4	
CREDITOR\EQUITYHOLDER \UCC ISSUES			
DPW RETENTION AND FEE ISSUES			
Butler JH	09/04/12	3.1	Analysis of updated conflicts searches.
Butler JH	09/05/12	3.8	Analysis of updated conflicts searches.
Ibrahim A	09/05/12	0.5	Call with R. Martin regarding conflicts check procedures (0.3); call with S. Krause and R. Martin regarding future conflicts checks (0.2).
Martin RL	09/05/12	1.0	Call with J. Butler regarding conflicts report (0.1); review conflicts reports (0.5); compose follow-up email to Conflicts Department (0.1); call with S. Krause and A. Ibrahim regarding conflicts issues (0.3).
Butler JH	09/06/12	5.3	Analysis of updated conflict searches.
Krause SC	09/06/12	2.0	Emails regarding parties in interest (0.5); review parties in interest list (0.8); emails regarding same (0.7).
Martin RL	09/06/12	1.6	Review conflicts reports and compose email updates to J. Butler on the same (1.4); update client match list (0.2).
Schaible DS	09/09/12	0.4	Review and revise conflicts declaration.
Krause SC	09/11/12	0.4	Review D. Schaible comments to supplemental disclosure and confer regarding same.
Butler JH	09/12/12	0.4	Emails with L. Samet, W. Warner, W. Taylor and M. McGreal regarding background of Davis Polk representation of Patriot (0.3); review Huebner declaration to Davis Polk fee application (0.1).
Krause SC	09/12/12	0.3	Emails regarding representations on the record.
Martin RL	09/12/12	0.3	Meeting with S. Krause regarding additional disclosure statement.
Coco KJ	09/13/12	1.8	Review and comment on draft fee statement.
Krause SC	09/13/12	0.5	Emails with R. Martin, J. Butler regarding parties in interest (0.1); confer regarding same with D. Schaible (0.1); review retention order regarding same (0.3).
Robertson C	09/13/12	0.5	Coordinate with project code "team leaders" to review fee statement for confidentiality.
Zhu B	09/13/12	0.7	Review and revise billing entries for confidentiality and correspond with K. Coco regarding same.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Glazer E	09/14/12	0.5	Review narratives within billing code "Employee Labor Issues" for privileged information.
Ibrahim A	09/14/12	1.3	Review Davis Polk fee statements for confidentiality issues (1.1); call with S. Krause and R. Martin regarding ongoing conflict check obligations (0.2).
Krause SC	09/14/12	1.2	Review conflicts issues (0.3); calls with J. Snider, J. Butler, B. Martin regarding same (0.4); review bills for confidentiality and privilege issues (0.5).
Martin RL	09/14/12	2.3	Call with K. Coco regarding contract rejection (0.1); call with J. Butler, J. Snider, and S. Krause regarding conflict check issues (0.5); call with S. Krause and A. Ibrahim regarding conflict check issues (0.1); call with S. Krause regarding past conflict check (0.1); review past conflict check and compose email to S. Krause regarding the same (0.5).
Melvin MM	09/14/12	6.8	Review comments from each project code mark-up and update narratives in the August monthly statement accordingly (6.4); contact certain timekeepers to request further information on their narratives (0.4).
Pak GY	09/14/12	0.5	Review bill narratives for financing activities for privileged information.
Robertson C	09/14/12	0.6	Coordinate with project code leaders regarding review of narratives for confidentiality (0.2); discuss comments with M. Melvin (0.2); discuss status of bill with N. Tsiouris (0.2).
Samet L	09/14/12	0.8	Review Davis Polk invoice.
Tsiouris N	09/14/12	1.2	Discussions with C. Robertson regarding status of bill (0.4); review bill for time entry narratives and correct project codes (0.8).
Turner AE	09/14/12	1.0	Review environmental and regulatory billing items for confidentiality.
Zhu B	09/14/12	2.2	Prepare markups for August billing entries for automatic stay, litigation and executory contracts billing codes (1.8); prepare various correspondence with K. Coco, C. Robertson and litigation team regarding same (0.4).
Butler JH	09/17/12	1.1	Analysis of conflicts searches (0.9); email with R. Martin and S. Krause regarding conflicts disclosure (0.2).
Krause SC	09/17/12	0.3	Review parties in interest list and updates from GCG.
Martin RL	09/17/12	1.1	Review conflicts reports related to supplemental disclosure (0.5); call with S. Krause regarding supplemental disclosure (0.1); email to J. Butler regarding supplemental disclosure outstanding items and respond to follow-up questions regarding the same (0.5).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick BM	09/17/12	1.4	Meet with C. Robertson to discuss bill (0.2); meet with D. Schaible regarding same (0.1); review bill (0.9); call with C. Robertson regarding same (0.2).
Robertson C	09/17/12	2.7	Review expenses to comply with U.S. Trustee guidelines (0.4); discuss write-off of expenses with D. Schaible (0.2); follow up with attorneys regarding expense reports (0.2); prepare bill for review by B. Resnick (0.4); discuss preparation of bill with B. Resnick (0.4); discuss status of bill with M. Melvin (0.3); review time entries for write-offs as per U.S. Trustee guidelines (0.8).
Butler JH	09/18/12	0.4	Analysis of potential conflicts (0.3); email to Martin and Krause regarding same (0.1).
Coco KJ	09/18/12	2.6	Review Davis Polk August fee statement and comment on same.
Melvin MM	09/18/12	1.3	Multiple communications with C. Robertson, C. Scarlett and A. Westerinen in Accounting regarding the August monthly fee statement (0.9); forward hour changes and write-offs to C. Scarlett (0.4).
Resnick BM	09/18/12	0.9	Review invoice (0.7); meet with C. Robertson regarding same (0.2).
Klein DS	09/20/12	2.6	Review and comment on confidentiality issues in Davis Polk monthly fee statement.
Martin RL	09/20/12	0.2	Revise supplemental disclosure.
McGreal MM	09/20/12	0.8	Review and comment on monthly fee statement (0.4); correspondence with B. Resnick, D. Klein, N. Tsiouris and others re same (0.4).
Melvin MM	09/20/12	0.8	Multiple communications with C. Robertson and C. Scarlett regarding August monthly statement preparation (0.5); update the chart of professionals' fees (0.3).
Resnick BM	09/20/12	0.7	Communications with Davis Polk team regarding final bill preparation.
Robertson C	09/20/12	4.7	Final review of bill for confidentiality and expenses (2.4); coordinate with M. Melvin, C. Scarlett, N. Tsiouris and others regarding same (2.3).
Starr AT	09/20/12	1.6	Conference call regarding conflict issues with M. Huebner, D. Toscano and J. Bean (1.0); draft conflict materials regarding the same (0.6).
Tsiouris N	09/20/12	4.0	Discussions with C. Robertson regarding changes to Patriot bill (1.1); edit Patriot bill (1.7); review of revised bill (1.2).
de Richemont P	09/21/12	3.7	Review, revise, assemble, prepare and file Davis Polk monthly fee statement.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klein DS	09/21/12	0.3	Meet with M. Huebner and others regarding billing issues.
McGreal MM	09/21/12	0.6	Conference with M. Huebner, B. Resnick and others regarding monthly fee statement (0.2); correspondence with N. Tsiouris, C. Robertson and others regarding filing monthly fee statement (0.4).
Melvin MM	09/21/12	0.3	Work with Accounting to update the schedules to the monthly statement.
Resnick BM	09/21/12	0.4	Emails regarding Davis Polk invoice (0.2); meet with M. Huebner and others regarding same (0.2).
Butler JH	09/24/12	0.3	Review and comment on supplemental declaration regarding conflicts.
de Richemont P	09/24/12	0.3	Email and calls about filed monthly fee statement.
Krause SC	09/24/12	0.7	Review supplemental disclosure statement (0.3); emails regarding same (0.2); revise same (0.2).
Martin RL	09/24/12	0.3	Edit supplemental disclosure (0.2); compose email to J. Butler regarding edits to the supplemental disclosure (0.1).
Butler JH	09/25/12	2.9	Analysis of confidential information and conflicts issues.
Resnick BM	09/25/12	0.1	Call with D. Klein regarding conflict issue.
Butler JH	09/26/12	1.9	Review of confidentiality and conflict issues.
de Richemont P	09/26/12	0.2	Email about August monthly fee statement (0.1); coordinate service of same (0.1).
Klein DS	09/26/12	0.3	Emails with S. Krause and J. Jones regarding invoice accruals.
Krause SC	09/26/12	0.3	Emails with company to respond to billing questions.
Law EC	09/26/12	0.8	Review time entries for fee application (0.4); numerous communications with M. Melvin regarding same (0.4).
Martin RL	09/26/12	0.1	Review Davis Polk invoices and send the same to S. Krause.
Tsiouris N	09/26/12	1.1	Email with K. Coco regarding service of fee statements (0.1); discussions with M. McGreal regarding billing issues (0.4); discussions with M. Melvin regarding fee statement logistics and timeline (0.6).
Klein DS	09/27/12	0.3	Emails with K. Hiltz and M. Huebner regarding invoice accruals.
Martin RL	09/27/12	0.1	Respond to email from S. Krause regarding supplemental disclosure.
Tsiouris N	09/27/12	0.1	Discussion with M. Melvin regarding the fee statement.
Butler JH	09/28/12	3.4	Review of confidentiality issues and conflicts.
de Richemont P	09/28/12	0.6	Review, revise, prepare and file supplemental declaration regarding Davis Polk retention (0.4); coordinate service of same (0.1); email about monthly fee statement (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Krause SC	09/28/12	0.7	Confer with M. Huebner regarding supplemental disclosure (0.2); revise same (0.3); file same (0.2).
Martin RL	09/28/12	0.7	Edit supplemental disclosure (0.4); call with A. Ibrahim regarding conflicts check (0.1); request and review conflicts check (0.2).
Melvin MM	09/28/12	2.4	Further review and updates to the September monthly fee statement (2.0); emails to timekeepers to request additional information (0.4).
Tsiouris N	09/28/12	0.4	Communications with M. Melvin regarding status of the Davis Polk fee statement.
Total DPW RETENTION AND FEE ISSUES		91.5	
EMPLOYEE LABOR ISSUES			
Wright JT	09/01/12	5.7	Review and revise draft §1114 proposal.
Aizen RM	09/02/12	0.5	Comment on retiree benefits presentation.
Moskowitz E	09/02/12	1.8	Review draft §1114 proposal and circulate comments regarding same (1.4); additional comments regarding revised §1114 proposal materials (0.4).
Wright JT	09/02/12	0.7	Correspondence regarding draft §1114 proposal.
Aizen RM	09/03/12	0.3	Emails with E. Moskowitz and J. Wright regarding retiree benefits.
Crandall JP	09/03/12	0.2	Review §1114 issues.
Huebner MS	09/03/12	0.2	Emails regarding labor issues and commencing review of §1114 proposal.
Moskowitz E	09/03/12	1.2	Review §§ 1113 and 1114 materials and circulate comments regarding same.
Schaible DS	09/03/12	0.4	Coordinate regarding union issues.
Wright JT	09/03/12	6.8	Review benefits materials (1.1); review and revise §1114 proposal and related issues list (5.7).
Aizen RM	09/04/12	2.0	Comment on retiree medical proposal (0.7); review multi-employer plan summary (0.5); discussion with E. Moskowitz, E. FitzGerald, J. Crandall and J. Wright regarding retiree medical proposal (0.8).
Bedell JM	09/04/12	0.9	Research the Dept. of Labor individual exemptions related to precedent VEBAs for J. Wright.
Crandall JP	09/04/12	1.3	Review §1114 issues (0.7); meet with working group regarding labor issues (0.6).
FitzGerald ET	09/04/12	0.8	Meeting with E. Moskowitz and J. Crandall on retiree medical proposal.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Glazer E	09/04/12	2.9	Revise §§ 1113 and 1114 confidentiality agreement and draft emails to E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding same (1.8); draft memorandum summarizing call on multi-employer plans (1.1).
Huebner MS	09/04/12	4.9	Review and markup of §§ 1113 and 1114 presentation and conversations with E. Moskowitz regarding same (3.1); call with Blackstone regarding tomorrow's labor meeting (0.8); review and markup of §1113 memo (1.0).
Libby A	09/04/12	1.5	Review the collective bargaining agreement memo.
Martin JD	09/04/12	1.2	Emails with E. Moskowitz and others regarding expert issues (0.5); emails with E. Moskowitz and E. Glazer regarding confidentiality agreement (0.3); review and revise confidentiality agreement (0.4).
McGreal MM	09/04/12	0.4	Review E. Glazer notes from legacy labor liabilities call.
Moskowitz E	09/04/12	3.7	Call with Blackstone regarding labor issues and follow-up (0.8); review and revise §1114 proposal (1.2); meet with benefits team regarding same (0.4); prepare for client meeting (1.3).
Wright JT	09/04/12	8.1	Review and revise §1114 proposal and meeting regarding same.
Aizen RM	09/05/12	0.4	Review retiree medical proposal.
Bedell JM	09/05/12	0.5	Research exemptions related to precedent VEBAs for J. Wright.
FitzGerald ET	09/05/12	1.0	Review of retiree medical precedents.
Glazer E	09/05/12	2.6	Draft emails to J. Bean, E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 confidentiality agreement (1.4); revise same (0.4); teleconference with J. Martin regarding same (0.6); draft emails to E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding retention notice (0.2).
Huebner MS	09/05/12	9.7	All day meeting in St. Louis with clients regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 issues.
Libby A	09/05/12	0.3	Meet with M. McGreal regarding multi-employer pension plan research.
Martin JD	09/05/12	3.0	Emails with E. Moskowitz and others regarding expert retention (0.7); call with E. Glazer regarding confidentiality agreement (0.6); revise confidentiality agreement (0.9); emails with J. Bean, E. Moskowitz and E. Glazer regarding same (0.8).
McGreal MM	09/05/12	0.6	Teleconference with J. Martin regarding retaining experts on labor issues (0.2); conference with A. Libby regarding memo on labor issues (0.4).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Moskowitz E	09/05/12	10.6	Meetings with clients and advisors in St. Louis regarding labor strategy (9.7); additional correspondence with team (0.9).
Resnick BM	09/05/12	0.2	Emails with R. Aizen regarding employee issues.
Aizen RM	09/06/12	0.5	Discussion with E. FitzGerald regarding VEBA (0.1); emails with O. Lozada regarding retiree medical (0.1); discussions with E. FitzGerald and S. Beshar regarding compensation issues (0.3).
Beshar SE	09/06/12	0.7	Communications with team and Company regarding compensation issues.
Eum JS	09/06/12	1.0	Pull dockets and precedent briefs related to §§ 1113 and 1114 issues, as per E. Glazer.
FitzGerald ET	09/06/12	0.7	Prepare outline for retiree medical VEBA.
Glazer E	09/06/12	1.0	Draft email to J. Eum regarding legal research related to §§ 1113 and 1114 (0.3); emails with E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 confidentiality agreement (0.4); review email related to §1114 proposal (0.2); review emails related to document retention notice (0.1).
Hait S	09/06/12	1.9	Research and Shephardize multi-employer pension plan memo.
Libby A	09/06/12	0.6	Research pension plan issues and discuss same with S. Hait.
Martin JD	09/06/12	0.6	Review §1114 materials.
Moskowitz E	09/06/12	2.7	Draft talking points (0.7); correspondence regarding §1114 issues (0.9); follow-up to client meetings (1.1).
Schaible DS	09/06/12	0.6	Coordinate regarding employee compensation issues.
Wright JT	09/06/12	2.2	Review §1114 proposal and research regarding same.
Aizen RM	09/07/12	3.2	Review pension plan materials (0.8); call with Patriot and Blackstone regarding pension plan (1.3); review retiree medical materials (0.5); call with Patriot and Blackstone regarding retiree medical (0.6).
Crandall JP	09/07/12	0.2	Review §1114 update.
FitzGerald ET	09/07/12	0.5	Review of revised retiree medical summary.
Glazer E	09/07/12	2.6	Emails with E. Moskowitz and L. Jacobs regarding document retention notice (0.3); teleconference related to multi-employer pension plans and preparation for same (1.6); teleconference with potential expert and discussions with J. Martin regarding same (0.7).
Libby A	09/07/12	1.4	Call with blackstone regarding multi employer pension plans and review of materials in preparation for same.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Lutrin J	09/07/12	2.1	Draft email summary of pension plan call (0.6); research into twenty year cap ERISA provision (1.3); meet with R. Aizen regarding same (0.1); and email with J. Woodrum regarding same (0.1).
Lutrin J	09/07/12	1.3	Call with Patriot, Blackstone, J. Woodrum and Davis Polk team regarding pension plan.
Martin JD	09/07/12	1.9	Call with J. Bean regarding confidentiality issues (0.3); follow up communications with E. Moskowitz, E. Glazer regarding same (0.2); call with potential experts (0.4); related communications with E. Glazer (0.2); review §1114 materials (0.8).
McGreal MM	09/07/12	1.8	Teleconference with Blackstone, D. Lucha, J. Woodrum, B. Resnick and others regarding labor issues (1.3); teleconference with B. Resnick, R. Aizen and A. Libby regarding same (0.2); teleconference with J. Orf and AlixPartners regarding payment of wages to contracts (0.2); conference with D. Klein regarding same (0.1).
Resnick BM	09/07/12	1.0	Review pension presentation (0.2); call with clients and Blackstone regarding pension issues (1.5); call with M. Buschmann regarding same and retention of experts (0.3).
Wright JT	09/07/12	6.1	Draft §1114 proposal (3.7); research regarding same (2.4).
Aizen RM	09/08/12	0.4	Emails with J. Woodrum and J. Lutrin regarding multiemployer plan.
Libby A	09/08/12	4.1	Research multi-employer pension issues.
Aizen RM	09/09/12	0.2	Emails with M. Huebner and M. McGreal regarding multiemployer plan.
Glazer E	09/09/12	5.6	Legal research regarding §1113 (1.6); draft email to E. Moskowitz summarizing same (0.9); draft email to E. Moskowitz and J. Martin summarizing teleconference related to pension plan liabilities (1.1); draft email to E. Moskowitz regarding retention of expert (0.9); draft email to J. Martin related to §§ 1113 and 1114 confidentiality agreement (1.1).
Libby A	09/09/12	2.4	Research multi-employer pension issues.
Aizen RM	09/10/12	3.2	Discussions with B. Resnick regarding actuaries (0.2); discussion with J. Wright regarding retiree medical (0.2); consider multiemployer plan issue (1.1); discussion with M. Travers regarding potential sale (0.9); discussions with J. Bean and S. Krause regarding compensation program (0.6); comment on retiree medical proposal (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Cho EK	09/10/12	0.8	Calls with DOL regarding VEBA exemptions; review existing exemptions; correspondence regarding the same.
Eum JS	09/10/12	1.5	Pull docket and precedent briefs related to §§ 1113 and 1114 issues, as per E. Glazer.
FitzGerald ET	09/10/12	1.2	Research and analysis regarding retiree medical alternatives.
Glazer E	09/10/12	0.3	Review emails related to §§ 1113 and 1114 confidentiality agreement (0.2); emails with J. Foust regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 materials (0.1).
Klein DS	09/10/12	0.2	Meet with J. Bean regarding labor issues.
Krause SC	09/10/12	0.3	Confer with R. Aizen regarding employee compensation issues and wages.
Lutrin J	09/10/12	0.3	Email with B. Resnick regarding multi-employer pension actuary (0.2); call with R. Aizen regarding same (0.1).
Martin JD	09/10/12	0.9	Emails with E. Moskowitz, E. Glazer and S. Jennik regarding confidentiality agreement.
McGreal MM	09/10/12	0.1	Correspondence regarding multiemployer plan actuary.
Resnick BM	09/10/12	0.4	Calls with R. Aizen regarding multi-employer pension plan actuary (0.2); call with M. Buschmann regarding same (0.2).
Wright JT	09/10/12	5.4	Conference with E. FitzGerald and R. Aizen regarding §1114 proposal and related research (2.1); draft §1114 proposal (3.3).
Aizen RM	09/11/12	2.8	Discussion with J. Wright regarding retiree medical proposal (0.3); review employee issues (2.5).
Eum JS	09/11/12	3.6	Research §§ 1113 and 1114 precedent briefing, as per E. Glazer.
Glazer E	09/11/12	0.3	Emails with E. Moskowitz and M. McGreal regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 materials.
Lutrin J	09/11/12	0.1	Call with R. Aizen regarding union documents.
Schaible DS	09/11/12	0.6	Emails regarding union timing issues.
Wright JT	09/11/12	3.8	Prepare §1114 proposal (2.1); research regarding same (1.7).
Aizen RM	09/12/12	1.0	Review VEBA issues.
Bedell JM	09/12/12	1.2	Research related to §1114 issues (0.6); locate publications for J. Wright (0.6).
Cho EK	09/12/12	0.2	Teleconference with DOL regarding files.
Lapitskaya J	09/12/12	0.5	Save additional retiree medical documents on the system.
Wright JT	09/12/12	3.5	Research regarding VEBA issues (1.4); prepare draft §1114 proposal (2.1).
Aizen RM	09/13/12	1.5	Review VEBA application materials.
FitzGerald ET	09/13/12	1.0	Review of VEBA precedents.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Glazer E	09/13/12	3.3	Meet with E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding various §§ 1113 and 1114 issues (0.8); prepare for same (0.8); draft emails to J. Snyder and K. Williams regarding potential expert (0.4); research related to expert issue (0.5); review news related to union and draft emails to E. Moskowitz and Word Processing team regarding same (0.8).
Huebner MS	09/13/12	1.9	Review of various United Mine Workers Association statements and resolutions and conversations and emails regarding 1113 implications (1.6); emails regarding §1114 proposal (0.2); emails regarding data room issues for United Mine Workers Association (0.1).
Lutrin J	09/13/12	0.1	Call with N. Tsiouris regarding retiree healthcare liabilities.
Martin JD	09/13/12	2.0	Conference and related emails with E. Moskowitz, E. Glazer regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 issues (1.3); review press reports related to §1113 issues (0.5); emails with E. Glazer and others regarding expert issues (0.2).
Moskowitz E	09/13/12	2.4	Team meeting (0.5); correspondence with J. Bean regarding proposals and status (0.6); various email correspondence with team member (1.3).
Schaible DS	09/13/12	2.0	Meeting and teleconference with team regarding union issues (0.6); review materials regarding union issues (0.9); review emails regarding employee issues (0.5).
Wright JT	09/13/12	3.9	Review draft §1114 proposal and conferences regarding same (1.8); prepare §1114 outline (2.1).
Aizen RM	09/14/12	3.2	Comment on retiree medical proposal (2.8); discussion with J. Lapitskaya regarding VEBA materials (0.3); discussion with S. Krause regarding pension issues (0.1).
FitzGerald ET	09/14/12	1.4	Analysis of retiree medical VEBA issues.
Glazer E	09/14/12	1.6	Draft email to E. Moskowitz regarding data room (0.5); meet with S. Johnson regarding same (0.2); review draft 1114 proposal and draft emails to E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.9).
Lapitskaya J	09/14/12	1.8	Review and analyze collective bargaining agreements (1.0); research memos on pensions (0.6); discuss VEBA with R. Aizen (0.2).
Martin JD	09/14/12	1.5	Review materials related to potential 1114 proposal.
Moskowitz E	09/14/12	1.5	Meet with labor team to discuss next steps (0.6); call with J. Bean (0.4); review draft proposal and correspondence to team regarding same (0.5).
Wright JT	09/14/12	2.4	Review letter regarding §1114 proposal and prepare comments (1.1); review §1114 issues (1.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Aizen RM	09/15/12	0.5	Emails with M. Travers and J. Woodrum regarding labor issues.
Lapitskaya J	09/15/12	0.1	Review email correspondence regarding retiree medical issues.
Martin JD	09/15/12	1.6	Review and comment on draft §§ 1113 and 1114 materials.
Resnick BM	09/15/12	0.8	Review research regarding multi-employer pension plans in preparation for a call with Blackstone and J. Woodrum.
Travers M	09/15/12	0.8	Emails with R. Aizen regarding multi-employer pension plan issues (0.5); emails coordinating discussions with labor counsel regarding same (0.3).
Aizen RM	09/16/12	1.8	Calls and emails with Davis Polk and Ogletree regarding employee issues.
Glazer E	09/16/12	0.2	Emails with B. Resnick and J. Martin regarding draft §§ 1113 and 1114 materials.
Martin JD	09/16/12	0.8	Emails with E. Moskowitz, E. Glazer and others regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 materials (0.5); review expert materials (0.3).
Moskowitz E	09/16/12	2.1	Revise §1114 proposal and circulate edits and comments (1.4); related email correspondence with team (0.7).
Resnick BM	09/16/12	0.4	Review §1114 proposal (0.2); review 1113 and 1114 presentation (0.2).
Schaible DS	09/16/12	0.4	Emails and review regarding §1114 work.
Travers M	09/16/12	2.3	Telephone call with labor counsel, R. Aizen, B. Resnick, D. Meyer and N. Dashman regarding collective bargaining agreement and multi-employer pension plan (1.2); review collective bargaining agreement and multiple employee pension plan materials in preparation for call and discussion with Patriot management (0.9); follow-up emails regarding multiple employee pension plan (0.2).
Aizen RM	09/17/12	1.0	Emails with J. Lapitskaya regarding retiree medical and multiemployer plans (0.6); comment on schedules (0.1); review multiemployer plan summary (0.3).
Coco KJ	09/17/12	0.2	Call with G. Moody regarding employee issues.
FitzGerald ET	09/17/12	1.9	Review of proposals on multi-employer plan and retiree medical benefits.
Foust JT	09/17/12	0.4	Meeting with E. Glazer to discuss 1114 research.
Glazer E	09/17/12	1.3	Meet with J. Foust regarding §1114 legal research (0.4); legal research regarding same (0.9).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Lapitskaya J	09/17/12	2.2	Calls and emails regarding retiree medical and pension plan trust documents (1.9); review updated presentations regarding retiree medical and multiemployer plan (0.3).
Libby A	09/17/12	0.4	Review wages motion and respond to company question regarding employee stock option plans.
Martin JD	09/17/12	2.8	Research §§ 1113 and 1114 issue (1.3); draft email regarding same for client (0.3); review draft §§ 1113 and 1114 presentation (0.8); emails with S. Jennik, E. Moskowitz and E. Glazer regarding revised confidentiality agreement with union (0.4).
McGreal MM	09/17/12	1.8	Review Blackstone presentation on multiemployer pension plan (0.3); teleconference with Blackstone, B. Resnick and others re same (0.6); correspondence with AlixPartners and A. Libby re wages order (0.2); review draft employee letters (0.4); conference with D. Schaible re same (0.3).
Meyer DP	09/17/12	1.8	Email correspondence regarding the multi-employer pension plan call (0.2); multi-employer pension plan call (0.2); call regarding multi-employer pension plan liabilities (0.6); review emails and attachments regarding union contracts (0.8).
Resnick BM	09/17/12	0.5	Call with J. Bean regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 issue (0.1); call with J. Martin regarding same (0.1); emails regarding same (0.3).
Schaible DS	09/17/12	1.9	Review employee communications and revise and teleconferences and emails with company regarding same and related issues (0.8); emails and review labor issues and materials (0.6); emails regarding §1113 issues (0.5).
Wright JT	09/17/12	1.3	Review and comment on §1114 proposal.
Aizen RM	09/18/12	2.9	Review employee compensation materials (0.7); discussions with Davis Polk team regarding multi-employer plan and other benefits issues (1.6); review multi-employer plan issues (0.6).
FitzGerald ET	09/18/12	1.5	Discussions with R. Aizen and follow up analysis on pension plan issues (1.0); meeting and analysis discussion with R. Aizen regarding labor issues (0.5).
Foust JT	09/18/12	5.6	Research §1114 precedents from the Southern District of New York.
Glazer E	09/18/12	0.5	Review draft §1114 proposal and presentation regarding same.
Krause SC	09/18/12	0.3	Calls and emails regarding employee compensation issues.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Lapitskaya J	09/18/12	4.7	Attend meeting with R. Aizen and E. FitzGerald regarding multi-employer plan and other benefits issues (0.5); attend meeting with E. FitzGerald, R. Aizen and bankruptcy group regarding same (0.5); review VEBA materials (3.7).
McGreal MM	09/18/12	1.4	Conference with E. Fitzgerald, B. Resnick and others regarding multiemployer pension plan (0.9); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding research memo on same (0.2); email benefits team data room documents related to multiemployer pension plan (0.3).
Resnick BM	09/18/12	2.2	Meetings with M. McGreal and S. Krause regarding employee compensation plans (0.3); review presentation materials regarding same (0.4); meet with E. Fitzgerald and others regarding multiple employer pension plans (0.8); review multiple employer pension plans memo and presentation (0.7).
Aizen RM	09/19/12	3.7	Comment on employee compensation plans (1.4); review documents relating to multiemployer plan (0.7); discussions with Davis Polk team and consultant regarding employee compensation issues (1.2); comment on press release (0.4); email from M. Luna regarding employee census data (0.1).
Bedell JM	09/19/12	2.6	Scan and save documents for J. Lapitskaya.
FitzGerald ET	09/19/12	3.6	Davis Polk meetings and review of employee compensation proposals (2.2); meeting with Davis Polk benefits team and review of multi-employer plan and retiree medical issues (1.4).
Glazer E	09/19/12	3.0	Legal research regarding §1114 issues (1.8); legal research related to 1113 and 1114 confidentiality agreement and draft emails to E. Moskowitz and J. Martin summarizing same (1.2).
Huebner MS	09/19/12	1.7	Call with Towers Watson regarding employee and compensation issues and review of materials for same.
Lapitskaya J	09/19/12	0.4	Finalize table of contents for the VEBA file (0.3); circulate table of contents (0.1).
Libby A	09/19/12	6.2	Research related to multi-employer pension plan (5.0); draft summary of research and analysis regarding same (1.2).
Martin JD	09/19/12	0.7	Review and comment on union's position regarding confidentiality order (0.4); review draft §1113 materials (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	09/19/12	1.1	Review presentation on employee compensation plans (0.4); conference with M. Huebner, E. Fitzgerald and others regarding same (0.5); correspondence with R. Aizen regarding same (0.2).
Moskowitz E	09/19/12	0.9	Correspondence with team regarding labor status.
Resnick BM	09/19/12	1.9	Review employee compensation presentations (0.3); meetings with M. Huebner and others regarding same (0.6); call with N. Bubnovich regarding same (0.4); emails regarding same (0.2); emails regarding multi-employer pension plan (0.4).
Travers M	09/19/12	0.2	Review updated §1113 proposal.
Wright JT	09/19/12	1.7	Review VEBA issues and price list transactions.
Agostinho JN	09/20/12	2.2	Discuss labor project with R. Aizen (0.3); review first day motion for inclusion of employee compensation benefits (1.9).
Aizen RM	09/20/12	1.8	Review multiemployer plan funding improvement plan and §1113 proposal (0.2); discussions with Patriot, E. FitzGerald and J. Agostinho regarding employee compensation and retiree medical (0.9); discussion with W. Hoeben regarding 8-K (0.2); comment on retiree medical proposal (0.5).
Bedell JM	09/20/12	0.9	Create and send zip files to J. Lapitskaya containing VEBA information.
Beshar SE	09/20/12	0.8	Emails and correspondence with General Counsel regarding management issues.
FitzGerald ET	09/20/12	5.0	Review of materials and alternatives for retention employee compensation (1.2); analysis of multi-employer pension plan liability management alternatives (2.3); review of documents and analysis of alternatives for retiree medical (1.5).
Foust JT	09/20/12	3.3	Research §1114 precedents from the Southern District of New York (2.9); meet with E. Glazer to discuss §1114 research (0.4).
Glazer E	09/20/12	1.5	Teleconference with union counsel and J. Martin regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 confidentiality agreement (0.2); meet with J. Martin regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 work streams (0.1); revise 1113 and 1114 confidentiality agreement (0.4); draft email to J. Martin regarding same (0.3); meet with J. Foust regarding §1114 legal research and prepare for same (0.5).
Huebner MS	09/20/12	0.4	Emails regarding employee and United Mine Workers Association issues.
Lapitskaya J	09/20/12	0.5	Revise and circulate materials related to VEBA.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Martin JD	09/20/12	1.9	Call with S. Jennik regarding confidentiality order (0.2); prepare for same (0.5); review materials related to §§ 1113 and 1114 issues (1.2).
McGreal MM	09/20/12	0.3	Correspondence with B. Resnick, R. Aizen and others regarding safety bonus plans.
Moskowitz E	09/20/12	1.0	Correspondence regarding Union activity (0.7); call with J. Bean regarding proposals (0.3).
Resnick BM	09/20/12	0.5	Review employee compensation plan presentations and emails regarding same (0.3); call with E. Fitzgerald regarding same (0.2).
Wright JT	09/20/12	0.6	Review draft §1114 proposal.
Agostinho JN	09/21/12	5.9	Discuss incentive plans (0.3); discuss same with R. Aizen (0.8); correspondence regarding employee compensation (0.2); revise draft §1114 proposal (0.3); review retiree medical issues (2.0); discuss status with E. Fitzgerald and R. Aizen (0.4); research multi-employer plans and discuss same with R. Aizen (1.9).
Aizen RM	09/21/12	5.3	Comment on retiree medical proposal (0.9); discussions with M. Luna and J. Agostinho regarding employee compensation (0.6); discussions with W. Hoeben and J. Tucker regarding 8-K (0.4); comment on multiemployer plan proposal (1.8); comment on website text (0.6); discussions with E. FitzGerald, B. Resnick and J. Agostinho regarding multiemployer plan (1.0).
Beshar SE	09/21/12	1.3	Multiple emails with Company and team regarding management (0.7); review Form 8-K, disclosures (0.6).
FitzGerald ET	09/21/12	1.9	Review of retiree medical proposal (1.2); review pension plan proposal from Blackstone (0.7).
Glazer E	09/21/12	0.3	Review emails related to §§ 1113 and 1114 issues (0.1); revise §§ 1113 and 1114 confidentiality agreement (0.2).
Huebner MS	09/21/12	0.6	Conversations with E. Moskowitz regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 materials and timeline (0.2); emails regarding confidentiality agreement with union (0.2); conversations regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's financial advisors (0.2).
Klein DS	09/21/12	0.2	Emails with R. Aizen et al regarding employee compensation issues.
Martin JD	09/21/12	1.2	Review and revise draft confidentiality order (0.2); emails with J. Bean, E. Glazer and E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.5); emails with E. Moskowitz and others regarding 1113 and 1114 issues (0.5).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	09/21/12	2.5	Review and comment on Blackstone's presentation regarding multiemployer pension plan (0.6); teleconference with B. Resnick and R. Aizen regarding same (0.4); review legal research relating to multiemployer pension plans (0.7); correspondence with B. Resnick, A. Libby and J. Aghostino regarding same (0.4); teleconference with B. Resnick and Chartis regarding workers' compensation (0.3); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.1).
Moskowitz E	09/21/12	2.0	Revise §1114 proposal and correspondence regarding same (1.5); call with S. Jennik and follow-up (0.5).
Resnick BM	09/21/12	1.2	Review Blackstone multi-employer presentation (0.3); calls with Davis Polk labor team regarding same (0.4); discuss same with M. McGreal (0.3); review research regarding same (0.2).
Travers M	09/21/12	0.3	Review materials relating to §§ 1113 and 1114 proposals.
Wright JT	09/21/12	0.8	Review §1114 proposal and conference regarding same.
Agostinho JN	09/22/12	4.7	Research cases and filings regarding multi-employer plan (4.4); correspondence regarding same (0.3).
Aizen RM	09/22/12	2.9	Emails with J. Woodrum regarding multiemployer plan (0.6); emails with E. FitzGerald and B. Resnick regarding a certain employment letter (0.3); comment on multi-employer plan presentation (0.8); research multi-employer plan issue (1.2).
FitzGerald ET	09/22/12	1.0	Discussions with R. Aizen and review of materials relating to multi-employer pension plan.
Libby A	09/22/12	6.1	Research related to multi-employer pension plan (5.5); emails with M. McGreal and J. Aghostino regarding same (0.6).
McGreal MM	09/22/12	0.2	Correspondence with A. Libby and J. Agostinho regarding multiemployer plan research.
Resnick BM	09/22/12	0.8	Emails regarding multi-employer pension plan (0.3); review research regarding multi-employer pension plans (0.5).
Schaible DS	09/22/12	0.8	Emails regarding employee change issues.
Agostinho JN	09/23/12	0.9	Conference call regarding multi-employer plan.
Aizen RM	09/23/12	1.1	Call with Davis Polk team and J. Woodrum regarding multi-employer plan (0.9); research multi-employer plan issue (0.2).
FitzGerald ET	09/23/12	1.2	Review of case law and conference call with W. Woodrum regarding multi-employer pension plan.
Glazer E	09/23/12	0.2	Review news articles related to 1113 and 1114 issues.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Huebner MS	09/23/12	0.8	Review of additional relevant union materials and emails with clients regarding same.
McGreal MM	09/23/12	1.4	Teleconference with B. Resnick, E. Fitzgerald and others regarding multiemployer pension plan issues (0.9); review memo on same (0.3); correspondence with B. Resnick and A. Libby regarding same (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/23/12	2.1	Call with J. Woodrum and Davis Polk benefits team regarding multi-employer pension plans (0.8); review research regarding same (1.0); review employee compensation materials (0.3).
Agostinho JN	09/24/12	4.0	Call to discuss employee compensation (1.6); further research regarding multi-employer pension plans (2.4).
Aizen RM	09/24/12	3.9	Review draft §1113 proposal (0.6); call with Patriot regarding employee compensation plans (2.3); review revised multi-employer pension plan presentation (0.2); comment on 8-K (0.5); comment on employee communications (0.2); emails with A. Libby regarding multiemployer plan research (0.1).
FitzGerald ET	09/24/12	3.1	Review of retiree medical proposal (0.6); conference call with Patriot team regarding retention and incentive plan proposals (2.2); review of employee compensation proposals (0.3).
Glazer E	09/24/12	2.7	Review relevant news articles (0.2); draft slides for §§ 1113 and 1114 presentation (1.8); draft email to E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding same (0.1); emails with D. Toscano regarding expert issue (0.1); review draft §§ 1113 and 1114 proposals (0.5).
Huebner MS	09/24/12	2.8	Prepare for and attend call with company and co-advisors regarding compensation issues (2.6); review and markup of employee letter and emails regarding same (0.2).
Krause SC	09/24/12	1.4	Review employee letter and supporting document (0.8); emails regarding same (0.4); review M. Huebner comments regarding same (0.2).
Law EC	09/24/12	0.4	Docket research regarding employees and retirees benefits precedent (0.3); communications with A. Libby regarding same (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Libby A	09/24/12	9.6	Meet with M. McGreal regarding multi-employer pension plan follow-up research (0.4); call with J. Agohstino regarding multi-employer pension plan (0.3); call with J. Agohstino regarding 1401 statutory interpretation (0.2); emails with M. McGreal regarding same (0.2); research related to multi-employer pension plan (5.0); draft summary of same (1.1); additional research related to multi-employer pension plan (2.4).
Martin JD	09/24/12	0.6	Review draft slides for presentation to union (0.5); emails with J. Bean, E. Moskowitz regarding confidentiality agreement (0.1).
McGreal MM	09/24/12	3.2	Teleconference with Company, M. Huebner and others regarding employee compensation (2.2); correspondence with A. Libby regarding employee compensation research (0.2); review updated research on multi-employer pension plans (0.4); correspondence with B. Resnick and A. Libby regarding same (0.4).
Melvin MM	09/24/12	3.2	Research regarding multi-employer pension plans for A. Libby.
Moskowitz E	09/24/12	0.4	Calls with Blackstone and team regarding confidentiality issue.
Resnick BM	09/24/12	2.7	Call with clients and N. Bubnovich regarding employee compensation (2.2); review multi-employer pension plan research (0.5).
Travers M	09/24/12	0.6	Review labor agreements and Jobs MOU.
Agostinho JN	09/25/12	1.4	Research regarding multi-employer pension plan (0.6); correspondence regarding same with R. Aizen (0.3); discuss same with E. FitzGerald (0.5).
Aizen RM	09/25/12	0.1	Emails with J. Agostinho regarding multi-employer plan.
FitzGerald ET	09/25/12	2.8	Analysis of multi-employer plan issues (1.3); analysis of issues relating to potential retiree medical changes (1.5).
Glazer E	09/25/12	2.0	Meet with D. Toscano regarding potential expert on §§ 1113 and 1114 issues (0.3); review draft §§ 1113 and 1114 proposals and draft emails to M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz, and J. Foust regarding same (1.3); review relevant news articles (0.2); review materials related to expert retention (0.2).
Huebner MS	09/25/12	1.7	Call with management regarding multiple retiree issues and possible adjustments (1.5); emails and voice mail exchanges with E. FitzGerald and others regarding same (0.2).
Klein DS	09/25/12	0.5	Call with S. Jennick regarding data room access (0.2); multiple emails with J. Martin et al regarding same (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Krause SC	09/25/12	0.6	Calls and emails regarding employee letter and supporting document (0.4); edits to same (0.2).
Libby A	09/25/12	0.3	Review materials related to employee compensation research.
Martin JD	09/25/12	1.2	Communications with S. Jennik and others regarding confidentiality order with union (0.5); work on §§ 1113 and 1114 presentation (0.5); call with E. Moskowitz, E. Glazer regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 presentation (0.2).
McGreal MM	09/25/12	0.9	Email summary of §1114 research to E. Fitzgerald and others (0.4); review and comment on employee claims letter (0.3); correspondence with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding same (0.2).
Moskowitz E	09/25/12	1.7	Review draft proposals, analyses and presentation.
Resnick BM	09/25/12	0.3	Discuss employee Q&A with S. Krause (0.1); emails regarding Director and Officer policies (0.2).
Travers M	09/25/12	0.4	Review §1114 memo.
Agostinho JN	09/26/12	0.2	Correspondence regarding multi-employer pension plan.
Aizen RM	09/26/12	0.8	Retiree medical research.
FitzGerald ET	09/26/12	4.5	Research and analysis of §§ 1113 and 1114 issues.
Glazer E	09/26/12	0.6	Review §§ 1113 and 1114 draft proposals (0.4); emails with M. Huebner regarding same (0.2).
Huebner MS	09/26/12	0.9	Review and markup of union presentation and emails regarding same (0.8); review of CEO letter draft (0.1).
Klein DS	09/26/12	0.3	Emails with J. Martin et al regarding data room.
Libby A	09/26/12	4.3	Research employee compensation in bankruptcy cases (2.4); draft summary survey chart of same (1.7); discuss same with M. McGreal (0.2).
Martin JD	09/26/12	3.5	Call with S. Jennik regarding confidentiality order (0.2); emails with E. Moskowitz and others regarding same (0.4); review §§ 1113 and 1114 analysis in preparation for call with company (2.9).
McGreal MM	09/26/12	0.9	Teleconference with J. Jones, J. Orf and K. Coco regarding employee claims letter (0.4); correspondence with B. Resnick and J. Jones regarding same (0.1); conference with A. Libby regarding employee compensation research (0.2); review same (0.2).
Melvin MM	09/26/12	4.0	Obtain employee compensation plan precedents for A. Libby's review.
Resnick BM	09/26/12	0.2	Emails regarding bar date letter to employees.
Travers M	09/26/12	0.3	Emails with R. Aizen and B. Resnick regarding §1114 and retiree medical benefits.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Agostinho JN	09/27/12	1.1	Conference regarding multi-employer plan with E. FitzGerald, B. Resnick, R. Aizen and M. McGreal (0.5); review materials to prepare for discussion (0.2); review news coverage of transaction (0.4).
Aizen RM	09/27/12	3.3	Comment on revised employee compensation material (1.1); discussion with E. FitzGerald and B. Resnick regarding multi-employer plan (0.5); call with Patriot regarding 1113 proposal (1.5); review Mercer conflict materials (0.2).
FitzGerald ET	09/27/12	2.3	Research regarding pension issues and 1113 and 1114 HCA notice and amendment issues.
Glazer E	09/27/12	9.3	Review and revise §§ 1113 and 1114 draft proposals (2.0); teleconference with client, Blackstone and others regarding same (4.5); meet with M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding same (1.1); prepare comments on §§ 1113 and 1114 presentation (0.9); draft emails to E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding potential experts (0.4); revise expert retention letter (0.3); call with R. Aizen regarding potential expert (0.1).
Hoeben W	09/27/12	0.5	Review employee communication.
Huebner MS	09/27/12	1.2	Review and markup of draft materials for United Mine Workers Association and conversation with J. Martin and E. Glazer regarding same.
Martin JD	09/27/12	6.7	Conference call with B. Hatfield, I. Engelhardt, D. Lucha, and others regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 proposals (4.8); calls and conferences with E. Moskowitz, M. Huebner and E. Glazer regarding same (0.9); analyze union position regarding modification of benefits (0.5); analysis of expert issues (0.5).
McGreal MM	09/27/12	1.9	Conference with E. Fitzgerald, B. Resnick and others regarding multiemployer plan issues (0.5); legal research regarding same (1.3); email M. Huebner, B. Resnick and others regarding employee compensation research (0.1).
Moskowitz E	09/27/12	5.4	Prepare for call with clients (0.7); call with client and advisor team regarding proposals, presentation and related issues (4.3); follow-up call and correspondence with J. Martin and E. Glazer (0.4).
Resnick BM	09/27/12	1.9	Review research regarding multi-employer pension plans (0.8); call with M. Buschmann regarding same (0.2); meet with E. Fitzgerald, R. Aizen and others regarding same (0.5); review Chrysler decision (0.2); emails with R. Aizen regarding multi-employer pension plans (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Agostinho JN	09/28/12	0.7	Review media coverage of client (0.3); review memoranda and documents regarding retiree medical plans (0.4).
Aizen RM	09/28/12	0.8	Review multi-employer plan issue.
FitzGerald ET	09/28/12	1.7	Review of employee compensation materials (0.5); review of non-union retiree medical issues and procedures and notice (1.2).
Glazer E	09/28/12	5.7	Review revised draft §§ 1113 and 1114 proposals and related letter (2.3); emails with E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding same (0.6); emails and meeting with D. Young regarding 1113 and 1114 issues (0.8); teleconference and emails with L. Kabakov regarding staffing (0.2); legal research related to expert issue (1.8).
Hoeben W	09/28/12	0.5	Review employee letter and press release (0.5).
Martin JD	09/28/12	1.2	Review and revise draft §§ 1113 and 1114 proposals.
McGreal MM	09/28/12	3.9	Revise lift stay motion (1.9); review precedent motions for expedited relief (0.4); conference with D. Klein regarding same (0.1); conference with M. Huebner and B. Resnick regarding lift stay motion (0.3); correspondence with D. McAllister, B. Resnick, K. Coco and others regarding filing lift stay motion (0.7); research precedent lift stay motions (0.4); email same to C. Lynch (0.1).
McGreal MM	09/28/12	5.9	Teleconference with J. Jones, J. Orf, K. Coco and others regarding employee claims letter (0.6); correspondence with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding same (0.3); review precedent letters (0.4); correspondence regarding same with D. Schaible, D. Klein and others (0.2); review and comment on employee claims letter (2.8); review and comment on employee frequently asked questions (1.6).
Moskowitz E	09/28/12	1.6	Review and edit proposals and accompanying letter (1.2); correspondence with team regarding experts and related issues (0.4).
Resnick BM	09/28/12	0.9	Call with J. Smolinsky regarding multi-employer pension plans (0.2); review employee compensation precedents and presentation (0.7).
Aizen RM	09/29/12	0.6	Review employee compensation analysis (0.1); emails with E. Moskowitz regarding actuaries (0.4); voicemail from M. Luna regarding retiree medical (0.1).
Huebner MS	09/29/12	0.1	Review and markup of employee's presentation and internal emails regarding same.
Aizen RM	09/30/12	0.2	Review retiree medical data.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Glazer E	09/30/12	1.6	Revise §§ 1113 and 1114 draft proposals and accompanying letter (0.7); draft emails to M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz, J. Martin, J. Bean, and Word Processing Center regarding same (0.9).
McGreal MM	09/30/12	0.4	Review employee bar date letter and frequently asked questions (0.3); email B. Resnick regarding same (0.1).
Total EMPLOYEE LABOR ISSUES		462.3	
EXECUTORY CONTRACTS			
Starr AT	09/03/12	1.1	Review draft agreement (0.6); conference call with J. Martin and R. Estacio regarding the same (0.5).
Martin JD	09/04/12	5.6	Revise draft agreements (1.7); review materials related to same (2.1); communications with C. Ebetino, R. Mead and R. Estacio regarding same (1.8).
McGreal MM	09/04/12	1.3	Correspondence with J. Martin, D. Klein and R. Estacio regarding amending and assuming certain agreements (0.3); correspondence with Kramer Levin and A. Starr regarding presentation to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee on Peabody motion (0.2); prepare binder of redacted Peabody agreements and cover letter for Chambers and U.S. Trustee (0.3); teleconference with E. Moskowitz to update on same (0.2); correspondence with R. McWilliams, B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding contract counterparty (0.3).
McGreal MM	09/05/12	0.2	Correspondence with AlixPartners and B. Resnick regarding a counterparty contract.
Resnick BM	09/05/12	0.7	Review AlixPartners presentation regarding executory contracts (0.3); call with D. Brewer regarding lease tax payments (0.3); emails with M. Roeschenthaler regarding same (0.1).
Coco KJ	09/06/12	0.4	Draft rejection order.
Klein DS	09/06/12	1.1	Call with J. Tucker and others regarding contract assessment issues and follow-up related to same.
Libby A	09/06/12	1.2	Kick-off call regarding executory contracts with AlixPartners and Company.
McGreal MM	09/06/12	0.6	Correspondence with A. Starr and G. Moody regarding status of Peabody assumption motion (0.1); teleconference with counsel to Siemens regarding lease buyouts (0.1); email Curtis Mallet regarding Siemens lease rejection (0.1); teleconference with S. Schutzenhofer regarding rejecting equipment leases accounting for lease rejection damages (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick BM	09/06/12	1.4	Call with Alix and clients regarding executory contract rejections.
Coco KJ	09/07/12	1.5	Emails with counterparties, conflicts counsel and Davis Polk team regarding contract rejections (0.8); draft order and notice regarding same (0.7).
Hait S	09/07/12	0.7	Draft proposed fifth omnibus rejection order.
Klein DS	09/07/12	0.9	Call with J. Eagan and others regarding court approval for executory contracts and asset purchases (0.4); call with B. Wolfe regarding rejection notice and discuss same with K. Coco (0.3); call with J. Conte regarding same (0.2).
Starr AT	09/07/12	5.5	Calls and emails regarding Peabody agreement and order with A. Rogoff, C. Black, G. Moody, M. Huebner, B. Bennett, T. Thomas, A. Mell and A. Yerramalli (2.6); draft and revise amendment to Peabody agreement (0.9); draft and revise Peabody motion and order (2.0).
Hait S	09/09/12	0.7	Draft proposed order for fifth omnibus rejection.
Coco KJ	09/10/12	1.2	Meeting with B. Resnick and D. Klein regarding contract rejections, follow-up emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6); research in connection with same (0.6).
Glazer E	09/10/12	0.6	Legal research regarding integration of contracts under §365 (0.4); review objection to debtors' notice of rejection of certain executory contracts and related materials (0.2).
Hait S	09/10/12	0.3	Draft proposed order for first rejection notice.
Klein DS	09/10/12	0.4	Meet with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding contract rejection issues.
Martin JD	09/10/12	2.9	Communications with C. Ebetino regarding certain contracts (0.9); review and revise certain contracts (0.5); emails regarding same with A. Starr, M. McGreal, R. Estacio and others (0.8) review contract for potential rejection (0.4); related emails with C. Ebetino and D. Klein (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	09/10/12	2.1	Review revised Peabody order (0.3); correspondence with A. Starr and G. Moody regarding same (0.3); email revised Peabody order to counsel for DIP Lenders and Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.1); correspondence with K. Coco regarding notice of filing of revised Peabody order (0.2); review and comment on same (0.2); review and comment on surety agreement documents (0.4); correspondence with J. Martin, R. Estacio and D. Klein regarding same (0.3); correspondence with counsel to the contract counterparty and B. Resnick regarding elevator contract (0.3).
Resnick BM	09/10/12	0.7	Review GECC objection (0.2); meet with D. Klein and K. Coco regarding same (0.3); emails regarding a counterparty issue (0.2).
Satter KM	09/10/12	2.1	Draft and file notice of motion regarding Peabody (1.8); emails regarding same (0.3).
Schaible DS	09/10/12	0.5	Coordinate regarding contract issues.
Starr AT	09/10/12	2.3	Revise and finalize Peabody order (0.6); calls and emails regarding same with B. Bennett, G. Moody, M. McGreal, A. Rogoff and C. Black (1.2); prepare for hearing (0.5).
Coco KJ	09/11/12	3.0	Emails with conflicts counsel regarding equipment lease rejections (0.4); research regarding executory contract rejection issues (1.3); emails with counsel to counterparty regarding contract rejections (0.7); review contract rejection pleadings received (0.6).
Glazer E	09/11/12	2.4	Review equipment leases in connection with objection to Debtors' notice of rejection of certain executory contracts (2.2); draft email to J. Martin regarding same (0.2).
Klein DS	09/11/12	0.5	Call with J. Martin regarding surety contracts (0.2); email B. Wolfe regarding contract rejection (0.1); coordinate with K. Coco regarding vendor agreement (0.2).
Martin JD	09/11/12	1.7	Revise surety agreement (0.7); emails with C. Ebetino and others related to same (0.8); call with D. Klein regarding same (0.2).
McGreal MM	09/11/12	0.4	Correspondence with B. Resnick and C. Robertson regarding the contract counterparty.
Moody, Jr. GM	09/11/12	0.3	Call with A. Starr regarding bankruptcy hearing on executory contracts (0.1); correspondence with M. McGreal regarding same (0.1); correspondence with client regarding approval of assumption agreements (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick BM	09/11/12	2.2	Review case law cited by the contract counterparty in a letter and draft motion (0.7); call with D. DeNeal (0.2); meet with C. Robertson regarding same (0.2); meet with M. McGreal regarding same (0.2); review research regarding GECC motion (0.1); call with K. Coco regarding counterparty rejection notice (0.1); emails regarding same (0.2); call with D. Schaible regarding the contract counterparty's letter (0.3); calls with M. McGreal regarding same (0.2).
Ruiz EL	09/11/12	0.4	Call with counterparty regarding service termination letter.
Schaible DS	09/11/12	0.8	Emails regarding contract counterparty issues (0.4); conference call and follow-up regarding contract counterparty issues (0.4).
Starr AT	09/11/12	6.7	Prepare for hearing (2.4); attend Court hearing (4.0); emails regarding approval of Peabody agreement to B. Bennett, P. Thomas and J. Bean (0.3).
Coco KJ	09/12/12	4.4	Emails with company regarding contracts rejections (0.6); review and analysis of objections to contract rejection notices (0.8); research and review memos and analysis regarding same (1.2); call with E. Glazer regarding same, follow-up (0.3); emails with E. Glazer regarding same (0.3); review notice requirements for real property contracts (0.2); review investigative requirements for real property contracts and emails clients regarding same (0.8); review contract rejection notice letters in connection with DIP loans (0.2).
Glazer E	09/12/12	1.2	Review equipment leases in connection with objection to debtors' notice of rejection of certain executory contracts (1.1); draft email to B. Resnick regarding same (0.1).
Klein DS	09/12/12	0.1	Review letter from contract counterparty regarding performance.
Martin JD	09/12/12	1.6	Call with A. Starr, C. Ebetino and others regarding certain agreements (0.9); revise draft contract (0.2); emails with A. Starr, J. Tucker and others regarding same (0.2); review research on equipment lease rejections (0.3).
McGreal MM	09/12/12	0.1	Correspondence with Company regarding a counterparty.
Resnick BM	09/12/12	0.2	Review letter to counterparty.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	09/12/12	2.1	Emails regarding Peabody payments with T. Thomas; conference call regarding certain agreements with C. Ebetino, B. Bennett, T. Thomas and J. Tucker (0.7); emails regarding a certain agreement with J. Martin and R. Estacio (0.4); meet with H. Baker, A. Turner and J. Martin regarding lawsuit (0.5); review assumption agreement (0.5).
Coco KJ	09/13/12	2.1	Call with conflicts counsel regarding contract rejections and objections (0.2); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); research and analysis of objections and law (1.6).
Estacio R	09/13/12	3.7	Conferences with A. Starr regarding potential breach of contract damages and date breach would occur (0.4); analyze relevant agreements to determine potential claims arising from breach (1.3); legal research regarding the same (1.2); draft analysis regarding the same for A. Starr and J. Martin (0.8).
Glazer E	09/13/12	0.5	Call with K. Coco related to objection to debtors' notice of rejection of certain executory contracts (0.3); draft email to K. Coco regarding same (0.2).
Hait S	09/13/12	0.2	Discuss third rejection notice with K. Coco.
Klein DS	09/13/12	0.5	Call with B. Rosenblum related to contract amendment (0.4); email J. Tucker regarding postpetition contract provisions (0.1).
Martin JD	09/13/12	0.2	Review and comment on objection to lease rejection.
McGreal MM	09/13/12	0.9	Correspondence with counsel to the contract counterparty (0.1); review and comment on letter to the contract counterparty (0.8).
Resnick BM	09/13/12	0.5	Emails regarding executory contract rejections (0.2); emails regarding research issues (0.3).
Starr AT	09/13/12	1.5	Call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding a certain agreement (1.0); prepare materials for Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.5).
Coco KJ	09/14/12	2.3	Call with company regarding contract rejections analysis (0.5); emails and analysis of contract rejection issues (1.2); analysis of objections to contract rejection notice (0.6).
Estacio R	09/14/12	1.0	Conferences with A. Starr regarding Patriot contracts (0.1); draft correspondence for Creditors' Committee regarding the same (0.5); research regarding breach of contract damages in bankruptcy (0.3); draft correspondence regarding the same for A. Starr and J. Martin (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Hait S	09/14/12	2.3	Draft third rejection notice and review agreements being rejected.
Martin JD	09/14/12	0.7	Call with A. Starr regarding certain contracts (0.3); review revised surety agreement (0.4).
McGreal MM	09/14/12	2.7	Legal research regarding motions to compel assumption (0.8); revise letter to the contract counterparty (1.1); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.3); teleconference with counsel to the contract counterparty and B. Resnick regarding motion to compel (0.3); correspondence with Company regarding lease rejection damages (0.1); email counsel to counterparty (0.1).
Resnick BM	09/14/12	0.8	Review letter to a contract counterparty (0.2); meetings with M. McGreal regarding same (0.3); call with J. Bean regarding same (0.1); call with D. DeNeal regarding same (0.2).
Starr AT	09/14/12	2.3	Conference call with client Blackstone and Alix Partners regarding case progress (0.7); review revised contract (0.3); emails regarding same to R. Estacio (0.2); review research regarding enforceability of certain contracts (1.1).
Zhu B	09/14/12	0.5	Correspond with A. Starr, M. McGreal and R. Estacio regarding potential rejection of certain coal supply agreements and related contracts.
Estacio R	09/15/12	1.3	Edit new agreement between Patriot and counter-party regarding letters of credit (0.2); research regarding interpretation of contractual provisions (1.1).
Martin JD	09/15/12	0.5	Emails with C. Ebetino, A. Starr, R. Estacio and others regarding certain contracts.
Travers M	09/15/12	0.3	Emails regarding subleases and potential subdivision of existing leases.
Estacio R	09/16/12	1.2	Edit new agreement between Patriot and counter-party regarding surety bonds (0.1); research regarding interpretation of contractual provisions (0.4); draft analysis of the same for A. Starr and J. Martin (0.4); draft correspondence to Patriot regarding the same (0.3).
Resnick BM	09/16/12	0.3	Review and revise letter to the contract counterparty.
Coco KJ	09/17/12	2.9	Draft contract rejection motion (2.3); emails with clients, AlixPartners, GCG and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6).
Martin JD	09/17/12	0.4	Call with A. Starr regarding certain agreements (0.2); review certain agreements (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	09/17/12	0.9	Teleconference with Company re calculating rejection damages (0.3); review equipment leases (0.3); review and revise letter to the contract counterparty's counsel (0.3).
Resnick BM	09/17/12	0.2	Meeting with K. Coco and D. Klein regarding rejections of executory contracts.
Starr AT	09/17/12	0.9	Review materials (0.1); review draft (0.3); calls regarding counterparty with J. Martin and C. Ebetino (0.5).
Zhu B	09/17/12	6.2	Attend conference with A. Perez-Marques and J. Martin regarding Massey 12(c) brief (1.0); revise 12(c) brief (1.1); correspond with J. Martin and Patriot team regarding same (0.3); conduct research regarding ancillary papers for 12(c) motion (1.1); correspond with managing attorney's office regarding same (0.1); correspond with A. Mehes regarding notice of motion (0.1); analyze STB motion to dismiss and exhibits (1.6); prepare summary of analysis of STB motion (0.7); correspond with J. Martin and G. Moody regarding same (0.2).
Coco KJ	09/18/12	4.3	Call with clients and conflicts counsel regarding objections to contract rejections, preparation and follow-up regarding same (1.1); call with conflicts counsel regarding contract rejection issues (0.2); emails and call with counsel to counterparty regarding contract rejections (0.2); emails and call to company regarding equipment lease rejections (1.6); research and contract review regarding same (1.2).
Estacio R	09/18/12	9.3	Draft and revise motion to reject certain agreements (1.8); legal research regarding ability of counterparties to terminate contracts (3.4); draft analysis regarding the same for A. Starr and J. Martin (1.6); conference with A. Starr and others regarding motion to reject certain agreements (1.7); correspond with Patriot regarding certain contracts (0.8).
Glazer E	09/18/12	0.4	Conference call with client and K. Coco regarding rejection of equipment leases.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klein DS	09/18/12	2.5	Call with C. Ebetino et al regarding executory contracts and real estate and follow-up related to same (0.8); call with K. Hartsog et al regarding equipment rejections (0.3); call/email with R. Mead regarding coal sale contracts (0.3); emails with J. Tucker and discussions with B. Resnick regarding intercompany agreements (0.3); call with A. Starr and email M. McGreal regarding contract rejections and negotiations (0.3); emails regarding coal sale contract with clients and B. Resnick and review contract (0.5).
Martin JD	09/18/12	2.5	Call with C. Ebetino, J. Jones, and others regarding certain contracts (0.5); conference with A. Starr, R. Estacio regarding same (0.5); review draft contract rejection motions (0.7); review research relating to same (0.4); emails with A. Starr, R. Estacio, C. Ebetino and others regarding same (0.4).
McGreal MM	09/18/12	0.9	Review and revise chart on contract rejection damages (0.8); correspondence with Blackstone regarding same (0.1).
Resnick BM	09/18/12	0.9	Revise letter to counterparty (0.2); discuss same with M. McGreal (0.1); email to J. Bean regarding same (0.1); calls with clients and Alix regarding rejection objections (0.5).
Starr AT	09/18/12	4.9	Revise a motion (0.8); review research regarding same (1.3); conference call with C. Ebetino, B. Bennett, J. Jones, J. Tucker and J. Martin (1.6); review administration contract (0.3); follow-up calls regarding rejection with J. Martin, R. Estacio and D. Klein (0.9).
Starr AT	09/18/12	0.6	Emails and calls with D. Klein and B. Bennett regarding coal sales agreement.
Coco KJ	09/19/12	2.7	Draft, review, revise coal contract rejection (1.7); review documents in connection with same (0.3); emails with Davis Polk team and AlixPartners in connection with same (0.4); coordinate service with respect to same (0.3).
Estacio R	09/19/12	10.1	Draft and revise motion to reject certain agreements (5.8); conferences with A. Starr regarding the same (0.2); conferences with K. Coco regarding the same (0.3); correspond with A. Starr and others regarding the same (0.2); correspond with D. Klein and others regarding the same (0.1); legal research regarding the effects of contract rejection (2.6); draft analysis regarding the same for A. Starr and J. Martin (0.9).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Hait S	09/19/12	1.0	Make list of notice parties for third rejection notice (0.7); discuss notice parties with K. Coco (0.3).
Klein DS	09/19/12	1.6	Call with A. Starr regarding customer contracts and follow-up regarding same (0.5); call/emails with C. Damba regarding customer contract (0.2); review and comment on same (0.4); call with A. Starr regarding same (0.2); emails with DIP team regarding same (0.3).
Martin JD	09/19/12	1.1	Review and revise draft rejection motion for certain contracts (0.6); emails with C. Ebetino, A. Starr, and others regarding same (0.5).
McGreal MM	09/19/12	1.2	Correspondence with Blackstone regarding rejection damages (0.2); review and comment on a rejection motion (0.8); correspondence with D. Klein, K. Coco and R. Estacio regarding same (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/19/12	0.3	Call with A. Starr and J. Martin regarding rejection motion strategy.
Schaible DS	09/19/12	0.5	Emails regarding contract rejection issues.
Schaible DS	09/19/12	1.9	Prepare for and teleconference regarding lease rejection issues (0.8); teleconference with the Chief Restructuring Officer regarding lease issues (0.4); review, revise and coordinate regarding lease letter materials (0.7).
Starr AT	09/19/12	4.5	Calls with R. Estacio, J. Martin, B. Resnick, D. Klein, C. Ebetino and J. Jones regarding a counterparty (1.9); revise motion (1.3); calls and emails with counsel to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and DIP lenders regarding the same (0.8); calls and emails regarding credit terms of coal supply contract with D. Klein, T. Chepiga and B. Bennett (0.5).
Coco KJ	09/20/12	3.2	Analysis of contract rejection issues (1.1); coordinate filing of coal rejection motion (0.2); emails regarding coal rejection motion (0.4); draft, review and revise coal rejection motion (0.8); emails with AlixPartners regarding company training for contract rejection issues, follow-up regarding same (0.7).
Estacio R	09/20/12	4.6	Revise motion to reject certain agreements (2.3) conferences with A. Starr regarding revisions the same (0.6); proofread and file the same (1.7).
Klein DS	09/20/12	0.1	Emails with C. Damba regarding executory contract counterparty.
Libby A	09/20/12	0.2	File a rejection motion and emails with K.Coco regarding same.
Martin JD	09/20/12	0.8	Communications with A. Starr and others regarding certain contracts.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick BM	09/20/12	0.2	Emails regarding a rejection motion.
Starr AT	09/20/12	5.6	Revise a motion (2.4); calls with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and DIP Lenders counsel regarding a rejection (1.1); calls and emails with C. Ebetino, J. Jones, B. Bennett, T. Thomas and M. Buschman regarding same (1.8); finalize a motion (0.3).
Coco KJ	09/21/12	2.0	Call to counterparty's counsel regarding contract rejections (0.2); call with J. Creighton regarding contract rejection training and emails regarding same (0.7); review example contracts in connection with same (0.8); call with clients regarding negotiations for equipment finance rent payments going forward (0.3).
Klein DS	09/21/12	0.4	Call with C. Damba et al regarding postpetition contract provisions and follow-up related to same.
McGreal MM	09/21/12	0.2	Correspondence with B. Resnick, D. Klein and others regarding coal sale contracts.
Resnick BM	09/21/12	0.3	Call with A. Starr regarding rejection issues.
Starr AT	09/23/12	0.2	Emails regarding a motion with B. Bennett, T. Thomas and C. Ebetino.
Coco KJ	09/24/12	2.6	Calls and emails with J. Creighton regarding company contract review issues (0.6); review and analyze example contracts in connection with same (1.3); draft and file notice of no objections regarding equipment lease rejections (0.7).
de Richemont P	09/24/12	0.7	Draft motion regarding deadline to assume leases.
Estacio R	09/24/12	4.4	Correspond with legal assistant regarding contract signature pages (0.2); draft analysis regarding the same for A. Starr and J. Martin (0.3); draft motion to reject executory contract (0.8); legal research regarding the same (2.4); draft analysis regarding the same for A. Starr and J. Martin (0.7).
Hait S	09/24/12	1.8	Draft notice of no objections for first rejection notice (0.6); draft proposed order for first rejection notice (0.9); file notice of no objections (0.3).
Klein DS	09/24/12	1.0	Review and comment on rejection order (0.6); email J. Tucker regarding postpetition agreement provisions (0.2); coordinate on notice of no objection for contract rejections (0.2).
Martin JD	09/24/12	0.3	Emails with A. Starr and others regarding certain agreements.
McGreal MM	09/24/12	0.3	Review and comment on notice of no objection to notice of rejection of equipment leases (0.2); correspondence with D. Klein and K. Coco regarding same (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	09/24/12	0.9	Conference call with D. McCallister, R. Estacio and M. Stuart regarding West Virginia permitting issues (0.6); meet with R. Estacio regarding materials for West Virginia lawyers (0.3).
Coco KJ	09/25/12	3.9	Call with K. Hartsog and others regarding equipment lease rejections strategy (0.5); follow-up call and email with conflicts counsel regarding same (0.4); revise order for equipment lease rejections and coordinate sending to chambers (0.7); communications with clients regarding same (0.4); meeting with D. Klein regarding contract rejections (0.1); call with J. Creighton and clients regarding approval issues for contracts review by company (1.6); emails with company and conflicts counsel regarding upcoming contracts issues (0.2).
Klein DS	09/25/12	0.5	Review and comment on rejection order (0.2); emails with K. Coco regarding same (0.1); emails with contract counterparty and C. Damba regarding contract provision (0.2).
Martin JD	09/25/12	0.2	Emails with A. Starr and others regarding certain contracts.
Starr AT	09/25/12	0.7	Draft legal analysis regarding assignability of coal supply agreements (0.5); emails regarding same with B. Bennett and A. Delaney (0.2).
Starr AT	09/25/12	0.8	Review agency question regarding certain contracts (0.3); emails regarding West Virginia permits with M. Stuart and A. McAllister (0.4); calls to R. Estacio regarding the same (0.1).
Coco KJ	09/26/12	3.2	Draft presentation for call with company regarding executory contracts (1.5); coordinate regarding executory contracts training sessions and calls with company (0.6); answer emails from clients regarding executory contracts questions (0.2); analysis of real property lease issues (0.6); emails with AlixPartners regarding contracts training and real property lease rejection deadline (0.3).
Klein DS	09/26/12	0.5	Emails with T. Chepiga regarding lease terminations (0.2); emails with S. Robinson and K. Coco regarding rejection procedures (0.2); email contract counterparty regarding postpetition agreement (0.1).
Martin JD	09/26/12	1.3	Call with Steptoe and others regarding permitting issues (0.9); emails with A. Starr, C. Ebetino regarding certain contracts (0.4).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Starr AT	09/26/12	3.1	Emails regarding a motion timing with C. Ebetino, S. O'Neill, J. Martin and R. Estacio (1.1); calls and emails regarding guarantees and bonds with D. McAllister, C. Ebetino, J. Jones, M. Stuart and R. Estacio (1.8); emails to McGreal regarding adjournment (0.2).
Zhu B	09/26/12	0.4	Correspond with R. Estacio and A. Mehes regarding Peabody agreements.
Coco KJ	09/27/12	3.1	Emails with AlixPartners and Davis Polk team regarding executory contracts issues (0.8); call with company and AlixPartners for training on executory contract review, prepare for same (1.8); review email from counterparties in connection with equipment lease issues (0.2); emails and call with K. Hartsog and equipment lease team regarding rejections (0.3).
de Richemont P	09/27/12	0.1	Email about contract rejection.
Martin JD	09/27/12	0.6	Communications with A. Starr, S. O'Neal regarding scheduling for motion (0.3); emails with A. Starr, R. Estacio regarding certain contracts (0.3).
Resnick BM	09/27/12	0.3	Emails regarding rejections of executory contracts.
Starr AT	09/27/12	1.3	Calls and email regarding the adjournment and briefing schedule with S. O'Neill, J. Martin and M. McGreal.
Coco KJ	09/28/12	6.9	Emails with M. Williams and company regarding real property rejections (0.6); emails with surety counsel regarding same (0.3); emails with M. Williams and company regarding rejection of financial services agreements (0.4); emails with Davis Polk team and Curtis Mallet team regarding same (0.6); call with company and AlixPartners regarding real property rejections issues, follow-up regarding same (1.7); review and comment on Evergreen lease documentation (1.5); emails with M. Williams regarding same (0.3); review documents in connection with equipment lease buyouts (0.9); discussions with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2); discussions with company and counterparty counsel regarding same (0.4).
Klein DS	09/28/12	1.6	Call with AlixPartners regarding real estate lease analysis (0.3); call with clients regarding same (0.7); follow-up discussion with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding same (0.3); emails with B. Early and discussion with K. Coco regarding rejection (0.3).
McGreal MM	09/28/12	0.4	Correspondence with K. Coco regarding rejecting contracts (0.2); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding potential rejection damages (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick BM	09/28/12	0.6	Emails with D. Klein and K. Coco regarding rejections (0.2); meet with D. Klein and K. Coco regarding same (0.4).
Starr AT	09/28/12	1.3	Emails and calls regarding certain guarantees.
Coco KJ	09/29/12	0.3	Emails with company regarding diligence requests from surety company.
Estacio R	09/29/12	1.8	Analyze coal supply contracts regarding integration with ancillary agreements.
Total EXECUTORY CONTRACTS		215.8	
FINANCING			
Robertson C	09/02/12	3.5	Research limited liability company law.
Vonnegut EJ	09/02/12	1.4	Research and draft summary of analysis for LLC issues.
Resnick BM	09/03/12	4.4	Review memo and cases regarding sole-member LLCs (3.2); calls with E. Vonnegut and C. Robertson regarding same (0.9); call with E. White regarding same (0.3).
Robertson C	09/03/12	3.8	Call with B. Resnick and E. Vonnegut to discuss limited liability company research (0.4); conduct follow-up research (2.2); email summary of same to E. Vonnegut (0.5); follow-up call with B. Resnick and E. Vonnegut regarding same (0.4); emails with B. Resnick and E. Vonnegut regarding same (0.3).
Vonnegut EJ	09/03/12	5.5	Research and draft summary of analysis for LLC issues and discuss same with B. Resnick and C. Robertson.
Beshar SE	09/04/12	0.5	Conference call with internal team regarding operating agreement amendments.
Chepiga TL	09/04/12	3.9	Conference with B. Resnick, W. Warner and others regarding local counsel opinions (1.0); call with G. Pak regarding Deposit Account Control Agreements and emails regarding same (0.2); calls with B. Resnick, W. Warner, West Virginia, Virginia and Kentucky local counsel regarding local counsel opinions (1.7); call with S. Gordon regarding reporting requirements (0.4); calls with S. Beshar and W. Hoeben regarding disclosure and email regarding same (0.4); call with E. Vonnegut regarding status (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Pak GY	09/04/12	5.7	Correspondences with Davis Polk bankruptcy team regarding West Virginia, Virginia and Kentucky issues (0.3); meet with Davis Polk Credit and Bankruptcy teams to discuss West Virginia, Virginia and Kentucky issues (0.8); correspondences to local counsels regarding call on sub issues (0.4); correspondences with Company and Weil regarding Bank of America Deposit Account Control Agreements (0.5); read updates on Patriot bankruptcy and related issues (0.2); review of revised springing Bank of America Deposit Account Control Agreement and prepare mark-up (0.5); review of revised full dominion Bank of America Deposit Account Control Agreement and prepare mark-up (0.5); call with West Virginia local counsel and Davis Polk credit and bankruptcy team (1.0); call with Kentucky local counsel and Davis Polk credit and bankruptcy team (0.5); update post-closing checklist (0.3); calls and correspondences with Weil and Company regarding operational issues to Bank of America Deposit Account Control Agreement (0.5); correspondences with Davis Polk teams regarding disclosure and amendments (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/04/12	5.5	Meeting with W. Warner, T. Chepiga and others regarding West Virginia and Kentucky DIP opinion issue (0.8); review research regarding same (2.8); calls with local counsel regarding same (1.4); call with J. Windels regarding same (0.2); call with E. Vonnegut regarding same (0.3).
Robertson C	09/04/12	1.3	Call with W. Warner, B. Resnick, T. Chepiga, G. Pak and local counsel regarding LLC agreements (0.5); research regarding same (0.8).
Vonnegut EJ	09/04/12	1.9	Meeting with Davis Polk team regarding LLC issues and preparation for same (1.5); discuss outcome of local counsel discussions with B. Resnick and T. Chepiga (0.4).
Warner W	09/04/12	4.4	Review opinion issues and statutes (1.3); telephone calls with local counsel and others regarding opinion issues (1.8); review email regarding opinions (0.3); conferences with Davis Polk team regarding opinion issues (1.0).
Chepiga TL	09/05/12	0.2	Emails and call with B. Resnick and others regarding local counsel opinions.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Pak GY	09/05/12	1.2	Correspondences with Company regarding status of Bank of America Deposit Account Control Agreements (0.2); review of execution versions of the Bank of America Deposit Account Control Agreements sent by Weil (0.3); call with Weil regarding revisions to Bank of America Deposit Account Control Agreements (0.1); further correspondences with Weil and Company regarding Bank of America Deposit Account Control Agreements (0.1); correspondences with local counsel and Davis Polk bankruptcy and credit teams regarding revised West Virginia opinion and related issues (0.2); reading updates on Patriot bankruptcy and related issues (0.3).
Resnick BM	09/05/12	0.7	Call with J. Smolinsky (0.2); emails with M. Huebner and D. Schaible regarding same (0.1); emails regarding DIP opinion (0.4).
Sorkin S	09/05/12	0.1	Emails regarding flood insurance.
VanLandingham K	09/05/12	5.7	Meet with B. Resnick and E. Vonnegut to discuss LLC research assignment (0.4); research regarding same (5.3).
Vonnegut EJ	09/05/12	0.6	Discuss LLC issues with B. Resnick and K. VanLandingham (0.4); review draft DIP opinions (0.2).
Warner W	09/05/12	1.2	Telephone call with B. Resnick regarding opinions (0.2); review email (0.1); email regarding opinions (0.1); telephone call with B. Resnick regarding LLCs (0.1); review local counsel opinion comments (0.3); review question of filing amendments to operating documents (0.4).
Chepiga TL	09/06/12	1.0	Call with Weil regarding local counsel opinions (0.5); calls with J. Jones and local counsel regarding same (0.5).
Immermann MC	09/06/12	1.7	Status update meeting with G. Pak (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team, Willkie, Weil regarding Deposit Account Control Agreements and stock certificates (1.5).
Pak GY	09/06/12	1.0	Updates on Patriot bankruptcy and related issues (0.3); meet with M. Immermann regarding status of post-closing items (0.2); call with Weil regarding outstanding Deposit Account Control Agreements (0.2); correspondences with Davis Polk team regarding status of West Virginia opinion (0.1); correpondences with M. McGreal regarding corporate documents (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/06/12	1.2	Calls with Weil and others regarding DIP opinion (1.0); review revised draft of same (0.2).
Sorkin S	09/06/12	0.5	Coordinate flood insurance (0.2); calls and emails regarding structures on SFHA (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
VanLandingham K	09/06/12	9.6	Research and draft memo regarding LLC issues.
Vonnegut EJ	09/06/12	1.5	Discuss LLC issues with Weil Gotshal and preparation for same (1.0); revise memo regarding LLC issues (0.5).
Warner W	09/06/12	1.9	Email regarding opinion deadline (0.1); review opinion language and statutes (0.6); conference call with Weil Gotshal regarding same (0.6); email for local counsel regarding opinion (0.6).
Chepiga TL	09/07/12	1.5	Call with J. Tucker and write-up of same (0.5); multiple calls and emails with Weil and Davis Polk team and local counsel regarding local counsel opinions (1.0).
Immermann MC	09/07/12	2.5	Draft request for post-closing deliverables deadline extension (0.1); correspondence with Weil and Davis Polk team regarding extension (0.2); correspondence with R. Mead at Patriot regarding revised BAML Deposit Account Control Agreement (0.3); review of revised BAML Deposit Account Control Agreement and discussions with G. Pak regarding comments (1.6); call with Weil and Davis Polk team regarding extension and BAML Deposit Account Control Agreement (0.2); correspondence with Weil, Patriot team regarding confirmation of deadline extension (0.1).
Pak GY	09/07/12	2.9	Correspondences with M. Immermann regarding extension request for post-closing matters and review of draft request (0.3); correspondences with Davis Polk team and Company regarding redemption of shares (0.2); updates on the Patriot bankruptcy (0.3); correspondences with Weil, Company and Davis Polk regarding Bank of America Deposit Account Control Agreements (0.4); review of draft of Merrill Lynch Deposit Account Control Agreement sent by Weil, review relevant precedents and confer with M. Immermann regarding the same (0.8); review revised Deposit Account Control Agreement and prepare mark-up (0.3); call with Weil regarding Merrill Lynch Deposit Account Control Agreement (0.2); correspondences with Davis Polk team regarding opinion deadline (0.2); correspondence to Weil and working group regarding local counsel opinion deadline (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/07/12	0.7	Emails regarding DIP opinion (0.2); call with local counsels regarding same (0.5).
Sorkin S	09/07/12	0.1	Emails regarding flood insurance.
VanLandingham K	09/07/12	4.8	Research and draft memo regarding LLC issues.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Vonnegut EJ	09/07/12	0.5	Conference call with local counsel regarding DIP opinions.
Warner W	09/07/12	0.9	Status update (0.1); prepare for and call with local counsel regarding opinions (0.8).
Resnick BM	09/08/12	0.6	Review research regarding LLCs (0.3); email to Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3).
Warner W	09/08/12	0.2	Review of issues presented by LLC statutes in Kentucky, Virginia and West Virginia.
VanLandingham K	09/09/12	0.8	Research LLC issues.
Chepiga TL	09/10/12	4.1	Emails with K. Williams and others regarding indentures (0.4); call with H. Baker and others (0.2); draft email to H. Baker and others regarding letters of credit (1.1); emails and calls with D. Klein and others regarding sureties (1.5); emails and calls with E. Moskowitz regarding certificates (0.4); calls and emails with H. Baker regarding letters of credit (0.5).
Huebner MS	09/10/12	1.9	Conversations with clients, DIP lenders Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel and other supporters regarding roles and presentation for DIP hearing.
Pak GY	09/10/12	1.5	Correspondence from L. Samet and J. Brenner regarding venue hearing (0.2); correspondence with D. Klein and T. Chepiga regarding surety bonds and letters of credit (0.3); review of prior correspondences and diligence documents on surety and letters of credit (0.5); correspondences and calls with Davis Polk Bankruptcy and Credit teams and Weil regarding stock certificates (0.3); review of copy of stock certificates and correspondence with M. Immermann regarding the same (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/10/12	0.1	Voicemail for J. Smolinsky.
Sorkin S	09/10/12	0.1	Call to R. Mead regarding flood insurance.
VanLandingham K	09/10/12	7.1	Research and revise memo regarding LLC issues.
Vonnegut EJ	09/10/12	0.3	Emails with B. Resnick and K. Vanlandingham regarding LLC issues.
Warner W	09/10/12	1.1	Review of issues relating to LLC statutes (0.9); review of issues relating to letter of credit requirements (0.2).
Pak GY	09/11/12	0.5	Correspondences from L. Samet and T. Chepiga regarding venue hearing (0.1); correspondences with local counsels and Davis Polk team regarding local counsel opinions (0.2); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding West Virginia, Virginia, Kentucky corporate documents (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/11/12	0.1	Emails regarding DIP Opinions.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Teixeira MM	09/11/12	1.9	Save down collateral documents delivered to Citi and create tracking schedule of all documents recieved.
Vonnegut EJ	09/11/12	1.0	Review and markup LLC amendment forms (0.7); review analysis memo of LLC related issues (0.3).
Warner W	09/11/12	0.4	Review corporate documents, opinions and related issues.
Haase KL	09/12/12	0.3	Respond to request from D. Klein for documents relating to New York subsidiaries.
Immermann MC	09/12/12	1.0	Locate and share with Davis Polk team Deposit Account Control Agreement provision in 2007 security document (0.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team and local counsel regarding call on corporate documents (0.3); follow-up regarding the Bank of America Securities Deposit Account Control Agreement (0.4).
Pak GY	09/12/12	0.4	Correspondences from M. McGreal and T.Chepiga regarding subsidiary guarantor requirement (0.1); correspondences with T. Chepiga, M. Immermann and E. Vonnegut regarding West Virginia, Virginia and Kentucky corporate documents (0.2); review updates on Patriot bankruptcy (0.1).
Sorkin S	09/12/12	0.5	Calls and emails regarding amending insurance agreements (0.2); calls and emails regarding providing list of structures in SFHAs (0.3).
Vonnegut EJ	09/12/12	0.2	Review draft lease rejection notices and email regarding same to J. Tucker.
Warner W	09/12/12	0.2	Review local counsel opinions.
Immermann MC	09/13/12	0.3	Call with local counsel to discuss comments to corporate documents.
Pak GY	09/13/12	0.9	Call with local counsels and Davis Polk teams regarding West Virginia and Virginia corporate documents (0.3); correspondences with E.Vonnegut, M. Immermann and the Company regarding corporate documents (0.2); correspondence with Weil regarding executed SACA (0.1); correspondences with Company regarding Private Bank deposit account and review of DIP credit agreement in connection with the same (0.3).
Sorkin S	09/13/12	0.3	Emails regarding flood insurance (0.1); call with N. Dashman regarding subleasing to affiliates (0.2).
Vonnegut EJ	09/13/12	1.0	Call with local counsel regarding DIP opinions and prepare for and followup from same.
Warner W	09/13/12	1.0	Review press reports (0.1); review local counsel opinions (0.9).
Immermann MC	09/14/12	0.2	Call K. Villarreal to discuss Private Bank Deposit Account Control Agreement.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Pak GY	09/14/12	0.6	Correspondences with M. Immermann and Company regarding Private Bank account (0.2); review chart of delivered stock certificates to Citi and conferred with M. Immermann regarding the same (0.2); review of updates on Patriot bankruptcy (0.2).
Sorkin S	09/14/12	0.1	Emails regarding flood insurance
Warner W	09/14/12	0.7	Weekly update call with Patriot and others.
Chepiga TL	09/17/12	0.1	Emails with G. Pak et al regarding local counsel opinions.
Immermann MC	09/17/12	0.1	Email West Virginia and Kentucky local counsel to determine opinion status.
Pak GY	09/17/12	0.4	Correspondences with local counsel, T. Chepiga, M. Immermann and E. Vonnegut regarding local counsel opinions and corporate documents.
Resnick BM	09/17/12	0.2	Emails regarding opinions (0.1); call with E. Vonnegut regarding same (0.1).
Sorkin S	09/17/12	0.1	Call E. Ganchrow regarding flood insurance.
Teixeira MM	09/17/12	0.9	Update archive report of stock certificates and documents delivered to Citi in relation with DIP.
Vonnegut EJ	09/17/12	1.3	Discuss DIP opinion issues with local counsel and Davis Polk team.
Warner W	09/17/12	0.1	Review of issues presented by opinion requests of DIP lender
Chepiga TL	09/18/12	1.9	Calls and emails with R. Mead, D. Klein and others regarding sale contract and review of documents in connection with same (1.0); email with D. Klein and others regarding business services agreement (0.1); email with D. Klein and others regarding sales contract and review of documents in connection with same (0.8).
Immermann MC	09/18/12	0.1	Correspondence with R. Mead regarding share power.
Pak GY	09/18/12	0.3	Correspondences from Company, T. Chepiga, D. Klein and E. Vonnegut regarding coal sales contracts and posting collateral for insurance issues (0.2); correspondences from Company and Davis Polk team regarding Patriot stock power (0.1).
Resnick BM	09/18/12	0.5	Discuss coal sale party collateral requirements with D. Klein (0.2); emails regarding same (0.2); emails regarding Kramer Levin diligence request (0.1).
Sorkin S	09/18/12	0.1	Emails regarding flood insurance.
Vonnegut EJ	09/18/12	0.2	Emails regarding coal sale contracts and use of proceeds of DIP financing with D. Klein and T. Chepiga.
Warner W	09/18/12	0.2	Request by customer for cash collateral.
Chepiga TL	09/19/12	0.2	Calls with D. Klein regarding sales contracts.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Pak GY	09/19/12	0.4	Correspondences with E. Vonnegut and local counsels regarding corporate documents (0.2); call with local counsels regarding local counsels deadline (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/19/12	0.3	Meet with D. Klein regarding DIP and swap issues (0.2); emails regarding same (0.1).
Sorkin S	09/19/12	0.1	Emails regarding flood insurance.
Vonnegut EJ	09/19/12	0.5	Review revised LLC documents for Virginia and West Virginia and emails regarding same with local counsel.
Immermann MC	09/20/12	0.1	Correspondence with Weil regarding Private Bank Deposit Account Control Agreement.
Pak GY	09/20/12	1.0	Correspondences with local counsels regarding extension request (0.2); correspondences with T. Chepiga and call to Company with M. Immermann regarding inquiry (0.2); confer with B. Resnick regarding projections question (0.1); review of relevant provisions in DIP Credit Agreements and sent analysis to W. Warner (0.3); correspondences with Company and Weil regarding extension request (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/20/12	0.5	Emails regarding DIP covenants (0.2); call with W. Warner regarding same (0.2); call with M. Huebner regarding same (0.1).
Sorkin S	09/20/12	0.1	Emails regarding flood insurance.
Warner W	09/20/12	0.6	Review treatment of projections under credit agreement and related calls.
McGreal MM	09/21/12	0.3	Teleconference with B. Resnick and counsel to surety providers regarding diligence request.
McIntyre JP	09/21/12	0.1	Conference with S. Sorkin regarding status of flood request compliance.
Pak GY	09/21/12	0.2	Correspondences with T. Chepiga and Weil regarding extension of opinion deadline.
Resnick BM	09/21/12	0.1	Emails regarding opinion.
Sorkin S	09/21/12	0.1	Call with J. Linden.
Warner W	09/21/12	0.1	Email regarding extension opinions.
Chepiga TL	09/23/12	0.2	Emails with H. Baker and others regarding DIP compliance.
McIntyre JP	09/24/12	0.2	Correspondence regarding status of flood insurance coverage.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Pak GY	09/24/12	2.4	Correspondences from Davis Polk environmental, bankruptcy and credit team regarding environmental-related covenants (0.2); review of relevant provisions in the DIP credit agreement and the DIP pledge and security agreement (0.5); draft analysis for W. Warner's review (0.2); further correspondences with Davis Polk credit team on covenant analysis (0.2); correspondences from Company and Davis Polk bankruptcy team regarding bond trustee fees and review for relevant sections in DIP (0.2); correspondences from Company and Davis Polk team regarding mechanic's liens (0.2); review prior correspondences and relevant sections in DIP Credit Agreement regarding mechanics liens (0.2); review of correspondences, drafts by local counsel and relevant provisions in DIP Credit Agreement related to Potter Lease (0.2); call with Company regarding mechanic's liens (0.5).
Resnick BM	09/24/12	0.2	Calls with W. Warner regarding DIP and environmental issues.
Warner W	09/24/12	1.8	Review credit agreement regarding selenium settlement issues (1.0); related calls and emails (0.8).
Coco KJ	09/25/12	0.7	Review DIP budget and coordinate with Davis Polk team regarding same.
Pak GY	09/25/12	0.2	Correspondences with Company and Weil regarding Private Bank Deposit Account Control Agreement.
Resnick BM	09/25/12	0.3	Call with B. Gorton regarding surety diligence.
Chepiga TL	09/26/12	0.3	Emails and call with E. Vonnegut and others regarding leases.
Pak GY	09/26/12	1.6	Correspondence with Company regarding Private Bank Deposit Account Control Agreement amendment (0.1); correspondences with Davis Polk teams regarding Potter leases (0.2); correspondence with local counsel and T. Chepiga regarding status of local counsel opinion (0.2); correspondence to Weil on status of local counsel documents (0.2); review updates on Patriot bankruptcy and other related events (0.2); review of precedents and drafting of amendment for Private Bank Deposit Account Control Agreement (0.7).
Resnick BM	09/26/12	0.2	Emails with B. Gorton regarding surety diligence.
Vonnegut EJ	09/26/12	0.9	Discuss release of leased land and issues regarding same for financing with S. Gordon and Davis Polk team.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Chepiga TL	09/27/12	1.5	Review and analysis of loan documents in connection with lease question and multiple emails with E. Vonnegut and others regarding same.
McIntyre JP	09/27/12	0.5	Review file regarding status of flood insurance coverage (0.2); conference with R. Ramjas regarding status (0.3).
Pak GY	09/27/12	2.1	Correspondence from Weil on comments to Private Bank Deposit Account Control Agreement (0.1); revise Private Bank Deposit Account Control Agreement amendment with exhibits, prepare blackline and send to Weil for review (0.4); correspondences from Davis Polk bankruptcy team regarding filed credit documents on docket (0.1); review of relevant provisions in the DIP credit agreements and the pledge and security agreement regarding Potter Leases and draft analysis for Davis Polk team's review (1.1); correspondences with T. Chepiga and E. Vonnegut regarding Potter Leases (0.2); prepare signature page to Private Bank Deposit Account Control Agreement amendment and send to Company for execution (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/27/12	0.1	Emails regarding letters of credit.
Vonnegut EJ	09/27/12	0.5	Discuss partial lease terminations with S. Gordon and Davis Polk team.
Warner W	09/27/12	0.4	Review emails and documents (0.2); analyze request for lien releases for return of area not being mined to lessor (0.2).
McIntyre JP	09/28/12	0.7	Correspondence regarding flood insurance coverage and Citi contact (0.1); teleconferences with E. Moskovitz regarding FEMA guidelines (0.2); review FEMA guidelines (0.1); correspondence with R. Mead regarding compliance with FEMA guidelines (0.3).
Pak GY	09/28/12	0.7	Correspondence with N. Tsiouris regarding the DIP credit agreement (0.1); review updates on Patriot bankruptcy and related matters (0.2); correspondences with Weil regarding the Private Bank Deposit and Control Agreement Amendment (0.2); review signature pages received for Private Bank Deposit and Control Agreement Amendment (0.1); prepare executed copy of the Private Bank Deposit and Control Agreement (0.1).
Huebner MS	09/29/12	0.7	Review of DIP budget and email to K. Hiltz regarding same.
Total FINANCING		140.6	

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
GENERAL CASE ADMINISTRATION			
Eum JS	09/03/12	3.0	Update Key Cases and Other Cases binder in preparation for hearing as per R. Estacio.
Resnick BM	09/03/12	0.2	Emails with M. Huebner, D. Klein and others regarding various issues.
Schaible DS	09/03/12	0.7	Coordinate regarding case issues.
Coco KJ	09/04/12	3.5	Research and draft responses to U.S. Trustee issues with monthly operating report (1.7); draft and file notice on docket regarding video broadcasts, emails with court regarding same (0.6); coordinate service regarding same (0.4); coordinate changes to Patriot website (0.8).
Hait S	09/04/12	2.3	Pull and review monthly operating report precedents (1.0); save and organize rejection notices filed (0.3); review bar date motion precedents (1.0).
Huebner MS	09/04/12	0.6	Conversation with J. Bean regarding multiple matters.
Klein DS	09/04/12	1.2	Meet with B. Resnick and others regarding contract and claim workstream assignments and follow-up related to same (0.6); draft near term workstreams list for internal purposes (0.6).
Law EC	09/04/12	0.8	Route pleadings (0.6); communications with K. Satter regarding same (0.1); communications with M. Teixeira regarding Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs filing (0.1).
Libby A	09/04/12	0.7	Update case calendar.
McGreal MM	09/04/12	0.7	Teleconference with B. Resnick and D. Klein regarding claims and contracts assessment teams (0.4); correspondence with client regarding rescheduling 341 meeting (0.1); correspondence with K. Coco and A. Libby regarding case calendar (0.1); email Chambers order extending schedules deadline (0.1).
Satter KM	09/04/12	0.6	Draft notice of presentment and speak with K. Coco regarding the same.
Travers M	09/04/12	1.8	Read collective bargaining agreement memo (0.6); review successorship clauses in collective bargaining agreements (0.5); read environmental disclosure in Patriot '34 Act filings (0.7).
Coco KJ	09/05/12	2.5	Review responses to monthly operating report inquiries (0.9); file §341 notice and extension of schedules, coordinate service of same (0.7); review case calendar, respond to inquiries regarding same (0.6); coordinate scheduling (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klein DS	09/05/12	1.3	Review case information website and email to K. Coco regarding changes to same (0.4); coordinate with K. Coco regarding response to U.S. Trustee's requests for monthly operating reports (0.5); review precedents related to same (0.4).
Law EC	09/05/12	1.3	Route pleadings (0.4); numerous communications with J. Foust and M. Melvin regarding §341 meeting transcripts (0.5); communications with A. Libby regarding ECF logins (0.1); communications with B. Feldman, M. Teixeira, K. Stewart and M. Melvin regarding extension to filing Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs (0.3).
Libby A	09/05/12	2.2	Update case calendar (1.1); email with team leaders regarding same (0.5); revise notice of adjournment of §341 notice (0.4); file and serve same (0.2).
McGreal MM	09/05/12	1.7	Review and comment on notice of presentment of order extending schedules deadline (0.4); email D. Schaible regarding same (0.1); email client regarding same (0.1); correspondence with A. Rubenstein regarding NOL order (0.1); correspondence with B. Resnick and D. Klein regarding attendance at hearing and dialing in (0.1); correspondence with Chambers regarding GCG website and hearing agenda (0.2); correspondence with K. Coco regarding GCG website (0.1); email E. Moskowitz regarding logistics of hearing (0.1); correspondence with K. Coco and A. Libby regarding case calendar (0.1); review and revise calendar (0.4).
Melvin MM	09/05/12	2.3	Communications with J. Foust regarding obtaining precedent transcripts (0.1); obtain precedent motions to compel compliance for K. Coco (1.8); route incoming pleadings (0.2); review and distribute incoming mail (0.1); integrate originals into the main file (0.1).
Resnick BM	09/05/12	0.2	Review case calendar (0.1); emails regarding U.S. Trustee's comments to the monthly operating report (0.1).
Satter KM	09/05/12	1.8	Revise and file notice of presentment (1.6); emails and routing (0.2).
Schaible DS	09/05/12	0.6	Coordinate regarding the monthly operating report.
Coco KJ	09/06/12	0.9	Draft email responding to U.S. Trustee inquiries concerning monthly operating report.
Hait S	09/06/12	1.5	Turn Garden City Group comments to Bar Date motion (1.2); save proofs of claim to the system (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Huebner MS	09/06/12	1.7	Conversation with CEO regarding multiple matters (0.5); conversation with general counsel regarding multiple matters (0.3); bi-weekly senior management and advisor meeting (0.9).
Klein DS	09/06/12	0.6	Review R. Mead reporting chart and emails regarding same.
Krause SC	09/06/12	0.5	Call with J. Chincheck and M. McGreal regarding proposed ordinary course purchase.
Libby A	09/06/12	0.3	Update case calendar (0.2); review emails regarding Statements of Financial Affairs (0.1).
McGreal MM	09/06/12	1.8	Weekly all-hands update call (0.6); conference with M. Huebner, B. Resnick and D. Klein regarding case update (0.3); email R. Mead regarding reporting deadlines (0.2); correspondence with E. Law and M. Melvin regarding hearing binders (0.1); review hearing binders (0.1); teleconference with J. Chincheck and S. Krause regarding potential asset purchase (0.3); correspondence with AlixPartners regarding revised language for Global Notes (0.1); email clients notice of presentment of extension of schedules deadline (0.1).
Melvin MM	09/06/12	2.7	Continue to review various mega case dockets in the last three years to locate schedule extensions for A. Libby (1.0); update chart regarding same (0.3); assist with September 11th hearing binders assembly for Judge Chapman containing retention applications (1.0); communications with M. McGreal regarding same (0.1); prepare labels for same (0.1); obtain the U.S. Trustee Guidelines regarding the filing of monthly operating reports for K. Coco (0.1); communication with K. Coco regarding same (0.1).
Resnick BM	09/06/12	0.2	Meet with M. Huebner, M. McGreal and D. Klein.
Spence TM	09/06/12	0.8	Deliver documents to Judge Chapman at S.D.N.Y Bankruptcy Court for E. Law.
Klein DS	09/07/12	0.1	Call with R. Mead regarding reporting deadlines.
Libby A	09/07/12	0.4	Emails with Garden City Group regarding §341 notice previously sent to creditor matrix (0.2); discuss same with E. Ruiz (0.2).
McGreal MM	09/07/12	0.6	Teleconference with R. Mead and D. Klein regarding reporting requirements (0.2); teleconference with J. Jones, C. Ebetino, D. Klein and others regarding ordinary course transactions (0.4).
Resnick BM	09/07/12	0.2	Discuss various issues with M. McGreal and D. Klein.
Schaible DS	09/07/12	0.3	Case update.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Libby A	09/08/12	0.5	Update case calendar invites (0.2); review updated spreadsheet regarding deliverables in connection with same (0.3).
Schaible DS	09/09/12	0.6	Coordinate and emails and review materials regarding monthly operating report issues.
Coco KJ	09/10/12	0.5	Coordinate preparations for omnibus hearing.
Klein DS	09/10/12	0.1	Email R. Mead regarding US trustee comments to monthly operating report.
Law EC	09/10/12	2.8	Assemble and revise hearing binder.
Libby A	09/10/12	0.4	Update case calendar (0.1); email S. Krause regarding same (0.1); communications with M. McGreal regarding case status (0.2).
McGreal MM	09/10/12	0.2	Correspondence with Chambers regarding second extension of deadline to file schedules (0.1); teleconference with DOJ regarding claims settlement procedures (0.1).
Resnick BM	09/10/12	0.3	Discuss various case issues with M. McGreal, D. Klein and M. Huebner.
Spence TM	09/10/12	0.2	Obtain a Bankruptcy docket for J. Martin.
Tsiouris N	09/10/12	0.1	Follow-up with A. Libby regarding timing of Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs.
Halford EB	09/11/12	2.5	Citecheck tasks included: generate a manual table of authorities for the Objection Procedures Motion brief (1.5); bluebook and correct typographical error in the citations (0.5); quality check the pagination of the table of authorities (0.5).
Jacobs LE	09/11/12	1.0	A. Delaney inquiry regarding objections to 30(b)(6) notices for deposition and research regarding same; email regarding same.
Law EC	09/11/12	0.2	Communications with A. de Richemont and M. Teixeira regarding timing for filing of Schedules and SOFAs.
Libby A	09/11/12	0.3	Emails regarding Statements of Financial Affairs issues.
Tsiouris N	09/11/12	1.5	Emails with D. Klein regarding Global Notes (0.9); edit Global Notes per D. Klein comments (0.6).
Hoeben W	09/12/12	0.4	Call with J. Tucker and J. Orf.
Law EC	09/12/12	1.7	Assemble materials and plan for filing of Schedules and SOFAs (1.3); communications with A. de Richemont and M. Melvin regarding same (0.4).
Libby A	09/12/12	1.8	Update case calendar (1.4); emails with Davis Polk teams regarding same (0.4).
Satter KM	09/12/12	0.2	Review and route documents.
Aizen RM	09/13/12	0.2	Discussion with N. Tsiouris regarding schedule of claims.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Beshar SE	09/13/12	1.1	Review forward-looking statements (0.4); review Company policy (0.3); call with Company regarding same (0.4).
Coco KJ	09/13/12	2.2	Draft notices of extensions for adversary proceedings, emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6); calls and emails with Davis Polk team regarding monthly operating report issues (0.4); research regarding same (0.4); emails with Davis Polk and GCG regarding preparation of schedules (0.5); review and comment on case calendar (0.3).
Hait S	09/13/12	0.9	Highlight provisions in monthly operating report precedents for call with U.S. Trustee (0.6); discuss monthly operating report with K. Coco (0.3).
Huebner MS	09/13/12	2.1	Calls with CEO, deputy general counsel, general counsel regarding multiple pending matters (1.2); review and reply to multiple emails and routing incoming queries post- trial (0.9).
Klein DS	09/13/12	0.4	Discussions with N. Tsiouris and email D. Schaible regarding Schedules.
Law EC	09/13/12	0.5	Revise checklists for filing of Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs.
Libby A	09/13/12	4.4	Call with company and AlixPartners and N. Tsiouris regarding Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs (0.3); follow-up call with Alix Partners regarding same (0.3); call with GCG regarding logistics of filing Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs (0.8); call with Davis Polk employee benefits team regarding open issues regarding Statements of Financial Affairs and Schedules (0.3); call with GCG regarding changes to Schedules (0.3); call with J.Jones at company regarding liability disclosures on Schedules (0.3); research precedent regarding Statements of Financial Affairs issues (1.7); emails to N. Tsiouris regarding Statements of Financial Affairs and Schedules research (0.4).
McGreal MM	09/13/12	0.7	Correspondence with J. Martin, K. Coco and K. Satter re notice of adjournment of pretrial conference (0.2); review notice of adjournment (0.1); teleconference with Chambers re same (0.1); correspondence with N. Tsiouris re schedules (0.2); correspondence re case calendar with D. Klein and others (0.1).
Melvin MM	09/13/12	0.7	Save recently filed Notices of Appearance to the system (0.2); obtain docket updates (0.2); review and distribute incoming mail (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Satter KM	09/13/12	1.8	Route various documents (0.2); draft notice document (1.6).
Schaible DS	09/13/12	0.4	Emails regarding U.S. Trustee monthly operating report issues.
Schaible DS	09/13/12	1.8	Teleconferences regarding case strategy (0.4); meeting and client teleconferences regarding Statements of Financial Affairs (0.8); review materials review Statements of Financial Affairs (0.6).
Tsiouris N	09/13/12	5.7	Call with Patriot, Alix Partners and A. Libby regarding outstanding items for Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs (0.3); follow-up call with Alix Partners and A. Libby regarding same (0.3); call with GCG and A. Libby regarding logistics of filing Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs (0.8); call with R. Aizen, J. Lutrin and A. Libby regarding various disclosures on Schedules (0.3); call with GCG regarding changes to Schedules (0.3); call with Patriot and A. Libby regarding liability disclosures on Schedules (0.3); draft email to Patriot regarding changes to disclosures on Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs (0.4); discussion with D. Schaible regarding changes to Schedules (0.3); research precedent regarding various unsecured claims disclosures (2.7).
Coco KJ	09/14/12	1.3	Attend weekly update call (0.5); draft notice of extension of deadlines and emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); revise and review case management order and emails with Kramer Levin regarding same (0.5).
de Richemont P	09/14/12	0.1	Email about filing schedules and statements of financial affairs.
Hait S	09/14/12	1.1	Review Patriot monthly operating report (0.3); review bar date motion and proof of claim (0.4); save and organize proofs of claim (0.4).
Huebner MS	09/14/12	0.2	Conversation with F. Huffard regarding various strategic matters.
Klein DS	09/14/12	0.4	Emails/discussions with N. Tsiouris regarding Schedules.
Libby A	09/14/12	2.5	Analysis of Statements of Financial Affairs issues (0.8); research precedent regarding disclosure issues in connection with preparation of Statements of Financial Affairs and Schedules (1.1) meet with N. Tsiouris and M. McGreal regarding same (0.2); discuss same with N. Tsiouris (0.2); emails with M. McGreal regarding same (0.1); emails regarding service issues with C. Robertson (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	09/14/12	2.9	Update call with Company and advisors (0.9); update call with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's counsel, D. Schaible and others (0.9); email A. Starr regarding an assumption of liabilities (0.1); correspondence with N. Tsiouris and A. Libby regarding schedules (0.6); correspondence with Blackstone regarding the UCC data room (0.1); correspondence with J. Martin and K. Satter regarding adjournment of Tampa pretrial conference (0.1); review same (0.1); correspondence with Chambers regarding omnibus and adjourned dates (0.1).
Melvin MM	09/14/12	2.5	Obtain docket updates (0.3); route incoming pleadings (0.4); prepare and send a "welcome" package to all those that recently filed a Notice of Appearance (1.0); post-hearing clean-up (0.8).
Resnick BM	09/14/12	0.7	Weekly update call.
Satter KM	09/14/12	3.5	File, draft and route various documents.
Schaible DS	09/14/12	1.5	Coordinate regarding monthly operating report issues (0.3); update call with clients (0.3); coordinate regarding cutbacks (0.4); teleconferences and coordinate regarding Statements of Financial Affairs (0.5).
Travers M	09/14/12	0.7	Conflicts check regarding new contract rejection motion (0.2); prepare for asset discussion with Patriot management (0.5).
Tsiouris N	09/14/12	6.0	Discussions with M. McGreal and A.Libby regarding outstanding items on Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs (0.8); follow up precedent research regarding same (2.1); discussions with R. Aizen, J. Lutrin and A. Libby regarding benefits and pension liabilities on Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs (0.9); follow up communications with A. Libby regarding same (0.7); follow up communications with Alix Partners regarding changes to Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs (0.9); draft email to Patriot regarding status and open items related to of Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs (0.3); communications with D. Klein and D. Schaible regarding email (0.3).
Volano T	09/14/12	0.8	Assist with post-hearing clean up of materials.
Aizen RM	09/15/12	0.1	Emails with N. Tsiouris regarding pension trust.
Tsiouris N	09/15/12	0.5	Call with Alix Partners regarding changes to Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs.
Schaible DS	09/16/12	0.3	Emails regarding monthly operating report issues.
Brenner J	09/17/12	0.5	Research certain policies of companies in bankruptcy.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Coco KJ	09/17/12	2.9	Review calendar (0.3); coordinate calls with Committee (0.2); coordinate update calls with clients (0.2); coordinate filing of Statements of Financial Affairs and Schedules (0.3); gather notice information for upcoming pleadings to be filed (1.0); call with clients regarding monthly operating reports, follow-up regarding same (0.9).
de Richemont P	09/17/12	0.7	Coordinate filing of Schedules and Statements of financial affairs (0.6); email about same (0.1).
Klein DS	09/17/12	3.1	Coordinate with N. Tsiouris and others regarding Schedules.
Libby A	09/17/12	2.0	Communications with N. Tsiouris regarding schedules (0.4); research issues regarding schedules (1.4); meet with D. Klein and M. McGreal regarding schedules (0.2).
McGreal MM	09/17/12	1.2	Review and comment on adversary proceeding adjournment notices (0.2); correspondence with K. Satter regarding same (0.1); email the Department of Justice regarding venue hearing transcripts (0.1); correspondence with D. Klein, N. Tsiouris and others regarding schedules (0.6); conference with K. Coco regarding bar date order (0.2).
Melvin MM	09/17/12	1.1	Obtain docket updates (0.3); integrate originals into the main file (0.5); route incoming pleadings for adversary proceedings (0.3).
Satter KM	09/17/12	0.8	Draft and file notices of adjournment.
Tsiouris N	09/17/12	5.6	Calls with Alix Partners regarding changes to unsecured claims on Schedules (0.8); calls with GCG regarding same (0.8); edit Global Notes to account for recent changes (1.1); discussions with M. McGreal, D. Klein and A. Libby regarding same (0.9); draft email to R. Aixen regarding same (0.4); review final set of Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs in preparation for filing (1.6).
Beshar SE	09/18/12	0.6	Communications with J. Bean regarding benefits issues (0.4); follow up with team regarding same (0.2).
de Richemont P	09/18/12	0.6	Coordinate filing of schedules and statements of financial affairs.
Downer CA	09/18/12	3.3	Assemble Joinder Affidavit Binder, as per K. Williams.
Huebner MS	09/18/12	1.6	Review, route and reply to emails on various topics (1.4); Davis Polk emails regarding various employee topics (0.2).
Klein DS	09/18/12	0.2	Emails with N. Tsiouris and others regarding Schedules.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Law EC	09/18/12	0.4	Prepare logistics and planning for filing of schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs (0.3); communications with A. de Richemont regarding same (0.1).
Libby A	09/18/12	3.0	Call with D. Klein and N. Tsiouris regarding Schedules (0.2); read emails regarding same (0.3); modify calendar invites (0.1); communications with C. Robertson regarding filing fee statements (0.2); research regarding multi-employer pension plans (2.2).
McGreal MM	09/18/12	1.8	Correspondence with Chambers regarding pretrial conferences (0.1); correspondence with J. Martin and K. Satter regarding same (0.1); review and comment on notice of adjournment (0.1); correspondence with D. Klein, N. Tsiouris and others regarding schedules (0.7); review and comment on global notes (0.4); correspondence with J. Martin, D. Klein and others regarding motion to extend time to remove actions (0.3); correspondence with Kramer Levin regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee update call (0.1).
McGreal MM	09/18/12	0.2	Conference with K. Coco regarding the bar date order and exclusivity motion.
Melvin MM	09/18/12	0.3	Route incoming pleadings.
Resnick BM	09/18/12	0.3	Discuss issues regarding coal sale agreements with D. Klein.
Satter KM	09/18/12	1.6	Draft and file various adjournments (1.4); route various documents (0.2).
Tsiouris N	09/18/12	2.9	Email Alix Partners regarding Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs listings (0.2); email R. Aizen and J. Lapitskaya regarding documents for Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs (0.6); revise Global Notes based on changes to Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs (1.1); emails with M. McGreal regarding same (0.6); emails with Alix Partners regarding same (0.4).
Beshar SE	09/19/12	0.7	Various emails with Company and team regarding management changes.
Brown PG	09/19/12	5.0	Prepare binder of all Peabody agreements as per A. Mehes.
Coco KJ	09/19/12	1.8	Coordinate service of multiple filings with GCG (1.2); review and make comments on company website and discuss issues regarding same with GCG (0.6).
de Richemont P	09/19/12	7.3	Coordinate filing of schedules and statements of financial affairs (4.4); file same (2.7); email about same (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Feldman BL	09/19/12	2.5	File Schedules and Statements for the Patriot Coal bankruptcy.
Hait S	09/19/12	5.3	File Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs (2.5); draft motion to extend removal deadline (2.5); meet with M. McGreal regarding motion to extend removal deadline (0.3).
Klein DS	09/19/12	0.1	Comment on case management order.
Lane EM	09/19/12	1.5	Pull documents for Elyse Glazer.
Law EC	09/19/12	12.9	Coordinate filing of Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs (2.5); assemble and update preparatory materials and electronic files regarding same (4.5); adjust planning regarding logistics and preparations regarding same (1.2); numerous communications with A. de Richemont, M. Melvin, C. Barrett, C. Wytenus, M. Teixeira and Computer Support regarding preparations for same (1.8); conduct training session regarding schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs filing with C. Barrett and C. Wytenus (1.4); prepare training materials regarding same (1.2); update of notes and materials post-filing (0.2); communications with M. McGreal and M. Melvin regarding bridge orders (0.1).
Libby A	09/19/12	1.9	Update case calendar (1.5); email Davis Polk teams regarding same (0.4).
McGreal MM	09/19/12	2.4	Conferences with S. Hait regarding motion to extend time to remove actions (0.3); review and comment on same (0.5); correspondence with Chambers regarding scheduling of same (0.1); review precedent bridge orders (0.3); correspondence with A. Starr regarding adjourning equity committee motion (0.1); correspondence with D. Klein, N. Tsiouris, A. de Richemont and others regarding filing schedules (0.7); review and comment on case calendar (0.3); correspondence with A. Libby regarding same (0.1).
Melvin MM	09/19/12	0.7	Obtain docket updates (0.4); route incoming pleadings (0.3).
Moskowitz E	09/19/12	0.4	Email correspondence with team regarding overall status and work streams.
Resnick BM	09/19/12	0.2	Emails regarding Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs.
Schaible DS	09/19/12	0.9	Emails regarding rejections issues (0.5); review news issues (0.4).
Stewart KS	09/19/12	4.3	Assist with the filing of Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Teixeira MM	09/19/12	5.4	Assist with the filing of Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs.
Tsiouris N	09/19/12	5.7	Emails with Alix Partners and GCG regarding logistics of filing Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs (1.1); revise Global Notes (0.4); email M. McGreal regarding revised Global Notes (0.4); review precedent Schedules regarding unsecured claims (1.4); review final Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs (2.4).
Wytenus CJ	09/19/12	5.2	Assisted in the electronic filing of schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs for A. de Richemont.
Zhu B	09/19/12	0.5	Review calendar report (0.3); correspond with A. Libby and A. Mehes regarding calendar updates for adversary proceedings (0.2).
Coco KJ	09/20/12	1.3	Revise email regarding monthly operating report issues and emails with Davis Polk regarding same (0.6); review case calendar and calendar invites (0.4); review and comment on Patriot case website and emails with GCG regarding same (0.3).
de Richemont P	09/20/12	1.5	Coordinate document production, records management, dissemination and service of schedules and statements of financial affairs.
Hait S	09/20/12	2.0	Update bar date motion (1.3); revise motion to extend removal deadline (0.7).
Halford EB	09/20/12	1.5	Citecheck task included: generating a manual table of authorities for the Massey 12(c) brief draft.
Huebner MS	09/20/12	2.5	Calls with CEO and general counsel regarding multiple pending matters (1.8); weekly senior leadership call with CEO, K. Hiltz, F. Huffard and B. Resnick regarding workstreams (0.7).
Klein DS	09/20/12	0.1	Emails with clients regarding monthly operating report.
Law EC	09/20/12	0.2	Review communications regarding filing and processing of Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs.
Libby A	09/20/12	0.9	Update calendar.
McClammy JI	09/20/12	0.7	Follow-up regarding joinder affidavit needs (0.3); review joinder correspondence (0.4).
McGreal MM	09/20/12	1.7	Correspondence with Blackstone, Kramer Levin and others re copies of schedules (0.2); correspondence re case calendar (0.2); correspondence re all hands update call (0.1); review bar date motion (0.6); correspondence re same with B. Resnick, K. Coco and others (0.3); correspondence with Weil re September 24 hearing (0.1); correspondence with B. Resnick and others re motion to extend time to remove actions (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Melvin MM	09/20/12	0.8	Obtain docket updates (0.3); route incoming pleadings (0.3); review and distribute incoming mail (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/20/12	3.7	Review bar date motion (1.0); call with I. Engelhardt, F. Huffard, K. Hiltz and M. Huebner regarding various priorities (1.4); follow-up tasks from same (0.8); call with M. Levitt regarding Chartis insurance (0.2); email to clients regarding same (0.1); review Peabody letter (0.1); emails regarding same (0.1).
Tsiouris N	09/20/12	0.3	Email M. McGreal regarding final Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs document (0.1); discussions with A. de Richemont (0.2).
Coco KJ	09/21/12	3.6	Coordinate regarding Schedules and Statements of Financial Affairs issues (0.9); coordinate regarding changes to Patriot website (0.2); review draft monthly operating report and emails with clients regarding same (1.2); review case calendar (0.2); general update call and prepare for same (1.1).
de Richemont P	09/21/12	0.4	Email and calls about schedules and statements of financial affairs (0.3); email about petitions (0.1).
Halford EB	09/21/12	1.0	Generate a manual table of authorities for the Massey 12(c) brief revised draft (0.4); quality check the table of authorities for missing citations and pagination (0.3); minor bluebooking of two citations (0.3).
Huebner MS	09/21/12	1.9	Weekly senior advisors call regarding all pending workstreams (1.0); conversations with CEO and general counsel regarding various matters (0.9).
Klein DS	09/21/12	0.7	Update call with clients.
Krause SC	09/21/12	1.5	Review website updates and emails regarding same.
Law EC	09/21/12	0.2	Review various communications regarding litigation and fee application filings.
Libby A	09/21/12	0.6	Update case calendar and outlook invites.
McGreal MM	09/21/12	1.4	Correspondence with B. Resnick, K. Coco and others regarding bar date order (0.4); revise same (0.2); update call with Company and advisors (0.7); correspondence re case calendar (0.1).
Melvin MM	09/21/12	0.7	Obtain docket updates (0.3); route incoming pleadings (0.4).
Meyer DP	09/21/12	1.9	Review email correspondence/documents regarding asset deposition.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick BM	09/21/12	2.1	Meet with M. McGreal regarding bar date motion and various issues (0.5); call with A. Rogoff and T. Mayer regarding various issues (0.2); weekly update call with clients (0.8); calls with M. Levitt (0.4); review workers comp motion regarding same (0.2).
Schaible DS	09/21/12	1.6	Status conference call (0.7); coordinate regarding monthly operating report issues (0.5); email regarding U.S. Trustee's monthly operating report questions (0.4).
McGreal MM	09/22/12	1.8	Review and summarize UCC's comments to claims settlement procedures order.
Resnick BM	09/22/12	0.8	Review Kramer Levin's comments to claims settlement procedures motion.
de Richemont P	09/23/12	0.1	Email about extension motions.
Beshar SE	09/24/12	1.6	Review Form 8-K, lawsuit issues (0.7); review documents in connection with management change (0.9).
Brenner J	09/24/12	0.6	Review new website content.
Coco KJ	09/24/12	1.2	Review and revise monthly operating report (0.6); coordinate regarding filing/service of same (0.6).
Eum JS	09/24/12	1.7	Prepare courtesy copies of Massey Notice of Motion and Memorandum of Law as per B. Zhu.
Hait S	09/24/12	1.0	File August monthly operating report (0.3); save and organize proofs of claims (0.7).
Huebner MS	09/24/12	0.4	Call with CEO regarding multiple pending matters.
Law EC	09/24/12	1.1	Route pleadings (0.2); review recent filings (0.4); docket precedent research regarding Horizon Natural Resources (0.3); communications with A. Libby and M. Melvin regarding same (0.2).
McGreal MM	09/24/12	0.9	Correspondence with Kramer Levin regarding Massey pretrial conference (0.1); conference with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments to claims settlement procedures (0.8).
Melvin MM	09/24/12	0.4	Route pleadings (0.2); review and distribute incoming mail (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/24/12	1.3	Call with M. Levitt regarding Chartis insurance issues (0.2); call with R. Mead regarding same and other issues (0.3); review Kramer Levin markup to claims settlement procedures motion (0.3); meet with M. McGreal and K. Coco regarding same (0.5).
Jacobs LE	09/25/12	0.2	Email regarding calculating time to amend complaint and answer to amendment.
Law EC	09/25/12	0.3	Update pleadings files (0.2); review filings (0.1).
McGreal MM	09/25/12	0.2	Correspondence with A. Starr regarding insurance policies.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick BM	09/25/12	0.4	Calls with M. Huebner and M. McGreal regarding various issues.
Beshar SE	09/26/12	0.8	Communications with Company and team regarding various disclosure issues.
Coco KJ	09/26/12	1.7	Review and comment on case calendar (0.6); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.1); call with GCG regarding bar date and proof of claim issues, follow-up regarding same (0.7); coordinate conference calls with Creditors' Committee counsel (0.3).
Eum JS	09/26/12	0.3	Coordinate circulation of cases cited in a bankruptcy memo for integration and executory contract issues as per R. Estacio.
Huber BM	09/26/12	1.9	Summarize Horizon bankruptcy documents.
Libby A	09/26/12	1.3	Update case calendar and emails with project teams regarding same.
McGreal MM	09/26/12	0.9	Teleconference with A. Starr regarding insurance policies (0.1); correspondence with Weil regarding claims settlement procedures objection and bar date order (0.1); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.1); correspondence with D. Klein regarding transcript request (0.1); review the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments to bar date order (0.3); correspondence with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding same (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/26/12	1.2	Review Kramer Levin comments to Bar Date Order (0.3); emails regarding same (0.3); emails with K. Coco and M. Huebner regarding updating business plan (0.4); call with M. McGreal regarding various issues (0.2).
Travers M	09/26/12	0.3	Review United Mine Workers Association bankruptcy frequently asked questions.
Zhu B	09/26/12	0.4	Correspond with A. Libby and A. Mehes regarding calendaring deadlines for adversary proceedings (0.2); review various correspondence with J. Martin and opposing counsel regarding same (0.2).
Beshar SE	09/27/12	0.7	Communications with General Counsel regarding various disclosures.
Coco KJ	09/27/12	0.8	Coordinate filing of pleadings (0.4); coordinate service (0.3); review calendar (0.1).
Hait S	09/27/12	1.6	Prepare and file bar date motion (1.0); prepare and file motion to extend removal deadline (0.6).
Huebner MS	09/27/12	0.2	Internal conversations regarding inquiry from Chambers.
Law EC	09/27/12	0.4	Route pleadings (0.3); communications with M. McGreal regarding revisions to routing lists (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Libby A	09/27/12	1.0	Update case calendar and emails with K. Coco regarding same (0.6); update outlook invites (0.4).
McGreal MM	09/27/12	2.4	Email Chambers regarding notice of no objection to notice of rejection of equipment leases (0.2); correspondence with D. Schaible and A. Starr regarding adjournment of Equity Committee motion (0.1); teleconference with T. Mayer, B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding bar date order (0.5); review Willkie's comments to bar date order (0.3); correspondence with Willkie regarding same (0.2); correspondence with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding revisions to bar date order (0.6); review and comment on revised bar date order and cover email to Clerk's office (0.5).
Schaible DS	09/27/12	0.3	Teleconferences from court and follow-up regarding case issues.
Travers M	09/27/12	1.4	Review union agreements forwarded by J. Jones.
Beshar SE	09/28/12	0.7	Call with Company regarding employee letter (0.4); follow up with team regarding same (0.3).
Coco KJ	09/28/12	0.8	Review calendar (0.2); review docket and news articles (0.3); coordinate meetings (0.3).
Klein DS	09/28/12	0.3	Coordinate with M. McGreal regarding expedited relief provisions under case management order.
Law EC	09/28/12	0.5	Route pleadings (0.4); call with R. Ramjas regarding obtaining latest version of DIP credit agreement (0.1).
Libby A	09/28/12	0.4	Update case calendar and outlook invites.
McGreal MM	09/28/12	0.2	Correspondence with N. Tsiouris regarding scheduled employee claims.
Melvin MM	09/28/12	0.1	Integrate original pleadings into the main file.
Resnick BM	09/28/12	0.2	Call with B. Gorton regarding surety issues.
Tsiouris N	09/28/12	0.6	Communications with M. McGreal regarding listing of certain unsecured liabilities on Schedules and Statments of Financial Affairs (0.2); emails with AlixPartners regarding same (0.2); review of Schedules to confirm listings of same (0.2).
Total GENERAL CASE ADMINISTRATION		275.5	
GOVERNANCE COMMUNICATIONS			
Haase KL	09/06/12	0.5	Review formation of Patriot Coal entities (0.3); emails relating to the same (0.2).
Schaible DS	09/06/12	0.4	Disclosure issues.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Williams KC	09/10/12	0.9	Review 10-Q and record for environmental liability claims.
Krause SC	09/13/12	0.4	Review disclosure in press release (0.3); emails regarding same (0.1).
Beshar SE	09/17/12	0.8	Multiple calls and emails with Company regarding corporate governance issues.
Huebner MS	09/19/12	2.3	Attend Board Meeting (telephonically).
Resnick BM	09/22/12	0.2	Emails regarding management changes.
Krause SC	09/24/12	0.4	Review website and emails regarding same.
Resnick BM	09/24/12	0.2	Review and revise 8-K.
Starr AT	09/24/12	0.2	Calls and emails with D. Klein and M. Freitag regarding press inquiries.
Brenner J	09/25/12	2.5	Review and comment on employee letter and website materials; discuss same with W. Hoeben; coordinate Davis Polk comments.
Krause SC	09/25/12	1.2	Emails and calls regarding website (0.2); edits to same (1.0).
Brenner J	09/26/12	0.3	Coordinate 10-Q comments among groups.
Hoeben W	09/26/12	1.0	Call with J. Wubker regarding Form 10-Q (0.3); review website disclosure (0.5); review legend employee presentation (0.2).
Krause SC	09/26/12	0.7	Review edits to website (0.2); 10-Q review (0.5).
Resnick BM	09/26/12	0.1	Emails regarding 10-Q.
Brenner J	09/27/12	0.6	Coordinate Davis Polk comments to employee letter.
Krause SC	09/27/12	1.2	Review and edit 10-Q (1.0); emails regarding same (0.2).
Krause SC	09/28/12	1.0	Confer regarding 10-Q with B. Resnick, J. Brenner (0.3); revise same (0.5); review blackline of same (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/28/12	1.6	Review draft 10-Q (1.3); discuss same with S. Krause (0.3).
Starr AT	09/28/12	0.5	Emails and calls regarding disclosure question with W. Hoeben.
Turner AE	09/28/12	1.8	Review draft 10-Q.
Samet L	09/30/12	0.2	Review draft form 10-Q.
Total GOVERNANCE COMMUNICATIONS		19.0	
NON-DPW RETENTION			
Klein DS	09/04/12	0.1	Email J. Jones regarding professionals reporting.
Krause SC	09/04/12	0.6	Call with J. Jones regarding paying professionals (0.1); follow-up regarding paying professionals (0.5).
Ibrahim A	09/05/12	0.3	Correspondence with retained firms regarding retention hearings.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klein DS	09/05/12	0.4	Call and email with J. Martin regarding professional's retention and review pleadings related to same.
Krause SC	09/05/12	0.3	Confer regarding retention applications.
McGreal MM	09/05/12	0.1	Correspondence with S. Krause regarding special counsel retentions.
Krause SC	09/06/12	0.6	Emails regarding §327(e) applications (0.3); prepare proposed orders (0.3).
Martin RL	09/06/12	0.8	Create final Word versions of the proposed orders for the retention of special counsel (0.7); call with S. Krause regarding finalizing orders (0.1).
McGreal MM	09/06/12	0.3	Correspondence with Chambers regarding hearing binders and special counsel retention orders (0.2); email Blackstone regarding retention order (0.1).
Ibrahim A	09/07/12	0.3	Correspondence with professionals regarding retention hearings (0.2); correspondence with R. Martin regarding same (0.1).
de Richemont P	09/08/12	0.1	Email about ordinary course professional retention.
Krause SC	09/10/12	1.1	Emails regarding §327(e) retentions (0.3); review §327(e) orders (0.2); review professionals' retentions (0.4); emails regarding same (0.2).
Martin RL	09/10/12	0.5	Review §327(e) retention orders entered and forward same to the relevant professionals (0.3); call with M. Buschmann at Blackstone regarding parties in interest (0.1); compose email to S. Krause regarding call with M. Buschmann (0.1).
McGreal MM	09/10/12	0.2	Correspondence with S. Krause and others regarding special counsel retentions.
Robertson C	09/10/12	1.0	Review mark-ups of Unsecured Creditor's Committee professionals' engagement letters and retention orders (0.7); emails to S. Krause regarding same (0.3).
Krause SC	09/11/12	0.3	Email with M. Buschmann at Blackstone regarding disclosures (0.1); calls regarding same (0.2).
Krause SC	09/12/12	0.1	Call M. Buschmann at Blackstone regarding disclosures.
Krause SC	09/13/12	0.2	Call M. Buschmann at Blackstone regarding disclosures (0.1); emails with J. Jones, J. Bean regarding ordinary course professionals and parties in interest (0.1).
de Richemont P	09/14/12	0.3	Email and research about ordinary course professional retention.
Krause SC	09/14/12	1.2	Confer with M. Buschmann regarding disclosures (0.2); confer with D. Scabile regarding same (0.1); confer with R. Aizen regarding same (0.3); emails regarding same (0.6).
Krause SC	09/14/12	0.4	Emails regarding invoices from Steptoe.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Resnick BM	09/14/12	0.2	Call with S. Krause regarding Blackstone.
Ruiz EL	09/14/12	0.2	Emails to A. de Richemont and S. Krause regarding ordinary course professional issues.
Resnick BM	09/16/12	0.2	Call with M. Buschmann regarding disclosure.
de Richemont P	09/17/12	0.1	Email about ordinary course professional retention.
Tsiouris N	09/17/12	0.4	Draft email to professionals with filing instructions (0.2); draft email to Foley & Lardner answering a question regarding the filing of the Foley fee statement (0.2).
de Richemont P	09/18/12	0.1	Email about professionals' monthly fee statements.
Ibrahim A	09/18/12	0.3	Discussion with S. Krause regarding fee statements for retained professionals.
Krause SC	09/18/12	1.0	Call with Steptoe regarding fee application (0.4); emails regarding fee applications (0.4); confer with A. Ibrahim, C. Robertson regarding same (0.2).
Robertson C	09/18/12	1.7	Emails with P. Buenger regarding Curtis monthly fee statement (0.3); discuss same with N. Tsiouris (0.4); file same (0.7); coordinate service of same (0.3).
Tsiouris N	09/18/12	0.2	Email Curtis Mallet regarding July fee statement (0.1); call with Curties Mallet regarding same (0.1).
Krause SC	09/19/12	0.7	Call with Jackson Kelly regarding scope of retention (0.3); review Steptoe fee application (0.2); conference regarding same with C. Robertson (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/19/12	0.2	Correspondence with S. Krause regarding Jackson Kelly retention.
Robertson C	09/19/12	1.1	Call from M. Graham to discuss Steptoe and Johnson fee statement (0.1); review statement (0.4); emails regarding same with N. Tsiouris (0.2); email to M. Graham regarding monthly fee statement (0.4).
Tsiouris N	09/19/12	0.4	Review Steptoe and Johnson fee statement (0.3); email to C. Robertson regarding same (0.1).
Krause SC	09/20/12	0.6	Call with Jackson Kelly regarding scope of retention (0.2); conference with B. Resnick regarding same (0.2); emails with B. Martin regarding same (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/20/12	0.3	Meetings and calls with S. Krause regarding Jackson Kelly supplemental retention application.
Ibrahim A	09/21/12	0.4	Call with client regarding services of a retained professional (0.2); discuss issue with S. Krause (0.2).
Klein DS	09/21/12	0.1	Email C. Robertson regarding Jackson Kelly invoice.
Robertson C	09/21/12	0.6	File fee statements for retained professionals and arrange for service of same.
Tsiouris N	09/21/12	0.1	Review emails with professionals regarding filing instructions.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Klein DS	09/24/12	0.2	Emails with R. Mead and E. Vonnegut regarding bond trustee fees.
Krause SC	09/24/12	0.4	Confer with E. Waller regarding Steptoe invoices (0.1); confer with E. Waller regarding Jackson Kelly supplement (0.1); emails with J. Jones, E. Waller regarding invoices (0.1); confer with A. Ibrahim regarding same (0.1).
Ibrahim A	09/25/12	0.3	Discussion with S. Krause regarding supplemental applications for retained professionals.
Klein DS	09/25/12	0.1	Email R. Mead regarding estimated fees.
Krause SC	09/25/12	0.4	Calls regarding supplemental declarations and applications.
Ibrahim A	09/26/12	0.3	Call with S. Krause to discuss Jackson Kelly retention issues.
Krause SC	09/26/12	0.2	Calls regarding supplemental declarations and applications.
Schaible DS	09/26/12	0.6	Emails regarding counsel selection.
Tsiouris N	09/26/12	0.6	Review of Steptoe & Johnson fee statement (0.4); review of order for service parties (0.1); email with A. de Rlichemont re same (0.1).
de Rlichemont P	09/27/12	0.4	Review and file AP Services staffing report (0.3); coordinate service of same (0.1).
Ibrahim A	09/27/12	0.8	Meeting with S. Krause to discuss supplemental application of Jackson Kelly.
Krause SC	09/27/12	0.1	Emails regarding AlixPartners and Chief Restructuring Officer filing.
Tsiouris N	09/27/12	1.4	Review AP Services staffing report (0.4); communications with A. de Rlichemont regarding filing (0.2); communications with S. Krause regarding same (0.1); review of docket for professional fee statement filings for purposes of follow-up (0.7).
Ibrahim A	09/28/12	5.1	Correspondence with B. Dobbs at Jackson Kelly (0.2); call with S. Krause regarding Jackson Kelly retention (0.3); review supplemental retention precedents (0.9); draft new Jackson Kelly retention application (3.1); create blacklines (0.2); review same (0.1); meeting with S. Krause regarding same (0.3).
Krause SC	09/28/12	0.2	Confer with A. Ibrahim regarding supplemental disclosure for Jackson Kelly.
Resnick BM	09/28/12	0.1	Call with M. Levitt (Chartis) regarding counsel payments.
Resnick BM	09/30/12	0.1	Emails with J. Bean regarding St. Louis counsel.
Total NON-DPW RETENTION		29.4	

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
NON-WORKING TRAVEL			
Huebner MS	09/04/12	3.4	Non-working travel to St. Louis.
Lane EM	09/04/12	0.5	Travel to the S.D.N.Y. Bankruptcy Court to deliver courtesy copies of documents.
Moskowitz E	09/04/12	6.3	Travel from New York to St. Louis for client meetings.
Huebner MS	09/05/12	2.1	Non-working travel home to New York.
Moskowitz E	09/05/12	5.3	Travel from St. Louis to New York.
Spence TM	09/05/12	0.8	Hand deliver a letter with exhibits to Judge Chapman's Chambers and the U.S. Trustee for M. McGreal.
Foust JT	09/11/12	0.6	Travel to and from courthouse.
Law EC	09/11/12	1.1	Travel between Court and Firm for hearing.
McGreal MM	09/11/12	0.8	Travel to and from hearing.
Moody, Jr. GM	09/11/12	0.8	Travel to and from bankruptcy court for hearing.
Samet L	09/11/12	0.8	Travel to and from venue hearing.
Schaible DS	09/11/12	0.5	Travel to court.
Stewart KS	09/11/12	1.2	Travel to and from Court for 9/11/2012 hearing.
Travers M	09/11/12	4.1	Travel to New York for reorganization structural planning meetings.
Foust JT	09/12/12	0.6	Travel to and from courthouse.
McGreal MM	09/12/12	0.8	Travel to and from venue hearing.
Samet L	09/12/12	0.8	Travel to and from venue hearing.
Stewart KS	09/12/12	1.1	Travel to and from court for 9/12/12 hearing.
Travers M	09/13/12	4.5	Travel from New York to San Francisco.
Spence TM	09/24/12	0.8	Hand deliver documents to the U.S. Trustee and courtesy copies to the Judge and others.
Martin JD	09/25/12	0.9	Travel to and from court for Massey pretrial conference.
Total NON-WORKING TRAVEL		37.8	
PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT			
Huebner MS	09/21/12	0.7	Conversations with CEO, lenders' counsel, Blackstone regarding business plan issues.
de Richemont P	09/25/12	2.8	Research, draft and revise motion regarding exclusivity period.
Schaible DS	09/26/12	0.8	Emails regarding emergence planning.
Total PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT		4.3	
REGULATORY AND ENVIRONMENTAL			
Coco KJ	09/04/12	0.2	Email with company regarding Virginia tax department.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Foust JT	09/04/12	3.7	Draft analysis of treatment of environmental obligations in bankruptcy.
Foust JT	09/04/12	4.2	Draft analysis of treatment of indemnification claims in bankruptcy.
Huber BM	09/04/12	2.0	Meeting with H. Baker and A. Turner regarding environmental matters (1.5); review revised AVS memo by Jackson Kelly (0.5).
McGreal MM	09/04/12	0.3	Review research on indemnification of environmental obligations related to selenium issues.
Rubenstein A	09/04/12	0.5	Emails regarding NOL motion changes (0.1); review NOL motion (0.2); correspondence with K. Constantine regarding NOL motion (0.2).
Turner AE	09/04/12	4.3	Meet with H. Baker and B. Huber regarding status of various client issues (1.1); email correspondence regarding 9019 motion (0.1); update indemnity analysis notes (0.6); revise internal workstreams document (0.2); discuss indemnity analysis notes with H. Baker; B. Huber (0.2); email correspondence with J. Eagan regarding lease (0.2); email regarding review of AVS memo from Jackson Kelly (0.1); draft email explanations from last week (0.1); prepare for meeting with B. Huber and H. Baker (0.4); send update emails from last week to H. Baker (0.5); review AVS memo from Jackson Kelly (0.8).
Baker HS	09/05/12	1.3	Call with D. McCallister regarding selenium litigation (0.2); meeting with A. Turner regarding status and workstreams (0.2); review of AVS memo and call with B. Gardner regarding same (0.9).
Ferrell KL	09/05/12	0.5	Follow up with T. Mayer of Kramer Levin and A. Rubenstein regarding NOL order.
Foust JT	09/05/12	3.2	Draft analysis of environmental issues relating to indemnity agreements.
Huber BM	09/05/12	0.8	Emails regarding permit block memo (0.2); claim analysis (0.6).
McGreal MM	09/05/12	2.4	Review and revise motion to approve selenium settlement.
Rubenstein A	09/05/12	1.6	Prepare emails regarding NOL order (0.4); discuss email regarding NOL order with M. McGreal (0.1); send revised order to counsel for other parties (0.2); discuss NOL order with K. Ferrell (0.1); revise NOL order (0.6); discuss NOL motion with counsel for indenture trustees (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Turner AE	09/05/12	4.5	Review case calendar (0.1); prepare for call with B. Gardner (0.2); review AVS memo and discuss same with H. Baker (0.8); read cases related to selenium claim (0.6); email correspondence with J. Eagan regarding lease (0.2); email regarding case calendar (0.1); prepare packet of materials with notes for H. Baker regarding selenium claim (1.5); review B. Huber emails regarding selenium claim (0.4); call with B. Gardner of Jackson Kelly regarding AVS memo and related issues (0.6).
Baker HS	09/06/12	4.0	Review of indemnity documents (2.5); preparation of 8-K (1.5).
McGreal MM	09/06/12	0.2	Teleconference with H. Baker and A. Turner regarding filing motions in West Virginia District Court (0.1); correspondence with A. Rubenstein regarding NOL order (0.1).
Rubenstein A	09/06/12	0.6	Prepare NOL order for filing (0.4); discuss same with M. McGreal (0.1); discuss interim order with K. Coco (0.1).
Turner AE	09/06/12	4.1	Review J. Foust email regarding indemnity claim legal research (0.4); discuss legal research regarding indemnities for claim with H. Baker (0.2); meet with H. Baker regarding documents (0.5); legal research regarding indemnities for claim (1.1); weekly update call with client and others (0.9); review revised selenium settlement documents (0.8); send J. Foust emails with information for 9019 motion (0.2).
Baker HS	09/07/12	6.5	Review of indemnity materials (1.9); review of selenium litigation materials (1.6); research regarding indemnification (1.2); meeting with A. Turner regarding indemnification (0.6); review of Illinois litigation (0.3); meeting regarding Illinois litigation (0.4); review of court filings (0.5).
Beshar SE	09/07/12	0.4	Multiple emails with Company and team regarding tax issues.
Ferrell KL	09/07/12	0.4	Email to T. Chepiga regarding gift/return of shares.
McGreal MM	09/07/12	0.5	Correspondence with H. Baker regarding selenium motion (0.4); email A. Turner Huffard Declaration (0.1).
Rubenstein A	09/07/12	0.1	Review material regarding return of shares.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Turner AE	09/07/12	4.2	Legal research regarding survival of indemnities for indemnity claim, including discussing same with H. Baker (2.7); look up information regarding People v. Heritage Coal (0.2); send email regarding the Huffard declaration (0.1); email correspondence regarding selenium agreement (0.1); draft email regarding indemnity provisions in 2005 PSA, assignment agreement, lease agreements (0.5); discuss email correspondence regarding selenium agreement with H. Baker (0.1); email information regarding People v. Heritage Coal (0.3); locate email regarding the Huffard declaration (0.2).
McGreal MM	09/09/12	0.3	Correspondence with H. Baker and J. Foust regarding selenium settlement discussions.
Baker HS	09/10/12	6.6	Correspondence regarding selenium litigation with D. McCallister (1.1); review of selenium litigation documents (3.1); research regarding reclamation liabilities (1.9); correspondence with T. Chepiga regarding Credit Agreement (0.5).
Brenner J	09/10/12	0.8	Assist bankruptcy team with research and wording to describe notes indenture.
McGreal MM	09/10/12	1.0	Revise selenium 9019 motion (0.6); correspondence with B. Resnick, H. Baker and D. Klein regarding brief and memo of law on extending compliance deadlines (0.4).
Resnick BM	09/10/12	1.2	Discuss environmental filing with J. Bean (0.1); review same (0.8); discuss same with H. Baker and M. McGreal (0.3).
Rubenstein A	09/10/12	0.1	Discuss NOL motion with T. Matlock.
Turner AE	09/10/12	3.6	Review precedent documents (1.5); review Hobet and Patriot motion (0.8); telephone T. Chepiga regarding Letters of Credit (0.1); discuss matter with H. Baker (0.3); review T. Chepiga email regarding the Hobet Letter of Credit (0.2); discuss Letters of Credit with H. Baker (0.2); review personal liability research (0.5).
Baker HS	09/11/12	8.6	Review of selenium documents and correspondence with D. McCallister regarding same (3.6); correspondence with M. Treavers regarding same (0.7); research of precedent asset purchase agreements (4.3).
Resnick BM	09/11/12	0.6	Emails regarding selenium and environmental filings (0.1); review motion for briefing schedule (0.1); review permit blocking memo (0.2); review motion to modify orders (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Turner AE	09/11/12	2.0	Review motion for expedited hearing (0.4); discuss asset sales issues with H. Baker (0.1); discuss selenium call with H. Baker (0.1); email correspondence regarding MSHA (0.1); review email regarding selenium issues (0.2); call with D. McCallister and A. Schlesinger regarding selenium negotiations (0.6); prepare for selenium call with Blackstone and D. McCallister (0.2); email correspondence regarding selenium (0.1); order precedent docket documents (0.2).
Baker HS	09/12/12	3.3	Review of selenium proceedings (1.3); correspondence with D. McCallister regarding selenium proceedings (0.8); meeting with A. Starr and J. Martin regarding indemnity litigation and prepare for same (1.2).
Brenner J	09/12/12	0.3	Coordinate with bankruptcy to review forward-looking statements.
Resnick BM	09/12/12	1.7	Discuss selenium issue with D. Klein (0.3); research regarding automatic stay issues relevant to selenium (1.4).
Turner AE	09/12/12	4.7	Email correspondence regarding Magnum PSA (0.1); review calendar (0.2); revise calendar (0.2); review draft memo of law to modify selenium compliance deadlines (0.9); organize call with E. Waller and Blackstone regarding MSHA issues (0.2); telephone R. Verheij with H. Baker and D. Klein (0.2); prepare for meeting with A. Starr, J. Martin and H. Baker regarding Magnum PSA (1.2); discuss A.Starr and J. Martin meeting with H. Baker (0.1); review precedent (0.6); meet with A. Starr, J. Martin and H. Baker regarding Magnum PSA (0.7); email correspondence regarding applicability of stay (0.3).
Baker HS	09/13/12	10.9	Correspondence with Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel regarding selenium litigation and related follow-up (1.9); correspondence with Wilkie Farr regarding selenium litigation (0.8); meeting with M. Huebner, B. Resnick regarding selenium proceedings (1.9); correspondence with D. McCallister regarding selenium proceedings (1.9); correspondence with Jackson Kelly and Arnold and Porter regarding selenium proceedings (0.8); review of precedent asset sales (2.1); call with E. Waller regarding MSHA (0.6); review of workstreams chart (0.9).
Brenner J	09/13/12	1.3	Review and comment on forward-looking statements (1.2); coordinate with bankruptcy team on same (0.1).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Dashman NJ	09/13/12	0.2	Correspond with A. Turner regarding environmental consent decrees.
Foust JT	09/13/12	2.7	Draft stipulation regarding modification of automatic stay.
Foust JT	09/13/12	0.4	Team meeting to discuss environmental research projects.
Huebner MS	09/13/12	2.4	Two sets of detailed environmental calls regarding way forward on selenium (1.5); late night conference call and multiple emails regarding committee suggestions on environmental litigations (0.9).
McGreal MM	09/13/12	9.1	Legal research on automatic stay (3.4); conferences with B. Resnick, D. Klein and K. Coco regarding same (1.7); conferences with M. Huebner, H. Baker and others regarding update on selenium proceedings (0.9); conference with R. Estacio, J. Foust and others regarding selenium lift stay motion and stipulation (0.4); email selenium background information to team (0.2); teleconference with counsel to DIP lenders, B. Resnick and others regarding update on selenium action (0.5); teleconference with counsel to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee, B. Resnick and others regarding update on selenium action (0.7); follow up call with B. Resnick, H. Baker and others regarding next steps (0.7); review draft pleadings to be filed in West Virginia District Court (0.6).
Resnick BM	09/13/12	6.1	Call with Davis Polk team to prepare for call with clients and co-counsel (0.2); call with clients regarding selenium (0.5); meetings with Davis Polk team regarding selenium strategy (2.3); call with Weil and Willkie regarding same (0.5); call with Kramer Levin regarding same (0.8); call with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); emails regarding same (1.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Turner AE	09/13/12	8.2	Call with E. Waller and Blackstone regarding MSHA (0.4); look into outcomes of approaches to West Virginia consent decrees (3.7); call with D. McCallister and R. Verheij regarding West Virginia District Court motions (0.5); prepare for call with E. Waller and Blackstone regarding MSHA (0.2); discuss research regarding West Virginia District Court motions with H. Baker (0.8); debrief with Davis Polk team (0.2); discuss outcomes of approaches to West Virginia consent decrees with H. Baker (0.1); meet with M. Huebner, B. Resnick, D. Klein, M. McGreal and H. Baker regarding selenium consent decrees (1.2); call with D. McCallister, Arnold and Porter, Jackson Kelly and Davis Polk team regarding environmental consent decrees (0.8); draft emails regarding outcomes of approaches to West Virginia consent decrees (0.3).
Baker HS	09/14/12	8.7	Conference with B. Resnick, D. Klein, M. McGreal regarding selenium litigation (3.2); review of related pleadings (5.2); review of workstreams chart (0.3).
Foust JT	09/14/12	2.6	Team meeting to discuss environmental obligations research (0.4); research environmental obligations (2.2).
Huebner MS	09/14/12	0.6	Emails and Davis Polk call regarding selenium issues and approach.
Libby A	09/14/12	0.9	Meet with K.Coco regarding selenium automatic stay research (0.3); read background material regarding Sonnax factors for automatic stay research (0.6).
McGreal MM	09/14/12	4.4	Teleconference with local counsel, B. Resnick and others regarding selenium proceedings (0.9); teleconference with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's counsel, B. Resnick and others regarding West Virginia selenium proceedings (1.4); conferences with D. Klein, K. Coco and others regarding research relating to selenium proceedings (0.8); conferences with B. Resnick and D. Klein regarding West Virginia selenium proceedings and related court filings (1.3).
Resnick BM	09/14/12	7.3	Calls with clients, Jackson Kelly and Arnold and Porter regarding selenium litigation (1.8); calls with Kramer Levin regarding same (1.5); call with J. Smolinsky regarding same (0.2); meetings with Davis Polk team regarding same (2.5); calls with M. Huebner regarding same (0.3); emails regarding same (1.0).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Turner AE	09/14/12	4.4	Review email correspondence regarding selenium litigation (0.2); call with Arnold and Porter, Jackson Kelly, Davis Polk regarding West Virginia District Court consent decree motions and debrief with H. Baker, B. Resnick, D. Klein, M. Huebner and M. McGreal (1.0); weekly update call with client and others (0.7); review draft motion and memorandum of law (1.1); send consent decree and order to team (0.1); call with Kramer Levin, Arnold and Porter, Jackson Kelly and Davis Polk regarding West Virginia District Court consent decree motions (1.3).
Baker HS	09/15/12	0.7	Correspondence regarding selenium litigation (0.3); related research (0.4).
Libby A	09/15/12	7.6	Research regarding automatic stay (5.4); research regarding Sonnax factors (2.2).
McGreal MM	09/15/12	1.8	Review Hobet orders and consent decree (0.2); correspondence with H. Baker and D. Klein regarding same (0.2); review talking points for Judge Chambers conference (0.3); draft rider to West Virginia District Court brief (0.9); correspondence regarding same with B. Resnick and D. Klein (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/15/12	2.8	Review and revise lift stay motion regarding OVEC (2.2); review Jackson Kelly introduction and talking points (0.3); emails with D. Klein and M. McGreal regarding same (0.3).
Turner AE	09/15/12	0.5	Email correspondence regarding motions.
Baker HS	09/16/12	4.4	Review of selenium pleadings (1.8); review of selenium obligations (2.6).
McGreal MM	09/16/12	1.1	Correspondence with M. King regarding permit blocking (0.2); review research regarding same (0.2); review and comment on talking points for Judge Chambers' conference (0.4); teleconference with B. Resnick, H. Baker, Jackson Kelly and others regarding conference with Judge Chambers (0.3).
Resnick BM	09/16/12	4.4	Review permit blocking memo (0.4); review and revise motions for relief from automatic stay (2.0); review and revise talking points for Jackson Kelly (0.4); call with Jackson Kelly (0.3); emails with various parties regarding lift stay motions (0.9); review and revise talking points for Monday hearing (0.4).
Turner AE	09/16/12	1.0	Review draft motions to delay.
Baker HS	09/17/12	0.4	Correspondence with B. McLusky regarding selenium litigation.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
McGreal MM	09/17/12	0.4	Teleconference with B. Resnick, H. Baker, Jackson Kelly and others regarding teleconference with Judge Chambers (0.2); email regarding same to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's counsel and DIP counsel (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/17/12	1.7	Prepare for potential court hearing (1.4); emails regarding J. Chambers conference (0.1); call with co-counsel and clients regarding same (0.2).
Schaible DS	09/17/12	0.6	Teleconferences and review materials regarding employee claim letter.
Turner AE	09/17/12	1.7	Review draft motions to lift stay (0.7); meet with Davis Polk team regarding West Virginia District Court hearing (0.3); review consent decree provisions for M. Travers with H. Baker (0.7).
Huber BM	09/18/12	1.6	Consider selenium consent decree amendment negotiations (0.5); consider coal bankruptcy precedents (0.9); conference with H. Baker regarding a claim (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/18/12	0.4	Review research regarding environmental issues.
Baker HS	09/19/12	2.1	Research regarding selenium litigation.
Baker HS	09/19/12	1.9	Preparation of selenium litigation presentation.
Brenner J	09/19/12	0.2	Discuss filings with W. Hoeben.
Huber BM	09/19/12	7.5	Telephone conference with M. Travers, B. Resnick and H. Baker regarding environmental issues (0.5); review precedent docket for environmental issues (7.0).
Huebner MS	09/19/12	0.5	Meetings and emails re environmental issues and proposed lift-stay approach.
McGreal MM	09/19/12	2.8	Teleconference with M. Travers, B. Resnick, H. Baker and others regarding environmental issues (0.3); summarize research on various issues relating to the selenium proceedings (1.9); conference with M. Huebner, B. Resnick and H. Baker regarding same (0.6).
Meyer DP	09/19/12	2.2	Call regarding environmental liabilities (partial) (0.4); review law regarding environmental claims (1.8).
Resnick BM	09/19/12	3.8	Review research regarding environmental stay issues (1.8); meetings with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8); review Jackson Kelly presentation (0.3); emails regarding same and other environmental issues (0.9).
Travers M	09/19/12	0.5	Telephone call with H. Baker and B. Moy regarding environmental liabilities and permit issues.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Turner AE	09/19/12	4.1	Draft talking points for selenium considerations powerpoint presentation (2.1); meet with M. Huebner, B. Resnick, H. Baker and M. McGreal regarding environmental and selenium issues (0.6); review M. McGreal research regarding various selenium litigation issues (0.3); email correspondence and discussions regarding permitting at client (0.2); meet with B. Resnick, H. Baker and M. McGreal regarding environmental and selenium issues (0.1); review precedent docket and pull documents (0.8).
Baker HS	09/20/12	3.9	Preparation of selenium litigation presentation (3.5); correspondence regarding same (0.4).
Huber BM	09/20/12	1.1	Review precedent plan documents.
McGreal MM	09/20/12	0.7	Review and comment on presentation on environmental issues (0.6); correspondence with B. Resnick and H. Baker re same (0.1).
Resnick BM	09/20/12	1.3	Review comments to environmental presentation (0.3); call with H. Baker regarding same (0.5); review research regarding environmental issues (0.5).
Turner AE	09/20/12	1.5	Email correspondence (0.1); review selenium slide deck and discuss same with H. Baker (1.0); review revised lift stay motion (0.3); email correspondence regarding status call (0.1).
Baker HS	09/21/12	1.6	Prepare selenium presentation (1.1); correspondence regarding same (0.5).
Coco KJ	09/21/12	0.9	Call with B. Resnick and others regarding the selenium presentation to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee.
Huber BM	09/21/12	0.7	Review emails regarding status.
Huebner MS	09/21/12	1.4	Calls with B. Hatfield and Davis Polk regarding selenium issues and possible pathways.
McGreal MM	09/21/12	1.6	Teleconference with Company, Jackson Kelly, B. Resnick and others regarding presentation on environmental proceedings (1.1); conference with B. Resnick, D. Klein, K. Coco and others regarding preparation for call with Kramer Levin on same (0.2); review talking points on same for call with Kramer Levin (0.3).
Resnick BM	09/21/12	2.8	Review and revise presentation (0.5); review research regarding environmental and stay issues (1.3); call with Kramer Levin regarding lift stay motion (0.2); call with clients, Jackson Kelly and Arnold Porter to prepare for call with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.8).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Turner AE	09/21/12	2.7	Selenium call to prepare for the Unsecured Creditors' Committee meeting with Arnold & Porter, Jackson Kelly and Davis Polk (0.9); review requested documents from Horizon Natural Resources Docket (0.2); review selenium presentation (0.3); review selenium talking points prior to selenium call (0.2); prepare follow-up email notes following weekly update call (0.2); weekly update call with client, Blackstone, Davis Polk and J. Frank (0.7); discuss weekly update call with B. Huber (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/22/12	0.8	Draft talking points for the Unsecured Creditors' Committee presentation.
Baker HS	09/23/12	0.8	Correspondence regarding Credit Agreement (0.2); review of same (0.6).
Huebner MS	09/23/12	0.6	Environmental call with internal counsel regarding possible selenium settlement issues.
Resnick BM	09/23/12	2.6	Call with D. McCallister, R. Verheij, M. Huebner and H. Baker regarding WV proceeding (0.6); follow-up call with H. Baker (0.3); prepare for presentation to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (1.5); review revised Jackson Kelly presentation (0.2).
Baker HS	09/24/12	7.2	Call with Kramer Levin regarding selenium litigation (1.1); prepare for same (2.7); review of web content (0.6); review of Credit Agreement (1.8); correspondence with D. McCallister regarding asset sales (0.4); review of workstreams chart (0.6).
Coco KJ	09/24/12	1.0	Call with Kramer Levin regarding selenium issues.
Huebner MS	09/24/12	1.3	Call with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's advisors regarding environmental issues and preparation for same.
McGreal MM	09/24/12	1.5	Teleconference with Kramer Levin, M. Huebner and others regarding West Virginia environmental proceedings (1.3); conference with M. Huebner, B. Resnick and others regarding same (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/24/12	3.8	Call with A. Rogoff to prepare for the Unsecured Creditors' Committee call (0.2); review deck, research and prepare for the Unsecured Creditors' Committee call (1.6); meeting with M. Huebner and others to prepare for call with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.2); call with Kramer Levin regarding West Virginia litigation issues (1.2); call with M. Huebner regarding same (0.1); review Kramer Levin's comments to lift stay motion (0.5).
Schaible DS	09/24/12	0.5	Emails and coordinate regarding claims motion.

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Turner AE	09/24/12	3.7	Discuss selenium issues with H. Baker (0.1); review materials in advance of call with Kramer Levin (1.2); call with Kramer Levin and client regarding selenium issues (1.5); review email correspondence regarding DIP facility (0.3); discuss selenium negotiations with H. Baker (0.1); review selenium slides following Kramer Levin call (0.4); call A. McCallister and R. Verheijh following Kramer Levin call (0.1).
Baker HS	09/25/12	7.6	Call with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (1.2); review of selenium proceeding materials (3.5); review of public relations material (0.5); preparation of selenium presentation (2.4).
Coco KJ	09/25/12	0.9	Attend call regarding selenium issues with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee.
Huebner MS	09/25/12	1.7	Conference call with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding environmental issues (0.8); follow up calls with Kramer Levin, Willkie Farr, Weil Gotshal regarding same (0.6); conversation with CEO regarding same (0.3).
McGreal MM	09/25/12	1.8	Teleconference with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee, Kramer Levin, M. Huebner and others regarding environmental proceedings (0.9); teleconference with DIP lenders' counsel, M. Huebner and others regarding West Virginia environmental proceedings (0.4); teleconference with D. McAllister, B. Resnick and others regarding same (0.3); teleconference with M. Huebner and B. Resnick regarding follow up on same (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/25/12	4.9	Review presentation and prepare for the Unsecured Creditors' Committee call (0.5);. call with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding West Virginia orders (1.2); follow-up call with M. Huebner and T. Mayer (0.5) calls with M. Huebner to discuss negotiations regarding orders (0.5); calls with D. McCallister and R. Verheij regarding same (0.4); calls with Weil and Willkie regarding same (0.5); emails regarding same (0.4); review revised motion to lift automatic stay (0.6); call with M. McGreal regarding same (0.3).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Turner AE	09/25/12	2.5	Prepare for a call with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding selenium issues (0.4); review draft lift stay motion (0.4); review selenium slide presentation (0.3); call with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding selenium issues (1.2); discuss selenium issues with H. Baker and B. Resnick prior to a call with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.2).
Baker HS	09/26/12	2.8	Review of selenium proceeding materials (2.3); review of Lift stay motion (0.5).
Huebner MS	09/26/12	0.2	Emails regarding the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's comments and position regarding selenium issues.
McGreal MM	09/26/12	0.5	Review draft settlement agreement (0.3); correspondence with B. Resnick and H. Baker re same (0.2).
Resnick BM	09/26/12	2.7	Emails regarding lift stay motion (0.9); review comments to same (0.9); review settlement agreement (0.4); call with H. Baker and M. McGreal regarding same and negotiations (0.3); emails regarding same (0.2).
Schaible DS	09/26/12	0.8	Emails regarding bar date order.
Turner AE	09/26/12	1.6	Review new draft settlement agreement (1.1); review matter calendar (0.2); email correspondence (0.1); review new draft lift stay motion (0.2).
Baker HS	09/27/12	6.2	Review of selenium proceeding materials (1.8); review of lift stay motion (0.8); research regarding selenium proceedings (2.5); research regarding selenium issues (1.1).
Huebner MS	09/27/12	2.0	Draft language regarding selenium negotiations (0.6); calls with internal lawyers, B. Resnick, M. McGreal and D. McAllister regarding environmental issues (1.4).
McGreal MM	09/27/12	1.4	Review and comment on provisions of draft selenium settlement agreement (0.3); conference with M. Huebner and B. Resnick regarding same (0.3); teleconference with D. McAllister and B. Resnick regarding settlement discussions (0.2); teleconferences with J. Jones, D. McAllister, M. Huebner and B. Resnick regarding settlement discussions (0.6).
Resnick BM	09/27/12	2.8	Review comments to lift stay motion (0.7); review and revise lift stay motion (0.6); call with M. Freitag regarding same (0.2); calls with D. McAllister regarding same and negotiations (0.4); meetings with M. Huebner and M. McGreal regarding same (0.5); call with J. Smolinsky regarding same (0.2); call with A. Alfonso regarding same (0.2).

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Turner AE	09/27/12	3.5	Review Hobet selenium complaint (0.3); case law research and reading regarding selenium issues (3.2).
Baker HS	09/28/12	2.4	Correspondence with D. McCallister regarding litigation (0.3); legal research (1.2); review of selenium litigation materials (0.9).
Brenner J	09/28/12	0.4	Review employee letter.
Coco KJ	09/28/12	2.1	Revise lift stay motion (0.8); file same (0.4); emails with Davis Polk regarding same (0.3); coordinate service regarding same (0.6).
Huebner MS	09/28/12	1.6	Review of selenium lift stay motion, conversations with internal team regarding same and comments of other parties (1.0); conversations and emails internally regarding response of environmental plaintiffs (0.6).
Resnick BM	09/28/12	2.2	Finalize lift stay motion (1.8); call with D. McCallister regarding same and negotiations (0.2); call with J. Smolinsky regarding same (0.2).
Schaible DS	09/28/12	0.4	Emails regarding bar date issues.
Turner AE	09/28/12	3.1	Case law research regarding liability under the Clean Water Act.
McGreal MM	09/29/12	2.1	Legal research regarding administrative proceedings (1.7); email summary of same to H. Baker (0.4).
McGreal MM	09/30/12	0.1	Correspondence with H. Baker regarding lift stay research.
Resnick BM	09/30/12	0.1	Emails with A. McCallister regarding settlement negotiations.
Total REGULATORY AND ENVIRONMENTAL		314.6	
SECURITIES CLASS ACTION			
Huebner MS	09/26/12	1.0	Emails regarding class action.
Lynch C	09/26/12	0.8	Review insurance contracts (0.3); meet with A. Starr to discuss, analyze same (0.5).
Starr AT	09/26/12	3.0	Revise and finalize letter to Peabody regarding indemnification (0.4); calls and emails regarding counsel issues (0.9); review insurance policies (0.4); meet with C. Lynch regarding the same (0.5); analyze securities complaint (0.8)
Starr AT	09/27/12	2.1	Calls and emails regarding securities class action with B. Resnick, M. Huebner, J. Bean, J. Martin and D. Schaible.
Starr AT	09/28/12	1.1	Calls and emails regarding securities case against individual defendants.
Total SECURITIES CLASS ACTION		8.0	

Time Detail By Project

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Narrative
Total		3,574.9	