

BOWLES RICE LLP
600 Quarrier Street (25301)
Post Office Box 1386
Charleston, West Virginia 25325-1386
Telephone: (304) 347-1100
Facsimile: (304) 343-3058
Julia A. Chincheck
Mark B. D'Antoni
Daniel J. Cohn

*Special Counsel for the Debtors
and Debtors in Possession*

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF MISSOURI
EASTERN DIVISION**

In re:

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION, et al.,

Debtors.¹

**Chapter 11
Case No. 12-51502-659
(Jointly Administered)**

**NINTH FEE STATEMENT OF BOWLES RICE LLP FOR
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AND DISBURSEMENTS FOR THE PERIOD OF
APRIL 1, 2013 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2013**

NAME OF APPLICANT:	Bowles Rice LLP
ROLE IN THE CASE:	Special Counsel to the Debtors and Debtors-in-Possession
TIME PERIOD:	April 1, 2013 through and including April 30, 2013
CURRENT APPLICATION:	Total Fees Requested: \$ 56,755.20 80% of Fees Requested: \$ 45,404.16 Total Expenses Requested: \$ 2,854.78

¹ The Debtors are the entities listed on Schedule 1 attached hereto. The employer tax identification numbers and addresses for each of the Debtors are set forth in the Debtors' chapter 11 petitions.

PRIOR APPLICATIONS:

First Interim Application of Bowles Rice LLP for Allowance of Compensation filed November 16, 2012; Order entered December 19, 2012.

Second Interim Application of Bowles Rice LLP for Allowance of Compensation filed April 15, 2013; Order entered May 24, 2013.

1. On July 9, 2012 (the "Petition Date"), Patriot Coal Corporation and substantially all of its affiliated subsidiary companies ("Debtors") filed voluntary petitions for Chapter 11 Relief. [ECF No. 1]. Debtors' cases are being jointly administered by order of this Court. [ECF No. 30].

2. Prior to the Petition Date, Bowles Rice LLP ("Bowles Rice") rendered substantial legal services to Debtors in a wide range of areas. Debtors have retained Bowles Rice – with authorization by the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of New York pursuant to its *Order Authorizing the Employment and Retention of Bowles Rice McDavid Graff & Love LLP as Special Counsel for the Debtors Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date*, dated September 10, 2012 [ECF No. 539] (the "Bowles Rice Employment Order") – *nunc pro tunc* from the Petition Date to continue to render professional services (collectively, the "Authorized Representation"):

(a) to provide advice, representation and preparation of necessary documentation and to make all necessary filings regarding (i) coal and other property acquisitions, financings and other transactions and (ii) regulatory requirements involving coal properties and operations;

(b) to defend and provide advice, representation and the preparation of necessary documentation regarding various litigation matters, including Federal Black Lung, mining safety matters and bankruptcy matters where the Debtors are creditors of the bankrupt party or parties in interest in the bankruptcy case; and

(c) to provide advice, representation and the preparation of necessary documentation regarding issues under local and state law relating to corporate and commercial matters.

3. In accordance with the Bowles Rice Employment Order and the *Order to Establish Procedures for Interim Monthly Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals* [ECF No. 262] (the “Interim Compensation Order”) (the terms of which are incorporated herein), Bowles Rice, as special counsel to the Debtors, hereby submits its Ninth Fee Statement for Professional Services and Disbursements (the “Fee Statement”) for the period from April 1, 2013 through and including April 30, 2013 (the “Fee Statement Period”).

4. Bowles Rice holds no retainer in this case.

5. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Bowles Rice seeks payment of \$48,258.94 representing (i) 80% of Bowles Rice’s fees for services rendered and (ii) 100% of actual and necessary expenses incurred by, paid by, or invoiced to Bowles Rice during the Fee Statement Period. As of the date of this Fee Statement, Bowles Rice has not been paid for the services and expenses included herein.

6. Attached hereto as Exhibit A is a listing of Bowles Rice’s professionals and paraprofessionals (collectively the “Bowles Rice Professional(s)”) that rendered services for Debtors as authorized by the Bowles Rice Employment Order during the Fee Statement Period. Exhibit A includes, among other things, the total hours billed, hourly rate and total fees for each Bowles Rice Professional, plus a blended hourly rate for each category of Bowles Rice Professionals, excluding paralegals.

7. Attached hereto as Exhibit B is a schedule summarizing the categories of actual and necessary expenses for which Bowles Rice is seeking reimbursement and the total amount for each such expense category for the Fee Statement Period.

8. Attached hereto as Exhibit C is a summary of the number of hours and amounts billed by Bowles Rice during the Fee Statement Period for services authorized by the Bowles Rice Employment Order during the Fee Statement Period, organized by project type authorized by said Order. These services include all services that were typically rendered in the ordinary course or were being provided to Debtors before the Petition Date, but only as specifically authorized by the Bowles Rice Employment Order in connection with the Authorized Representation.

9. Attached hereto as Exhibit D are the time records of Bowles Rice, which provide the contemporaneous record summaries of the time spent by each Bowles Rice Professional during the Fee Statement Period by project category.

10. The undersigned certifying professional hereby certifies and represents: (i) that she has read this Fee Statement; (ii) that to the best of her knowledge, information and belief formed after reasonable inquiry, the fees and disbursements requested herein fall within this Court's guidelines and those of the United States Trustee; (iii) that the fees and disbursements sought herein are billed at rates in accordance with Bowles Rice's customary practices and generally accepted by its clients; and (iv) that in providing reimbursable services, Bowles Rice does not make a profit on the services.

Notice

11. Consistent with the procedures described in the Interim Compensation Order and this Court's local rules, the Debtors will serve this Fee Statement, by hand or overnight delivery, on: (i) the Debtors, Patriot Coal Corporation, 12312 Olive Boulevard, Suite 400, St. Louis, Missouri, 63141, Attn: Jacquelyn A. Jones, Esq.; (ii) attorneys for the Debtors, Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP, 450 Lexington Avenue, New York, New York 10017, Attn: Marshall S. Huebner, Esq., and Brian M. Resnick, Esq.; (iii) the Office of the United States Trustee for the Eastern District of Missouri, 111 South 10th Street, Suite 6353, St. Louis, MO 63102, Attn: Leonora S. Long, Esq., and Paul A. Randolph, Esq.; (iv) attorneys for the administrative agent for the Debtors' postpetition lenders, (a) Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP, 767 Fifth Avenue, New York, New York 10153, Attn: Marcia Goldstein, Esq., and Joseph Smolinsky, Esq., and (b) Willkie Farr & Gallagher LLP, 787 Seventh Avenue, New York, New York 10019, Attn: Margot B. Schonholtz, Esq., and Ana Alfonso, Esq.; and (v) counsel to the official committee of unsecured creditors, Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP, 1177 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10036, Attn: Adam C. Rogoff, Esq., and Gregory G. Plotko, Esq.

WHEREFORE, Bowles Rice respectfully requests that the Court grant the relief requested herein and such other and further relief as is just and proper.

DATED: May 30, 2013.

Respectfully submitted,

BOWLES RICE LLP

/s/ Julia A. Chincheck

Julia A. Chincheck (WV Bar No. 718)
Mark B. D'Antoni (WV Bar No. 4646)
Daniel J. Cohn (WV Bar No. 11916)
BOWLES RICE LLP
600 Quarrier Street (25301)
Post Office Box 1386
Charleston, West Virginia 25325-1386
Telephone: (304) 347-1100
Facsimile: (304) 343-3058

*Special Counsel to Debtors and
Debtors in Possession*

SCHEDULE 1
(Debtor Entities)

1. Affinity Mining Company
2. Apogee Coal Company, LLC
3. Appalachia Mine Services, LLC
4. Beaver Dam Coal Company, LLC
5. Big Eagle, LLC
6. Big Eagle Rail, LLC
7. Black Stallion Coal Company, LLC
8. Black Walnut Coal Company
9. Bluegrass Mine Services, LLC
10. Brook Trout Coal, LLC
11. Catenary Coal Company, LLC
12. Central States Coal Reserves of Kentucky, LLC
13. Charles Coal Company, LLC
14. Cleaton Coal Company
15. Coal Clean LLC
16. Coal Properties, LLC
17. Coal Reserve Holding Limited Liability Company No. 2
18. Colony Bay Coal Company
19. Cook Mountain Coal Company, LLC
20. Corydon Resources LLC
21. Coventry Mining Services, LLC
22. Coyote Coal Company LLC
23. Cub Branch Coal Company LLC
24. Dakota LLC
25. Day LLC
26. Dixon Mining Company, LLC
27. Dodge Hill Holding JV, LLC
28. Dodge Hill Mining Company, LLC
29. Dodge Hill of Kentucky, LLC
30. EACC Camps, Inc.
31. Eastern Associated Coal, LLC
32. Eastern Coal Company, LLC
33. Eastern Royalty, LLC
34. Emerald Processing, L.L.C.
35. Gateway Eagle Coal Company, LLC
36. Grand Eagle Mining, LLC
37. Heritage Coal Company LLC
38. Highland Mining Company, LLC
39. Hillside Mining Company
40. Hobet Mining, LLC
41. Indian Hill Company LLC
42. Infinity Coal Sales, LLC
43. Interior Holdings, LLC
44. IO Coal LLC
45. Jarrell's Branch Coal Company
46. Jupiter Holdings LLC
47. Kanawha Eagle Coal, LLC
48. Kanawha River Ventures I, LLC
49. Kanawha River Ventures II, LLC
50. Kanawha River Ventures III, LLC
51. KE Ventures, LLC
52. Little Creek LLC
53. Logan Fork Coal Company
54. Magnum Coal Company LLC
55. Magnum Coal Sales LLC
56. Martinka Coal Company, LLC
57. Midland Trail Energy LLC
58. Midwest Coal Resources II, LLC
59. Mountain View Coal Company, LLC
60. New Trout Coal Holdings II, LLC
61. Newtown Energy , Inc.
62. North Page Coal Corp.
63. Ohio County Coal Company, LLC
64. Panther LLC
65. Patriot Beaver Dam Holdings, LLC
66. Patriot Coal Company, L.P.
67. Patriot Coal Corporation
68. Patriot Coal Sales LLC
69. Patriot Coal Services LLC
70. Patriot Leasing Company LLC
71. Patriot Midwest Holdings, LLC
72. Patriot Reserve Holdings, LLC
73. Patriot Trading LLC
74. PCX Enterprises, Inc.
75. Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC
76. Pond Creek Land Resources, LLC
77. Pond Fork Processing LLC
78. Remington Holdings LLC
79. Remington II LLC
80. Remington LLC
81. Rivers Edge Mining, Inc.
82. Robin Land Company, LLC
83. Sentry Mining, LLC
84. Snowberry Land Company
85. Speed Mining LLC
86. Sterling Smokeless Coal Company, LLC
87. TC Sales Company, LLC
88. The Presidents Energy Company LLC
89. Thunderhill Coal LLC
90. Trout Coal Holdings, LLC
91. Union County Coal Co., LLC
92. Viper LLC
93. Weatherby Processing LLC
94. Wildcat Energy LLC
95. Wildcat, LLC
96. Will Scarlet Properties LLC
97. Winchester LLC
98. Winifrede Dock Limited Liability Company
99. Yankeetown Dock, LLC

EXHIBIT A

Professionals and Rates

[See attached.]

I. PARTNERS/COUNSEL

NAME OF PARTNER/COUNSEL	YEAR ADMITTED	DEPARTMENT	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	1983 - WV	COMMERCIAL & FINANCIAL	4.90	\$250.00	\$ 1,225.00
D'ANTONI, MARK B.	1987 - WV	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	25.10	\$235.00	\$ 5,898.50
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	1981 - WV	MASS & TOXIC TORTS	114.40	\$165.00	\$ 18,876.00
LANE, J. THOMAS	1973 - WV	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	0.80	\$285.00	\$ 228.00
OBLAK, REBECCA	1988 - WV, PA, DC	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	1.40	\$275.00	\$ 385.00
SAYRE, KIN	1986 - WV	TAX	2.20	\$246.00	\$ 541.20
TOTAL PARTNERS AND COUNSEL			148.80		\$ 27,153.70

II. ASSOCIATES

NAME OF ASSOCIATE	YEAR ADMITTED	DEPARTMENT	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
COHN, DANIEL	2012 - WV	COMMERCIAL & FINANCIAL	7.80	\$175.00	\$ 1,365.00
HANCOCK, THOMAS	2007 - WV	EMPLOYER LEGAL SERVICES	14.00	\$135.00	\$ 1,890.00
TOTAL ASSOCIATES			21.80		\$ 3,255.00

III. PARAPROFESSIONALS

NAME OF PARAPROFESSIONAL	DEPARTMENT	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	MASS & TOXIC TORTS	73.00	\$70.00	\$ 5,110.00
HARRISON, TINA	MASS & TOXIC TORTS	19.30	\$70.00	\$ 1,351.00
LESTER, SHANNON	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	76.60	\$70.00	\$ 5,362.00
TAYLOR, DEBRA	MASS & TOXIC TORTS	64.70	\$70.00	\$ 4,529.00
VANCE, UTE	MASS & TOXIC TORTS	86.40	\$70.00	\$ 6,048.00
TOTAL PARAPROFESSIONALS		320.00		\$ 22,400.00

IV. ADMINISTRATIVE

NAME OF ADMINISTRATIVE STAFF	DEPARTMENT	TOTAL HOURS BILLED	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL FEES
PAULEY, PAULETTE	MASS & TOXIC TORTS	51.20	\$70.00	\$ 3,584.00
ROTRUCK, ROBIN	ENERGY & REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT	2.90	\$125.00	\$ 362.50
TOTAL ADMINISTRATIVE STAFF		54.10		\$ 3,946.50

GRAND TOTAL	544.70	\$ 56,755.20
--------------------	---------------	---------------------

	ATTORNEY BLENDED RATE	TOTAL ATTORNEY HOURS	TOTAL ATTORNEY FEES
PARTNERS/COUNSEL	182.48	148.80	\$ 27,153.70
ASSOCIATES	149.31	21.80	\$ 3,255.00
TOTAL	178.25	170.60	\$ 30,408.70

EXHIBIT B

Expenses

[See attached.]

**ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES
INCURRED BY BOWLES RICE LLP ON
BEHALF OF THE DEBTORS DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD**

<u>CATEGORY OF EXPENSES</u>	<u>AMOUNTS</u>
Travel Expenses	\$170.14
Federal Express Corporation	\$215.17
Photocopy Charges	\$12.50
Postage Charges	\$543.69
Long Distance Calls	\$90.93
Photocopy Charges	\$1,822.35
TOTAL	\$2,854.78

EXHIBIT C

Summary by Project Code

[See attached.]

SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING
THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY BOWLES RICE LLP
ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY

DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER #	MATTER DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
Black Lung				499.50	\$46,750.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00007	DELP, CARNIS H.	16.80	\$1,233.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00015	TOPARDO, JOSEPH	0.80	\$56.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00051	HAMPTON, EUGENE	2.10	\$147.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00122	CONAWAY, DORWIN	4.10	\$287.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00180	LONG, KENNETH E./FED. BLACK LUNG	1.70	\$157.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00333	SIZEMORE, HARRY	3.30	\$316.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00376	LUSK, RALPH J.	0.20	\$14.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00390	WHALING, HERMAN	3.80	\$427.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00496	RASI, DIONIGI	1.60	\$197.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00510	TOLER, ALVIN L.	1.40	\$98.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00693	BARR, JUNIOR MCCOY	1.70	\$119.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00694	BELCHER, TERRY K.	0.30	\$21.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00751	MILLER, DELVIN	17.50	\$1,671.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00835	ELLIS, DANNY R.	0.30	\$21.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00846	TOLER, ARVIS R.	0.70	\$49.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00858	HALSEY, CLIFFORD O.	0.30	\$21.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00865	WRISTON, DONALD R.	26.30	\$2,411.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00867	FLOYD, THEODORE	1.20	\$122.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00880	WHITE, JERRY LEE	3.70	\$259.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00899	WOOTEN, DALLAS D.	2.70	\$189.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00963	FERRELL, BOBBY JOE	1.70	\$166.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00973	BOLEN, MICKEY GENE	4.30	\$339.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01043	SMITH, JOHN W.	0.90	\$63.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01089	COOK, ALFRED M.	0.40	\$28.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01112	RICHARDSON, JAMES G.	1.70	\$119.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01136	LAMB, ALVIN J.	0.10	\$7.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01166	CLAIMANT: MARTIN, RUBERT LEE	1.00	\$70.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01176	GARDNER, PAUL R.	2.90	\$250.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01235	WHITTINGTON, RALPH E.	13.10	\$1,240.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01254	MASSEY, ROBERT E.	0.50	\$35.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01291	CREWS, CHARLES W.	3.10	\$245.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01304	CRIFIELD, LEON S.	8.50	\$690.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01372	SLAUGHTER, SAMUEL H.	0.50	\$35.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01406	PACK, RONALD, E.	1.60	\$188.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01455	BLAIR, VERLIE JR.	2.00	\$168.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01480	MOORE, JAMES G.	6.10	\$598.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01531	ELKINS, CHARLES L.	2.90	\$203.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01535	WOOTEN, HARRY	0.70	\$49.00

SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY BOWLES RICE LLP ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY

DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER #	MATTER DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01540	CRUM, BENNY T.	3.70	\$287.50
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01542	NEWBILL, WILBURN M., SR.	6.40	\$448.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01618	HICKS, WALTER THOMAS	1.10	\$181.50
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01623	BAILEY, VERNON LESSEL	0.45	\$31.50
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01649	ADKINS, PERRY WESLEY	1.15	\$80.50
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01654	EVANS, LAWRENCE T	23.00	\$2,902.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01708	HARMAN, JOHN R	2.20	\$268.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01737	SMITH, RALPH BENSON	1.10	\$77.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01747	COOK, DENNIS LARRY, SR.	5.30	\$418.50
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01760	BUSCH, ALLAN E. SR.	12.80	\$1,095.50
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01812	PRINCE, RICKY G.	0.40	\$28.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01858	MILAM, ROY LEE	0.40	\$28.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01885	MORGAN, STEVEN D.	3.40	\$323.50
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01916	DICKERSON JAMES V. EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL	1.20	\$141.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01957	ABEL, ROBERT LEE	14.20	\$1,070.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01977	PAULEY, ROBERT D.	3.70	\$401.50
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02032	EPLING, HAROLD WILLIAM	2.20	\$230.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02037	LUSK, RALPH EMERSON	3.60	\$252.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02050	LAFFERTY, MARVIN RAY	2.30	\$199.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02062	LUSK, RICKY N.	4.10	\$287.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02110	SALISBURY, PAUL B.	1.50	\$105.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02187	TANKERSLEY, SAMUEL R.	2.20	\$154.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02220	KENNEDY, CLARENCE J.	3.60	\$423.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02227	CARPENTER, JR., JAMES E.	5.60	\$392.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02235	BLEVINS, OAKLEY T.	0.20	\$14.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02243	HARMON, WILLIE	8.60	\$1,124.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02254	RANKIN, LOWELL W.	1.10	\$143.50
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02257	PERSINGER, JR., WILLIAM A.	3.20	\$281.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02281	FULK, JR., RUSSELL	2.50	\$289.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02288	WILSON, LENNIE L.	0.70	\$49.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02299	HARRIS, JERRY L. SR.	1.30	\$91.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02305	TINCHER, SR., DONALD	1.90	\$133.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02320	FREETAGE, ALLEN M.	2.40	\$291.50
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02332	SHORT, DANNY	3.00	\$286.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02341	ROBINSON, DELBERT J.	2.10	\$147.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02358	COUCH, ELBERT	0.40	\$28.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02403	THOMAS, ROBERT D.	0.40	\$28.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02409	THACKER, ROBERT R.	0.40	\$28.00
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02422	PENNINGTON, HAROLD	1.20	\$84.00

SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY BOWLES RICE LLP ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY

DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER #	MATTER DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02424	ENGLAND, DOUGLAS L.	24.60	\$2,748.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02433	GREENWOOD, LEWIS G.	3.90	\$377.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02442	SAXTON, WARREN L.	0.60	\$42.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02445	GUNNOE, KERMIT	4.40	\$422.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02448	GARZA, ELIEZER F.	0.90	\$63.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02451	CONRAD, NORMAN	0.40	\$28.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02454	DEAVERS, VERNON D.	1.70	\$185.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02463	BELCHER, BUFORD	1.00	\$70.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02465	MCCOY, GEORGE F	12.80	\$1,342.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02476	BRADFORD, JOHN E.	2.95	\$235.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02484	ALDERMAN, ALVISE E.	0.60	\$42.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02487	WILLIAMS, KEITH	16.40	\$1,811.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02492	TUCKER, RICKEY	2.00	\$140.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02496	JACKSON, JACKIE	0.50	\$35.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02513	MILLER, RICHARD	3.90	\$301.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02524	WILEY, THOMAS R.	8.30	\$1,027.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02532	HATFIELD, JAMES (DONNA)	1.40	\$98.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02537	RAMSEY, LARRY WAYNE	1.40	\$126.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02538	COOK, DENNIS (SARAH)	0.70	\$49.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02543	PATTON, WILLIE	0.40	\$28.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02548	DAVIS, MALCOLM R.	4.10	\$287.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02550	VANCE, DONALD RAY	2.20	\$230.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02555	GRAHAM, JAMES G.	1.00	\$70.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02558	SNODGRAS, PHILLIP D.I	1.70	\$147.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02570	HORVWALT, ROBERT D.	4.40	\$498.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02573	BILBRO, JAMES N.	1.90	\$171.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02578	HOOD, RAYMOND K.	0.30	\$21.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02579	DANIELS, JIMMY (DEBORAH)	0.30	\$21.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02581	SMITH, GARY A.	2.60	\$182.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02585	GIBSON, JAMES LEVI	0.90	\$63.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02588	CARTER, DALLAS R.	0.20	\$14.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02596	UNDERWOOD, CHARLES L.	9.70	\$679.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02598	LINVILLE, GREGORY C.	1.30	\$91.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02600	RUNYON, FREDERICK R.	1.90	\$228.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02601	HARLESS, JAMES C.	0.10	\$7.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02602	COLWELL, HAROLD	3.20	\$328.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02603	COOK, MICHAEL W	0.20	\$14.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02604	MCGINNIS, HOWARD (OPAL)	1.60	\$159.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02605	SMOOT, RICHARD J.	3.70	\$373.00

SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING
THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY BOWLES RICE LLP
ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY

DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER #	MATTER DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02606	WHITE, DONALD G.	0.30	\$21.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02607	WOOTEN, EDWARD (MARY)	1.10	\$105.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02609	BROWNING, MICHAEL J	1.95	\$231.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02610	BIBEY, HOMER E.	0.10	\$7.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02611	TAYLOR, JERRY LEE	6.90	\$701.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02612	GRIFFITH, ARNOLD D	4.10	\$344.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02614	ANTHONY, JOE W	0.40	\$28.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02615	COPLEY, LAWRENCE B	3.40	\$342.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02616	PATRICK, HERMAN C.	6.60	\$680.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02618	LYONS, GEORGE (RUBY)	3.50	\$245.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02619	BIAS, MICHAEL RAY	2.10	\$223.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02620	ANTHONY, JESSE JR.	3.10	\$255.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02621	THOMPSON, GEORGE L.	6.50	\$721.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02622	SNODGRASS, EDDY A.	4.30	\$481.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02623	SPICER, MARVIN P.	4.50	\$476.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02624	DALRYMPLE, JACK L.	3.80	\$427.50
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02625	GOODWIN, CALVIN (FREDA)	3.40	\$380.50
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00008	KINCAID, MILTON	20.10	\$1,929.50
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00017	CRAWFORD, ROBERT E.	0.40	\$28.00
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00031	HAGY, EARL JR.	10.60	\$846.50
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00042	BAILEY, JR., ROBERT W.	0.50	\$35.00
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00044	COOK, ROBERT	0.10	\$7.00
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00051	TURNER, JOSEPH D.	0.50	\$35.00
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00072	AMOS, DENNIS C.	1.40	\$126.50
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00077	COALSON, RICKIE CHARLES	0.40	\$28.00
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00096	DELUNG, RUSSELL LEE	0.90	\$63.00
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00100	ADKINS, HENLEY	1.00	\$70.00
Commercial				12.30	\$2,490.00
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION				12.30	\$2,490.00
Energy & Real Estate				28.50	\$6,767.70
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION				28.50	\$6,767.70
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL,LLC	P0493.10221	ROBIN LAND CO., SUBSIDIARY - THE QUIKRETE COMPANIES, INC.	18.00	\$4,230.00
	EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL,LLC	P0493.10222	ROBIN LAND CO., SUBSIDIARY - TONEY'S FORK LAND, LOGAN COUNTY	7.10	\$1,668.50
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0505.00068	BRODY MINING, LLC	0.40	\$100.00
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0505.00069	CLAIM FOR UNDERPAYMENT OF ROYALTIES - PAYNE-GALLATIN MINING	3.00	\$769.20
Safety and Health				4.30	\$747.50
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION				4.30	\$747.50
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION				0.50	\$92.50

**SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING
THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY BOWLES RICE LLP
ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY**

DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER #	MATTER DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	E1166.00066	HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2008-619	1.90	\$327.50
	PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	E1166.00071	HIGHLAND 9 MINE KENT 2009-168	1.90	\$327.50
TOTAL HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED:				544.70	\$56,755.20

EXHIBIT D

Time Records

[See attached.]

Bowles Rice LLP
Time Detail by Project

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
BLACK JUNG					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01957	ABEL, ROBERT LEE			
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM HUNTINGTON VA HOSPITAL REGARDING OUR MEDICAL RECORDS REQUEST AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/01/2013	0.90	REVIEW FILE AND PREPARED 5/30/12 X-RAY TO ATTORNEY BILONICK PER HIS REQUEST FOR REBUTTAL
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/01/2013	0.20	REVIEW RECORDS FROM DEPT OF VETERANS AFFAIRS; REVIEW RESPONSE FROM FAIRMONT GENERAL; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/02/2013	0.20	REVIEW INVOICE FROM MONONGALIA GENERAL; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/03/2013	0.20	DRAFTING REQUEST TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL FOR FILM
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/03/2013	0.20	REVIEWING SUBMISSION FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL OF REPORT AND X-RAY
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/03/2013	0.20	REVIEW AND SIGN REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/03/2013	0.30	CHECK STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT; REVIEW DISCOVERY; REVIEW CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/04/2013	0.20	REVIEWING SUBMISSION FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND VERIFYING CLAIM STATUS
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/08/2013	3.40	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DEPARTMENT OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/09/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	04/09/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/11/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/22/2013	0.20	REVIEW CD OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CLARKSBURG VA; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		HARRISON, TINA	04/23/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/23/2013	0.50	DRAFT SECOND REQUEST FOR EMPLOYER'S SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE UPON CLAIMANT
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/23/2013	0.30	CONFIRM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL HAS NOT RESPONDED TO DISCOVERY, CHECK HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE SAME

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/23/2013	2.80	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE ADDITIONAL MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DEPARTMENT OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/24/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/25/2013	0.40	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE X-RAY FROM CLARKSBURG VA MEDICAL CENTER
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/25/2013	1.00	REVIEW 4 CDS OF MEDICAL RECORDS; PUT IN DATE ORDER; LIST X RAYS ON FOLLOW UP SHEET; TELEPHONE CALL FROM EAST OHIO REGIONAL; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/25/2013	0.80	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS; DRAFTING REQUEST FOR X-RAYS; UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/26/2013	0.30	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE X-RAYS FROM EAST OHIO REGIONAL
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/26/2013	0.20	REVIEW X RAY FROM EAST OHIO REGIONAL; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/26/2013	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/29/2013	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM EAST OHIO REGIONAL HOSPITAL; TELEPHONE CALL TO EAST OHIO REGIONAL HOSPITAL REGARDING X-RAYS
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/30/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		ABEL, ROBERT LEE TOTAL		14.20	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01649	ADKINS, PERRY WESLEY			
		VANCE, UTE	04/03/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EXHIBIT #9 AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/05/2013	0.20	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CAMC RE INADEQUATE RELEASE FOR ADC; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/08/2013	0.10	REVIEW RESPONSE FROM THOMAS HOSPITAL RE ADULT DISABLED CHILD; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/09/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM PRESTERA RE RECORDS FOR ADULT DISABLED CHILD; PROCESS FAX; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. VIDAL'S OFFICE RE RECORDS FOR ADULT DISABLED CHILD; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/24/2013	0.05	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.20	REVIEW CD FROM CAMC; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		ADKINS, PERRY WESLEY TOTAL		1.15	

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02484	ALDERMAN, ALVIS E. TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/02/2013	0.30	REVIEWING STATUS OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S TESTIMONY AND DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE			
			04/08/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE			
			04/11/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE			
			04/29/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE			
				0.60				
ALDERMAN, ALVIS E. TOTAL								
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02620	ANTHONY, JESSE JR. VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.30	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM UNDERWRITERS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); IMPORTING ALL DOCUMENTS CONTAINED ON COMPACT DISC INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.2)			
			04/03/2013	0.50	INTERNET RESEARCH FOR PULMONARY EXPERTS DOING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION IN GEORGIA (.2); TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. DANIEL (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUESTING LIST OF PULMONARY EXPERTS IN GEORGIA (.2)			
			04/08/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE			
			04/11/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE			
			04/18/2013	1.00	INTERNET RESEARCH TRYING TO FIND PHYSICIAN DOING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION TO REFER CLAIMANT TO			
			04/22/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORT FROM DR. MEYER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE			
			04/23/2013	0.30	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING B-READER REPORT BY DR. MEYER (.1); DRAFTING REBUTTAL EVIDENCE (.2)			
			04/24/2013	0.20	REVIEW AND SIGN EVIDENCE SUBMISSION			
			04/24/2013	0.20	REVIEW REPORT FROM DR. MEYER, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES			
			04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR X-RAY READING FROM DR. MEYER			
				3.10				
			ANTHONY, JESSE JR. TOTAL					
			ANTHONY, JOE W					
			EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02614				

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01623	VANCE, UTE	04/04/2013	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR X-RAY READINGS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS MEDICINE	
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/24/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE	
		ANTHONY, JOE W TOTAL		0.40		
		BAILEY, VERNON LESSEL				
		VANCE, UTE	04/09/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/12/2013	0.20	REVIEWING NOTICE OF APPEAL FROM THE BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD AND UPDATING CLAIM	
		VANCE, UTE	04/17/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/24/2013	0.05	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE	
		BAILEY, VERNON LESSEL TOTAL			0.45	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00693	BARR, JUNIOR MCCOY				
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/04/2013	0.60	TELEPHONE CALLS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAY REQUEST	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/11/2013	0.60	TELEPHONE CALL FROM MEDICAL FACILITY REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS; REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR INVOICE FOR MEDICAL RECORDS	
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/24/2013	0.20	VERIFYING STATUS OF EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT PURSUANT TO PENDING DEADLINE BEFORE THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE	
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/30/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. HADDADJIN; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM	
		BARR, JUNIOR MCCOY TOTAL			1.70	
		BELCHER, BUFORD				
		HARRISON, TINA	04/04/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE	
		VANCE, UTE	04/04/2013	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM GENESIS HEALTHCARE REGARDING OUR RECORD REQUEST	
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.20	REVIEWING DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (1); REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORDS AND EXECUTRIX PAPERS FROM CLAIMANT (1)			

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00694	VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR RADIOLOGY FILMS FROM GENESIS BETHESDA/GOOD SAMARITAN HOSPITAL
		VANCE, UTE	04/16/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM BETHESDA HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISC TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISC (1)
		VANCE, UTE	04/22/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM OHIO STATE UNIVERSITY REGARDING OUR PATHOLOGY SLIDES REQUEST AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
BELCHER, BUFORD TOTAL				1.00	
BELCHER, TERRY K.					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02619	VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.20	REVIEW INTERROGATORIES; REVIEW MEDICAL RECORD FOLLOW UP SHEET; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		BELCHER, TERRY K. TOTAL		0.30	
BIAS, MICHAEL RAY					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02619	PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/01/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/03/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER'S OFFICE REGARDING STATUS OF REPORT (1)
		VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR X-RAY READING FROM DR. WHEELER
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.20	DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.20	DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF REBUTTAL EVIDENCE
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY REGARDING UPCOMING DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/29/2013	0.40	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES, AND DESIGNATE EVIDENCE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/29/2013	0.40	REVIEW AND SIGN SUBMISSION OF DR. WHEELER REPORT; REVIEW AND SIGN SUBMISSION OF DR. SCOTT REPORT

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02610	PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE, PREPARE MAIL
		BIAS, MICHAEL RAY TOTAL BIBEY, HOMER E.		2.10	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02573	HARRISON, TINA	04/04/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		BIBEY, HOMER E. TOTAL BILBRO, JAMES N.		0.10	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01455	PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/01/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DR. U'SELLIS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/19/2013	0.80	REVIEW FILE PREPARED SECOND REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL EMPLOYER'S INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE TO CLAIMANT
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/24/2013	0.40	REVIEW DISCOVERY, CONTINUED DISCOVERY PROBLEMS (3), REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (1)
		VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	04/26/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/26/2013	0.20	REVIEW OF CLAIMANT'S REBUTTAL READING BY DR. ALEXANDER FRO 04-23-12 X-RAY
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/30/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE, ORGANIZE FILE
		BILBRO, JAMES N. TOTAL BLAIR, VERLIE JR.		1.90	
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/09/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/18/2013	0.50	REVIEW FILE AND DRAFTED EMPLOYER'S SECOND REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE UPON CLAIMANT
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/18/2013	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
		HARRISON, TINA VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013 04/24/2013	0.10 0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/24/2013	0.40	REVIEW INTERROGATORIES; PREPARE MEDICAL REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
LESTER, SHANNON	04/24/2013	0.30	REVIEW OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO EMPLOYER'S INTERROGATORIES FOR NEW MEDICAL INFORMATION IN PREP FOR HEARING		
PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/30/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE		
BILBRO, JAMES N. TOTAL BLAIR, VERLIE JR. TOTAL BLEVINS, OAKLEY T.		2.00			

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/02/2013	0.10	REVIEWING LETTER FROM THE OFFICE OF THE SOLICITOR AND VERIFYING CLAIM STATUS
		VANCE, UTE	04/09/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD'S REPLY BRIEF AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		BLEVINS, OAKLEY T. TOTAL		0.20	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00973	BOLEN, MICKEY GENE			
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/04/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; CHECK FILE COPIES
		HARRISON, TINA	04/04/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/10/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADULT DISABLED CHILD'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/10/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/11/2013	1.00	REVIEW INTERROGATORIES; PREPARE FOLLOW UP SHEET; PREPARE MEDICAL AND X RAY REQUESTS FOR CLAIMANT AND ADULT DISABLED CHILD; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.40	REVIEW DRAFT EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT PLAN, COMPARE WITH ISSUES AND EVIDENCE, AND DIRECT ACTION ACCORDINGLY
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. LOVEGROVE'S OFFICE RE RECORDS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/22/2013	0.20	REVIEW INVOICE FROM RALEIGH GENERAL RE ADULT DISABLED CHILD; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM MILDRED MITCHELL BATEMAN HOSPITAL; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/23/2013	0.50	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM DR. TAMMY SMITH AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/23/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM TAMMY SMITH; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/23/2013	0.30	REVIEWING INVOICE RECEIVED FROM MEDI-COPY (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO MEDI-COPY REGARDING CHARGES FOR RECORD REQUEST FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL (.2)
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/24/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/25/2013	0.30	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CAMC; REVIEW CD FROM RALEIGH GENERAL RE MEDICAL RECORDS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/26/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>		
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02476	VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM NEW RIVER HEALTH		
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL		
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.20	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CAMC; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM		
BOLEN, MICKEY GENE TOTAL				4.30			
BRADFORD, JOHN E.							
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02609	PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/01/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE		
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/11/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. THYMIUS; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM		
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM ACCESS HEALTH		
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/15/2013	0.40	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. TIFFANY THYMIUS		
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/15/2013	0.50	DRAFTED EMPLOYERS SUPPLEMENTAL REQUEST FOR INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE UPON CLAIMANT		
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/15/2013	0.80	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE STATUS OF CASE AND WHAT TASKS NEED TO BE ACCOMPLISHED BEFORE ALL HEARING		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/16/2013	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY, AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL		
		HARRISON, TINA	04/22/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE		
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/24/2013	0.05	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE		
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR RECORD REVIEW AND REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG		
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
		BRADFORD, JOHN E. TOTAL				2.95	
		BROWNING, MICHAEL J					
		EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02609	VANCE, UTE	04/03/2013	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES (1); DRAFTING SECOND REQUEST FOR DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (2)
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/03/2013			0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY, AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT		
HARRISON, TINA	04/08/2013			0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE		
PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/24/2013			0.05	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE		

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495-01760	VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.30	REVIEWING PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING DOCKET WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE (1); DRAFTING RESPONSE TO PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (2)
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; PREPARE MAIL
BROWNING, MICHAEL J TOTAL	P0495-01760	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/30/2013	0.20	REVIEW RESPONSE TO DECISION, COMPARE WITH CASE MATERIALS AND SIGN
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/30/2013	0.50	REVIEW DECISION OF DISTRICT DIRECTOR, REVIEW EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS AND ISSUES
				1.95	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495-01760	VANCE, UTE	04/03/2013	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION NEEDED BY THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR FOR PAYMENT OF INVOICE FROM ALUM CREEK MEDICAL CENTER
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/03/2013	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	04/04/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/04/2013	1.10	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. DONALD LILLY'S OFFICE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/04/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; CHECK FILE COPIES
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/05/2013	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/11/2013	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE: TELEPHONE CALL FROM BECKLEY APPALACHIAN REGIONAL HOSPITAL REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/11/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIWAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISC RECEIVED FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISC (1)
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORD FROM BOONE MEMORIAL HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/15/2013	0.60	REVIEW DRAFT EVIDENCE SUMMARY; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND EVIDENCE BEING DEVELOPED; SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL WITH SUMMARY
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/15/2013	0.30	REVIEW FILMS NEEDED FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE; SIGN REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE SAME
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM BOONE MEMORIAL HOSPITAL
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/15/2013	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL TO BECKLEY APPALACHIAN REGIONAL HOSPITAL AND NORTON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL REGARDING X-RAYS
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/15/2013	0.50	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR RELEVANT INFORMATION FOR DOCTOR'S REVIEW
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/15/2013	0.30	DRAFTING LETTER TO DOCTOR FOR CONSULTING OPINION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/15/2013	0.60	DRAFTING INITIAL EVIDENCE SUMMARY
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/15/2013	0.20	DRAFTING REQUEST TO SCHEDULE DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/16/2013	0.40	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS FOR ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE NEEDED; DIRECT ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT AND DESIGNATE EXPERT FOR CONSULTATION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/16/2013	0.70	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR, CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION; DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION; UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM
		HARRISON, TINA	04/17/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/17/2013	0.40	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ROSENBERG FOR CONSULT, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND CASE MATERIALS (-); REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG (1)
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/17/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. LILLY REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/17/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/18/2013	0.50	DRAFTED EMPLOYER'S MOTION TO COMPEL CLAIMANT TO PROVIDED ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND AN EXECUTED MEDICAL RELEASE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/18/2013	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE

<u>CLIENT_NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK_DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	04/18/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF X-RAY FILM, COMPACT DISC, AND RADIOLOGY REPORTS FROM BECKLEY ARH AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	04/19/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/22/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	04/23/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/23/2013	0.20	REVIEW DEPOSITION SCHEDULE AND ARRANGEMENTS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/23/2013	0.20	REVIEW AND SIGN NOTICE OF DEPOSITION AND CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE RE SAME
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/23/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/24/2013	0.90	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM BECKLEY APPALACHIAN REGIONAL HOSPITAL REGARDING X-RAYS
		VANCE, UTE	04/25/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EXHIBITS #1 THROUGH #3 AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR RADIOLOGY FILMS FROM BECKLEY ARH HOSPITAL
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/29/2013	0.80	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM BECKLEY APPALACHIAN REGIONAL HOSPITAL REGARDING X-RAYS
		BUSCH, ALLAN E. SR. TOTAL		12.80	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02227	CARPENTER, JR., JAMES E.			
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/01/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/03/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM PULMONARY SERVICES OF CHARLESTON; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/08/2013	0.70	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. WADIH KABBARA
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/08/2013	0.40	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. KABBARA; PUT IN DATE ORDER; PROCESS FAX FROM NEUROLOGICAL ASSOCIATES; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/09/2013	0.20	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; REVIEW FAX FROM DR. SIDDIQI; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/11/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CAMC; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.10	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM BRAIN & SPINE SPECIALISTS

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02588	VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM RALEIGH-BOONE MEDICAL CENTER REGARDING OUR MEDICAL RECORDS REQUEST
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/17/2013	0.70	REVIEW AND PUT MEDICAL RECORDS IN CHRONOLOGICAL ORDER FOR ELECTRONIC FILE. REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. GEORGIANNA RICHARDS
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/24/2013	2.50	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CAMC
		CARPENTER, JR., JAMES E. TOTAL		5.60	
		CARTER, DALLAS R.			
		HARRISON, TINA	04/04/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/04/2013	0.10	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RESPONSE TO PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE
		CARTER, DALLAS R. TOTAL		0.20	
		CLAIMANT: MARTIN, RUBERT LEE			
		HARRISON, TINA	04/02/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01166	VANCE, UTE	04/04/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/04/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE
		VANCE, UTE	04/04/2013	0.40	REVIEWING EVIDENCE SUBMITTED BY CLAIMANT AND COMPARE TO EVIDENCE SUBMITTED ON BEHALF OF EMPLOYER AT THIS TIME (3); DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY (.1)
		VANCE, UTE	04/10/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S SUBMISSIONS OF EVIDENCE IN MINER'S AND IN WIDOW'S CLAIMS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CLAIMANT: MARTIN, RUBERT LEE TOTAL		1.00	
		COLWELL, HAROLD			
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/03/2013	0.20	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CROSS LANES URGENT CARE
		VANCE, UTE	04/03/2013	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT REBUTTAL DEADLINE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/04/2013	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02602	VANCE, UTE	04/04/2013	0.20	DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL FORWARDING 3/13/13 X-RAY FILM
		VANCE, UTE			

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/04/2013	0.30	REVIEW X-RAY FILM, COMPARE WITH REQUEST FROM CLAIMANT AND EVIDENCE ALREADY DEVELOPED
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/04/2013	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		HARRISON, TINA	04/08/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	04/09/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.30	RECEIPT OF 2 COMPACT DISCS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISCS RECEIVED FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISC (2)
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR X-RAY READINGS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS MEDICINE
		VANCE, UTE	04/16/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF MULTIPLE EVIDENCE FROM CLAIMANT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/16/2013	0.30	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING EVIDENCE SUBMITTED BY CLAIMANT TO DETERMINE NEED FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/19/2013	0.70	REVIEW EVIDENCE AND MEDICAL TREATMENT RECORDS RECEIVED FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL; COMPARE DR. GAZIANO REPORT AND TEST RESULTS WITH THOSE FROM DR. ZALDIVAR; REVIEW VARIOUS INFORMATION IN TREATMENT RECORDS RE COMPLICATED PNEUMOCOONIOSIS
		COLWELL, HAROLD TOTAL		3.20	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00122	CONAWAY, DORWIN			
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/01/2013	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM BRIDGEPORT MEDICINE; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/03/2013	0.20	REVIEWING ORDER CHANGING VENUE FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING CLAIM RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/16/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/19/2013	0.20	REVIEWING CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND VERIFYING CLAIM STATUS
		VANCE, UTE	04/23/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM MONONGALIA GENERAL HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/23/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. WOOFER; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02451	CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/23/2013	1.70	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: DRAFTING REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS: UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013	0.20	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF PAYMENT FOR INVOICE FROM FAIRMONT GENERAL HOSPITAL (1); DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO UNDERWRITERS
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/24/2013	0.20	CHECKING ON STATUS OF PAYMENT FOR INVOICE (1) SCAN MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. WOOFETER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/26/2013	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. MOHAMMAD
		CONAWAY, DORWIN TOTAL		4.10	
		CONRAD, NORMAN			
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/09/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM FAIRFIELD MEDICAL REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS
		CONRAD, NORMAN TOTAL		0.40	
		COOK, ALFRED M.			
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01089	TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/23/2013	0.30	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD AND VERIFYING AND UPDATING CLAIM STATUS WITH DEADLINES FOR APPEAL
		COOK, ALFRED M. TOTAL		0.40	
		COOK, DENNIS (SARAH)			
		VANCE, UTE	04/19/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/25/2013	0.20	REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/25/2013	0.30	UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS
		COOK, DENNIS (SARAH) TOTAL		0.70	
		COOK, DENNIS LARRY, SR.			
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/01/2013	0.20	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FOLLOW UP SHEET; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01747	HARRISON, TINA	04/04/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/17/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	04/18/2013	2.50	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES TO DETERMINE MEDICAL RECORDS NEEDED IN DEFENSE OF CLAIM (.3); REVIEWING CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES FROM PRIOR FEDERAL BLACK LUNG CLAIMS (.2); INTERNET RESEARCH FOR AREA OF EXPERTISE AND CONTACT INFORMATION OF PHYSICIANS NAMED BY CLAIMANT (.4); DRAFTING MULTIPLE REQUESTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS, RADIOLOGY FILMS, AND PATHOLOGY SLIDES (1.1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM DR. BOUSTANI IN 2009 (.5)
		VANCE, UTE	04/22/2013	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM PULMONARY ASSOCIATES REGARDING OUR RECORD REQUEST
		VANCE, UTE	04/23/2013	0.30	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM RHEUMATOLOGY & PULMONARY CLINIC AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISC TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISC (.2)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/24/2013	0.30	REVIEW PROJECTED DATES OF EVIDENCE COMPLETION AND DEADLINES ESTABLISHED BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/24/2013	0.20	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, COMPARE WITH CASE MATERIALS AND SIGN
		VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED PURSUANT TO UPCOMING DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE (.1); DRAFTING MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME (.2)
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/24/2013	0.20	REVIEW INTERROGATORIES; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. BOUSTANI
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR X-RAY READING FROM JOHNS HOPKINS
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM HASAN MEDICAL
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR RADIOLOGY FILMS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02603	COOK, DENNIS LARRY, SR. TOTAL		5.30	
		COOK, MICHAEL W	04/15/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR RECORD REVIEW AND REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02615	COOK, MICHAEL W TOTAL		0.20	
		COPLEY, LAWRENCE B	04/04/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/04/2013	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD REQUEST (1); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RECORDS TO DR. RANAVAYA (2)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.30	CONFIRM INFORMATION AND ARRANGEMENTS FOR EXAMINATION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT RE SAME
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.30	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES; DESIGNATE EVIDENCE
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.20	DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF REBUTTAL EVIDENCE
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR ACTIONS NEEDED AT RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR SCHEDULING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION (1) DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY (1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT AND TRAVEL VOUCHER TO CLAIMANT (2)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/12/2013	0.20	REVIEW EVIDENCE BEING SUBMITTED AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR X-RAY READINGS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS MEDICINE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; PREPARE MAIL
		VANCE, UTE	04/17/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT UPCOMING DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE (1); REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF MEDICAL DEVELOPMENT (1); DRAFTING MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME (2)
HARRISON, TINA	04/17/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE		
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/18/2013	0.30	REVIEW PROJECTED DATES OF EVIDENCE COMPLETION, EVIDENCE DEADLINES, AND REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENT TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUESTING EXTENSION		

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495-02358	HARRISON, TINA	04/24/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER TO COMPEL AND DEPARTMENT OF LABOR EXTENDING TIME FRAMES AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/25/2013	0.10	REVIEWING DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES
		COPLEY, LAWRENCE B TOTAL		3.40	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495-01291	COUCH, ELBERT			
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/09/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FOLLOW UP SHEET; DO RESEARCH FOR POA AND DEATH CERTIFICATE; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/22/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OHIO STATE RE LIST OF X RAYS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		COUCH, ELBERT TOTAL		0.40	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495-01291	CREWS, CHARLES W.			
		HARRISON, TINA	04/04/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/04/2013	0.10	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RESPONSE TO PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/05/2013	0.30	TELEPHONE CALL FROM AND CONFERENCE WITH CLAIMANT REGARDING DISCOVERY
		VANCE, UTE	04/09/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF WIDOW'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/10/2013	1.00	REVIEW INTERROGATORIES; PREPARE FOLLOW UP SHEET; PREPARE MEDICAL AND X RAY REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/11/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL AND FAX FROM BLUEFIELD REGIONAL; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/18/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC AND REPORTS FROM BECKLEY VAMC AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/22/2013	0.20	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM KANAWHA VALLEY RADIOLOGY; AND PRINCETON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL; REVIEW LETTER FROM DR. JONES
		VANCE, UTE	04/22/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/23/2013	0.20	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISC RECEIVED FROM BECKLEY VA HOSPITAL TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISC
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/23/2013	0.30	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DR. HASAN; CANCEL ALL MEDICAL REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/26/2013	0.00	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495-01304	PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.20	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CAMC; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		CREWS, CHARLES W. TOTAL CRIHFELD, LEON S.	04/02/2013	1.00	PREPARE MEDICAL RECORDS FOLLOW UP SHEET; PREPARE MEDICAL AND X RAY REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/03/2013	0.20	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE BLOOD TEST RECORDS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/03/2013	0.70	CHECK STATUS OF CASE AND CASE DEVELOPMENT; CONFIRM RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR EXHIBITS; CHECK FOR ANY ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FROM CLAIMANTS COUNSEL; CONFIRM NO ACTION YET BY OFFICE OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGES; CHECK STATUS OF RECORD DEVELOPMENT; DIRECT ADDITIONAL DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF STATUS
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/08/2013	0.30	REVIEW INVOICE FROM RALEIGH GENERAL; REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/09/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH-BOONE MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/09/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/11/2013	0.50	DRAFTED SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE FOR CLAIMANT
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/11/2013	0.70	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE STATUS OF CASE AND WHAT TASKS NEED TO BE ACCOMPLISHED BEFORE ALJ HEARING
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/11/2013	0.40	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. PORTERFIELD; QUICK TAG; PUT IN ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/12/2013	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE SAME
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/12/2013	1.50	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. CHARLES PORTERFIELD
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. PORTERFIELD
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM RALEIGH-BOONE MEDICAL CENTER REGARDING OUR MEDICAL RECORDS REQUEST

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/17/2013	0.50	REVIEW AND PUT MEDICAL RECORDS IN CHRONOLOGICAL ORDER FOR ELECTRONIC FILE. REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH RADIOLOGY UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	04/18/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/22/2013	0.40	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CAMC; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/24/2013	0.40	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CAMC
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/25/2013	0.20	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE X-RAY FROM CAMC
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/25/2013	0.30	REVIEW CD FROM CAMC; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.30	REVIEW 3 CDS FROM CAMC; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		CRIFIELD, LEON S. TOTAL		8.50	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P049501540	CRUM, BENNY T.			
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/04/2013	0.30	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE X-RAYS FROM CAMC
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/05/2013	0.30	REVIEW RADIOLOGY CD FROM CAMC; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/09/2013	0.50	DRAFTED SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE UPON CLAIMANT
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/09/2013	0.50	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE STATUS OF CASE AND WHAT TASKS NEED TO BE ACCOMPLISHED BEFORE ALJ HEARING
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/09/2013	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE SAME
		HARRISON, TINA	04/10/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/11/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CAMC; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/12/2013	0.40	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CAMC
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER
		VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/24/2013	0.30	REVIEW OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO EMPLOYER'S INTERROGATORIES FOR NEW MEDICAL INFORMATION IN PREP FOR HEARING
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/25/2013	0.30	REVIEW INTERROGATORIES; PREPARE MEDICAL REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>		
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02624	PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/30/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE		
		CRUM, BENNY T. TOTAL		3.70			
		DALRYMPLE, JACK L.					
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/19/2013	0.70	REVIEW NEW CLAIM MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS, STATUS, WORK HISTORY, PROCEDURAL HISTORY, DOL EXAMINATION AND TEST RESULTS, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, ISSUES		
		HARRISON, TINA	04/23/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/23/2013	0.20	CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM AND SIGN REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/23/2013	0.20	CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR CONSULT AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS		
		VANCE, UTE	04/23/2013	1.80	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR FOR INITIALIZING LITIGATION PROCESS (2); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (1); OPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER (1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (2); DRAFTING SUMMARY SHEET (2); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, AND EXAMINATION RECORDS FROM DR. SALUDO (2); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION STRATEGY (2); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (1)		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/23/2013	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/23/2013	0.20	REVIEW NOTICE OF APPEARANCE, COMPARE WITH INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DOL		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/23/2013	0.20	REVIEW AND APPROVE PLANNED EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT		
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
					3.80		
		EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02579	DALRYMPLE, JACK L. TOTAL DANIELS, JIMMY (DEBORAH)			

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/30/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORD FOLLOW UP SHEET; SCAN DEATH CERTIFICATE; PREPARE MEDICAL RECORD REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
DANIELS, JIMMY (DEBORAH) TOTAL					
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/02/2013	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM LOGAN REGIONAL RE FILMS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/03/2013	0.40	REVIEWING SUBMISSION FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL OF TREATMENT RECORDS FROM DR. CABAUATAN'S OFFICE FOR RELEVANT INFORMATION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/03/2013	0.10	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE GRANTING CONTINUANCE AND UPDATING CLAIM
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/03/2013	0.20	REVIEWING SUBMISSION FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL OF EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM AND DETERMINING STATUS OF EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/03/2013	0.10	REVIEW FAX FROM NORTON COMMUNITY RE FILMS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/03/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. WHEELER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/03/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/04/2013	0.10	REVIEW FAX FROM LOGAN REGIONAL; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/09/2013	0.10	CONFIRMING HEARING CONTINUED
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/10/2013	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. WHEELER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/10/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.10	REVIEW INVOICE FROM NORTON COMMUNITY; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM NORTON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/15/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. WHEELER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/17/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/19/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. WHEELER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/23/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/23/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. WHEELER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR RECORD REVIEW AND REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02454	DAVIS, MALCOLM R. TOTAL	04/01/2013	4.10	
		DEAVERS, VERNON D.			
		PAULEY, PAULETTE			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/19/2013	0.70	REVIEW MEDICAL REQUEST FOLLOW UP SHEET; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM CHECK STATUS OF CASE AND CASE DEVELOPMENT; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS; CHECK FOR RECEIPT OF ANY ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL, CHECK FOR ANY ACTION BY JUDGE OR DEPARTMENT OF LABOR; CHECK STATUS OF RECORD DEVELOPMENT
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/19/2013	0.80	REVIEW FILE AND DRAFTED MOTION TO REMAND TO CONSOLIDATE MINER AND SURVIVOR'S CLAIMS
		DEAVERS, VERNON D. TOTAL		1.70	
		DELP, CARNIS H.			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00007	TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/01/2013	4.00	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF VOLUMINOUS RECORDS FROM DR. ZAVITSANOS' OFFICE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/01/2013	1.70	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE FOR STATUS OF EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT AND DRAFTING INITIAL EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/01/2013	0.50	REVIEWING STATUS OF REQUEST FOR MEDICAL TREATMENT RECORDS AND PATHOLOGY
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/02/2013	1.50	REVIEWING AND PREPARING MEDICAL RECORDS FROM HEALTHSOUTH FOR CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/02/2013	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/03/2013	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY; TELEPHONE CALL TO MEDICAL FACILITY REGARDING PATHOLOGY
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/03/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/05/2013	0.90	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY; REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/08/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/09/2013	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/09/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM SOLISTAS LAB REGARDING OUR PATHOLOGY REQUEST
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/12/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF SUBPOENA AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/16/2013	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/17/2013	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/17/2013	0.50	DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR READING OF CT SCAN
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/17/2013	0.30	REVIEW CT SCAN FILMS, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE AND CASE MATERIALS; SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS REQUESTING CONSULTING REPORTS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/18/2013	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/18/2013	1.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: DRAFTING REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS; DRAFTING REQUEST FOR INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE; UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/19/2013	0.70	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR PATHOLOGY: TELEPHONE CALL TO MEDICAL FACILITY REGARDING PATHOLOGY
		HARRISON, TINA	04/22/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR PATHOLOGY SLIDES FROM SOLSTAS LAB PARTNERS
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR PROCESS SERVER FEES FROM CIVIL PROCESS SERVICE OF NORTH CAROLINA PLLC
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S MOTION AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM DIRECTOR'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/30/2013	0.40	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO DEADLINE FOR RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR AND REVIEWING ORDER CONTINUING HEARING
		Delp, Carnis H. Total		16.80	
<u>EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.</u>	<u>P0495.01916</u>	<u>DICKERSON JAMES V. EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL</u>			
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/03/2013	0.20	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S OFFICE REGARDING ATTORNEY FEE ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/22/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MARK SOLOMONS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/23/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S AMENDED FEE PETITION AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/26/2013	0.10	REVIEWING LETTER FROM ANOTHER PARTY AND VERIFYING CLAIM STATUS

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01531	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/26/2013	0.30	REVIEW MESSAGE FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS RE SAME
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/26/2013	0.30	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND CONFERENCE WITH DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
DICKERSON JAMES V. EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL TOTAL 1.20					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00835	ELKINS, CHARLES L.			
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/03/2013	0.40	PREPARE MEDICAL AND X RAY REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/05/2013	0.10	REVIEW FAX FROM ST. FRANCIS RE INVOICE AND X RAYS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/08/2013	0.10	REVIEW RESPONSE FROM DR. GAZIANO; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/10/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. MARZOUK'S OFFICE; FAX MEDICAL REQUEST; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/10/2013	0.40	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. WARIS; PUT IN DATE ORDER; TELEPHONE CALL FROM RALEIGH GENERAL RE FILMS; REVIEW CD FROM LOGAN REGIONAL; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/11/2013	0.50	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE STATUS OF CASE AND WHAT TASKS NEED TO BE ACCOMPLISHED BEFORE ALJ HEARING
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/11/2013	0.30	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE X-RAYS & CTS FROM LOGAN REGIONAL MEDICAL
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR RADIOLOGY FILMS FROM ST. FRANCIS HOSPITAL
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR RADIOLOGY FILMS FROM LOGAN REGIONAL MEDICAL CENTER
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02424	LESTER, SHANNON	04/15/2013	0.50	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. WARIS A. WARIS
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.20	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM FAMILY HEALTH CARE IN MAN; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
ELKINS, CHARLES L. TOTAL 2.90					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00835	ELLIS, DANNY R.			
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/03/2013	0.10	REVIEW INVOICE FROM CAMC; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/26/2013	0.10	REVIEW INVOICE FROM SELECT SPECIALTY HOSPITAL; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER
ELLIS, DANNY R. TOTAL 0.30					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02424	ENGLAND, DOUGLAS L.			
		VANCE, UTE	04/05/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EXHIBITS #1 THROUGH #5 AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	04/05/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/05/2013	0.80	REVIEW CLAIMANT'S EXHIBITS RECEIVED; COMPARE WITH MEDICAL RECORDS SUBMITTED IN DIRECTOR EXHIBITS; DIRECT ADDITIONAL ACTION RE SAME TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/08/2013	0.20	
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/10/2013	0.90	REVIEW MEDICAL TREATMENT RECORDS FOR EXPERT REVIEW FOR DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	04/10/2013	0.30	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE WHAT DOCUMENTS NEED TO BE SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	04/10/2013	0.70	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE AND INDEX TO DR. ZALDIVAR FORWARDING DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/11/2013	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATE RAIL FOR RECEIPT OF INVOICE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.70	REVIEW ADDITIONAL MEDICAL TREATMENT RECORDS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.30	REVIEW RECORDS BEING SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR
		HARRISON, TINA	04/11/2013	3.20	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS (VOLUMINOUS) SUBMITTED BY CLAIMANT AND THOSE CONTAINED IN THE DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS IN PREPARATION FOR DR. ZALDIVAR'S DEPOSITION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/12/2013	0.30	REVIEWING CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM AND VERIFYING CLAIM STATUS
		HARRISON, TINA	04/12/2013	0.40	TELEPHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS FROM AND TO DR. ZALDIVAR'S OFFICE CONCERNING DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	04/12/2013	0.20	REVISE CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND INDEX FORWARDING DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/14/2013	1.80	REVIEW REPORTS, MEDICAL RECORDS, IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/15/2013	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR, CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/15/2013	0.50	MEET WITH DR. ZALDIVAR IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/15/2013	1.90	TRAVEL TO AND TAKE DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/17/2013	0.40	REVIEW ADDITIONAL MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ROSENBERG FOR DEPOSITION, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND CASE MATERIALS (3); REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG (1)

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/18/2013	0.80	REVIEWING NUMEROUS SUBMISSIONS OF EVIDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL FOR REBUTTAL PURPOSES AND UPDATING CLAIM
		HARRISON, TINA	04/19/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/19/2013	0.40	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG, CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/22/2013	1.50	REVIEW EXPERT REPORTS AND OTHER EVIDENCE AND TREATMENT RECORDS IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/22/2013	1.00	DEPOSE DR. ROSENBERG
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/22/2013	0.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION AND ADDITIONAL MATERIALS REVIEWED
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/22/2013	3.80	REVIEWING REPORT BY DR. PERPER AND REVIEWING RECORDS SUBMITTED BY CLAIMANT FOR ADDITIONAL RECORDS FOR DOCTOR'S REVIEW
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/22/2013	1.70	REVIEWING TREATMENT RECORDS FOR ADDITIONAL RECORDS FOR DOCTOR'S REVIEW FOR PENDING DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	04/22/2013	0.20	E-MAILS TO AND FROM DR. ROSENBERG'S CONCERNING ADDITIONAL MEDICAL RECORDS NEEDED IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/22/2013	0.50	REVIEW ADDITIONAL MATERIALS TO SEND TO DR. ROSENBERG; CONFIRM RECEIPT AND REVIEW BY DR. ROSENBERG
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/25/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION AND DEPOSITION FROM DR. ZALDIVAR
				24.60	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02032	ENGLAND, DOUGLAS L. TOTAL EPLING, HAROLD WILLIAM			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/09/2013	0.60	REVIEW DECISION OF DISTRICT DIRECTOR; REVIEW EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR; COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN RECORD AND CASE MATERIALS
		VANCE, UTE	04/09/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.20	REVIEW AND SIGN RESPONSE TO PDO
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.60	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.30	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); ORGANIZING RECORDS RECEIVED FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER INTO DATE CHRONOLOGICAL ORDER IN PREPARATION FOR ELECTRONIC INPUT AND REVIEW AND ANALYSIS (2)
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.20	REVIEWING PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND DOCKETING RESPONSE DUE DATE (1); DRAFTING RESPONSE TO PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		VANCE, UTE	04/16/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	04/18/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		EPLING, HAROLD WILLIAM TOTAL		2.20	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01654	EVANS, LAWRENCE T			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/03/2013	0.30	REVIEW PHONE MESSAGE AND EMAIL FROM DR. GHIO REGARDING DEPOSITION SCHEDULE AND REQUESTING CHANGE; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS RE SAME AND DIRECT ACTION TO CHANGE DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/05/2013	0.70	TELEPHONE CALLS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAY REQUEST
		HARRISON, TINA	04/08/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/09/2013	0.60	TELEPHONE CALL FROM RALEIGH GENERAL REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS INVOICE; REVIEWING FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/10/2013	1.70	MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INVOICE REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. BOUSTANIS OFFICE FOR PENDING HEARING
		HARRISON, TINA	04/10/2013	0.70	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE AND INDEX TO DR. ZALDIVAR FORWARDING DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	04/10/2013	0.30	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE WHAT DOCUMENTS NEED TO BE SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/10/2013	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/10/2013	0.50	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR FOR REVIEW FOR DEPOSITION; COMPARE EVIDENCE IN THE RECORD AND OTHER INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS AND MEDICAL TREATMENT RECORDS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/11/2013	0.60	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/11/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.			04/11/2013	1.30	REVIEW MATERIALS SENT TO DR. GHIO, REPORT, CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE, IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION OF DR. GHIO
PAULEY, PAULETTE			04/11/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
VANCE, UTE			04/11/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.			04/12/2013	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL
TAYLOR, DEBRA			04/12/2013	0.20	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.			04/12/2013	0.40	PREPARE FOR DEPOSITION, DIRECT FAXING DR. GHIO REPORT TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.			04/12/2013	1.50	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DR. GHIO; DEPOSE DR. GHIO
VANCE, UTE			04/15/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.			04/15/2013	0.80	REVIEW EVIDENCE IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.			04/15/2013	0.50	MEET WITH DR. ZALDIVAR IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.			04/15/2013	1.70	TRAVEL TO AND DEPOSE DR. ZALDIVAR
VANCE, UTE			04/16/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE AND OF CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.			04/16/2013	0.80	TELEPHONE CALLS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAY REQUESTS
VANCE, UTE			04/18/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF DR. GHIO'S DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.			04/18/2013	5.50	TRAVEL TO AND APPEAR FOR HEARING
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.			04/19/2013	0.40	REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND DR. GHIO, COMPARE WITH NOTES AND ISSUES
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.			04/19/2013	0.30	REVIEW AND SIGN SUBMISSIONS OF EVIDENCE TO JUDGE
CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.			04/19/2013	0.50	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.			04/19/2013	0.30	REVIEW AND MEMORIALIZE HEARING NOTES AND POST-HEARING DEADLINES
TAYLOR, DEBRA			04/19/2013	0.20	REVIEWING CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND VERIFYING CLAIM STATUS
TAYLOR, DEBRA			04/19/2013	0.40	REVIEWING STATUS OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S TESTIMONY AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE SUBMITTING TESTIMONY

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/19/2013	0.40	REVIEWING STATUS OF DR. GHIO'S TESTIMONY AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE SUBMITTING TESTIMONY
		HARRISON, TINA	04/23/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/25/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR COURT REPORTER FEE FROM BONNIE WOLFE/CR
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION AND DEPOSITION FROM DR. ZALDIVAR
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR COURT REPORTER FEE FROM DR. ZALDIVAR
		EVANS, LAWRENCE T TOTAL		23.00	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00963	FERRELL, BOBBY JOE			
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/02/2013	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL FROM COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/03/2013	0.10	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE GRANTING CONTINUANCE AND UPDATING CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/05/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/09/2013	0.10	CONFIRMING HEARING SCHEDULED CONTINUED AND UPDATING CLAIM
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/12/2013	0.20	REVIEW EVIDENCE SUBMISSION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/12/2013	0.30	REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT; COMPARE WITH NOTES
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/12/2013	0.30	REVIEWING STATUS OF RECEIPT OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S TESTIMONY AND DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR COURT REPORTER FEES FROM DAVID BOLIN
		HARRISON, TINA	04/17/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		FERRELL, BOBBY JOE TOTAL		1.70	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00867	FLOYD, THEODORE			
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM ST. MARY'S FAMILY CARE CENTER
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/18/2013	0.40	REVIEW CT SCAN FILM, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND TREATMENT RECORD READINGS (3); REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE REQUESTING CONSULTATION (1)
		VANCE, UTE	04/19/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM NORTON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02320	LESTER, SHANNON	04/23/2013	0.30	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM NORTON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL
		HARRISON, TINA	04/24/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/25/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		FLOYD, THEODORE TOTAL FREETAGE, ALLEN M.		1.20	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02281	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/03/2013	0.90	CHECK STATUS OF CASE AND CASE DEVELOPMENT; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS RE SAME; CHECK FOR ANY FURTHER ACTION BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FOLLOWING REMAND; CHECK FOR ANY FURTHER ACTION OR APPEARANCE BY OR ON BEHALF OF CLAIMANT; CHECK STATUS OF DEVELOPMENT AND DISCOVERY, AND ACTION NEEDED
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/19/2013	1.00	REVIEW FILE FOR INFORMATION ON A DISABLED CHILD OF DECEASED MINER. PREPARED SECOND REQUEST FOR EMPLOYER'S INTERROGATORIES, MEDICAL RELEASE, AND LETTER OF ADMINISTRATIVE.
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/22/2013	0.40	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND INFORMATION RE DISABLED CHILD, AND REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S DAUGHTER RE SAME
		PAULEY, PAULETTE FREETAGE, ALLEN M. TOTAL FULK, JR., RUSSELL	04/29/2013	0.10 2.40	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; PREPARE MAIL
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02281	PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/01/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/02/2013	0.40	REVIEW NOTES FROM CONVERSATIONS WITH CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL, EMAILS FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND PATRIOT REGARDING WITHDRAWING APPEAL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/02/2013	0.30	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE WITHDRAWING APPEAL AND REPORTING SETTLEMENT OF ATTORNEY FEES
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/02/2013	0.10	REVIEW INVOICE FROM FAIRFIELD MEDICAL CENTER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/03/2013	0.30	PREPARE FAXES TO CANCEL MEDICAL RECORD REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		HARRISON, TINA	04/04/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/09/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/11/2013	0.20	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. BRANDTIZ; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	04/16/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL'S FEE APPLICATION AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/18/2013	0.50	REVIEW FEE PETITION RECEIVED FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL; COMPARE WITH CASE MATERIALS, PREVIOUS FILINGS WITH JUDGE; EMAILS TO AND FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE SAME
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FULK, JR., RUSSELL TOTAL		2.50	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01176	GARDNER, PAUL R.			
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S SIGNED MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/19/2013	0.50	REVIEW ORDER OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR; COMPARE WITH CASE MATERIALS, PROCEDURAL HISTORY (4); REVIEW AND SIGN REQUEST FOR HEARING (1)
		VANCE, UTE	04/19/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/19/2013	0.20	REVIEWING LETTER FROM CLAIMANT ENCLOSING RELEASE AND UPDATING CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/19/2013	0.30	DRAFTING RESPONSE TO AWARD ORDER TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND REQUESTING HEARING BEFORE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (2); REVIEWING PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING DOCKET WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE (1)
		HARRISON, TINA	04/24/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/24/2013	0.40	REVIEW INTERROGATORIES; PREPARE MEDICAL REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/24/2013	0.30	REVIEW OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO EMPLOYERS INTERROGATORIES FOR NEW MEDICAL INFORMATION IN PREP FOR HEARING
		VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S MOTION TO SUBSTITUTE PARTIES AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES WITHOUT MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR PAY ORDERS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM GENESIS RE MEDICAL RECORDS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/30/2013	0.10	REVIEW INVOICE FROM DR. POOLE; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		GARDNER, PAUL R. TOTAL		2.90	

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02448	GARZA, ELIEZER F. VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013	0.90	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CLAIMANT'S ANSWER TO INTERROGATORIES AND EVIDENCE TO DETERMINE RECORDS NEEDED IN DEFENSE OF CLAIM (2); DRAFTING REQUESTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS, RADIOLOGY FILMS AND PATHOLOGY SLIDES (7)
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02585	GARZA, ELIEZER F. TOTAL GIBSON, JAMES LEVI PAULEY, PAULETTE VANCE, UTE TAYLOR, DEBRA VANCE, UTE	04/02/2013	0.40	PREPARE MEDICAL AND X RAY REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
			04/15/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
			04/24/2013	0.30	REVIEWING LETTER FROM CLAIMANT WITHDRAWING CLAIM AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC FILE
			04/29/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
				0.90	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02625	GIBSON, JAMES LEVI TOTAL GOODWIN, CALVIN (PRED) FRAMPTON, PAUL E. FRAMPTON, PAUL E. VANCE, UTE	04/22/2013	0.70	REVIEW NEW CASE RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS, STATUS, PROCEDURAL HISTORY, SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, MEDICAL TREATMENT RECORDS, AUTOPSY, AND ISSUES REVIEW DRAFT LITIGATION PLAN, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE AND APPROVE
			04/23/2013	0.30	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR FOR INITIALIZING LITIGATION PROCESS (2); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (1); OPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER (1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (2); DRAFTING SUMMARY SHEET (2); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, DEATH CERTIFICATE, AUTOPSY REPORT AND MEDICAL RECORDS (4); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION STRATEGY (2); DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2)
			04/23/2013	1.90	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02555	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/24/2013	0.20	REVIEW NOTICE OF APPEARANCE AND COMPARE WITH CASE MATERIALS, AND SIGN
		GOODWIN, CALVIN (FREDA) TOTAL GRAHAM, JAMES G.		3.40	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02433	PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/10/2013	0.40	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. BOUSTANI; PUT IN DATE ORDER; REVIEW CD RE X RAYS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/15/2013	0.50	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. MARIA BOUSTANI
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/30/2013	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CAMC RE RECORDS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		GRAHAM, JAMES G. TOTAL GREENWOOD, LEWIS G.		1.00	
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR RADIOLOGY FILMS FROM GENESIS BETHESDA
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/03/2013	0.10	REVIEW INVOICE FROM FAIRFIELD MEDICAL CENTER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/04/2013	0.30	RECEIPT OF PAST DUE INVOICE FROM FAIRFIELD MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE (.1); REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF INVOICE (.1); DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO UNDERWRITERS REGARDING STATUS OF PAYMENT OF INVOICE (.1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/04/2013	0.70	CHECK STATUS OF CASE AND CASE DEVELOPMENT; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS; CHECK FOR ANY FURTHER ACTION BY OALJ; CHECK FOR ANY ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FROM CLAIMANT; CHECK STATUS OF MEDICAL RECORD DEVELOPMENT; DIRECT EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/05/2013	0.20	PREPARE MEMO TO FAIRFIELD MEDICAL RE STATUS OF PAYMENT OF INVOICE; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/08/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DR. MULLINS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
LESTER, SHANNON	04/25/2013	0.50	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE STATUS OF CASE AND WHAT TASKS NEED TO BE ACCOMPLISHED BEFORE ALJ HEARING		
LESTER, SHANNON	04/25/2013	0.50	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RIVERSIDE MEMORIAL HOSPITAL		
LESTER, SHANNON	04/25/2013	0.50	DRAFTED EMPLOYER'S SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE UPON CLAIMANT		
PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/25/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RIVERSIDE METHODIST; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM		

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02612	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/26/2013	0.40	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY, CHECK FOR ANY APPEARANCE OF COUNSEL, AND REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT RE SAME
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM MOUNT CARMEL HOSPITAL
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; PREPARE MAIL
		GREENWOOD, LEWIS G. TOTAL		3.90	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02612	GRIFFITH, ARNOLD D			
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM OCEANA MEDICAL CENTER REGARDING OUR MEDICAL RECORD REQUEST
		VANCE, UTE	04/02/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM BECKLEY ARH REGARDING OUR X-RAY REQUESTS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/02/2013	0.50	RECEIPT OF LIST OF ALL RADIOLOGY FILMS AT RALEIGH CANCER CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); REVIEWING LIST TO DETERMINE FILMS BENEFICIAL TO DEFENSE OF CLAIM (2); DRAFTING NEW REQUEST FOR RADIOLOGY FILMS TO RALEIGH CANCER CENTER (2)
		VANCE, UTE	04/02/2013	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM RALEIGH CANCER CENTER REGARDING OUR RADIOLOGY FILM REQUESTS
		VANCE, UTE	04/03/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EXTENSION REQUEST AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/04/2013	0.50	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS (4)
		VANCE, UTE	04/04/2013	0.40	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS AND 2 COMPACT DISCS FROM RALEIGH CANCER CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISCS TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISCS (2)
		VANCE, UTE	04/05/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/09/2013	0.10	REVIEWING DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISC RECEIVED FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISC (1)

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR RADIOLOGY FILMS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR X-RAY READINGS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM BECKLEY ONCOLOGY ASSOCIATES
		HARRISON, TINA	04/17/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/17/2013	0.60	CONFIRM EXAMINATION SCHEDULE AND ARRANGEMENTS (1); REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR FOR CONSULTATION AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND IN CASE MATERIALS (3); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR (1); CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR RADIOGRAPHIC CONSULTATION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER (.1)
		VANCE, UTE	04/17/2013	0.50	DRAFTING REFERRAL LETTER TO DR. ZALDIVAR (2); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR READING OF ZALDIVAR FILM (1); PREPARING REFERRAL PACKET FOR DR. ZALDIVAR (2)
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		GRIFFITH, ARNOLD D TOTAL		4.10	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02445	GUNNOE, KERMIT			
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR X-RAY AND CT SCAN READINGS FROM DR. MEYER
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/01/2013	0.10	REVIEW INVOICE FROM DR. BOUSTANI; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/02/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM BECKLEY ARH REGARDING OUR X-RAY REQUESTS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/04/2013	0.10	REVIEWING STATUS OF CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO NOTICE OF HEARING DEADLINE FOR NEW ISSUES
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/10/2013	0.20	FAX MEDICAL RELEASE TO DR. SALON'S OFFICE; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/11/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. SALON; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.40	REVIEW EVIDENCE AND ISSUES;
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.30	EMAIL TO PATRIOT RE STATUS AND ISSUES
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/12/2013	0.10	REVIEWING READINGS FROM DR. SHIPLEY'S OFFICE AND UPDATING CLAIM

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00858	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/12/2013	0.20	REVIEW EMAIL FROM PATRIOT RE WITHDRAWING CONTEST OF CASE	
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/12/2013	0.60	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING CLAIM AND UPDATING FILE	
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. BOUSTANI	
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM ACCESS HEALTH	
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/15/2013	0.50	PREPARING CLAIM FOR PENDING HEARING AND DRAFTING OFFICIAL TRANSCRIPT REQUEST	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/15/2013	0.70	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL FOR HEARING	
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/15/2013	0.30	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLERK OF JUDGE	
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/25/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE	
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		GUNNOE, KERMIT TOTAL			4.40	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00051	HALSEY, CLIFFORD O.	04/30/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORD FOLLOW UP SHEET; RESEARCH OLD MEDICAL RECORDS; SCAN DEATH CERTIFICATE; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM	
		PAULEY, PAULETTE		0.30		
		HALSEY, CLIFFORD O. TOTAL			0.30	
		HAMPTON, EUGENE				
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM ST. FRANCIS HOSPITAL REGARDING OUR MEDICAL RECORDS	
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	REQUEST AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/19/2013	0.50	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM ST. FRANCIS HOSPITAL	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/26/2013	1.40	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE STATUS OF CASE AND WHAT TASKS NEED TO BE ACCOMPLISHED BEFORE ALJ HEARING	
		HAMPTON, EUGENE TOTAL			2.10	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS; TELEPHONE CALLS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS
		HARLESS, JAMES C.				
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02601	PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/26/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE	
		HARLESS, JAMES C. TOTAL			0.10	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01708	HARMAN, JOHN R				

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/22/2013	0.80	CHECK STATUS OF CASE FOR UPCOMING BRIEFING DEADLINE; REVIEW POST HEARING DEADLINES, STATUS OF CASE, ACTION BY CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEATH OF CLAIMANT AND SUBSTITUTION OF PARTY, STATUS OF DISCOVERY AND RECORD DEVELOPMENT FOLLOWING DEATH
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/26/2013	0.20	REVIEW AND EDIT CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE RE STATUS AND DEADLINES
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/26/2013	0.80	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING MOTION TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE TO EXTEND TIME TO FILE CLOSING ARGUMENT
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/26/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING EXTENSION TO FILE BRIEF
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/26/2013	0.20	REVIEW INFORMATION REGARDING CONTACT WITH CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE STATUS AND DEADLINES
		HARMAN, JOHN R TOTAL		2.20	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02243	HARMON, WILLIE			
		VANCE, UTE	04/19/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/22/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/25/2013	0.40	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE GRANTING PROOF TIME AND EXTENSION TO FILE BRIEFS AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH NEW DEADLINES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/25/2013	0.20	REVIEW INFORMATION FROM CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE DEPOSITION; DIRECT RESPONSE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/25/2013	0.50	REVIEW REPORT OF DR. RASMUSSEN AND ISSUES FOR DEPOSITION
		HANCOCK, THOMAS	04/26/2013	3.70	TRAVEL TO BECKLEY, WEST VIRGINIA TO ATTEND DEPOSITION AND CROSS-EXAMINE DR. DONALD L. RASMUSSEN
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/26/2013	0.50	DISCUSS RASMUSSEN OPINION AND STRATEGY FOR ISSUES TO BE ADDRESSED AT DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/26/2013	0.40	REVIEW TRANSCRIPT OF DR. ROSENBERG DEPOSITION, COMPARE WITH NOTES FROM DEPOSITION AND CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/26/2013	0.20	REVIEW AND SIGN EVIDENCE SUBMISSION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/26/2013	0.50	TELEPHONE CALL TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION; REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE FOR DEPOSITION

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02299	HANCOCK, THOMAS	04/26/2013	1.70	REVIEWING MEDICAL RECORDS AND REPORTS AND DRAFTING BRIEF OUTLINE OF QUESTIONS AND ISSUES FOR USE AT DEPOSITION AND CROSS-EXAMINATION OF DR. DONALD L. RASMUSSEN
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION AND DEPOSITION FROM DR. ROSENBERG
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; PREPARE MAIL
		HARMON, WILLIE TOTAL		8.60	
		HARRIS, JERRY L, SR.			
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/03/2013	0.40	PREPARE MEDICAL RECORDS AND X RAY REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.10	REVIEW INVOICE AND CORRESPONDENCE FORM RIVERSIDE METHODIST RE RECORDS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RIVERSIDE METHODIST HOSPITAL
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/22/2013	0.10	REVIEW FAX FROM DR. HAGGENIOS RE X RAYS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/23/2013	0.50	REVIEW INVOICE FROM RIVERSIDE METHODIST; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02532	VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR RADIOLOGY FILMS FROM RIVERSIDE METHODIST HOSPITAL
		HARRIS, JERRY L, SR. TOTAL		1.30	
		HATFIELD, JAMES (DONNA)			
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/05/2013	0.20	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CAMC RE EXECUTRIX; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/11/2013	0.10	REVIEW INVOICE FROM LOGAN REGIONAL; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/22/2013	0.50	REVIEW INVOICE FROM LOGAN REGIONAL; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/23/2013	0.50	TELEPHONE CALL WITH WILLIAMSON MEMORIAL RE FILMS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM SATHISH & RADHA IM GROUP
		HATFIELD, JAMES (DONNA) TOTAL		1.40	
		HICKS, WALTER THOMAS			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01618	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/09/2013	0.20	REVIEW VOICEMAIL MESSAGE FROM CLERK OF JUDGE; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS RE SAME
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/10/2013	0.40	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLERK OF JUDGE REGARDING EXHIBITS AND SCHEDULING TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE; REVIEW DIRECTOR EXHIBITS RE SAME

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/12/2013	0.50	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE AND APPEAR FOR TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE
HICKS, WALTER THOMAS TOTAL					
HOOD, RAYMOND K.					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02578	PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/03/2013	0.20	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FOLLOW UP SHEET; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
HOOD, RAYMOND K. TOTAL					
HORVWALT, ROBERT D.					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02570	LESTER, SHANNON	04/03/2013	0.80	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE OF DR. COHEN'S TIME OF 2/27/2013 PERFORMED BY CLAIMANT COUNSEL
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/09/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/18/2013	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/18/2013	0.50	REVIEW FILE AND DRAFTED EMPLOYER'S SECOND REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE UPON CLAIMANT.
		VANCE, UTE	04/22/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF MOTION FROM DIRECTOR'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	04/24/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/25/2013	0.50	PREPARED EXHIBITS TO EMPLOYER'S RESPONSE TO CLAIMANT'S REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RECORDS PRODUCTION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/25/2013	1.70	REVIEW VARIOUS DISCOVERY REQUESTS BY CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (4); REVIEW CASE MATERIALS FOR DOCUMENTS TO PRODUCE IN RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION, REPORTS AND MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM DR. RENN, AND MATERIALS SENT TO DR. RENN, REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS (9); DRAFT RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION (4)
		VANCE, UTE	04/25/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	04/26/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
HORVWALT, ROBERT D. TOTAL					
JACKSON, JACKIE					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02496	PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/08/2013	0.20	REVIEW CD FROM WAKE FOREST RE X-RAYS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/08/2013	0.30	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE CT SCAN FROM WAKE FOREST

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02220	JACKSON, JACKIE TOTAL		0.50	
		KENNEDY, CLARENCE J.			
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/04/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; PREPARE MAIL
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/04/2013	0.40	REVIEWING STATUS OF CLAIM AND DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE SUBMITTING READING BY DR. SCOTT
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/05/2013	0.40	CHECK STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT AND FOR ANY ACTION OF COURT ON MOTION TO DISMISS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/05/2013	0.30	CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE REQUESTING RULING ON MOTION TO DISMISS AND EXTENSION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/05/2013	0.40	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS; DESIGNATE EVIDENCE AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE
		HARRISON, TINA	04/08/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/09/2013	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/11/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/12/2013	0.50	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/22/2013	0.70	REVIEW EMAIL FROM UNDERWRITERS WITH NEW CASE MATERIALS REGARDING CLAIM BY SURVIVOR; COMPARE WITH CASE MATERIALS, EVIDENCE, ISSUES IN MINER'S CASE; REVIEW STATUS OF DISCOVERY
		KENNEDY, CLARENCE J. TOTAL		3.60	
		LAFFERTY, MARVIN RAY			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02050	LESTER, SHANNON	04/05/2013	0.40	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE X-RAYS FROM CAMC
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/05/2013	0.30	REVIEW RADIOLOGY CD FROM CAMC; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/09/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/09/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	04/09/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.20	REVIEW AND SIGN REQUEST FOR CONSULTATION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.20	REVIEW FILM AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/11/2013	0.50	REVIEW CLAIMANT'S 2/12/13 FILM AND DRAFTED CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER FOR REBUTTAL READING.
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF X-RAY FILM FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM PULMONARY ASSOCIATES OF CHARLESTON

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01136	PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; PREPARE MAIL
		HARRISON, TINA	04/17/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		LAFFERTY, MARVIN RAY TOTAL		2.30	
LAMB, ALVIN J.					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01136	VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		LAMB, ALVIN J. TOTAL		0.10	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02598	LINVILLE, GREGORY C.	04/23/2013	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ATKINS REGARDING OUR RECORD REQUEST
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.70	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM DR. ROBERT ATKINS AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.40	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. ADKINS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); PUTTING RECORDS INTO DATE CHRONOLOGICAL ORDER IN PREPARATION FOR ELECTRONIC INPUT AND REVIEW AND ANALYSIS (3)
VANCE, UTE					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00180	VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM MADISON MEDICAL PLLC
		LINVILLE, GREGORY C. TOTAL		1.30	
LONG, KENNETH E./FED. BLACK LUNG					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02037	PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/22/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. HESS; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/23/2013	0.30	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. MICHAEL HESS
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/23/2013	0.50	DRAFT SECOND REQUEST FOR EMPLOYER'S SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE UPON CLAIMANT
FRAMPTON, PAUL E.					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02037	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/24/2013	0.40	REVIEW DISCOVERY, CONTINUED DISCOVERY PROBLEMS (3); REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL (1)
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/25/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02037	HARRISON, TINA	04/26/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		LONG, KENNETH E./FED. BLACK LUNG TOTAL		1.70	
LUSK, RALPH EMERSON					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02037	PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/04/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; CHECK FILE COPIES
		HARRISON, TINA	04/04/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/10/2013	0.40	REVIEW NEW INTERROGATORIES; PREPARE MEDICAL AND X RAY REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM BLUEFIELD PULMONARY AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM BLUEFIELD PULMONARY CONSULTANTS
		VANCE, UTE	04/16/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM BLUEFIELD REGIONAL HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/16/2013	0.40	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM BLUEFIELD PULMONARY CONSULTANT
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/17/2013	0.40	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE X-RAYS AND CTS FROM BLUEFIELD REGIONAL
		VANCE, UTE	04/19/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/24/2013	0.20	REVIEW INTERROGATORIES; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM ROANOKE CARLION; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/30/2013	0.70	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. ANTHONY RASI AND CARLION ROANOKE MEMORIAL HOSPITAL
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/30/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. RASI; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LUSK, RALPH EMERSON TOTAL		3.60	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00376	LUSK, RALPH J.			
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/09/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/09/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		LUSK, RALPH J. TOTAL		0.20	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02062	LUSK, RICKY N.			
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/01/2013	0.10	REVIEW INVOICE FROM PULMONARY ASSOCIATES; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/01/2013	1.00	RESEARCH ON MISSING X-RAY AND CT'S CLAIMANT COUNSEL HAS REQUESTED FOR REBUTTAL
		VANCE, UTE	04/02/2013	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DR. ZALDIVAR'S DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/02/2013	0.40	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION; TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	04/04/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/09/2013	0.30	REVIEWING CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING X-RAY

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/09/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/09/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/09/2013	0.50	REVIEW OF CLAIMANT'S SECOND REQUEST FOR X-RAY AND CTS. CONTINUED SEARCH FOR MISSING CTS.
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.10	REVIEW INVOICE FROM CAMC; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM PULMONARY ASSOCIATES OF CHARLESTON
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/22/2013	0.10	REVIEW INVOICE FROM PULMONARY ASSOCIATES; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DR. GREY; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR RECORD REVIEW AND REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/30/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. LAO; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LUSK, RICKY N. TOTAL		4.10	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02618	LYONS, GEORGE (RUBY)			
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/03/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DR. NAZER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/03/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/04/2013	0.40	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE X-RAYS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/04/2013	0.80	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/04/2013	0.00	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE STATUS OF CASE AND WHAT TASKS NEED TO BE ACCOMPLISHED BEFORE ALJ HEARING
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/04/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/05/2013	0.20	REVIEW RADIOLOGY CD FROM RALEIGH GENERAL; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		HARRISON, TINA	04/05/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM THE GREENBRIER CLINIC
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CLINCH VALLEY MEDICAL CENTER
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR X-RAY FILMS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL'S RADIOLOGY DEPARTMENT
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.20	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CAMC RE AUTHORIZATION; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/23/2013	0.50	TELEPHONE CALL WITH GREENBRIER CLINIC RE RECORDS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.40	REVIEW INVOICE FROM RALEIGH GENERAL; REVIEW CD FROM CAMC; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LYONS, GEORGE (RUBY) TOTAL		3.50	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01254	MASSEY, ROBERT E.			
		VANCE, UTE	04/16/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/17/2013	0.10	REVIEWING DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES REGARDING MODIFICATION PROCEEDINGS IN MINER'S CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/22/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF RENEWED REQUEST FOR MODIFICATION IN MINER'S AND WIDOW'S CLAIMS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		MASSEY, ROBERT E. TOTAL		0.50	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02465	MCCOY, GEORGE F.			
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM FAIRMONT GENERAL HOSPITAL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/01/2013	0.60	CHECK STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT; CHECK FOR RECEIPT OF EXAMINATION REPORT; REVIEW MEDICAL TREATMENT RECORDS RECEIVED TO DATE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/03/2013	0.40	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM FAIRMONT GENERAL HOSPITAL
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/03/2013	0.30	DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR READING OF FILM AND UPDATING CLAIM
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/03/2013	0.10	REVIEWING LETTER FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL FOR FORWARDING FILE FOR READING
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/03/2013	0.20	REVIEW X-RAY FILM, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/03/2013	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS REQUESTING CONSULTATION
		VANCE, UTE	04/04/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CONSULTING REPORT FROM DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/08/2013	0.90	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS; TELEPHONE CALLS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAY REQUESTS

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/08/2013	0.60	REVIEWING MEDICAL REPORT FROM DR. ZALDIVAR AND DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/08/2013	0.40	UPDATING DRAFT OF EVIDENCE SUMMARY
		HARRISON, TINA	04/09/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/09/2013	0.50	REVIEW REPORT FROM DR. ZALDIVAR; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD, DOL EXAMINATION REPORT AND TEST RESULTS, DR. RENN REPORT AND TEST RESULTS, AND ISSUES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/09/2013	0.30	REVIEW EVIDENCE SUBMISSIONS AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/09/2013	0.40	REVIEW EVIDENCE TO DATE FROM PARTIES AND DIRECT ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT FOR HEARING
		HARRISON, TINA	04/10/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/11/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. RENN REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/11/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR RECORD REVIEW AND REPORT FROM DR. ZALDIVAR
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/15/2013	0.50	REVIEW SCHEDULE OF DR. RENN AND CONFIRM DEPOSITION; REVIEW AND SIGN NOTICE OF DEPOSITION AND CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/15/2013	0.60	DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION; TELEPHONE CALL TO COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/16/2013	0.40	REVIEW SCHEDULE OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND CONFIRM DEPOSITION; REVIEW AND SIGN NOTICE OF DEPOSITION AND CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/16/2013	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR, CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION; DRAFTING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION; UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/18/2013	0.30	DRAFTING LETTER REGARDING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR AND UPDATING CLAIM
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/19/2013	0.40	REVIEW NOTICE TO JUDGE RE ISSUES; COMPARE WITH CASE MATERIALS AND RECORD (.3); SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE (.1)
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/22/2013	0.40	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANTS COUNSEL REGARDING CLOSING
		HARRISON, TINA	04/23/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/24/2013	0.20	VERIFYING STATUS OF EVIDENTIARY DEVELOPMENT PURSUANT TO PENDING DEADLINE BEFORE THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORT FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR X-RAY READING FROM JOHNS HOPKINS
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/29/2013	0.80	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL AND DRAFTING PREHEARING REPORT
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/29/2013	1.00	DRAFTING MOTION TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE TO HOLD RECORD OPEN FOR REBUTTAL READING
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/29/2013	0.50	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE FROM CLAIMANT AND OTHER INFORMATION ABOUT THE DIGITAL FILM; CHECK STATUS OF FILM; DIRECT ADDITIONAL ACTION AND EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/29/2013	0.80	CONFIRM DEPOSITION SCHEDULE AND REVIEW OTHER POSSIBLE POST HEARING EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT NECESSARY IN LIGHT OF PROBLEMS WITH X-RAY FILM (4); REVIEW AND EDIT MOTION TO HOLD THE RECORD OPEN (3); REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE (1)
		MCCOY, GEORGE F TOTAL		12.80	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02604	MCGINNIS, HOWARD (OPAL)			
		VANCE, UTE	04/04/2013	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	04/04/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/16/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/17/2013	0.30	REVIEWING PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING DOCKET WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE (1); DRAFTING RESPONSE TO PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (2)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/18/2013	0.40	REVIEW DECISION OF DISTRICT DIRECTOR, REVIEW EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/18/2013	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR RE DENIAL
		HARRISON, TINA	04/24/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
			04/24/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. OESTERLING REGARDING INVOICE (1); REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF PAYMENT OF INVOICE FROM DR. OESTERLING AND FORWARDING RENEWED REQUEST TO UNDERWRITERS (1)
MCGINNIS, HOWARD (OPAL) TOTAL					
				1.60	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01858	MILAM, ROY LEE			
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM GREENBRIER VALLEY UROLOGY
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.20	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORD FOLLOW UP SHEET; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
MILAM, ROY LEE TOTAL					
				0.40	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00751	MILLER, DELVIN			
		HARRISON, TINA	04/01/2013	0.40	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE WHAT DOCUMENTS NEED TO BE SENT TO DR. ZALDIVIAR IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	04/01/2013	0.20	E-MAILS TO AND FROM DR. ZALDIVIAR'S OFFICE CONCERNING DOCUMENTS NEEDED IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/01/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/01/2013	0.30	REVIEW VOICEMAIL MESSAGE FROM CLERK OF JUDGE; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS ACCORDINGLY
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/02/2013	0.40	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION; TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVIAR AND COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/02/2013	0.70	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS, ISSUES AND STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT IN PREPARATION FOR TELEPHONIC CONFERENCE WITH COURT RE STATUS AND HEARING
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/02/2013	0.40	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING EVIDENCE STATUS, DEPOSITION SCHEDULE, AND UPCOMING HEARING
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/02/2013	0.40	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/03/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/04/2013	0.50	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
		VANCE, UTE	04/09/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/09/2013	0.30	REVIEW ORDER OF JUDGE AND COMPARE WITH INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/10/2013	0.70	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/10/2013	6.50	REVIEW OF ALL MEDICAL RECORDS FOR CLAIMANT IN SEARCH OF ANY MENTION OF SMOKING HISTORY TO PROVE DR. STOLLINGS RECORDS ARE TRUE AND PREPARED SUMMARY REPORT (11 RECORDS REVIEWED)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/10/2013	1.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM VARIOUS FACILITIES IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/10/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLAIMANTS COUNSEL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/10/2013	0.60	DEPOSE CLAIMANT
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/12/2013	2.00	REVIEW OF ALL MEDICAL RECORDS FOR CLAIMANT IN SEARCH OF ANY MENTION OF SMOKING HISTORY TO PROVE DR. STOLLINGS RECORDS ARE TRUE AND PREPARED SUMMARY REPORT (FINISHED LAST 4 RECORDS)
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION AND DEPOSITION FROM DR. ZALDIVAR
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/12/2013	0.30	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE FOR DECISION ON THE RECORD AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/17/2013	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/19/2013	0.20	REVIEW AND SIGN EVIDENCE SUBMISSION TO JUDGE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/19/2013	0.30	REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT AND COMPARE WITH NOTES
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/19/2013	0.40	REVIEWING STATUS OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S TESTIMONY AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE SUBMITTING TESTIMONY
		HARRISON, TINA	04/23/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ARDELLA MILLER'S DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR COURT REPORTER FEE FROM DAVID BOLIN/CR
		MILLER, DELVIN TOTAL		17.50	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495-02513	MILLER, RICHARD			
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM HEALTHPORT (CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER)
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/03/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/10/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. ATKINS; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/11/2013	0.90	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. ROBERT ATKINS
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/11/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM MADISON MEDICAL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/18/2013	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/18/2013	0.50	REVIEW FILE AND DRAFTED EMPLOYER'S THIRD REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE UPON CLAIMANT.
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/18/2013	0.50	DRAFTED EMPLOYER'S MOTION TO COMPEL CLAIMANT TO PROVIDED ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND AN EXECUTED MEDICAL RELEASE
		VANCE, UTE	04/22/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/23/2013	0.30	REVIEW OF CLAIMANT'S RESPONSE TO EMPLOYER'S SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES
		HARRISON, TINA	04/24/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/24/2013	0.40	REVIEW SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES; PREPARE MEDICAL REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		MILLER, RICHARD TOTAL		3.90	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01480	MOORE, JAMES G.			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/04/2013	0.60	REVIEW NEW CASE MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS, STATUS, SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE, DOL EXAMINATION AND TEST RESULTS, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS; COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN CASE MATERIALS, ISSUES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/10/2013	0.20	REVIEW DOL INFORMATION RE INSURANCE, AND TPA; SIGN CORRECTIVE CORRESPONDENCE TO DOL RE SAME
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/10/2013	0.20	CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM AND SIGN REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/10/2013	0.10	CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR CONSULTATIONS AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. MEYER
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/10/2013	0.20	REVIEW NOTICE OF APPEARANCE, COMPARE WITH INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS AND SIGN
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/10/2013	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	04/10/2013	2.00	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR FOR INITIALIZING LITIGATION PROCESS (2); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (1); REOPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER (1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (1); DRAFTING SUMMARY SHEET (2); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, AND EXAMINATION RECORDS FROM DR. RASMUSSEN (2); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION STRATEGY (2); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. MEYER FOR RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2); DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF CORRECT OPERATOR AND THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR INFORMATION (2)
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.50	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); IMPORTING DOCUMENTS FROM COMPACT DISC INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2); UPDATING CLAIM SUMMARY SHEET WITH NEW CLAIMS INFORMATION (1); DRAFTING REQUEST FOR COMPLETE CLAIM FILE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAULE.	04/12/2013	0.30	REVIEW INFORMATION REGARDING CLOSED CASE AND ATTEMPTS TO OBTAIN COPIES OF CASE MATERIALS, AND SIGN REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR RE SAME
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; PREPARE MAIL
		HARRISON, TINA	04/17/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/18/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/19/2013	0.30	INTERNET RESEARCH FOR PULMONOLOGIST ABLE TO DO AN INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION WITHIN THE 100 MILE RADIUS OF CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE (2); TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. TERRY IN BALTIMORE (1)
		VANCE, UTE	04/22/2013	0.50	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING RECORDS RECEIVED FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT DOCUMENTS

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>		
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01885	VANCE, UTE	04/22/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF COMPLETE CLAIM FILE FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
		VANCE, UTE	04/25/2013	0.40	RESEARCH TO FIND PHYSICIAN WITHIN 100-MILE DRIVING DISTANCE OF CLAIMANT'S HOME ABLE TO DO INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION (2); TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. WHEELER REQUESTING RECOMMENDATION (1); DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. TERRY (1)		
		MOORE, JAMES G. TOTAL		6.10			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01542	PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/04/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; CHECK FILE COPIES		
		HARRISON, TINA	04/04/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE		
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/08/2013	0.80	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM BROWN SUMMIT FAMILY MEDICAL		
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/08/2013	0.40	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM BROWN SUMMIT FAMILY MEDICINE; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM		
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/09/2013	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM WESTERN ROCKING MEDICAL RE INVOICE; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM		
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM BROWN SUMMIT FAMILY MEDICINE		
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
		VANCE, UTE	04/22/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/22/2013	0.90	REVIEW NOTICE OF ASSIGNMENT OF JUDGE AND ORDERS RE PROPOSED HEARING SCHEDULE; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS ACCORDINGLY RE STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT AND ADDITIONAL DEVELOPMENT NECESSARY		
		VANCE, UTE	04/23/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/25/2013	0.40	REVIEW INTERROGATORIES; PREPARE MEDICAL REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM		
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM WAKE FOREST UNIVERSITY BAPTIST HOSPITAL		
				MORGAN, STEVEN D. TOTAL		3.40	

EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01542	NEWBILL, WILBURN M., SR.	04/01/2013	0.20	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DR. CARDONA AND DR. AGARWAL; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE			

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/03/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DR. QAZI; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/03/2013	0.50	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE STATUS OF CASE AND WHAT TASKS NEED TO BE ACCOMPLISHED BEFORE ALJ HEARING
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/03/2013	0.30	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. NAEEM QAZI
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/04/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM TUG RIVER CLINIC; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/08/2013	0.10	REVIEW INVOICE FROM BLUEFIELD REGIONAL MEDICAL CENTER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/09/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF X-RAY FILMS FROM TUG RIVER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/09/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. BRICK; PUT IN ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/09/2013	0.50	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. JAMES BRICK
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/11/2013	0.20	REVIEW X-RAY FROM TUG RIVER HEALTH ASSOCIATIONS AND ORGANIZED CASE MATERIAL
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM BLUEFIELD REGIONAL MEDICAL CENTER
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. QAZI
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/17/2013	0.90	REVIEW AND PUT MEDICAL RECORDS IN CHRONOLOGICAL ORDER FOR ELECTRONIC FILE.
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/22/2013	0.50	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CARLION ROANOKE MEMORIAL
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/24/2013	2.00	REVIEW CD WITH MEDICAL RECORDS FROM ST. LUKE'S; PRINT RECORDS; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM ST. LUKE'S HOSPITAL
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM WELCH COMMUNITY HOSPITAL
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM PRINCETON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CARLION ROANOKE MEMORIAL HOSPITAL
				6.40	
					NEWBILL, WILBURN M., SR. TOTAL
					PACK, RONALD, E.
					EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP. P0495.01406

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/22/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	04/23/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/23/2013	0.20	REVIEW AND SIGN RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR RE DECISION
		VANCE, UTE	04/23/2013	0.30	REVIEWING PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING DOCKET WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE (1); DRAFTING RESPONSE TO PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (2)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/23/2013	0.60	REVIEW DECISION OF DISTRICT DIRECTOR, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, COMPARE WITH INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS AND EVIDENCE OF RECORD, AND ISSUES
				1.60	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02616	PACK, RONALD, E. TOTAL			
		PATRICK, HERMAN C.			
		VANCE, UTE	04/04/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/10/2013	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR ACTIONS NEEDED AT RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY (1)
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.20	DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF REBUTTAL EVIDENCE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.30	REVIEW AND CONFIRM EVIDENCE BEING SUBMITTED, AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.30	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS, COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES; DESIGNATE EVIDENCE
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES (1); DRAFTING SECOND REQUEST FOR DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (2)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/12/2013	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; PREPARE MAIL
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR X-RAY READINGS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS MEDICINE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	04/17/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT UPCOMING DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE (1); DRAFTING MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME AND MOTION TO COMPEL INTERROGATORIES (.3)
		HARRISON, TINA FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/17/2013 04/18/2013	0.20 0.30	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE REVIEW PROJECTED DATES OF EVIDENCE COMPLETION, EVIDENCE DEADLINES, AND REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENT TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR REQUESTING EXTENSION
		HARRISON, TINA VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013 04/24/2013	0.10 0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR EXTENDING TIME FRAMES AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/25/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/25/2013	0.10	REVIEWING DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	1.70	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES TO DETERMINE MEDICAL RECORDS NEEDED IN DEFENSE OF CLAIM (.3); INTERNET RESEARCH OF AREA OF EXPERTISE AND CONTACT INFORMATION OF PHYSICIANS NAMED IN CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES (2); DRAFTING NUMEROUS REQUESTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS AND RADIOLOGY FILMS (1.2)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/29/2013	0.30	CONFIRM EXAMINATION ARRANGEMENTS, SCHEDULE, REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; PREPARE MAIL
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; PREPARE MAIL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/30/2013	0.50	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR FOR REVIEW, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE IN THE RECORD, MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, TREATMENT RECORDS TO DETERMINE ADDITIONAL MATERIALS TO SEND
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/30/2013	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR WITH MATERIALS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/30/2013	0.20	CONFIRM RADIOLOGIST FOR CONSULTATION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/30/2013	0.20	REVIEW CD FROM PRINCETON; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PATRICK, HERMAN C. TOTAL		6.60	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02543	PATTON, WILLIE			

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01977	VANCE, UTE	04/05/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/08/2013	0.30	REVIEW INTERROGATORIES; PREPARE MED REQUEST TO CAMC; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PATTON, WILLIE TOTAL PAULEY, ROBERT D.	04/22/2013	2.00	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR FOR INITIALIZING LITIGATION PROCESS (2); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (1); REOPENING CLIENT MATTER (1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (2); DRAFTING SUMMARY SHEET (2); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, AND EXAMINATION RECORDS FROM DR. ALLEN (3); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION STRATEGY (2); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2); DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/22/2013	0.70	REVIEW NEW CLAIM MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS, STATUS, WORK HISTORY, PROCEDURAL HISTORY, DOL EXAMINATION AND TEST RESULTS, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, ISSUES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/23/2013	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/23/2013	0.20	CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM AND SIGN REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/23/2013	0.20	CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR CONSULT AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/23/2013	0.20	REVIEW NOTICE OF APPEARANCE, COMPARE WITH INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DOL
		HARRISON, TINA	04/24/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, ROBERT D. TOTAL		3.70	

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02422	PENNINGTON, HAROLD LESTER, SHANNON	04/04/2013	1.00	REVIEW FILE AND DRAFTED EMPLOYER'S MOTION TO REMAND TO CONSOLIDATE THE MINER'S AND WIDOW'S CLAIM
			04/08/2013	0.20	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORD FOLLOW UP SHEET; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
				1.20	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02257	HARRISON, TINA VANCE, UTE CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D. FRAMPTON, PAUL E. FRAMPTON, PAUL E. TAYLOR, DEBRA CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D. CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D. PAULEY, PAULETTE PERSINGER, JR., WILLIAM A. TOTAL PRINCE, RICKY G.	04/04/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
			04/23/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM BOONE MEMORIAL HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
			04/23/2013	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL TO BOONE MEMORIAL HOSPITAL REGARDING X-RAYS; TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANTS COUNSEL REGARDING X-RAY
			04/26/2013	0.40	CHECK STATUS OF FILM; REVIEW FILM AND HOSPITAL READING; COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE AND CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR CONSULTATION
			04/26/2013	0.20	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS
			04/26/2013	0.40	REVIEWING RECEIPT OF FILM FROM BOONE MEMORIAL HOSPITAL AND DRAFTING LETTER FORWARDING FILM TO DR. WHEELER FOR READING
			04/26/2013	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAY TO FORWARD TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL
			04/29/2013	0.70	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAY TO FORWARD TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL
			04/30/2013	0.20	REVIEW CD FROM BOONE MEMORIAL; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
				3.20	
			EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01812	CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D. PRINCE, RICKY G. TOTAL RAMSEY, LARRY WAYNE
	0.40				
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02537	LESTER, SHANNON LESTER, SHANNON FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/15/2013	0.50	DRAFTED EMPLOYERS SUPPLEMENTAL REQUEST FOR INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE UPON CLAIMANT
			04/15/2013	0.50	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE STATUS OF CASE AND WHAT TASKS NEED TO BE ACCOMPLISHED BEFORE ALJ HEARING
			04/16/2013	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY, AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANTS COUNSEL

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>		
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02254	HARRISON, TINA	04/22/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE		
		RAMSEY, LARRY WAYNE TOTAL 1.40					
		RANKIN, LOWELL W.					
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/05/2013	0.20	CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/05/2013	0.30	REVIEW HEARING TRANSCRIPT AND PROCEDURAL HISTORY, POST HEARING DEVELOPMENT		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/05/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OFFICE OF CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL		
		HARRISON, TINA	04/09/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE		
		VANCE, UTE	04/19/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/25/2013	0.20	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING EXTENSION TO FILE BRIEFS AND UPDATING CLAIM		
		RANKIN, LOWELL W. TOTAL 1.10					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00496	RASI, DIONIGI					
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/01/2013	0.40	REVIEW DECISION OF BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD AFFIRMING DENIAL; COMPARE WITH ARGUMENT		
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/03/2013	0.20	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINE FOR APPEAL AND DEADLINE FOR RECONSIDERATION		
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/04/2013	0.20	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD DENYING BENEFITS AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR APPEAL		
		VANCE, UTE	04/22/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL'S MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION TO BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/22/2013	0.50	REVIEW MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION FILED BY CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL; COMPARE WITH DECISION OF BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD AND ARGUMENTS IN BRIEFS		
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM UNDERWRITERS REGARDING BENEFITS REVIEW BOARD'S ORDER		
		RASI, DIONIGI TOTAL 1.60					
		EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01112	RICHARDSON, JAMES G.			
				PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/02/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORD FOLLOW UP SHEET; PREPARE X RAY REQUEST TO BARH; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
HARRISON, TINA	04/02/2013			0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE		
VANCE, UTE	04/03/2013			0.10	RECEIPT OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
LESTER, SHANNON	04/04/2013			1.00	REVIEW, ORGANIZED AND PREPARED ELECTRONIC FILE OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS FROM DOL		

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02341	RICHARDSON, JAMES G. TOTAL		1.70	
		ROBINSON, DELBERT J.			
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/02/2013	1.00	REVIEW INTERROGATORIES; PREPARE MEDICAL AND X RAY REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/10/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. MUTCHER'S OFFICE RE TIME; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.20	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DR. KNIGHT; REVIEW INVOICE FROM RIVERSIDE METHODIST; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RIVERSIDE METHODIST HOSPITAL
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR RADIOLOGY FILMS FROM RIVERSIDE METHODIST HOSPITAL
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR HAGENJOS; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		2.10			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02600	ROBINSON, DELBERT J. TOTAL		2.10	
		RUNYON, FREDERICK R.			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/09/2013	0.70	REVIEW DECISION OF DISTRICT DIRECTOR AWARDING BENEFITS; REVIEW EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR; COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN RECORD AND CASE MATERIALS, AND ISSUES
		VANCE, UTE	04/09/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.30	REVIEW REQUEST FOR HEARING; COMPARE WITH CASE MATERIALS AND SIGN
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.30	DRAFTING RESPONSE TO AWARD ORDER TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND REQUESTING HEARING BEFORE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE (.1); REVIEWING PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING DOCKET WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE (.2)
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANTS SIGNED MEDICAL RELEASE FOR ST. MARY'S HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; PREPARE MAIL
		HARRISON, TINA	04/17/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02110	VANCE, UTE	04/18/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDERS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		RUNYON, FREDERICK R. TOTAL		1.90	
		SALISBURY, PAUL B.			
		VANCE, UTE	04/19/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/25/2013	0.20	REVIEWING NOTICE OF HEARING FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/25/2013	0.30	UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINES FOR EVIDENCE AND PLEADINGS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/26/2013	0.90	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS
		SALISBURY, PAUL B. TOTAL		1.50	
		SAXTON, WARREN L			
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/10/2013	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS
SAXTON, WARREN L TOTAL		0.60			
SHORT, DANNY					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02332	VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.30	REVIEWING PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING DOCKET WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE (1); DRAFTING RESPONSE TO PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER DENYING AWARD TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (2)
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM GENESIS HEALTHCARE SYSTEM
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/01/2013	0.60	REVIEW DECISION OF DISTRICT DIRECTOR; REVIEW EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR; COMPARE WITH INFORMATION AND EVIDENCE IN RECORD AND CASE MATERIALS AND ISSUES
		VANCE, UTE	04/02/2013	1.10	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM COSHOCTON COUNTY MEMORIAL HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING MEDICAL RECORDS FROM COSHOCTON COUNTY MEMORIAL HOSPITAL AND BOOKMARKING RELEVANT REPORTS (9)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/02/2013	0.20	REVIEW AND SIGN RESPONSE TO DECISION
		HARRISON, TINA	04/08/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/17/2013	0.10	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RESPONSE TO PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00333	VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION FROM DR. ROSENBERG
		SHORT, DANNY TOTAL		3.00	
		HARRISON, TINA	04/04/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/04/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/05/2013	0.50	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/05/2013	0.40	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/09/2013	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM WIDOW REGARDING REQUEST FOR DEATH CERTIFICATE AND LETTER OF ADMINISTRATION
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/29/2013	1.00	REVIEW FILE AND DRAFTED MOTION TO COMPEL CLAIMANT TO PROVIDED SIGNED EXECUTRIX OR LETTER OF ADMINISTRATION
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01372	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/29/2013	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY PROBLEMS, PAST ACTION TAKEN AND ACTION NEEDED
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/29/2013	0.30	REVISE AND EDIT MOTION
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; PREPARE MAIL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/30/2013	0.30	REVIEW AND SIGN FINAL MOTION AND CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE
		SIZEMORE, HARRY TOTAL		3.30	
		SLAUGHTER, SAMUEL H.	04/05/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	04/11/2013	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR X-RAY READINGS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS MEDICINE
		SLAUGHTER, SAMUEL H. TOTAL		0.50	
		SMITH, GARY A.	04/01/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S SIGNED MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02581	VANCE, UTE	04/03/2013	0.20	REVIEWING ORDER CHANGING VENUE FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING CLAIM
		TAYLOR, DEBRA			

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01043	HARRISON, TINA	04/04/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/18/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM MONGALIA GENERAL HOSPITAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/24/2013	0.40	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE FOR RELEVANT INFORMATION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/24/2013	0.40	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING INITIAL EVIDENCE SUMMARY LISTING EVIDENCE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/25/2013	1.20	REVIEWING AND PREPARING RECORDS FROM MONGALIA GENERAL HOSPITAL
		SMITH, GARY A. TOTAL		2.60	
		SMITH, JOHN W.			
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.50	REVIEW INVOICE FROM WELCH COMMUNITY HOSPITAL; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.40	REVIEW INTERROGATORIES; PREPARE MEDICAL AND X RAY REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		SMITH, JOHN W. TOTAL		0.90	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01737	SMITH, RALPH BENSON			
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/05/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. BRADFORD'S OFFICE RE RECORDS AND INVOICE; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/05/2013	0.10	REVIEW FAX FROM STONEWALL HOSPITAL; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/09/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. BRADFORD; PUT IN ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/09/2013	0.50	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. JOSHUA BRADFORD
		SMITH, RALPH BENSON TOTAL		1.10	
		SMOOT, RICHARD J.			
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM MEDI-COPY (LOGAN REGIONAL MEDICAL CENTER)
		VANCE, UTE	04/03/2013	0.30	RECEIPT OF INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION REPORT FROM DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF READINGS OF ZALDIVAR FILM FROM JOHNS HOPKINS (.1); DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER REQUESTING STATUS OF RE-READINGS OF ZALDIVAR FILM (.1)
		VANCE, UTE	04/04/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02605	VANCE, UTE	04/04/2013	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED AT DEADLINE FOR REBUTTAL EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	04/09/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); PUTTING RECORDS INTO DATE CHRONOLOGICAL ORDER IN PREPARATION FOR ELECTRONIC INPUT AND REVIEW AND ANALYSIS (.1) REVIEWING ZALDIVAR'S AND WHEELER'S REPORTS AND DRAFTING REVIEW SUMMARY
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.40	REVIEW REPORT FROM DR. ZALDIVAR, COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN SUBMISSION OF DR. ZALDIVAR REPORT TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR SUBMITTING DR. WHEELER REPORT
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.30	REVIEW CT SCAN FILMS, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND SIGN REQUEST FOR REVIEW TO DR. WHEELER
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.70	DRAFTING CONSULTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR RE-READING OF CT-SCANS (.3); DRAFTING SUBMISSION INTO EVIDENCE OF ZALDIVAR REPORT (.2); DRAFTING SUBMISSION INTO EVIDENCE OF WHEELER'S READING OF ZALDIVAR FILM (.2)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.30	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS; COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR X-RAY READINGS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS MEDICINE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; PREPARE MAIL
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION FROM DR. ZALDIVAR
		HARRISON, TINA	04/18/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/26/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		SMOOT, RICHARD J. TOTAL		3.70	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495:02558	SNODGRAS, PHILLIP D.I			
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/03/2013	0.30	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE REBUTTAL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/18/2013	0.30	READING BY DR. ALEXANDER OF X-RAY 2/10/12
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/18/2013	0.50	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/18/2013	0.50	DRAFTED EMPLOYER'S MOTION TO COMPEL CLAIMANT TO PROVIDED ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND AN EXECUTED MEDICAL RELEASE
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/18/2013	0.50	REVIEW FILE AND DRAFTED EMPLOYER'S THIRD REQUEST FOR SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE UPON CLAIMANT.

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02622	HARRISON, TINA	04/23/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		SNODGRASS, PHILIP D.I TOTAL		1.70	
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/08/2013	0.70	REVIEW NEW CASE MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS, STATUS, PROCEDURAL HISTORY, SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE, EXAMINATION REPORT AND TEST RESULTS FROM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DOL, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY, ISSUES REVIEW EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT PLAN, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/09/2013	0.40	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR FOR INITIALIZING LITIGATION PROCESS (2); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (1); OPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER (1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (1); DRAFTING SUMMARY SHEET (2); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, AND EXAMINATION RECORDS FROM DR. KAYI (2); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION STRATEGY (2); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. MEYER FOR RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (1)
		VANCE, UTE	04/10/2013	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT RE SAME
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/10/2013	0.20	CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM AND SIGN REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/10/2013	0.20	REVIEW NOTICE OF APPEARANCE, COMPARE WITH INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS AND SIGN
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/10/2013	0.20	CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR CONSULTATION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. MEYER
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); IMPORTING DOCUMENTS FROM COMPACT DISC INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1)
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; PREPARE MAIL
		HARRISON, TINA	04/18/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02623	VANCE, UTE	04/25/2013	0.20	REVIEWING FOR STATUS OF RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); SENDING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. MEYER REGARDING STATUS OF READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1)
		VANCE, UTE	04/25/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		SNODGRASS, EDDY A. TOTAL		4.30	
		SPICER, MARVIN P.			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.60	REVIEW NEW CASE MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS, STATUS, PROCEDURAL HISTORY, SCHEDULE FOR SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE, REPORT OF DR. WOLFE AND TEST RESULTS, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/15/2013	0.20	CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR CONSULT AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. MEYER
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/15/2013	0.20	CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM AND SIGN REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	1.70	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR FOR INITIALIZING LITIGATION PROCESS (2); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (1); OPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER (1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (1); DRAFTING SUMMARY SHEET (2); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, AND EXAMINATION RECORDS FROM DR. WOLFE (2); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION STRATEGY (2); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. MEYER FOR RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD FILM TO DR. MEYER (1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2); DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/15/2013	0.20	REVIEW NOTICE OF APPEARANCE, COMPARE WITH CASE MATERIALS AND SIGN
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/15/2013	0.20	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
		HARRISON, TINA	04/17/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/18/2013	0.30	REVIEW EXAMINATION SCHEDULE AND ARRANGEMENTS, AND REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S SCHEDULE WITH NOTICE OF IME

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02187	VANCE, UTE	04/18/2013	0.40	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ZALDIVAR'S OFFICE REGARDING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION APPOINTMENT (1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT AND TRAVEL VOUCHER TO CLAIMANT (-3)
		VANCE, UTE	04/18/2013	0.30	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM UNDERWRITERS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1);
		VANCE, UTE	04/19/2013	0.10	IMPORTING FILE DOCUMENTS ON COMPACT DISC INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2)
		VANCE, UTE	04/19/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	04/24/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		SPICER, MARVIN P. TOTAL		4.50	
		TANKERSLEY, SAMUEL R.			
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. STANKO
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR X-RAY FILMS FROM GENESIS-BETHESDA HOSPITAL
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/01/2013	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM MT. CARMEL EAST; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
LESTER, SHANNON	04/02/2013	0.30	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM GENESIS HEALTHCARE SYSTEM		
PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/02/2013	0.10	REVIEW GENESIS INVOICE; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM		
PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/05/2013	0.40	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. TRAPP; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM		
LESTER, SHANNON	04/05/2013	0.50	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. JOSEPH TRAPP		
LESTER, SHANNON	04/09/2013	0.50	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE STATUS OF CASE AND WHAT TASKS NEED TO BE ACCOMPLISHED BEFORE ALJ HEARING		
VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM GENESIS HEALTHCARE SYSTEM		
TANKERSLEY, SAMUEL R. TOTAL		2.20			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02611	TAYLOR, JERRY LEE			
VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY SLIDES AND PATHOLOGY REPORTS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1);		
VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING PATHOLOGY REPORTS RECEIVED FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER (-1)		
VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR RADIOLOGY FILMS FROM PLATEAU MEDICAL CENTER		

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR PATHOLOGY SLIDES FROM THOMAS MEMORIAL HOSPITAL
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM MEDI-COPY (PULMONARY ASSOCIATES OF CHARLESTON)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/01/2013	0.70	REVIEW MEDICAL TREATMENT RECORDS, PATHOLOGY PROCEDURE AND REPORT, CONFIRM PATHOLOGY SLIDES IN OUR POSSESSION; DIRECT NECESSARY EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT
		VANCE, UTE	04/02/2013	0.30	DRAFTING CONSULTING REQUEST TO DR. OESTERLING AND PREPARING REFERRAL PACKET
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/02/2013	0.50	REVIEW MATERIALS AND RECORDS BEING SENT TO DR. OESTERLING; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND MEDICAL TREATMENT RECORDS; CONFIRM DEADLINES; AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. OESTERLING REQUESTING CONSULTING OPINION
		HARRISON, TINA	04/05/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/09/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM PLATEAU MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); ORGANIZING MEDICAL RECORDS RECEIVED FROM PLATEAU MEDICAL CENTER INTO DATE CHRONOLOGICAL ORDER IN PREPARATION FOR ELECTRONIC INPUT AND REVIEW AND ANALYSIS (.1)
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.60	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM NEW RIVER HEALTH AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); ORGANIZING RECORDS FROM NEW RIVER HEALTH INTO DATE CHRONOLOGICAL ORDER IN PREPARATION FOR ELECTRONIC INPUT AND REVIEW AND ANALYSIS (.5)
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.10	REVIEWING DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR RADIOLOGY FILMS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL'S RADIOLOGY DEPARTMENT
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM PLATEAU MEDICAL CENTER
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM THOMAS MEMORIAL HOSPITAL
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM RALEIGH GENERAL HOSPITAL

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR X-RAY READINGS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS MEDICINE
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR PATHOLOGY SLIDES FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM NEW RIVER FAMILY HEALTH CENTER
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY REPORT FROM DR. OESTERLING AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/16/2013	0.20	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING REPORT RECEIVED FROM DR. OESTERLING
		VANCE, UTE	04/16/2013	0.70	DRAFTING REFERRAL LETTER TO DR. ZALDIVAR (2); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR READING OF ZALDIVAR FILM (1); PREPARING REFERRAL PACKET FOR DR. ZALDIVAR (4)
		FRAMPTON, PAULE	04/17/2013	0.50	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS (4); REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR (1)
		HARRISON, TINA	04/17/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAULE	04/19/2013	0.60	REVIEW CT SCAN FILMS AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND TREATMENT RECORD REPORTS (3); REVIEW PATHOLOGY REPORT FOR SENDING TO DR. WHEELER (1); REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. WHEELER REQUESTING CONSULTATION (2)
		VANCE, UTE	04/19/2013	0.40	FORWARDING DR. OESTERLING'S REPORT TO DR. ZALDIVAR FOR REVIEW PURSUANT TO INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION (1); DRAFTING CONSULTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR RE-READING OF CT SCANS AND X-RAYS (3)
		HARRISON, TINA	04/23/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR PATHOLOGY REPORT FROM DR. OESTERLING
		TAYLOR, JERRY LEE TOTAL		6.90	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495-02409	THACKER, ROBERT R.			
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF X-RAY FILM FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	04/09/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORT FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR X-RAY READINGS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS
		THACKER, ROBERT R. TOTAL		0.40	

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02403	THOMAS, ROBERT D.	04/03/2013	0.40	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FOLLOW UP SHEET; PREPARE MEDICAL AND X RAY REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02621	THOMAS, ROBERT D. TOTAL			
		THOMPSON, GEORGE L.			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/04/2013	0.70	REVIEW NEW CASE MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM UNDERWRITERS, STATUS, PROCEDURAL HISTORY, PREVIOUS FILINGS BY UNDERWRITERS, EXAMINATION REPORT AND TEST RESULTS FROM DR. RASMUSSEN, ISSUES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/05/2013	0.30	REVIEW DRAFT LITIGATION PLAN AND COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE AND ISSUES
		VANCE, UTE	04/09/2013	1.80	REVIEWING NEW FILE MATERIAL RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR FOR INITIALIZING LITIGATION PROCESS (2); CIRCULATING CONFLICT CHECK (1); OPENING NEW CLIENT MATTER (1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (1); DRAFTING SUMMARY SHEET (2); DRAFTING DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO CLAIMANT (2); REVIEWING SCHEDULE FOR THE SUBMISSION OF ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE FOR PROCEDURAL HISTORY, WORK HISTORY, ISSUES, AND EXAMINATION RECORDS FROM DR. RASMUSSEN (2); DRAFTING PROPOSED LITIGATION STRATEGY (2); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DR. WHEELER FOR RE-READING OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR FILM (1); DRAFTING REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR TO FORWARD FILM TO JOHNS HOPKINS UNIVERSITY (1); IMPORTING FILE MATERIAL INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); DOCKETING EVIDENTIARY DEADLINES (1); DRAFTING E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR REQUESTING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION DATE AND TIME (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/09/2013	0.20	CONFIRM STATUS OF FILM AND SIGN REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/09/2013	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY, COMPARE WITH PREVIOUS DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT RE SAME
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/09/2013	0.20	CONFIRM PHYSICIAN FOR CONSULTATION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO JOHNS HOPKINS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/09/2013	0.20	REVIEW NOTICE OF APPEARANCE, COMPARE WITH CASE MATERIALS AND SIGN

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		HARRISON, TINA	04/10/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF COMPACT DISC FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1); IMPORTING DOCUMENTS FROM COMPACT DISC INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/11/2013	0.20	REVIEW ARRANGEMENTS FOR EXAMINATION, SCHEDULE; COMPARE WITH DEADLINES
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.30	TELEPHONE CALL FROM DR. ZALDIVAR'S OFFICE SCHEDULING INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION (1); DRAFTING NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT AND TRAVEL VOUCHER TO CLAIMANT (2)
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; PREPARE MAIL
		HARRISON, TINA	04/18/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/25/2013	0.20	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES TO DETERMINE RECORDS NEEDED IN DEFENSE OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/25/2013	0.40	PREPARE MEDICAL RECORDS FOLLOW UP SHEET; REVIEW INTERROGATORIES; PREPARE MEDICAL AND X RAY REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/26/2013	0.10	REVIEW FAX FROM CABIN CREEK HEALTH CENTER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/29/2013	0.40	TELEPHONE CALL FROM VALLEY HEALTH REGARDING UPCOMING APPOINTMENT WITH DR. ZALDIVAR AND PREVIOUS TREATMENT BY DR. ZALDIVAR; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS FOR INFORMATION RE SAME
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/29/2013	0.20	REVIEW STATUS OF EXAMINATION ARRANGEMENT AND DIRECT ADDITIONAL TREATMENT CONFIRMATION FROM DR. ZALDIVAR IN LIGHT OF TELEPHONE CALL ON BEHALF OF CLAIMANT
		THOMPSON, GEORGE L. TOTAL		6.50	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02305	TINCHER, SR., DONALD			
		VANCE, UTE	04/05/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/08/2013	0.40	REVIEW INTERROGATORIES; PREPARE MEDICAL AND X RAY REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>		
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00510	VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/16/2013	0.50	REVIEW ATTY MANN'S REQUEST FOR X-RAY 11-24-2010. REVIEW FILE AND DRAFTED LETTER WITH RESPONSE AND X-RAY PER HIS REQUEST.		
		VANCE, UTE	04/16/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. VIDAL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/25/2013	0.30	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE X-RAY FROM CAMC		
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/25/2013	0.30	REVIEW INVOICE FROM CAMC AND CD WITH FILMS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM		
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. MELCHOR VIDAL		
		TINCHER, SR., DONALD TOTAL		1.90			
		TOLER, ALVIN L.					
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/09/2013	0.80	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS: TELEPHONE CALLS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAY REQUESTS		
		VANCE, UTE	04/09/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/10/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORD FOLLOW UP SHEET; RESEARCH OLD RECORDS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM				
TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/12/2013	0.20	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE CONTINUING HEARING AND REMANDING CLAIM TO THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR				
TOLER, ALVIN L. TOTAL		1.40					
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00846	TOLER, ARVIS R.					
		VANCE, UTE	04/10/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER ON RECONSIDERATION AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE		
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/12/2013	0.20	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE GRANTING ORDER FOR RECONSIDERATION AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINE FOR CLOSING ARGUMENT		
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/12/2013	0.20	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE GRANTING ORDER FOR RECONSIDERATION		
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/12/2013	0.20	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE GRANTING ORDER FOR RECONSIDERATION AND UPDATING CLAIM WITH DEADLINE FOR AFFIRMATIVE REPORT		
		TOLER, ARVIS R. TOTAL		0.70			
		TOPARDO, JOSEPH					
		EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00015				

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	TOPARDO, JOSEPH TOTAL	TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/03/2013	0.20	REVIEWING ORDER CHANGING VENUE FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE AND UPDATING CLAIM	
	P0495.02492 TUCKER, RICKEY	CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/23/2013	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS REQUEST	
				0.80		
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02596 UNDERWOOD, CHARLES L.	VANCE, UTE	04/02/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM BECKLEY ARH REGARDING OUR X-RAY REQUESTS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/12/2013	0.80	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS: CATALOGING X-RAYS	
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/18/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS	
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/22/2013	0.40	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR	
		HARRISON, TINA	04/23/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE	
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EXHIBITS #1 THROUGH #12 AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE	
					2.00	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02596 UNDERWOOD, CHARLES L.	PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/01/2013	0.40	PREPARE FOLLOW UP SHEET; PREPARE MEDICAL AND X RAY REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM	
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/02/2013	1.50	REVIEW, ORGANIZED AND PREPARED ELECTRONIC FILE OF DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS FROM DOL	
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/03/2013	0.30	REVIEW FAX FROM HEALTHSOUTH RE X RAYS; PREPARE X RAY REQUEST TO MORGANTOWN PULMONARY; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM	
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/04/2013	0.30	TELEPHONE CALL FROM MORGANTOWN PULMONARY; PREPARE X RAY REQUEST; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM	
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/04/2013	0.80	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE X-RAYS FROM FAIRMONT GENERAL	
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/05/2013	0.30	REVIEW 3 CDS FROM FAIRMONT GENERAL; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM	
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/08/2013	0.10	REVIEW INVOICE FROM HEALTHSOUTH MOUNTAINVIEW REHAB; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM	
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/09/2013	0.50	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE STATUS OF CASE AND WHAT TASKS NEED TO BE ACCOMPLISHED BEFORE ALJ HEARING	
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/10/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. DEVABHAKTUNI; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM	

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM HEALTHSOUTH MOUNTAINVIEW REGIONAL REHABILITATION HOSPITAL
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM MARION BLACK LUNG CLINIC
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MONONGALIA GENERAL HOSPITAL REGARDING OUR X-RAY REQUEST AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/15/2013	1.00	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. PARASAD DEVABHAKTUNI
		VANCE, UTE	04/25/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EXHIBIT #1 AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/25/2013	0.40	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM FAIRMONT GENERAL; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/26/2013	0.20	REVIEW OF DR. GROTEN'S REBUTTAL READING OF 8-27-12 X-RAY
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/26/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/26/2013	3.00	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM FAIRMONT GENERAL HOSPITAL
		UNDERWOOD, CHARLES L. TOTAL		9.70	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02550	VANCE, DONALD RAY			
		HARRISON, TINA	04/23/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/23/2013	1.20	REVIEWING NEW WIDOWS CLAIM RECEIVED FROM THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR IN PREPARATION FOR LITIGATION (.1); IMPORTING DOCUMENTS INTO ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.2); DRAFTING NOTICE OF REPRESENTATION (.1); DRAFTING OPERATOR CONTROVERSION, CONTROVERSION FORM, AND COVER LETTER (.4); DRAFTING NOTICE OF CORRECT OPERATOR'S AND THIRD PARTY ADMINISTRATOR'S INFORMATION TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.2); DRAFTING SECOND REQUEST FOR DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS TO WIDOW AND ADULT, DISABLED SON (.2)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/23/2013	0.20	REVIEW NOTICE OF APPEARANCE, COMPARE WITH INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS AND SIGN
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/23/2013	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN NOTICE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR RE TPA
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/23/2013	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/23/2013	0.20	REVIEW OPERATOR RESPONSE AND CONTROVERSIONS, COMPARE WITH INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS AND SIGN

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00390	VANCE, DONALD RAY TOTAL		2.20	
		WHALING, HERMAN			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/01/2013	0.50	REVIEW EVIDENCE SUBMITTED BY CLAIMANT; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND EVIDENCE AND ARGUMENT FROM PREVIOUS CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/03/2013	0.70	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING EVIDENCE RECEIVED FROM CLAIMANT (2); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING EVIDENCE SUBMITTED ON BEHALF OF EMPLOYER DURING CLAIMANT'S PRIOR FEDERAL BLACK LUNG CLAIM (2); DRAFTING SUBMISSIONS OF EVIDENCE TO REBUT CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE (3)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/03/2013	0.30	REVIEW REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND ISSUES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/03/2013	0.40	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH REPORT OF DR. WHEELER; REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR WITH REPORT OF DR. SCATARIGE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/04/2013	0.20	REVIEWING SUBMISSION OF CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE OF CT SCANS
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/04/2013	0.20	REVIEWING STATUS OF CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	04/04/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/04/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; CHECK FILE COPIES
		VANCE, UTE	04/05/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	04/08/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDERS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/15/2013	0.40	REVIEW DECISION OF DISTRICT DIRECTOR, EVIDENCE AND LIABILITY ANALYSIS BY DEPARTMENT OF LABOR, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS
		VANCE, UTE	04/16/2013	0.20	REVIEWING PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER AND UPDATING DOCKET WITH DEADLINE FOR RESPONSE (1); DRAFTING RESPONSE TO PROPOSED DECISION AND ORDER TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/17/2013	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOR
		HARRISON, TINA	04/22/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		WHALING, HERMAN TOTAL		3.80	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02606	WHITE, DONALD G.			
		VANCE, UTE	04/18/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495-00880	VANCE, UTE	04/19/2013	0.10	REVIEWING DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND DOCKETING RESPONSE DUE DATE
		WHITE, DONALD G. TOTAL		0.30	
		WHITE, JERRY LEE			
		HARRISON, TINA	04/04/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/04/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; CHECK FILE COPIES
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/05/2013	0.40	REVIEW RECORDS FROM PULMONARY ASSOCIATES OF CHARLESTON; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/05/2013	0.80	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM PULMONARY ASSOCIATES OF CHARLESTON
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/09/2013	0.40	REVIEW NEW INTERROGATORIES; SEND MEDICAL AND X RAY REQUESTS; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/09/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM WHARTON MEDICAL CENTER
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/12/2013	0.90	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM WHARTON MEDICAL CENTER
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.40	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM WHARTON MEDICAL CENTER; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/26/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORD FOLLOW UP SHEET; PREPARE MEDICAL REQUEST; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		WHITE, JERRY LEE TOTAL		3.70	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01235	WHITTINGTON, RALPH E.			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/01/2013	0.70	CHECK STATUS OF CASE AND CASE DEVELOPMENT; REVIEW CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE SUBMITTED TO DATE; REVIEW REPORT OF DR. GREEN; DIRECT ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/02/2013	0.70	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAY REQUESTS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/02/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/02/2013	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	04/03/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM PRINCETON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL REGARDING OUR RECORD REQUEST AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/03/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM OCEANA MEDICAL CENTER REGARDING OUR X-RAY REQUESTS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/08/2013	0.50	TELEPHONE CALLS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAY REQUESTS
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM PRINCETON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/15/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/17/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/17/2013	0.40	REVIEW MEDICAL EVIDENCE FROM DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS AND OTHER EVIDENCE FOR REVIEW BY CONSULTANTS
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/17/2013	0.40	DRAFTING LETTER FOR CONSULTING OPINION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/17/2013	0.20	REVIEWING REPORT BY DR. OESTERLING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/17/2013	0.50	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING EVIDENCE SUMMARY
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/17/2013	1.00	REVIEWING AND OBTAINING COPIES OF TREATMENT RECORDS AND PREPARING RECORDS FOR DOCTOR'S REVIEW
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/18/2013	0.50	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. ROSENBERG FOR CONSULTING OPINION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/18/2013	0.40	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING LETTER OF INDEX FOR DOCTOR'S REVIEW
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/18/2013	0.50	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. ZALDIVAR FOR CONSULTING OPINION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/19/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/19/2013	0.90	REVIEW EVIDENCE BEING SENT TO PULMONARY SPECIALIST FOR REVIEW; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND DR. GREEN'S REPORT, AND VARIOUS TREATMENT RECORDS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/19/2013	0.20	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND TO DR. ROSENBERG
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/22/2013	0.40	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/22/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL. TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/22/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR, CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013 04/29/2013	0.10 0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE RECEIPT INDEPENDENT MEDICAL EXAMINATION REPORT FROM DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/29/2013	0.70	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL AND DRAFTING EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM SUMMARIZING EVIDENCE PURSUANT TO THE NOTICE OF HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/29/2013	1.20	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL AND DRAFTING PROCEDURAL HISTORY
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/29/2013	0.40	REVIEW REPORT FROM DR. ZALDIVAR, COMPARE WITH OTHER MEDICAL OPINIONS AND EVIDENCE OF RECORD; DIRECT ACTION ACCORDINGLY
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/30/2013	0.40	REVIEW REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG, COMPARE WITH OTHER EVIDENCE, REPORTS FROM OTHER EXPERTS AND ISSUES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/30/2013	0.20	REVIEW EVIDENCE SUBMISSION AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/30/2013	0.20	REVIEW EVIDENCE BEING SUBMITTED AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		WHITTINGTON, RALPH E. TOTAL		13.10	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02524	WILEY, THOMAS R.			
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/01/2013	0.60	REVIEW ORDER OF CONTINUANCE; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS AND EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT IN LIGHT OF CONTINUANCE OF HEARING; CHECK EVIDENCE SUBMITTED AND DEPOSITION SCHEDULE; DIRECT EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT ACCORDINGLY
		HARRISON, TINA	04/03/2013	0.30	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO DETERMINE WHAT DOCUMENTS NEED TO BE SENT TO DR. ZALDIVAR IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/03/2013	0.10	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE GRANTING CONTINUANCE AND UPDATING CLAIM
		HARRISON, TINA	04/03/2013	0.30	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE AND INDEX TO DR. ZALDIVAR FORWARDING DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR HIS DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/03/2013	0.40	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO EXPERT FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND BEING SUBMITTED
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/03/2013	0.10	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/08/2013	0.90	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING FILE MATERIAL FOR DEPOSITION: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR, COURT REPORTER AND CLAIMANTS COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION: TELEPHONE CALL FROM COURT REPORTER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/08/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL FROM CLAIMANTS COUNSEL REGARDING CONTINUANCE IN CLAIM
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/08/2013	1.20	REVIEW REPORT OF DR. ZALDIVAR, REPORT OF DR. RASMUSSEN, MEDICAL TREATMENT RECORDS FROM VARIOUS FACILITIES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/08/2013	0.30	CONFERENCE WITH DR. ZALDIVAR IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/08/2013	0.10	CHECK AND CONFIRM DEPOSITION SCHEDULE STILL GOING FORWARD AS PLANNED
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/08/2013	1.50	DEPOSE DR. ZALDIVAR AND CONFERENCE AFTER DEPOSITION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/09/2013	0.10	CONFIRMING HEARING SCHEDULED CONTINUED AND UPDATING CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/12/2013	0.50	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE STATUS OF CASE AND WHAT TASKS NEED TO BE ACCOMPLISHED BEFORE ALJ HEARING
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.10	REVIEW INVOICE FROM CAMC; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR DEPOSITION PREPARATION AND DEPOSITION FROM DR. ZALDIVAR
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT OF DR. ZALDIVAR AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/19/2013	0.30	REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT AND COMPARE WITH NOTES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/19/2013	0.20	REVIEW AND SIGN SUBMISSION OF EVIDENCE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/19/2013	0.40	REVIEWING STATUS OF DR. ZALDIVAR'S TESTIMONY AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE SUBMITTING TESTIMONY
		HARRISON, TINA	04/23/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR COURT REPORTER FEE FROM MARGARET BILLANT/CR
		WILEY, THOMAS R. TOTAL		8.30	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495-02487	WILLIAMS, KEITH			
		VANCE, UTE	04/02/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANTS ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/02/2013	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/02/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/08/2013	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL FROM RAM DIAGNOSTIC REGARDING X-RAYS
		VANCE, UTE	04/09/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/10/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/12/2013	0.20	REVIEWING LETTER FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING PENDING DEPOSITION AND VERIFYING CLAIM STATUS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/15/2013	0.20	REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/15/2013	0.50	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ROSENBERG FOR CONSULTATION; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND TREATMENT RECORDS (-4); REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG (-1)
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/15/2013	0.20	DRAFTING REQUEST TO SCHEDULE DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/15/2013	0.20	DRAFTING REQUEST TO SCHEDULE DEPOSITION OF DR. ROSENBERG
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/15/2013	0.70	DRAFTING INITIAL EVIDENCE SUMMARY LISTING EVIDENCE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/15/2013	0.30	DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. ROSENBERG FOR CONSULTING OPINION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/15/2013	0.70	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR RELEVANT INFORMATION FOR DR. ROSENBERG'S REVIEW
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/15/2013	0.40	REVIEW DRAFT EVIDENCE SUMMARY, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND EVIDENCE BEING DEVELOPED
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/15/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		HANCOCK, THOMAS	04/16/2013	2.00	DRAFTING OUTLINE OF QUESTIONS FOR DEPOSITION OF DR. RASMUSSEN
		HANCOCK, THOMAS	04/16/2013	3.00	REVIEWING DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION OF DR. RASMUSSEN
		HARRISON, TINA	04/17/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		HANCOCK, THOMAS	04/17/2013	3.60	TRAVEL TO BECKEY AND ATTEND DEPOSITION OF DR. RASMUSSEN
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/17/2013	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/17/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.02288	CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/19/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/22/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR AND CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/22/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	04/23/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/26/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS
		WILLIAMS, KEITH TOTAL		16.40	
		WILSON, LENNIE L.			
		VANCE, UTE	04/04/2013	0.30	RECEIPT OF PAST DUE INVOICE FROM FAIRFIELD MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING CLAIM FILE (.1); REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR STATUS OF INVOICE (.1); DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO UNDERWRITERS REGARDING STATUS OF PAYMENT OF INVOICE (.1)
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/05/2013	0.20	PREPARE MEMO TO FAIRFIELD MEDICAL RE STATUS OF INVOICE; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR RECORD REVIEW AND REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG		
WILSON, LENNIE L. TOTAL		0.70			
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00899	WOOTEN, DALLAS D.			
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/05/2013	1.50	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. ROBERT ATKINS
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/05/2013	0.50	REVIEW FILE TO DETERMINE STATUS OF CASE AND WHAT TASKS NEED TO BE ACCOMPLISHED BEFORE ALL HEARING
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM MADISON MEDIAL PLLC
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/22/2013	0.50	REVIEW INVOICE FROM CAMC; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/26/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		WOOTEN, DALLAS D. TOTAL		2.70	
		WOOTEN, EDWARD (MARY)			
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/12/2013	0.20	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS; SEARCH FOR DEATH CERTIFICATE; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/19/2013	0.50	REVIEW FILE AND DRAFTED CORRESPONDENCE REQUESTING POWER OF ATTORNEY OR EXECUTRIX PAPERS FROM SPOUSE OF DECEASED MINER

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.01535	FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/22/2013	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT
		HARRISON, TINA	04/23/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		WOOTEN, EDWARD (MARY) TOTAL		1.10	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00865	WOOTEN, HARRY			
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/09/2013	0.20	REVIEW INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RECORD FOLLOW UP SHEET
		VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR LITIGATION STATUS AND ACTIONS NEEDED PURSUANT TO UPCOMING DEADLINE FOR CLAIMANT'S REBUTTAL EVIDENCE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/30/2013	0.30	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. LOSTETTER; PUT IN DATE ORDER; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		WOOTEN, HARRY TOTAL		0.70	
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP.	P0495.00865	WRISTON, DONALD R.			
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM HEALTHPORT (CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER)
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/02/2013	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/02/2013	0.80	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/03/2013	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/03/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		VANCE, UTE	04/04/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/04/2013	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM CAMC REGARDING X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/05/2013	0.40	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CAMC: REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF INVOICE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/05/2013	0.70	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS: UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/09/2013	1.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS: TELEPHONE CALLS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAY REQUESTS
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/09/2013	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY, HISTORY OF DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE SAME
		VANCE, UTE	04/10/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. NELLHAUS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	04/10/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. KURT NELLHAUS

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.50	RECEIPT OF 3 COMPACT DISCS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (2); REVIEWING AND ANALYZING COMPACT DISCS RECEIVED FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER TO DETERMINE RADIOLOGY FILMS CONTAINED ON DISCS (3)
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/15/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/16/2013	0.40	REVIEW CASE MATERIALS FOR ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE NEEDED; DIRECT ADDITIONAL EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT AND DESIGNATE EXPERT FOR CONSULTATION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/16/2013	0.20	DRAFTING REQUEST TO SCHEDULE DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/16/2013	0.20	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM FOR READING BY DR. WHEELER OF CT SCAN DATED OCTOBER 24, 2006
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/16/2013	0.20	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM FOR READING BY DR. WHEELER OF CT SCAN DATED FEBRUARY 28, 2007
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/16/2013	0.20	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM FOR READING BY DR. WHEELER OF CT SCAN DATED OCTOBER 2, 2007
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/16/2013	0.30	DRAFTING REQUEST TO SCHEDULE DEPOSITION OF DR. ZALDIVAR
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/16/2013	0.40	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR RELEVANT INFORMATION FOR DOCTOR'S REVIEW
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/16/2013	0.40	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR CONSULTING OPINION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/16/2013	0.20	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM FOR READING BY DR. WHEELER OF CT SCAN DATED NOVEMBER 29, 2010
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/16/2013	0.20	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM FOR READING BY DR. WHEELER OF CT SCAN DATED DECEMBER 1, 2010
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/16/2013	0.20	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM FOR READING BY DR. WHEELER OF CT SCAN DATED AUGUST 13, 2012
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/16/2013	0.20	DRAFTING SUBMISSION FORM FOR READING BY DR. WHEELER OF CT SCAN DATED SEPTEMBER 12, 2012
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/17/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/17/2013	0.40	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ROSENBERG FOR CONSULT, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD AND CASE MATERIALS (.3); REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG (1)
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/17/2013	0.50	REVIEW VARIOUS REPORTS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE AND ISSUES, AND SIGN VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/17/2013	0.40	REVIEWING RECEIPT OF CD FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER WITH CT SCANS AND CONFIRMING DATE OF READINGS BY WHEELER
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/18/2013	0.60	TELEPHONE CALLS TO MEDICAL FACILITIES REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/19/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	04/22/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/22/2013	0.40	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE AND DRAFTING LETTER TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE REGARDING RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/22/2013	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/22/2013	0.20	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/23/2013	0.50	REVIEW FILE AND PREPARED EMPLOYER'S RESPONSE TO CLAIMANT'S REQUEST FOR X-RAYS
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/23/2013	1.20	REVIEWING AND PREPARING RECORDS FROM CHARLESTON AREA MEDICAL CENTER
		HARRISON, TINA	04/24/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S ANSWERS TO SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES WITHOUT MEDICAL RELEASE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/24/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S REQUEST FOR RADIOLOGY FILMS FROM EMPLOYER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/24/2013	0.50	REVISED EMPLOYER'S ANSWERS TO CLAIMANT'S INTERROGATORIES REGARDING SUBMISSION OF ALL X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/24/2013	0.40	TELEPHONE CALL TO AND FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/25/2013	0.30	REVIEW AND SIGN SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORIES AND CORRESPONDENCE RE SAME
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/25/2013	0.20	REVIEW FILMS BEING SENT TO DR. WHEELER AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE RE SAME
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/25/2013	0.30	REVIEW CT SCANS, TREATMENT RECORD REPORTS AND DESIGNATE ADDITIONAL FILMS FOR READING

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/25/2013	1.90	REVIEW DISCOVERY REQUESTS; IN LIGHT OF DISCOVERY REQUESTS REVIEW CLOSED CLAIM MATERIALS, PREVIOUS EXAMINATIONS ON BEHALF OF EMPLOYER, X-RAY READINGS; REVIEW CLOSED CLAIM DIRECTOR EXHIBITS REGARDING EVIDENCE SUBMITTED, COMPARE WITH DISCOVERY REQUESTS AND DRAFT RESPONSES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/25/2013	0.40	REVIEW, REVISE AND SIGN FINAL RESPONSES AND CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/25/2013	0.40	REVIEWING STATUS OF CT SCANS AND DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. WHEELER FOR READING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/25/2013	0.50	REVIEWING DIRECTOR'S EXHIBITS FOR COMPLETE FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/25/2013	1.10	REVISE AND EDIT RESPONSES TO DISCOVERY; REVIEW DOCUMENTS BEING PRODUCED IN RESPONSE TO REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/25/2013	0.60	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS: TELEPHONE CALL TO CAMC REGARDING X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/25/2013	0.80	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: DRAFTING REQUEST FOR MEDICAL RELEASE: UPDATING STATUS OF CLAIM
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/26/2013	0.30	DRAFTED CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTY MACDONNELL REGARDING CHEST CT 1-14-13 BEING SENT TO HIS OFFICE UPON ITS RETURN FROM DR. WHEELER
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		HARRISON, TINA	04/26/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/26/2013	0.20	REVIEWING SUBMISSION FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING CLAIM
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/26/2013	0.20	CONFIRM STATUS OF CT SCAN FILMS AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE SAME
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EXHIBITS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/29/2013	1.00	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL AND DRAFTING PREHEARING REPORT LISTING PROCEDURE HISTORY PURSUANT TO THE NOTICE OF HEARING
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/29/2013	0.70	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL AND DRAFTING EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM SUMMARIZING EVIDENCE PURSUANT TO THE NOTICE OF HEARING
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; PREPARE MAIL
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/29/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS FROM CAMC

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL CORP. TOTAL					
	WRISTON, DONALD R. TOTAL			26.30	
				463.70	
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION					
	F5191.00100	ADKINS, HENLEY			
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/02/2013	0.90	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE ADDITIONAL MEDICAL RECORDS FROM ST. MARYS MEDICAL CENTER
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/03/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		ADKINS, HENLEY TOTAL		1.00	
	F5191.00072	AMOS, DENNIS C.			
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/01/2013	0.20	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORDS FOLLOW UP SHEET; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/03/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM HEISKELL SURGICAL RE MEDICAL RECORDS AND INVOICE; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM HEISKELL KING BURNS & TLLMAN SURGICAL ASSOCIATES
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/19/2013	0.30	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT RE SAME
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/19/2013	0.50	REVIEW FILE AND DRAFTED EMPLOYER'S SECOND REQUEST FOR INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE TO CLAIMANT
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/30/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		AMOS, DENNIS C. TOTAL		1.40	
	F5191.00042	BAILEY, JR., ROBERT W.			
		VANCE, UTE	04/17/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF DEPARTMENT OF LABOR ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/23/2013	0.40	REVIEWING ORDER FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND VERIFYING CLAIM STATUS; DISCUSSING CLAIM WITH ATTORNEY
		BAILEY, JR., ROBERT W. TOTAL		0.50	
	F5191.00077	COALSON, RICKIE CHARLES			
		HARRISON, TINA	04/04/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/05/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM NEW RIVER HEALTH AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE (.1); ORGANIZING RECORDS FROM NEW RIVER HEALTH INTO DATE CHRONOLOGICAL ORDER IN PREPARATION FOR ELECTRONIC INPUT AND REVIEW AND ANALYSIS (.1)
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM NEW RIVER FAMILY HEALTH

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00044	COALSON, RICKIE CHARLES TOTAL COOK, ROBERT		0.40	
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/01/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00017	COOK, ROBERT TOTAL CRAWFORD, ROBERT E.		0.10	
		VANCE, UTE	04/26/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR RECORD REVIEW AND REPORT FROM DR. ROSENBERG
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S HEARING NOTICE AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/29/2013	0.20	REVIEW MEDICAL RECORD FOLLOW UP SHEET; UPDATE STATUS OF CLAIM
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00096	CRAWFORD, ROBERT E. TOTAL DELUNG, RUSSELL LEE		0.40	
		VANCE, UTE	04/05/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM NEW RIVER HEALTH AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/09/2013	0.50	REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND SUMMARIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM NEW RIVER HEALTH
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/11/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM PULMONARY ASSOCIATES OF CHARLESTON (LATE FEE)
		VANCE, UTE	04/15/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM NEW RIVER FAMILY HEALTH
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5191.00031	DELUNG, RUSSELL LEE TOTAL HAGY, EARL JR.		0.90	
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM HEALTHPORT (BLUEFIELD REGIONAL MEDICAL CENTER)
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR MEDICAL RECORDS FROM PRINCETON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/02/2013	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/02/2013	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL: TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/03/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR INTERROGATORIES AND MEDICAL RELEASE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/09/2013	0.60	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/16/2013	0.40	TELEPHONE CALL FROM CAMC REGARDING X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/17/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/18/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF PATHOLOGY; DRAFTING REQUEST FOR PATHOLOGY REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL AND DRAFTING EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM LISTING ALL EVIDENCE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/19/2013	1.00	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM PRINCETON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/19/2013	0.80	REVIEWING AND OBTAINING CLAIM MATERIAL FOR RELEVANT INFORMATION FOR DOCTOR'S REVIEW
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/19/2013	0.60	REVIEWING AND DRAFTING SUMMARY OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM BLUEFIELD REGIONAL MEDICAL CENTER
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/19/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/22/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ZALDIVAR REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/22/2013	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. ROSENBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION
		HARRISON, TINA	04/23/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/23/2013	0.60	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO EXPERT FOR CONSULTING OPINION; COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD, MEDICAL TREATMENT RECORDS AND INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS (-5); REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ZALDIVAR
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/23/2013	0.40	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL AND DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. ROSENBERG FOR CONSULTING OPINION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/23/2013	0.60	REVIEWING CLAIM MATERIAL AND DRAFTING LETTER TO DR. ZALDIVAR FOR CONSULTING OPINION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/23/2013	0.50	REVIEW MATERIALS BEING SENT TO DR. ROSENBERG, COMPARE WITH EVIDENCE OF RECORD, MEDICAL TREATMENT RECORDS AND INFORMATION IN CASE MATERIALS (-4); REVIEW AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. ROSENBERG
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/26/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/29/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM DIRECTOR'S COUNSEL AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/30/2013	0.40	REVIEWING CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO DEADLINE FOR RESPONSIBLE OPERATOR AND REVIEWING ORDER CONTINUING HEARING
		HAGY, EARL JR. TOTAL		10.60	
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	PS191.00008	KINCAID, MILTON			
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUEST FOR PAYMENT FOR RADIOLOGY FILMS FROM BECKLEY ARH HOSPITAL

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/03/2013	0.40	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL. TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. WHEELER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/04/2013	0.10	REVIEWING STATUS OF CLAIM FILE PURSUANT TO NOTICE OF HEARING DEADLINE FOR NEW ISSUES
		HARRISON, TINA	04/04/2013	0.10	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/04/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF B-READER REPORT FROM JOHNS HOPKINS AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/04/2013	0.20	REVIEWING CLAIM FOR INFORMATION PERTAINING TO STATE CLAIMS AND VERIFYING CLAIM STATUS
		LESTER, SHANNON	04/04/2013	1.00	REVIEW FILE, CONFERENCE WITH PAUL FRAMPTON AND DRAFTED CORRESPONDENCE TO JACKSON KELLEY REGARDING CLAIMANT'S OCCUPATIONAL PNEUMOCONIOSIS STATE RECORDS TO BE DISCLOSED.
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/04/2013	0.90	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF MEDICAL RECORDS AND X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/04/2013	0.80	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/05/2013	0.70	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF RECORDS FROM BECKLEY APPALACHIAN REGIONAL HOSPITAL
		HARRISON, TINA	04/05/2013	0.20	UPDATE ELECTRONIC FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/05/2013	1.30	REVIEW DRAFT RESPONSES TO CLAIMANT'S INTERROGATORIES AND REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION; COMPARE WITH CASE MATERIALS, MEDICAL REPORTS, ISSUES; EDIT RESPONSES AND SIGN
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/09/2013	0.30	CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL DRAFTING SUBMISSION OF READING OF FILM BY DR. WHEELER
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/09/2013	0.50	PREPARING EMPLOYER'S EXHIBITS FOR THE ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S REVIEW
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/09/2013	0.20	DRAFTING REQUEST FOR OFFICIAL TRANSCRIPT
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/09/2013	0.30	UPDATING CLAIMANT'S EXHIBITS AND DRAFTING INDEX
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/09/2013	0.30	UPDATING DRAFT OF EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/09/2013	1.00	REVIEWING AND PREPARING CLAIM FILE FOR PENDING HEARING
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/09/2013	0.20	REVIEW EVIDENCE BEING SUBMITTED AND SIGN CORRESPONDENCE TO CLAIMANT'S COUNSEL RE SAME
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/09/2013	0.30	REVIEW ADDITIONAL X-RAY EVIDENCE AND EVIDENCE SLOTS AVAILABLE
		VANCE, UTE	04/09/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EVIDENCE SUMMARY FORM AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/10/2013	0.50	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		VANCE, UTE	04/10/2013	0.10	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/10/2013	0.50	REVIEW STATUS OF EVIDENCE DEVELOPMENT; REVIEW CASE MATERIALS; CHECK STATUS OF FILM AND REPORT FROM JOHNS HOPKINS; DIRECT CANCELLATION OF DEPOSITION IN LIGHT OF NEED FOR ADDITIONAL CONSULTATION REPORT
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/10/2013	1.30	REVIEWING AND ORGANIZING MEDICAL RECORDS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/10/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. WHEELER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/11/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/11/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF CLAIMANT'S EXHIBIT #8 AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		VANCE, UTE	04/12/2013	0.10	PREPARING REQUESTS FOR PAYMENTS FOR X-RAY READINGS FROM JOHNS HOPKINS MEDICINE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/12/2013	0.50	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/12/2013	0.60	REVIEWING AND CATALOGING X-RAYS
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/15/2013	0.20	DRAFTING MEDICAL RELEASE
		TAYLOR, DEBRA	04/15/2013	0.50	UPDATING CLAIM FILE REGARDING POSTPONING DEPOSITIONS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/15/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. WHEELER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		FRAMPTON, PAUL E.	04/16/2013	3.20	TRAVEL TO AND APPEAR FOR HEARING
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/18/2013	0.50	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/19/2013	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. WHEELER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/22/2013	0.30	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL; TELEPHONE CALL TO DR. WHEELER REGARDING DEPOSITION
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/23/2013	0.80	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS; TELEPHONE CALL TO OFFICE OF JUDGES REGARDING X-RAYS
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/26/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE
		CHESTNUT, KIMBERLY D.	04/29/2013	0.90	REVIEWING FILE MATERIAL FOR RECEIPT OF X-RAYS; TELEPHONE CALL TO OFFICE OF JUDGES REGARDING X-RAYS; TELEPHONE CALL TO OFFICE OF INSURANCE COMMISSION REGARDING X-RAYS
		KINCAID, MILTON TOTAL		20.10	
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	F5191.00051	TURNER, JOSEPH D.			
		VANCE, UTE	04/01/2013	0.20	RECEIPT OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW JUDGE'S ORDER AND UPDATING ELECTRONIC CLAIM FILE
		PAULEY, PAULETTE	04/01/2013	0.10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; ORGANIZE FILE

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION TOTAL				35.90	
BLACK LUNG TOTAL				499.60	
COMMERCIAL					
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P5523.00001	FIRM RETENTION			
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	04/10/2013	0.90	REVIEW AMENDED DECEMBER 2012 FEE STATEMENT (3); CORRESPONDENCE TO C. ROBERTSON RE: SAME (2); CORRESPONDENCE TO E. WALLER, J. LINDEN RE: SAME (2); CORRESPONDENCE FROM/T/O C. ROBERTSON RE: SAME, DECEMBER FEE STATEMENT (2).
		COHN, DANIEL	04/10/2013	2.70	DRAFT JANUARY FEE STATEMENT (1.2); DRAFT SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION (1.3); REVISE AND SEND AMENDED DECEMBER FEE STATEMENT (0.2).
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	04/11/2013	0.60	TWO TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH C. ROBERTSON RE: FEE APPLICATIONS (4); MULTIPLE CORRESPONDENCE FROM C. ROBERTSON RE: SAME (2).
		COHN, DANIEL	04/11/2013	2.10	DRAFT SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION AND OBTAIN AND REVIEW INFORMATION TO BE INCORPORATED THEREIN.
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	04/12/2013	1.00	REVIEW, REVISE SIXTH FEE STATEMENT (1.0).
		COHN, DANIEL	04/12/2013	0.10	CONFERENCE WITH J. CHINCHECK RE: STATUS OF FEE STATEMENTS AND FEE APPLICATION.
		COHN, DANIEL	04/15/2013	2.40	CONFERENCE WITH J. CHINCHECK RE: FEE STATEMENT (0.1); REVISE FEE STATEMENT (0.4); CONFERENCE WITH J. CHINCHECK RE: FEE APPLICATION (0.2); REVIEW LOCAL RULE REQUIREMENTS FOR FEE APPLICATIONS (0.2); REVISE FEE APPLICATION (1.4); EMAIL RE: SAME (0.1).
		CHINCHECK, JULIA A.	04/15/2013	2.00	WORK ON INTERIM FEE APPLICATION (1.5); MULTIPLE CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. ROBERTSON RE: SAME (5).
		COHN, DANIEL	04/30/2013	0.50	DRAFT FEBRUARY FEE STATEMENT.
		FIRM RETENTION TOTAL		12.30	
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION TOTAL				12.30	
COMMERCIAL TOTAL				12.30	
ENERGY					

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>		
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL, LLC	P0493.10221	ROBIN LAND CO., SUBSIDIARY - THE QUIKRETE COMPA D'ANTONI, MARK B.	04/23/2013	4.50	REVIEW AND ANALYZE REVISED PURCHASE AGREEMENT AND DEED		
			04/26/2013	4.00	WORKING ON PURCHASE AGREEMENT (3.0) AND DEED (1.0)		
			04/28/2013	2.00	WORKING ON PURCHASE AGREEMENT (1.30) AND DEED(.5)		
			04/29/2013	4.00	ADDITIONAL WORK ON PURCHASE AGREEMENT (2.5) AND DEED (1.5)		
			04/30/2013	3.50	ADDITIONAL WORK ON PURCHASE AGREEMENT (2.5) AND DEED(1.0)		
			ROBIN LAND CO., SUBSIDIARY - THE QUIKRETE COMPANIES, INC 8100				
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL, LLC	P0493.10222	ROBIN LAND CO., SUBSIDIARY - TONEY'S FORK LAND, L D'ANTONI, MARK B.	04/25/2013	3.50	WORKING ON DEED (2.5) AND PARTIAL RELEASE (1.0)		
			04/26/2013	3.60	ADDITIONAL WORK ON DEED (2.0) AND PARTIAL RELEASE(1.6)		
			ROBIN LAND CO., SUBSIDIARY - TONEY'S FORK LAND, LOGAN CO 110				
EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL, LLC TOTAL 25.10							
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0505.00068	BRODY MINING, LLC CHUNCHECK, JULIA A.	04/04/2013	0.40	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. JONES, M. IMMERMAN RE: STOCK ISSUE (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. JONES RE: SAME (.2).		
			BRODY MINING, LLC TOTAL 0.40				
			CLAIM FOR UNDERPAYMENT OF ROYALTIES - PAYNE-G				
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	P0505.00069	LANE, J. THOMAS SAYRE, KIN	04/25/2013	0.80	REVIEWING AND ANALYZING ROYALTY CLAUSE REGARDING ABILITY TO DEDUCT SEVERANCE TAX PER REQUEST FROM J. EAGAN.		
			04/26/2013	2.20	REVIEW 1970'S COAL TAX STRUCTURE TO DETERMINE DEDUCTIBILITY OF CURRENT SEVERANCE TAX		
			CLAIM FOR UNDERPAYMENT OF ROYALTIES - PAYNE-GALLATIN 110				
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION TOTAL 3.40							
ENERGY TOTAL 28.50							
SAFETY AND HEALTH							
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	E1166.00058	FEDERAL NO. 2 MINE - WEVA 2009-97 ROTRUCK, ROBIN	04/09/2013	0.20	REVIEW FILE REGARDING THE STATUS OF THIS MATTER AND JUDGE BULLUCK'S ISSUANCE OF AN ORDER REGARDING THE TRIAL HELD REGARDING SAME;		
			PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION TOTAL 0.20				

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	FEDERAL NO. 2 MINE - WEVA 2009-97 TOTAL			0.50	
	E1166.00066 HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2008-619				
		OBLAK, REBECCA	04/01/2013	0.20	RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL WITH ATTACHMENTS FROM SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING THE FINAL DOCUMENTS FORWARDED TO JUDGE FELDMAN REGARDING THE OPERATOR, AND MR. BOCKHORN AND MR. SHEFFIELD AND PRINT OFF HARD COPY FOR REVIEW OF SAME;
		ROTRUCK, ROBIN	04/02/2013	0.10	ALARM STATUS SHEET AND CALENDARS REGARDING ALL DEADLINES REGARDING SAME;
		ROTRUCK, ROBIN	04/02/2013	0.30	DRAFT COVER CORRESPONDENCE TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT PER ATTORNEY OBLAK WITH ATTACHED COPY OF EXECUTED JOINT MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT REGARDING THIS MATTER;
		ROTRUCK, ROBIN	04/03/2013	0.20	DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT PER ATTORNEY OBLAK WITH ATTACHED COPY OF THE EXECUTED JOINT MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT REGARDING THIS MATTER;
		ROTRUCK, ROBIN	04/03/2013	0.10	RECEIPT AND REVIEW RESPONSE EMAIL FROM SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING SAME;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	04/03/2013	0.20	RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM MS. THOMPSON OF SOLICITOR MORHOLT'S OFFICE WITH THE FINAL DOCUMENTS (ORDER AND JOINT SETTLEMENT) OF THE PARTIES AND PRINT OFF SAME FOR FINAL REVIEW;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	04/03/2013	0.10	DIRECTIVES TO MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER TO FORWARD SAME TO CLIENT;
		ROTRUCK, ROBIN	04/04/2013	0.30	DRAFT COVER CORRESPONDENCE TO MR. RANDY DUNCAN (XC: ERIC WALLER, ESQUIRE, MR. LARRY MILLBURG AND MR. AARON FARMER) PER ATTORNEY OBLAK REGARDING THE SECRETARY'S JOINT MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT AND PROPOSED DECISION APPROVING SAME;
		ROTRUCK, ROBIN	04/04/2013	0.20	DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO ERIC WALLER, ESQUIRE PER ATTORNEY OBLAK WITH ATTACHED COPY OF THE SECRETARY'S JOINT MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT AND PROPOSED DECISION APPROVING SAME;
		ROTRUCK, ROBIN	04/04/2013	0.10	ALARM STATUS SHEET REGARDING SAME AND DEADLINES REGARDING SAME;

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		OBLAK, REBECCA	04/22/2013	0.10	REVIEW FOR STATUS OF JUDGE'S DECISION ON THE PARTIES' JOINT MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT AND PROPOSED DECISION APPROVING SETTLEMENT;
				1.90	
HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2008-619 TOTAL					
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION	E1166.00071	HIGHLAND 9 MINE KENT 2009-168			
		OBLAK, REBECCA	04/01/2013	0.20	RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL WITH ATTACHMENTS FROM SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING THE FINAL DOCUMENTS FORWARDED TO JUDGE FELDMAN REGARDING THE OPERATOR, AND MR. BOCKHORN AND MR. SHEFFIELD AND PRINT OFF HARD COPY FOR REVIEW OF SAME;
		ROTRUCK, ROBIN	04/02/2013	0.10	ALARM STATUS SHEET AND CALENDARS REGARDING ALL DEADLINES REGARDING SAME;
		ROTRUCK, ROBIN	04/02/2013	0.30	DRAFT COVER CORRESPONDENCE TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT PER ATTORNEY OBLAK WITH ATTACHED COPY OF EXECUTED JOINT MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT REGARDING THIS MATTER;
		ROTRUCK, ROBIN	04/03/2013	0.20	DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO SOLICITOR MORHOLT PER ATTORNEY OBLAK WITH ATTACHED COPY OF THE EXECUTED JOINT MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT REGARDING THIS MATTER;
		ROTRUCK, ROBIN	04/03/2013	0.10	RECEIPT AND REVIEW RESPONSE EMAIL FROM SOLICITOR MORHOLT REGARDING SAME;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	04/03/2013	0.20	RECEIPT AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM MS. THOMPSON OF SOLICITOR MORHOLT'S OFFICE WITH THE FINAL DOCUMENTS (ORDER AND JOINT SETTLEMENT) OF THE PARTIES AND PRINT OFF SAME FOR FINAL REVIEW; DIRECTIVES TO MSHA PRACTICE MANAGER TO FORWARD SAME TO CLIENT;
		OBLAK, REBECCA	04/03/2013	0.10	ALARM STATUS SHEET REGARDING SAME AND DEADLINES REGARDING SAME;
		ROTRUCK, ROBIN	04/04/2013	0.30	DRAFT COVER CORRESPONDENCE TO MR. RANDY DUNCAN (XC: ERIC WALLER, ESQUIRE, MR. LARRY MILLBURG AND MR. AARON FARMER) PER ATTORNEY OBLAK REGARDING THE SECRETARY'S JOINT MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT AND PROPOSED DECISION APPROVING SAME;
		ROTRUCK, ROBIN	04/04/2013	0.20	DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO ERIC WALLER, ESQUIRE PER ATTORNEY OBLAK WITH ATTACHED COPY OF THE SECRETARY'S JOINT MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT AND PROPOSED DECISION APPROVING SAME;

<u>CLIENT NAME</u>	<u>MATTER</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>WORK DATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>
		OBLAK, REBECCA	04/22/2013	0.10	REVIEW FOR STATUS OF JUDGE'S DECISION ON THE PARTIES' JOINT MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT AND PROPOSED DECISION APPROVING SETTLEMENT;
	HIGHLAND 9 MINE KENT 2009-168 TOTAL			1.90	
PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION TOTAL				4.30	
SAFETY AND HEALTH TOTAL				4.30	
	TOTAL			544.70	