

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
EASTERN DISTRICT OF MISSOURI
EASTERN DIVISION**

In re:

PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION, *et al.*,

Debtors.

**Chapter 11
Case No. 12-51502-659
(Jointly Administered)**

**Objection Deadline:
July 10, 2013 at 4:00 p.m.
(prevailing Central Time)**

**MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP FOR
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AND DISBURSEMENTS FOR THE PERIOD OF
MAY 1, 2013 THROUGH MAY 31, 2013**

| | |
|---|--|
| NAME OF APPLICANT: | <u>Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP</u> |
| ROLE IN THE CASE: | Counsel to the Debtors |
| TIME PERIOD: | May 1, 2013 through and including May 31, 2013 |
| CURRENT APPLICATION¹: | Total Fees Requested: \$1,715,198.25 80% of Fees Requested: \$1,372,158.60 Total Expenses Requested: \$89,696.39 |

¹ These amounts reflect \$16,242.15 in voluntary reductions of fees and expenses, which voluntary reductions are in addition to reductions of \$27,356.65 on account of Southern District of New York and U.S. Trustee guidelines.

1. In accordance with the *Order To Establish Procedures for Interim Monthly Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals* [ECF No. 262] (the “**Interim Compensation Order**”), Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP (“**Davis Polk**”), counsel to the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (collectively, the “**Debtors**”), hereby submits its Monthly Statement for Professional Services and Disbursements (the “**Fee Statement**”) for the period of May 1, 2013 through and including May 31, 2013 (the “**Fee Statement Period**”).

2. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Davis Polk seeks payment of \$1,461,854.99, representing (a) 80% of Davis Polk’s fees for services rendered and (b) 100% of actual and necessary expenses incurred.

3. Attached hereto as Exhibit A is a listing of Davis Polk professionals and paraprofessionals (collectively, the “**Davis Polk Professionals**”), including the hourly rate for each Davis Polk Professional who rendered services to the Debtors in connection with these chapter 11 cases during the Fee Statement Period and the title, aggregate hours worked and the amount of fees billed by each Davis Polk Professional.

4. Attached hereto as Exhibit B is a schedule specifying the categories of actual and necessary expenses for which Davis Polk is seeking reimbursement and the total amount for each such expense category.

5. Attached hereto as Exhibit C is a summary of the number of hours and amounts billed by Davis Polk during the Fee Statement Period, organized by project categories. Such services included:

- Participating in numerous meetings and telephone conferences with the Debtors’ management and employees covering topics

- such as the chapter 11 cases generally, interpretation of court orders, determination of the status of claims, contract and lease rejection issues, operational issues and general business issues;
- Advising the Patriot Coal Corporation board of directors regarding fiduciary duty issues, disclosure obligations, business and reorganization issues, the bankruptcy process and its options regarding all of the above;
 - Assisting with the Debtors' retention of professionals in the Debtors' chapter 11 cases and in the ordinary course of business;
 - Responding to numerous telephone calls and letters from creditors, equityholders and other parties in interest concerning the Debtors' chapter 11 cases, the filing of claims against the Debtors and the rights of creditors under the Bankruptcy Code and conducting associated legal research;
 - Research and analysis related to the Debtors' rights and obligations under coal supply agreements and other commercial contracts;
 - Researching and analyzing environmental and regulatory issues, including with respect to the U.S. Securities and Exchange Commission, the Financial Industry Regulatory Authority, and the Mine Safety and Health Administration, and advising the Debtors regarding the same;
 - Preparation and filing of Exchange Act filings;

- Providing advice generally to the Debtors about the debtor-in-possession financing facilities;
- Assisting the Debtors with and analyzing issues related to the Debtors' section 503(b)(9) claims and negotiating with creditors regarding related issues;
- Analyzing various creditor issues and assisting the Debtors with the claims reconciliation process;
- Analyzing and researching issues related to numerous executory contracts and advising the Debtors regarding the assumption, rejection and extending the time to assume or reject the same;
- Defending against and developing strategies with respect to parties filing motions seeking to lift the automatic stay;
- Coordinating and communicating with the Debtors and various parties regarding potential violations of the automatic stay;
- Seeking declaratory judgments regarding the Debtors' contractual rights under various royalty agreements;
- Participating in numerous teleconferences with the Debtors and other parties regarding vendor and customer issues;
- Participating in numerous meetings and teleconferences to provide advice to the Debtors' management concerning financial matters (e.g., cost reductions), union negotiations, union and non-union communications, and litigation and non-litigation strategy with respect to labor issues;

- Preparing proposals in connection with section 1113 and 1114 of the Bankruptcy Code and advising the Debtors with respect to the same;
- Communicating and negotiating with professionals engaged by the Debtors' union concerning collective bargaining agreements and various other matters;
- Researching and drafting the Debtors' motion under sections 1113 and 1114 of the Bankruptcy Code, including coordinating the preparation of declarations from numerous professionals engaged by the Debtors with respect to their labor and retiree obligations;
- Responding to objections to the Debtors' motion under sections 1113 and 1114 of the Bankruptcy Code;
- Preparing for and participating in a trial on the Debtors' section 1113 and 1114 motion and coordinating extensive negotiations and discovery with respect thereto, including attending numerous depositions;
- Researching and analyzing tax issues and advising the Debtors regarding the same;
- Participating in numerous telephone conferences with the Office of the U.S. Trustee regarding various procedural, case management and other issues;
- Researching and analyzing various legal issues related to potential claims against certain counterparties;

- Researching and preparing several non-first-day procedural and substantive motions;
- Coordinating with the Creditors' Committee regarding various pleadings and administration of the Debtors' estates generally and responding to comments and concerns of the Creditors' Committee;
- Preparing for, attending and taking part in bankruptcy court hearings; and
- Filing and service of court papers.

6. Attached hereto as Exhibit D are the time records of Davis Polk, which provide a daily summary of the time spent by each Davis Polk Professional during the Fee Statement Period by project category.

Notice

7. Consistent with the procedures described in the Interim Compensation Order, the Debtors will serve this Fee Statement, by hand or overnight delivery, on (i) the Debtors, Patriot Coal Corporation, 12312 Olive Boulevard, Suite 400, St. Louis, Missouri, 63141, Attn: Jacquelyn A. Jones, (ii) the Office of the United States Trustee for the Eastern District of Missouri, 111 South 10th Street, Suite 6.353, St. Louis, MO 63102, Attn: Leonora S. Long and Paul A. Randolph, (iii) attorneys for the administrative agent for the Debtors' postpetition lenders, (a) Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP, 767 Fifth Avenue, New York, New York 10153, Attn: Marcia Goldstein and Joseph Smolinsky, and (b) Willkie Farr & Gallagher LLP, 787 Seventh Avenue, New York, New York 10019, Attn: Margot B. Schonholtz and Ana Alfonso, and (iv) counsel to the official

committee of unsecured creditors, Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP, 1177 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10036, Attn: Adam C. Rogoff, Esq. and Gregory G. Plotko, Esq.

8. WHEREFORE, the Debtors respectfully request that the Court grant the relief requested herein and such other and further relief as is just and proper.

Dated: New York, New York
June 25, 2013

By: /s/ Brian M. Resnick
Marshall S. Huebner
Damian S. Schaible
Brian M. Resnick
Michelle M. McGreal

DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP
450 Lexington Avenue
New York, New York 10017
Telephone: (212) 450-4000
Facsimile: (212) 607-7983

*Counsel to the Debtors
and Debtors in Possession*

EXHIBIT A

Professionals and Rates

I.A. Partners/Counsel

| NAME OF PARTNER/ COUNSEL | YEAR ADMITTED | DEPARTMENT | TOTAL HOURS BILLED | HOURLY RATE | TOTAL FEES |
|-----------------------------------|------------------|--|-----------------------|----------------|---------------------|
| Partners | | | | | |
| Sarah E. Beshar | 1986-NY | Capital Markets | 1.6 | \$985 | \$1,576.00 |
| Kathleen Ferrell | 1998-NY | Tax | 1.8 | \$985 | \$1,773.00 |
| Edmond T. FitzGerald | 1992-NY | Executive Compensation and Employee Benefits | 3.7 | \$985 | \$3,644.50 |
| Marshall S. Huebner | 1994-NY | Insolvency & Restructuring | 69.1 | \$985 | \$68,063.50 |
| Benjamin Kaminetzky | 1996-NY | Litigation | 75.5 | \$985 | \$74,367.50 |
| Elliot Moskowitz | 2002-NY | Litigation | 112.9 | \$975 | \$110,077.50 |
| Brian M. Resnick | 2004-NY | Insolvency & Restructuring | 85.3 | \$975 | \$83,167.50 |
| Damian S. Schaible | 2002-NY | Insolvency & Restructuring | 0.3 | \$985 | \$295.50 |
| Amelia T. R. Starr | 1995-NY | Litigation | 21.3 | \$985 | \$20,980.50 |
| Mischa Travers | 1998-NY | Corporate | 15.4 | \$985 | \$15,169.00 |
| Waide Warner | 1980-NY | Credit | 1.0 | \$985 | \$985.00 |
| Simon Witty | 1987-UK | Corporate | 1.0 | \$985 | \$985.00 |
| Counsel | | | | | |
| Ron M. Aizen | 2006-NY | Executive Compensation and Employee Benefits | 23.4 | \$915 | \$21,411.00 |
| Hayden S. Baker | 2003-NY | Environmental | 13.6 | \$915 | \$12,444.00 |
| Erin K. Cho | 1998-NY | Executive Compensation and Employee Benefits | 2.1 | \$985 | \$2,068.50 |
| Jonathan D. Martin | 2004-NY | Litigation | 102.4 | \$915 | \$93,696.00 |
| Michael J. Russano | 2002-NY | Litigation | 128.6 | \$915 | \$117,669.00 |
| John T. Wright | 1982-NY | Executive Compensation and Employee Benefits | 1.1 | \$985 | \$1,083.50 |
| Total Partners and Counsel | | | 660.1 | | \$629,456.50 |

II.A. Associates

| NAME OF ASSOCIATE | YEAR ADMITTED | DEPARTMENT | TOTAL HOURS BILLED | HOURLY RATE | TOTAL FEES |
|-----------------------|--------------------|--|--------------------|-------------|--------------|
| Jeremy Adler | 2010-NY | Litigation | 14.5 | \$750 | \$10,875.00 |
| Jessica Agostinho | 2011-NY | Executive Compensation and Employee Benefits | 23.8 | \$675 | \$16,065.00 |
| Adam Balin | 2012-NY | Litigation | 12.1 | \$575 | \$6,957.50 |
| Jeffrey Brenner | 2012-NY | Capital Markets | 1.5 | \$575 | \$862.50 |
| Maxwell P. Chapman | Admission Pending | Insolvency and Restructuring | 155.5 | \$465 | \$72,307.50 |
| Boyoon Choi | 2009-NY | Mergers and Acquisitions | 10.6 | \$795 | \$8,427.00 |
| Kevin J. Coco | 2010-NY | Insolvency and Restructuring | 224.2 | \$750 | \$168,150.00 |
| Deryn Darcy | 2010-NJ | Litigation | 44.9 | \$675 | \$30,307.50 |
| Lauren Howard Elbert | 2010-NY | Litigation | 3.4 | \$750 | \$2,550.00 |
| Richard Estacio | 2010-NY | Litigation | 52.6 | \$750 | \$39,450.00 |
| Joshua Friedman | 2012-NY | Litigation | 27.3 | \$575 | \$15,697.50 |
| Andrew S. Gehring | 2010-NY | Litigation | 116.8 | \$750 | \$87,600.00 |
| Elyse Glazer | 2010-NY | Litigation | 69.2 | \$750 | \$51,900.00 |
| Shirin Hakimzadeh | 2011-NY | Litigation | 22.5 | \$675 | \$15,187.50 |
| Mhairi C. Immerman | 2005-NY | Credit | 10.9 | \$575 | \$6,267.50 |
| Darren S. Klein | 2007-NY | Insolvency and Restructuring | 1.5 | \$795 | \$1,192.50 |
| Steven C. Krause | 2007-MA 2008-NY | Insolvency and Restructuring | 4.1 | \$795 | \$3,259.50 |
| Angela Libby | 2012-NY | Insolvency and Restructuring | 42.7 | \$575 | \$24,552.50 |
| Daniel M. Loss | 2005-NY | Litigation | 31.9 | \$795 | \$25,360.50 |
| Christopher Lynch | 2008-NY | Litigation | 1.5 | \$795 | \$1,192.50 |
| Tracy Matlock | 2013-NY | Tax | 7.0 | \$465 | \$3,255.00 |
| Michelle M. McGreal | 2007-NJ 2008-NY | Insolvency and Restructuring | 72.9 | \$795 | \$57,955.50 |
| Adam Mehes | 2011-NY | Litigation | 88.4 | \$675 | \$59,670.00 |
| Lina Peng | Admission Pending | Litigation | 12.4 | \$465 | \$5,766.00 |
| Craig Phillips | 2007-NY | Tax | 4.5 | \$795 | \$3,577.50 |
| Craig M. Reiser | 2011-NY | Litigation | 100.2 | \$675 | \$67,635.00 |
| Christopher Robertson | Admission Pending | Insolvency and Restructuring | 29.0 | \$465 | \$13,485.00 |

| | | | | | |
|-------------------------|----------------------|---------------------------------|----------------|-------|-----------------------|
| Lara Samet | 2008-NJ 2009-NY | Litigation | 69.6 | \$795 | \$55,332.00 |
| Daniel Silberger | 2012-NY | Insolvency and Restructuring | 24.5 | \$575 | \$14,087.50 |
| Eugene Sokoloff | 2013-NY | Litigation | 77.6 | \$465 | \$36,084.00 |
| Robert Stewart | Admission Pending | Insolvency and Restructuring | 75.5 | \$465 | \$35,107.50 |
| Marc J. Tobak | 2009-NY | Litigation | 39.6 | \$795 | \$31,482.00 |
| Amy E. Turner | 2009-NY | Environmental | 1.6 | \$795 | \$1,272.00 |
| Adam VanWagner | Admission Pending | Insolvency and Restructuring | 8.5 | \$465 | \$3,952.50 |
| Amit Vora | 2011-NY | Litigation | 101.5 | \$675 | \$68,512.50 |
| Total Associates | | | 1,584.3 | | \$1,045,336.00 |

III.A. Summer Associates

| NAME OF ASSOCIATE | YEAR ADMITTED | DEPARTMENT | TOTAL HOURS BILLED | HOURLY RATE | TOTAL FEES |
|--------------------------------|----------------------|-------------------|---------------------------|--------------------|-------------------|
| Alexandra Cowen | | | 6.1 | \$235 | \$1,433.50 |
| Stephanie Goldfarb | | | 5.9 | \$235 | \$1,386.50 |
| Erika James | | | 24.3 | \$235 | \$5,710.50 |
| Total Summer Associates | | | 36.3 | | \$8,530.50 |

Attorney Blended Rates

| | ATTORNEY BLENDED RATE | TOTAL ATTORNEY HOURS BILLED | TOTAL ATTORNEY FEES¹ |
|-----------------------------|----------------------------------|--|--|
| Partners and Counsel | 953.6 | 660.1 | \$629,456.50 |
| Associates | 659.8 | 1,584.3 | \$1,045,336.00 |
| Summer Associates | 235.0 | 36.3 | \$8,530.50 |
| Total | 738.1 | 2,280.7 | \$1,683,323.00 |

¹ These figures reflect reductions as referenced above.

III.A. Paraprofessionals

| NAME OF PARAPROFESSIONAL | DEPARTMENT | TOTAL HOURS BILLED | HOURLY RATE | TOTAL FEES¹ |
|---------------------------------|----------------------------|---------------------------|--------------------|-------------------------------|
| Jen Eum | Legal Assistant Corporate | 50.3 | \$325 | \$16,347.50 |
| Elliot Law | Legal Assistant Corporate | 31.5 | \$385 | \$12,127.50 |
| Michael Pucci | Legal Assistant Corporate | 1.0 | \$325 | \$325.00 |
| Rachel Lange | Legal Assistant Litigation | 0.6 | \$325 | \$195.00 |
| Robert Jones | Managing Attorney's Office | 9.7 | \$310 | \$3,007.00 |
| Johnny Chen | Litigation Support | 2.0 | \$285 | \$570.00 |
| Romella Cheong | Litigation Support | 2.0 | \$285 | \$570.00 |
| Edgar Halford | Litigation Support | 3.4 | \$320 | \$1,088.00 |
| Matthew Harrington | Litigation Support | 66.3 | \$295 | \$19,558.50 |
| John Cavaiuolo | Information Systems | 27.5 | \$160 | \$4,400.00 |
| A. Lim | Document Clerk | 4.5 | \$105 | \$472.50 |
| Total Paraprofessionals | | 198.8 | | \$58,661.00 |

¹ These figures reflect voluntary reductions as referenced above.

EXHIBIT B

Expenses

ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES
INCURRED BY DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP ON
BEHALF OF THE DEBTORS DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD

| CATEGORY OF EXPENSES | AMOUNTS |
|--|--------------------|
| Computer research | \$13,591.32 |
| Duplication | \$1,516.50 |
| Litigation Support | \$38.70 |
| Postage, courier and freight | \$1,343.45 |
| Court and other fees | \$24,272.00 |
| Outside document retrieval (transcript, PACER, etc.) | \$2,412.27 |
| Travel | \$41,127.89 |
| Meals | \$5,394.26 |
| Total | \$89,696.39 |

EXHIBIT C

Summary by Project Code

**SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING
THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP
ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY**

| PROJECT CATEGORY | DESCRIPTION | HOURS | AMOUNT |
|--|--|---------------|-----------------------------------|
| 1. | ASSET DISPOSITIONS | 5.6 | \$4,570.50 |
| 2. | AUTOMATIC STAY | 54.1 | \$45,064.00 |
| 3. | CLAIMS INVESTIGATION | 377.9 | \$264,288.50 |
| 4. | CREDITOR\EQUITYHOLDER\UCC ISSUES | 153.3 | \$111,094.50 |
| 5. | DPW RETENTION | 9.1 | \$5,239.50 |
| 6. | EMPLOYEE LABOR ISSUES | 963.2 | \$707,745.00 |
| 7. | EXECUTORY CONTRACTS | 211.4 | \$149,409.50 |
| 8. | FINANCING | 16.4 | \$11,719.00 |
| 9. | GENERAL CASE ADMINISTRATION | 96.3 | \$64,748.50 |
| 10. | GOVERNANCE COMMUNICATIONS | 6.1 | \$5,607.50 |
| 11. | LITIGATION | 8.3 | \$7,885.00 |
| 12. | NON-DPW RETENTION | 27.6 | \$15,329.50 |
| 13. | NON-WORKING TRAVEL | 87.7 | \$26,785.75 |
| 14. | PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT | 269.1 | \$183,775.00 |
| 15. | PREPARATION OF FEE STATEMENTS/APPLICATIONS | 136.0 | \$72,025.50 |
| 16. | REGULATORY AND ENVIRONMENTAL | 53.3 | \$36,671.50 |
| 17. | SECURITIES CLASS ACTION | 4.1 | \$3,239.50 |
| Total Hours and Compensation Requested: | | 2479.5 | \$1,715,198.25¹ |

¹ This figure reflects reductions as referenced above.

EXHIBIT D

Time Record

| ASSET DISPOSITIONS | | | |
|---------------------------------|----------|------------|--|
| Coco KJ | 05/01/13 | 1.6 | Analysis of proposed joint venture transaction (1.4); call with M. Immermann regarding same and follow-up email (0.2). |
| Resnick BM | 05/01/13 | 0.2 | Emails with clients regarding potential joint venture transaction. |
| Coco KJ | 05/02/13 | 0.6 | Call with clients regarding possible joint venture transaction (0.4); meet with B. Resnick regarding same (0.2). |
| Resnick BM | 05/02/13 | 0.9 | Meet with K. Coco regarding potential joint venture transaction (0.5); call with multiple clients regarding same (0.4). |
| Travers M | 05/02/13 | 0.5 | Call with Patriot team regarding joint venture transaction. |
| Coco KJ | 05/15/13 | 0.2 | Call with auctioneer regarding equipment sales. |
| Libby A | 05/15/13 | 0.2 | Review Coal Sales order regarding procedures for Tier II sales and correspondence with M. McGreal regarding same. |
| Coco KJ | 05/30/13 | 0.5 | Emails with clients regarding Joint Venture transaction and review documents in connection with same. |
| McGreal MM | 05/31/13 | 0.9 | Review and revise confidentiality agreement for potential business transaction. |
| Total ASSET DISPOSITIONS | | 5.6 | |
| AUTOMATIC STAY | | | |
| Adler J | 05/01/13 | 0.5 | Correspond with K. Coco regarding Ryan lift-stay motion. |
| Starr AT | 05/01/13 | 2.8 | Calls and emails with J. Jones, E. Waller, K. Coco and J. Adler regarding Bowles lift-stay inquiry (2.1); emails regarding Ryan lift-stay motion (0.3); review McGhee stay motion (0.4). |
| Adler J | 05/02/13 | 1.3 | Review McGhee lift-stay motion (0.3); review Ryan lift-stay motion (0.3); perform legal research and review precedents for opposing a lift-stay motion in the Eighth Circuit (0.4); call with D. Sosne seeking to file a lift-stay motion in Bowles (0.3). |
| Coco KJ | 05/02/13 | 0.2 | Email to T. Brown regarding lift-stay stipulation with E. Burns. |
| McGreal MM | 05/02/13 | 0.1 | Teleconference with A. Starr and K. Coco regarding McGhee lift-stay motion. |
| Starr AT | 05/02/13 | 2.3 | Calls and emails with K. Coco, D. Sosne, E. |

| | | | |
|-----------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | Waller, J. Adler, H. Lawrence and J. Shook regarding stay issues (1.6); review lift-stay motion regarding McGhee claim (0.4); emails regarding Ryan lift-stay motion with E. Waller and J. Adler (0.3). |
| Martin JD | 05/05/13 | 0.2 | Emails with H. Lawrence and others regarding lift-stay motion. |
| Adler J | 05/06/13 | 3.0 | Draft opposition to McGhee motion to lift automatic stay. |
| Martin JD | 05/06/13 | 0.2 | Call with A. Starr regarding lift-stay motion. |
| Starr AT | 05/06/13 | 0.5 | Calls and emails regarding stay issues in Bowles litigation with E. Waller and D. Sosne. |
| Martin JD | 05/07/13 | 0.2 | Emails with H. Lawrence and others regarding Bowles action. |
| Starr AT | 05/07/13 | 0.4 | Emails regarding McGhee stay motion with J. Adler and E. Waller. |
| Adler J | 05/08/13 | 2.5 | Call with E. Waller and A. Starr regarding McGhee lift-stay motion (0.2); call with A. Starr regarding same (0.1); draft and revise opposition to same (2.2). |
| Estacio R | 05/08/13 | 0.3 | Correspond with K. Coco, J. Adler and others regarding McGhee automatic stay motion (0.2); emails with K. Coco regarding Burns automatic stay stipulation (0.1). |
| Klein DS | 05/08/13 | 0.2 | Call with K. Coco regarding lift-stay motion and insurance proceeds issue. |
| Starr AT | 05/08/13 | 0.5 | Emails and calls with J. Adler regarding McGhee stay motion. |
| Adler J | 05/09/13 | 1.5 | Revise opposition to McGhee motion to lift the automatic stay. |
| Coco KJ | 05/09/13 | 1.2 | Email to T. Brown regarding lift-stay matter (0.2); emails and call with Davis Polk team regarding various lift-stay issues (0.6); review and revise lift-stay stipulation for E. Burns (0.4). |
| Estacio R | 05/09/13 | 0.2 | Emails from K. Coco regarding Burns automatic stay stipulation. |
| Adler J | 05/13/13 | 1.9 | Correspond with J. Martin regarding opposition to McGhee lift-stay motion (0.2); revise opposition to McGhee lift-stay motion (1.3); call with opposing counsel regarding possible lift-stay motion in Bowles matter (0.2); correspond with A. Starr regarding same (0.2). |
| Coco KJ | 05/13/13 | 2.0 | Call with E. Waller regarding E. Burns lift-stay matter and follow-up emails (0.9); call with J. Adler regarding objection to McGhee lift-stay motion and follow-up email (0.4); email to T. |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | Brown regarding Burns lift-stay matter (0.2); review and comment on McGhee lift-stay draft objection (0.5). |
| Estacio R | 05/13/13 | 0.1 | Emails with A. Starr regarding Ryan motion for relief from automatic stay. |
| Martin JD | 05/13/13 | 2.3 | Communications with E. Waller, R. Mead, K. Coco, M. McGreal and others regarding Burns lift-stay motion (1.1); review and revise McGhee lift-stay opposition brief (1.2). |
| McGreal MM | 05/13/13 | 0.9 | Teleconferences with J. Martin and K. Coco regarding Burns lift-stay motion (0.2); teleconference with E. Waller, J. Martin and K. Coco regarding same (0.4); correspondence with K. Coco regarding same (0.2); correspondence with J. Adler and K. Coco regarding objection to McGhee lift-stay motion (0.1). |
| Adler J | 05/14/13 | 1.5 | Review and revise opposition to McGhee motion to lift stay. |
| Coco KJ | 05/14/13 | 1.1 | Review and comment on lift-stay objection for McGhee matter (0.8); coordinate filing and service of same (0.3). |
| Estacio R | 05/14/13 | 0.1 | Email with K. Coco regarding Burns automatic stay. |
| Martin JD | 05/14/13 | 0.6 | Review and comment on McGhee lift-stay opposition brief. |
| Adler J | 05/15/13 | 0.5 | Perform legal research regarding the status of potential claims brought by Debtors' insurance provider in connection with the Bowles lift-stay motion. |
| Coco KJ | 05/16/13 | 1.1 | Emails with S. Elliot and E. Waller regarding lift-stay matters (0.6); calls with A. Starr regarding lift-stay matters and follow-up email (0.5). |
| Martin JD | 05/16/13 | 1.6 | Review pleadings and case law in preparation for oral argument on McGhee motion. |
| McGreal MM | 05/16/13 | 0.3 | Teleconference with A. Starr and K. Coco regarding potential lift-stay stipulations. |
| Starr AT | 05/16/13 | 0.6 | Review chart summary of filed or threatened stay motions (0.2); conference call with M. McGreal and K. Coco regarding stay motions and insurance (0.4). |
| Coco KJ | 05/17/13 | 1.3 | Emails and call with S. Elliott regarding various lift-stay matters (0.6); emails with A. Starr regarding same (0.2); review chart with analysis of same (0.5). |
| Starr AT | 05/17/13 | 0.6 | Emails with K. Coco and S. Elliott regarding lift-stay requests (0.3); review chart of cases subject |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | to lift stay requests (0.3). |
| Martin JD | 05/19/13 | 1.8 | Draft and revise argument on McGhee lift-stay motion. |
| Adler J | 05/20/13 | 0.7 | Correspond with D. Sosne regarding possible lift-stay motion in Bowles matter (0.3); call with A. Starr regarding Bowles matter (0.2); draft email to E. Waller regarding same (0.2). |
| Coco KJ | 05/20/13 | 2.0 | Call with A. Starr and S. Elliott regarding various lift-stay inquiries and follow-ups (1.0); call with E. Waller regarding same (0.5); follow-up emails with E. Waller and S. Elliott regarding same (0.4); call with R. Mead regarding same (0.1). |
| Starr AT | 05/20/13 | 1.8 | Conference call with K. Coco and S. Elliott regarding stay litigation requests (0.9); review complaint (0.3); conference call with E. Waller regarding lift-stay requests (0.3); email to R. Mead regarding insurance issue (0.1); call with J. Adler regarding Sosne stay inquiry (0.2). |
| Coco KJ | 05/21/13 | 0.4 | Emails with A. Starr and E. Waller regarding lift-stay matters. |
| Martin JD | 05/21/13 | 1.0 | Review cases and pleadings in preparation for argument on McGhee lift-stay motion. |
| Starr AT | 05/21/13 | 0.8 | Calls and emails with K. Coco, J. Adler, E. Waller and J. Martin regarding McGhee stay motion, Sosne stay request and insurance disclosures regarding the same. |
| Martin JD | 05/22/13 | 0.2 | Emails with A. Starr, E. Waller and others regarding Bowles action. |
| Coco KJ | 05/23/13 | 0.5 | Emails with S. Elliott and clients regarding various lift-stay matters for tort litigation claims. |
| Coco KJ | 05/23/13 | 0.4 | Coordinate drafting of proposed order denying lift-stay motion. |
| Libby A | 05/23/13 | 0.5 | Draft proposed order denying McGhee lift-stay motion and review transcript regarding same. |
| Martin JD | 05/23/13 | 0.2 | Review Bowles lift-stay motion. |
| Starr AT | 05/23/13 | 0.3 | Emails with K. Coco and J. Martin regarding new stay motion. |
| Coco KJ | 05/24/13 | 0.3 | Coordinate regarding proposed lift-stay order. |
| Libby A | 05/24/13 | 0.6 | Draft and revise proposed order denying McGhee lift-stay motion (0.3); incorporate K. Coco and M. McGreal comments into same (0.3). |
| Martin JD | 05/24/13 | 0.2 | Review and comment on proposed McGhee order. |
| McGreal MM | 05/24/13 | 0.3 | Review and comment on proposed order denying McGhee lift-stay motion (0.2); correspondence with K. Coco and A. Libby regarding same (0.1). |

| | | | |
|-----------------------------|----------|-------------|---|
| Coco KJ | 05/28/13 | 0.5 | Call with A. Starr regarding lift-stay matters and follow-up emails with litigation counsel. |
| McGreal MM | 05/28/13 | 0.1 | Email Chambers McGhee lift-stay order. |
| Starr AT | 05/28/13 | 0.6 | Emails regarding lift-stay issues with E. Waller, S. Elliott and K. Coco (0.2); call with R. Mead regarding Chartis insurance policy (0.4). |
| Coco KJ | 05/29/13 | 1.4 | Emails with S. Elliott and clients regarding lift-stay matters (0.6); call with A. Starr and research regarding applicability of lift-stay (0.8). |
| Martin JD | 05/29/13 | 0.1 | Call with A. Starr regarding Bowles lift-stay motion. |
| Starr AT | 05/29/13 | 1.3 | Calls and emails regarding stay motions with K. Coco, S. Elliott, J Martin, J. Adler and R. Mead (0.8); review redacted insurance policies prior to production (0.5). |
| Coco KJ | 05/30/13 | 0.4 | Emails with E. Waller and J. Linden regarding black lung lift-stay matter. |
| McGreal MM | 05/30/13 | 0.1 | Review correspondence from E. Waller regarding potential lift-stay claimant. |
| Starr AT | 05/30/13 | 0.6 | Calls and emails regarding stay issues with S. Elliott and H. Coco (0.4); calls to J. Adler regarding Sosne stay motion (0.2). |
| Adler J | 05/31/13 | 1.1 | Prepare insurance agreements for production to opposing counsel in connection with Bowles lift-stay motion (0.4); communicate with J. Shook regarding production of insurance agreements (0.3); draft and send email to opposing counsel in connection with production of agreements (0.4). |
| Coco KJ | 05/31/13 | 0.9 | Call with A. Starr regarding various lift-stay matters (0.2); emails with S. Elliot regarding same (0.5); email to clients regarding Burns lift-stay matter (0.1); email with Burns counsel regarding same (0.1). |
| Starr AT | 05/31/13 | 0.4 | Calls and emails regarding Bowles stay motion with J. Adler and J. Martin. |
| Total AUTOMATIC STAY | | 54.1 | |
| CLAIMS INVESTIGATION | | | |
| Reiser CM | 05/01/13 | 4.6 | Review articles concerning Patriot bankruptcy proceedings (0.1); second review of documents pertinent to potential claims investigation (4.5). |
| Russano MJ | 05/01/13 | 0.5 | Emails with P. Wilson regarding Peabody discovery (0.3); email to B. O'Neill regarding same (0.2). |
| Reiser CM | 05/02/13 | 0.8 | Second review of documents pertinent to |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | potential claims investigation. |
| Russano MJ | 05/02/13 | 2.7 | Confer with M. Huebner regarding discovery status and call with Winston and Strawn (0.2); email to Peabody and Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel regarding discovery meet and confer and proposed order (0.3); call with Winston and Strawn regarding discovery motions (0.5); review and revise draft confidentiality order (1.1); email to R. Reinthaler regarding same (0.3); confer with M. Tobak regarding same (0.3). |
| Tobak MJ | 05/02/13 | 0.9 | Revision to draft confidentiality agreement in connection with special litigation committee (0.3); conferences and correspondence with M. Russano and A. Dove regarding same (0.6). |
| Reiser CM | 05/03/13 | 0.6 | Second review of documents pertinent to potential claims investigation. |
| Tobak MJ | 05/03/13 | 0.3 | Correspondence with K. Coco regarding retiree inquiry. |
| Balin A | 05/06/13 | 1.8 | Second review of documents related to investigation. |
| Darcy D | 05/06/13 | 1.4 | Prepare for meeting with J. Friedman regarding outstanding workstreams for fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (0.2); meet with J. Friedman regarding outstanding workstreams for fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (0.5); review case law regarding jurisdictional question (0.7). |
| Friedman J | 05/06/13 | 0.6 | Confer with D. Darcy regarding research on potential claims. |
| Gehring AS | 05/06/13 | 3.2 | Review draft protective order (0.7); emails with M. Russano and M. Tobak regarding same (0.4); meet with M. Russano and M. Tobak regarding same (1.1); call with M. Russano and M. Tobak to Peabody and the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding same (1.0). |
| Reiser CM | 05/06/13 | 7.3 | Second review of documents pertinent to potential claims investigation. |
| Russano MJ | 05/06/13 | 8.7 | Draft, review and revise search term list for Rule 2004 discovery (1.4); review Unsecured Creditors' Committee correspondence regarding same (0.3); call with Peabody regarding same and proposed orders (0.8); draft, review and revise proposed discovery orders (0.9); confer with M. Tobak and A. Gehring regarding same (0.3); review notable documents from second review (1.7); draft, review and revise proposed |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | confidentiality order (1.0); confer with M. Tobak regarding same (0.2); confer with D. Darcy regarding legal research and memo regarding potential claims (0.2); update case chronology and key issues memo (1.9). |
| Tobak MJ | 05/06/13 | 5.8 | Work on Peabody Rule 2004 protective order (0.6); confer with M. Russano regarding same (0.3); confer with B. O'Neill, A. Dove, M. Russano and A. Gehring regarding same (0.3); confer with Jones Day, B. O'Neill, A. Dove, M. Russano and A. Gehring regarding confidentiality order (1.2); confer with A. Gehring regarding backup restoration (0.8); correspond with M. Russano regarding confidentiality order (0.1); revise third-party subpoena (1.9); correspond with M. Russano regarding same (0.4); respond to retiree inquiry (0.2). |
| Cheong RC | 05/07/13 | 1.2 | Search DocuMatrix database and prepare documents for attorney review per C. Reiser. |
| Darcy D | 05/07/13 | 3.7 | Perform case law research on jurisdictional issue for fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (3.6); discuss outstanding research for fraudulent transfer choice of law research with J. Friedman (0.1). |
| Friedman J | 05/07/13 | 2.0 | Research regarding potential claims (1.8); confer with D. Darcy regarding same (0.2). |
| Gehring AS | 05/07/13 | 2.3 | Call with M. Tobak to Peabody regarding confidentiality order (0.8); communications with M. Tobak and the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding same (0.2); call with C. Reiser regarding document review (0.3); review and edit draft Rule 2004 subpoena (0.4); emails and calls with document review team and Litigation Technical Support regarding document review (0.6). |
| Reiser CM | 05/07/13 | 6.9 | Second review of documents pertinent to potential claims investigation (6.4); confer with A. Gehring regarding status of second review (0.2); emails with R. Hinton regarding preparation of documents for review (0.3). |
| Russano MJ | 05/07/13 | 7.0 | Prepare for and attend meet and confer discovery call with Peabody and Unsecured Creditors' Committee (1.1); review and revise draft Rule 2004 and confidentiality orders (0.9); call with B. O'Neill regarding same (0.4); call with M. Tobak and A. Gehring regarding same (0.3); review |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | memo on potential restoration email points (0.8); confer with M. Tobak regarding same (0.3); review and comment on third-party subpoena draft (1.0); confer with M. Tobak and A. Gehring regarding same (0.3); review documents and update case chronology (1.9). |
| Tobak MJ | 05/07/13 | 2.9 | Telephone conference with Jones Day, B. O'Neill, A. Dove, M. Russano and A. Gehring regarding confidentiality agreement (0.8); draft status update for board presentation (0.4); conference and correspondence with M. Russano and A. Gehring regarding third-party subpoena (0.5); revise same (0.5); correspondence with B. Schulman regarding search terms (0.3); review changes to confidentiality order (0.4). |
| Darcy D | 05/08/13 | 2.0 | Review case law for research on jurisdictional issue (0.4); meet with M. Russano and J. Friedman to discuss research for fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (0.7); discuss outstanding research workstreams with J. Friedman following meeting (0.3); compile materials for fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (0.2); conduct research on creditors for fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (0.4). |
| Friedman J | 05/08/13 | 5.0 | Research regarding fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (4.0); confer with M. Russano and D. Darcy regarding same (1.0). |
| Gehring AS | 05/08/13 | 3.8 | Review Peabody's proposed search terms (0.5); review Duff and Phelps and Morgan Stanley Rule 2004 motions (0.8); review draft confidentiality order (0.4); review draft Rule 2004 order (0.6); communications and meetings with M. Russano, M. Tobak and the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding same (1.5). |
| Reiser CM | 05/08/13 | 5.8 | Review articles concerning Patriot bankruptcy proceedings (0.1); second review of documents pertinent to potential claims investigation (5.7). |
| Russano MJ | 05/08/13 | 7.2 | Review and analyze Peabody markups to various discovery orders (1.1); confer with M. Tobak and A. Gehring regarding same (0.4); review and analyze court transcript regarding discovery motions (0.5); confer with Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel regarding discovery orders (0.6); review and analyze correspondence regarding discussions with Peabody counsel (0.7); |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | confer with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.1); review and revise memorandum on choice of law and statute of limitations (2.1); meet with D. Darcy regarding same (0.3); call with Curtis Mallet regarding third-party discovery (0.5); confer with M. Tobak regarding same (0.3); review revised case management order regarding objection procedures and email to T. Foudy regarding same (0.4); confer with A. Libby regarding same (0.2). |
| Tobak MJ | 05/08/13 | 2.5 | Telephone conference with B. O'Neill, A. Dove, M. Russano and A. Gehring regarding Peabody revisions to Rule 2004 order (0.8); confer with A. Gehring regarding search terms and confidentiality agreement (0.8); review Peabody revisions to Rule 2004 order (0.3); revise draft Rule 2004 order (0.6). |
| Balin A | 05/09/13 | 2.8 | Second review of documents related to investigation. |
| Darcy D | 05/09/13 | 2.6 | Conduct research in connection with fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (1.9); discuss same with J. Friedman (0.2); review case law relating to fraudulent transfer choice of law research (0.5). |
| Friedman J | 05/09/13 | 4.1 | Research regarding potential claims (2.9); email with D. Darcy regarding same (1.0); confer with D. Darcy regarding same (0.2). |
| Gehring AS | 05/09/13 | 2.6 | Meeting and call with M. Tobak to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding document search terms (1.5); meeting with C. Reiser regarding same (0.1); review and edit draft confidentiality order and proposed Rule 2004 order (1.0). |
| Reiser CM | 05/09/13 | 6.6 | Second review of documents pertinent to potential claims investigation (5.2); confer with A. Gehring regarding search terms for Rule 2004 discovery (0.2); prepare list of entities considered by Peabody for inclusion in Patriot (1.0); prepare email regarding same (0.2). |
| Russano MJ | 05/09/13 | 4.0 | Confer with Peabody and Unsecured Creditors' Committee Counsel regarding call scheduling (0.3); review Peabody statements in various press releases and articles (0.8); review latest draft of confidentiality order and confer with M. Tobak regarding same (0.9); review and revise draft Rule 2004 motion (0.8); confer with Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel regarding same |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | (0.5); confer with M. Tobak and A. Gehring regarding same (0.7). |
| Tobak MJ | 05/09/13 | 3.4 | Revisions to Rule 2004 order (0.7); correspondence with Jones Day regarding same (0.4); correspondence with B. O'Neill, A. Dove, M. Russano and A. Gehring regarding same (0.5); review and revise confidentiality order (0.6); conference with B. O'Neill, B. Schulman, A. Dove and A. Gehring regarding search terms (0.8); conference with A. Gehring regarding same (0.4). |
| Coco KJ | 05/10/13 | 0.4 | Call and email with conflicts counsel and email with Davis Polk team regarding Morgan Stanley Rule 2004 motion. |
| Darcy D | 05/10/13 | 0.5 | Review case law as part of research for fraudulent transfer choice of law research. |
| Friedman J | 05/10/13 | 0.6 | Research regarding potential claims. |
| Gehring AS | 05/10/13 | 1.2 | Communications with M. Russano and M. Tobak regarding Rule 2004 order (0.3); call with M. Russano and M. Tobak to Peabody and the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding same (0.9). |
| Reiser CM | 05/10/13 | 2.4 | Review articles concerning Patriot bankruptcy proceedings (0.1); finalize list of entities considered by Peabody for inclusion in Patriot (0.4); second review of documents pertinent to potential claims investigation (1.9). |
| Russano MJ | 05/10/13 | 5.8 | Email to M. Huebner and E. Moskowitz regarding status of Rule 2004 investigation and proposed orders (0.3); email update to J. Bean regarding same (0.6); confer with M. Tobak and A. Gehring regarding status of orders and process for submitting to the court (0.5); confer with J. Mazzotti regarding request for information (0.5); email to M. Tobak regarding same (0.3); prepare for and attend Rule 2004 meet and confer with Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel and Peabody (1.6); review documents and update case chronology (2.0). |
| Tobak MJ | 05/10/13 | 2.4 | Correspondence with J. Mazzotti regarding board presentations (0.2); retrieve same (0.4); correspondence with M. McGreal regarding discovery update (0.2); review proposed Rule 2004 order (0.2); conference with M. Russano, A. Gehring, B. O'Neill, A. Dove, P. Wilson and S. Cousins regarding Rule 2004 order (0.6); |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|------|--|
| | | | conference with A. Gehring regarding search terms (0.2); correspondence with M. Russano, A. Gehring, B. O'Neill and A. Dove regarding confidentiality order (0.3); correspondence with M. Russano, A. Gehring, B. O'Neill and A. Dove regarding backup tape schedule (0.3). |
| Darcy D | 05/11/13 | 4.6 | Revise memorandum regarding fraudulent transfer choice of law research (2.2); conduct research regarding issues relating to fraudulent transfer choice of law research (2.4). |
| Darcy D | 05/13/13 | 10.0 | Read and revise memorandum regarding fraudulent transfer choice of law research (5.9); discuss same with J. Friedman (0.6); conduct research for fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (3.1); read case law regarding fraudulent transfer choice of law issues (0.4). |
| Friedman J | 05/13/13 | 5.5 | Research regarding potential claims (2.3); draft memorandum regarding same (3.0); confer with D. Darcy regarding same (0.2). |
| Gehring AS | 05/13/13 | 2.1 | Review Peabody objections to Duff & Phelps and Morgan Stanley Rule 2004 motions (0.3); emails with M. Russano regarding same (0.2); review draft protective order (0.1); revise document search terms (1.5). |
| Reiser CM | 05/13/13 | 3.5 | Review articles concerning Patriot bankruptcy proceedings (0.2); review Peabody's objections to Rule 2004 discovery from Morgan Stanley and Duff & Phelps (0.2); second review of documents pertinent to potential claims investigation (3.1). |
| Russano MJ | 05/13/13 | 2.3 | Review and revise drafts of proposed confidentiality and Rule 2004 orders (0.8); emails with P. Wilson regarding same (0.3); review Peabody objections to third-party subpoenas (1.0); confer with A. Gehring regarding same (0.2). |
| Tobak MJ | 05/13/13 | 0.3 | Review revised search term proposal. |
| Darcy D | 05/14/13 | 0.6 | Review fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (0.1); discuss citecheck of fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum with J. Friedman (0.1); review case law in connection with research for fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (0.4). |
| Friedman J | 05/14/13 | 2.3 | Review citations in memorandum regarding potential claims. |
| Gehring AS | 05/14/13 | 3.6 | Revise document search terms (1.3); communications with M. Russano, M. Tobak and |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding same (1.8); communications with C. Reiser regarding same (0.5). |
| Reiser CM | 05/14/13 | 6.4 | Second review of documents pertinent to potential claims investigation (3.4); confer with A. Gehring regarding search terms for Rule 2004 discovery and status of the case (0.4); update list of entities and reserves considered by Peabody for inclusion in Patriot (2.4); review draft Rule 2004 search terms (0.2). |
| Russano MJ | 05/14/13 | 1.0 | Confer with M. Tobak and A. Gehring regarding status of Rule 2004 and confidentiality orders (0.5); email to P. Wilson regarding same (0.3); email to E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.2). |
| Tobak MJ | 05/14/13 | 2.4 | Review and revise search term proposal (1.3); confer with B. Schulman, A. Dove and A. Gehring regarding search terms (0.9); correspond with A. Gehring regarding same (0.2). |
| Coco KJ | 05/15/13 | 0.3 | Call with H. Hiznay regarding Rule 2004 motions and follow-up email to Davis Polk team. |
| Darcy D | 05/15/13 | 1.9 | Organize research assignments for fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (0.4); meet with E. James to provide introduction to case and discuss citechecking assignment (0.6); review fraudulent transfer case law for fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (0.9). |
| Friedman J | 05/15/13 | 5.4 | Review citations in memorandum regarding potential claims. |
| Gehring AS | 05/15/13 | 2.8 | Communications with M. Russano, C. Reiser, Bryan Cave and client regarding document collection (0.6); communications with M. Russano, M. Tobak, Peabody and the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding Rule 2004 order (1.6); revise document search terms (0.2); communications with M. Tobak and the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding same (0.2); review Morgan Stanley letter regarding Rule 2004 motion (0.2). |
| James EA | 05/15/13 | 0.6 | Meet with D. Darcy for overview of research assignment. |
| Reiser CM | 05/15/13 | 5.1 | Second review of documents pertinent to potential claims investigation (4.5); calls and emails with A. Gehring and G. Koenig regarding hard copy documents retrieved from Patriot's headquarters (0.5); review articles concerning Patriot bankruptcy proceedings (0.1). |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|---|
| Russano MJ | 05/15/13 | 3.5 | Call from J. Jones regarding document collection (0.2); confer with A. Gehring and M. Tobak regarding same (0.3); prepare for and attend call with Peabody and Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding draft Rule 2004 and confidentiality orders (1.2); confer with M. Tobak and A. Gehring regarding same (0.3); call with T. Foudy regarding Peabody objection to third-party subpoena and upcoming hearing regarding same (0.5); review correspondence between M. Tobak and T. Foudy regarding comments to confidentiality order (0.5); email to J. Bean regarding preparation for upcoming hearing (0.3); confer with D. Darcy regarding research memo (0.2). |
| Tobak MJ | 05/15/13 | 2.1 | Conference with P. Wilson, B. O'Neill, A. Dove, M. Russano and A. Gehring regarding Peabody revisions to Rule 2004 order, confidentiality stipulation (0.8); conference with A. Gehring regarding revisions to confidentiality stipulation (0.3); correspondence with Curtis Mallet regarding confidentiality stipulation, comments to same (0.5); correspondence with M. Russano regarding Rule 2004 order (0.2); correspondence regarding revisions to search terms (0.3). |
| Darcy D | 05/16/13 | 1.8 | Review fraudulent transfer case law for fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (1.4); discuss research with J. Friedman regarding choice of law issue for fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (0.3); obtain access to case files for E. James (0.1). |
| Friedman J | 05/16/13 | 1.4 | Research regarding potential claims (0.8); confer with L. Jacobs regarding same (0.3); confer with D. Darcy regarding same (0.3). |
| Gehring AS | 05/16/13 | 2.4 | Communications with M. Tobak and the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding document search terms (0.4); communications with M. Russano and M. Tobak regarding Rule 2004 order (0.7); review and edit same and confidentiality order (0.8); review Rule 2004 motion responses (0.3); communications with C. Reiser and client regarding document collection (0.2). |
| Reiser CM | 05/16/13 | 5.6 | Review status of precedent spin-off case (0.1); second review of documents pertinent to potential claims investigation (5.2); calls and e-mails with |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | A. Gehring and G. Koenig regarding hard copy documents retrieved from Patriot's headquarters (0.3). |
| Russano MJ | 05/16/13 | 3.2 | Review and comment on revised Rule 2004 and confidentiality orders (0.9); confer with M. Tobak and A. Gehring regarding same (0.5); review and revise response to Peabody objection to third-party subpoenas (1.0); email to T. Foudy and J. Bean regarding same (0.4); confer with B. O'Neill regarding status of various orders and upcoming hearing strategy (0.4). |
| Tobak MJ | 05/16/13 | 2.3 | Correspond with B. O'Neill, B. Schulman and A. Dove regarding Peabody Rule 2004 order (0.4); confer with B. O'Neill regarding same (0.3); correspond with M. Russano, A. Gehring regarding same (0.7); revise Rule 2004 order and confidentiality order (0.9). |
| Darcy D | 05/17/13 | 0.5 | Review fraudulent transfer case law in connection with research for fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum. |
| Gehring AS | 05/17/13 | 3.7 | Second review of documents for potential claims investigation (3.1); communications with document review team regarding same (0.6). |
| James EA | 05/17/13 | 2.0 | Revise claims investigation memorandum for D. Darcy. |
| Reiser CM | 05/17/13 | 3.1 | Second review of documents pertinent to potential claims investigation (2.7); calls with A. Gehring regarding second review of documents (0.3); review articles concerning Patriot bankruptcy proceedings (0.1). |
| Russano MJ | 05/17/13 | 0.3 | Review correspondence between E. Moskowitz and investigation team regarding assumed Peabody contracts (0.2); email to M. Tobak and A. Gehring regarding same (0.1). |
| Tobak MJ | 05/17/13 | 1.1 | Correspondence with M. Russano and A. Gehring regarding Rule 2004 order (0.2); manage second review staffing (0.9). |
| Darcy D | 05/18/13 | 0.5 | Review fraudulent transfer case law for fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum. |
| Darcy D | 05/19/13 | 0.5 | Review fraudulent transfer case law for fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum. |
| Tobak MJ | 05/19/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with M. Russano regarding Peabody Rule 2004 order. |
| Chen JW | 05/20/13 | 2.0 | Perform coding analysis on responsive email threads for privilege review per C. Reiser (1.0); create folder of email threads with privilege |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | coding issues for case team review per C. Reiser (1.0). |
| Darcy D | 05/20/13 | 1.5 | Meet with M. Russano to discuss draft of fraudulent transfer memorandum and questions regarding outstanding research items for same (0.8); discuss research on statute of limitations issues with J. Friedman (0.1); review briefing from fraudulent transfer case for fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (0.6). |
| Friedman J | 05/20/13 | 0.4 | Confer with D. Darcy regarding memorandum on potential claims (0.2); email with D. Darcy regarding same (0.2). |
| Gehring AS | 05/20/13 | 1.1 | Review Peabody filings regarding Rule 2004 motions (0.2); communications with M. Tobak and C. Reiser regarding document privilege (0.5); communications with M. Russano, M. Tobak and the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding Rule 2004 order (0.4). |
| James EA | 05/20/13 | 4.2 | Revise claims investigation memorandum for D. Darcy. |
| Reiser CM | 05/20/13 | 9.3 | Second review of documents pertinent to potential claims investigation (2.6); review Peabody's statement in support of Rule 2004 objection (0.1); confer with A. Gehring and M. Tobak regarding second review of documents and document production to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.5); review documents in document review database for quality control with respect to privilege (5.6); emails with J. Chen and A. Balin regarding same (0.5). |
| Russano MJ | 05/20/13 | 3.2 | Confer with A. Libby regarding omnibus hearing (0.2); call with T. Foudy regarding various procedural questions (0.5); confer with B. Resnick regarding same (0.3); review and analyze Peabody submissions in response to third-party subpoenas (0.8); confer with T. Foudy regarding same (0.4); confer with J. Bean regarding same (0.3); call with Joele Frank regarding same (0.3); confer with B. O'Neill and A. Dove regarding status of union confidentiality provisions within the draft Rule 2004 order (0.4). |
| Tobak MJ | 05/20/13 | 1.1 | Confer with A. Gehring and C. Reiser regarding document review (0.5); confer with M. Russano regarding Rule 2004 order (0.3); review Peabody filings in connection with conflicts Rule 2004 discovery (0.3). |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|--|
| Balin A | 05/21/13 | 1.9 | Review documents in document review database for quality control with respect to privilege (1.0); speak to C. Reiser regarding the same (0.5); read Patriot emails related to review (0.4). |
| Darcy D | 05/21/13 | 1.2 | Review briefing from fraudulent transfer case in connection with fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (1.1); discuss cite check of fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum with E. James (0.1). |
| Gehring AS | 05/21/13 | 1.2 | Conference and communications with M. Russano, M. Tobak, the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and Peabody regarding Rule 2004 order and confidentiality order (0.8); communications with M. Russano and M. Tobak regarding litigation trust (0.4). |
| Reiser CM | 05/21/13 | 0.2 | Call with A. Balin regarding quality control privilege review. |
| Russano MJ | 05/21/13 | 5.4 | Telephonically appear during court omnibus hearing regarding Rule 2004 discovery (1.0); confer with T. Foudy regarding proposed order regarding same (0.3); prepare for and attend call with Peabody and Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel regarding Rule 2004 discovery and proposed orders (1.1); call with B. O'Neill regarding same (0.4); review proposed electronic search terms (0.7); review news articles regarding Rule 2004 discovery rulings (0.5); confer with E. Moskowitz regarding confidentiality order disputes (0.6); review correspondence with Peabody counsel and internal communications regarding same (0.5); email with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.3). |
| Tobak MJ | 05/21/13 | 1.6 | Telephone conference with M. Russano, B. O'Neill, P. Wilson, S. Cousins, A. Dove and A. Gehring regarding Rule 2004 order and confidentiality order (1.0); confer with A. Gehring regarding restore points (0.2); correspond with B. O'Neill, B. Schulman and A. Dove regarding same (0.1); conferences and correspondence with M. Russano and K. Coco regarding local rules (0.3). |
| Balin A | 05/22/13 | 1.6 | Review documents in document review database for quality control with respect to privilege (1.5); confer with C. Reiser regarding the same (0.1). |
| Darcy D | 05/22/13 | 0.3 | Review briefing from fraudulent transfer case for fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | (0.2); follow up with M. Russano regarding same (0.1). |
| James EA | 05/22/13 | 5.0 | Revise claims investigation memorandum for D. Darcy. |
| Reiser CM | 05/22/13 | 6.5 | Calls with A. Balin regarding quality control privilege review (0.3); review documents in document review database for quality control with respect to privilege (6.2). |
| Russano MJ | 05/22/13 | 3.0 | Review backup tape restoration proposal (0.9); confer with M. Tobak regarding same (0.2); review correspondence with Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel regarding same (0.3); review documents from second review (1.1); confer with M. Tobak regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee production (0.5). |
| Tobak MJ | 05/22/13 | 0.9 | Revise draft Rule 2004 order (0.3); correspondence with P. Wilson, S. Cousins, B. O'Neill, M. Russano and A. Gehring regarding restore points (0.4); review transcript of May 21 omnibus hearing (0.2). |
| Balin A | 05/23/13 | 3.8 | Review documents in document review database for quality control with respect to privilege (3.4); confer with C. Reiser regarding same (0.4). |
| Cheong RC | 05/23/13 | 0.8 | Prepare spreadsheets for attorney review per C. Reiser. |
| Darcy D | 05/23/13 | 7.8 | Discuss fraudulent transfer choice of law analysis and case workstreams with C. Reiser (0.5); review briefing in fraudulent transfer case for fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (0.9); research state fraudulent transfer law for fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (1.0); discuss cite check for fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum with E. James (0.1); read and revise fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (4.3); cite check fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum (1.0). |
| Gehring AS | 05/23/13 | 0.8 | Communications with M. Russano, M. Tobak, C. Reiser and Litigation Technical Services regarding document privilege. |
| James EA | 05/23/13 | 7.0 | Revise claims investigation memorandum for D. Darcy. |
| Pucci MV | 05/23/13 | 1.0 | Identify, run searches and quality check potentially privileged documents in DocuMatrix as per C. Reiser. |
| Reiser CM | 05/23/13 | 7.6 | Review documents in document review database for quality control with respect to privilege (5.8); |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | confer with D. Darcy regarding status of claims investigation (0.5); confer with A. Balin regarding quality control privilege review (0.2); confer with A. Gehring and M. Tobak regarding same (0.9); emails regarding same (0.2). |
| Russano MJ | 05/23/13 | 3.8 | Email with M. Huebner and M. Freitag regarding Rule 2004 discovery order (0.6); review Peabody filing and court transcript regarding same (0.9); call with M. Freitag regarding same (0.4); confer with M. Tobak regarding production to Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.4); confer with counsel for Peabody and Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding Rule 2004 and confidentiality order negotiations and scheduling (0.7); review latest drafts of discovery orders (0.8). |
| Tobak MJ | 05/23/13 | 2.2 | Conference with M. Russano regarding case status (0.3); conference with C. Reiser regarding review of privileged documents (0.7); correspondence with M. Russano regarding privileged documents (0.7); review privileged documents (0.5). |
| Balin A | 05/24/13 | 0.2 | Review documents in document review database for quality control with respect to privilege. |
| Darcy D | 05/24/13 | 2.3 | Revise fraudulent transfer choice of law memorandum based on results of cite check (1.8); conduct research for cite check (0.5). |
| Gehring AS | 05/24/13 | 1.5 | Communications with M. Tobak and C. Reiser regarding document privilege (0.8); second review documents for privilege (0.7). |
| James EA | 05/24/13 | 5.5 | Revise claims investigation memorandum for D. Darcy. |
| Reiser CM | 05/24/13 | 3.6 | Second review of documents pertinent to potential claims investigation (1.0); review documents in document review database for quality control with respect to privilege (1.4); emails in connection with same (0.6); confer with A. Gehring regarding same (0.6). |
| Russano MJ | 05/24/13 | 5.1 | Review news articles regarding Rule 2004 investigation (0.4); review correspondence from T. Foudy to J. Bean regarding third-party subpoenas (0.3); review and revise draft memo regarding statute of limitations and choice of law (1.9); second review of documents (2.5). |
| Tobak MJ | 05/24/13 | 1.1 | Final review of privileged documents (0.8); correspondence with A. Gehring and C. Reiser |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | regarding same (0.3). |
| Gehring AS | 05/26/13 | 0.2 | Communications with M. Tobak and C. Reiser regarding document privilege. |
| Tobak MJ | 05/26/13 | 1.8 | Final review of privileged documents (0.9); correspondence with A. Gehring, C. Reiser and A. Balin regarding same (0.9). |
| Gehring AS | 05/27/13 | 0.3 | Communications with M. Tobak and C. Reiser regarding document privilege. |
| Reiser CM | 05/27/13 | 1.1 | Emails with M. Tobak, A. Gehring and A. Balin regarding quality control document review. |
| Gehring AS | 05/28/13 | 1.4 | Communications with M. Russano, M. Tobak and C. Reiser regarding document privilege (0.8); communications with Peabody and the Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding Rule 2004 discovery (0.2); review Peabody's proposed document search terms (0.4). |
| Lim AS | 05/28/13 | 4.5 | Assist in the organizing and printing of potential privileged documents from the DocuMatrix database as per C. Reiser. |
| Reiser CM | 05/28/13 | 2.9 | Review documents in document review database for quality control with respect to privilege (0.9); emails in connection with same (0.5); confer with A. Gehring, M. Pucci and A. Lim regarding same (0.4); prepare potential privileged documents and coordinate printing of relevant documents therein (1.1). |
| Russano MJ | 05/28/13 | 4.0 | Emails with Peabody and Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel regarding Rule 2004 negotiations and scheduling (0.3); confer with A. Gehring regarding document production (0.6); review of documents selected from second review (1.4); update case chronology (1.7). |
| Tobak MJ | 05/28/13 | 0.3 | Correspondence with A. Gehring and C. Reiser regarding privileged documents. |
| Gehring AS | 05/29/13 | 3.8 | Conference and communications with M. Russano, Peabody, the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and Curtis Mallet regarding Rule 2004 order (1.5); revise same (0.4); draft letter to court regarding same (0.3); communications with M. Tobak, the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and Peabody regarding document search terms (1.2); second review of documents related to potential claims investigation (0.4). |
| Reiser CM | 05/29/13 | 1.8 | Confer with A. Gehring regarding status of claims investigation (0.1); second review of documents pertinent to potential claims investigation (1.7). |

| | | | |
|---------------|----------|-----|--|
| Russano MJ | 05/29/13 | 4.4 | Prepare for and attend Rule 2004 discovery calls with A. Gehring, counsel for Peabody and Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel (0.9); review revised drafts of discovery orders proposed by Peabody (0.8); confer with A. Gehring, B. O'Neill and A. Dove regarding same (0.4); call with T. Foudy regarding status of discussions with Peabody and draft confidentiality order (0.5); confer with A. Gehring regarding procedures for submission of competing orders (0.4); confer with E. Moskowitz regarding status of discussions with Peabody (0.3); email to J. Bean regarding same (0.8); confer with local counsel regarding disputed orders procedure and email to B. O'Neill regarding same (0.3). |
| Gehring AS | 05/30/13 | 3.4 | Communications and conferences with M. Tobak and C. Reiser regarding document search terms (1.2); communications with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and consultant regarding same (0.9); confer with M. Russano regarding Rule 2004 order (0.3); draft letter regarding same (1.0). |
| Reiser CM | 05/30/13 | 2.8 | Confer with A. Gehring regarding status of claims investigation (0.1); emails with litigation technical support regarding targeted searches of search terms in document database (0.3); conduct targeted searches in document database for purpose of developing search terms for Peabody document production (1.7); confer with A. Gehring regarding same (0.3); second review of documents pertinent to potential claims investigation (0.4). |
| Russano MJ | 05/30/13 | 3.0 | Review and analyze documents sent by J. Bean (0.2); review and comment on draft statute of limitations and conflict of law memo (2.0); review letter to court (0.8). |
| Gehring AS | 05/31/13 | 0.9 | Communications with M. Tobak, C. Reiser, the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and Peabody regarding document search terms. |
| Kaminetzky BS | 05/31/13 | 0.8 | Email and analysis regarding strategy, negotiations and next steps. |
| Reiser CM | 05/31/13 | 1.4 | Call with A. Gehring, Kramer Levin and Jones Day regarding search terms for Peabody Rule 2004 document production (0.3); second review of documents pertinent to potential claims |

| | | | |
|---|----------|--------------|---|
| | | | investigation (1.1). |
| Russano MJ | 05/31/13 | 7.6 | Confer with M. Huebner, B. Kaminetzky and E. Moskowitz regarding overall investigation strategy (0.5); call with P. Wilson regarding discovery (0.6); confer with B. O'Neill and A. Dove regarding same (0.4); confer with A. Gehring and M. Tobak regarding same (0.5); review local rules regarding same (0.4); review documents from production (2.5); review research memo regarding potential claims investigation (1.4); review news articles regarding Peabody (0.5); review precedent fraudulent transfer case summary updates (0.8). |
| Total CLAIMS INVESTIGATION | | 377.9 | |
| CREDITOR\EQUITYHOLDER\UCC ISSUES | | | |
| Coco KJ | 05/01/13 | 2.8 | Calls to creditors regarding settlement agreement issues (0.4); update email to clients and AlixPartners regarding same (0.3); call with Cal First regarding lease and claims issues (0.4); email to clients regarding same (0.1); conduct analysis and drafting in connection with same (0.8); conduct analysis and drafting in connection with RoyaltyCo settlement (0.5); emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3). |
| Libby A | 05/01/13 | 0.8 | Review materials regarding coal counterparty settlement agreement (0.5); confer with R. Stewart and K. Coco regarding same (0.3). |
| McGreal MM | 05/01/13 | 0.1 | Teleconference with K. Coco regarding proposed claims settlement. |
| Stewart R | 05/01/13 | 3.3 | Draft RoyaltyCo claim settlement agreement with release from avoidance actions (1.7); draft notice of settlement (1.6). |
| Coco KJ | 05/02/13 | 1.2 | Emails with clients and local counsel regarding analysis of Penn Virginia claims (0.8); emails with clients and Davis Polk team regarding RoyaltyCo claims settlement (0.4). |
| Klein DS | 05/02/13 | 0.1 | Call with creditor regarding claim treatment. |
| Libby A | 05/02/13 | 0.8 | Review and comment on coal contract settlement agreement and related notice (0.6); confer with R. Stewart regarding same (0.2). |
| McGreal MM | 05/02/13 | 0.4 | Confer with K. Coco regarding claims objection (0.1); review and comment on RoyaltyCo claims settlement agreement notice (0.3). |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|--|
| Stewart R | 05/02/13 | 2.4 | Revise claim settlement agreement and notice per Davis Polk team's comments. |
| Coco KJ | 05/03/13 | 1.2 | Draft and circulate notice of tier 2 coal sale contract (0.5); emails with clients regarding same (0.3); emails with Bryan Cave and AlixPartners regarding tier 2 claims settlements (0.4). |
| Coco KJ | 05/04/13 | 0.3 | Emails with Davis Polk team regarding RoyaltyCo settlement documents. |
| Coco KJ | 05/06/13 | 3.7 | Draft and revise settlement agreement and notice of settlement for RoyaltyCo settlement (0.5); emails with clients and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8); call and emails with AlixPartners regarding avoidance action issues concerning same (0.6); analysis and research concerning same (1.2); call with S. Blank regarding creditor settlement inquiries (0.3); emails with J. Joseph regarding Greenleaf creditor settlement issues (0.3). |
| Huebner MS | 05/06/13 | 0.3 | Call with Blackstone regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee diligence requests (0.2); emails with bondholders and counsel regarding confidentiality (0.1). |
| Lynch C | 05/06/13 | 1.0 | Correspond with counsel for equityholders and internal correspondence with A. Starr and J. Adler regarding same. |
| Stewart R | 05/06/13 | 1.0 | Revise notice of RoyaltyCo claim settlement. |
| Coco KJ | 05/07/13 | 3.0 | Draft documentation regarding RoyaltyCo settlement (0.3); emails with clients and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); meet with M. McGreal regarding same (0.2); call with counsel to Greenleaf regarding claims and follow-up drafting (0.7); call with counsel to Phillips 66 regarding claims (0.3); emails with clients and drafting regarding same (0.8); call with AlixPartners regarding Greenleaf and other claims issues and follow-up email (0.4). |
| Libby A | 05/07/13 | 0.2 | Review and comment on coal contract settlement agreement and confer with K. Coco and R. Stewart regarding same. |
| Lynch C | 05/07/13 | 0.5 | Correspond with counsel for equity holders regarding deposition charges. |
| Resnick BM | 05/07/13 | 0.4 | Call with J. Lushefski, J. Bean and M. Buschmann regarding sharing of information (0.3); call with J. Bean regarding claims objection (0.1). |
| Starr AT | 05/07/13 | 0.7 | Calls and emails regarding equity committee |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | deposition with M. Carney and C. Lynch. |
| Stewart R | 05/07/13 | 0.3 | Revise notice of RoyaltyCo claim settlement. |
| Coco KJ | 05/08/13 | 1.6 | Draft and revise documentation for settlement of RoyaltyCo claim (0.4); calls and emails with client and counterparty regarding same (0.5); attend weekly claims call (0.5); call with D. Darcy and email regarding claims question (0.2). |
| Coco KJ | 05/08/13 | 2.2 | Call with clients and email regarding Phillips 66 claims (0.5); call with C. Smith regarding Shonk lease assumption and analysis of same (0.6); emails with clients and AlixPartners regarding contract rejections analysis (0.5); emails with Bryan Cave regarding binder for chambers (0.2); call with J. Jones, R. Mead and others clients regarding contract rejection process (0.4). |
| Huebner MS | 05/08/13 | 0.2 | Conversation with T. Mayer regarding multiple Unsecured Creditors' Committee issues. |
| Libby A | 05/08/13 | 0.4 | Telephonically attend weekly claims update call. |
| McGreal MM | 05/08/13 | 0.1 | Correspondence with E. Glazer regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee data room. |
| Chapman MP | 05/09/13 | 0.3 | Confer with K. Coco to discuss Phillips 66 claims research. |
| Coco KJ | 05/09/13 | 4.3 | Calls with R. McWilliams regarding claims issues (0.4); call with B. Walsh regarding claims objections (0.2); revise RoyaltyCo notice of dismissal and claims settlement documentation (0.6); emails with counterparty and Unsecured Creditors' Committee advisors regarding RoyaltyCo settlement (0.7); emails with AlixPartners regarding transferee settlement letters (0.3); comment on documentation regarding same (0.7); emails with clients and AlixPartners regarding coordination of claims meeting for Monday (0.1); call with J. Staggs regarding claims settlement issue (0.3); respond to calls and emails from creditors regarding settlement letters (0.4); coordinate with M. Chapman regarding Phillips 66 claims research (0.3); review personal injury claimant issue (0.3). |
| Libby A | 05/09/13 | 0.3 | Discuss stipulation of dismissal of adversary proceeding with R. Stewart and K. Coco (0.1); review and comment on same (0.2). |
| Resnick BM | 05/09/13 | 0.8 | Call with B. Walsh and K. Coco regarding claims objections (0.2); call with T. Mayer regarding various issues (0.3); review research regarding same (0.2); emails with K. Coco regarding claims |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | issues (0.1). |
| Stewart R | 05/09/13 | 1.6 | Draft stipulation of dismissal in RoyaltyCo adversary proceeding. |
| Chapman MP | 05/10/13 | 1.2 | Confer with K. Coco to discuss Phillips 66 claims research (0.1); research same (1.1). |
| Coco KJ | 05/10/13 | 2.1 | Emails with Siemens counsel regarding lease issues (0.3); review settlement agreement draft for transferee parties and comment on same (0.6); emails with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3); calls and email with counterparty regarding RoyaltyCo settlement documentation (0.4); call with Davis Polk team and emails with Unsecured Creditors' Committee and DIP lenders regarding same (0.5). |
| Huebner MS | 05/10/13 | 1.0 | Review of court's decision on trustee motion (0.2); call with senior management and emails regarding same (0.2); conference calls with Blackstone and senior management regarding new term sheet (0.6). |
| McGreal MM | 05/10/13 | 0.1 | Correspondence with K. Coco regarding claims settlement agreement. |
| Coco KJ | 05/13/13 | 2.3 | Research issues in connection with Phillips 66 claims (0.6); emails with M. Hulsey-Lupp regarding Alpha Engineering claims (0.4); review and comment on omnibus objections to claims (0.5); attend claims call with company and advisors (0.5); call with R. McWilliams regarding litigation claims and next steps (0.3). |
| McGreal MM | 05/13/13 | 0.8 | Teleconference with J. Bean, R. McWilliams, K. Coco and others regarding claims resolution process (0.6); correspondence with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding same (0.2). |
| Coco KJ | 05/14/13 | 1.1 | Meet with M. Chapman regarding Phillips 66 claims issues (0.2); conduct research and email clients regarding same (0.9). |
| Huebner MS | 05/14/13 | 2.1 | Review and markup of potential investor term sheet (1.4); meet with B. Resnick, M. Travers and M. McGreal regarding consolidating comments on term sheet (0.5); emails and conversation with B. O'Neill and Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel regarding next week's hearing (0.2). |
| Klein DS | 05/14/13 | 0.1 | Confer with K. Coco regarding Phillips 66 claims negotiations. |
| McGreal MM | 05/14/13 | 0.6 | Prepare chart of outstanding liabilities (0.4); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.1); review materials regarding same (0.1). |

| | | | |
|-------------|----------|-----|---|
| Resnick BM | 05/14/13 | 0.9 | Meet with T. Graulich, D. Schaible and M. McGreal regarding claims issues. |
| Schaible DS | 05/14/13 | 0.3 | Meeting regarding claims issues. |
| Coco KJ | 05/15/13 | 3.8 | Emails with local counsel regarding Alpha Engineering mechanic's lien claims (0.4); emails with M. Esposito regarding claims matters (0.5); call with J. Bean and others regarding strategy and next steps for litigation claims (2.0); emails with Unsecured Creditors' Committee, DIP Agents and counterparty regarding documentation for RoyaltyCo claim settlement (0.9). |
| Coco KJ | 05/15/13 | 0.7 | Edit RoyaltyCo documents per comments from DIP Agents. |
| Eum JS | 05/15/13 | 2.5 | Compile briefs and cases cited in objection for McGhee lift-stay motion binder per J. Adler. |
| Lange RL | 05/15/13 | 0.6 | Compile documents for McGhee lift-stay motion binder per J. Adler. |
| Libby A | 05/15/13 | 0.2 | Telephonically attend weekly claims update call with Garden City Group and AlixPartners. |
| Martin JD | 05/15/13 | 2.6 | Teleconference with J. Bean, B. Resnick and others regarding status of litigation claims (2.0); review summary of litigation claims in preparation for same (0.2); review emails with K. Coco, Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel and DIP counsel regarding RoyaltyCo claim (0.4). |
| McGreal MM | 05/15/13 | 2.2 | Teleconference with J. Bean, E. Waller, B. Resnick and others regarding litigation claims (1.7); teleconference with J. Bean, R. McWilliams, J. Jones and others regarding claims resolution process (0.5). |
| Resnick BM | 05/15/13 | 3.1 | Call with E. Waller regarding claims strategy (0.7); call with R. McWilliams regarding same (0.2); correspondence with E. Glazer regarding various creditors' confidentiality arrangements (0.2); call with clients and AlixPartners regarding claims strategy (2.0). |
| Chapman MP | 05/16/13 | 2.4 | Review proofs of claim of creditor per K. Coco (2.2); emails with K. Coco regarding same (0.2). |
| Coco KJ | 05/16/13 | 2.5 | Review fourth omnibus objection to claims documents (0.3); call with AlixPartners regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee's inquiries into litigation claims and follow-up (0.5); emails with clients and M. Esposito regarding claims (0.3); draft chart and analysis regarding litigation claims strategy (1.2); emails with local counsel and |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | clients regarding mechanic's lien claims (0.2). |
| Klein DS | 05/16/13 | 0.2 | Confer with B. Resnick and others regarding litigation claim objections. |
| McGreal MM | 05/16/13 | 0.6 | Correspond with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding prepetition litigation claims (0.3); correspond with Blackstone, L. Samet and others regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee data room requests (0.3). |
| Resnick BM | 05/16/13 | 0.6 | Correspondence with K. Coco and others regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee inquiries regarding claims. |
| Stewart R | 05/16/13 | 3.3 | Meet with K. Coco and A. Libby to receive assignment (0.3); review and summarize documents related to Monsanto indemnification agreements (2.1); review and summarize documents related to Hutchinson and Adkins lawsuits (0.9). |
| Coco KJ | 05/17/13 | 2.6 | Call with S. Gordon regarding Kenergy claims and issues (0.4); emails with clients and AlixPartners regarding tax claims (0.5); analysis and research meeting with M. Chapman regarding same (0.7); call and email to J. Lane regarding Alpha Engineering claims (0.3); call and email to S. August regarding Sierra Liquidity claims (0.3); emails with clients regarding Utilities claims (0.4). |
| Huebner MS | 05/17/13 | 0.4 | Conversation with T. Mayer (Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel) regarding multiple matters including negotiation progress with various counterparties. |
| Libby A | 05/17/13 | 0.1 | Correspondence with R. Stewart regarding flood litigation claims review. |
| McGreal MM | 05/17/13 | 0.1 | Correspondence with K. Coco regarding objections to claims. |
| Resnick BM | 05/17/13 | 0.7 | Correspond with K. Coco and others regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee inquiries regarding claims (0.5); correspond with K. Coco regarding priority tax claims (0.2). |
| Stewart R | 05/17/13 | 1.3 | Review and summarize documents related to Hutchinson and Adkins lawsuits. |
| Coco KJ | 05/19/13 | 0.9 | Emails with clients regarding litigation claims (0.3); emails with clients and analysis of utilities claims (0.6). |
| Coco KJ | 05/20/13 | 5.7 | Meet with B. Resnick regarding chart of certain litigation claims and analysis and preparation of same (1.6); call with K. Hartsog and others |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | regarding contracts and utilities claims and analysis of same (0.5); call with A. Mehes and coordinate review of utilities contracts claims (0.4); meet with M. Chapman regarding tax claims analysis and conduct analysis of same (0.5); emails with clients and counterparty regarding Phillips 66 claims (0.5); email to M. Esposito regarding vendor claims (0.1); calls and meeting with Davis Polk bankruptcy and tax teams regarding analysis of tax claims (0.9); review and revise claims analysis chart in preparation for call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.6); call from A. Hanson regarding claim settlement agreement and follow-up emails with AlixPartners regarding same (0.3); call with Sierra Liquidity regarding claims settlement agreement and follow-up email to clients and AlixPartners regarding same (0.3). |
| Huebner MS | 05/20/13 | 0.4 | Conversation with T. Mayer (Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel) regarding multiple issues in case and 5/21 hearing (0.3); emails to clients regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee views on possible settlement offer (0.1). |
| Klein DS | 05/20/13 | 0.1 | Call with K. Coco regarding utility deposits. |
| Libby A | 05/20/13 | 1.1 | Review Flood and Monsanto documents and comment on related diligence chart (0.9); confer with R. Stewart on same (0.2). |
| McGreal MM | 05/20/13 | 2.8 | Teleconference with E. Waller and K. Coco regarding pending litigation claims (0.6); review and comment on summary chart regarding same (0.4); correspondence with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding same (0.6); correspondence with B. Resnick, K. Coco, C. Phillips and others regarding priority claims (0.6); correspondence with Blackstone, J. Brenner and M. Immermann regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee data room (0.2); correspondence with K. Coco regarding claims objections (0.3); teleconference with counsel to lessor regarding objection to proof of claim (0.1). |
| Resnick BM | 05/20/13 | 0.7 | Review materials regarding claims in preparation for Unsecured Creditors' Committee call (0.4); meet with M. McGreal and K. Coco regarding same (0.3). |
| Stewart R | 05/20/13 | 1.5 | Revise summary of Monsanto litigation documents and Flood litigation documents per A |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | Libby's comments. |
| Coco KJ | 05/21/13 | 5.5 | Draft chart of litigation claims analysis (1.8); email with Alpha Engineering counsel regarding claims settlement (0.2); review of claims spreadsheet for Industrial Supply Solutions claims and emails with counterparty counsel regarding same (1.6); pre-call with company regarding litigation claims and internal discussion (0.5); call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding same and follow-up (0.7); call to counsel for creditor Heintzmann regarding claims settlement agreement and follow-up email (0.3); emails with clients and local counsel regarding mechanic's liens filed by Core Minerals (0.4). |
| Huebner MS | 05/21/13 | 1.1 | Conversations with J. Bean and E. Moskowitz regarding settlement issues with confidential counterparty (0.7); emails with client group regarding same (0.2); emails with clients regarding surety request and emails with surety counsel (0.2). |
| McGreal MM | 05/21/13 | 1.7 | Teleconference with J. Bean, E. Waller, B. Resnick and others regarding litigation proofs of claim (0.4); teleconference with Kramer Levin, Mesirov, J. Bean, B. Resnick and others regarding same (0.6); email B. Walsh regarding potential objections omnibus claims objections (0.1); correspondence with potential objectors (0.1); review materials on priority claims (0.2); correspondence with K. Coco regarding same (0.3). |
| Resnick BM | 05/21/13 | 1.5 | Call with J. Spindler regarding claims objection (0.2); prepare for litigation claims call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.5); pre-call with clients regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee litigation claims call (0.4); call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding litigation claims (0.4). |
| Coco KJ | 05/22/13 | 5.2 | Call with AlixPartners regarding upcoming claims objections (0.3); emails with Phillips 66 counsel regarding settlement agreement (0.3); emails with AlixPartners regarding claim withdrawal issues (0.4); call with S. Thompson regarding various creditor claims (0.2); emails with J. Chincheck regarding review of mechanic's lien issues (0.5); emails with Peerless (creditor) regarding claims settlement agreement (0.2); |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | weekly claims call with Garden City Group and AlixPartners (0.5); emails with AlixPartners regarding Heintzmann claims settlement agreement comments (0.2); review and analysis of spreadsheet of litigation claims and next steps (1.5); review status of various 503(b)(9) objections and send follow-up emails (0.6); call with K. Barber regarding alleged unpaid retainage fees and follow-up emails with same (0.5). |
| Klein DS | 05/22/13 | 0.1 | Email to K. Coco and others regarding reclamation claims. |
| Libby A | 05/22/13 | 1.2 | Weekly claims update call with AlixPartners and Garden City Group (0.3); draft email to bondholder regarding omnibus objection and confer with K. Coco regarding same (0.5); analysis of Wilmington Trust and US Bank proofs of claims in connection with bondholder inquiries and correspondence with Garden City Group regarding same (0.4). |
| McGreal MM | 05/22/13 | 0.8 | Review and comment on summary of research on priority claims (0.3); correspondence with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding same (0.2); correspondence with R. McWilliams regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee diligence request (0.1); correspondence with B. Walsh and potential objector to omnibus claims objections (0.1); correspondence with Blackstone. A. Gehring and E. Glazer regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee data room (0.1). |
| Resnick BM | 05/22/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with M. McGreal and K. Coco regarding claims resolutions. |
| Coco KJ | 05/23/13 | 7.1 | Emails with clients and analysis regarding potential crop damage claims (0.5); call with D. Klein regarding same (0.1); confer with M. McGreal regarding same (0.1); coordinate response to calls from bondholders regarding claim objection (0.8); review claim objection calendar and spreadsheet prepared by AlixPartners (0.4); research regarding utilities claims issues and communications with clients and A. Mehes regarding same (1.7); emails with S. Thompson regarding Peerless claims (0.2); emails with AlixPartners regarding Peerless claims settlement agreement (0.3); email to Caterpillar counsel regarding 503(b)(9) claims (0.2); emails with AlixPartners regarding follow- |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | up on 503(b)(9) objections and claims (0.5); call with B. Walsh regarding claims objections and responses to bondholder inquiries and follow-up (0.6); emails with W. Pettit regarding Industrial Supply Solutions claims settlement (0.3); review spreadsheet regarding same and discuss with AlixPartners (0.9); call with A. Wong regarding RoyaltyCo claim settlement (0.1); emails with Committee regarding follow-ups to discussion regarding litigation claims estimates (0.4). |
| Klein DS | 05/23/13 | 0.1 | Discussion with K. Coco regarding property damage claims. |
| McGreal MM | 05/23/13 | 1.8 | Review and comment on summary of legal research regarding priority claims (0.3); correspondence with M. Buschmann and K. Coco regarding same (0.2); teleconference with B. Walsh and K. Coco regarding potential objections to omnibus claims objections (0.3); confer with K. Coco regarding same (0.2); correspondence with potential objector to omnibus objection to claims (0.1); correspondence with Z. Mitschrich and E. Glazer regarding data room (0.2); teleconference with J. Jones and K. Coco regarding potential claims objections (0.2); correspondence with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding same (0.3). |
| Resnick BM | 05/23/13 | 0.3 | Correspondence with M. McGreal and K. Coco regarding claims objections (0.2); emails regarding tax priority claims (0.1). |
| Coco KJ | 05/24/13 | 5.4 | Call with G. Plotko and Carmody MacDonald regarding follow-up diligence in connection with certain material litigation claims (0.5); conduct diligence and communications with clients regarding same (1.8); review claims objections calendar and spreadsheet from AlixPartners and discuss same with Davis Polk team (0.5); call with M. Williams regarding potential crop damage claims and follow-up (0.4); call with counsel to Industrial Supply Solutions regarding claim settlement proposal and follow-up email to AlixPartners (0.3); emails with AlixPartners and Garden City Group regarding claim withdrawals (0.2); research and communications with A. Mehes regarding utilities claims research (0.7); draft and send research email to clients regarding same (1.0). |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|---|
| Coco KJ | 05/28/13 | 5.1 | Call with counsel to Wetland Reclamation regarding claim status and follow-up email to clients regarding same (0.6); review claims from Bulldog Excavating and related documents (0.7); discuss same with AlixPartners (0.3); draft and send letter to counsel for Bulldog regarding same (0.3); call with J. Jones, R. Mead and others regarding upcoming claims objections and prepare for same (1.8); emails with AlixPartners and counterparty regarding claims filed by Petroleum Products (0.3); emails with AlixPartners regarding guarantee claims (0.4); email with J. Chincheck regarding tax claim issue (0.1); email with counsel to creditor Heintzmann regarding claim settlement letters (0.2); review documents in preparation for call with company regarding utilities claims and settlement (0.4). |
| Huebner MS | 05/28/13 | 0.3 | Conversation with T. Mayer (Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel) regarding multiple issues. |
| McGreal MM | 05/28/13 | 2.1 | Teleconference with J. Jones, R. Mead, K. Coco and others regarding potential claims objections (1.4); correspondence with K. Coco regarding same (0.6); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same (0.1). |
| Coco KJ | 05/29/13 | 5.7 | Prepare for and attend call with clients regarding utilities claims negotiation strategy and next steps (1.5); attend weekly claims call with advisors (0.4); emails with AlixPartners regarding guarantee claims issues (0.3); emails with clients, Kramer Levin and Carmody MacDonald regarding material litigation claims (1.3); meet with M. Chapman and emails with clients regarding claims filed by Tampa Electric (0.5); call to Tampa Electric's counsel (0.2); meet with M. McGreal to review litigation claims schedule and follow-up tasks (1.5). |
| McGreal MM | 05/29/13 | 0.6 | Correspondence with E. Waller and counsel to settlement counterparty regarding payment of settlement claim (0.2); confer with K. Coco regarding potential claims objections (0.4). |
| Resnick BM | 05/29/13 | 0.1 | Call with J. Bean regarding claims. |
| Chapman MP | 05/30/13 | 3.8 | Research and analysis in connection with claims filed by Tampa Electric Company (2.1); summarize same (1.2); confer with K. Coco and call with M. Williams regarding same (0.5). |

| | | | |
|---|----------|--------------|--|
| Coco KJ | 05/30/13 | 4.5 | Review spreadsheet analyzing upcoming litigation-related claims objections (0.6); coordinate review of certain proofs of claim in connection with same (0.5); call to counsel to litigant Pettry (0.1); emails with clients and AlixPartners regarding objections to litigation claims (0.4); research and analysis in connection with claims filed by Tampa Electric Company (1.0); meet with M. Chapman and call with M. Williams regarding same (0.5); analysis of guarantee claims issues and email with AlixPartners regarding same (0.4); emails with clients and Bryan Cave regarding analysis of former employee claims (1.0). |
| Huebner MS | 05/30/13 | 0.6 | Conversation with T. Mayer (Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel) regarding multiple matters (0.2); conversations with E. Moskowitz, J. Bean and other clients regarding confidential settlement issues (0.4). |
| McGreal MM | 05/30/13 | 0.4 | Correspondence with J. Clarrey and R. Johnson regarding payments to vendors (0.2); confer with K. Coco regarding claims objections to litigation claims (0.2). |
| Resnick BM | 05/30/13 | 0.2 | Call with J. Bean regarding claims. |
| Coco KJ | 05/31/13 | 3.1 | Call with Pocahontas counsel regarding claims objections (0.1); follow-up emails with clients and Bryan Cave (0.4); discussion and emails with AlixPartners regarding filed guarantee claims (0.6); comments to settlement agreement with Deutsche Bank (0.4); email to clients regarding same (0.1); emails with Bryan Cave regarding Tier 1 and Tier 2 settlements (0.5); emails with clients and local counsel and research regarding employee claims (1.0). |
| McGreal MM | 05/31/13 | 0.3 | Correspondence with K. Coco regarding potential claims objections. |
| Resnick BM | 05/31/13 | 0.3 | Correspondence with J. Bean and K. Coco regarding R. Whiting claim. |
| Stewart R | 05/31/13 | 1.6 | Research meaning of compensation under 502(b)(7) in connection with Whiting claims (1.4); meet with K. Coco to receive assignment (0.2). |
| Total CREDITOR\EQUITYHOLDER\UCC ISSUES | | 153.3 | |
| | | | |

| DPW RETENTION | | | |
|----------------------------|----------|------------|--|
| Huebner MS | 05/06/13 | 0.3 | Emails and conversations with M. McGreal and L. Long regarding Davis Polk fee questions. |
| Libby A | 05/06/13 | 0.4 | Correspondence with M. McGreal and C. Robertson regarding redactions to fee applications. |
| Robertson C | 05/06/13 | 1.8 | Emails with M. McGreal regarding redaction of fee statements (0.4); emails with M. McGreal regarding U.S. Trustee meal and photocopying caps (0.5); emails with M. McGreal regarding voluntary and involuntary write-offs during the second compensation period (0.5); emails with M. McGreal regarding Patriot billing rates (0.4). |
| Huebner MS | 05/07/13 | 1.2 | Prepare for conference call with U.S. Trustee regarding Davis Polk fee questions including review of various materials and conversation with M. McGreal (0.7); conference call with U.S. Trustee and M. McGreal regarding U.S. Trustee questions (0.5). |
| Robertson C | 05/07/13 | 2.4 | Research and draft email to M. McGreal regarding voluntary and involuntary expense write-offs in response to U.S. Trustee inquiry (1.5); call with U.S. Trustee, M. Huebner and M. McGreal to discuss interim fee statement (0.9). |
| Huebner MS | 05/08/13 | 0.1 | Call with U.S. Trustee regarding Davis Polk fee issues. |
| Robertson C | 05/09/13 | 0.5 | Review March bill with A. VanWagner in connection with question from J. Jones regarding invoice amounts. |
| Krause SC | 05/13/13 | 0.4 | Emails with B. Resnick and A. VanWagner regarding conflicts. |
| Robertson C | 05/13/13 | 0.1 | Email to M. Chapman regarding fee guidelines. |
| Stewart R | 05/13/13 | 0.7 | Respond to conflicts inquiry regarding State of Illinois and Illinois Attorney General's office. |
| VanWagner AB | 05/13/13 | 0.3 | Discuss counterparty conflicts issue with R. Stewart. |
| Robertson C | 05/16/13 | 0.4 | Conduct research regarding redaction of monthly fee statements. |
| Robertson C | 05/17/13 | 0.2 | Emails with B. Resnick and M. Geraghty in accounting regarding payment of Davis Polk fees. |
| Robertson C | 05/21/13 | 0.3 | Prepare backup for certain expenses for chambers with M. Chapman. |
| Total DPW RETENTION | | 9.1 | |
| | | | |

| EMPLOYEE LABOR ISSUES | | | |
|------------------------------|----------|------|---|
| Agostinho JN | 05/01/13 | 0.4 | Emails regarding letters to non-union retirees. |
| Aizen RM | 05/01/13 | 2.1 | Comment on supplemental 401(k) resolutions, amendment and services agreement letter (2.0); confer with M. McGreal regarding shares (0.1). |
| Cho EK | 05/01/13 | 0.5 | Review and comment on resolutions and amendments to supplemental 401(k) plans. |
| Estacio R | 05/01/13 | 15.4 | Confer with B. Kaminetzky and others regarding closing arguments (0.8); prepare hearing testimony regarding B. Hatfield (1.5); attend §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (7.7); confer with J. Eum regarding supplemental deposition designations (0.3); draft cross-examination questions for A. Traynor regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (0.8); draft closing argument (4.3). |
| Eum JS | 05/01/13 | 13.0 | Compile documents for Mandarino cross-examination preparation per E. Glazer (2.0); compile documents for Akunuri cross-examination in preparation for hearing per A. Gehring (2.5); compile deposition excerpts for Cobin cross-examination demonstrative per A. Vora (3.0); compile question list for Traynor cross-examination per R. Estacio (0.4); prepare chart of debtors' designations and United Mine Workers of America's counter-designations of Stover's deposition transcript per R. Estacio (1.5); assemble Buckner cross-examination demonstrative per D. Loss (0.5); compile responses to PwC's April 24 Status Report in preparation of meeting per L. Samet (0.3); assemble copies of final DIP order in preparation for hearing per E. Glazer (0.3); assemble joint exhibits for Cobin cross-examination per A. Vora (2.5). |
| Gehring AS | 05/01/13 | 15.9 | Prepare for S. Akunuri testimony (5.3); attend §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (5.8); prepare for P. Mandarino testimony (4.0); meet with B. Kaminetzky, E. Moskowitz, L. Samet, R. Estacio and E. Glazer regarding closing (0.8). |
| Glazer E | 05/01/13 | 18.8 | Dial into §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (4.2); prepare for cross-examination of P. Mandarino (10.2); meet with E. Moskowitz and A. Gehring regarding same (2.2); meet with E. Moskowitz and M. Buschmann regarding same (1.1); attend to §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing logistics (1.1). |

| | | | |
|---------------|----------|------|---|
| Hakimzadeh S | 05/01/13 | 12.6 | Attend §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (8.6); second seat A. Traynor cross examination (1.4); assist with closing argument demonstratives and P. Mandarino cross question (2.6). |
| Harrington M | 05/01/13 | 15.7 | Maintain and support IT equipment use for Davis Polk team (2.1); attend to trial team logistics (10.0); phone calls and emails with Bryan Cave and Davis Polk regarding use of trial preparation demonstratives for §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (3.6). |
| Huebner MS | 05/01/13 | 5.6 | Partial attendance at §1113 hearing and work with Davis Polk team and witnesses regarding preparation for today's witnesses and argument (4.7); calls with B. Kaminetzky, E. Moskowitz and J. Bean regarding last 2 trial days (0.7); confer with Unsecured Creditors' Committee advisors regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee position on §1113 (0.2). |
| Kaminetzky BS | 05/01/13 | 16.4 | Prepare for trial (7.6); attend trial (8.8). |
| Loss DM | 05/01/13 | 15.4 | Draft counterpoints to anticipated union arguments regarding motion to strike Buckner testimony (4.7); attend trial (3.6); revise and finalize demonstrative for Buckner cross-examination (2.5); confer with B. Kaminetzky regarding Buckner cross-examination, including mock-cross examination (1.6); revise Buckner cross-examination outline (1.9); prepare deposition transcripts and supporting materials for Buckner cross-examination (1.1). |
| Martin JD | 05/01/13 | 14.1 | Attend §§ 1113 and 1114 trial (9.8); prepare for same (4.3). |
| McGreal MM | 05/01/13 | 0.6 | Correspond with J. Cohen, J. Agostinho and Garden City Group regarding retiree letters (0.2); attend telephonically §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (0.4). |
| Moskowitz E | 05/01/13 | 16.6 | Prepare for §§ 1113 and 1114 trial (3.5); participate in §§ 1113 and 1114 trial (7.7); follow-up discussions and preparation for Mandarino examination (5.4). |
| Peng L | 05/01/13 | 6.9 | Prepare powerpoint deck for M. Buckner motion to strike (1.1); dial in to M. Buckner motion to strike and §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (1.0); research in support of M. Buckner motion to strike (0.5); prepare powerpoint deck for M. Buckner cross-examination (4.3). |
| Reiser CM | 05/01/13 | 0.2 | Review transcript of declaratory judgment |

| | | | |
|--------------|----------|------|---|
| | | | complaint motions hearing. |
| Resnick BM | 05/01/13 | 0.8 | Research multi-employer pension plan issues for §§ 1113 and 1114 team. |
| Russano MJ | 05/01/13 | 15.8 | Prepare for cross-examination of S. Akunuri (6.6); confer with A. Gehring regarding same (1.3); confer with S. Schwartz regarding same (0.4); review S. Schwartz direct testimony and declaration (1.1); prepare for S. Akunuri motion to strike testimony (1.9); legal research regarding hearsay rules (0.4); confer with M. Tobak and D. Darcy regarding motion to strike (0.4); attend court hearing (3.7). |
| Samet L | 05/01/13 | 16.7 | Attend §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing and meetings during breaks (8.8); prepare for B. Hatfield testimony (0.9); draft closing statement (3.2); prepare summary of trial (0.4); prepare for 1113 and 1114 hearing (1.2); analysis regarding information sharing (2.2). |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/01/13 | 7.8 | Attend §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing telephonically (4.2); prepare demonstratives for §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (3.6). |
| Tobak MJ | 05/01/13 | 3.0 | Review Akunuri, Mandarino and Buckner declarations in connection with argument to exclude expert testimony (2.1); correspond with M. Russano regarding caselaw in connection with same (0.9). |
| Vora A | 05/01/13 | 18.6 | Draft cross-examination outline of E. Cobin (12.5); perform corresponding research and analysis (2.6); analyze research and correspondence from Mercer and Blackstone (1.4); create slide-deck for use in litigation (2.1). |
| Agostinho JN | 05/02/13 | 0.2 | Discuss retiree life insurance valuation with M. Luna. |
| Aizen RM | 05/02/13 | 0.5 | Confer with E. FitzGerald, M. McGreal and M. Luna regarding multi-employer pension plan and supplemental 401(k). |
| Cho EK | 05/02/13 | 0.4 | Review revised resolutions and amendments. |
| Coco KJ | 05/02/13 | 0.2 | Respond to call from retiree and emails with Davis Polk team regarding same. |
| Estacio R | 05/02/13 | 19.4 | Draft closing argument for B. Kamintzky regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 motion (11.4); revise same (6.9); confer with B. Kamintzky and E. Moskowitz regarding same (1.1). |
| Eum JS | 05/02/13 | 12.5 | Assemble Cobin Demonstrative, cross-examination outline, joint exhibits and additional documents for Cobin cross-examination per A. |

| | | | |
|---------------|----------|------|---|
| | | | Vora (3.0); update Cobin cross-examination demonstrative with additional deposition excerpts per A. Vora (3.5); confer with Davis Polk team regarding closing statements (1.5); attend court hearing (4.0); compile copies of Mazzotti email per L. Samet (0.5). |
| FitzGerald ET | 05/02/13 | 0.3 | Discussions with Ron Aizen regarding United Mine Workers of America pension plan claim. |
| Gehring AS | 05/02/13 | 20.1 | Prepare for P. Mandarino testimony (8.6); attend §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (7.2); prepare for §§ 1113 and 1114 closing (4.3). |
| Glazer E | 05/02/13 | 20.2 | Attend §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (7.2); prepare for cross-examination of P. Mandarino (10.2); meet with E. Moskowitz, M. Buschmann and A. Gehring regarding same (0.8); meet with Davis Polk team regarding closing arguments (0.9); draft section of closing argument (1.1). |
| Harrington M | 05/02/13 | 14.3 | Maintain and support IT equipment use for Davis Polk team (2.1); attend to trial team logistics (11.8); phone calls and emails with Bryan Cave and Davis Polk regarding use of trial preparation demonstratives for §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (0.4). |
| Huebner MS | 05/02/13 | 5.3 | Review of draft of Blackstone recoveries matrix (0.3); confer with M. Buschmann and Blackstone team regarding same (0.2); confer with J. Bean regarding today's trial and next steps (0.6); extensive negotiations with Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding settlement of §§ 1113 and 1114 objection (1.2); confer with clients and Blackstone regarding terms of proposed Unsecured Creditors' Committee settlement (0.3); exchange of settlement document with T. Mayer and conversations to finalize same (0.7); confer with B. Kaminetzky and E. Moskowitz regarding today's witnesses and multiple topics relating to §§ 1113 and 1114 trial closing arguments (0.9); partial attendance at 1113 and 1114 trial by telephone (1.1). |
| Kaminetzky BS | 05/02/13 | 17.5 | Prepare for trial (8.5); attend trial (9.0). |
| Loss DM | 05/02/13 | 5.5 | Confer with B. Kaminetzky regarding Buckner cross-examination preparation (0.9); attend trial, including assistance with Buckner cross-examination (4.6). |
| Martin JD | 05/02/13 | 15.2 | Attend §§ 1113 and 1114 trial (8.9); prepare for same (6.3). |

| | | | |
|-------------|----------|------|--|
| McGreal MM | 05/02/13 | 0.9 | Review and comment on supplemental 401(k) board resolutions and related documents (0.2); teleconference with R. Aizen regarding same (0.1); teleconference with M. Luna regarding same (0.1); correspond with J. Cohen and M. Luna regarding retiree letters (0.1); correspond with M. Tobak and K. Coco regarding same (0.1); telephonically attend §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (0.3). |
| Moskowitz E | 05/02/13 | 19.0 | Prepare for Mandarino examination (2.1); participate in §§ 1113 and 1114 trial (9.3); follow-up discussions after trial with Davis Polk team (1.7); prepare for closing arguments and related materials (5.9). |
| Peng L | 05/02/13 | 5.0 | Conduct research for P. Mandarino cross-examination outline (1.2); conduct research in support of M. Buckner cross-examination (0.3); dial-in to M. Buckner's cross examination (2.5). |
| Resnick BM | 05/02/13 | 0.9 | Calls with Blackstone and M. Huebner regarding potential §§ 1113 and 1114 settlement (0.6); emails regarding same (0.3). |
| Russano MJ | 05/02/13 | 1.8 | Confer with D. Loss regarding hearing update (0.3); confer with M. Tobak regarding motion to strike testimony (0.3); review hearing transcript (1.2). |
| Samet L | 05/02/13 | 21.4 | Draft and edit closing argument (7.9); review case law, exhibits and testimony for same (4.4); prepare and edit demonstratives for closing argument (2.1); research for same (3.2); meet with B. Kaminetzky, E. Moskowitz and others regarding same (0.9); attend §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (2.1); revise status report (0.8). |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/02/13 | 10.0 | Attend §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (6.0); meet with Davis Polk team to discuss closing arguments for same (1.0); prepare closing arguments and demonstratives (4.0). |
| Tobak MJ | 05/02/13 | 0.5 | Correspondence with M. Russano and D. Darcy regarding expert exclusion argument (0.3); correspondence regarding retiree inquiry (0.2). |
| Vora A | 05/02/13 | 22.2 | Create and update slide deck for cross-examination of E. Cobin (6.4); prepare for, set up and assist with cross-examination of E. Cobin (3.5); draft section of closing related to E. Cobin (4.4); draft sections of closing related to Voluntary Employee Beneficiary Association, retiree healthcare and Affordable Care Act (5.3); |

| | | | |
|---------------|----------|------|---|
| | | | confer with Davis Polk team members on strategy for closing (1.8); perform research tasks related to closing (0.8). |
| Agostinho JN | 05/03/13 | 0.8 | Review life insurance premium valuation (0.3); emails regarding same (0.5). |
| Aizen RM | 05/03/13 | 1.1 | Revise supplemental 401(k) documents (0.9); review life insurance spreadsheet (0.2). |
| Cavaiuolo JA | 05/03/13 | 1.0 | Meet with M. Harrington regarding trial office breakdown. |
| Cho EK | 05/03/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with R. Aizen regarding termination of 401(k) plan. |
| Estacio R | 05/03/13 | 6.6 | Attend §§ 1113 and 1114 trial and conferences regarding the same (5.8); emails regarding the same (0.2); trial logistics (0.6). |
| Eum JS | 05/03/13 | 5.0 | Attend §§ 1113 and 1114 closing. |
| Gehring AS | 05/03/13 | 12.7 | Draft and edit closing argument (5.1); communicate with Davis Polk team regarding same (1.3); attend §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (5.8); post-trial logistics (0.5). |
| Glazer E | 05/03/13 | 10.9 | Attend §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (5.3); draft section of closing argument (4.9); attend to post trial logistics (0.5); review news articles related to 1113 and 1114 hearing (0.2). |
| Hakimzadeh S | 05/03/13 | 2.7 | Telephonically attend closing arguments in §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing. |
| Harrington M | 05/03/13 | 10.6 | Maintain and support IT equipment use for Davis Polk team (2.1); attend to trial team logistics (8.1); phone calls and emails with Bryan Cave and Davis Polk regarding use of trial preparation demonstratives for §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (0.4). |
| Huebner MS | 05/03/13 | 3.3 | Partial telephonic attendance at conclusion of §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (1.9); exchanges with in-court team regarding ideas for closing and rebuttal (0.5); brief post-trial conversations with J. Bean, E. Moskowitz and B. Kaminetzky regarding final day of trial and next steps with labor (0.9). |
| Kaminetzky BS | 05/03/13 | 11.2 | Prepare for trial (6.4); attend trial (4.0); post-trial meetings with Davis Polk team (0.6); emails regarding trial and press reports (0.2). |
| Loss DM | 05/03/13 | 3.7 | Listen to trial closing arguments via court teleconference. |
| Martin JD | 05/03/13 | 5.2 | Attend §§ 1113 and 1114 trial. |
| McGreal MM | 05/03/13 | 0.4 | Attend telephonically the §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing. |

| | | | |
|--------------|----------|------|--|
| Moskowitz E | 05/03/13 | 7.1 | Prepare for §§ 1113 and 1114 trial (1.5); participate in §§ 1113 and 1114 trial (5.6). |
| Reiser CM | 05/03/13 | 0.3 | Research burden of proof for §§ 1113 and 1114 proceeding (0.2); emails with A. Gehring regarding same (0.1). |
| Resnick BM | 05/03/13 | 0.6 | Research §1113 issue for E. Moskowitz and L. Samet (0.3); review summary of life insurance benefits (0.1); correspondence with J. Agostinho regarding same (0.1); emails with J. Jones regarding §363 benefits order (0.1). |
| Samet L | 05/03/13 | 5.5 | Attend §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (4.8); attend to post-trial logistics (0.4); emails regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (0.3). |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/03/13 | 11.5 | Prepare closing arguments and demonstratives (6.3); attend §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing (5.2). |
| Vora A | 05/03/13 | 13.7 | Draft sections of closing related to Voluntary Employee Beneficiary Association, retiree healthcare and Affordable Care Act (3.7); confer with Davis Polk team members on strategy for closing (0.8); perform research tasks in preparation for closing (1.9); attend closing argument (4.8); manage case files, materials and correspondence (2.5). |
| Agostinho JN | 05/04/13 | 0.2 | Emails with M. Luna regarding life insurance cash cost. |
| Aizen RM | 05/04/13 | 0.1 | Emails from M. Luna and B. Resnick regarding retiree life insurance. |
| Cavaiuolo JA | 05/04/13 | 8.5 | Breakdown, pack and prepare shipment of trial office equipment, supplies and materials. |
| Eum JS | 05/04/13 | 2.5 | Assemble and review joint exhibits binders and additional hearing materials for preservation and delivery to New York office. |
| Harrington M | 05/04/13 | 8.7 | Breakdown and pack trial office equipment, supplies and materials (8.0); phone calls and emails with Bryan Cave and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.7). |
| Huebner MS | 05/04/13 | 0.5 | Emails with B. Hatfield, J. Bean and E. Moskowitz regarding next steps with United Mine Workers of America. |
| Agostinho JN | 05/05/13 | 0.2 | Emails regarding life insurance cash cost valuation. |
| Cavaiuolo JA | 05/05/13 | 5.0 | Breakdown, pack and prepare shipment of trial office equipment, supplies and materials. |
| Harrington M | 05/05/13 | 9.5 | Breakdown, pack and prepare shipment of trial office equipment, supplies and materials (8.8); phone calls and emails with Bryan Cave and |

| | | | |
|---------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | Davis Polk regarding same (0.7). |
| Huebner MS | 05/05/13 | 0.3 | Emails with T. Mayer, F. Huffard and J. Bean regarding trial testimony and United Mine Workers of America proposals and next steps. |
| Agostinho JN | 05/06/13 | 0.7 | Arrange call with Mercer and Patriot (0.2); call with J. Cohen regarding premium payment projections (0.2); discuss same with R. Aizen (0.3). |
| Aizen RM | 05/06/13 | 0.7 | Confer with M. Luna, B. Resnick and J. Agostinho regarding retiree life insurance. |
| Cho EK | 05/06/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with R. Aizen regarding termination of supplemental 401(k) plan. |
| Coco KJ | 05/06/13 | 0.2 | Call and emails with Davis Polk team regarding retiree inquiries. |
| Estacio R | 05/06/13 | 1.4 | Review Patriot 10-Q regarding litigations (0.2); research regarding withdrawal liability (0.3); correspond with E. Moskowitz regarding the same (0.2); compile deposition designations for the Court (0.4); correspond with L. Samet regarding the same (0.1); confer with L. Samet regarding case status (0.1); correspond with L. Glazer regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 deposition invoices (0.1). |
| Eum JS | 05/06/13 | 2.0 | Review Cobin deposition and case materials in accordance with preservation order per A. Vora. |
| Glazer E | 05/06/13 | 0.4 | Emails with J. Agostinho regarding various labor issues (0.2); review invoices from TSG for court reporting services (0.2). |
| Harrington M | 05/06/13 | 2.7 | Meet with and emails with Bryan Cave regarding final disposition of Davis Polk materials, return of their equipment and unused supplies. |
| Huebner MS | 05/06/13 | 1.5 | Conference call with B. Hatfield, F. Huffard, J. Bean, E. Moskowitz regarding §1113 and next steps on negotiations with United Mine Workers of America (1.2); emails with M. McGreal, T. Mayer and F. Huffard regarding Blackstone testimony at 1113 hearing (0.3). |
| Huebner MS | 05/06/13 | 0.4 | Confer with J. Bean and E. Moskowitz regarding Peabody and other related litigation issues. |
| Kaminetzky BS | 05/06/13 | 2.0 | Call with management team regarding strategy and next steps (0.5); emails with Davis Polk team regarding strategy, next steps and decision (0.4); review and analyze trial transcripts (1.1). |
| Moskowitz E | 05/06/13 | 2.1 | Call with client team regarding strategy and next steps (1.0); discuss same with L. Samet and Davis Polk team (1.1). |

| | | | |
|---------------|----------|-----|--|
| Resnick BM | 05/06/13 | 0.1 | Correspondence with R. Aizen regarding life insurance benefit calculations. |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/06/13 | 0.2 | Emails regarding demonstratives for closing arguments in §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing. |
| Agostinho JN | 05/07/13 | 1.4 | Call with Mercer, Patriot and R. Aizen regarding payment projections (0.6); follow up correspondence regarding same (0.3); call with J. Cohen regarding same (0.5). |
| Aizen RM | 05/07/13 | 1.8 | Discussions with Patriot, J. Cohen and Mercer regarding retiree life (1.2); comment on supplemental 401(k) letter (0.6). |
| Cho EK | 05/07/13 | 0.1 | Correspondence with R. Aizen regarding termination of supplemental 401(k) plan. |
| Eum JS | 05/07/13 | 2.5 | Compile hard copy and electronic versions of depositions in preparation for trial for archives. |
| Glazer E | 05/07/13 | 0.2 | Draft email to M. McGreal regarding 1113 and 1114 issues. |
| Kaminetzky BS | 05/07/13 | 0.6 | Email with Davis Polk team regarding Peabody and strategy (0.3); call and meeting with M. Huebner regarding update (0.3). |
| McGreal MM | 05/07/13 | 0.1 | Review and comment on letter to employees regarding supplemental 401(k) plan. |
| Moskowitz E | 05/07/13 | 3.0 | Call with counsel to Peabody and report same to clients and Davis Polk team (0.8); emails with Davis Polk team regarding post-trial issues and additional research and negotiations (2.2). |
| Resnick BM | 05/07/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with R. Aizen and J. Agostinho regarding salaried retiree benefits. |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/07/13 | 0.1 | Emails regarding demonstratives for closing arguments in §§ 1113 and 1114 trial. |
| Aizen RM | 05/08/13 | 0.5 | Confer with M. Luna regarding retiree life and supplemental 401(k) (0.2); comment on supplemental 401(k) letter (0.3). |
| Estacio R | 05/08/13 | 0.1 | Review Patriot analysis regarding 1113 and 1114 negotiation issues. |
| Gehring AS | 05/08/13 | 0.2 | Review §§ 1113 and 1114 savings summary. |
| Glazer E | 05/08/13 | 0.3 | Correspondence with M. McGreal and J. Mazzotti at AlixPartners regarding access to Unsecured Creditors' Committee data room (0.2); manage Unsecured Creditors' Committee data room access (0.1). |
| Huebner MS | 05/08/13 | 1.2 | Conference call with B. Hatfield and co-advisors regarding United Mine Workers of America negotiations (1.0); confer with Peabody counsel regarding labor litigation (0.2). |
| Kaminetzky BS | 05/08/13 | 2.2 | Review press reports (0.1); emails regarding |

| | | | |
|---------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | developments, Peabody and update (0.3); review and analyze transcript (1.8). |
| McGreal MM | 05/08/13 | 0.1 | Review revised letter to employees regarding supplemental 401(k). |
| Moskowitz E | 05/08/13 | 2.6 | Call with counsel to Peabody (0.4); call with clients regarding negotiations update and strategic issues (0.8); correspondence with client regarding proposals (0.7); emails to Davis Polk team regarding trial follow-up issues (0.7). |
| Samet L | 05/08/13 | 0.9 | Communications with Davis Polk team regarding research on procedural and appellate issues (0.4); review correspondence and analysis regarding labor issues (0.4); review media coverage (0.1). |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/08/13 | 3.9 | Research appellate issues relating to 1113 and 1114. |
| Agostinho JN | 05/09/13 | 0.4 | Review life insurance benefit cost projections from Mercer (0.3); emails regarding same (0.1). |
| Aizen RM | 05/09/13 | 0.7 | Emails with J. Wright, M. Luna, B. Resnick, J. Agostinho and E. Moskowitz regarding supplemental 401(k), retiree life, Voluntary Employee Beneficiary Association and active health benefits. |
| Cho EK | 05/09/13 | 0.1 | Teleconference with E. FitzGerald regarding Voluntary Employee Beneficiary Association issue. |
| FitzGerald ET | 05/09/13 | 0.8 | Analysis of requirements for establishment of Voluntary Employee Beneficiary Association. |
| Huebner MS | 05/09/13 | 1.1 | Calls with E. Moskowitz and J. Bean regarding pension issues and possible Voluntary Employee Beneficiary Association approach (0.2); conversation with B. Hatfield regarding same (0.3); work with E. Moskowitz on bullet points for same and call with United Mine Workers of America (0.2); call with F. Huffard regarding possible way forward on United Mine Workers of America issues (0.4). |
| Kaminetzky BS | 05/09/13 | 0.6 | Review discussion documents (0.2); emails regarding update, discussions and analysis (0.4). |
| McGreal MM | 05/09/13 | 0.4 | Review and comment on employee website frequently asked questions (0.2); teleconference with B. Resnick and R. Aizen regarding retiree benefit issues (0.1); email J. Woodrum regarding same (0.1). |
| Moskowitz E | 05/09/13 | 2.2 | Strategy calls with B. Hatfield (0.5); draft bullet points for B. Hatfield and negotiations and correspondence regarding same (0.9); emails with |

| | | | |
|---------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | Davis Polk team regarding continued research and related post-trial issues (0.8). |
| Peng L | 05/09/13 | 0.5 | Meet with L. Samet regarding strategy and next steps in §§ 1113 and 1114 motion. |
| Resnick BM | 05/09/13 | 0.6 | Calls with R. Aizen and E. FitzGerald regarding Voluntary Employee Beneficiary Association (0.5); emails regarding Peabody litigation (0.1). |
| Samet L | 05/09/13 | 0.9 | Edit memorandum regarding appellate and procedural issues (0.5); communications with E. Sokoloff regarding same (0.2); correspondence with E. Moskowitz, A. Gehring and others regarding labor issues (0.2). |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/09/13 | 2.8 | Research appellate issues relating to 1113 and 1114. |
| Vora A | 05/09/13 | 7.2 | Research and analyze Affordable Care Act rules and regulations to formulate advice for client. |
| Wright JT | 05/09/13 | 1.1 | Research regarding Voluntary Employee Beneficiary Association and quality employer securities issues under ERISA (0.9); confer with R. Aizen regarding same (0.2). |
| Agostinho JN | 05/10/13 | 0.9 | Provide documents regarding pre-March 1990 group for DIP lenders (0.5); review bondholder financing proposal (0.4). |
| Aizen RM | 05/10/13 | 0.2 | Email from A. Vora regarding health benefits (0.1); emails from J. Bean and M. Luna regarding supplemental 401(k) (0.1). |
| FitzGerald ET | 05/10/13 | 1.3 | Analyze Voluntary Employee Beneficiary Association implementation issues (0.5); analyze contribution of employer note to Voluntary Employee Beneficiary Association (0.8). |
| Gehring AS | 05/10/13 | 0.2 | Emails with L. Samet regarding DIP lender requests. |
| Hakimzadeh S | 05/10/13 | 0.3 | Review memo on rights of appeal and successive filings under §§ 1113 and 1114. |
| Huebner MS | 05/10/13 | 0.7 | Emails with clients, E. Moskowitz and benefits lawyers regarding United Mine Workers of America issue and structuring possibilities. |
| Kaminetzky BS | 05/10/13 | 0.1 | Email regarding update on United Mine Workers of America issue. |
| McGreal MM | 05/10/13 | 0.3 | Teleconference with M. Luna regarding supplemental 401(k) claims (0.2); correspondence with L. Samet regarding union issues (0.1). |
| Moskowitz E | 05/10/13 | 3.9 | Participate in client update call (1.1); call with Blackstone and clients regarding bondholder and follow-up (0.9); correspondence with clients and Davis Polk team regarding Peabody-Assumed |

| | | | |
|--------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | Group issues and proposals (1.3); correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding related retiree healthcare issues (0.3); assign additional legal research to L. Samet and Davis Polk team (0.3). |
| Reiser CM | 05/10/13 | 0.2 | Review memorandum regarding appeals of 1113 and 1114 decisions. |
| Samet L | 05/10/13 | 2.5 | Edit research memorandum regarding procedural issues (0.3); telephone conference with A. Saavedra regarding labor issues (0.4); research regarding labor issues (1.1); communications with D. Lucha, E. Moskowitz and others regarding same (0.5); review media coverage (0.2). |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/10/13 | 3.1 | Research appellate issues relating to 1113 and 1114. |
| Vora A | 05/10/13 | 2.8 | Research and analyze Affordable Care Act rules and regulations to formulate advice for client. |
| Aizen RM | 05/11/13 | 0.2 | Review exit financing proposal. |
| Agostinho JN | 05/12/13 | 0.2 | Respond to request from non-union retiree committee counsel. |
| Aizen RM | 05/12/13 | 0.2 | Email from J. Cohen regarding retiree medical data request (0.1); email to J. Woodrum regarding union medical benefits (0.1). |
| Agostinho JN | 05/13/13 | 2.6 | Revise COBRA notice for retiree benefit plan participants to reflect updates to COBRA model notice (2.3); correspondence regarding additional information for non-union retiree committee's counsel (0.3). |
| Aizen RM | 05/13/13 | 2.2 | Review Voluntary Employee Beneficiary Association materials and exit financing proposal (1.5); review revised COBRA election notice (0.4); emails and discussions with E. Moskowitz and J. Woodrum regarding Affordable Care Act (0.3). |
| Cho EK | 05/13/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence regarding Voluntary Employee Beneficiary Association issues. |
| Gehring AS | 05/13/13 | 0.2 | Emails with L. Samet regarding DIP lender requests. |
| Glazer E | 05/13/13 | 0.5 | Correspondence with L. Samet regarding various §§ 1113 and 1114 issues (0.2); correspondence with A. Rosen at PwC regarding access to United Mine Workers of America data room (0.2); confer with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.1). |
| Huebner MS | 05/13/13 | 1.2 | Conversations with J. Bean and E. Moskowitz regarding §1113 issues and further negotiations (0.9); conversation with G. Crandall regarding possible United Mine Workers of America |

| | | | |
|---------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | liquidity source (0.2); emails to clients regarding same and data room access (0.1). |
| Kaminetzky BS | 05/13/13 | 0.5 | Email regarding bondholder (0.1); review negotiation summary document (0.2); review term sheet (0.1); review decision regarding trustee (0.1). |
| McGreal MM | 05/13/13 | 0.2 | Review materials related to benefits programs. |
| Moskowitz E | 05/13/13 | 3.3 | Correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding potential investor issues (0.7); call with H. Sheppard regarding R. Whiting issues (0.3); review legal research and correspondence with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with Benefits team regarding Affordable Care Act issues and analysis (1.0); emails with Davis Polk team regarding post-trial issues (0.7); correspondence with clients regarding procedural issues (0.3). |
| Samet L | 05/13/13 | 1.9 | Review research regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 procedural issues (0.9); communications with A. Saavedra, E. Glazer, A. Gehring and others regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 trial (0.7); review media coverage (0.1); telephone conferences with E. Glazer regarding labor issues (0.2). |
| Vora A | 05/13/13 | 0.6 | Research and analyze Affordable Care Act rules and regulations to formulate advice for client. |
| Agostinho JN | 05/14/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence regarding pension obligations. |
| Aizen RM | 05/14/13 | 0.8 | Discussions with M. Luna, K. Burlage and M. McGreal regarding long term incentive plan (0.6); email to E. FitzGerald regarding Voluntary Employee Beneficiary Association (0.1); emails from J. Woodrum regarding multi-employer pension plan and medical benefits (0.1). |
| Cho EK | 05/14/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence regarding multi-employer pension plan issues. |
| Estacio R | 05/14/13 | 0.8 | Email from E. Moskowitz regarding status of §§ 1113 and 1114 negotiations (0.1); emails from E. Moskowitz and J. Woodrum regarding pension liability risks (0.5); draft analysis regarding the same (0.2). |
| Gehring AS | 05/14/13 | 0.4 | Review documents responsive to PwC data requests for confidentiality (0.3); communications with J. Mazzotti at AlixPartners regarding same (0.1). |
| Glazer E | 05/14/13 | 0.4 | Review news coverage (0.1); correspondence with E. Moskowitz and A. Rosen at PwC regarding access to United Mine Workers of |

| | | | |
|---------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | America data room (0.1); manage United Mine Workers of America data room access (0.2). |
| Huebner MS | 05/14/13 | 0.8 | Calls with clients and E. Moskowitz regarding next steps with union regarding potential investor term sheet. |
| Kaminetzky BS | 05/14/13 | 0.8 | Review memo and materials regarding legal issues. |
| McGreal MM | 05/14/13 | 1.0 | Teleconference with M. Luna and R. Aizen regarding benefits programs (0.4); correspondence with R. Aizen regarding same (0.1); confer with B. Resnick regarding same (0.1); review memo from Company regarding same (0.2); correspondence with L. Samet regarding union issues (0.1); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding Coal Act issues (0.1). |
| Moskowitz E | 05/14/13 | 4.4 | Update call with client team (1.2); review memo regarding strategic pathways (0.4); correspondence with Blackstone and clients regarding information requests (0.7); correspondence with J. Bean regarding strategic issues (0.6); correspondence with client team regarding changes to proposal (0.9); emails with Davis Polk team regarding proposal changes, pension plan issues and appeal issues (0.6). |
| Samet L | 05/14/13 | 2.0 | Conference call with B. Hatfield, J. Bean, E. Moskowitz and others regarding labor issues (0.7); communications with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.2); research regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 procedural issues (0.8); communications with E. Sokoloff regarding same (0.2); review media coverage (0.1). |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/14/13 | 2.9 | Research appellate issues relating to 1113 and 1114. |
| Agostinho JN | 05/15/13 | 0.4 | Review participant data and send to non-union retiree committee counsel (0.2); correspondence regarding same (0.2). |
| Gehring AS | 05/15/13 | 0.2 | Post documents responsive to PwC data requests to data room. |
| Glazer E | 05/15/13 | 0.3 | Correspondence with B. Resnick, M. Buschmann at Blackstone and A. Rosen at PwC regarding access to United Mine Workers of America data room. |
| Resnick BM | 05/15/13 | 0.5 | Call with J. Bean regarding incentive and retention issue (0.1); research regarding same (0.2); emails regarding salaried retiree committee data request (0.2). |

| | | | |
|---------------|----------|-----|--|
| Samet L | 05/15/13 | 1.3 | Review and revise research regarding 1113 and 1114 procedural issues (1.0); emails with D. Lucha, E. Glazer and A. Saavedra regarding labor issues (0.3). |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/15/13 | 4.2 | Research on standing to appeal bankruptcy court orders. |
| Vora A | 05/15/13 | 4.3 | Confer with officials at Department of Labor and Department of Health and Human Services regarding the Affordable Care Act, to formulate advice for client (0.8); research the extent to which federal administrative regulations are waivable by non-regulated beneficiaries (3.5). |
| Agostinho JN | 05/16/13 | 0.6 | Review draft employee letter regarding retention payments (0.1); meet with E. Fitzgerald and R. Aizen regarding compensation and benefits issues (0.3); correspondence regarding same (0.2). |
| Aizen RM | 05/16/13 | 0.7 | Discussions and emails with E. FitzGerald, B. Resnick and J. Agostinho regarding Voluntary Employee Benefits Association and long term incentive plan (0.6); call to M. Luna regarding critical employee retention plan (0.1). |
| Coco KJ | 05/16/13 | 0.5 | Review critical employee retention plan and annual incentive plan decision and emails with Davis Polk team regarding same. |
| Eum JS | 05/16/13 | 0.8 | Compile and review attorney work product and case materials relating to preservation order for archives as per L. Samet and S. Hakimzadeh. |
| FitzGerald ET | 05/16/13 | 0.5 | Discussions with R. Aizen and J. Agostinho regarding Voluntary Employee Beneficiary Association structure |
| Gehring AS | 05/16/13 | 1.0 | Research declaratory judgment appeals (0.5); call with C. Reiser regarding same (0.3); communications with M. McGreal and L. Samet regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee data room (0.2). |
| Libby A | 05/16/13 | 0.3 | Call with M. McGreal regarding incentive and retention plan next steps (0.1); review incentive plan hearing transcript regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee stipulation and send same to M. Russano (0.2). |
| Loss DM | 05/16/13 | 0.3 | Review decision on incentive plan motion. |
| McGreal MM | 05/16/13 | 0.5 | Correspondence with Garden City Group and AlixPartners regarding supplemental 401(k) claims (0.1); review employee letter regarding incentive plan (0.2); correspondence with M. Luna, R. Aizen and others regarding same (0.2). |

| | | | |
|---------------|----------|-----|---|
| Reiser CM | 05/16/13 | 0.5 | Confer with A. Gehring regarding appeal of §§ 1113 and 1114 motion and declaratory judgment action motions (0.4); review order approving incentive plan motion (0.1). |
| Resnick BM | 05/16/13 | 0.6 | Review decision regarding incentive plan (0.4); emails with clients and others regarding incentive plan decision (0.2). |
| Russano MJ | 05/16/13 | 1.5 | Review and analyze court decision on employee incentive and retention programs (0.8); email to J. Bean regarding same (0.4); emails to B. Resnick, B. Kaminetzky, D. Loss and A. Libby regarding same (0.3). |
| Samet L | 05/16/13 | 1.2 | Research regarding procedural issues (0.3); communications with E. Vonnegut and E. Sokoloff regarding same (0.2); review media coverage (0.1); review annual incentive plan and critical employee retention plan opinion (0.4); correspondence with M. McGreal and A. Gehring regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee data requests (0.2). |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/16/13 | 5.1 | Research on standards for granting stays of bankruptcy court orders pending appeal. |
| Agostinho JN | 05/17/13 | 2.6 | Revise draft retention award letter and annex (2.3); correspondence regarding same (0.3). |
| Aizen RM | 05/17/13 | 2.0 | Comment on critical employee retention plan letter (1.1); email from A. Vora regarding health benefits (0.1); discuss critical employee retention plan letter with D. Loss, A. Libby, J. Agostinho and M. Luna (0.8). |
| Estacio R | 05/17/13 | 0.2 | Emails with E. Moskowitz regarding value of contracts assumed from Peabody. |
| Gehring AS | 05/17/13 | 0.4 | Review documents responsive to PwC information requests for confidentiality (0.2); communications with E. Moskowitz regarding sales contracts (0.2). |
| Glazer E | 05/17/13 | 0.2 | Manage data room access. |
| Huebner MS | 05/17/13 | 1.2 | Conference call with senior management regarding potential settlement of union issues (0.8); confer with E. Moskowitz and B. Resnick regarding various union and pension issues (0.4). |
| Kaminetzky BS | 05/17/13 | 2.4 | Review and analyze key employee retention plan decision (0.6); email regarding key employee retention plan decision, resolution and update (0.8); call with E. Moskowitz regarding key employee retention plan decision and update (0.2); analyze implementation question (0.2); |

| | | | |
|-------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | review proposal deck (0.1); review memo regarding legal issue (0.2); meet with M. Huebner regarding decision and update (0.3). |
| Libby A | 05/17/13 | 0.7 | Analyze critical employee retention plan payment issues (0.3); correspondence with R. Aizen, M. Russano and B. Resnick regarding same (0.1); call with D. Loss regarding same (0.1); email J. Agostinho regarding critical employee retention plan implementation issues (0.2). |
| Loss DM | 05/17/13 | 0.4 | Communications with A. Libby, R. Aizen and M. Russano regarding incentive and retention payment correspondence with employees, including review of motion in connection with same. |
| McGreal MM | 05/17/13 | 0.2 | Correspond with A. Libby regarding letter to employees regarding incentive plan (0.1); review correspondence from R. Aizen regarding same (0.1). |
| Moskowitz E | 05/17/13 | 1.1 | Correspondence with M. Huebner and Davis Polk team regarding Peabody strategy. |
| Reiser CM | 05/17/13 | 0.1 | Review memorandum regarding stays pending appeal of an §§ 1113 and 1114 order. |
| Resnick BM | 05/17/13 | 0.5 | Emails with Davis Polk litigation team regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 research issues (0.2); review letter to incentive plan participants (0.2); correspondence with R. Aizen and others regarding same (0.1). |
| Russano MJ | 05/17/13 | 1.0 | Review correspondence between client and R. Aizen regarding retention program (0.3); confer with D. Loss and A. Libby regarding same (0.3); review motion papers regarding same (0.4). |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/17/13 | 1.2 | Research on standards for granting stay of bankruptcy court order pending appeal (1.1); circulate same (0.1). |
| Vora A | 05/17/13 | 2.1 | Research Affordable Care Act issues (1.2); update E. Moskowitz on research related to Affordable Care Act (0.9). |
| Aizen RM | 05/18/13 | 0.3 | Email to M. Luna regarding retention letter. |
| Gehring AS | 05/18/13 | 0.2 | Communications with M. McGreal regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee information requests. |
| Huebner MS | 05/18/13 | 0.2 | Emails with Blackstone and management regarding United Mine Workers of America negotiations. |
| Aizen RM | 05/19/13 | 0.1 | Email from M. Luna regarding retention letter. |
| Huebner MS | 05/19/13 | 0.5 | Emails with B. Hatfield, F. Huffard, E. |

| | | | |
|---------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | Moskowitz and T. Mayer regarding 1113 issues and negotiations. |
| Agostinho JN | 05/20/13 | 0.8 | Review list of questions from retiree committee's counsel and correspondence regarding same (0.6); review retention agreement (0.2). |
| Aizen RM | 05/20/13 | 1.5 | Email from E. Moskowitz regarding 1113 and 1114 (0.1); comment on retention letter (1.4). |
| Gehring AS | 05/20/13 | 0.2 | Post documents responsive to PwC information requests to data room. |
| Glazer E | 05/20/13 | 0.3 | Call with A. Rosen at PwC regarding confidential potential investor (0.1); correspondence with E. Moskowitz, B. Resnick and M. Buschmann at Blackstone regarding same (0.2). |
| Huebner MS | 05/20/13 | 0.4 | Review of NLRB charge and emails with clients regarding same (0.2); review of United Mine Workers of America letter to customers and client emails regarding same (0.2). |
| Kaminetzky BS | 05/20/13 | 1.3 | Emails regarding legal research, decision, term sheet, negotiations, update, strategy and Peabody (1.1); review revised term sheet (0.2). |
| Libby A | 05/20/13 | 1.7 | Research and analysis regarding critical employee retention plan implementation issues (1.2); locate past research regarding same (0.2); meet with B. Resnick regarding same (0.2); call with B. Resnick and M. Russano regarding same (0.1). |
| Loss DM | 05/20/13 | 0.2 | Review information pertaining to pre-petition claims for 2012 incentive program. |
| McGreal MM | 05/20/13 | 0.7 | Correspond with R. Aizen regarding letters to employees regarding incentive plan (0.2); correspond with B. Resnick regarding same (0.3); review revised employee letters regarding supplemental 401(k) (0.2). |
| Moskowitz E | 05/20/13 | 1.3 | Emails with Davis Polk team regarding preparation for decision (0.6); meet with L. Samet regarding stay issues (0.3); call with J. Bean regarding status (0.4). |
| Resnick BM | 05/20/13 | 2.1 | Correspondence with J. Bean and M. McGreal regarding independent contractor issue (0.4); calls with J. Bean regarding incentive plan implementation (0.2); correspondence with M. Russano and A. Libby regarding same (0.4); review research regarding same (0.8); call with M. Huebner regarding same (0.1); review letter to employees (0.2). |
| Russano MJ | 05/20/13 | 1.1 | Confer with B. Resnick and A. Libby regarding potential employee pre-petition claims relating to |

| | | | |
|---------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | incentive program (0.4); review research regarding same (0.4); confer with D. Loss regarding same (0.3). |
| Samet L | 05/20/13 | 1.5 | Research regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 procedural issues (0.7); confer with E. Moskowitz and E. Sokoloff regarding same (0.5); communications with E. Sokoloff regarding same (0.2); review media coverage (0.1). |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/20/13 | 1.8 | Meet with E. Moskowitz and L. Samet to discuss research on stays pending appeal of bankruptcy court orders (0.3); additional research regarding same (1.5). |
| Vora A | 05/20/13 | 1.3 | Review research report regarding Affordable Care Act. |
| Agostinho JN | 05/21/13 | 0.8 | Review letter to retirees regarding retiree health direct services (0.6); correspondence regarding call with retiree committee (0.2). |
| Aizen RM | 05/21/13 | 0.7 | Review union healthcare proposal (0.2); comment on healthcare exchange letter (0.4); discuss healthcare proposal with E. Glazer (0.1). |
| Coco KJ | 05/21/13 | 0.3 | Emails with Davis Polk team regarding retiree inquiries. |
| Gehring AS | 05/21/13 | 0.5 | Review documents responsive to PwC information requests for confidentiality (0.3); communications with J. Mazzotti at AlixPartners regarding same (0.2). |
| Glazer E | 05/21/13 | 1.1 | Review United Mine Workers of America proposal related to active medical care coverage (0.4); correspondence with R. Aizen and A. Vora regarding same (0.3); call with A. Rosen at PwC regarding potential investor (0.1); correspondence with Company and M. Buschmann at Blackstone regarding same (0.3). |
| Huebner MS | 05/21/13 | 0.5 | Emails with clients regarding United Mine Workers of America negotiations and next steps (0.3); review of relevant United Mine Workers of America articles (0.2). |
| Kaminetzky BS | 05/21/13 | 1.1 | Review objections to discovery (0.3); email and analysis regarding critical employee retention plan questions (0.4); meet with M. Russano, A. Libby and D. Loss regarding same (0.4). |
| Libby A | 05/21/13 | 0.6 | Meet with B. Kaminetzky, D. Loss and M. Russano regarding questions in connection with implementation of critical employee retention plan (0.4); analysis and research regarding same (0.2). |

| | | | |
|-------------|----------|-----|--|
| Loss DM | 05/21/13 | 0.7 | Confer with B. Kaminetzky, M. Russano and A. Libby regarding incentive plan issues (0.3); prepare for same (0.2); teleconference with M. Luna and M. Russano regarding same (0.2). |
| Moskowitz E | 05/21/13 | 3.1 | Correspondence with clients regarding Peabody issues (0.9); meet with M. Huebner regarding Affordable Care Act issues (0.3); call with J. Woodrum and A. Vora regarding same (0.9); emails with Davis Polk team regarding preparation for decisions (0.7); meet with B. Resnick and M. McGreal regarding Affordable Care Act and strategic issues (0.3). |
| Resnick BM | 05/21/13 | 0.7 | Correspondence with J. Bean, M. Luna and Davis Polk team regarding implementation of incentive plan (0.5); correspondence with M. McGreal regarding Retiree Committee issues (0.2). |
| Russano MJ | 05/21/13 | 1.9 | Review client correspondence regarding potential retention plan program (0.4); meet with B. Kaminetzky, D. Loss and A. Libby regarding same (0.6); call with M. Luna regarding same (0.4); email to J. Bean regarding same (0.2); email to B. Resnick and M. McGreal regarding same (0.3). |
| Samet L | 05/21/13 | 1.6 | Research regarding procedural issues (0.9); review correspondence and presentations regarding labor negotiations (0.4); communications with E. Glazer and A. Vora regarding healthcare issues (0.3). |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/21/13 | 2.7 | Research on stays pending appeal of bankruptcy court orders (0.6); draft outline of opposition to potential stay motion (2.1). |
| Vora A | 05/21/13 | 7.8 | Confer with E. Moskowitz, M. Huebner and co-counsel on Affordable Care Act issues (1.2); research and analyze the Affordable Care Act (6.6). |
| Aizen RM | 05/22/13 | 0.1 | Confer with M. McGreal regarding supplemental 401(k). |
| Gehring AS | 05/22/13 | 0.6 | Review updated financial outlook (0.3); communications with M. McGreal and E. Glazer regarding provision of documents to the Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.3). |
| Glazer E | 05/22/13 | 1.5 | Correspondence with E. Moskowitz, M. Buschmann at Blackstone, A. Rosen at PwC and A. Traynor at United Mine Workers of America regarding data room access for potential investor (0.3); manage data room access (0.2); review |

| | | | |
|---------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | documents responsive to Unsecured Creditors' Committee information requests and upload to Unsecured Creditors' Committee data room (0.4); correspondence with M. McGreal and A. Gehring regarding same (0.1); correspondence with A. Vora regarding proposed healthcare plans (0.3); correspondence with A. Schlesinger at Blackstone regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 and equity committee hearings (0.2). |
| Huebner MS | 05/22/13 | 1.1 | Conference call with clients regarding union negotiations (0.7); conversations with E. Moskowitz regarding multiple union-related issues (0.4). |
| Kaminetzky BS | 05/22/13 | 0.2 | Call with E. Moskowitz regarding negotiation update. |
| Libby A | 05/22/13 | 0.3 | Analysis of issues regarding implementation of critical employee retention plan and correspondence with M. Russano and D. Loss regarding same. |
| Loss DM | 05/22/13 | 0.3 | Correspondence with M. Luna and M. Russano regarding critical employee retention plan. |
| McGreal MM | 05/22/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with R. Aizen and K. Burlage regarding supplemental 401(k) claims. |
| Moskowitz E | 05/22/13 | 4.5 | Review and edit communications materials (1.1); call with clients regarding negotiating update (0.7); call with Blackstone regarding same (0.4); call with client regarding business plan issues (0.6); emails with Davis Polk team regarding proposals, negotiations and next steps (1.7). |
| Resnick BM | 05/22/13 | 0.4 | Call with E. Moskowitz regarding 1113 and 1114 negotiations (0.1); meet with M. McGreal regarding Retiree Committee issues (0.3). |
| Russano MJ | 05/22/13 | 2.1 | Review client questions regarding retention program (0.4); confer with D. Loss and A. Libby regarding same (0.4); review court transcript and filings regarding same (0.8); email to M. Luna regarding same (0.5). |
| Samet L | 05/22/13 | 1.2 | Review research regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 procedural issues (0.4); confer with E. Sokoloff regarding same (0.2); review draft materials regarding financial outlook (0.4); confer with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.2). |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/22/13 | 1.7 | Finalize outline of opposition of potential motion for stay pending appeal of §§ 1113 and 1114 decision. |
| Vora A | 05/22/13 | 6.1 | Research and analyze Affordable Care Act |

| | | | |
|---------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | requirements (5.6); compile legal research and memoranda (0.5). |
| Agostinho JN | 05/23/13 | 0.6 | Arrange call to discuss items requested by retiree committee. |
| Estacio R | 05/23/13 | 0.2 | Conduct research regarding expected contributions to benefit plans (0.1); emails with E. Moskowitz regarding the same (0.1). |
| Gehring AS | 05/23/13 | 0.2 | Review documents responsive to PwC information requests for confidentiality. |
| Glazer E | 05/23/13 | 1.2 | Correspondence with M. Buschmann at Blackstone regarding United Mine Workers of America protective order (0.2); correspondence with A. Rosen at PwC and A. Traynor at United Mine Workers of America regarding data room access for potential investor (0.3); manage data room access (0.2); review documents responsive to Unsecured Creditors' Committee information requests and upload to Unsecured Creditors' Committee data room (0.3); correspondence with M. McGreal and Z. Mitschrich at Blackstone regarding same (0.2). |
| Huebner MS | 05/23/13 | 1.1 | Review of new United Mine Workers of America statements and relevant coverage (0.1); review of §1113 bid and ask grid and emails with client group regarding same (0.7); emails regarding language regarding pension issues and conversation with E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.3). |
| Kaminetzky BS | 05/23/13 | 0.2 | Review press reports (0.1); call with E. Moskowitz regarding update (0.1). |
| Libby A | 05/23/13 | 0.2 | Analysis regarding issues in connection with the implementation of the critical employee retention plan. |
| Loss DM | 05/23/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with M. Luna and M. Russano regarding critical employee retention plan. |
| Moskowitz E | 05/23/13 | 4.3 | Review proposal spreadsheet and comment on same (0.5); update call with clients regarding negotiations and follow-up (1.1); call and correspondence with J. Woodrum and J. Bean regarding pension plan issues (1.6); emails with Davis Polk team regarding negotiations, pension plan issues and next steps (1.1). |
| Resnick BM | 05/23/13 | 0.7 | Emails with D. Woodrum, E. Moskowitz, M. Huebner and clients regarding multi-employer pension plan and §1113 issues (0.3); call with J. Bean, D. Woodrum, M. Huebner and E. |

| | | | |
|--------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | Moskowitz regarding United Mine Workers of America proposal (0.4). |
| Russano MJ | 05/23/13 | 0.9 | Review and respond to client emails regarding implementation of retention program (0.7); confer with D. Loss regarding same (0.2). |
| Samet L | 05/23/13 | 0.3 | Communications with E. Moskowitz, Z. Mitschrich and others regarding financial outlook. |
| Vora A | 05/23/13 | 2.9 | Confer with agency call center regarding Affordable Care Act requirements (0.7); research and analyze corresponding Affordable Care Act statutory regulations (2.2). |
| Agostinho JN | 05/24/13 | 1.6 | Respond to questions from O. Lozada regarding retiree medical benefits (1.4); discuss same with R. Aizen (0.2). |
| Aizen RM | 05/24/13 | 0.9 | Confer with J. Agostinho and O. Lozada regarding COBRA (0.4); call with M. Luna, L. Knight and M. McGreal regarding supplemental 401(k) (0.2); confer with J. Agostinho regarding 11-K (0.2); email from A. Vora regarding health benefits (0.1). |
| Glazer E | 05/24/13 | 0.2 | Draft email to Z. Mitschrich at Blackstone regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 proposals (0.1); review news coverage (0.1). |
| Huebner MS | 05/24/13 | 0.9 | Call with United Mine Workers of America, clients, Blackstone and other advisors (0.6); follow on calls with Blackstone regarding same and pending issues (0.3). |
| McGreal MM | 05/24/13 | 0.3 | Teleconference with M. Luna and R. Aizen regarding supplemental 401(k) claims (0.2); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding benefits under wages order (0.1). |
| Moskowitz E | 05/24/13 | 4.0 | Update call with clients and follow-up (1.1); call with J. Woodrum regarding negotiations (0.5); review and edit draft side letter with Union (0.4); correspondence with clients regarding pension plan issue (0.7); call with United Mine Workers of America, Blackstone and clients regarding negotiations (0.7); review Affordable Care Act legal research (0.6). |
| Resnick BM | 05/24/13 | 1.8 | Call with Blackstone and Davis Polk teams regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 negotiations (0.2); call with clients, United Mine Workers of America and advisors regarding same (0.8); correspondence with F. Huffard, E. Moskowitz, M. Huebner and S. Hessler regarding same (0.8). |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/24/13 | 0.2 | Emails to E. Moskowitz and L. Samet regarding |

| | | | |
|---------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | liquidation analysis. |
| Vora A | 05/24/13 | 5.9 | Compose memorandum detailing research, analysis and communications regarding the Affordable Care Act. |
| Agostinho JN | 05/28/13 | 1.9 | Call with J. Cohen, L. Wills of retiree committee, M. Luna, O. Lozada and M. Bothwell of Patriot and R. Aizen regarding retiree benefit termination (1.1); call with O. Lozada, R. Wald and R. Aizen regarding retiree benefits (0.8). |
| Aizen RM | 05/28/13 | 2.1 | Review §§ 1113 and 1114 proposal recap (0.2); calls with M. Luna, B. Wald, O. Lozada, J. Agostinho and Retiree Committee regarding medical benefits (1.9). |
| Glazer E | 05/28/13 | 0.2 | Review summary of §§ 1113 and 1114 negotiations. |
| Huebner MS | 05/28/13 | 1.7 | Conversations with E. Moskowitz, J. Bean regarding Affordable Care Act and United Mine Workers of America issues (0.3); call with senior noteholders regarding United Mine Workers of America issues (0.6); several emails to and from clients regarding United Mine Workers of America negotiations and tomorrow's ruling (0.3); conference call with client group regarding today's United Mine Workers of America negotiations (0.5). |
| Kaminetzky BS | 05/28/13 | 1.2 | Call with E. Moskowitz regarding decision and hearing (0.2); review negotiation materials (0.4); conference call with B. Hatfield regarding update (0.5); post-call with E. Moskowitz (0.1). |
| Moskowitz E | 05/28/13 | 5.0 | Update call with clients regarding negotiations (0.7); call with M. Huebner regarding status (0.3); call with clients and bondholders teams and follow-up (0.8); call with Peabody's counsel (0.5); summary to clients regarding same (0.4); calls with J. Bean regarding status (0.6); correspondence with J. Woodrum and team regarding pension plan issues (0.6); emails with team regarding preparation for decision and related issues (1.1). |
| Resnick BM | 05/28/13 | 1.0 | Emails with E. Moskowitz regarding Peabody litigation (0.2); call with Company and bondholders regarding labor negotiations (0.8). |
| Samet L | 05/28/13 | 1.2 | Communications with J. Orf, D. Lucha, E. Moskowitz and others regarding labor issues (0.8); review materials concerning ongoing §§ 1113 and 1114 negotiations (0.4). |

| | | | |
|--------------|----------|-----|---|
| Vora A | 05/28/13 | 0.5 | Review materials regarding Affordable Care Act and issues regarding Voluntary Employee Benefits Association. |
| Agostinho JN | 05/29/13 | 3.2 | Research regarding retiree benefits and COBRA (2.2); call to discuss results of §§ 1113 and 1114 motion (1.0). |
| Aizen RM | 05/29/13 | 1.6 | Emails from J. Woodrum and E. Moskowitz regarding multi-employer pension plan (0.2); discussions and emails with E. FitzGerald and M. McGreal regarding Voluntary Employee Benefits Association (0.2); review 1113 and 1114 order (1.2). |
| Cho EK | 05/29/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with R. Aizen regarding evergreen clause for multi-employer pension plan. |
| Coco KJ | 05/29/13 | 1.5 | Review §§ 1113 and 1114 decision and related documents (0.6); attend update call with clients regarding same (0.9). |
| Darcy D | 05/29/13 | 1.2 | Review §§ 1113 and 1114 and Peabody declaratory judgment decisions (0.9); discuss same with C. Reiser (0.3). |
| Estacio R | 05/29/13 | 1.5 | Review §§ 1113 and 1114 decision (0.4); confer with M. Huebner, B. Kaminetzky, E. Moskowitz, Patriot and others regarding the same (1.1). |
| Gehring AS | 05/29/13 | 4.4 | Review declaratory judgment action decision (0.7); review §§ 1113 and 1114 decision (2.3); communications with Davis Polk team and client regarding same (0.8); communications with L. Samet and E. Sokoloff regarding appeal procedure (0.4); research same (0.2). |
| Glazer E | 05/29/13 | 2.2 | Review §§ 1113 and 1114 decision (0.8); call with Patriot regarding same (0.4); research related to potential grounds for appeal of 1113 and 1114 decision (0.5); review Peabody-Assumed Group decision (0.3); review Fifth United Mine Workers of America counterproposal (0.2). |
| Hakimzadeh S | 05/29/13 | 1.4 | Read Judge's opinion on §§ 1113 and 1114 motion (0.3); teleconference regarding same (1.1). |
| Huebner MS | 05/29/13 | 2.9 | Emails with J. Woodrum and E. Moskowitz regarding pension and evergreen issues (0.3); emails with clients and E. Moskowitz regarding actuarial calculations and valuation of healthcare issues (0.3); review of 1113 and Peabody decisions and planning and notes regarding next steps on same (1.2); multiple calls with clients |

| | | | |
|--------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | regarding new labor decisions (1.1). |
| Kamnetzky BS | 05/29/13 | 6.3 | Review and analyze §§ 1113 and 1114 and Peabody decisions (3.7); conference call with clients, Blackstone and Davis Polk team regarding opinions and strategy (1.1); email regarding decisions, proposals and strategy (0.5); calls with M. Huebner and E. Moskowitz regarding decisions and strategy (0.6); review press reports (0.3); review counterproposal (0.1). |
| Martin JD | 05/29/13 | 1.4 | Review decisions on §§ 1113 and 1114 motion and Peabody motion (0.7); analysis of strategy related to same (0.7). |
| McGreal MM | 05/29/13 | 1.3 | Teleconference with Company and advisors regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 decision (1.1); correspondence with K. Coco and others regarding same (0.2). |
| Moskowitz E | 05/29/13 | 7.4 | Correspondence with clients regarding Peabody issues (0.4); review §§ 1113 and 1114 decision and Peabody decisions (2.4); call with client team regarding decisions (0.6); calls with J. Bean regarding same (0.8); correspondence with public relations team regarding media communications (0.7); draft brief summary for client team (0.6); emails with clients and team regarding negotiations, decisions and Peabody issues (1.9). |
| Reiser CM | 05/29/13 | 1.8 | Review §§ 1113 and 1114 and declaratory judgment action summary judgment rulings (1.2); confer with D. Darcy and A. Gehring regarding same (0.6). |
| Resnick BM | 05/29/13 | 2.5 | Read §§ 1113 and 1114 and Peabody decisions (0.9); call with clients and co-advisors regarding same (1.1); call with S. Hessler and E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.3); emails regarding Peabody issues (0.2). |
| Russano MJ | 05/29/13 | 3.9 | Review and analyze court opinions regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 motions and Peabody summary judgment motion (2.1); confer with E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding same (0.5); call with clients regarding same (1.1); email to S. Schwartz regarding same (0.2). |
| Samet L | 05/29/13 | 2.7 | Review §§ 1113 and 1114 opinion and Peabody assumed opinion (0.8); telephone conference with B. Hatfield, J. Bean and others regarding same (1.0); communications with E. Moskowitz, E. Glazer, A. Gehring and others regarding same (0.5); review media coverage and press releases |

| | | | |
|---------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | relating to §§ 1113 and 1114 (0.4). |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/29/13 | 2.2 | Review decision on §§ 1113 and 1114 motion (0.8); call with Davis Polk team and client to discuss same (1.0); calls with L. Samet and A. Gehring to discuss next steps and appeal of decision on declaratory judgment action (0.3); circulate research on appeals and stays of bankruptcy court orders (0.1). |
| Starr AT | 05/29/13 | 1.7 | Review opinions regarding Labor and Peabody (0.6); conference call with client, M. Huebner, E. Moskowitz and B. Kaminetzky regarding the same (1.1). |
| Vora A | 05/29/13 | 0.5 | Manage and review case files, updates and correspondence. |
| Agostinho JN | 05/30/13 | 2.3 | Research requirements for terminated employees (1.9); discuss status of benefits projects with E. FitzGerald and R. Aizen (0.4). |
| Aizen RM | 05/30/13 | 1.3 | Discussion with E. FitzGerald and J. Agostinho regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 order, COBRA and supplemental 401(k) (0.3); research COBRA question (0.4); review §§ 1113 and 1114 order (0.6). |
| Coco KJ | 05/30/13 | 0.7 | Review §§ 1113 and 1114 decision. |
| Gehring AS | 05/30/13 | 6.2 | Communications and conferences with E. Moskowitz, J. Martin, L. Samet, E. Sokoloff and S. Goldfarb regarding declaratory judgment ruling (3.5); draft summary of same (2.3); communications with L. Samet and E. Glazer regarding joint exhibits (0.2); review memorandum regarding motions for reconsideration (0.2). |
| Glazer E | 05/30/13 | 1.5 | Emails with L. Samet and A. Gehring regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing joint exhibits (0.3); review §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing transcript and decision related to same (0.5); review summary of §§ 1113 and 1114 decision (0.1); review legal research on motions to reconsider (0.2); conduct research related to potential appeal (0.4). |
| Goldfarb SM | 05/30/13 | 1.8 | Confer with A. Gehring and E. Sokoloff regarding declaratory judgment action. |
| Huebner MS | 05/30/13 | 0.7 | Conference call with B. Hatfield and client team regarding today's negotiation session with United Mine Workers of America. |
| Kaminetzky BS | 05/30/13 | 3.6 | Decisions review and analysis (2.9); email regarding Peabody assumed group analysis and strategy (0.4); review press reports (0.3). |

| | | | |
|-------------|----------|-----|--|
| Martin JD | 05/30/13 | 1.9 | Emails with E. Moskowitz and others regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 strategy issues (0.4); confer with E. Moskowitz and A. Gehring regarding litigation strategy (0.2); conference call with B. Hatfield, J. Bean and others regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 negotiations (1.3). |
| Moskowitz E | 05/30/13 | 7.1 | Further review of decisions (1.2); calls with clients and team regarding same (1.1); call with Kirkland regarding negotiations (0.6); edit summary of opinion (0.7) review legal research regarding Peabody issues (0.8); emails with team regarding decisions, strategy and next steps (2.7). |
| Reiser CM | 05/30/13 | 0.3 | Confer with A. Gehring regarding declaratory judgment action rulings. |
| Resnick BM | 05/30/13 | 1.7 | Review memo and emails with litigation team regarding strategic options in light of §§ 1113 and 1114 and Peabody decisions (1.3); discuss same with E. Moskowitz and others (0.4). |
| Russano MJ | 05/30/13 | 3.5 | Review and analysis of court opinion regarding Peabody summary judgment (1.5); review related contract documents (1.3); confer with E. Moskowitz and J. Martin regarding potential response strategy (0.7). |
| Samet L | 05/30/13 | 5.6 | Review §§ 1113 and 1114 and Peabody Assumed decisions (1.3); draft memorandum for clients regarding same (3.8); review materials regarding 1113 and 1114 negotiations (0.3); review media coverage (0.2). |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/30/13 | 4.3 | Meet with A. Gehring and S. Goldfarb to discuss research on motions to reconsider (0.8); research and circulate standards and procedures related to motions to reconsider (3.5). |
| Aizen RM | 05/31/13 | 1.0 | Email to B. Wald and O. Lozada regarding COBRA (0.9); email from O. Lozada regarding Retiree Committee requests (0.1). |
| Coco KJ | 05/31/13 | 0.4 | Review summary of §§ 1113 and 1114 decision and Peabody Assumed Group decision. |
| Gehring AS | 05/31/13 | 6.1 | Review summary of §§ 1113 and 1114 decision (0.2); communications with team regarding same (0.2); research and draft motion for reconsideration (5.3); communications with E. Sokoloff and S. Goldfarb regarding same (0.4). |
| Glazer E | 05/31/13 | 0.4 | Correspondence with L. Samet regarding 1113 and 1114 hearing joint exhibits. |
| Goldfarb SM | 05/31/13 | 4.1 | Research declaratory judgment action issues (2.0); summarize research and submit to A. |

| | | | |
|-----------------------------|----------|--------------|--|
| | | | Gehring and E. Sokoloff (1.0); confer with L. Samet regarding same (0.2); correspond with A. Gehring regarding same (0.9). |
| Kamietzky BS | 05/31/13 | 1.9 | Call with E. Moskowitz regarding negotiations (0.1); review press reports (0.6); email regarding negotiations (0.1); review legal memoranda regarding next steps and summary (0.6); email and analysis regarding legal issues (0.5). |
| Loss DM | 05/31/13 | 0.3 | Communications with M. Luna, K. Burlage and M. Russano regarding incentive plan. |
| McGreal MM | 05/31/13 | 0.4 | Correspondence with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding employee agreements (0.1); review legal research regarding same (0.2); review summary of §§ 1113 and 1114 decision (0.1). |
| Moskowitz E | 05/31/13 | 5.3 | Update call with clients (1.0); calls with J. Bean (0.6); call with bondholder team and advisors (0.9); call with Blackstone team regarding business plan and negotiations (0.7); review revised business plan and comment on same (1.0); emails with team regarding negotiations and legal research (1.1). |
| Reiser CM | 05/31/13 | 0.3 | Review memorandum regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 and declaratory judgment action rulings. |
| Resnick BM | 05/31/13 | 3.0 | Review Blackstone presentation regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 and business plan (0.4); call with bondholders and clients regarding 1113 and 1114 negotiations and strategy (0.8); calls with Blackstone regarding same (0.6); call with S. Hessler regarding same (0.3); call with M. Huebner and E. Moskowitz regarding same (0.1); review court decisions and union materials (0.4); emails with litigation team regarding same (0.2); review memo regarding same (0.2). |
| Samet L | 05/31/13 | 1.0 | Revise memorandum regarding §§ 1113 and 1114 and Peabody assumed decisions (0.4); communications with B. Kamietzky, E. Moskowitz and others regarding litigation strategy (0.2); review media coverage regarding labor issues (0.2); confer with S. Goldfarb regarding labor issues (0.2). |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/31/13 | 0.6 | Call with K. Coco regarding research (0.1); emails with A. Gehring regarding relief on motions under 1113 and 1114 (0.4); review research on procedures for motions for reconsideration (0.1). |
| Total EMPLOYEE LABOR | | 963.2 | |

| ISSUES | | | |
|----------------------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | |
| EXECUTORY CONTRACTS | | | |
| Coco KJ | 05/01/13 | 1.9 | Call and email with S. Schutzenhofer regarding Royal Bank of Scotland agreement (0.3); call with Siemens regarding lease issues and follow-up analysis regarding same (1.2); email to clients regarding update of same (0.2); meet with B. Resnick regarding same (0.2). |
| Klein DS | 05/01/13 | 0.1 | Emails with K. Coco regarding rejection damages claim treatment. |
| Martin JD | 05/01/13 | 0.2 | Call with K. Coco regarding Payne-Gallatin objection. |
| Mehes A | 05/01/13 | 7.0 | Research legal issues regarding Payne-Gallatin lease (3.7); draft Payne-Gallatin brief (3.1); review Payne-Gallatin's proposed stipulation of facts (0.2). |
| Resnick BM | 05/01/13 | 0.2 | Meet with K. Coco regarding rejection issue. |
| Coco KJ | 05/02/13 | 5.2 | Call with C. Ebetino and J. Eagan regarding Payne-Gallatin and Shonk issues and email follow-up (1.0); analysis of Cal First lease amendment issues (0.4); emails with clients regarding same (0.3); call with S. Schutzenhofer regarding Siemens and Cal First lease issues and send follow-up email (0.4); review and revise lease assumption order for Shonk (1.5); emails with clients and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); review and revise Payne-Gallatin draft papers (0.8); emails with clients regarding same (0.5). |
| Mehes A | 05/02/13 | 4.6 | Draft Payne-Gallatin brief. |
| Coco KJ | 05/03/13 | 3.3 | Analysis and drafting in connection with stipulation of facts with Payne-Gallatin (lessor) (1.9); emails with clients and counterparty regarding finalization of Cal First lease amendment (0.4); review and revise assumption order for Shonk leases (0.4); emails with clients regarding same (0.3); emails with Davis Polk team regarding comments to same (0.3). |
| Libby A | 05/03/13 | 0.3 | Draft notification of tier II ordinary course contract. |
| McGreal MM | 05/03/13 | 0.3 | Review and comment on lease assumption order. |
| Mehes A | 05/03/13 | 1.5 | Edit Payne-Gallatin brief (1.3); edit Payne-Gallatin fact stipulation (0.2). |
| Coco KJ | 05/04/13 | 0.5 | Emails with Davis Polk team regarding Payne- |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | Gallatin and Shonk lease issues. |
| Mehes A | 05/04/13 | 3.0 | Research Payne-Gallatin's alleged claims. |
| Martin JD | 05/05/13 | 1.2 | Review and comment on draft response to Payne-Gallatin objection. |
| Mehes A | 05/05/13 | 5.9 | Edit Payne-Gallatin brief. |
| Chapman MP | 05/06/13 | 2.2 | Review and revise Payne-Gallatin stipulation of facts (1.6); confer with K. Coco regarding same (0.4); file same (0.2). |
| Coco KJ | 05/06/13 | 4.2 | Review and revise statement of facts with Payne-Gallatin (1.2); emails with clients and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); review and revise draft Payne-Gallatin brief (0.9); emails with clients and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.6); revise draft assumption order for Shonk leases (0.3); emails with clients and counterparty regarding same (0.4); email with counterparty and clients regarding Siemens leases (0.3). |
| Libby A | 05/06/13 | 0.5 | Review and comment on Payne-Gallatin stipulation and confer with M. Chapman regarding same. |
| Martin JD | 05/06/13 | 4.0 | Review and comment on response to Payne-Gallatin objection (2.2); communications with C. Ebetino, J. Eagan, K. Coco and A. Mehes regarding same (1.8). |
| Mehes A | 05/06/13 | 4.9 | Call with J. Martin, K. Coco, C. Ebetino and J. Eagan regarding Payne-Gallatin (0.9); edit Payne-Gallatin brief (4.0). |
| Coco KJ | 05/07/13 | 3.9 | Review and revise Payne-Gallatin brief (1.5); emails with clients and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.8); second review of brief and coordinate regarding same (0.6); emails with clients and counterparty regarding Shonk assumption issues (0.5); emails with clients and AlixPartners regarding contract rejection issues (0.5). |
| Klein DS | 05/07/13 | 0.2 | Emails with K. Coco regarding real property assumption cure issues. |
| Martin JD | 05/07/13 | 2.6 | Review and comment on response to Payne-Gallatin objection (1.8); communications with C. Ebetino, K. Coco and A. Mehes regarding same (0.8). |
| McGreal MM | 05/07/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with K. Coco regarding proposed settlement. |
| Mehes A | 05/07/13 | 3.6 | Edit Payne-Gallatin brief. |
| Chapman MP | 05/08/13 | 0.5 | Emails with Bryan Cave regarding Payne-Gallatin stipulation of facts. |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|------|---|
| Coco KJ | 05/08/13 | 3.3 | Review and revise Payne-Gallatin brief (1.4); file and coordinate service of same (0.5); review Payne-Gallatin brief and discuss same with Davis Polk team (1.0); review outline of response to Payne-Gallatin brief (0.4). |
| Halford EB | 05/08/13 | 1.3 | Generate a manual table of authorities for the Payne-Gallatin brief (1.0); quality check page location of the citations in the table of authorities (0.3). |
| Martin JD | 05/08/13 | 4.1 | Revise and finalize reply to Payne-Gallatin objection (2.5); communications with C. Ebetino, J. Eagan, K. Coco and A. Mehes regarding same (1.1); call with J. Jones, K. Coco and others regarding contract rejection issues, including preparation (0.5). |
| Mehes A | 05/08/13 | 6.1 | Edit Payne-Gallatin brief (4.5); calls with C. Ebetino, J. Eagan and K. Coco regarding Payne-Gallatin brief (0.4); draft outline of Payne-Gallatin reply brief (1.2). |
| Chapman MP | 05/09/13 | 0.6 | Emails with Bryan Cave regarding Payne-Gallatin stipulation of facts. |
| Coco KJ | 05/09/13 | 2.5 | Draft outline of Payne-Gallatin reply brief and emails with clients and Davis Polk team regarding same (1.0); emails with clients and counterparty in connection with Shonk lease assumption (0.5); call with C. Smith regarding same (0.2); review and comment on consignment agreement and emails with A. McCallister regarding same (0.8). |
| Martin JD | 05/09/13 | 2.3 | Review Payne-Gallatin submission in support of objection (0.5); review cases for reply to Payne-Gallatin objection (1.6); emails with K. Coco and A. Mehes regarding same (0.2). |
| Mehes A | 05/09/13 | 0.4 | Correspondence with K. Coco and J. Martin regarding Payne-Gallatin reply brief. |
| Resnick BM | 05/09/13 | 0.1 | Emails with Coco regarding executory contract assumption. |
| Coco KJ | 05/10/13 | 2.0 | Review and advise client regarding consignment agreement issues (0.8); consult with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); emails with clients regarding same (0.2); research regarding CONSOL contracts and emails to clients regarding same (0.5). |
| McGreal MM | 05/10/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with M. Tobak and K. Coco regarding executory contracts. |
| Mehes A | 05/10/13 | 10.0 | Draft Payne-Gallatin reply brief. |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|---|
| Martin JD | 05/11/13 | 2.5 | Review and revise reply to Payne-Gallatin objection. |
| Mehes A | 05/11/13 | 4.2 | Draft Payne-Gallatin reply brief. |
| Martin JD | 05/12/13 | 0.3 | Review draft reply to Payne-Gallatin objection. |
| Mehes A | 05/12/13 | 6.1 | Edit Payne-Gallatin reply brief. |
| Coco KJ | 05/13/13 | 1.9 | Review and revise reply brief for Payne-Gallatin cure dispute matter (0.4); emails with clients and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4); draft proposed order for same (0.5); review Heritage contracts and discuss with E. Waller (0.3); review revised turn of Payne-Gallatin brief (0.3). |
| Martin JD | 05/13/13 | 3.1 | Review draft reply brief to Payne-Gallatin objection and related cases (2.2); communications with C. Ebetino, J. Eagan, K. Coco and A. Mehes regarding same (0.9). |
| McGreal MM | 05/13/13 | 0.3 | Correspondence with E. Waller and K. Coco regarding assumption of executory contract and related cure amount (0.2); teleconference with J. Jones regarding review of executory contract (0.1). |
| Mehes A | 05/13/13 | 5.4 | Edit Payne-Gallatin reply brief. |
| Resnick BM | 05/13/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with K. Coco regarding assumption issues. |
| Coco KJ | 05/14/13 | 4.9 | Multiple calls and emails with counsel to Shonk Land Company regarding proposed assumption order (2.4); emails with clients regarding Payne-Gallatin reply brief (0.6); review and finalize same (0.4); coordinate filing and service of same (0.3); review Nelson Brothers contracts and advise E. Waller regarding assumption and rejection issues (1.2). |
| Halford EB | 05/14/13 | 1.8 | Generate a manual table of authorities for the Payne-Gallatin reply brief (1.0); search LEXIS and library stacks for citation information (0.3); quality check page location of the citations in the table of authorities (0.3); minor bluebooking (0.2). |
| Klein DS | 05/14/13 | 0.1 | Call with K. Coco regarding lease assumption defaults. |
| Martin JD | 05/14/13 | 1.2 | Review and comment on draft reply brief to Payne-Gallatin objection (0.8); review Payne-Gallatin reply brief (0.4). |
| McGreal MM | 05/14/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with K. Coco regarding lease assumption stipulation. |
| Mehes A | 05/14/13 | 4.0 | Review and edit Payne-Gallatin brief. |
| Coco KJ | 05/15/13 | 1.4 | Emails with D. Neier and clients regarding Penn |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | Virginia easements and assumption of leases (0.4); emails with clients and counterparty regarding changes to Shonk assumption order (0.6); emails with clients regarding analysis of consignment agreement issues (0.4). |
| Eum JS | 05/15/13 | 2.5 | Compile cases cited in Panther and Payne-Gallatin briefs and reply briefs for Payne-Gallatin lease dispute cases binders per A. Mehes. |
| McGreal MM | 05/15/13 | 0.1 | Correspondence with K. Coco regarding lease assumption stipulation. |
| Mehes A | 05/15/13 | 0.1 | Review materials to send to J. Martin in preparation of Payne-Gallatin oral argument. |
| Coco KJ | 05/16/13 | 2.0 | Call with J. Bean and C. Ebetino regarding CONSOL contracts (0.9); prepare for same (0.2); emails and call with J. Eagan regarding Shonk assumption order and cure amounts (0.4); calls with Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding same (0.5). |
| McGreal MM | 05/16/13 | 0.8 | Teleconference with C. Ebetino, K. Coco and others regarding assumption of certain executory contracts (0.7); correspondence with K. Coco regarding same (0.1). |
| Coco KJ | 05/17/13 | 1.8 | Emails with clients and counterparty regarding Shonk assumption order (0.6); email order to chambers (0.2); review and revise Penn Virginia assumption order (0.5); emails with clients and Penn Virginia regarding same (0.5). |
| Eum JS | 05/17/13 | 0.7 | Compile Panther Payne-Gallatin joint stipulation of facts exhibit A and B per A. Mehes. |
| Martin JD | 05/17/13 | 5.5 | Review pleadings and relevant contracts in preparation for argument on Payne-Gallatin objection (2.0); legal research in preparation for argument on Payne-Gallatin objection (3.5). |
| Mehes A | 05/17/13 | 1.2 | Correspondence with J. Martin regarding Payne-Gallatin (0.6); review Payne-Gallatin Lease (0.6). |
| Martin JD | 05/18/13 | 3.5 | Draft and revise argument on Payne-Gallatin objection. |
| Coco KJ | 05/19/13 | 0.3 | Emails with Davis Polk team regarding Payne-Gallatin contracts. |
| Martin JD | 05/19/13 | 2.7 | Draft and revise argument on Payne-Gallatin objection. |
| Mehes A | 05/19/13 | 0.8 | Correspondence with J. Martin regarding Payne-Gallatin dispute. |
| Coco KJ | 05/20/13 | 1.0 | Emails with clients, Davis Polk team and counterparty regarding Payne-Gallatin cure dispute and preparation for 5/21 hearing (0.8); |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | call with A. Saavedra regarding Shonk leases (0.2). |
| Martin JD | 05/20/13 | 5.5 | Draft and revise argument on Payne-Gallatin objection (3.5); communications with Payne-Gallatin counsel regarding document admissibility issues (0.5); review case law in preparation for Payne-Gallatin argument (1.5). |
| McGreal MM | 05/20/13 | 1.4 | Teleconference with R. Mead, R. McWilliams, K. Coco and others regarding assumption of executory contracts (0.6); correspond with J. Martin, A. Mehes and K. Coco regarding same (0.4); conduct legal research regarding same (0.4). |
| Mehes A | 05/20/13 | 1.9 | Research Payne-Gallatin legal issues in preparation for oral argument (1.2); correspondence with J. Martin and K. Coco regarding Payne-Gallatin oral argument preparation (0.7). |
| Martin JD | 05/21/13 | 2.5 | Review cases and pleadings in preparation for argument on Payne-Gallatin objection. |
| Mehes A | 05/21/13 | 2.2 | Review various debtor's assumption and assignment contracts to determine executory status for purposes of assumption or rejection. |
| Coco KJ | 05/22/13 | 1.1 | Draft and send email to clients regarding analysis of utilities contracts (0.8); emails with client and counterparty regarding Shonk lease assumption (0.3). |
| Martin JD | 05/22/13 | 0.2 | Emails with C. Ebetino and others regarding Payne-Gallatin argument. |
| Mehes A | 05/22/13 | 0.6 | Review Payne-Gallatin oral argument transcript. |
| Chapman MP | 05/23/13 | 3.5 | Review CONSOL contracts. |
| Coco KJ | 05/23/13 | 0.4 | Emails with clients regarding Shonk cure payments (0.2); emails with counsel to Penn Virginia regarding assumption of leases (0.2). |
| McGreal MM | 05/23/13 | 0.4 | Correspondence with K. Coco regarding legal research regarding assumption of certain executory contracts (0.2); review legal research regarding same (0.2). |
| Mehes A | 05/23/13 | 4.4 | Research rejection of utility contracts. |
| Chapman MP | 05/24/13 | 6.1 | Review and summarize executory contracts regarding priority development rights per K. Coco. |
| McGreal MM | 05/24/13 | 0.4 | Review and comment on summary of research regarding executory contracts (0.2); teleconferences with K. Coco regarding same (0.2). |

| | | | |
|----------------------------------|----------|--------------|--|
| Mehes A | 05/24/13 | 3.1 | Calls with K. Coco regarding possible rejection of executory contract (0.5); research regarding possible rejection of executory contract (2.6). |
| Coco KJ | 05/25/13 | 0.3 | Respond to email from C. Ebetino regarding assumption and rejection of utilities contracts. |
| Chapman MP | 05/28/13 | 7.7 | Review and summarize CONSOL contracts for purpose of determining whether or not executory (7.1); meet with K. Coco regarding same (0.6). |
| Coco KJ | 05/28/13 | 1.1 | Meet with M. Chapman regarding CONSOL contracts and follow-up analysis of same. |
| Chapman MP | 05/29/13 | 4.6 | Review and summarize CONSOL contracts for purpose of determining whether or not executory (3.0); create and edit one page chart summary of same (1.1); meet with K. Coco regarding same (0.5). |
| Coco KJ | 05/29/13 | 1.1 | Analysis and coordination with Davis Polk team regarding Arch assignment and assumption agreements (0.6); discussions with M. Chapman and analysis regarding CONSOL contracts (0.5). |
| Martin JD | 05/29/13 | 0.4 | Communications with K. Coco and A. Mehes regarding analysis of assumption and assignment contracts and related analysis. |
| McGreal MM | 05/29/13 | 0.7 | Teleconference with C. Ebetino, J. Jones, K. Coco and others regarding potential rejection of executory contracts (0.6); confer with K. Coco regarding same (0.1). |
| Mehes A | 05/29/13 | 1.7 | Review various debtor's assumption and assignment contracts to determine executory status for purposes of assumption or rejection. |
| Coco KJ | 05/30/13 | 1.3 | Emails with counterparty Penn Virginia regarding lease assumptions and easements (0.3); call with M. Williams regarding same (0.1); call with S. Schutzenhofer regarding Bank of America lease buyout and follow-up email (0.3); call with Curtis-Mallet regarding same (0.2); review research and analysis regarding assignment and assumption agreements and emails with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.4). |
| Martin JD | 05/30/13 | 0.3 | Communications with A. Mehes and others regarding analysis of assignment contracts. |
| Mehes A | 05/30/13 | 3.0 | Review assumption and assignment contracts for executory status and integration for possible rejection. |
| Total EXECUTORY CONTRACTS | | 211.4 | |
| | | | |

| FINANCING | | | |
|------------------|----------|-----|--|
| Warner W | 04/30/13 | 0.7 | Review and comment on draft amendment to DIP financing agreement. |
| Immermann MC | 05/01/13 | 0.8 | Draft potential amendment. |
| Immermann MC | 05/02/13 | 1.3 | Conference call with Patriot and Davis Polk team (0.3); call with K. Coco (0.1); research permitted land swaps (0.9). |
| Resnick BM | 05/02/13 | 0.3 | Review credit agreement analysis of potential joint venture transaction (0.2); call with M. Immermann regarding same (0.1). |
| Immermann MC | 05/03/13 | 1.0 | Email correspondence regarding sale. |
| Resnick BM | 05/03/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with M. Immermann and C. Ebetino regarding lease transaction. |
| Immermann MC | 05/06/13 | 1.4 | Discuss DIP covenants with C. Ebetino and J. Eagan (0.6); prepare synopsis for W. Warner regarding same (0.8). |
| Huebner MS | 05/07/13 | 2.6 | Attend meeting with potential investor regarding capital structure (2.1); post-meeting conversations with Blackstone regarding potential capital structures (0.5). |
| Immermann MC | 05/07/13 | 0.9 | Email correspondence relating to covenant question (0.7); call with W. Warner to discuss same (0.2). |
| Immermann MC | 05/08/13 | 1.3 | Call with Patriot team regarding covenant question (0.7); calls with W. Warner to discuss same (0.5); draft email to summarize advice to Patriot team (0.1). |
| Immermann MC | 05/10/13 | 1.0 | Research consignment question. |
| Warner W | 05/10/13 | 0.1 | Review issues regarding consignment agreements. |
| Immermann MC | 05/13/13 | 0.1 | Research consignment question. |
| Immermann MC | 05/14/13 | 0.8 | Discuss consignments with Davis Polk team (0.6); prepare mark-up of consignment agreement (0.2). |
| Warner W | 05/14/13 | 0.2 | Confer with M. Immermann regarding consignments of bolts and purchase money security issues. |
| Immermann MC | 05/20/13 | 0.1 | Respond to document request from Bankruptcy team. |
| Resnick BM | 05/21/13 | 0.2 | Call with S. Guttman (DIP Lender) regarding hearing. |
| Huebner MS | 05/22/13 | 0.9 | Conference calls with client group and Blackstone regarding financial projections (0.4); conversation with M. Buschmann regarding comments on finance deck (0.2); review and markup of finance deck (0.3). |

| | | | |
|------------------------------------|----------|-------------|--|
| Immermann MC | 05/23/13 | 0.1 | Email correspondence relating to permitted land swap. |
| Huebner MS | 05/27/13 | 0.1 | Emails regarding update call with potential investors. |
| Immermann MC | 05/29/13 | 0.2 | Review notice regarding partial release. |
| Huebner MS | 05/31/13 | 0.3 | Conversation with E. Moskowitz and B. Resnick and various emails regarding call with investors. |
| Immermann MC | 05/31/13 | 1.8 | Prepare supplement documents for new subsidiary. |
| Total FINANCING | | 16.4 | |
| GENERAL CASE ADMINISTRATION | | | |
| Coco KJ | 05/01/13 | 0.2 | Review docket and routing. |
| Jones RL | 05/01/13 | 0.4 | Review transcript per M. McGreal. |
| Law EC | 05/01/13 | 0.4 | Route pleadings (0.2); update docket files (0.1); communications with K. Coco regarding same (0.1). |
| Libby A | 05/01/13 | 0.1 | Review local rules. |
| Resnick BM | 05/01/13 | 0.3 | Correspond with M. McGreal, M. Huebner and K. Coco regarding various case issues. |
| Robertson C | 05/01/13 | 0.8 | Meet with M. McGreal and A. VanWagner to discuss U.S. Trustee's questions regarding second interim fee statement (0.5); research response to same (0.3). |
| Witty S | 05/01/13 | 1.0 | Conference call with M. Todd QC (0.5); emails with A. Starr and T. Coleman (0.5). |
| Coco KJ | 05/02/13 | 2.5 | Attend §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing telephonically. |
| Jones RL | 05/02/13 | 0.4 | Review documents/dockets 4/30/2013 transcript M. McGreal. |
| Resnick BM | 05/02/13 | 0.1 | Draft monthly operating report disclosure. |
| Robertson C | 05/02/13 | 0.5 | Respond to U.S. Trustee fee inquiries. |
| Coco KJ | 05/03/13 | 2.8 | Attend §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing telephonically (2.6); review docket and routing (0.2). |
| Huebner MS | 05/03/13 | 0.3 | Conversation with U.S. Trustee regarding various matters. |
| Jones RL | 05/03/13 | 0.4 | Review transcript per M. McGreal. |
| Law EC | 05/03/13 | 0.2 | Review filings on docket. |
| Libby A | 05/03/13 | 0.2 | Coordinate filing of updated master service lists and email with J. Demma regarding same. |
| McGreal MM | 05/03/13 | 0.1 | Confer with B. Resnick regarding monthly operating report. |
| Stewart R | 05/03/13 | 0.3 | Update case calendar per last week's docket entries. |
| McGreal MM | 05/04/13 | 0.6 | Revise notes to monthly operating report (0.5); correspondence with B. Resnick regarding same |

| | | | |
|--------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | (0.1). |
| Coco KJ | 05/06/13 | 0.7 | Emails with clients and Davis Polk team regarding monthly operating reports and related issues (0.4); review same (0.1); review docket and routing (0.2). |
| Huebner MS | 05/06/13 | 0.6 | Conversation with M. Scharf regarding global update on multiple Patriot issues. |
| Jones RL | 05/06/13 | 0.6 | Review documents and transcripts per M. McGreal. |
| Libby A | 05/06/13 | 1.3 | Review and comment on monthly operating report (0.9); confer with K. Coco regarding same (0.1); confirm figures in same with AlixPartners (0.1); confer with D. Silberger and K. Coco regarding insurance call (0.2). |
| McGreal MM | 05/06/13 | 0.3 | Correspondence with B. Resnick regarding monthly operating reports (0.1); revise notes to monthly operating reports (0.1); correspondence with J. Wubker and K. Coco regarding same (0.1). |
| Resnick BM | 05/06/13 | 0.2 | Review and revise monthly operating report disclaimer (0.1); emails regarding same (0.1). |
| Silberger DM | 05/06/13 | 0.2 | Call with E. Ryan from Afco regarding refund check. |
| Coco KJ | 05/07/13 | 1.6 | Review and revise monthly operating report (0.5); communications with clients and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.3); draft bullets for board meeting (0.7); emails with M. McGreal regarding same (0.1). |
| Libby A | 05/07/13 | 0.6 | Confer with K. Coco regarding monthly operating report and review same. |
| McGreal MM | 05/07/13 | 0.1 | Correspondence with B. Resnick regarding revised notes to monthly operating report. |
| Resnick BM | 05/07/13 | 0.3 | Calls with J. Bean regarding board presentation (0.1); review same (0.2). |
| Coco KJ | 05/08/13 | 0.8 | Revise board deck slides (0.5); call with H. Hiznay regarding notices and follow-up email regarding same (0.3). |
| Law EC | 05/08/13 | 0.3 | Route pleadings. |
| Libby A | 05/08/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with M. Russano and K. Coco regarding objection deadline analysis. |
| Coco KJ | 05/09/13 | 1.2 | Review monthly operating report (0.3); coordinate filing and service of same (0.3); prepare for matters for omnibus hearing on May 21 (0.6). |
| Estacio R | 05/09/13 | 0.2 | Correspond with R. Stewart regarding updating case calendar to include automatic stay deadlines. |

| | | | |
|-------------|----------|-----|---|
| Huebner MS | 05/09/13 | 0.5 | Conversation with L. Long regarding upcoming hearing, non-Davis Polk professional fee issues and brief conversation regarding Davis Polk fee issues. |
| Libby A | 05/09/13 | 0.9 | Review and comment on case calendar (0.2); review master service list and coordinate filing of same (0.4); correspondence with K. Coco regarding monthly operating report and coordinate filing of same (0.3). |
| McGreal MM | 05/09/13 | 0.6 | Review and comment on case calendar (0.2); correspondence with K. Coco and R. Stewart regarding same (0.1); review updated master service list filing (0.1); review monthly operating report (0.1); correspondence with K. Coco and J. Wubker regarding same (0.1). |
| Resnick BM | 05/09/13 | 1.5 | Calls with M. Huebner (including other team members) regarding various case issues (1.2); call with A. Starr regarding May 21 hearing (0.1); call with J. Martin and M. Huebner regarding same (0.2). |
| Stewart R | 05/09/13 | 1.5 | Update case calendar (0.6); finalize and file core parties service list (0.5); finalize and file March operating report (0.4). |
| Coco KJ | 05/10/13 | 1.7 | Attend weekly update call (1.0); emails with litigation team regarding drafting of proposed orders (0.3); review docket and routing (0.4). |
| Law EC | 05/10/13 | 0.2 | Review filings on docket and routings. |
| McGreal MM | 05/10/13 | 1.1 | Weekly update call with Company and advisors. |
| Resnick BM | 05/10/13 | 1.4 | Weekly update call with clients and co-advisors (0.9); meet with M. Huebner regarding various issues (0.4); call with J. Bean regarding various issues (0.1). |
| Stewart R | 05/10/13 | 0.3 | Route docket filings. |
| McGreal MM | 05/13/13 | 0.1 | Teleconference with A. Wong regarding agenda for May 21 hearing. |
| Resnick BM | 05/13/13 | 0.5 | Calls with J. Bean regarding various issues (0.3); correspondence with M. Huebner and M. McGreal regarding upcoming hearing (0.2). |
| Stewart R | 05/13/13 | 0.1 | Route docket filings. |
| Chapman MP | 05/14/13 | 0.3 | File objection to motion for relief from Automatic Stay. |
| Resnick BM | 05/14/13 | 0.2 | Review research regarding chapter 11 process issues. |
| Robertson C | 05/14/13 | 1.0 | Discuss preparation of second interim fee order with M. McGreal (0.2); discuss same with M. Chapman (0.2); review and revise same (0.5); |

| | | | |
|-------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | email regarding same to M. McGreal (0.1). |
| Stewart R | 05/14/13 | 2.6 | Draft preliminary agenda for May 21 hearing (1.9); route and file docket filings (0.7). |
| Coco KJ | 05/15/13 | 1.7 | Call with bankruptcy management committee (1.0); revise and coordinate drafting of preliminary agenda (0.5); communications with M. McGreal regarding fee application scheduling and other administrative matters (0.2). |
| Law EC | 05/15/13 | 0.8 | Route pleadings (0.3); update docket files (0.4); communications with K. Coco regarding same (0.1). |
| Libby A | 05/15/13 | 0.3 | Review and comment on April monthly operating report. |
| McGreal MM | 05/15/13 | 0.2 | Circulate required monthly reports to Unsecured Creditors' Committee and DIP counsel (0.1); correspondence with K. Coco regarding May 21 agenda (0.1). |
| Resnick BM | 05/15/13 | 0.3 | Call with J. Jones regarding non-Debtor strategy (0.2); call with B. Walsh regarding May 21 court hearing (0.1). |
| Robertson C | 05/15/13 | 0.9 | Emails with J. Jones regarding firms retained as ordinary course professionals (0.3); revise second interim fee order (0.6). |
| Stewart R | 05/15/13 | 1.3 | Revise and update preliminary agenda for May 21 hearing (0.9); route and file docket filings (0.4). |
| Coco KJ | 05/16/13 | 1.8 | Review and revise agenda (0.4); circulate same to Davis Polk team, Curtis Mallet and Bryan Cave (0.3); input comments to same (0.2); emails with clients regarding monthly operating report and provide comments (0.6); review and revise case calendar (0.3). |
| Huebner MS | 05/16/13 | 0.3 | Review and reply to approximately 50 miscellaneous Patriot emails on multiple topics accumulated during 2-day absence. |
| Jones RL | 05/16/13 | 2.0 | Review documents and dockets per E. Law. |
| Libby A | 05/16/13 | 0.7 | Review and comment on case calendar (0.2); meet with K. Coco and R. Stewart regarding litigation claims research and diligence assignment (0.3); discuss April monthly operating report with K. Coco and comment on same (0.2). |
| McGreal MM | 05/16/13 | 0.6 | Review and comment on hearing agenda (0.2); correspond with K. Coco regarding same (0.1); review April monthly operating report (0.1); review and comment on case calendar (0.2). |
| Resnick BM | 05/16/13 | 0.2 | Correspond with M. McGreal and others regarding May 21 hearing. |

| | | | |
|-------------|----------|-----|--|
| Stewart R | 05/16/13 | 1.3 | Finalize preliminary agenda for May 21 hearing (0.6); route and file docket filings (0.3); update case calendar (0.4). |
| Coco KJ | 05/17/13 | 1.7 | Review docket and routing (0.3); revise and coordinate filing and service of hearing agenda (0.5); weekly update call (0.9). |
| Huebner MS | 05/17/13 | 1.6 | Weekly all hands call with co-advisors and clients (0.9); catch up call with J. Bean regarding multiple strategic matters and next steps in case (0.5); review of agenda for upcoming hearing and internal Davis Polk emails regarding roles for same (0.2). |
| Jones RL | 05/17/13 | 5.5 | Review documents and dockets per E. Law. |
| Law EC | 05/17/13 | 0.4 | Review recent filings on docket. |
| Libby A | 05/17/13 | 0.1 | Coordinate filing of March monthly operating report. |
| McGreal MM | 05/17/13 | 0.1 | Review revised May 21 hearing agenda. |
| Moskowitz E | 05/17/13 | 2.0 | Participate in weekly update call. |
| Resnick BM | 05/17/13 | 0.9 | Weekly update call (0.7); meet with M. McGreal and K. Coco regarding various issues (0.2). |
| Stewart R | 05/17/13 | 1.5 | Prepare revised version of final agenda for May 21 hearing (0.4); send outlook reminders corresponding to recent calendar updates (0.4); file and route docket filings (0.7). |
| Coco KJ | 05/20/13 | 0.7 | Review agenda and coordinate filing of same (0.4); review docket and routing (0.3). |
| Huebner MS | 05/20/13 | 0.4 | Conversation with J. Bean regarding various matters. |
| Law EC | 05/20/13 | 0.3 | Review filings on docket. |
| McGreal MM | 05/20/13 | 0.3 | Review revised hearing agenda (0.1); correspond with K. Coco regarding same (0.1); correspond with B. Walsh, M. Russano, K. Coco and others regarding appearances at May 21 hearing (0.1). |
| Stewart R | 05/20/13 | 0.5 | Route docket filings (0.2); update and file agenda for May 21 hearing (0.3). |
| Coco KJ | 05/21/13 | 1.2 | Review docket and routing (0.2); attend hearing telephonically (1.0). |
| Huebner MS | 05/21/13 | 0.6 | Telephonic participation in omnibus hearing. |
| Law EC | 05/21/13 | 1.4 | Research fee letters precedents. |
| Libby A | 05/21/13 | 0.2 | Respond to press inquiry and confer with K. Coco regarding same. |
| Martin JD | 05/21/13 | 2.0 | Attend omnibus hearing and argue Payne-Gallatin and McGhee matters. |
| McGreal MM | 05/21/13 | 1.9 | Attend omnibus hearing telephonically (1.7); circulate required monthly reports (0.1); email A. Libby regarding amending schedules (0.1). |

| | | | |
|-------------|----------|-----|---|
| Mehes A | 05/21/13 | 1.1 | Telephonically attend omnibus hearing. |
| Moskowitz E | 05/21/13 | 1.5 | Review and revise bill. |
| Resnick BM | 05/21/13 | 0.7 | Discuss hearing and general case issues with M. Huebner, M. McGreal and E. Moskowitz. |
| Stewart R | 05/21/13 | 0.6 | Update case calendar and outlook invitations in regards to August 20 omnibus hearing and related deadlines. |
| Tobak MJ | 05/21/13 | 0.5 | Telephonically attend May 21 omnibus hearing. |
| Jones RL | 05/22/13 | 0.4 | Review documents/dockets 5/21/2013 transcript M. McGreal. |
| Libby A | 05/22/13 | 0.7 | Prepare notice of amended schedules and sofas (0.2), confer with S. Nesci regarding same (0.5). |
| McGreal MM | 05/22/13 | 0.2 | Review notice of amended schedules. |
| Resnick BM | 05/22/13 | 0.3 | Review 5/21 hearing transcript. |
| Stewart R | 05/22/13 | 0.3 | Route docket filings. |
| Coco KJ | 05/23/13 | 0.2 | Review docket and routing. |
| Law EC | 05/23/13 | 0.7 | Review recent filings on docket (0.5); communications with R. Stewart regarding notices reclassifying claims (0.2). |
| Libby A | 05/23/13 | 0.2 | Review and comment on case calendar. |
| McGreal MM | 05/23/13 | 0.4 | Review and revise case calendar (0.2); correspondence with R. Stewart regarding same (0.2). |
| Stewart R | 05/23/13 | 2.7 | Route docket filings (0.9); coordinate weekly update of case calendar (1.8). |
| Coco KJ | 05/24/13 | 0.8 | Attend weekly update call. |
| Libby A | 05/24/13 | 1.0 | Prepare notice of amended schedules and sofas (0.7); confer with S. Nesci regarding same and email same to M. McGreal (0.3). |
| McGreal MM | 05/24/13 | 0.8 | Weekly update call with Company and professionals (0.7); correspondence with K. Burlage and A. Libby regarding amending schedules (0.1). |
| Resnick BM | 05/24/13 | 1.1 | Meet with M. McGreal and K. Coco prior to update call (0.1); weekly update call with clients and co-advisors (0.8); discuss various issues with M. McGreal and K. Coco (0.2). |
| Stewart R | 05/24/13 | 0.5 | Route docket filings (0.1); create outlook invites for weekly calendar update (0.4). |
| Huebner MS | 05/28/13 | 0.3 | Review and reply to many miscellaneous Patriot emails. |
| Chapman MP | 05/29/13 | 0.5 | Emails with C. Robertson and B. Resnick regarding second interim fee application. |
| Coco KJ | 05/29/13 | 0.2 | Emails with A. Saavedra regarding June hearing. |
| Huebner MS | 05/29/13 | 0.3 | Conversations and emails with clients, Bryan Cave regarding safety issues. |

| | | | |
|--|----------|-------------|--|
| Law EC | 05/29/13 | 0.5 | Route pleadings (0.1); monitor docket (0.4). |
| Stewart R | 05/29/13 | 0.3 | Route docket filings. |
| Travers M | 05/29/13 | 1.1 | Review ruling on §§ 1113 and 1114 relief. |
| Coco KJ | 05/30/13 | 0.2 | Review select news articles. |
| FitzGerald ET | 05/30/13 | 0.8 | Analysis of actions to carry out medical benefit restructuring. |
| Law EC | 05/30/13 | 0.4 | Route pleadings (0.1); review recent filings on docket (0.3). |
| McGreal MM | 05/30/13 | 0.2 | Review and revise case calendar. |
| Resnick BM | 05/30/13 | 0.5 | Correspondence with M. Huebner, M. McGreal and K. Coco regarding preparation for weekly update call and general case issues (0.2); review Rhino letters (0.1); discuss same with K. Coco and M. Travers (0.2). |
| Stewart R | 05/30/13 | 0.5 | Weekly update of case calendar. |
| Turner AE | 05/30/13 | 0.1 | Review weekly case calendar. |
| Chapman MP | 05/31/13 | 0.7 | Research actual fees billed versus projected fees (0.5); email B. Resnick regarding same (0.2). |
| Coco KJ | 05/31/13 | 1.1 | Attend weekly update call. |
| Huebner MS | 05/31/13 | 0.5 | Participate in weekly update call with clients and co-advisors. |
| McGreal MM | 05/31/13 | 1.0 | Weekly update call with Company and advisors. |
| Resnick BM | 05/31/13 | 1.0 | Weekly update call with clients and co-advisors. |
| Stewart R | 05/31/13 | 0.4 | Create outlook invites related to weekly calendar update. |
| Total GENERAL CASE ADMINISTRATION | | 96.3 | |
| GOVERNANCE COMMUNICATIONS | | | |
| Huebner MS | 05/02/13 | 0.2 | Emails with J. Jones regarding upcoming board meetings. |
| Huebner MS | 05/06/13 | 0.4 | Emails with J. Jones regarding upcoming board meeting (0.1); emails with J. Bean, J. Jones and internal conversations regarding board materials for next week (0.3). |
| Huebner MS | 05/07/13 | 0.3 | Confer with J. Bean and J. Jones regarding board meeting. |
| McGreal MM | 05/07/13 | 1.9 | Prepare legal update presentation for Board (1.7); correspondence with B. Resnick, K. Coco and others regarding same (0.2). |
| McGreal MM | 05/08/13 | 0.1 | Correspondence with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding legal update presentation for Board. |
| McGreal MM | 05/09/13 | 0.1 | Correspondence with M. Huebner and K. Coco regarding memo to Board. |
| Huebner MS | 05/14/13 | 1.5 | Prepare for and attend Patriot board of directors |

| | | | |
|--|----------|------------|---|
| | | | meeting. |
| Huebner MS | 05/23/13 | 0.6 | Review and markup of communications materials and emails with J. Orf regarding same. |
| Huebner MS | 05/28/13 | 0.1 | Emails with M. Freitag regarding communications issues. |
| Huebner MS | 05/29/13 | 0.7 | Work with B. Hatfield on communications materials for §1113 ruling. |
| Resnick BM | 05/29/13 | 0.2 | Review media reports of §§ 1113 and 1114 decision. |
| Total GOVERNANCE COMMUNICATIONS | | 6.1 | |
| LITIGATION | | | |
| Starr AT | 05/01/13 | 1.4 | Calls with J. Adler and J. Shook regarding Bowles litigation (0.4); review Bowles settlement (0.5); conference call with S. Witty, M. Mattingly and M. Todd regarding Bridgehouse legal issues (0.5). |
| Resnick BM | 05/06/13 | 0.1 | Call with A. Starr regarding potential resolution of litigation. |
| Starr AT | 05/07/13 | 0.7 | Emails and calls with E. Waller, J. Shook and H. Lawrence regarding bankruptcy rules relating to settlement. |
| Huebner MS | 05/08/13 | 0.9 | Emails and calls with E. Moskowitz, J. Bean and B. Hatfield regarding confidential litigation issues. |
| Martin JD | 05/08/13 | 0.3 | Emails with K. Coco and others regarding RoyaltyCo claim. |
| Resnick BM | 05/08/13 | 0.1 | Review and revise provision of adversary proceeding settlement. |
| Starr AT | 05/08/13 | 0.7 | Review injunction briefs in Bridgehouse matter (0.4); emails to J. Jones, M. Mattingly, A. Wong and J. Wagner regarding the same (0.3). |
| Resnick BM | 05/09/13 | 0.2 | Review adversary proceeding settlement. |
| Halford EB | 05/10/13 | 0.3 | Search the bluebook for citation formatting information for provision from the Kentucky Uniform Commercial Code (0.1); respond to associate citation formatting question (0.2). |
| Martin JD | 05/10/13 | 0.5 | Communications with K. Coco regarding RoyaltyCo settlement. |
| Starr AT | 05/15/13 | 0.2 | Emails with J. Jones and E. Waller regarding indemnification of employees relating to employee termination litigation. |
| Mehes A | 05/16/13 | 0.1 | Review and update case calendar. |
| Starr AT | 05/16/13 | 0.9 | Review correspondence with insurer regarding employee litigation (0.4); conference call with J. |

| | | | |
|--------------------------|----------|------------|--|
| | | | Jones R. Mead and E. Waller regarding indemnification and insurance regarding employee litigation (0.5). |
| Starr AT | 05/21/13 | 0.3 | Emails with J. Jones, A. Wong and J. Wagner regarding Bridgehouse order. |
| Huebner MS | 05/28/13 | 0.4 | Conversations with E. Moskowitz and J. Bean regarding litigation settlement issues. |
| Huebner MS | 05/29/13 | 0.4 | Emails with clients regarding confidential litigation issues (0.2); conversation with B. Hatfield regarding same (0.2). |
| Starr AT | 05/29/13 | 0.5 | Review Bridgehouse summary judgment motions (0.3); emails to A. Wong and J. Wagner regarding the same (0.2). |
| Huebner MS | 05/31/13 | 0.3 | Emails with B. Kaminetzky, M. Russano and E. Moskowitz regarding confidential litigation matter (0.2); conversation with E. Moskowitz and B. Resnick regarding same (0.1). |
| Total LITIGATION | | 8.3 | |
| NON-DPW RETENTION | | | |
| Robertson C | 05/03/13 | 0.5 | Review and file AP Services' March staffing report on behalf of AP Services (0.3); review and file Curtis' February fee statement on behalf of Curtis (0.2). |
| Chapman MP | 05/06/13 | 1.5 | Review and update ordinary course professionals report per K. Coco. |
| Coco KJ | 05/06/13 | 0.5 | Review draft ordinary course professionals report (0.3); emails with clients and Davis Polk team regarding same (0.2). |
| McGreal MM | 05/06/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with K. Coco regarding quarterly ordinary course professional report (0.1); review and comment on same (0.1). |
| Robertson C | 05/06/13 | 0.1 | Email J. Jones regarding Greenberg Traurig retention. |
| Coco KJ | 05/07/13 | 0.5 | Review and revise ordinary course professionals report and communications with clients regarding same. |
| Chapman MP | 05/09/13 | 0.5 | Revise quarterly ordinary course professional report (0.3); file same (0.2). |
| Krause SC | 05/09/13 | 0.3 | Emails regarding Greenberg Traurig retention. |
| McGreal MM | 05/09/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with M. Huebner and K. Coco regarding ordinary course professionals (0.1); review ordinary course professional quarterly report (0.1). |
| Robertson C | 05/09/13 | 0.2 | Emails with J. Jones, C. Coco and D. Eastlake regarding Greenberg Traurig retention. |

| | | | |
|--------------|----------|-----|---|
| McGreal MM | 05/13/13 | 0.1 | Teleconference with J. Jones regarding retention of ordinary course professional. |
| Huebner MS | 05/14/13 | 0.1 | Conversation with L. Long (U.S. Trustee) regarding omnibus fee order for next week's hearing. |
| Robertson C | 05/14/13 | 0.7 | Call with R. Rosenthal at Greenberg Traurig to discuss parties in interest for conflicts purposes (0.2); conduct follow up research on certain parties (0.5). |
| VanWagner AB | 05/14/13 | 0.6 | Discuss parties-in-interest issues with C. Robertson in connection with Greenberg Traurig retention. |
| Coco KJ | 05/15/13 | 0.3 | Emails with Davis Polk team and Greenberg Traurig regarding Greenberg Traurig retention. |
| Krause SC | 05/15/13 | 0.3 | Emails with J. Jones and C. Robertson regarding approved ordinary course professional firms. |
| Robertson C | 05/15/13 | 1.7 | Emails with R. Rosenthal regarding parties in interest (0.6); discuss parties in interest with A. VanWagner (0.3); email to D. Eastlake regarding Greenberg Traurig retention application (0.4); discuss same with C. Coco and S. Krause (0.2); emails with G. Ford at Jackson Kelly regarding interim fee hearing (0.2). |
| VanWagner AB | 05/15/13 | 0.3 | Discuss parties-in-interest issues with C. Robertson in connection with Greenberg Traurig retention. |
| Robertson C | 05/16/13 | 0.1 | Email to J. Chincheck at Bowles Rice regarding appearance at interim fee hearing. |
| Robertson C | 05/17/13 | 0.7 | Emails to retained professionals regarding telephonic appearances at hearing (0.3); email to G. Ford regarding same (0.1); call with M. Buschmann regarding same (0.1); call with L. Peterson regarding same (0.2). |
| Chapman MP | 05/20/13 | 1.0 | Review and file Jackson Kelly monthly fee statement (0.3); review and file Ernst and Young monthly fee statement (0.3); emails with A. Wiener regarding same (0.1); review and file Steptoe and Johnson fee statement (0.3). |
| Robertson C | 05/20/13 | 0.1 | Email to D. Eastlake regarding Greenberg Traurig retention application. |
| Coco KJ | 05/21/13 | 0.5 | Call with C. Robertson and emails with clients regarding Greenberg Traurig retention application issues. |
| Krause SC | 05/21/13 | 0.6 | Emails with C. Robertson regarding Greenberg Traurig retention application (0.1); review same (0.3); confer with C. Robertson regarding same |

| | | | |
|-------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | (0.2). |
| Robertson C | 05/21/13 | 2.6 | Review draft Greenberg Traurig retention application received from Greenberg Traurig (0.4); discuss same with S. Krause (0.3); mark up draft and circulate same to Greenberg Traurig (1.4); email to Desai Eggmann regarding payment information (0.2); review proposed fee order to address comments from Kramer Levin and discuss same with M. McGreal (0.3). |
| Coco KJ | 05/22/13 | 0.4 | Review Greenberg Traurig retention application. |
| Krause SC | 05/22/13 | 0.8 | Confer with C. Robertson regarding Greenberg Traurig retention (0.2); emails regarding same (0.4); review application (0.2). |
| Robertson C | 05/22/13 | 1.9 | Call with D. Eastlake to discuss Greenberg Traurig application (0.4); discuss same with S. Krause (0.3); revise same and circulate to Greenberg Traurig (0.8); review Stahl Cowen fee applications and email M. McGreal regarding same (0.3); draft email regarding fee hearing to H. Hiznay (0.1). |
| Chapman MP | 05/23/13 | 1.1 | Review fees and expenses of Desai Eggmann and Stahl Cowen per M. McGreal (0.8); file Bowles Rice eighth monthly fee statement (0.3). |
| Robertson C | 05/23/13 | 1.5 | Email to J. Jones regarding payment of interim fees (0.1); email to J. Jones regarding Desai Eggmann payment information (0.1); email to K. LaBrada regarding payment of Cole Schotz fees and expenses (0.1); circulate Greenberg Traurig application to company (0.2); incorporate company's comments and revise drafts (0.8); discuss same with M. McGreal and S. Krause (0.2). |
| Chapman MP | 05/24/13 | 0.4 | Review fees and expenses of Bryan Cave per C. Robertson. |
| Coco KJ | 05/24/13 | 0.5 | Emails with Davis Polk team and review documents in connection with Greenberg Traurig retention application. |
| Krause SC | 05/24/13 | 0.5 | Call with Greenberg Traurig regarding retention (0.2); call with C. Robertson regarding same (0.1); emails regarding same (0.2). |
| Robertson C | 05/24/13 | 1.8 | Emails with J. Jones, R. Mead and J. Linden regarding Greenberg Traurig retention application (0.4); research regarding precedent fee applications for J. Jones (0.2); provide comments on Greenberg Traurig application to D. Eastlake (0.3); coordinate with D. Eastlake regarding |

| | | | |
|--------------------------------|----------|-------------|---|
| | | | production of for-filing version of application (0.2); review schedule of fees to be paid to various retained professionals as per J. Jones (0.7). |
| Chapman MP | 05/28/13 | 1.1 | Prepare Greenberg Traurig retention application for filing (0.5); confer with M. McGreal and C. Robertson regarding same (0.3); file same (0.3). |
| Coco KJ | 05/28/13 | 1.0 | Coordinate review, revision and filing of Greenberg Traurig retention application. |
| Krause SC | 05/28/13 | 0.3 | Emails regarding Greenberg Traurig retention. |
| McGreal MM | 05/28/13 | 0.6 | Review and comment on Greenberg Traurig retention application (0.4); correspondence with K. Coco and C. Robertson regarding same (0.2). |
| Robertson C | 05/28/13 | 0.9 | Discuss Greenberg Traurig application with K. Coco (0.2); revise application (0.3); circulate revisions to Greenberg Traurig (0.2); coordinate filing of application with M. Chapman (0.2). |
| Chapman MP | 05/30/13 | 0.4 | File Bowles Rice ninth monthly fee statement and email J. Chincheck regarding same. |
| Resnick BM | 05/30/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with J. Bean and E. Moskowitz regarding S. Schwartz retention. |
| Total NON-DPW RETENTION | | 27.6 | |
| NON-WORKING TRAVEL | | | |
| Huebner MS | 05/01/13 | 2.1 | Non-working travel time from trial in St Louis to New York. |
| Hakimzadeh S | 05/02/13 | 5.5 | Travel from St. Louis back to New York City. |
| Loss DM | 05/02/13 | 4.9 | Return travel from trial in St. Louis. |
| Russano MJ | 05/02/13 | 6.9 | Travel to New York from §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing. |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/02/13 | 5.0 | Travel to St. Louis for §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing. |
| Cavaiuolo JA | 05/03/13 | 8.0 | Travel from NY to St Louis. |
| Martin JD | 05/03/13 | 3.5 | Travel from St. Louis to New York. |
| Sokoloff EA | 05/03/13 | 6.3 | Travel from §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing in St. Louis to New York. |
| Vora A | 05/03/13 | 5.0 | Return trip to New York from hearing in St. Louis. |
| Estacio R | 05/04/13 | 5.3 | Travel from St. Louis §§ 1113 and 1114 trial to NYC. |
| Eum JS | 05/04/13 | 6.3 | Return to New York from St. Louis. |
| Gehring AS | 05/04/13 | 4.8 | Travel from St. Louis to New York. |
| Glazer E | 05/04/13 | 4.7 | Travel from St. Louis to New York following §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing. |
| Cavaiuolo JA | 05/05/13 | 5.0 | Travel from St Louis to NY. |
| Kaminetzky BS | 05/05/13 | 4.6 | Travel from St. Louis to New Jersey. |

| | | | |
|----------------------------------|----------|-------------|---|
| Harrington M | 05/06/13 | 4.8 | Travel from St. Louis, MO to Newark, NJ. |
| Martin JD | 05/20/13 | 2.0 | Travel to St. Louis for omnibus hearing. |
| Martin JD | 05/21/13 | 3.0 | Travel from St. Louis to New York following omnibus hearing. |
| Total NON-WORKING TRAVEL | | 87.7 | |
| PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT | | | |
| Huebner MS | 05/01/13 | 0.2 | Conversation with F. Huffard regarding bondholder non-disclosure agreement. |
| Libby A | 05/02/13 | 1.3 | Research precedent plans of reorganization and email M. McGreal and K. Coco regarding same. |
| Resnick BM | 05/02/13 | 0.3 | Call with M. Travers regarding non-disclosure agreement (0.2); review same (0.1). |
| Resnick BM | 05/03/13 | 0.9 | Correspond with counterparty and J. Bean regarding non-disclosure agreement (0.6); revise same (0.3). |
| Huebner MS | 05/06/13 | 0.8 | Conference calls with F. Huffard, M. Buschmann and B. Resnick regarding recharacterization and substantive consolidation issues. |
| Resnick BM | 05/06/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with counterparty, J. Bean and Blackstone regarding non-disclosure agreement. |
| Resnick BM | 05/06/13 | 0.8 | Call with Blackstone and M. Huebner regarding substantive consolidation and recharacterization (0.4); follow-up emails and research regarding same (0.4). |
| Travers M | 05/06/13 | 0.3 | Emails with Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel regarding bondholder non-disclosure agreement. |
| Resnick BM | 05/07/13 | 2.8 | Review research regarding substantive consolidation and recharacterization (1.0); draft talking points regarding same (0.8); call with Blackstone and K. Hiltz regarding same (0.5); meet with M. Huebner regarding plan issues (0.2); call with M. Buschmann regarding same (0.2); emails with J. Jones regarding corporate restructuring (0.1). |
| Silberger DM | 05/07/13 | 2.1 | Research filings for plan structure issues. |
| Coco KJ | 05/08/13 | 1.5 | Review and revise plan memo. |
| Coco KJ | 05/08/13 | 0.3 | Emails with E. Glazer regarding non-disclosure agreement questions. |
| Huebner MS | 05/08/13 | 3.4 | Meet with Blackstone regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee call on recharacterization and subordination (0.7); call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee advisors regarding same |

| | | | |
|--------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | (1.1); confer with J. Bean regarding plan process and related issues (0.3); review and markup of plan memo and timeline and edits of same (1.3). |
| Resnick BM | 05/08/13 | 1.9 | Prepare for call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee advisors (0.7); call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee advisors (1.2). |
| Resnick BM | 05/08/13 | 0.8 | Call with M. Buschmann regarding bondholder proposal (0.3); draft email summary regarding same (0.3); review plan summary (0.2). |
| Silberger DM | 05/08/13 | 0.6 | Information sharing conference call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee. |
| Travers M | 05/08/13 | 0.2 | Email Patriot team regarding bondholder non-disclosure agreement. |
| Coco KJ | 05/09/13 | 2.2 | Meet with B. Resnick and others regarding plan issues (1.0); meet with M. McGreal regarding various plan research issues (0.5); meet with R. Stewart and analysis regarding disclosure statement motions and documentation (0.3); meet with D. Silberger and coordinate regarding disclosure statement issues (0.4). |
| Ferrell KL | 05/09/13 | 0.8 | Review bondholder proposal. |
| Huebner MS | 05/09/13 | 0.6 | Calls with Blackstone and B. Resnick regarding various plan-related matters and structuring issues. |
| Matlock TL | 05/09/13 | 1.4 | Discuss plan proposal with C. Phillips (0.4); review same (0.4); research tax consequences of same (0.6). |
| McGreal MM | 05/09/13 | 1.2 | Teleconference with M. Huebner, B. Resnick and others regarding plan process (0.8); correspondence with D. Klein regarding same (0.2); confer with K. Coco regarding same (0.2). |
| Phillips CA | 05/09/13 | 1.0 | Consider tax issues in connection with plan (0.5); confer with T. Matlock regarding same (0.4); confer with B. Resnick regarding same (0.1). |
| Resnick BM | 05/09/13 | 1.3 | Call with S. Hessler regarding plan proposal (0.2); call with J. Jones regarding plan restructuring (0.2); call with M. Huebner and F. Huffard regarding plan structuring issues (0.4); call with C. Phillips regarding plan tax issues (0.2); review research regarding same (0.3). |
| Silberger DM | 05/09/13 | 1.2 | Meet with B. Resnick, M. McGreal and K. Coco regarding plan structure issues (1.0); meet with K. Coco regarding disclosure statement (0.2). |
| Travers M | 05/09/13 | 0.2 | Call with M. Buschmann regarding bondholder non-disclosure agreement and disclosure of reserve information. |

| | | | |
|--------------|----------|-----|---|
| Coco KJ | 05/10/13 | 1.5 | Review plan structure and exit financing issues, proposals and documentation. |
| Huebner MS | 05/10/13 | 1.4 | Review of term sheet from financier and emails with clients regarding same. |
| Matlock TL | 05/10/13 | 2.7 | Research consequences of proposed plan (1.6); discuss same with C. Phillips (0.2); email C. Phillips regarding same (0.3); review proposed plan (0.6). |
| McGreal MM | 05/10/13 | 0.2 | Review term sheet from potential investor. |
| Phillips CA | 05/10/13 | 0.6 | Emails with T. Matlock regarding plan proposal (0.3); confer with T. Matlock regarding same (0.2); confer with B. Resnick regarding same (0.1). |
| Resnick BM | 05/10/13 | 1.1 | Call with clients and Blackstone regarding bondholder proposal (0.6); call with S. Hessler regarding same (0.1); call with M. Travers regarding same and other issues (0.3); call with J. Jones regarding corporate restructuring (0.1). |
| Silberger DM | 05/10/13 | 2.2 | Revise disclosure statement documents (1.3); research on plan structure issues (0.9). |
| Stewart R | 05/10/13 | 2.1 | Review precedent motions to approve disclosure statement, solicitation procedures and related proposed orders. |
| Travers M | 05/10/13 | 0.3 | Emails regarding non-disclosure agreement for use with prospective third-party investors. |
| Travers M | 05/10/13 | 0.3 | Call with B. Resnick regarding bondholder term sheet. |
| Resnick BM | 05/11/13 | 0.6 | Review sponsor plan proposal (0.3); review Blackstone summary of same (0.3). |
| Resnick BM | 05/12/13 | 0.7 | Call with Blackstone regarding summary of plan proposal (0.5); review revised draft of same (0.2). |
| Travers M | 05/12/13 | 1.2 | Review bondholder term sheet (0.8); review Blackstone slides regarding bondholder proposal (0.3); email B. Resnick regarding bondholder term sheet (0.1). |
| Coco KJ | 05/13/13 | 2.0 | Research plan investment transaction and plan issues (1.3); communications with A. Libby regarding plan-related motions drafting (0.3); review board of directors memo (0.3); call with A. Libby regarding disclosure statement issues (0.1). |
| Ferrell KL | 05/13/13 | 0.7 | Review bondholder proposal. |
| Law EC | 05/13/13 | 7.9 | Research regarding plan investment transaction (3.2); obtain and assemble documents regarding same (2.3); review background materials regarding same (0.9); draft tracker chart regarding |

| | | | |
|-------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | same (1.3); communications with M. McGreal and A. Libby regarding same (0.2). |
| Libby A | 05/13/13 | 3.0 | Review disclosure statement documents (0.3); call with D. Silberger regarding disclosure statement research and status (0.1); discuss board of director research with R. Stewart (0.2); correspondence with K. Coco regarding same (0.1); draft motion to approve plan-related documents (1.5); research regarding same (0.8). |
| McGreal MM | 05/13/13 | 1.7 | Review precedent plan and disclosure statement related materials (0.9); correspondence with E. Law regarding same (0.1); confer with K. Coco regarding same (0.2); review proposal from potential investor (0.2); correspondence with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding same (0.2). |
| Phillips CA | 05/13/13 | 1.6 | Review proposed term sheet (0.5); confer with K. Ferrell regarding same (0.6); confer with B. Resnick regarding same (0.5). |
| Resnick BM | 05/13/13 | 2.6 | Correspondence with M. Huebner, M. Travers, M. McGreal and others regarding bondholder proposal and Blackstone summary thereof (1.4); emails with G. Crandall regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. Travers regarding same (0.2); correspondence with Blackstone team regarding same (0.3); correspondence with M. Huebner, M. McGreal and K. Coco regarding plan and disclosure statement issues (0.6). |
| Stewart R | 05/13/13 | 4.6 | Research board of directors issues (2.9); review motions to approve disclosure statement, solicitation procedures and related proposed orders in precedent cases (1.7). |
| Travers M | 05/13/13 | 0.2 | Emails with Unsecured Creditors' Committee counsel and Blackstone regarding bondholder non-disclosure agreement. |
| Coco KJ | 05/14/13 | 1.5 | Review and comment on plan workstreams chart (0.8); review plan-related precedents and term sheet (0.7). |
| Law EC | 05/14/13 | 5.1 | Research regarding plan-related motions (1.9); obtain and assemble documents regarding same (0.8); numerous calls and emails with A. Libby regarding same (0.2); research regarding plan investment transaction (1.1); obtain and assemble documents regarding same (0.4); draft tracker chart regarding same (0.4); communications with M. McGreal and A. Libby regarding same (0.3). |
| Libby A | 05/14/13 | 3.2 | Research plan-related motion (1.3); draft same |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | (1.0); draft proposed order on same (0.5); draft motion to expedite hearing on same (0.3); confer with K. Coco regarding same (0.1). |
| McGreal MM | 05/14/13 | 2.8 | Draft plan workstreams chart (1.9); correspondence with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding same (0.3); teleconference with M. Huebner, B. Resnick and M. Travers regarding plan proposal from potential investor (0.4); conferences with M. Huebner and B. Resnick regarding same (0.2). |
| Resnick BM | 05/14/13 | 3.0 | Correspondence with Blackstone and Davis Polk team regarding bondholder proposal (1.8); call with S. Hessler regarding same (0.2); emails with G. Crandall regarding same (0.1); correspondence with M. McGreal and M. Huebner regarding plan and disclosure statement preparation issues (0.9). |
| Stewart R | 05/14/13 | 5.3 | Locate precedents for disclosure statement-related motions (0.6); research board composition precedents (4.7). |
| Travers M | 05/14/13 | 0.6 | Call with M. Huebner and B. Resnick regarding bondholder term sheet for plan investment transaction. |
| Coco KJ | 05/15/13 | 2.1 | Call with Blackstone regarding plan-related issues (0.6); discuss disclosure statement issues with Davis Polk team (0.5); call with company regarding potential investment proposal (1.0). |
| Law EC | 05/15/13 | 1.7 | Research regarding plan precedents. |
| Libby A | 05/15/13 | 1.3 | Review precedent disclosure statements regarding required company information (0.8); confer with K. Coco regarding same (0.5). |
| McGreal MM | 05/15/13 | 2.4 | Teleconference with Blackstone, B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding proposed plan term sheet from potential investors (0.7); teleconference with Company, Blackstone, B. Resnick and others regarding same (0.8); draft email with issues list regarding same (0.4); correspondence with B. Resnick, M. Travers and others regarding same (0.2); revise plan workstreams chart (0.3). |
| Resnick BM | 05/15/13 | 2.8 | Call with Blackstone team regarding investment term sheet and plan strategy (0.6); review plan workstreams chart (0.2); draft response to investment term sheet (1.0); call with senior management and co-advisors regarding same (1.0). |
| Travers M | 05/15/13 | 0.6 | Emails regarding Annex A to bondholder non-disclosure agreement (0.4); draft new language |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | for Annex A to non-disclosure agreement (0.2). |
| Travers M | 05/15/13 | 2.1 | Call with Blackstone team regarding bondholder term sheet (0.6); call with Patriot management and Blackstone regarding bondholder term sheet (0.7); discuss bondholder proposal with B. Choi (0.4); review draft comments on bondholder term sheet (0.4). |
| Choi B | 05/16/13 | 8.6 | Review plan-related precedents (3.0); confer with bondholder and Patriot (0.8); confer with Davis Polk team regarding same (0.5); confer with M. Travers regarding same (0.9); review and revise term sheet (3.4). |
| Coco KJ | 05/16/13 | 4.0 | Call with potential investors, company and advisors regarding potential plan investment transaction (1.0); follow-up meeting with M. McGreal regarding same (0.2); drafting in connection with same (0.8); review precedents for plan and investment-related documents (0.7); drafting in connection with same (1.3). |
| Law EC | 05/16/13 | 4.9 | Obtain precedents of plan investment agreements (1.1); research plan-related documents (2.5); assemble additional documents regarding same (0.9); numerous emails and calls with M. McGreal, K. Coco and A. Libby regarding same (0.4). |
| Libby A | 05/16/13 | 1.2 | Review disclosure statement-related documents (0.4); research content of disclosure statements (0.5); discuss plan-related documents with K. Coco and research regarding same (0.3). |
| McGreal MM | 05/16/13 | 3.9 | Teleconference with Company, Blackstone, potential investor and others regarding term sheet (0.8); teleconference with Company, Blackstone, B. Resnick and others regarding same (0.2); teleconference with B. Resnick, M. Travers, K. Coco and others regarding same (0.2); revise proposed term sheet (1.6); correspond with B. Resnick and K. Coco regarding same (0.4); review precedent term sheets (0.6); correspond with B. Choi regarding same (0.1). |
| Resnick BM | 05/16/13 | 4.1 | Calls with F. Huffard, M. Buschmann and A. Schlesinger regarding term sheet and negotiation strategy regarding same (1.2); call with J. Lushefski and J. Bean regarding same (0.3); calls with M. Travers and B. Choi regarding same (0.8); call with bondholder team regarding restructuring term sheet (0.8); review revised |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | term sheet (0.7); calls with K. Coco regarding same (0.3). |
| Resnick BM | 05/16/13 | 0.2 | Emails with Unsecured Creditors' Committee and clients regarding non-disclosure agreement. |
| Travers M | 05/16/13 | 3.7 | Call with B. Choi to discuss bondholder proposal and negotiations (0.6); review precedents regarding registration rights and resales of restricted securities (1.1); revise registration rights section of bondholder term sheet (0.3); discuss changes to bondholder term sheet with B. Choi (0.4); internal restructuring discussion with J. Jones (0.5); call with bondholder and their counsel regarding bondholder plan investment transaction term sheet proposal (0.8). |
| Choi B | 05/17/13 | 1.9 | Call with B. Resnick regarding term sheet (0.2); confer with bondholder counsel and Davis Polk team regarding same (1.0); confer with B. Resnick and M. Travers regarding same (0.5); circulate precedent language for same (0.2). |
| Coco KJ | 05/17/13 | 3.0 | Review and revise term sheet for potential transaction (0.8); call with S. Hessler regarding same (1.0); research precedents and case law regarding same (0.8); review and comment on disclosure statement-related documents (0.4). |
| Cowen AL | 05/17/13 | 2.0 | Research precedent regarding disclosure statement issue. |
| Law EC | 05/17/13 | 3.4 | Review and organize precedent files from plan research (3.1); numerous communications with K. Coco and R. Jones regarding same (0.3). |
| Libby A | 05/17/13 | 1.4 | Draft plan-related document (0.2); research regarding same (1.2). |
| McGreal MM | 05/17/13 | 0.2 | Review revised proposed investment term sheet. |
| Resnick BM | 05/17/13 | 6.7 | Correspondence with senior management and Blackstone regarding term sheet (2.8); call with bondholder team regarding same (0.5); meet with M. Huebner regarding same (0.2); calls with Travers and B. Choi regarding same (0.5); correspondence with S. Hessler regarding same (0.2); review, revise and distribute same (2.5). |
| Stewart R | 05/17/13 | 3.5 | Research board of directors selection issues. |
| Travers M | 05/17/13 | 1.6 | Review non-disclosure agreement markup (0.2); discuss non-disclosure agreement with J. Bean (0.3); review potential term sheet markup (0.2); confer with B. Resnick regarding term sheet (0.7); finalize non-disclosure agreement (0.2). |
| Coco KJ | 05/18/13 | 0.5 | Review and comment on disclosure statement- |

| | | | |
|------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | related documents. |
| Resnick BM | 05/19/13 | 0.9 | Call with S. Hessler regarding bondholder's comments to term sheet (0.3); email to clients regarding same (0.2); review precedent investment transaction chart (0.2); emails with M. Huebner, K. Coco and M. McGreal regarding same (0.2). |
| Coco KJ | 05/20/13 | 5.4 | Emails with Davis Polk team regarding possible investment documentation (0.2); draft chart of certain aspects of same (0.3); review and revise term sheet for possible investment (0.8); emails with R. Stewart regarding precedent research regarding same and analysis of same (2.9); omnibus meeting with B. Resnick and others regarding preparation of various plan and disclosure statement-related documents (0.6); meet with M. McGreal and others regarding same and follow-up coordination with Davis Polk team (0.6). |
| Cowen AL | 05/20/13 | 3.8 | Research precedent bankruptcy for disclosure statement (2.7); meet with B. Resnick, K. Coco and M. McGreal to go over next steps for plan-related research (0.3); review precedent for disclosure statement issues (0.8). |
| Huebner MS | 05/20/13 | 0.9 | Review of plan investment precedents and brief conversation with B. Resnick regarding same (0.3); conversations and emails with B. Resnick and Blackstone regarding potential investor issues (0.6). |
| Law EC | 05/20/13 | 2.8 | Research regarding plan investment transactions (2.7); communications with K. Coco regarding same (0.1). |
| Libby A | 05/20/13 | 4.0 | Meet with B. Resnick, M. McGreal, K. Coco, R. Stewart and D. Silberger regarding plan and disclosure statement process (0.4); follow-up meeting with M. McGreal, K. Coco, R. Stewart and D. Silberger regarding same (0.2); draft and revise plan-related document (3.4). |
| McGreal MM | 05/20/13 | 1.8 | Confer with B. Resnick, K. Coco and others regarding plan proposal from potential investor (0.4); review revised term sheet from potential investor (0.4); confer with K. Coco regarding same (0.6); confer with K. Coco, A. Libby, D. Silberger and others regarding same (0.4). |
| Resnick BM | 05/20/13 | 2.8 | Call with M. Buschmann regarding term sheet (0.2); review and revise term sheet (0.8); calls |

| | | | |
|--------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | with M. Travers regarding same (0.5); call with E. Moskowitz regarding same (particularly with respect to multi-employer pension plan issue) (0.3); meet with Davis Polk team to discuss plan process (0.3); review precedent plan investments (0.7). |
| Silberger DM | 05/20/13 | 4.8 | Meet with B. Resnick, M. McGreal, K. Coco, A. Libby and R. Stewart regarding timelines for plan and disclosure statement documents (0.4); follow-up meeting with K. Coco, M. McGreal and R. Stewart regarding same (0.5); research on timelines of analogous precedent plan and disclosure statement processes (3.9). |
| Stewart R | 05/20/13 | 6.8 | Meet with B. Resnick, M. McGreal, K. Coco, D. Silberger and A. Libby to discuss process for plan research (0.2); meet with M. McGreal, K. Coco and A. Libby to receive assignment regarding review of plan precedents (0.5); summarize timeline of plan approval process in precedents (1.4); locate and summarize relevant language from precedent plan-related documents (2.1); continue research of the composition of boards of directors in precedent mega-cases (2.6). |
| Coco KJ | 05/21/13 | 8.0 | Review plan-related documents and meet with A. Libby regarding same (4.3); research related to same in connection with Chemtura case (0.8); pre-call with B. Resnick regarding term sheet from potential investor (0.3); call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding same (1.5); second review of plan-related documents (1.1). |
| Cowen AL | 05/21/13 | 0.3 | Call with K. Coco regarding precedent plan support documents (0.2); edit same (0.1). |
| Huebner MS | 05/21/13 | 1.6 | Call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee regarding potential investor terms (1.0); confer with Blackstone regarding same (0.6). |
| Libby A | 05/21/13 | 4.9 | Draft and revise plan-related document (4.7); meet with K. Coco to discuss same (0.2). |
| McGreal MM | 05/21/13 | 3.3 | Teleconference with Kramer Levin, Houlihan, M. Huebner and others regarding term sheet from potential investor (0.9); draft email to Company regarding same (0.3); review and revise chart of precedent term sheets (0.8); confer with B. Resnick, K. Coco and others regarding same (0.2); correspondence with K. Coco, D. Silberger and R. Stewart regarding same (0.3); review precedent plan materials (0.8). |

| | | | |
|--------------|----------|-----|---|
| Resnick BM | 05/21/13 | 2.0 | Call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee advisors regarding term sheet (1.0); review precedent term sheets (0.7); email to clients regarding Unsecured Creditors' Committee comments to term sheet (0.3). |
| Silberger DM | 05/21/13 | 6.6 | Research plan process in connection with plan structure negotiations (6.1); meet with B. Resnick, M. McGreal, K. Coco and R. Stewart regarding preparation for Unsecured Creditors' Committee call (0.5). |
| Stewart R | 05/21/13 | 7.4 | Locate and summarize relevant sections of precedent plan-related agreements (1.7); create timeline of precedent plan approval process (1.8); locate and summarize relevant language from precedent plan documents (2.1); create chart digesting relevant language from five precedent cases (1.3); prepare for meeting with B. Resnick (0.3); meet with B. Resnick, M. McGreal, K. Coco and D. Silberger to discuss findings (0.2). |
| Travers M | 05/21/13 | 1.4 | Conference call with B. Resnick and others to discuss bondholder term sheet (1.0); review bondholders' counsel's comments to bondholder term sheet (0.4). |
| Choi B | 05/22/13 | 0.1 | Review correspondence regarding bondholder proposal. |
| Coco KJ | 05/22/13 | 5.7 | Review and revise plan-related documents (4.4); discuss same with Davis Polk team (0.4); review precedents in connection with same (0.9). |
| Libby A | 05/22/13 | 2.8 | Draft and revise plan-related agreement (2.6); meet with K. Coco regarding issues concerning same (0.2). |
| McGreal MM | 05/22/13 | 2.9 | Review and comment on plan documents (1.9); correspondence with K. Coco and A. Libby regarding same (0.4); review precedent plan documents (0.6). |
| Resnick BM | 05/22/13 | 1.5 | Call with Blackstone and senior management regarding business plan (0.4); review research regarding plan issues (0.5); review memo regarding tax claim analysis (0.3); correspondence with K. Coco and M. McGreal regarding same (0.2); call with S. Hessler regarding status update (0.1). |
| Stewart R | 05/22/13 | 4.6 | Locate and summarize relevant sections of plan-related agreement in precedents (2.3); revise summary chart of plan precedents (0.5); research 8th circuit caselaw in support of disclosure |

| | | | |
|--------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | statement-related motions (1.8). |
| McGreal MM | 05/23/13 | 0.9 | Review and revise research chart on precedent plans (0.8); correspondence with D. Silberger regarding same (0.1). |
| Resnick BM | 05/23/13 | 0.1 | Correspondence with S. Hessler regarding investment term sheet. |
| Silberger DM | 05/23/13 | 0.5 | Docket research on plan-related motions. |
| Stewart R | 05/23/13 | 3.2 | Locate and summarize relevant portions of plan-related agreements in precedents (1.5); research size and composition of boards of directors in precedents (1.7). |
| Travers M | 05/23/13 | 0.6 | Review and edit non-disclosure agreement markup (0.4); call with counsel regarding non-disclosure agreement markup (0.2). |
| Libby A | 05/24/13 | 0.2 | Coordinate preparation of precedent materials for plan-related agreement. |
| McGreal MM | 05/24/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with R. Stewart regarding precedent plans. |
| Resnick BM | 05/24/13 | 0.4 | Review plan-related agreement. |
| Stewart R | 05/24/13 | 1.9 | Research size and composition of boards of directors upon emergence in precedent cases. |
| Resnick BM | 05/25/13 | 0.7 | Correspondence with S. Hessler and F. Huffard regarding union negotiations and term sheet. |
| Resnick BM | 05/28/13 | 0.2 | Call with J. Bean and M. McGreal regarding plan workstreams chart. |
| Stewart R | 05/28/13 | 2.3 | Research size and composition of boards of directors upon emergence in precedent cases. |
| Silberger DM | 05/29/13 | 1.5 | Prepare for meeting with K. Coco regarding disclosure statement-related documents (0.3); meet with K. Coco regarding same (0.2); revise disclosure statement-related documents per same (1.0). |
| Stewart R | 05/29/13 | 2.1 | Research size and composition of boards of directors upon emergence in precedent cases. |
| Travers M | 05/29/13 | 0.1 | Call with counsel regarding non-disclosure agreement. |
| Coco KJ | 05/30/13 | 0.4 | Discuss plan-related documents with Davis Polk team. |
| McGreal MM | 05/30/13 | 0.4 | Teleconference with B. Resnick and J. Bean regarding plan process workstreams (0.2); confer with K. Coco regarding same (0.2). |
| Resnick BM | 05/30/13 | 0.7 | Correspondence with S. Hessler and E. Moskowitz regarding term sheet and resolution of United Mine Workers of America issues (0.5); call with M. Travers regarding same (0.2). |
| Silberger DM | 05/30/13 | 1.9 | Revise disclosure statement-related documents. |

| | | | |
|---|----------|--------------|--|
| Travers M | 05/30/13 | 0.4 | Review non-disclosure agreement comments (0.2); prepare markup of non-disclosure agreement (0.2). |
| Coco KJ | 05/31/13 | 2.0 | Meet with D. Silberger regarding disclosure statement-related documents and follow-up emails and analysis (0.6); calls with company, Blackstone, Davis Polk team and others regarding plan-related documents and next steps (1.4). |
| McGreal MM | 05/31/13 | 1.7 | Teleconference with Company, Blackstone, B. Resnick and potential investor regarding case status (0.9); teleconferences with E. Moskowitz, B. Resnick and others regarding same (0.8). |
| Resnick BM | 05/31/13 | 0.2 | Call with K. Hiltz regarding intercompany claims. |
| Silberger DM | 05/31/13 | 2.6 | Revise disclosure statement-related documents (2.3); meet with K. Coco regarding same (0.3). |
| Total PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT | | 269.1 | |
| PREPARATION OF FEE STATEMENTS\APPLICATIONS | | | |
| Chapman MP | 05/01/13 | 8.3 | Review April fee statement for confidentiality and non-confidentiality entries (7.9); discuss same with C. Robertson (0.4). |
| McGreal MM | 05/01/13 | 0.4 | Teleconference with M. Huebner regarding second interim fee application (0.2); confer with C. Robertson and A. VanWagner regarding same (0.2). |
| Robertson C | 05/01/13 | 0.4 | Discuss preparation of April fee statement with M. Chapman. |
| VanWagner AB | 05/01/13 | 0.3 | Meet with M. McGreal and C. Robertson regarding interim fee statement. |
| Chapman MP | 05/02/13 | 4.2 | Review April fee statement for confidentiality and non-conforming entries. |
| McGreal MM | 05/02/13 | 0.1 | Correspond with C. Robertson regarding second interim fee application. |
| Resnick BM | 05/02/13 | 0.4 | Review and finalize March monthly fee statement. |
| Chapman MP | 05/03/13 | 3.9 | Review April fee statement for confidentiality and non-conforming entries (3.3); emails with B. Resnick regarding filing of March fee statement (0.1); confer with C. Robertson and A. VanWagner regarding same (0.5). |
| Law EC | 05/03/13 | 0.1 | Circulate precedents of fee statements and confer with M. Chapman regarding same. |
| Robertson C | 05/03/13 | 0.2 | Discuss finalization of March fee statement with |

| | | | |
|--------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | M. Chapman. |
| VanWagner AB | 05/03/13 | 0.8 | Review March fee statement (0.5); communications with M. Chapman regarding same (0.3). |
| Chapman MP | 05/06/13 | 3.9 | Review April fee statement for confidentiality and non-conforming entries. |
| McGreal MM | 05/06/13 | 0.7 | Correspondence with C. Robertson and A. Libby regarding fee guidelines (0.4); email M. Huebner regarding second interim fee statement (0.2); teleconference with M. Huebner regarding same (0.1). |
| Chapman MP | 05/07/13 | 4.9 | Review April fee statement for confidentiality and non-conforming entries. |
| McGreal MM | 05/07/13 | 1.4 | Confer with M. Huebner regarding second interim fee application (0.4); correspondence with C. Robertson, A. Libby and A. VanWagner regarding same (0.4); teleconference with L. Long, M. Huebner and C. Robertson regarding same (0.6). |
| Resnick BM | 05/07/13 | 0.2 | Discuss potential fee settlement with M. Huebner and M. McGreal. |
| Robertson C | 05/07/13 | 2.0 | Review Employee Labor project code entries in April monthly fee statement. |
| VanWagner AB | 05/07/13 | 0.4 | Call with M. McGreal regarding expenses and related research. |
| Chapman MP | 05/08/13 | 5.4 | Review April fee statement for confidentiality and non-conforming entries (4.7); confer with C. Robertson about same (0.4); confer with P. Sauvetre about same (0.3). |
| Robertson C | 05/08/13 | 3.1 | Review April fee statement (2.9); discuss same with M. Chapman (0.2). |
| Chapman MP | 05/09/13 | 7.8 | Review April fee statement for confidentiality and non-conforming entries (4.3); review April fee statement for potential write-offs (2.5); prepare document regarding same and email to B. Resnick (1.0). |
| McGreal MM | 05/09/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with J. Jones and A. VanWagner regarding March fees and expenses (0.1); correspondence with B. Resnick and C. Robertson regarding April expenses (0.1). |
| Robertson C | 05/09/13 | 0.5 | Email to M. Harrington regarding meal expenses (0.2); calls and email with M. McGreal and B. Resnick regarding same (0.2); call with M. Harrington regarding same (0.1). |
| Samet L | 05/09/13 | 0.2 | Review bill and expenses from §§ 1113 and 1114 hearing. |

| | | | |
|--------------|----------|-----|---|
| VanWagner AB | 05/09/13 | 0.6 | Review of March fee statement issues. |
| Chapman MP | 05/10/13 | 8.8 | Review April fee statement for non-conforming entries and confidentiality (4.2); emails with timekeepers regarding same (0.4); review expenses in April Fee statement (3.5); emails with accounting regarding same (0.7). |
| Reiser CM | 05/10/13 | 0.6 | Review of April Claims Investigation time entries for privileged information. |
| Robertson C | 05/10/13 | 0.1 | Discuss April expenses with M. Chapman. |
| Resnick BM | 05/11/13 | 0.3 | Review April bill question. |
| Chapman MP | 05/13/13 | 5.9 | Review April expenses (4.5); emails with accounting regarding same (0.6); research question regarding treatment of document clerks per B. Resnick (0.8). |
| Coco KJ | 05/13/13 | 2.0 | Review and comment on April fee statement. |
| Glazer E | 05/13/13 | 1.5 | Review of April employee and labor issues time entries for privileged information. |
| Immermann MC | 05/13/13 | 0.1 | Review of April Finance time entries for privileged information. |
| VanWagner AB | 05/13/13 | 2.6 | Discuss March expenses with M. Chapman (0.3); prepare February expense report (1.6); review April fee statement narratives for privileged information (0.7). |
| Chapman MP | 05/14/13 | 5.6 | Review expenses in April fee statement (4.2); revise second interim fee order (1.1); confer with C. Robertson and M. McGreal regarding same (0.3). |
| Estacio R | 05/14/13 | 0.8 | Review of April Automatic Stay time entries for privileged information (0.6); confer with K. Coco regarding the same (0.1); email with M. Chapman regarding the same (0.1). |
| Glazer E | 05/14/13 | 2.2 | Review of April employee and labor issues time entries for privileged information. |
| McGreal MM | 05/14/13 | 0.6 | Correspondence with B. Resnick regarding second interim fee order (0.1); correspondence with C. Robertson regarding same (0.2); review and revise second interim fee order (0.2); circulate proposed second interim fee order to U.S. Trustee and Unsecured Creditors' Committee (0.1). |
| Mehes A | 05/14/13 | 1.5 | Review of April Litigation time entries for privileged information. |
| Turner AE | 05/14/13 | 0.5 | Review of April Regulatory and Environmental time entries for privileged information. |
| VanWagner AB | 05/14/13 | 0.7 | Call with M. Harrington regarding expenses (0.2); preparation of February expense report (0.4); |

| | | | |
|--------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | discuss May fee statement with M. Chapman (0.1). |
| Chapman MP | 05/15/13 | 8.1 | Review expenses in April fee statement (3.2); confer with accounting department regarding same (0.9); review time entries for confidentiality (1.1); confer with timekeepers regarding same (2.2); emails with C. Robertson and M. McGreal regarding bill preparation (0.7). |
| Libby A | 05/15/13 | 1.5 | Review and mark-up April monthly fee statement for confidentiality and privilege issues and correspondence with K. Coco and M. Chapman regarding same. |
| McGreal MM | 05/15/13 | 0.5 | Correspondence with C. Robertson regarding second interim fee order (0.2); revise second interim fee order (0.1); correspondence with L. Long, B. Walsh and B. Resnick regarding second interim fee order (0.1); email proposed second interim fee order to Chambers (0.1). |
| Robertson C | 05/15/13 | 0.3 | Emails with M. McGreal and M. Chapman regarding bill preparation. |
| VanWagner AB | 05/15/13 | 1.4 | Prepare February expense report (0.9); correspondence with accounting regarding expenses (0.3); discuss April fee statement with M. Chapman (0.2). |
| Chapman MP | 05/16/13 | 6.4 | Revise draft of April fee statement to conform with U.S. Trustee guidelines (5.8); confer with accounting department regarding same (0.6). |
| Robertson C | 05/16/13 | 0.3 | Review April fee statement and discuss same with M. Chapman. |
| VanWagner AB | 05/16/13 | 0.3 | Discuss April fee statement with M. Chapman. |
| Chapman MP | 05/17/13 | 1.4 | Review team leader edits to April fee statement (0.9); emails with E. Moskowitz, M. Russano and J. Martin regarding same (0.5). |
| McGreal MM | 05/17/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with B. Walsh and C. Robertson regarding second interim fee hearing. |
| VanWagner AB | 05/17/13 | 0.2 | Review February expense issue and email to L. Elbert regarding same. |
| Resnick BM | 05/18/13 | 1.3 | Review April fee application. |
| Resnick BM | 05/20/13 | 1.1 | Finalize review of April bill (0.9); meet with M. Chapman to discuss same (0.2). |
| Russano MJ | 05/20/13 | 2.1 | Review fee statement and descriptions for privileged information. |
| Chapman MP | 05/21/13 | 3.3 | Emails regarding April fee statement with B. Resnick (0.7); review and summarize expenses from October-January fee statements and send same to C. Robertson (1.5); review May fee |

| | | | |
|-------------|----------|-----|--|
| | | | statement for confidentiality and non-conforming entries (1.1). |
| McGreal MM | 05/21/13 | 1.0 | Correspondence with K. Coco, C. Robertson and others regarding second interim fee order (0.3); correspondence with M. Huebner, B. Resnick and others regarding backup documentation for expenses (0.2); review and comment on second interim fee order (0.1); correspondence with B. Resnick, C. Robertson, M. Chapman and others regarding retiree committee fees and expenses (0.4). |
| Russano MJ | 05/21/13 | 0.4 | Confer with E. Moskowitz and M. Tobak regarding fee statement preparation. |
| Chapman MP | 05/22/13 | 1.3 | Review May fee statement for confidentiality and non-conforming entries. |
| McGreal MM | 05/22/13 | 0.3 | Correspondence with C. Robertson, M. Chapman and B. Resnick regarding retiree committee counsel fees and expenses. |
| McGreal MM | 05/23/13 | 0.7 | Teleconference with J. Cohen regarding retiree committee's fees and expenses (0.2); correspondence with J. Jones regarding same (0.1); correspondence with B. Resnick and M. Chapman regarding same (0.2); review additional second interim fee order (0.1); correspondence with B. Walsh regarding same (0.1). |
| McGreal MM | 05/28/13 | 0.1 | Teleconference with B. Walsh regarding second interim fee order. |
| Moskowitz E | 05/28/13 | 2.1 | Review and edit April bill. |
| Chapman MP | 05/29/13 | 3.2 | Review proposed edits to April fee statement (0.6); revise bullet summaries in April fee statement (0.8); emails with K. Coco regarding same (0.2) review May fee statement for confidentiality and non-conforming entries (1.6). |
| McGreal MM | 05/29/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with Bowles Rice regarding second interim fee statement (0.1); correspondence with U.S. Trustee regarding same (0.1). |
| Chapman MP | 05/30/13 | 5.1 | Emails with accounting department regarding charts in April fee statement (0.3); review and edit same for internal consistency (3.1); email timekeepers regarding question related to time entries (0.6) review May fee statement for non-conforming entries and confidentiality (1.1). |
| Chapman MP | 05/31/13 | 8.4 | Review and revise April fee statement in advance of filing (3.3); emails with accounting regarding same (0.3); file same (0.3); review May fee |

| | | | |
|---|----------|--------------|--|
| | | | statement for non-conforming entries and confidentiality (4.5). |
| Resnick BM | 05/31/13 | 0.2 | Finalize April bill. |
| Robertson C | 05/31/13 | 0.4 | Review April fee statement (0.3); discuss same with M. Chapman (0.1). |
| Total PREPARATION OF FEE STATEMENTS\APPLICATIONS | | 136.0 | |
| REGULATORY AND ENVIRONMENTAL | | | |
| Brenner J | 05/01/13 | 0.6 | Consolidate comments and comment on 10-Q. |
| Turner AE | 05/01/13 | 0.5 | Provide comments to draft 10-Q (0.4); email correspondence regarding same (0.1). |
| Brenner J | 05/02/13 | 0.2 | Phone calls with Company's internal counsel. |
| Resnick BM | 05/02/13 | 0.1 | Call with A. McCallister regarding environmental remediation at Hobet. |
| Beshar SE | 05/06/13 | 0.4 | Review matrix. |
| Brenner J | 05/06/13 | 0.2 | Answer company emails on 10-Q. |
| Huebner MS | 05/06/13 | 0.6 | Conversation with J. Bean regarding environmental issues, upcoming board meeting and materials regarding same (0.4); review of potential legends for new monthly operating report materials and emails with B. Resnick and S. Beshar regarding same (0.2). |
| Baker HS | 05/07/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with B. Grabowski regarding Colver mine. |
| Huebner MS | 05/07/13 | 0.2 | Review of environmental documents. |
| Resnick BM | 05/07/13 | 0.1 | Emails with A. McCallister regarding Hobet remediation issues. |
| Brenner J | 05/08/13 | 0.1 | Coordinate response to company questions on 10-Q. |
| Huebner MS | 05/08/13 | 0.3 | Review of environmental materials. |
| Krause SC | 05/08/13 | 0.5 | Emails with J. Brenner and B. Resnick regarding questions on 10-Q. |
| Baker HS | 05/09/13 | 1.6 | Review of Colver mine materials (0.5); review of Hobet 22 agreement (1.1). |
| Huebner MS | 05/09/13 | 0.4 | Confer with J. Bean and J. Lusheski regarding environmental matters. |
| Resnick BM | 05/09/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with A. McCallister and H. Baker regarding Hobet remediation. |
| Turner AE | 05/09/13 | 0.1 | Review case calendar. |
| Baker HS | 05/10/13 | 0.7 | Review of Colver mine documents. |
| Huebner MS | 05/10/13 | 0.3 | Conference call with environmental lawyers and chief operating officer regarding environmental |

| | | | |
|--------------|----------|-----|---|
| | | | issues. |
| Baker HS | 05/13/13 | 0.9 | Prepare for discussion with B. Grabowski regarding Colver mine. |
| McGreal MM | 05/14/13 | 0.1 | Teleconference with H. Baker regarding environmental liabilities. |
| Baker HS | 05/15/13 | 4.1 | Conference call with B. Grabowski, M. Sokolow and A. McCallister regarding Colver mine (1.1); prepare for same (2.0); correspond with B. Grabowski regarding Colver mine (1.0). |
| Turner AE | 05/15/13 | 0.2 | Discuss Colver mine with H. Baker. |
| Turner AE | 05/16/13 | 0.1 | Review case calendar. |
| Chapman MP | 05/17/13 | 4.5 | Conduct research regarding coal severance tax claims (3.8); confer with K. Coco regarding same (0.7). |
| Matlock TL | 05/17/13 | 0.1 | Discuss potential plan tax treatment with C. Phillips. |
| Silberger DM | 05/17/13 | 0.3 | Call with A. Long from Warrick County regarding taxes. |
| Baker HS | 05/20/13 | 0.6 | Call with A. McCallister and K. DesRocher regarding Colver mine (0.5); correspondence with B. Grabowski regarding same (0.1). |
| Chapman MP | 05/20/13 | 4.5 | Conduct research regarding coal severance tax claims (3.9); confer with K. Coco and T. Matlock regarding same (0.6). |
| Matlock TL | 05/20/13 | 0.3 | Discuss excise tax question with C. Phillips (0.1); discuss same with K. Coco and M. McGreal (0.2). |
| Phillips CA | 05/20/13 | 0.3 | Confer with K. Coco and M. McGreal regarding severance tax (0.2); confer with T. Matlock regarding same (0.1). |
| Chapman MP | 05/21/13 | 6.1 | Conduct research regarding coal severance tax claims (4.8); confer with T. Matlock regarding same (0.5); confer with K. Coco regarding same (0.8). |
| Coco KJ | 05/21/13 | 2.5 | Emails with clients and analysis and research regarding tax claims issue (1.5); review and revise research write-up regarding same (1.0). |
| Matlock TL | 05/21/13 | 1.8 | Discuss excise tax question with C. Phillips (0.1); discuss same with M. Chapman (0.2); research same (1.5) |
| Phillips CA | 05/21/13 | 0.1 | Confer with T. Matlock regarding severance tax issue. |
| Baker HS | 05/22/13 | 0.3 | Correspondence with K. DesRocher regarding Colver mine. |
| Chapman MP | 05/22/13 | 2.5 | Conduct research regarding coal severance tax claims (2.4); confer with K. Coco regarding same (0.1). |

| | | | |
|---|----------|-------------|--|
| Coco KJ | 05/22/13 | 1.6 | Review and revise analysis of severance tax issues (0.9); emails with clients and Blackstone regarding same (0.4); call with R. Hoffman regarding same (0.3). |
| Ferrell KL | 05/22/13 | 0.3 | Analyze characterization of certain West Virginia taxes. |
| Matlock TL | 05/22/13 | 0.7 | Read emails and memo regarding excise tax issue (0.3); discuss with C. Phillips (0.4). |
| Phillips CA | 05/22/13 | 0.9 | Analyze severance tax issue. |
| Baker HS | 05/23/13 | 2.6 | Draft Barnes and Tucker settlement documents. |
| Chapman MP | 05/23/13 | 1.6 | Conduct research regarding coal severance tax claims (1.5); confer with K. Coco regarding same (0.1). |
| Coco KJ | 05/23/13 | 1.8 | Research severance tax claims issues (0.4); send research email to clients and Blackstone regarding same (0.8); follow-up email and conversation with Blackstone regarding same (0.3); email to J. Chincheck regarding tax question related to same (0.3). |
| Klein DS | 05/23/13 | 0.2 | Call with H. Baker regarding Colver mine. |
| Krause SC | 05/23/13 | 0.4 | Call with Morrison Cohen regarding Ring claim (0.2); confer with K. Coco regarding same (0.2). |
| Turner AE | 05/23/13 | 0.1 | Review weekly case calendar. |
| Agostinho JN | 05/24/13 | 0.8 | Respond to question from J. Wubker regarding 11-K filing requirement. |
| Baker HS | 05/24/13 | 1.5 | Review of Colver mine materials. |
| Coco KJ | 05/24/13 | 1.3 | Call with H. Baker regarding Colver mine (0.3); follow-up emails with Davis Polk team and analysis regarding same (0.6); draft and send research email to clients regarding tax issues (0.4). |
| McGreal MM | 05/24/13 | 0.2 | Teleconference with K. Coco regarding potential settlement of certain environmental claims. |
| Baker HS | 05/28/13 | 0.2 | Correspondence with B. Grabowski regarding Colver mine. |
| Beshar SE | 05/29/13 | 0.7 | Review developments regarding disclosure issue. |
| Brenner J | 05/29/13 | 0.2 | Respond to question from J. Jones regarding 8-K disclosure. |
| Baker HS | 05/30/13 | 0.9 | Review of Colver mine materials. |
| Beshar SE | 05/30/13 | 0.5 | Review disclosure. |
| Brenner J | 05/30/13 | 0.2 | Review 8-K disclosure (0.1); emails with J. Jones regarding same (0.1). |
| Total REGULATORY AND ENVIRONMENTAL | | 53.3 | |
| | | | |

| | | | |
|--------------------------------------|----------|----------------|---|
| SECURITIES CLASS ACTION | | | |
| Starr AT | 05/06/13 | 0.3 | Calls and emails with J. Jones regarding securities class action motion to dismiss. |
| Starr AT | 05/21/13 | 0.4 | Review securities class action motion to dismiss. |
| Elbert LH | 05/23/13 | 1.2 | Review motion to dismiss filed in securities class action. |
| Elbert LH | 05/24/13 | 2.2 | Review and summarize securities class action complaint. |
| Total SECURITIES CLASS ACTION | | 4.1 | |
| | | | |
| Total | | 2,479.5 | |