

JACKSON KELLY PLLC  
500 Lee Street East, Suite 1600 (25301)  
Post Office Box 553  
Charleston, West Virginia 25322  
Telephone: (304) 340-1000  
Facsimile: (304) 340-1050  
Michael T. Cimino  
William F. Dobbs, Jr.

*Special Counsel to the Debtors  
and Debtors in Possession*

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK**

---

**In re:**

**PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION, *et al.*,**

**Debtors.<sup>1</sup>**

**Chapter 11  
Case No. 12-12900(SCC)  
(Jointly Administered)**

---

**FIRST FEE STATEMENT OF JACKSON KELLY PLLC FOR  
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AND DISBURSEMENTS FOR THE PERIOD OF  
JULY 9, 2012 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2012**

<b>NAME OF APPLICANT:</b>	<b>Jackson Kelly PLLC</b>
<b>ROLE IN THE CASE:</b>	Special Counsel to the Debtors and debtors- in-possession
<b>TIME PERIOD:</b>	The Petition Date (July 9, 2012) through and including August 31, 2012
<b>CURRENT APPLICATION:</b>	Total Fees Requested: \$ 123,579.08 80% of Fees Requested: \$ 98,863.26 Total Expenses Requested: \$ 14, 731.51
<b>PRIOR APPLICATION:</b>	None

---

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors are the entities listed on Schedule 1 attached hereto. The employer tax identification numbers and addresses for each of the Debtors are set forth in the Debtors' chapter 11 petitions.

1. On July 9, 2012 (the “Petition Date”), Patriot Coal Corporation and substantially all of its affiliated subsidiary companies (“Debtors”) filed voluntary petitions for Chapter 11 Relief. [See ECF No. 1]. Debtors’ cases are being jointly administered by order of this Court. [ECF No 30].

2. Prior to the Petition Date, Jackson Kelly PLLC (“Jackson Kelly”) rendered substantial legal services to Debtors in a wide range of areas. Debtors have retained Jackson Kelly – with this Courts authorization by its September 10, 2012, *Order Authorizing the Employment and Retention of Jackson Kelly PLLC as Special Counsel for the Debtors Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition Date* [ECF No. 540] (the “Jackson Kelly Employment Order”) – *nunc pro tunc* from the Petition Date to continue to render professional services in connection with (collectively the “Authorized Representation”):

(a) Environmental matters relating to the Debtors’ coal leases, coal property, mines and other properties and installations;

(b) Mine safety and health matters, including alleged violations of the Mine Safety and Health Act;

(c) The defense of Federal Black Lung cases;

(d) The defense of West Virginia deliberate intent litigation;

(e) Litigation on behalf of one or more of the Debtors as a party plaintiff;

(f) Litigation on behalf of one or more of the Debtors as a party defendant;

(g) Local real estate and commercial transactions, as needed from time to time, which may not duplicate services provided by the Debtors’ other counsel;

(h) Local legislative and lobbying services; and

(i) Representation of one or more of the debtors in arbitration issues.

3. In accordance with the Jackson Kelly Employment Order and the *Order to Establish Procedures for Interim Monthly Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals* [ECF No. 262] (the “Interim Compensation Order”, Jackson Kelly, as special counsel to the Debtors, hereby submits its First Statement for Professional Services and Disbursements (the “Fee Statement”) for the period from the Petition date through and including August 31, 2012 (the “Fee Statement Period”).

4. Attached hereto as Exhibit A is a listing of Jackson Kelly’s professional and paraprofessionals (collectively the “Jackson Kelly Professional(s)”) that rendered services for Debtors as authorized by the Jackson Kelly Employment Order during the Fee Statement Period. Exhibit A includes the, among other things, the total hours billed, hourly rate and total fees for each Jackson Kelly Professional, plus a blended hourly rate for each category of Jackson Kelly Professional, excluding paralegals.

5. Attached hereto as Exhibit B is a schedule summarizing the categories of actual and necessary expenses for which Jackson Kelly is seeking reimbursement and the total amount for each such expense category.

6. Attached hereto as Exhibit C is a summary of the number of hours and amounts billed by Jackson Kelly during the Fee Statement period for services authorized by the Jackson Kelly Employment Order during the Fee Statement Period, organized by project type authorized by said Order. These services include all services that were typically rendered in the ordinary course for had been being provided to Debtors before the Petition Date, but only as specifically authorized by the Jackson Kelly Employment Order in connection with the Authorized Representation.

7. Attached hereto as Exhibit D are the time records of Jackson Kelly, which provide the contemporaneous record summaries of the time spent by each Jackson Kelly Professional during the Fee Statement Period by project category.

8. The undersigned certifying professional hereby certifies and represents (i) that he has read this First Fee Statement; (ii) that to the best of his knowledge, information and belief formed after reasonable inquiry, the fees and disbursements requested herein fall within this Court's guidelines and those of the United States Trustee; (iii) that the fees and disbursements sought herein are billed at rates in accordance with Jackson Kelly's customary practices and generally accepted by its clients; and (iv) that in providing reimbursable services, Jackson Kelly does not make a profit on the services.

**Notice**

9. Consistent with the procedures described in the Interim Compensation Order, the Debtors will serve this Fee Statement, by hand or overnight delivery, on (i) the Debtors, Patriot Coal Corporation, 12312 Olive Boulevard, Suite 400, St. Louis, Missouri, 63141, Attn: Jacquelyn A. Jones, Esq., (ii) attorneys for the Debtors, Davis Polk & Wardwell LLP, 450 Lexington Avenue, New York, New York 10017, Attn: Marshall S. Huebner, Esq. and Brian M. Resnick, Esq., (iii) the Office of the United States Trustee for the Southern District of New York, 33 Whitehall Street, 21st Floor, New York, New York 10004, Attn: Elisabetta G. Gasparini, Esq. and Paul K. Schwartzberg, Esq., (iv) attorneys for the administrative agent for the Debtors' postpetition lenders, (a) Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP, 767 Fifth Avenue, New York, New York 10153, Attn: Marcia Goldstein, Esq. and Joseph Smolinsky, Esq., and (b) Willkie Farr & Gallagher LLP, 787 Seventh Avenue, New York, New York 10019, Attn: Margot B. Schonholtz, Esq. and Ana Alfonso, Esq., and (v) counsel to the official committee of unsecured creditors,

Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP, 1177 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York  
10036, Attn: Adam C. Rogoff, Esq. and Gregory G. Plotko, Esq.

10. WHEREFORE, Jackson Kelly respectfully requests that the Court grant the relief  
requested herein and such other and further relief as is just and proper.

Dated: September 21, 2012

Respectfully submitted,

**JACKSON KELLY PLLC**

/s/ Richard Grady Ford

William F. Dobbs, Jr. (WV Bar No. 1027)

Michael T. Cimino (WV Bar No. 6094)

Richard Grady Ford (WV Bar No. 11197)

JACKSON KELLY PLLC

500 Lee Street East, Suite 1600 (25301)

Post Office Box 553

Charleston, West Virginia 25322

Telephone (304) 340-1280

Facsimile (304) 340-1080

*Special Counsel to Debtors and  
Debtors in Possession*

**SCHEDULE 1**  
(Debtor Entities)

1. Affinity Mining Company
2. Apogee Coal Company, LLC
3. Appalachia Mine Services, LLC
4. Beaver Dam Coal Company, LLC
5. Big Eagle, LLC
6. Big Eagle Rail, LLC
7. Black Stallion Coal Company, LLC
8. Black Walnut Coal Company
9. Bluegrass Mine Services, LLC
10. Brook Trout Coal, LLC
11. Catenary Coal Company, LLC
12. Central States Coal Reserves of Kentucky, LLC
13. Charles Coal Company, LLC
14. Cleaton Coal Company
15. Coal Clean LLC
16. Coal Properties, LLC
17. Coal Reserve Holding Limited Liability Company No. 2
18. Colony Bay Coal Company
19. Cook Mountain Coal Company, LLC
20. Corydon Resources LLC
21. Coventry Mining Services, LLC
22. Coyote Coal Company LLC
23. Cub Branch Coal Company LLC
24. Dakota LLC
25. Day LLC
26. Dixon Mining Company, LLC
27. Dodge Hill Holding JV, LLC
28. Dodge Hill Mining Company, LLC
29. Dodge Hill of Kentucky, LLC
30. EACC Camps, Inc.
31. Eastern Associated Coal, LLC
32. Eastern Coal Company, LLC
33. Eastern Royalty, LLC
34. Emerald Processing, L.L.C.
35. Gateway Eagle Coal Company, LLC
36. Grand Eagle Mining, LLC
37. Heritage Coal Company LLC
38. Highland Mining Company, LLC
39. Hillside Mining Company
40. Hobet Mining, LLC
41. Indian Hill Company LLC
42. Infinity Coal Sales, LLC
43. Interior Holdings, LLC
44. IO Coal LLC
45. Jarrell's Branch Coal Company
46. Jupiter Holdings LLC
47. Kanawha Eagle Coal, LLC
48. Kanawha River Ventures I, LLC
49. Kanawha River Ventures II, LLC
50. Kanawha River Ventures III, LLC
51. KE Ventures, LLC
52. Little Creek LLC
53. Logan Fork Coal Company
54. Magnum Coal Company LLC
55. Magnum Coal Sales LLC
56. Martinka Coal Company, LLC
57. Midland Trail Energy LLC
58. Midwest Coal Resources II, LLC
59. Mountain View Coal Company, LLC
60. New Trout Coal Holdings II, LLC
61. Newtown Energy, Inc.
62. North Page Coal Corp.
63. Ohio County Coal Company, LLC
64. Panther LLC
65. Patriot Beaver Dam Holdings, LLC
66. Patriot Coal Company, L.P.
67. Patriot Coal Corporation
68. Patriot Coal Sales LLC
69. Patriot Coal Services LLC
70. Patriot Leasing Company LLC
71. Patriot Midwest Holdings, LLC
72. Patriot Reserve Holdings, LLC
73. Patriot Trading LLC
74. PCX Enterprises, Inc.
75. Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC
76. Pond Creek Land Resources, LLC
77. Pond Fork Processing LLC
78. Remington Holdings LLC
79. Remington II LLC
80. Remington LLC
81. Rivers Edge Mining, Inc.
82. Robin Land Company, LLC
83. Sentry Mining, LLC
84. Snowberry Land Company
85. Speed Mining LLC
86. Sterling Smokeless Coal Company, LLC
87. TC Sales Company, LLC
88. The Presidents Energy Company LLC
89. Thunderhill Coal LLC
90. Trout Coal Holdings, LLC
91. Union County Coal Co., LLC
92. Viper LLC
93. Weatherby Processing LLC
94. Wildcat Energy LLC
95. Wildcat, LLC
96. Will Scarlet Properties LLC
97. Winchester LLC
98. Winifrede Dock Limited Liability Company
99. Yankeetown Dock, LLC

**EXHIBIT A**

**Professionals and Rates**

**I.A. Partners/Counsel**

<b>NAME OF PARTNER / COUNSEL</b>	<b>YEAR ADMITTED</b>	<b>MATTER AREA OF LAW</b>	<b>TOTAL HOURS BILLED</b>	<b>HOURLY RATE</b>	<b>TOTAL FEES</b>
Brumley, Christina T.	1998-WV	Commercial	5.60	\$264	\$1,478.40
Cimino, Michael T.	1993-WV	Safety and Health	52.40	\$235	\$12,314.00
Dobbs, Jr., William F.	1973-WV	Safety and Health; Commercial	4.70	\$370	\$1,739.00
Gardner, Blair M.	2001-WV 1977-PA	Environmental (General)	66.10	\$264	\$17,450.40
Harman, Ashley M.	1996-WV	Black Lung	11.60	\$225	\$2,610.00
Huffman, Timothy E.	1980-WV	Workers Compensation	7.08	\$340	\$2,407.20
LaCagnin, Steve M.	1986-NC 1983-WV	Deliberate Intent Litigation	4.70	\$285	\$1,339.50
Loeb, Jr., Charles W.	1982-WV	Commercial	1.50	\$276	\$414.00
Mairs, John A.	1983-WV	Environmental (General)	6.00	\$315	\$1,890.00
Mattingly, William S.	1993-PA 1987-WV 1985-OH	Black Lung	1.00	\$276	\$276.00
McFarland, Benjamin M.	2005-WV	Safety and Health	69.00	\$175	\$12,075.00
McLusky, Robert G.	1981-WV	Environmental (General)	8.80	\$306	\$2,692.80
Moore, R. H.	1976-PA	Safety and Health	0.50	\$265	\$132.50
Nicholson, Roger	1995-WV 1986-KY	Commercial	5.70	\$310	\$1,767.00
Oakley, Kenneth B.	2005-KY	Safety and Health	39.30	\$175	\$6,877.50
Rembrandt, Ann B.	1987-WV	Black Lung	14.30	\$234	\$3,346.20
Robinson, Melissa M.	1991-WV	Safety and Health	29.10	\$220	\$6,402.00
Roeder, George E.	1993-PA 1981-WV	Black Lung	18.20	\$276	\$5,023.20
Sebok, Al F.	1985-WV	Environmental (General)	0.20	\$360	\$72.00
Snyder, Kathy L.	1998-PA 1992-WV	Black Lung	3.30	\$234	\$772.20
Tweel, Robert G.	1994-TN 1994-WV	Safety and Health; Environmental	3.10	\$330	\$1,023.00
<b>Total Partners and Counsel</b>			<b>352.18</b>		<b>\$82,101.90</b>

**II.A. Associates**

<b>NAME OF ASSOCIATE</b>	<b>YEAR ADMITTED</b>	<b>MATTER AREA OF LAW</b>	<b>TOTAL HOURS BILLED</b>	<b>HOURLY RATE</b>	<b>TOTAL FEES</b>
Adkins, Wendy G.	2003-WV	Deliberate Intent Litigation	0.50	\$187	\$93.50
Dennison, Patrick W.	2011-PA 2010-FL	Safety and Health	1.30	\$215	\$279.50
Ford, Richard G.	2010-WV	Safety and Health	23.10	\$215	\$4,966.50
Gillen, Kevin T.	2011-WV	Black Lung	9.90	\$190	\$1,881.00
Green, Chris M.	2008-WV	Black Lung	4.70	\$174	\$817.80
Heishman, Aaron S.	2010-WV	Environmental (General)	0.20	\$145	\$29.00
Kapushion, Meredith A.	2005-CO	Safety and Health	20.40	\$265	\$5,406.00
Karim, Waseem A.	2004-KY	Black Lung	4.60	\$191	\$878.60
Soukup, Jeffrey R.	2012-WV 2007-KY	Black Lung	0.20	\$183	\$36.60
Voelker, Ryan E.	2009-WV	Safety and Health	2.10	\$182.75	\$383.78
Webb, Jason P.	2007-PA	Safety and Health	63.90	\$170.00	\$10,863.00
<b>Total Associates</b>			<b>130.90</b>		<b>\$25,635.28</b>

**III.A. Summer Associates**

<b>NAME OF SUMMER ASSOCIATE</b>	<b>YEAR ADMITTED</b>	<b>MATTER AREA OF LAW</b>	<b>TOTAL HOURS BILLED</b>	<b>HOURLY RATE</b>	<b>TOTAL FEES</b>
Brick, Joshua M.		Black Lung	1.00	\$160	\$160.00
<b>Total Summer Associates</b>			<b>1.00</b>		<b>\$160.00</b>

**IV.A. Paraprofessionals**

<b>NAME OF PARAPROFESSIONAL</b>	<b>YEAR ADMITTED</b>	<b>MATTER AREA OF LAW</b>	<b>TOTAL HOURS BILLED</b>	<b>HOURLY RATE</b>	<b>TOTAL FEES</b>
Bostic, Rebecca L.		Workers Compensation	1.00	\$125	\$125.00
Calhoun, KD F.		Black Lung	5.40	\$115	\$621.00
Charlson, Tami S.		Safety and Health	0.40	\$130	\$52.00
Colston, Leanna L.		Safety and Health	32.50	\$130	\$4,225.00
Hammonds, Judy S.		Black Lung	36.80	\$102	\$3,753.60
Manchas, Penny L.		Black Lung	0.20	\$98	\$19.60
Mitchell, Janet L.		Black Lung	11.60	\$102	\$1,183.20
Roehl, Charles A.		Environmental (General)	5.10	\$111	\$566.10
Sigley, Marisa L.		Black Lung	2.70	\$102	\$275.40
Smith, Delores D.		Black Lung	5.20	\$125	\$650.00
Smith, Paula R.		Black Lung	1.00	\$125	\$125.00
Taulbee, Melissa L.		Black Lung	7.10	\$125	\$887.50
Vigneron, Morganna		Black Lung	1.40	\$125	\$175.00
Werner, Shannon L.		Safety and Health	11.70	\$130	\$1,521.00
Wilson, Lisa F.		Black Lung	0.10	\$125	\$12.50
Wolfe, Zachary		Black Lung	0.20	\$75	\$15.00
Zalewski, Larry A.		Safety and Health	11.80	\$125	\$1,475.00
<b>Total Paraprofessionals</b>			<b>134.20</b>		<b>\$15,681.90</b>

**Attorney Blended Rates**

<b>RANK</b>	<b>ATTORNEY BLENDED RATE</b>	<b>TOTAL ATTORNEY HOURS BILLED</b>	<b>TOTAL ATTORNEY FEES</b>
<b>Partners and Counsel</b>	\$233.12	352.18	\$82,101.90
<b>Associates</b>	\$195.84	130.90	\$25,635.28
<b>Summer Associates</b>	\$160.00	1.00	\$160.00
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$222.89</b>	<b>484.08</b>	<b>\$107,897.18</b>

**EXHIBIT B**

**Expenses**

**ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES  
INCURRED BY JACKSON KELLY PLLC ON  
BEHALF OF THE DEBTORS DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD**

<b>CATEGORY OF EXPENSES</b>	<b>AMOUNTS</b>
Computerized Legal Research - Westlaw	\$ 980.71
Copies	\$ 1,326.00
Copies - Out of Office	\$ 3,987.50
Copies of Medical Records/Reports/and Hospital Service Charges	\$ 673.56
Courier	\$ 56.50
Court Reporter Fee	\$ 985.85
Deposition Expense	\$ 950.00
Doctor's Fee/Consultation	\$ 3,596.00
Imaging	\$ 212.20
Lien Search	\$ 50.00
Long Distance Telephone	\$ 58.17
Mileage	\$ 27.50
Pacer	\$ 17.30
Special Postage	\$ 425.12
Travel	\$ 865.10
X-rays and/or re-reads	\$ 520.00
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$ 14,731.51</b>

**EXHIBIT C**

**Summary by Project Code**

**SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING  
THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY JACKSON KELLY PLLC  
ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY**

<b>PROJECT CATEGORY</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>CLIENT</b>	<b>MATTER</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>AMOUNT</b>
<b>1.</b>	<b>Black Lung</b>			<b>140.50</b>	<b>\$ 23,519.40</b>
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Baker, Bobby R.	0.10	\$ 19.10
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Barker, Carlos (deceased); Barbara S. Barker (wdiow)	7.00	\$ 771.40
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Creech, Rush	1.00	\$ 113.50
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Ellis, Donnie Eugene (deceased); Janice Alberta Ellis (widow)	11.90	\$ 1,388.50
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Freeman, Ermil A.	3.20	\$ 522.70
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Hall, Ronald D.	0.60	\$ 100.80
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	King, Robert T. (deceased); Betty Jean King (widow)	0.40	\$ 67.50
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Mattas, Larry D.	34.50	\$ 7,672.20
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	May, Andrew	0.20	\$ 20.40
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	May, Andrew (deceased); Charlotte May (widow)	1.50	\$ 155.30
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Miller, Donnie L.	0.20	\$ 19.60
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Nelson, Melvin	0.80	\$ 136.70
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Stowers, Jack V.	0.20	\$ 23.00
		Catenary Coal Company, LLC	Workman, Charles R.	0.20	\$ 20.40
		Hobet Mining, LLC	Bella, Charles, III	0.20	\$ 20.40
		Hobet Mining, LLC	Chambers, Edgar Howard	0.20	\$ 20.40
		Hobet Mining, LLC	Chandler, Charles F. (deceased); Susan C. Chandler (widow)	0.60	\$ 165.60
		Hobet Mining, LLC	Epling, Carl R., Jr.	10.70	\$ 2,407.50
		Hobet Mining, LLC	Hatfield, James E.	3.00	\$ 338.20
		Hobet Mining, LLC	Woody, Donny G. (deceased); Darlene Woody (widow)	0.90	\$ 202.50
		Hobet Mining, LLC	Workman, Carl E., II	17.80	\$ 2,962.30
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Farley, Elwood v. Sharples Coal Corp.	10.70	\$ 2,086.70
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Farley, Elwood (deceased); Leota Farley (widow) v. Sharples Coal Corp.	0.20	\$ 25.00
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Morris, Lee v. Ashland Coal, Inc.	4.90	\$ 623.20
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Powell, Homer J. (deceased); Betty Jo Powell (widow) v. Arch of KY	22.20	\$ 2,794.60
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Sutphin, James E. v. Sharples Coal Corp.	7.30	\$ 841.90
<b>2.</b>	<b>Commercial</b>			<b>15.20</b>	<b>\$ 4,547.40</b>
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Asset Purchase Agreement Form	15.20	\$ 4,547.40
<b>3.</b>	<b>Deliberate Intent Litigation</b>			<b>5.20</b>	<b>\$ 1,433.00</b>
		Patriot Coal Corporation	John Palmer, et al. v. John Renner; Eastern Associated Coal, LLC; and Patriot Coal Corporation; et al.	0.10	\$ 18.70
		Patriot Coal Corporation	John Renner, et al. v. Eastern Associated Coal, LLC; Patriot Coal Corporation; et al.	5.10	\$ 1,414.30

**SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING  
THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY JACKSON KELLY PLLC  
ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY**

<b>PROJECT CATEGORY</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>CLIENT</b>	<b>MATTER</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>AMOUNT</b>
<b>4.</b>	<b>Environmental (General)</b>			<b>88.50</b>	<b>\$ 23,393.30</b>
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Ohio Valley Environmental Coalition, Inc. and West Virginia Highlands Conservancy, Inc. v. Apogee Coal Company, LLC and Hobet Mining, LLC	2.50	\$ 598.80
		Hobet Mining, LLC	OVEC Re: Hobet 22 Temporary Restraining Order Motion	32.60	\$ 8,418.80
		Hobet Mining, LLC	Selenium Issues	10.00	\$ 2,640.00
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Appeal of Selenium Compliance Orders	0.50	\$ 153.00
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Ohio Valley Environmental Coalition, Inc. (OVEC); West Virginia Highlands Conservancy, Inc. and Sierra Club v. Patriot Coal Corporation; Apogee Coal Company, LLC; Catenary Coal Company, LLC and Hobet Mining, LLC	42.90	\$ 11,582.70
<b>5</b>	<b>Safety and Health</b>			<b>360.80</b>	<b>\$ 68,153.78</b>
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000192932 (Guyan Mine); WEVA 2009-1786	8.20	\$ 1,655.50
		Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Guyan Surface Mine/Richard Young, Jr. Fatality	1.10	\$ 258.50
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	105(c) Travis Catsonis; MORG-CD-2012-07	22.30	\$ 4,016.50
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000166204 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2009-229	2.60	\$ 433.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000222396 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-198	0.30	\$ 51.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000244760 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-932	27.80	\$ 4,685.50
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000244978 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2011-1012	0.60	\$ 75.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000246204 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2011-1190	1.50	\$ 228.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000246204 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2011-1191	0.10	\$ 17.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000251444 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2011-1681 and WEVA 2011-1682	3.40	\$ 585.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000254488 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-2057 and WEVA 2011-2058	4.80	\$ 802.50
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000257610 (Federal No. 2) WEVA 2011-2151	7.90	\$ 1,253.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000260205 (Federal No. 2) WEVA 2011-2188	2.90	\$ 475.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000263159 (Federal No. 2)	1.00	\$ 161.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000266251 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-20 and WEVA 2012-21	0.60	\$ 93.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000270521 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-174	5.10	\$ 867.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000270852 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-427 and WEVA 2012-428	4.70	\$ 790.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000273621 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-529 and WEVA 2012.530	6.10	\$ 1,014.50
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000291117 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-1368 and WEVA 2012-1369	4.90	\$ 889.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 00248954 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-1437	0.30	\$ 42.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Electronic Surveying Petitions	1.30	\$ 162.50
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Federal No. 2 Mine - Assessment 000276475	0.30	\$ 37.50
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Federal No. 2 Mine - WEVA 2012-624; Assessment 000276264	2.10	\$ 339.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Federal No. 2 Mine 105 (c)Travis Catsonis Discrimination Complaint	9.10	\$ 1,592.50
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Safety and Health Consultation	0.20	\$ 34.00
		Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	William Mark Stewart 105(c) Discrimination Complaint (Federal No. 2)	5.60	\$ 1,067.00
		Highland Mining Company, LLC	342Leslie Pride (Highland 9 Mine) Discrimination Complaint No. MAD1-CD-2009-11	1.30	\$ 227.50

**SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING  
THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY JACKSON KELLY PLLC  
ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY**

PROJECT CATEGORY	DESCRIPTION	CLIENT	MATTER	HOURS	AMOUNT
		Highland Mining Company, LLC	Case No. 000162446 (Highland 9 Mine)	57.60	\$ 9,607.50
		Hobet Mining, LLC	Case No. 000250766 (Beth Station No. 79 Prep Plant) WEVA 2011-1561	1.10	\$ 237.50
		Hobet Mining, LLC	Case No. 144-0165-2010 (West Ridge Surface Mine) NOV 28721	4.20	\$ 877.28
		Newtown Energy, Inc.	Electronic Surveying Petitions - Eagle Mine; Coalburg No. 1 Mine; Coalburg No. 2 Mine and Peerless Rachel Mine	0.40	\$ 50.00
		Ohio County Coal Company, LLC	Electronic Surveying Petitions	0.80	\$ 100.00
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Safety and Health Consultation	1.00	\$ 330.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000158162 (Big Mtn. No. 16); WEVA 2008-1623	1.90	\$ 354.50
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000163290 (Big Mtn No. 16) WEVA 2008-432	8.10	\$ 1,902.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000169073 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2009-407	17.90	\$ 3,596.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000172189 (Big Mountain Mine No. 16) WEVA 2009-666, WEVA 2009-667	0.10	\$ 22.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000191598 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2009-1772	2.40	\$ 528.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000197709; (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2010-19	4.40	\$ 968.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000218088 (Big Mountain No. 16); Motion to Reopen	0.60	\$ 132.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000236828 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-530	0.40	\$ 88.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000239682 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-552	0.10	\$ 22.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000248053 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-1293	2.10	\$ 462.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000250539 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2011-1504	1.50	\$ 330.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000253329 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2011-1754	1.20	\$ 264.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000256585 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-1990	1.60	\$ 352.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000259308 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2011-2178	0.10	\$ 22.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000262017 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-2358	0.10	\$ 22.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000265268 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-2459	1.10	\$ 152.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000267967 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2012-81	0.10	\$ 22.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000270891 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2012-258	0.10	\$ 22.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Electronic Surveying Petitions	0.80	\$ 100.00
		Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	MSHA Assessment Investigation and Research	70.90	\$ 15,976.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	101(c) Petition Fire Suppression Modification	0.40	\$ 70.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	American Eagle Mine; WEVA 2012-996 and WEVA 2012-999	0.60	\$ 105.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000215706 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2010-996	1.50	\$ 262.50
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000227784 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2010-1599	0.20	\$ 35.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000237281 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2011-537	3.90	\$ 592.50
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000242947 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-891	7.40	\$ 1,115.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000245651 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-1102	2.20	\$ 308.50
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000248498 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-1311	3.80	\$ 600.50
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000250991 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-1598	0.60	\$ 87.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000253895 (American Eagle Mine): WEVA 2011-1917 and WEVA 2011-1918	2.20	\$ 517.00

**SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED DURING  
THE COMPENSATION PERIOD BY JACKSON KELLY PLLC  
ORGANIZED BY INTERNAL PROJECT CATEGORY**

<b>PROJECT CATEGORY</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>CLIENT</b>	<b>MATTER</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>AMOUNT</b>
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000257054 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2011-2036	1.00	\$ 170.50
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000259753 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2011-2207 and WEVA 2011-2208	5.60	\$ 1,190.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000262590 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-2412	0.40	\$ 70.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000265768 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2012-17 and WEVA 2012-19	2.20	\$ 385.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000268443 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-124	1.30	\$ 209.50
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000274148 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-655	0.40	\$ 94.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000284555 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-999	2.50	\$ 392.50
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000285360 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-1102	3.20	\$ 524.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000291125 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-1453	3.50	\$ 560.00
		Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 175956 ( American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2009-871 & 2009-872	11.20	\$ 2,474.50
<b>6</b>	<b>Workers Compensation</b>			<b>8.08</b>	<b>\$ 2,532.20</b>
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Refunds	7.50	\$ 2,335.00
		Patriot Coal Corporation	Senate Bill Implementation	0.58	\$ 197.20
<b>Total Hours and Compensation Requested:</b>				<b>618.28</b>	<b>123,579.08</b>

**EXHIBIT D**

**Time Records**

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
<b>FEDERAL BLACK LUNG</b>					
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Baker, Bobby R.	Karim, Waseem A.	08/10/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence from Claimant regarding fee.
	<b>Baker, Bobby R. Total</b>			<b>0.10</b>	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Barker, Carlos (deceased); Barbara S. Barker (widow)	Vigneron, Morganna	07/30/12	0.10	Reviewing and preparing hearing calendar for attorney.
		Smith, Delores D.	08/01/12	0.20	Reviewing file(s).
		Smith, Delores D.	08/01/12	0.20	Reviewing notice of hearing.
		Smith, Delores D.	08/01/12	0.10	Correspondence to Wells Fargo Disability Management personnel re: hearing notice.
		Smith, Paula R.	08/07/12	0.10	Docketing response due date and updating claim(s) summary.
		Smith, Paula R.	08/07/12	0.10	Reviewing order.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/13/12	0.40	Reviewing and summarizing medical records.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/13/12	0.30	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/17/12	1.00	Drafting Administrative Law Judge Evidence Summary Form.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/17/12	1.00	Reviewing and summarizing medical records.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/17/12	0.50	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Green, Chris M.	08/28/12	0.10	Drafting memorandum to legal assistant.
		Green, Chris M.	08/28/12	0.10	Planning defense strategy regarding evidentiary development.
		Green, Chris M.	08/28/12	0.10	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Mattingly, William S.	08/28/12	0.10	Planning defense strategy.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/29/12	0.40	Additional work on medical summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/29/12	0.20	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/30/12	1.00	Arranging for review of medical records by consulting physician(s).
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/30/12	1.00	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
	<b>Barker, Carlos (deceased); Barbara S. Barker (widow) Total</b>			<b>7.00</b>	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Creech, Rush	Sigley, Marisa L.	07/12/12	0.10	Preparing memorandum to file regarding hearing status.
		Sigley, Marisa L.	07/12/12	0.10	Reviewing file following bankruptcy filing.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	07/27/12	0.20	Reviewing and cataloging medical evidence.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	07/27/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence regarding chest film.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/01/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence re: deposition of Dr. Jarboe.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/01/12	0.10	Reviewing file(s) to check status of transcript.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/04/12	0.20	Reviewing file(s) to check status of evidence and deadlines.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/04/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence re: depositions.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
	<b>Creech, Rush Total</b>			<b>1.00</b>	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Ellis, Donnie Eugene (deceased); Janice Alberta Ellis (widow)	Hammonds, Judy S.	07/12/12	2.00	Reviewing and summarizing medical records.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/12/12	2.00	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Smith, Delores D.	07/12/12	0.40	Arranging for depositions.
		Smith, Delores D.	07/12/12	0.30	Preparing notice of depositions (2).
		Smith, Delores D.	07/12/12	0.20	Telephone conference with physician re: scheduling deposition.
		Smith, Delores D.	07/12/12	0.10	Telephone conference with court reporter scheduling deposition.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	07/27/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence from Department of Labor and reviewing file(s) regarding claim status.
		Soukup, Jeffrey R.	08/08/12	0.20	Reviewing file(s) to prepare for deposition of Dr. Basheda.
		Smith, Delores D.	08/15/12	0.40	Preparing notice canceling deposition.
		Smith, Delores D.	08/15/12	0.20	Canceling deposition.
		Smith, Delores D.	08/15/12	0.20	Telephone conference with physician re: scheduling deposition.
		Smith, Delores D.	08/15/12	0.10	Telephone conference with claimant's representative re: scheduling deposition.
		Smith, Delores D.	08/15/12	0.10	Telephone conference with court reporter re: scheduling deposition.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/16/12	0.30	Reviewing and summarizing medical records.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/16/12	0.20	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/17/12	1.00	Drafting Administrative Law Judge Evidence Summary Form.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/17/12	1.00	Preparing prehearing report.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/17/12	0.50	Additional work on medical summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/17/12	0.50	Preparing exhibit list for Administrative Law Judge.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/17/12	0.30	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/17/12	0.20	Correspondence to Administrative Law Judge.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	08/25/12	0.70	Working on pre-hearing reports for Administrative Law Judge in anticipation of upcoming hearing.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/27/12	0.20	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/27/12	0.20	Revising prehearing report.
		Smith, Paula R.	08/30/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence.
		Smith, Paula R.	08/30/12	0.10	Updating detailed file summary.
		Vigneron, Morganna	08/30/12	0.10	Updating detailed file summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/31/12	0.20	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
	<b>Ellis, Donnie Eugene (deceased); Janice Alberta Ellis (widow) Total</b>			<b>11.90</b>	

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Freeman, Ermil A.	Calhoun, KD F.	07/23/12	1.90	Drafting motion to Benefits Review Board asking to hold case in abeyance pending appointment of counsel by Bankruptcy Court and updating detailed file summary.
		Snyder, Kathy L.	07/31/12	0.30	Planning appellate strategy.
		Snyder, Kathy L.	07/31/12	0.30	Reviewing director's brief.
		Snyder, Kathy L.	07/31/12	0.30	Reviewing file(s).
		Snyder, Kathy L.	08/01/12	0.20	Correspondence to client's representative regarding case status.
		Snyder, Kathy L.	08/01/12	0.20	Reviewing medicals and file regarding appellate strategy.
<b>Freeman, Ermil A. Total</b>				<b>3.20</b>	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Hall, Ronald D.	Rembrandt, Ann B.	08/26/12	0.30	Reviewing medical report(s) and correspondence to Chief Administrative Law Judge introducing evidence.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/27/12	0.20	Reviewing and summarizing medical records.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/27/12	0.10	Reviewing medicals and file.
<b>Hall, Ronald D. Total</b>				<b>0.60</b>	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	King, Robert T. (deceased); Betty Jean King (widow)	Karim, Waseem A.	07/30/12	0.20	Reviewing decision and order denying modification.
		Karim, Waseem A.	07/30/12	0.10	Correspondence to client's representative.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	07/30/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence regarding proposed decision and order denying request for modification.
<b>King, Robert T. (deceased); Betty Jean King (widow) Total</b>				<b>0.40</b>	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Mattas, Larry D.	Sigley, Marisa L.	07/12/12	0.10	Preparing memorandum to file regarding hearing status.
		Sigley, Marisa L.	07/12/12	0.10	Reviewing file following bankruptcy filing.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/17/12	0.30	Additional work on medical summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/17/12	0.20	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/17/12	0.10	Correspondence to physician(s).
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/18/12	0.30	Preparing prehearing report.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/18/12	0.20	Preparing exhibit list for Administrative Law Judge.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/18/12	0.20	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/18/12	0.20	Revise Administrative Law Judge evidence summary form.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/18/12	0.10	Correspondence to Administrative Law Judge.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	07/18/12	0.40	Revising and filing prehearing report, evidence summary form and exhibit list for Administrative Law Judge.
		Green, Chris M.	07/22/12	0.50	Preparing for deposition of Dr. Zaldivar.
		Green, Chris M.	07/22/12	0.40	Reviewing medical report(s) of Dr. Zaldivar.
		Green, Chris M.	07/22/12	0.30	Drafting deposition outline.
		Green, Chris M.	07/22/12	0.30	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Smith, Delores D.	07/25/12	0.10	Preparing notice rescheduling deposition.
Smith, Delores D.	07/25/12	0.10	Rescheduling deposition.		
Smith, Delores D.	07/25/12	0.10	Telephone conference with claimant's representative.		

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Smith, Delores D.	07/25/12	0.10	Telephone conference with court reporter re: scheduling deposition.
		Smith, Delores D.	07/25/12	0.10	Telephone conference with physician re: scheduling deposition.
		Green, Chris M.	07/27/12	0.10	Follow up regarding case status and preparing for deposition of Dr. Zaldivar.
		Green, Chris M.	07/29/12	0.20	Additional preparation for deposition of Dr. Zaldivar.
		Green, Chris M.	07/30/12	1.60	Representing client at deposition of Dr. Zaldivar.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/31/12	0.30	Additional work on medical summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/31/12	0.30	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	07/31/12	1.30	Preparing for deposition.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	07/31/12	1.00	Representing client at deposition of Dr. Rosenberg in Charleston, West Virginia.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	07/31/12	0.30	Conference with physician.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	07/31/12	0.30	Preparing deposition report.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/01/12	0.20	Reviewing and summarizing medical records.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/01/12	0.10	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Brick, Joshua M.	08/02/12	1.00	Researching Worldwide Equipment, Inc., to determine if it may be a responsible operator in black lung case against our client.
		Calhoun, KD F.	08/02/12	1.60	Preparing file and exhibit for 8/7/12 hearing.
		Snyder, Kathy L.	08/02/12	0.50	Drafting hearing notes regarding dependency, responsible operator, and timeliness issues.
		Snyder, Kathy L.	08/02/12	0.50	Instructing legal assistant regarding claimant exhibit list, updates to file summary, and preparing hearing documents.
		Snyder, Kathy L.	08/02/12	0.50	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Vigneron, Morganna	08/02/12	0.10	Updating detailed file summary.
		Roeder, George E.	08/03/12	1.10	Preparing for hearing, including reviewing evidence and drafting hearing notes.
		Roeder, George E.	08/03/12	1.00	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Wilson, Lisa F.	08/03/12	0.10	Telephone conference with claimant's representative requesting copy of evidence summary form.
		Roeder, George E.	08/04/12	6.30	Additional preparation for hearing, including reviewing Director's Exhibits, drafting questions for cross-examination of claimant and reviewing case law regarding issues which may be raised at hearing).
		Snyder, Kathy L.	08/04/12	0.50	Legal research regarding delivery person as "miner" within meaning of the Black Lung Benefits Act.
		Mattingly, William S.	08/06/12	0.20	Planning defense strategy regarding potential operator issue.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Roeder, George E.	08/06/12	1.20	Travel to Beckley for hearings.
		Roeder, George E.	08/06/12	1.00	Reviewing and revising hearing notes and questions for claimant and Administrative Law Judge evidence packet.
		Roeder, George E.	08/06/12	0.90	Additional preparation for hearing.
		Roeder, George E.	08/06/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with court reporter regarding transcript of Dr. Rosenberg deposition.
		Roeder, George E.	08/07/12	1.30	Representing client at hearing in Beckley.
		Roeder, George E.	08/07/12	1.00	Waiting for claim to be called for hearing.
		Roeder, George E.	08/08/12	1.20	Return travel from Beckley to Morgantown following hearing.
		Roeder, George E.	08/10/12	0.90	Preparing hearing report.
		Roeder, George E.	08/10/12	0.20	Preparing memorandum to file, including instructions to legal assistant regarding post-hearing action to be taken.
		Roeder, George E.	08/10/12	0.10	Updating detailed file summary regarding hearing and evidence and briefing schedule.
		Roeder, George E.	08/13/12	0.30	Reviewing and revising hearing report.
		Calhoun, KD F.	08/14/12	0.30	Calendaring post-hearing deadlines.
		Calhoun, KD F.	08/14/12	0.30	Updating detailed file summary.
		Wolfe, Zachary	08/14/12	0.20	Telephone conference with court reporter
		Calhoun, KD F.	08/15/12	0.30	Correspondence to Administrative Law Judge.
		Calhoun, KD F.	08/15/12	0.30	Updating detailed file summary.
		Roeder, George E.	08/15/12	0.70	Reviewing transcript of deposition(s) regarding Dr. Zaldivar testimony.
		Roeder, George E.	08/15/12	0.10	Preparing memorandum to file, including instructions to legal assistant regarding action to be taken.
		Sigley, Marisa L.	08/15/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence and calendaring briefing deadline.
		Calhoun, KD F.	08/22/12	0.30	Correspondence to Administrative Law Judge.
		Calhoun, KD F.	08/22/12	0.20	Updating detailed file summary.
		Roeder, George E.	08/28/12	0.20	Reviewing file(s) (regarding post-hearing evidence filed).
		<b>Mattas, Larry D. Total</b>		<b>34.50</b>	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	May, Andrew	Sigley, Marisa L.	07/12/12	0.10	Preparing memorandum to file regarding hearing status.
		Sigley, Marisa L.	07/12/12	0.10	Reviewing file following bankruptcy filing.
		<b>May, Andrew Total</b>		<b>0.20</b>	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	May, Andrew (deceased); Charlotte May (widow)	Hammonds, Judy S.	07/12/12	0.20	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/12/12	0.10	Correspondence requesting autopsy slides.
		Vigeneron, Morganna	07/26/12	0.10	Obtaining and cataloging chest x-rays and slides.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/21/12	0.50	Reviewing and summarizing medical records.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/21/12	0.30	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/22/12	0.30	Updating detailed file summary.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
<b>May, Andrew (deceased); Charlotte May (widow) Total</b>				<b>1.50</b>	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Miller, Donnie L.	Manchas, Penny L.	07/25/12	0.10	Forwarding File Status Update to S. Downey from A. Harman via e-mail
		Manchas, Penny L.	07/25/12	0.10	Reviewing claim for status.
<b>Miller, Donnie L. Total</b>				<b>0.20</b>	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Nelson, Melvin	Rembrandt, Ann B.	07/29/12	0.20	Reviewing claimant's motion for modification, new claimant's evidence, medical evidence of record and file.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	07/29/12	0.10	Correspondence to client's representative regarding claimant's modification request.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	07/29/12	0.10	Preparing memorandum to legal assistant(s) regarding evidentiary development.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/30/12	0.10	Arranging for review of x-rays by radiologist(s).
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/30/12	0.10	Reviewing and summarizing medical records.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/30/12	0.10	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Vigeneron, Morganna	08/30/12	0.10	Updating detailed file summary.
<b>Nelson, Melvin Total</b>				<b>0.80</b>	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Stowers, Jack V.	Calhoun, KD F.	08/09/12	0.20	Correspondence to client representative.
<b>Stowers, Jack V. Total</b>				<b>0.20</b>	
<b>Apogee Coal Company, LLC Total</b>				<b>61.60</b>	
Catenary Coal Company, LLC	Workman, Charles R.	Sigley, Marisa L.	07/12/12	0.10	Preparing memorandum to file regarding hearing status.
		Sigley, Marisa L.	07/12/12	0.10	Reviewing file following bankruptcy filing.
<b>Workman, Charles R. Total</b>				<b>0.20</b>	
<b>Catenary Coal Company, LLC Total</b>				<b>0.20</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	Bella, Charles, III	Sigley, Marisa L.	07/12/12	0.10	Preparing memorandum to file regarding hearing status.
		Sigley, Marisa L.	07/12/12	0.10	Reviewing file following bankruptcy filing.
<b>Bella, Charles, III Total</b>				<b>0.20</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	Chambers, Edgar Howard	Sigley, Marisa L.	07/12/12	0.10	Preparing memorandum to file regarding hearing status.
		Sigley, Marisa L.	07/12/12	0.10	Reviewing file following bankruptcy filing.
<b>Chambers, Edgar Howard Total</b>				<b>0.20</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	Chandler, Charles F. (deceased); Susan C. Chandler (widow)	Roeder, George E.	08/30/12	0.20	Preparing memorandum to file, including instructions to legal assistant regarding file closure.
		Roeder, George E.	08/30/12	0.20	Reviewing e-mail from Sandy Downey at Underwriters.
		Roeder, George E.	08/30/12	0.10	E-mail to Sandy Downey.
		Roeder, George E.	08/30/12	0.10	Reviewing file(s).
<b>Chandler, Charles F. (deceased); Susan C. Chandler (widow) Total</b>				<b>0.60</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	Epling, Carl R., Jr.	Harman, Ashley M.	07/25/12	1.00	Preparing petition for review and supporting brief to Benefits Review Board.
		Harman, Ashley M.	07/27/12	0.60	Additional work on preparing petition for review and supporting brief to Benefits Review Board regarding constitutionality issue.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Harman, Ashley M.	08/08/12	2.40	Additional work on Petition for Review and Supporting Brief to Benefits Review Board.
		Harman, Ashley M.	08/09/12	3.30	Additional work on preparing Petition for Review and Supporting Brief to Benefits Review Board.
		Harman, Ashley M.	08/10/12	1.20	Reviewing and revising Petition for Review and Supporting Brief to Benefits Review Board.
		Harman, Ashley M.	08/13/12	2.20	Finalizing and filing Petition for Review and Supporting Brief to Benefits Review Board.
	<b>Epling, Carl R., Jr. Total</b>			<b>10.70</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	Hatfield, James E.	Smith, Delores D.	07/24/12	0.10	Preparing memorandum to file.
		Smith, Delores D.	07/24/12	0.10	Telephone conference with judge's clerk re: hearing scheduled.
		Vigeneron, Morganna	07/30/12	0.20	Updating detailed file summary.
		Smith, Delores D.	08/01/12	0.20	Reviewing file(s).
		Smith, Delores D.	08/01/12	0.20	Reviewing notice of hearing.
		Smith, Delores D.	08/01/12	0.10	Correspondence to Wells Fargo Disability Management personnel re: hearing scheduled.
		Smith, Paula R.	08/07/12	0.10	Reviewing order.
		Smith, Paula R.	08/07/12	0.10	Updating claim(s) summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/13/12	0.10	Reviewing and summarizing medical records.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/13/12	0.10	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Smith, Delores D.	08/16/12	0.10	Telephone conference with client's representative re: hearing scheduled.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/28/12	0.30	Preparing file for new counsel.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/28/12	0.30	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/28/12	0.10	Correspondence to Administrative Law Judge.
		Vigeneron, Morganna	08/28/12	0.20	Obtaining and cataloging chest x-rays and reviewing file(s) and updating claim summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/29/12	0.70	Additional work preparing file for new counsel.
	<b>Hatfield, James E. Total</b>			<b>3.00</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	Woody, Donny G. (deceased); Darlene Woody (widow)	Harman, Ashley M.	08/07/12	0.60	Telephone conference(s) with claimant's counsel and Department of Labor claims examiner regarding payment of benefits.
		Harman, Ashley M.	08/29/12	0.10	Correspondence to client's representative.
		Harman, Ashley M.	08/29/12	0.10	Preparing memorandum to file.
		Harman, Ashley M.	08/29/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence from Department of Labor and reviewing order from Benefits Review Board concerning reimbursement to Department of Labor and attorney's fees.
	<b>Woody, Donny G. (deceased); Darlene Woody (widow) Total</b>			<b>0.90</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	Workman, Carl E., II	Hammonds, Judy S.	07/12/12	0.20	Reviewing and summarizing medical records.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/12/12	0.10	Correspondence regarding medical records.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/12/12	0.10	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/19/12	0.10	Updating detailed file summary.
		Vigneron, Morganna	07/19/12	0.10	Obtaining and cataloging chest x-rays, reviewing file(s), and updating claim summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/27/12	0.20	Additional work on medical summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/27/12	0.20	Preparing exhibit list for Administrative Law Judge.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/27/12	0.20	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/27/12	0.20	Revising evidence summary form.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/27/12	0.10	Correspondence to Administrative Law Judge.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/27/12	0.10	Preparing prehearing report.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/31/12	0.10	Additional work on medical summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/31/12	0.10	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/01/12	0.50	Additional work on Exhibit List, Evidence Summary Form and Pre-Hearing Report.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/01/12	0.50	Reviewing and summarizing medical records.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/01/12	0.50	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/02/12	0.30	Additional work on medical summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/02/12	0.30	Revising prehearing report.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/02/12	0.20	Correspondence regarding medical records.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/02/12	0.20	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/03/12	0.70	Additional work on medical summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/03/12	0.60	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/03/12	0.20	Correspondence to physician(s).
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/06/12	1.20	Additional work on medical summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/06/12	0.60	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/06/12	0.20	Correspondence to physician(s).
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	08/07/12	1.40	Preparing for deposition of Dr Basheda.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/08/12	0.30	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/08/12	0.20	Correspondence to physician(s).
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	08/08/12	1.00	Representing client at deposition of Dr. Basheda in Charleston, West Virginia.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	08/08/12	0.30	Conference with physician.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	08/08/12	0.30	Preparing deposition report.
		Smith, Delores D.	08/08/12	0.10	Telephone conference with personnel at physician's office and court reporter re: scheduling deposition.
		Vigneron, Morganna	08/10/12	0.10	Updating detailed file summary.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	08/13/12	1.30	Preparing for deposition of Dr. Zaldivar.
		Smith, Paula R.	08/13/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence.
		Smith, Paula R.	08/13/12	0.10	Updating detailed file summary.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	08/14/12	1.00	Representing client at deposition of Dr. Zaldivar in Charleston, West Virginia.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	08/14/12	0.30	Conference with physician.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	08/14/12	0.30	Preparing report of deposition of Dr. Zaldivar.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/20/12	0.20	Additional work on medical summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/20/12	0.20	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/21/12	0.10	Telephone conference with claimant's representative regarding deposition.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	08/21/12	1.30	Preparing for hearing.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	08/22/12	1.10	Representing client at hearing in Charleston, West Virginia.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	08/22/12	0.30	Preparing hearing report.
	<b>Workman, Carl E., II Total</b>			<b>17.80</b>	
<b>Hobet Mining, LLC Total</b>				<b>33.40</b>	
Patriot Coal Corporation	Farley, Elwood v. Sharples Coal	Vigneron, Morganna	08/16/12	0.10	Updating detailed file summary.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	08/17/12	1.50	Reviewing Administrative Law Judge order regarding denying employer's motion to dismiss for lack of subject matter jurisdiction and untimely modification request.
		Mattingly, William S.	08/17/12	0.50	Reviewing order and planning defense strategy.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	08/21/12	1.30	Legal research concerning regulations regarding noticing attorney appearances in support of motion for reconsideration.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	08/23/12	2.00	Drafting section of motion for reconsideration regarding notice of appearance before Office of Administrative Law Judges must be in writing.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	08/23/12	1.00	Analyzing Sharpe decision regarding what constitutes decision guided by erroneous legal principles.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	08/23/12	1.00	Drafting section of Closing Argument regarding failure to apply applicable Fourth Circuit case law.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	08/23/12	0.50	Analyzing case law regarding jurisdictional nature of statutory time periods for appeal.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	08/23/12	0.50	Legal research concerning argument in Motion for reconsideration.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	08/24/12	1.50	Additional work on motion to Administrative Law Judge for reconsideration.
		Gillen, Kevin T.	08/24/12	0.60	Reviewing and revising motion per supervising attorney.
		Mattingly, William S.	08/27/12	0.20	Reviewing and revising Motion To For Reconsideration.
	<b>Farley, Elwood v. Sharples Coal Total</b>			<b>10.70</b>	
Patriot Coal Corporation	Farley, Elwood (deceased); Leota Farley (widow) v. Sharples Coal Corp.	Vigneron, Morganna	08/16/12	0.10	Updating detailed file summary.
		Smith, Delores D.	08/17/12	0.10	Updating detailed file summary.
	<b>Farley, Elwood (deceased); Leota Farley (widow) v. Sharples Coal Corp. Total</b>			<b>0.10</b>	

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
Patriot Coal Corporation	Morris, Lee v. Ashland Coal, Inc.	Sigley, Marisa L.	07/11/12	1.00	Reviewing file following bankruptcy and preparing memorandum to file regarding medical developments.
		Sigley, Marisa L.	07/12/12	0.20	Reviewing file following bankruptcy filing and preparing memorandum to file regarding hearing status.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/23/12	0.20	Reviewing additional medicals and file and additional work on medical summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/02/12	0.20	Preparing HIPAA compliant medical authorization.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/02/12	0.10	Preparing interrogatories.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/02/12	0.10	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/06/12	0.40	Drafting Administrative Law Judge evidence summary form.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/06/12	0.20	Reviewing medicals and file; reviewing and summarizing medical records; correspondence to claimant; drafting Administrative Law Judge evidence summary form.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/06/12	0.10	Correspondence to claimant.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/06/12	0.10	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/17/12	0.10	Preparing memorandum to file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/17/12	0.10	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/17/12	0.10	Telephone conference with claimant.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/17/12	0.10	Telephone conference with personnel at physician's office.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	08/25/12	0.20	Preparing and filing preliminary evidence summary form to claimant in accordance with pre-hearing order.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	08/25/12	0.20	Working on motion to dismiss claim due to claimant's failure to attend examination or answer discovery.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	08/25/12	0.10	Correspondence to Administrative Law Judge submitting evidence.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	08/25/12	0.10	Reviewing e-mail from legal assistant regarding status of evidentiary development.
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	08/25/12	0.10	Reviewing medical report(s).
		Rembrandt, Ann B.	08/30/12	0.20	Completing and filing motion for dismiss for reason of abandonment.
		Smith, Paula R.	08/30/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence.
		Smith, Paula R.	08/30/12	0.10	Updating detailed file summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/31/12	0.30	Preparing prehearing report.
Hammonds, Judy S.	08/31/12	0.20	Preparing exhibit list for Administrative Law Judge.		
Hammonds, Judy S.	08/31/12	0.10	Additional work on medical summary.		
Hammonds, Judy S.	08/31/12	0.10	Correspondence to Administrative Law Judge.		
Hammonds, Judy S.	08/31/12	0.10	Reviewing additional medicals and file.		
<b>Morris, Lee v. Ashland Coal, Inc. Total</b>				<b>4.90</b>	
Patriot Coal Corporation	Powell, Homer J. (deceased); Betty Jo Powell	Taulbee, Melissa L.	07/28/12	0.30	Updating file regarding notice of hearing.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
	(widow) v. Arch of KY	Taulbee, Melissa L.	07/28/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	07/28/12	0.10	Reviewing file(s).
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	07/28/12	0.10	Reviewing notice of hearing.
		Karim, Waseem A.	07/30/12	0.50	Correspondence to Administrative Law Judge submitting evidence.
		Karim, Waseem A.	07/30/12	0.30	Reviewing medical report(s).
		Karim, Waseem A.	07/30/12	0.20	Planning defense strategy regarding hearing.
		Karim, Waseem A.	07/30/12	0.20	Preparing memorandum to file regarding medical development.
		Karim, Waseem A.	07/30/12	0.20	Reviewing director's exhibits.
		Karim, Waseem A.	07/30/12	0.20	Reviewing file(s).
		Mitchell, Janet L.	07/30/12	2.20	Arranging for review of medical records by consulting physicians, Dr. Castle and Dr. Basheda.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	07/30/12	0.50	Preparing interrogatories.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	07/30/12	0.50	Preparing medical records to consulting doctors.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	07/30/12	0.30	Preparing HIPAA authorization release.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	07/30/12	0.20	Correspondence to claimant's representative.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	07/30/12	0.20	Updating detailed file summary with procedural history.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	07/30/12	0.10	Docketing and calendaring hearing deadlines.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	07/30/12	0.10	Preparing memorandum to file.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/01/12	0.20	Reviewing correspondence re: evidence.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/01/12	0.10	Additional preparation of file for hearing.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/01/12	0.10	Reviewing file(s).
		Smith, Delores D.	08/02/12	0.10	Reviewing notice of hearing.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/04/12	0.20	Arranging for deposition.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/04/12	0.20	Preparing notice of deposition.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/04/12	0.20	Reviewing file(s).
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/04/12	0.20	Telephone conference with physician.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/04/12	0.20	Updating file regarding deposition.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/04/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/04/12	0.10	Telephone conference with court reporter.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/13/12	0.70	Preparing medical designation form.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/13/12	0.70	Updating detailed file summary: procedural history.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/13/12	0.30	Preparing exhibit list for Administrative Law Judge.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/13/12	0.30	Updating file re: deposition.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/13/12	0.20	E-mail to Dr. Castle re: deposition.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/13/12	0.20	Reviewing file(s).
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/13/12	0.10	Arranging for deposition.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/13/12	0.10	E-mail to court reporter.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/13/12	0.10	Preparing notice of deposition.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/13/12	0.10	Telephone conference with court reporter.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/13/12	0.10	Telephone conference with personnel at physician's office (Dr. Basheda).
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/13/12	0.10	Telephone conference with physician.
		Karim, Waseem A.	08/14/12	0.70	Drafting prehearing report for Administrative Law Judge.
		Karim, Waseem A.	08/14/12	0.40	Planning defense strategy.
		Karim, Waseem A.	08/14/12	0.30	Working on motion to submit evidence post-hearing.
		Karim, Waseem A.	08/14/12	0.20	Preparing exhibit list for Administrative Law Judge.
		Karim, Waseem A.	08/14/12	0.20	Preparing memorandum to file regarding x-rays.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/14/12	1.10	Revision to exhibit list and medical designation form.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/14/12	0.20	E-mail to Dr. Castle regarding status of consultation report.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/14/12	0.10	Additional telephone conference(s) with opposing counsel.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/14/12	0.10	Telephone conference with claimant's representative.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/15/12	0.10	Preparing memorandum to file.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/15/12	0.10	Telephone conference with claimant's representative.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/16/12	0.10	Reviewing file(s).
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/16/12	0.10	Telephone conference with claimant's representative.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/16/12	0.10	Telephone conference with personnel at physician's office ( Dr. Basheda ) re: deposition.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/18/12	0.50	Reviewing file(s)/preparing file for upcoming deposition.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/18/12	0.20	Calendar/docket deposition of Dr. Castle/deadline to prepare evidence for review.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/18/12	0.20	Reviewing Claimant's Motion for Continuance.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/20/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence regarding motion for continuance.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/20/12	0.20	Reviewing file(s).
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/20/12	0.10	Reviewing e-mail from Dr. Castle's office re: rescheduling deposition.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/20/12	0.10	Telephone conference with claimant's representative re: depositions.
		Karim, Waseem A.	08/21/12	0.10	Reviewing Claimant's motion to continue hearing.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/21/12	0.20	Telephone conference with claimant's representative.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/21/12	0.20	Telephone conference with court reporter.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/21/12	0.20	Telephone conference with physician.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/21/12	0.10	Canceling depositions.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/21/12	0.10	E-mail to court reporter re: cancellation.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/21/12	0.10	Preparing notice canceling deposition (Dr. Basheda).
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/21/12	0.10	Preparing notice canceling deposition (Dr. Castle).
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/21/12	0.10	Reviewing and responding to e-mail from Dr. Castle's office re: deposition of Dr. Castle.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/21/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence re: claimant's motion for continuance.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/21/12	0.10	Reviewing file(s).
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/21/12	0.10	Telephone conference with claimant's representative re: rescheduling deposition.
		Taulbee, Melissa L.	08/21/12	0.10	Updating file and calendar re: cancellations.
		Smith, Delores D.	08/22/12	0.10	Reviewing notice of deposition.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/24/12	0.10	Docketing and calendaring status of request.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/24/12	0.10	E-mail to Dr. Castle regarding report deadline.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/24/12	0.10	Reviewing file(s) regarding Dr. Castle's consult report.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/27/12	0.40	Correspondence to Administrative Law Judge.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/27/12	0.40	Correspondence to claimant's representative.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/27/12	0.30	Correspondence to UK Samaritan Hospital.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/27/12	0.30	Correspondence regarding x-rays.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/27/12	0.10	Docketing and calendaring status of request.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/29/12	0.50	Updating detailed file summary: evidence of Dr. Basheda.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/29/12	0.30	Correspondence to physician(s).
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/30/12	0.10	Preparing memorandum to file.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/30/12	0.10	Reviewing file(s) regarding interrogatory answers.
		Karim, Waseem A.	08/31/12	0.40	Reviewing medical report(s) - Dr. Basheda and reviewing file(s).
		Karim, Waseem A.	08/31/12	0.20	Planning defense strategy.
		Karim, Waseem A.	08/31/12	0.10	Correspondence to Administrative Law Judge submitting medical evidence.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/31/12	0.40	Correspondence to Administrative Law Judge.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/31/12	0.30	Correspondence to Department of Labor.
		Mitchell, Janet L.	08/31/12	0.10	Docket and calendar discovery request.
<b>Powell, Homer J. (deceased); Betty Jo Powell (widow) v. Arch of KY Total</b>				<b>22.20</b>	
Patriot Coal Corporation	Sutphin, James E. v. Sharples Coal	Sigley, Marisa L.	07/12/12	0.10	Preparing memorandum to file regarding hearing status.
		Sigley, Marisa L.	07/12/12	0.10	Reviewing file following bankruptcy filing.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/25/12	0.30	Additional work on medical summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	07/25/12	0.20	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/07/12	0.50	Drafting Administrative Law Judge Evidence Summary Form.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/07/12	0.50	Reviewing and summarizing medical records.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/07/12	0.30	Reviewing medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/07/12	0.20	Correspondence to claimant's representative.
		Green, Chris M.	08/08/12	0.40	Completing and filing evidence summary form.
		Green, Chris M.	08/08/12	0.30	Reviewing medical report(s) of Dr. Fino.
		Green, Chris M.	08/08/12	0.10	Completing and filing submission of report of Dr. Fino.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Green, Chris M.	08/08/12	0.10	Drafting memorandum to legal assistant.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/09/12	0.50	Additional work on medical summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/09/12	0.30	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Smith, Delores D.	08/13/12	0.30	Arranging for depositions.
		Smith, Delores D.	08/13/12	0.30	Preparing notice of depositions (2).
		Smith, Delores D.	08/13/12	0.20	Telephone conference with court reporter re: scheduling deposition.
		Smith, Delores D.	08/13/12	0.20	Telephone conference with physician scheduling deposition.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/14/12	0.20	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/14/12	0.10	Arranging for review of x-rays by radiologist(s).
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/20/12	0.20	Arranging for review of x-rays by radiologist(s).
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/20/12	0.10	Correspondence to claimant's representative.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/20/12	0.10	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Green, Chris M.	08/23/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence from claimant.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/24/12	0.20	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/24/12	0.10	Correspondence to claimant's representative.
		Vignerone, Morganna	08/27/12	0.10	Obtaining and cataloging chest x-rays.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/31/12	0.30	Additional work on medical summary.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/31/12	0.30	Preparing prehearing report.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/31/12	0.20	Correspondence to Administrative Law Judge.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/31/12	0.20	Preparing exhibit list for Administrative Law Judge.
		Hammonds, Judy S.	08/31/12	0.20	Reviewing additional medicals and file.
	<b>Sutphin, James v. Sharples Coal E. Total</b>			<b>7.30</b>	
<b>Patriot Coal Corporation Total</b>				<b>45.30</b>	
<b>BLACK LUNG TOTAL</b>				<b>140.50</b>	

**COMMERCIAL**

Patriot Coal Corporation	Asset Purchase Agreement Form	Loeb, Jr., Charles W.	08/22/12	1.10	Working on form asset purchase agreement concerning West Virginia and Kentucky property
		Loeb, Jr., Charles W.	08/22/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with Mr. Tucker re: form asset purchase agreement concerning West Virginia and Kentucky property
		Loeb, Jr., Charles W.	08/23/12	0.30	Additional work on asset purchase agreement structure bankruptcy issues.
		Brumley, Christina T.	08/24/12	0.40	Conference with Mr. Dobbs re: form asset purchase agreement for potential sales.
		Brumley, Christina T.	08/24/12	0.40	Telephone conference(s) with Messrs. Tucker and Dobbs re: form asset purchase agreement for potential sales.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	08/24/12	0.40	Telephone conference(s) with Ms. Brumley and Mr. Tucker re: terms of draft asset sale agreement.
		Brumley, Christina T.	08/27/12	0.30	Conference with Mr. Nicholson re: form of asset purchase agreement.
		Nicholson, Roger	08/27/12	0.50	Conference with C. Brumley re: form of APA.
		Brumley, Christina T.	08/28/12	0.30	Working on form asset purchase agreement.
		Brumley, Christina T.	08/28/12	0.10	Responding to e-mail correspondence from Messrs. Nicholson and Dobbs re: form asset purchase agreement.
		Brumley, Christina T.	08/28/12	0.10	Reviewing e-mail correspondence from Messrs. Nicholson and Dobbs re: form of asset purchase agreement.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	08/28/12	0.70	E-mails Ms. Brumley and Mr. Nicholson re: reviewing and revision of draft sales agreement.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	08/28/12	0.50	Reviewing draft sales agreement.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	08/28/12	0.50	Revising draft sales agreement.
		Nicholson, Roger	08/28/12	4.50	Draft form asset sale agreement.
		Brumley, Christina T.	08/29/12	1.50	Working on form asset purchase agreement.
		Brumley, Christina T.	08/29/12	0.50	Telephone conference with Mr. Nicholson concerning acquired assets.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	08/29/12	0.30	E-mails and telephone conference(s) with Ms. Brumley re: contract issues.
		Nicholson, Roger	08/29/12	0.70	Correspondence re: draft APA issues; conference with C. Brumley re: proposed revisions.
		Brumley, Christina T.	08/31/12	2.00	Working on form Asset Purchase Agreement.
	<b>Asset Purchase Agreement Form Total</b>			<b>15.20</b>	
<b>Patriot Coal Corporation Total</b>				<b>15.20</b>	
<b>COMMERCIAL TOTAL</b>				<b>15.20</b>	

**DELIBERATE INTENT LITIGATION**

Patriot Coal Corporation	John Palmer, et al. v. John Renner; Eastern Associated Coal, LLC; and Patriot Coal Corporation; et al.	Adkins, Wendy G.	07/11/12	0.10	Finalizing notice of stay to advise circuit court of pending bankruptcy.
<b>John Palmer, et al. v. John Renner; Eastern Assoc. Coal, LLC; and Patriot Coal Corp.; et al. Total</b>				<b>0.10</b>	
Patriot Coal Corporation	John Renner, et al. v. Eastern Associated Coal, LLC; Patriot Coal Corporation; et al.	Adkins, Wendy G.	07/09/12	0.20	Drafting e-mail correspondence to D. Allard as follow-up regarding scheduling employee interviews.
		Adkins, Wendy G.	07/09/12	0.10	Drafting e-mail correspondence to West Virginia Mine Safety and Health Administration requesting interview of T. Rankin.
		LaCagnin, Steve M.	07/09/12	1.20	Preparing for deposition of J. Renner.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		LaCagnin, Steve M.	07/10/12	3.20	Preparing outline of J. Renner deposition testimony.
		Adkins, Wendy G.	07/11/12	0.10	Finalizing notice of stay to advise circuit court of pending bankruptcy.
		LaCagnin, Steve M.	07/11/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with W. Adkins regarding stay in bankruptcy.
		LaCagnin, Steve M.	07/11/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with E. Waller regarding stay in bankruptcy.
<b>John Renner, et al. v. Eastern Associated Coal, LLC; Patriot Coal Corporation; et al. Total</b>				<b>5.10</b>	
<b>Patriot Coal Corporation Total</b>				<b>5.20</b>	
<b>DELIBERATE INTENT LITIGATION TOTAL</b>				<b>5.20</b>	
<b>ENVIRONMENTAL GENERAL</b>					
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Ohio Valley Environmental Coalition, Inc. and West Virginia Highlands Conservancy, Inc. v. Apogee Coal Company, LLC and Hobet Mining, LLC	Gardner, Blair M.	07/09/12	0.50	Completing and filing status report.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/09/12	0.60	Reviewing status report, notifying client of needed change, and file.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/31/12	0.40	Bi-weekly telephone conference(s) with Special Master re: Consent Decree
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/10/12	0.40	Review Project 3rd Quarter report; forward to Special Master, opposing counsel.
		Roehl, Charles A.	08/24/12	0.40	Updating pleadings file and index
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/28/12	0.20	Bi-weekly telephone conference(s) with Special Master re: Consent Decree
<b>OVEC, Inc. and WV Highlands Conservancy, Inc. v. Apogee Coal Company, LLC</b>				<b>2.50</b>	
<b>Apogee Coal Company, LLC Total</b>				<b>2.50</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	OVEC Re: Hobet 22 Temporary Restraining Order Motion	Gardner, Blair M.	07/09/12	0.40	Reviewing status report.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/09/12	0.10	Notifying client of needed change to report
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/09/12	0.30	Reviewing and responding to e-mail from A. McCallister
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/09/12	1.00	Telephone conference(s) with A. McCallister
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/09/12	0.10	Arranging meeting accommodation.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/09/12	0.70	Revising letter notifying court of bankruptcy filing.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/09/12	0.40	Telephone conference(s) with R. Verheij and A. McCallister
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/09/12	0.40	Reviewing complete states report.
		McLusky, Robert G.	07/09/12	1.00	Discussing status of discussions with opposing counsel and vendors.
		McLusky, Robert G.	07/09/12	0.50	Correspondence to client's representative.
		McLusky, Robert G.	07/09/12	0.50	Reviewing two orders entered by court extending compliance deadlines.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		McLusky, Robert G.	07/09/12	0.10	Correspondence to client's representative.
		Roehl, Charles A.	07/30/12	0.80	Updating pleadings file and index
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/03/12	2.10	Revise motion to extend.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/03/12	0.30	Telephone conference(s) with A. McCallister re: motion to extend.
		Heishman, Aaron S.	08/03/12	0.20	Update motion to modify consent decree requiring selenium treatment at Hobet.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/07/12	1.90	Revise motion to extend date for compliance.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/08/12	1.30	Draft motion for extension.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/08/12	0.40	Draft order.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/08/12	1.00	Meet with R. Verheij, A. McCallister re motion to modify order.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/08/12	0.40	Review and file status report.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/08/12	0.50	Revise motion.
		McLusky, Robert G.	08/08/12	0.60	Meet with client's representatives to discuss motion to extend compliance date of consent order.
		McLusky, Robert G.	08/08/12	0.30	Working on draft motions for extension.
		McLusky, Robert G.	08/08/12	0.20	Reviewing additional draft motion.
		McLusky, Robert G.	08/08/12	0.20	Reviewing correspondence from Court's law clerk.
		McLusky, Robert G.	08/08/12	0.10	Reviewing additional correspondence from Judge's law clerk.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/09/12	1.00	Telephone conference(s) with clients re: motion to modify consent decree.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/09/12	0.40	Telephone conference(s) with I. Forman, clerk with Judge Chambers, re: motion to modify consent decree.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/09/12	0.90	Telephone conference(s) with opposing counsel re: motion to modify consent decree.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/10/12	0.40	Discuss next activities for hearing on 8/16 with R. McLusky.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/10/12	0.80	Telephone conference(s) client, court, opposing counsel.
		McLusky, Robert G.	08/10/12	0.90	Meet with client's representatives to prepare for call.
		McLusky, Robert G.	08/10/12	0.30	Conference call with court re: selenium consent orders.
		McLusky, Robert G.	08/10/12	0.30	Discuss upcoming conference call with court with client's representatives.
		Roehl, Charles A.	08/10/12	0.50	Updating pleadings file and index
		Roehl, Charles A.	08/13/12	0.80	Updating pleadings file and index
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/14/12	3.70	Revise motion.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/14/12	0.80	Telephone conference(s) R. Verheij, A. McCallister re motion.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/15/12	0.60	Prepare for hearing re: motion for extension.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/15/12	1.30	Revise motion for extension.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/15/12	0.30	Telephone conference(s) with A. McCallister re: motion for extension.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/15/12	0.30	Telephone conference(s) with R. Verheij re: motion for extension.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/16/12	0.50	Forward extension Order.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/16/12	0.50	Meet with R. Verheij and A. McCallister to discuss hearing re: motion to extend.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/16/12	0.50	Provide R. McLusky with documents for extention hearing.
		McLusky, Robert G.	08/16/12	0.80	Appearing and representing client at hearing in federal court in Huntington.
		McLusky, Robert G.	08/16/12	0.50	Meet with client's representatives to prepare for hearing in Huntington.
		Roehl, Charles A.	08/24/12	0.70	Updating pleadings file and index
<b>OVEC Re: Hobet 22 Temporary Restraining Order Motion Total</b>				<b>32.60</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	Selenium Issues	Gardner, Blair M.	08/20/12	0.40	Forward information regarding revisions to Consent Decree and Settlement to Client, DEP.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/20/12	0.40	Revise documents re: settlement
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/20/12	0.40	Telephone conference(s) with A. McCallister regarding revision of documents.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/20/12	0.40	Telephone conference(s) with J. Frame regarding extension to comply.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/22/12	0.20	Responding to e-mail from I. France re: consent decree.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/22/12	0.10	Reviewing e-mail from I. France re: consent decree.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/22/12	0.30	Revising consent decree.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/22/12	0.20	Revising settlement.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/23/12	1.00	Meet at DEP to review status of selenium compliance at Hobet.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/23/12	0.50	Revise proposed order.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/27/12	0.90	Draft proposed motion to exten time to enter settlement.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/27/12	0.20	Forward motion to extend to client.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/27/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with A. McCallister re: motion to extend.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/28/12	0.30	Revising motion to extend time to enter settlement.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/28/12	0.10	Revising order to extend time to enter settlement.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/28/12	0.40	Telephone conference(s) with J. Frame re: mortion to extend.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/28/12	0.40	Transmit extension documents to DEP.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/29/12	0.40	Revise motion re: settlement.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/29/12	0.30	Revise proposed order re: settlement.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/29/12	0.70	Telephone conference(s) with A. McCallister and circuit court re: extending time to settle.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/31/12	2.20	Review file to identify date of original notice of intent which commenced action.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/31/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with Boone County Circuit Court regarding order.
	<b>Selenium Issues Total</b>			<b>10.00</b>	
<b>Hobet Mining, LLC Total</b>				<b>42.60</b>	
Patriot Coal Corporation	Appeal of Selenium Compliance Orders	McLusky, Robert G.	07/09/12	0.50	Correspondence to client's representative.
	<b>Appeal of Selenium Compliance Orders Total</b>			<b>0.50</b>	
Patriot Coal Corporation	Ohio Valley Environmental Coalition, Inc. (OVEC); West Virginia Highlands Conservancy, Inc. and Sierra Club v. Patriot Coal Corporation; et al.	Gardner, Blair M.	07/09/12	1.50	Revising June 22, 2012 letter to A. McCallister on operation and affect of AVS.
		McLusky, Robert G.	07/09/12	1.00	Discussing status of discussions with opposing counsel and vendors.
		McLusky, Robert G.	07/09/12	0.50	Reviewing two orders entered by court extending compliance deadlines.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/10/12	2.40	Distributing notice of bankruptcy filing to court, Special Master.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/10/12	1.20	Telephone conference(s) with R. Verheij and A. McCallister re: impact on litigation.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/11/12	2.40	Continue revising previous memorandum regarding purpose notice of bankruptcy in penalty cases.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/11/12	0.60	Reviewing legal memoranda re: AVS.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/11/12	0.40	Telephone conference(s) with K. McGuire regarding Kentucky regulations and violations that trigger AVS, reviewing legal memoranda, and continue revising previous memorandum regarding purpose notice of bankruptcy in penalty cases.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/12/12	5.70	Continue working on memorandum identifying permit blocking and administrative enforcement for non-payment of fees or environmental violation.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/12/12	0.10	E-mailing client re: identifying permit blocking and administrative enforcement for non-payment of fees or environmental violation.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/13/12	0.30	E-mail to A. McCallister regarding revocation of licenses for non-payment of taxes.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/13/12	0.70	E-mail to B. Haber, DPW, regarding distinction between AML and severance tax and liability of non-payment of each.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/13/12	1.00	Reviewing Kentucky statues regarding severance taxes.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/13/12	1.00	Reviewing West Virginia taxes statutes regarding officer and director liability for taxes.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/16/12	0.90	Revising memorandum on AVS and permit blocking.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/16/12	0.40	Telephone conference(s) with A. McCallister regarding tax liability memorandum.
		Roehl, Charles A.	07/17/12	0.30	Updating pleadings file and index.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/18/12	0.90	Revising motion for modification of orders.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/18/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with R. Verheij and A. McCallister to schedule hearing in accordance with discussions.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/18/12	0.10	Sending motion to client.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/19/12	0.10	Delivering new motion.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/19/12	0.80	Drafting new motion for modification.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/19/12	1.80	Drafting new motion for negotiator per A. McCallister.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/19/12	0.20	Reviewing changes to previous motion to modify.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/19/12	0.20	Revising motion to modify.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/19/12	0.10	Sending motion to A. McCallister.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/20/12	0.10	Delivering revised motion.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/20/12	0.20	Responding to e-mail from A. McCallister regarding updating information on civil actions against Patriot and subsidiaries.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/20/12	0.10	Reviewing e-mail from A. McCallister regarding updating information on civil actions against Patriot and subsidiaries.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/20/12	0.40	Telephone conference(s) with A. McCallister.
		Mairs, John A.	07/23/12	1.30	Legal research regarding officer liability for non-payment of West Virginia severance tax.
		Tweel, Robert G.	07/23/12	1.00	Conference regarding severance tax issues with D. McCalister and J. Mairs.
		Mairs, John A.	07/24/12	4.00	Preparing opinion letter regarding whether corporate officers can be made personally liable for failure of company to pay West Virginia severance tax.
		Tweel, Robert G.	07/24/12	0.50	Additional work on draft letter.
		Tweel, Robert G.	07/24/12	0.50	Reviewing draft letter.
		Mairs, John A.	07/25/12	0.70	Finalizing opinion letter to A. McCallister.
		Tweel, Robert G.	07/25/12	0.10	Reviewing final latter and transmittal e-mail.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/26/12	0.20	Responding to e-mail from A. McCallister regarding administrative action.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/26/12	0.20	Responding to e-mail from client and DPW.
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/26/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with H. Baker and DPW.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Gardner, Blair M.	07/26/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with Patriot management and DPW regarding obligation to pay subsidence claims and regulatory sanction for non-payment.
		Roehl, Charles A.	07/30/12	0.80	Updating pleadings file and index
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/01/12	0.10	Review revisions to AVS memo made by summer associate.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/02/12	0.80	Telephone conference(s) with A. McCallister, R. Verheij.
		McLusky, Robert G.	08/02/12	0.20	Meet with client's representative to discuss August 10 hearing.
		McLusky, Robert G.	08/06/12	0.30	Reviewing and editing draft motion to extend deadlines and reduce letter of credit posting.
		Sebok, Al F.	08/09/12	0.20	Conference re: hearing on motion for contempt and objection to participation by third-party at hearing.
		Roehl, Charles A.	08/13/12	0.40	Updating pleadings file and index
		Roehl, Charles A.	08/24/12	0.40	Updating pleadings file and index
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/28/12	0.10	Deliver AVS memo to client.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/28/12	1.70	Revise AVS memo.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/29/12	0.10	Revise AVS memorandum.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/29/12	0.10	Send AVS memo to DPW per client.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/31/12	0.10	Deliver revised AVS memo to OPW.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/31/12	1.50	Review AVS memo with A. McCallister.
		Gardner, Blair M.	08/31/12	1.60	Revise AVS memo.
	<b>OVEC; WV Highlands Conservancy, Inc. and Sierra Club v. Patriot Coal Corporation, et al. Total</b>			<b>42.90</b>	
	<b>Patriot Coal Corporation Total</b>			<b>43.40</b>	
	<b>ENVIRONMENTAL (GENERAL) TOTAL</b>			<b>88.50</b>	

**SAFETY AND HEALTH**

Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000192932 (Guyan Mine); WEVA 2009-1786	Cimino, Michael T.	07/27/12	0.20	E-mail traffic with A. Presler regarding settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/27/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with A. Presler regarding settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/27/12	0.20	Working on settlement.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/27/12	0.30	Preparing for conference.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/27/12	0.20	Reviewing order regarding conference.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/27/12	0.10	Calculating penalty reductions per our settlement demand.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/01/12	0.40	Email traffic regarding settlement.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/01/12	0.20	Updating settlement chart to prepare for conference with Administrative Law Judge.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/01/12	0.10	Reviewing offer from Solicitor.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/06/12	0.20	Working on issues regarding settlement negotiations.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/07/12	0.10	Review of email from Mr. Presler regarding settlement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/07/12	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/08/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with Solicitor regarding upcoming conference with Administrative Law Judge.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/08/12	0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/09/12	0.80	Working on issues regarding settlement negotiations.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/14/12	0.50	Working on settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/14/12	0.10	Review of Order from Judge Weisberger.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/14/12	0.30	Preparing settlement chart of offers.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/14/12	0.10	Receiving counter offer from Solicitor.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/14/12	0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/17/12	2.00	Working on settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/21/12	1.10	Working on settlement.
<b>Case No. 000192932 (Guyan Mine); WEVA 2009-1786 Total</b>				<b>8.20</b>	
Apogee Coal Company, LLC	Guyan Surface Mine/Richard Young, Jr. Fatality	Cimino, Michael T.	07/16/12	0.30	Reviewing citations and file material.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/16/12	0.20	Preparing defenses to citations.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/16/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with Ms. Hafeez regarding status.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/16/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with S. Grubbs regarding status.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/16/12	0.10	Correspondence to S. Grubbs regarding status.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/17/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence from S. Grubbs regarding status.
<b>Guyan Surface Mine/Richard Young, Jr. Fatality Total</b>				<b>1.10</b>	
<b>Apogee Coal Company, LLC Total</b>				<b>9.30</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	105(c) Travis Catsonis; MORG-CD-2012-07	Cimino, Michael T.	07/13/12	0.50	Working on issues regarding position statement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/13/12	0.30	Telephone conference(s) with M. Radosevich re: interviews
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/13/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with M. Radosevich re: interviews.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/19/12	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/20/12	1.50	Conducting factual investigation into underlying 105 (c) case.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/23/12	1.20	Working on issues regarding position statement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/26/12	1.90	Working on position statement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/26/12	0.50	Legal research regarding 105 (c) law issues.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/26/12	0.50	Working on investigation into underlying complaint.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/27/12	1.50	Working on position statement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/27/12	0.80	Working on investigation into underlying complaint.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/27/12	0.70	Legal research regarding 105 (c) claims issues.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/28/12	1.50	Working on position statement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/29/12	1.00	Working on position statement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/30/12	0.30	E-mail traffic regarding position statement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/30/12	0.20	Preparing position statement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/30/12	2.30	Drafting and editing position statement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/30/12	1.10	Reviewing and analyzing file.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/31/12	1.40	Drafting and finalizing position statement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/01/12	0.20	Email traffic regarding position statement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/08/12	0.20	Email traffic regarding serving complaint.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/08/12	0.10	Review of correspondence from Mr. Radosevich re: interviews.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/10/12	0.50	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/13/12	0.40	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/14/12	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/15/12	0.10	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/20/12	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/21/12	0.50	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/22/12	0.90	Working on investigation into facts underlying new 105(c) complaint.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/23/12	1.20	Conducting investigation into underlying 105 (c) complaint.
	<b>105(c) Travis Catsonis; MORG-CD-2012-07 Total</b>			<b>22.30</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000166204 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2009-229	Webb, Jason P.	08/08/12	1.30	Prepare settlement proposal.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/08/12	0.60	Review file.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/08/12	0.20	E-mail Bob Phillips regarding missing rebuttals.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/08/12	0.10	E-mail E. Waller.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/09/12	0.10	Review additional information provided by R. Phillips
		Webb, Jason P.	08/14/12	0.10	Reminder settlement
		Zalewski, Larry A.	08/15/12	0.20	Review pleadings, status regarding settlement.
	<b>Case No. 000166204 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2009-229 Total</b>			<b>2.60</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000222396 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-198	Webb, Jason P.	07/17/12	0.10	Consulting with H. Moore.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/17/12	0.10	E-mail Solicitor.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/17/12	0.10	Reviewing proposed motion and order.
	<b>Case No. 000222396 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-198 Total</b>			<b>0.30</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000244760 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-932	Webb, Jason P.	07/09/12	0.90	Reviewing file, conferring with A. Wolfson and H. Moore, and e-mail E. Waller.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/11/12	1.00	Telephone call with Mine.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/11/12	0.50	Consulting with H. Moore and A. Wolfson.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/11/12	0.50	Telephone call with Judge.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/11/12	0.30	Drafting settlement e-mail.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Webb, Jason P.	07/11/12	0.20	E-mail Solicitor regarding discovery.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/31/12	0.40	Telephone call with Solicitor.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/31/12	0.30	Conference with A. Wolfson.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/31/12	0.20	Telephone call with B. Phillips.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/31/12	0.10	Drafting e-mail to Solicitor.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	08/01/12	0.20	Review ALJ order, pleadings regarding case status.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/06/12	0.30	Email with Solicitor and reviewing information.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/06/12	0.20	Email Bob Phillips regarding interview with Mark Gourd.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/08/12	0.50	Call with Mark G.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/08/12	0.10	Responding to SOL email.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/09/12	6.00	Preparing motion to compel.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/09/12	0.20	Consulting with A. Wolfson.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/09/12	0.20	Emailing Waller (x2).
		Webb, Jason P.	08/09/12	0.20	Emailing Waller regarding motion to compel
		Webb, Jason P.	08/10/12	4.00	Prepare/edit motion and statements in support thereof
		Webb, Jason P.	08/13/12	1.50	Preparing motion to compel.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/13/12	0.30	Consulting with H. Moore and Arthur Wolfson.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/13/12	0.20	Emailing with Solicitor(x4).
		Webb, Jason P.	08/14/12	2.00	Preparing motion to compel and edit.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/14/12	0.40	Preparing exhibits.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/14/12	0.20	Call with clerk.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/14/12	0.20	Emailing Solicitor.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	08/14/12	0.20	Review, update case summary regarding motion to compel discovery, status.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/21/12	0.20	Drafting e-mail to clerk
		Webb, Jason P.	08/21/12	0.20	Emailing Solicitor.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/21/12	0.20	Obtaining proof of service.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/21/12	0.10	Calling Tureck clerk.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/22/12	0.10	Emailing Solicitor regarding extension.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/22/12	0.10	Reviewing Clerk's email and responding.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/23/12	0.10	Update status; Review Solicitor correspondence; Email Solicitor.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/24/12	0.10	Discussing offer with Hank Moore.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/24/12	0.10	Preparing correspondence to client.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/27/12	0.50	Draft letter for approval
		Zalewski, Larry A.	08/27/12	0.30	Review, update case summary, calendar regarding motion to compel, status report to ALJ.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/28/12	0.10	Preparing email and sending to Eastern
		Webb, Jason P.	08/28/12	0.10	Reviewing and replying to E. Waller email and discussing with H. Moore

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Zalewski, Larry A.	08/30/12	0.20	Review status of discovery responses, motion to compel.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/31/12	2.00	Legal Research
		Webb, Jason P.	08/31/12	1.00	Reviewing emails and prep for call.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/31/12	0.50	Emailing E. Waller.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/31/12	0.30	Call with Dinsmore regarding Mammoth Coal Order.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/31/12	0.30	Consulting with H. Moore.
<b>Case No. 000244760 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-932 Total</b>				<b>27.80</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000244978 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2011-1012	Zalewski, Larry A.	07/17/12	0.30	Pulling and reviewing Administrative Law Judge's settlement decision and forwarding same to client for review.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	07/25/12	0.30	Reviewing and updating case summary regarding settlement of penalties and decision approving same.
<b>Case No. 000244978 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2011-1012 Total</b>				<b>0.60</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000246204 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2011-1190	Webb, Jason P.	07/24/12	0.10	E-mailing client's representative regarding settlement status.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/24/12	0.10	Reviewing e-mail from Judge, and e-mails with client's representative.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/26/12	0.20	Telephone call with client's representative regarding settlement.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/26/12	0.10	E-mailing Administrative Law Judge's Clerk regarding settlement.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/26/12	0.10	E-mailing Clerk.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/26/12	0.10	Following up on J. Tureck's e-mail.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/26/12	0.10	Telephone call with R. Wyatt.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	08/01/12	0.60	Review, update case summary regarding settlement of citations, penalties, motion to approve same.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/31/12	0.10	Scan and e-mail order to pay settlement
<b>Case No. 000246204 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2011-1190 Total</b>				<b>1.50</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000246204 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2011-1191	Webb, Jason P.	08/31/12	0.10	Scan and e-mail order to pay settlement
<b>Case No. 000246204 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2011-1191 Total</b>				<b>0.10</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000251444 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2011-1681 and WEVA 2011-1682	Zalewski, Larry A.	07/18/12	0.30	Reviewing and updating case summary and calendar regarding status of motion to sever and hearing notice.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/22/12	0.60	E-mail P. Simpson and E. Waller regarding settlement conference.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/23/12	0.40	E-mail Solicitor regarding settlement conference.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	07/27/12	0.20	Reviewing prehearing order and status regarding settlement.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/30/12	0.10	Leaving message for G. McHenry regarding settlement conference.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/31/12	0.30	Telephone call with G. McHenry.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>	
		Webb, Jason P.	07/31/12	0.10	E-mailing Clerk regarding global settlement.	
		Webb, Jason P.	07/31/12	0.10	E-mailing Solicitor.	
		Webb, Jason P.	08/15/12	0.20	Preparing for settlement conference.	
		Webb, Jason P.	08/15/12	0.10	Reviewing counter offer.	
		Webb, Jason P.	08/15/12	0.10	Reviewing Solicitor's counter offer.	
		Zalewski, Larry A.	08/27/12	0.20	Review, update case summary and calendar regarding settlement status, report to ALJ.	
		Zalewski, Larry A.	08/30/12	0.20	Review ALJ order, status regarding discovery requests.	
		Moore, R. H.	08/31/12	0.50	Discussions with Eric Waller regarding strategy.	
		<b>Case No. 000251444 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2011-1681 and WEVA 2011-1682 Total</b>			<b>3.40</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000254488 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-2057 and WEVA 2011-2058	Webb, Jason P.	07/12/12	0.10	Reviewing pay order and e-mail to client.	
		Zalewski, Larry A.	07/25/12	0.30	Reviewing and updating case summary regarding settlement of citations, penalties, motion, and decision to approve same.	
		Webb, Jason P.	08/10/12	0.80	Prepare settlement	
		Webb, Jason P.	08/11/12	2.00	Prepare settlement	
		Webb, Jason P.	08/11/12	0.60	Prepare settlement	
		Webb, Jason P.	08/14/12	1.00	Prepare settlement	
		<b>Case No. 000254488 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-2057 and WEVA 2011-2058 Total</b>			<b>4.80</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000257610 (Federal No. 2) WEVA 2011-2151	Webb, Jason P.	07/10/12	0.20	E-mail Solicitor regarding settlement and reviewing prehearing order.	
		Webb, Jason P.	07/12/12	0.20	E-mail Clerk to request extension of time.	
		Webb, Jason P.	07/16/12	0.40	E-mail Solicitor regarding filing and impacts on ongoing litigation and telephone call with M. Cimino regarding status.	
		Zalewski, Larry A.	07/17/12	0.20	Reviewing and updating case summary and calendar regarding settlement status and report to Administrative Law Judge.	
		Webb, Jason P.	07/23/12	0.40	E-mails with Solicitor regarding global settlements.	
		Webb, Jason P.	07/24/12	0.20	E-mail Solicitor regarding global settlement.	
		Webb, Jason P.	07/26/12	0.10	E-mail to Administrative Law Judge's Clerk to update regarding settlements.	
		Webb, Jason P.	07/26/12	0.10	E-mail to M. Dean to update regarding settlements.	
		Webb, Jason P.	08/01/12	0.20	Updating status.	
		Webb, Jason P.	08/01/12	0.60	Reviewing files for settlement conferences.	
		Webb, Jason P.	08/07/12	0.20	Email Solicitor regarding settlement conference	
		Webb, Jason P.	08/15/12	0.90	Prepare settlement	
		Zalewski, Larry A.	08/15/12	1.80	Collect, review citations, inspection reports and other documents for purpose of settlement conference.	
		Webb, Jason P.	08/27/12	0.20	Settlement conference preparation	

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Webb, Jason P.	08/28/12	2.20	Prepare settlement
<b>Case No. 000257610 (Federal No. 2) WEVA 2011-2151 Total</b>				<b>7.90</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000260205 (Federal No. 2) WEVA 2011-2188	Webb, Jason P.	08/15/12	2.50	Prepare settlement and e-mail P. Simpson
		Zalewski, Larry A.	08/15/12	0.20	Review pleadings and discovery regarding case status.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	08/27/12	0.20	Review and update case summary and calendar regarding settlement status, report to ALJ.
<b>Case No. 000260205 (Federal No. 2) WEVA 2011-2188 Total</b>				<b>2.90</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000263159 (Federal No. 2)	Zalewski, Larry A.	08/01/12	0.20	Review pleadings, discovery regarding case status.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/08/12	0.20	Call with Bob Phillips regarding settlement.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/08/12	0.10	Review conference and information request.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/13/12	0.50	Call with Mark N. regarding settlement.
<b>Case No. 000263159 (Federal No. 2) Total</b>				<b>1.00</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000266251 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-20 and WEVA 2012-21	Webb, Jason P.	08/23/12	0.30	Identify ALJ Lewis cases and e-mail information.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/23/12	0.10	E-mail Judge Lewis regarding settlement conference.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	08/27/12	0.20	Review and update case summary, calendar regarding settlement status report.
<b>Case No. 000266251 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-20 and WEVA 2012-21 Total</b>				<b>0.60</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000270521 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-174	Webb, Jason P.	07/31/12	0.70	Prepare draft of settlement proposal.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/31/12	0.30	Telephone call with Mine to request information.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/31/12	0.10	E-mail information requests.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/31/12	0.10	E-mail with Solicitor.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/01/12	0.60	Review exam reports.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/01/12	0.50	Call Bob Phillips twice regarding exam reports.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/01/12	0.50	Return call to Fred Bundle regarding exam reports.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/01/12	0.50	Review onshift/preshifts
		Webb, Jason P.	08/01/12	0.10	E-mail Bob Phillips with questions.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/06/12	0.10	Call to Mark Napoleo regarding far facts
		Webb, Jason P.	08/17/12	1.00	Consult with Hank Moore regarding settlement
		Webb, Jason P.	08/17/12	0.50	E-mail Eastern regarding settlement.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/24/12	0.10	Email Solicitor regarding settlement
<b>Case No. 000270521 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-174 Total</b>				<b>5.10</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000270852 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-427 and WEVA 2012-428	Zalewski, Larry A.	08/01/12	0.20	Review pleadings, status regarding settlement.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/07/12	2.20	Prep settlement proposal
		Webb, Jason P.	08/08/12	1.10	Prep settlement and email to P. Simpson for approval
		Webb, Jason P.	08/08/12	1.00	Prepare settlement and email to Bob Phillips
		Webb, Jason P.	08/14/12	0.20	Reminder settlement

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
<b>Case No. 000270852 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-427 and WEVA 2012-428 Total</b>					<b>4.70</b>
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000273621 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-529 and WEVA 2012.530	Webb, Jason P.	07/19/12	0.10	Review Solicitor's offer.
		Webb, Jason P.	07/19/12	0.10	Telephone call with Solicitor.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/04/12	3.40	Prepare settlement
		Webb, Jason P.	08/06/12	1.50	Prepare settlement.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/06/12	0.10	Send reminder e-mail to client.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/10/12	0.30	Prepare settlement and email to P. Simpson
		Webb, Jason P.	08/14/12	0.10	Reminder settlement
		Zalewski, Larry A.	08/15/12	0.20	Review pleadings, discovery regarding case status.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	08/31/12	0.30	Review citations, violations for purpose of settlement.
<b>Case No. 000273621 (Federal No. 2); WEVA 2012-529 and WEVA 2012.530 Total</b>					<b>6.10</b>
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 000291117 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-1368 and WEVA 2012-1369	Cimino, Michael T.	08/22/12	0.20	Email traffic regarding new matter WEVA 2012-1368.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/22/12	0.20	Email traffic regarding new matter WEVA 2012-1369.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/24/12	0.60	Preparing Answer to Petition for Assessment in 2012-1369.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/24/12	0.40	Preparing discovery requests in 2012-1369.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/24/12	0.30	Preparing notice of deposition in 2012-1369.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/24/12	0.20	Reviewing Petition for Assessment in Docket WEVA 2012-1369.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/27/12	0.50	Preparing Answer regarding WEVA 2012-1368.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/27/12	0.50	Preparing Answer regarding WEVA 2012-1369.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/27/12	0.20	Review of Petition and Citations regarding WEVA 2012-1368.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/27/12	0.20	Review of Petition and Citations regarding WEVA 2012-1369.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/27/12	0.10	Correspondence to Ms. Boyd regarding WEVA 2012-1368.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/27/12	0.10	Correspondence to Ms. Boyd regarding WEVA 2012-1369.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/27/12	0.10	Preparing Discovery Requests regarding WEVA 2012-1368.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/27/12	0.10	Preparing Discovery Requests regarding WEVA 2012-1369.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/27/12	0.10	Preparing Notice of Deposition regarding WEVA 2012-1368.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/27/12	0.10	Preparing Notice of Deposition regarding WEVA 2012-1369.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/27/12	0.40	Preparing Answer to Petition for Assessment in 2012-1368.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/27/12	0.20	Preparing discovery requests in 2012-1368.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/27/12	0.20	Preparing notice of deposition in 2012-1368.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/27/12	0.20	Reviewing Petition for Assessment in Docket WEVA 2012-1368.
<b>Case No. 000291117 (Federal No. 2 Mine); WEVA 2012-1368 and WEVA 2012-1369 Total</b>					<b>4.90</b>

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Case No. 00248954 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-1437	Zalewski, Larry A.	08/01/12	0.20	Review, update case summary regarding settlement status.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/31/12	0.10	Scan and e-mail order to pay settlement
<b>Case No. 00248954 (Federal No. 2 Mine) WEVA 2011-1437 Total</b>				<b>0.30</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Electronic Surveying Petitions	Zalewski, Larry A.	07/20/12	0.50	Reviewing and editing motions to withdraw petitions for modification.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	07/23/12	0.60	Reviewing and editing requests for withdrawal of modification petitions for various mines.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	07/23/12	0.20	Preparing requests for withdrawal of modification petitions for various mines for filing.
<b>Electronic Surveying Petitions Total</b>				<b>1.30</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Federal No. 2 Mine - Assessment 000276475	Zalewski, Larry A.	08/31/12	0.30	Review citations, violations for purpose of settlement.
<b>Federal No. 2 Mine - Assessment 000276475 Total</b>				<b>0.30</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Federal No. 2 Mine - WEVA 2012-624; Assessment 000276264	Webb, Jason P.	08/08/12	0.90	Perform legal research and read cases.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/08/12	0.30	Prepare settlement proposal.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/10/12	0.20	Update settlement based on R. Phillips email
		Webb, Jason P.	08/17/12	0.10	E-mail G McHenry regarding settlement
		Webb, Jason P.	08/17/12	0.10	E-mail G. McHenry.
		Webb, Jason P.	08/17/12	0.10	Plan copying project.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	08/31/12	0.40	Review citations and violations for purpose of settlement of matter.
<b>Federal No. 2 Mine - WEVA 2012-624; Assessment 000276264 Total</b>				<b>2.10</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Federal No. 2 Mine 105 (c)Travis Catsonis Discrimination Complaint	McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/24/12	0.60	Working on issues regarding underlying discrimination complaint.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/25/12	1.00	Working on Position Statement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/25/12	0.60	Working on investigation of underlying discrimination complaint.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/26/12	0.90	Working on Position Statement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/26/12	0.50	Reviewing and analyzing file.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/27/12	2.10	Drafting and editing Position Statement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/27/12	1.10	Working on investigation into underlying complaint.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/27/12	0.60	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/27/12	0.40	Legal research concerning issues regarding Section 105 (c) of the Mine Act.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/28/12	0.80	Working on finalization of Position Statement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/28/12	0.50	Conferences and correspondence regarding status and strategy.
<b>Federal No. 2 Mine 105 (c)Travis Catsonis Discrimination Complaint Total</b>				<b>9.10</b>	
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	Safety and Health Consultation	Webb, Jason P.	08/16/12	0.20	Email Gary McHenry regarding settlement conference

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
<b>Safety and Health Consultation Total</b>					<b>0.20</b>
Eastern Associated Coal, LLC	William Mark Stewart 105(c) Discrimination Complaint (Fed. No. 2)	Cimino, Michael T.	08/01/12	0.10	Review of correspondence from Mr. Waller regarding settlement agreement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/08/12	0.10	Review of email from Mr. Phillip regarding settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/13/12	1.00	Multiple telephone conference(s) with A. Phillips regarding settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/13/12	0.30	Additional review of settlement documents.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/13/12	0.30	Email traffic regarding settlement documents.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/13/12	0.20	Review of settlement documents.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/13/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with Mr. Waller regarding settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/14/12	0.20	Email traffic regarding conference call.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/14/12	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/17/12	0.50	Telephone conference(s) with A. Phillips regarding settlement status.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/17/12	0.30	Email traffic with Mr. Phillips.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/29/12	1.80	Preparing summary of violations and defenses.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/29/12	0.40	Reviewing citations and rebuttal information.
		<b>William Mark Stewart 105(c) Discrimination Complaint (Federal No. 2) Total</b>			
<b>Eastern Associated Coal, LLC Total</b>					<b>115.50</b>
Highland Mining Company, LLC	342Leslie Pride (Highland 9 Mine) Discrimination Complaint No. MADI-CD-2009-11	Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/27/12	0.30	Reviewing file, pleadings, and correspondence to determine status of case.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/27/12	0.20	Reviewing and responding to Judge Gill's law clerk re scheduling status conference.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/31/12	0.70	Preparing for representing client at status conference with Administrative Law Judge Gill.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/31/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with R. Duncan regarding status conference with ALJ Gill.
<b>342Leslie Pride (Highland 9 Mine) Discrimination Complaint No. MADI-CD-2009-11 Total</b>					<b>1.30</b>
Highland Mining Company, LLC	Case No. 000162446 (Highland 9 Mine)	Oakley, Kenneth B.	07/26/12	1.00	Analyzing status of settlement negotiations and defense strategy for citations unlikely to settle.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	07/26/12	0.20	Reviewing and responding to e-mails from M. Lawson regarding dates to depose inspectors and settlement negotiations prior to depositions.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	07/31/12	0.80	Telephone conference(s) with R. Duncan regarding case status, case strategy, and responding to MSHA's settlement offers.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/01/12	0.20	Email traffic regarding settlement.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/01/12	0.60	Preparing e-mail to M. Lawson regarding settlement counteroffers and confirmation of deposition dates.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/02/12	0.10	Reviewing and revising notice of depositions for inspectors.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/02/12	0.30	Forward re-notice to court reporter via e-mail and U.S. mail.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/02/12	0.30	Prepare letter to Judge Rae forwarding re-notice of deposition for filing.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/02/12	0.30	Prepare re-notice of depositions of Jeff Winders, Keith Ryan and Archie Coburn.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/02/12	0.10	Revisions to Re-Notice of Depositions of Jeff Winders, Keith Ryan and Archie Coburn.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/07/12	0.50	Working on strategy for responding to same.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/07/12	0.30	Analyzing settlement offers received from MSHA on 8/7/12.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/07/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with R. Duncan re scheduling time to discuss MSHA's 8/7/12 settlement offers.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/08/12	0.90	Telephone conference(s) with R. Duncan re responses to MSHA's 8/7/12 settlement offers.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/08/12	0.40	Preparing email to M. Lawson re responses to MSHA's 8/7/12 settlement offers.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/09/12	0.20	Discussing same with R. Duncan.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/09/12	0.20	Preparing email to M. Lawson regarding Highland's responses to MSHA's 8/9/12 settlement offers.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/09/12	0.10	Analyzing 8/9/12 settlement offers received from MSHA.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/13/12	4.50	Preparing for depositions of Archie Coburn, Jeff Winders, and Keith Ryan.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/13/12	3.30	Travel to Evansville, IN for depositions.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/13/12	0.20	Telephone call with court reporter confirming deposition for August 14, 2012.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/14/12	5.00	Representing client at depositions of Archie Coburn, Jeff Winders, and Keith Ryan.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/14/12	4.30	Return travel from Morganfield, KY to Lexington, KY.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/14/12	1.00	Travel from Evansville, IN to Morganfield, KY to represent client at inspector depositions.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/15/12	0.30	Reviewing MSHA's discovery requests and emailing same to R. Duncan.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/15/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with R. Duncan regarding summary of inspector deposition testimony.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/15/12	2.00	Prepare Responses to Interrogatories and Request for Production of Documents from Highland Mining Company to Secretary.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/15/12	0.50	Review of Worldox to determine discovery requests were served in December of 2008, but no answers received.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/15/12	0.40	Update to pleadings index.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/15/12	0.20	Conference with Brad Oakley regarding definitive date discovery requests were served upon MSHA.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/15/12	0.20	Email draft of Highland Mines Responses to Secretary's Discovery to Brad Oakley for review and revisions.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/15/12	0.20	Save scanned file to Worldox and email same to Brad Oakley.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/15/12	0.20	Scan and save secretary's discovery requests into Worldox.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/15/12	0.20	Telephone call to L. Colston in Charleston office requesting review of file to verify service date of discovery to secretary and have same scanned to us.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/16/12	0.60	Telephone conference(s) with R. Duncan regarding summary of MSHA inspector deposition testimony and MSHA's most recent settlement offers.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/16/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with R. Duncan regarding D. Massoth potential testimony regarding 6697504.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/17/12	0.50	Working on settlement.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/17/12	0.10	Preparing email to M. Lawson regarding response to outstanding discovery requests.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/20/12	2.70	Preparing lengthy email to E. Waller regarding pre-trial status report.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/21/12	0.50	Working on settlement.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/21/12	0.10	Finalizing pre-hearing case status report and emailing same to E. Waller.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/22/12	0.50	Working on settlement.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/22/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with R. Duncan regarding response to MSHA's settlement offers.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/22/12	0.10	Preparing email to M. Lawson regarding responses to MSHA's settlement offers.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/22/12	0.20	Email to court reporter asking for time frame for receiving copies of inspector's deposition transcript.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/22/12	0.10	Conference with Brad Oakley regarding contacting court reporter for copies of inspector's transcripts.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/23/12	0.50	Analyzing documents to use as trial exhibits for each citation.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/23/12	1.30	Begin draft exhibit and witness list.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/23/12	0.50	Review email from court reporter attaching requested exhibits and print and save for our file.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/23/12	0.20	Conference with Brad Oakley regarding drafting exhibit and witness list.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/23/12	0.20	Conference with Brad Oakley regarding return of exhibits to us by court reporter.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/23/12	0.20	Forward email to Brad Oakley for his review.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/23/12	0.20	Review of email from Brad Oakley containing pending citation numbers to include.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/23/12	0.10	Telephone call to court reporter describing exhibits and directing her they be returned by August 24, 2012 (leave message).
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/24/12	0.20	Working on settlement.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/24/12	0.30	Analyzing settlement offers received from MSHA and discussing same with R. Duncan.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/24/12	0.30	Telephone conference(s) with R. Duncan re witness list.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/24/12	0.20	Preparing email to M. Lawson re response to settlement offers.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/27/12	1.50	Working on exhibit and witness list.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/28/12	0.50	Preparing for hearing.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/28/12	4.40	Continued work on exhibit and witness list including summaries of expected witness testimony.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/28/12	0.50	Lengthy telephone conference(s) with Randy Duncan regarding pre-hearing disclosures and expected witness testimony.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/28/12	0.10	Reviewing and responding to email from E. Waller regarding pre-hearing status report.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/28/12	2.00	Begin spreadsheet showing amount of savings, reductions in penalties and percentage of savings from statement.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/28/12	0.40	Receive rough draft transcripts and print all for review by Brad Oakley.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/28/12	0.30	Prepare and send email to court reporter, Tonya Collins, inquiring if rough drafts of deposition transcripts for citation numbers 8489043, 6699578 and 6697504 can be prepared and forwarded as soon as possible.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/28/12	0.30	Receive and send responsive emails regarding transcripts being previously emailed and inform court reporter they were not received.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/28/12	0.20	Conference with Brad Oakley regarding creating spreadsheet regarding settlement savings and reductions.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/29/12	0.40	Preparing for hearing.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/29/12	1.70	Continued work on exhibit and witness list and filing of same.
		Oakley, Kenneth B.	08/29/12	0.50	Working on settlement analysis chart.
		Werner, Shannon L.	08/29/12	0.40	Revisions to spreadsheet of savings and reductions in penalties.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/30/12	1.10	Review of deposition testimony of Mr. Winders.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/30/12	2.00	Additional work on trial preparations.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/30/12	1.50	Preparing trial notebook.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/30/12	0.50	Reviewing remaining citations and relevant information concerning citations.
<b>Case No. 000162446 (Highland 9 Mine) Total</b>				<b>57.60</b>	
<b>Highland Mining Company, LLC Total</b>				<b>58.90</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	Case No. 000250766 (Beth Station No. 79 Prep Plant) WEVA 2011-1561	Colston, Leanna L.	07/16/12	0.10	Forwarding order of assignment and prehearing order to client.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/16/12	0.10	Receiving order of assignment and prehearing order.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/17/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with Mr. Gutierrez re: status.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/17/12	0.10	E-mail traffic with Mr. Gutierrez re: status.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/21/12	0.30	Telephone conference(s) with Dominique Gutierrez regarding status on settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/21/12	0.20	Working on settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/21/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with K. Blair re: settlement.
<b>Case No. 000250766 (Beth Station No. 79 Prep Plant) WEVA 2011-1561 Total</b>				<b>1.10</b>	
Hobet Mining, LLC	Case No. 144-0165-2010 (West Ridge Surface Mine) NOV 28721	Cimino, Michael T.	07/09/12	0.50	Preparing defenses for hearing.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/09/12	0.50	Working on reply.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/09/12	0.30	Telephone conference(s) with B. Koerber regarding stipulations.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/09/12	0.20	Reviewing response from West Virginia Office of Miners Health Safety and Training.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/09/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with K. Blair regarding status.
		Voelker, Ryan E.	07/09/12	2.10	Legal research regarding motion to re-open.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/11/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with K. Blair.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/23/12	0.20	Correspondence to client regarding Order.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/23/12	0.10	Review of Order.
<b>Case No. 144-0165-2010 (West Ridge Surface Mine) NOV 28721 Total</b>				<b>4.20</b>	
<b>Hobet Mining, LLC Total</b>				<b>5.30</b>	
Newtown Energy, Inc.	Electronic Surveying Petitions - Eagle Mine; Coalburg No. 1 Mine; Coalburg No. 2 Mine and Peerless Rachel Mine	Zalewski, Larry A.	07/19/12	0.40	Reviewing petitions for modification for various mines regarding status and forwarding same to client.
<b>Electronic Surveying Petitions - Eagle Mine; Coalburg No. 1 Mine; Coalburg No. 2 Mine and Peerless Rachel</b>				<b>0.40</b>	

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
<b>Newtown Energy, Inc. Total</b>					<b>0.40</b>
Ohio County Coal Company, LLC	Electronic Surveying Petitions	Zalewski, Larry A.	07/18/12	0.80	Preparing withdrawals of modification petitions and letters for Freedom Mine.
<b>Electronic Surveying Petitions Total</b>					<b>0.80</b>
<b>Ohio County Coal Company, LLC Total</b>					<b>0.80</b>
Patriot Coal Corporation	Safety and Health Consultation	Tweel, Robert G.	08/01/12	1.00	Telephone conference(s) with Drew McAllister on lien for unpaid severance taxes.
<b>Safety and Health Consultation Total</b>					<b>1.00</b>
<b>Patriot Coal Corporation Total</b>					<b>1.00</b>
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000158162 (Big Mtn. No. 16); WEVA 2008-1623	Dennison, Patrick W.	07/18/12	0.30	Reviewing file in preparation of joint appendix.
		Dennison, Patrick W.	07/18/12	0.10	Telephone call to M. Cimino regarding status of case.
		Dennison, Patrick W.	07/18/12	0.10	Telephone calls with E. Waller regarding D.C. Court brief.
		Dennison, Patrick W.	07/25/12	0.30	Finalizing motion to postpone briefing.
		Dennison, Patrick W.	07/25/12	0.20	Telephone call and e-mail to Solicitor regarding motion.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	07/26/12	0.30	Reviewing and updating case summary and calendar regarding briefing schedule status and motion to postpone.
		Dennison, Patrick W.	07/31/12	0.10	E-mails with M. Cimino regarding settlement.
		Dennison, Patrick W.	08/03/12	0.10	Email to Hank Moore and Mike Cimino.
		Dennison, Patrick W.	08/03/12	0.10	Review order postponing briefing.
		Zalewski, Larry A.	08/03/12	0.30	Review, update case summary, calendar regarding scheduling order, status.
<b>Case No. 000158162 (Big Mtn. No. 16); WEVA 2008-1623 Total</b>					<b>1.90</b>
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000163290 (Big Mtn No. 16); WEVA 2008-432	Cimino, Michael T.	07/16/12	0.50	E-mail traffic with E. Waller and W. Dobbs re: MSHA.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/18/12	0.10	Reviewing e-mail from Mr. Wilson regarding global settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/19/12	0.70	Working on global settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/19/12	0.30	Reviewing (d) orders and settlement information.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/20/12	0.30	Telephone conference(s) with J. Hargraves regarding global settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/20/12	0.30	Working on global settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/24/12	1.10	Negotiating global settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/26/12	0.30	E-mail traffic regarding global settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/27/12	1.20	Working on global settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/30/12	0.70	Working on global settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/31/12	0.50	E-mail traffic with Secretary of Labor, Judge Harner and counsel regarding global settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/01/12	0.20	Email traffic with Mr. Wilson and Judge Harner regarding global settlement.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/13/12	0.10	Reviewing order of reassignment regarding WEVA 2009-71 and WEVA 2009-407.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/14/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with Bob Wilson regarding global settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/14/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with Eric Waller regarding global settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/15/12	0.50	Working on global settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/15/12	0.40	Multiple emails regarding missing dockets.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/16/12	0.50	Email traffic regarding global settlement.
				<b>8.10</b>	
	<b>Case No. 000163290 (Big Mtn No. 16); WEVA 2008-432 Total</b>				
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000169073 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2009-407	Robinson, Melissa M.	07/09/12	0.10	E-mail to J. Ray.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/09/12	0.10	E-mails with K. Shah regarding depositions of J. Ray and D. Ashby.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/09/12	0.50	Reviewing books regarding production request.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/10/12	3.00	Additional work on discovery responses.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/10/12	0.10	E-mail to R. Collins and K. Houston regarding maps.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/10/12	0.30	E-mails with D. Overton.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/10/12	0.50	Telephone conference with D. Overton regarding employees working as continuous miner operators and last known contact information.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/10/12	0.20	Working on additional witnesses for defense.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/11/12	1.80	Finalizing discovery responses and documents for production.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/11/12	0.20	E-mail traffic with J. Ray regarding 7000-2 Forms.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/11/12	0.10	Reviewing notices of deposition for J. Ray and D. Ashby.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/11/12	0.50	Telephone conference with J. Ray regarding additional information required to complete discovery for WEVA 2009-407.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/11/12	7.00	Working on discovery for WEVA 2009-407 and completing and filing same.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/13/12	0.10	Correspondence to client regarding notice of hearing.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/13/12	0.10	Reviewing notice of hearing.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/16/12	0.40	Preparing for upcoming depositions of witnesses.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/16/12	0.10	Reviewing notice of deposition.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/30/12	0.10	E-mail from K. Shah, attorney for MSHA, regarding teleconference with Judge Feldman regarding trial scheduled in WEVA 2009-407.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/30/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with K. Shah regarding prehearing order and conference with Administrative Law Judge.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/01/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with witnesses regarding cancellation of hearing and depositions.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/01/12	0.30	Conference call with ALJ regarding Motion to Stay.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/01/12	0.10	E-mail to client regarding conference call.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/01/12	0.10	Email with K. Shah, attorney for MSHA, regarding call in number for teleconference with Judge Fledman on August 1, 2012 in WEVA 2009-407.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/01/12	0.20	Reviewing Motion to Stay and Order.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/02/12	0.10	E-mail to client regarding Order.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/02/12	0.20	Reviewing Order to Stay.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/09/12	0.70	Assisting with preparation of discovery responses.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/09/12	0.60	Preparing documents for production.
<b>Case No. 000169073 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2009-407 Total</b>				<b>17.90</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000172189 (Big Mountain Mine No. 16) WEVA 2009-666 and WEVA 2009-667	Robinson, Melissa M.	08/16/12	0.10	Reviewing order.
<b>Case No. 000172189 (Big Mountain Mine No. 16) WEVA 2009-666 and WEVA 2009-667 Total</b>				<b>0.10</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000191598 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2009-1772	Robinson, Melissa M.	07/10/12	1.50	Reviewing Secretary of Labor's responses to interrogatories.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/11/12	0.20	E-mails with K. Shah, attorney for MSHA, regarding prehearing order and settlement negotiations for WEVA 2009-1772.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/30/12	0.10	E-mail from K. Shah, attorney for MSHA, regarding prehearing order and settlement negotiations for WEVA 2010-855, 2010-1169 and 2010-1323.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/30/12	0.10	Telephone conference regarding conference with Administrative Law Judge.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/09/12	0.20	Reviewing proposed motion to stay and order.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/13/12	0.10	Reviewing Secretary of Labor's Motion to Stay.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/28/12	0.10	Reviewing order granting stay.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/30/12	0.10	Reviewing order.
<b>Case No. 000191598 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2009-1772 Total</b>				<b>2.40</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000197709; (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2010-19	Robinson, Melissa M.	07/10/12	0.20	E-mails with B. Smith and J. Hargraves regarding prehearing conference.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/10/12	0.20	E-mails with J. Hargraves regarding settlement.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/17/12	0.20	E-mails with B. Smith and J. Hargraves regarding prehearing conference.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/19/12	0.20	E-mails with B. Smith and J. Hargraves regarding prehearing conference.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/20/12	0.30	E-mail correspondence with B. Smith, clerk for Judge Steele and J. Hargraves, attorney for MSHA regarding teleconference with Judget Steele re: WEVA 2010-19.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/23/12	0.20	Reviewing file(s) regarding status and strategy in advance of prehearing conference with Administrative Law Judge.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/24/12	0.50	Conference call with Administrative Law Judge and attorney for Secretary of Labor.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/24/12	0.20	E-mail with J. Hargraves, attorney for MSHA, regarding proposed changes to prehearing order.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/24/12	0.50	Teleconference with J. Hargraves regarding status report to Administrative Law Judge.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/01/12	0.10	E-mail to J. Hargraves regarding Motion to Stay.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/01/12	0.10	Reviewing file(s) regarding status.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/02/12	0.10	Email correspondence with J. Hargraves, attorney for MSHA, regarding motion to continue trial in WEVA 2010-19
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/02/12	0.50	Preparing Motion to Stay and Order.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/06/12	0.20	Email with J. Hargraves regarding Motion to Stay.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/20/12	0.20	Correspondence to client regarding order to stay trial in WEVA 2010-19
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/20/12	0.40	Email with B. Smith, clerk for Judge Steele, and J. Hargraves regarding order to stay in WEVA 2010-19.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/20/12	0.10	Reviewing order.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/20/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with B. Smith and J. Hargraves.
<b>Case No. 000197709; (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2010-19 Total</b>				<b>4.40</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000218088 (Big Mountain No. 16); Motion to Reopen	Robinson, Melissa M.	08/30/12	0.50	Emails with N. Lien regarding WEVA 2010-1453, 2011-531, 2011-769, 2011-1293 and 2011-1504.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/31/12	0.10	Email with N. Lien, attorney for MSHA, regarding extension of time to accomodate settlement negotiations.
<b>Case No. 000218088 (Big Mountain No. 16); Motion to Reopen Total</b>				<b>0.60</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000236828 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-530	Robinson, Melissa M.	08/31/12	0.20	Email from K. Blatt regarding WEVA 2011-531, 769, 1293 and 1504.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/31/12	0.20	Email from N. Lien regarding WEVA 2011-531, 769, 1293 and 1504.
<b>Case No. 000236828 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-530 Total</b>				<b>0.40</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000239682 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-552	Robinson, Melissa M.	08/16/12	0.10	Reviewing order.
<b>Case No. 000239682 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-552 Total</b>				<b>0.10</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000248053 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-1293	Robinson, Melissa M.	07/10/12	1.00	Working on responses to discovery regarding WEVA 2011-1292.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/11/12	0.30	E-mails with Judge Harner's office and J. Hargraves regarding WEVA 2011-1292, 1754 and 1503.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/11/12	0.10	Telephone conference(s) with Judge's Clerk regarding WEVA 2011-1292, 1754 and 1503.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/30/12	0.10	E-mail from J. Hargraves regarding WEVA 2011-1292, 1503 and 1754.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/01/12	0.10	E-mail to client regarding Stay in WEVA 2011-1292, 1754 and 1503.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/20/12	0.20	Correspondence to client regarding stay in WEVA 2011-1292, 2011-1503 and 2011-1754.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/20/12	0.30	Reviewing order regarding indefinite stay in WEVA 2011-1292, 2011-1503 and 2011-1754.
<b>Case No. 000248053 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-1293 Total</b>				<b>2.10</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000250539 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2011-1504	Robinson, Melissa M.	07/10/12	0.50	Discussing deposition dates with J. Hargraves regarding WEVA 2011-1503, 1292 and 1754.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/10/12	1.00	Working on responses to discovery regarding WEVA 2011-1503.
<b>Case No. 000250539 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2011-1504 Total</b>				<b>1.50</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000253329 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2011-1754	Robinson, Melissa M.	07/10/12	1.00	Working on responses to discovery regarding WEVA 2011-1754.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/13/12	0.10	Reviewing notice of change of counsel regarding WEVA 2011-1755.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/22/12	0.10	Reviewing order.
<b>Case No. 000253329 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2011-1754 Total</b>				<b>1.20</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000256585 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-1990	Robinson, Melissa M.	07/10/12	0.30	E-mail with J. Hargraves, attorney for MSHA, regarding scheduling of depositions for WEVA 2011, 1292, 2011-1503, 2011-1754.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/10/12	0.10	E-mail with J. Hargraves, attorney for MSHA, regarding conference call with Judge Harner.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/11/12	0.10	E-mail from K. Blatt regarding WEVA 2011-1990.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/11/12	0.20	E-mails with K. Blatt and J. Hargraves regarding WEVA 2011-1990.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/11/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with Administrative Law Judge's Clerk regarding WEVA 2011-1990.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/13/12	0.10	Reviewing notice of change of counsel regarding WEVA 2011-1991.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/16/12	0.20	Reviewing file(s) regarding status and strategy in advance of prehearing conference with Administrative Law Judge regarding WEVA 2011-1990.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/25/12	0.20	E-mails with K. Blatt and J. Hargraves regarding status and scheduling in WEVA 2011-1990.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	08/16/12	0.20	Reviewing order and correspondence to client regarding WEVA 2011-1991.
<b>Case No. 000256585 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-1990 Total</b>				<b>1.60</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000259308 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2011-2178	Robinson, Melissa M.	07/13/12	0.10	Reviewing notice of change of counsel.
<b>Case No. 000259308 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2011-2178 Total</b>				<b>0.10</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000262017 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-2358	Robinson, Melissa M.	07/13/12	0.10	Reviewing notice of change of counsel.
<b>Case No. 000262017 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-2358 Total</b>				<b>0.10</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000265268 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-2459	Colston, Leanna L.	07/10/12	0.50	Additional work on preparing discovery responses.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/10/12	0.50	Working on interviewing witnesses regarding information needed for discovery responses.
		Robinson, Melissa M.	07/13/12	0.10	Reviewing notice of change of counsel.
<b>Case No. 000265268 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2011-2459 Total</b>				<b>1.10</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000267967 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2012-81	Robinson, Melissa M.	07/13/12	0.10	Reviewing notice of change of counsel regarding WEVA 2012-81.
<b>Case No. 000267967 (Big Mountain No. 16) WEVA 2012-81 Total</b>				<b>0.10</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Case No. 000270891 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2012-258	Robinson, Melissa M.	07/13/12	0.10	Reviewing notice of change of counsel regarding WEVA 2012-258.
<b>Case No. 000270891 (Big Mountain No. 16); WEVA 2012-258 Total</b>				<b>0.10</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	Electronic Surveying Petitions	Zalewski, Larry A.	07/18/12	0.80	Preparing withdrawals of modification petitions and letters for Big Mountain Mine.
<b>Electronic Surveying Petitions Total</b>				<b>0.80</b>	
Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC	MSHA Assessment Investigation and Research	Cimino, Michael T.	08/28/12	2.00	Researching issues of MSHA assessments.
		Ford, Richard G.	08/28/12	5.90	Researching treatment of MSHA civil penalty assessments.
		Ford, Richard G.	08/28/12	2.30	Drafting memo to Mr. Dobbs re: MSHA civil penalty assessments.
		Ford, Richard G.	08/28/12	0.30	Discussing MSHA assessments project with Mr. Dobbs.
		Kapushion, Meredith A.	08/28/12	6.30	Researching potential liability of operator and affiliated entities in event that order to pay settlement is not adhered to.
		Kapushion, Meredith A.	08/28/12	0.50	Additional telephone conference(s) with B. McFarland regarding same.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/28/12	2.30	Working on issues regarding MSHA's enforcement powers regarding unpaid assessment penalties.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/28/12	1.50	Legal research concerning MSHA's enforcement powers regarding unpaid assessments.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/29/12	2.00	Legal research concerning MSHA assessment.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	08/29/12	0.30	Meeting with Mr. Ford re: research needed re: MSHA fines.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	08/29/12	0.30	Telephone conference(s) with Mr. Cimino re: MSHA fine issues.
		Ford, Richard G.	08/29/12	4.00	Additional work researching MSHA assessments in cases of non-payment.
		Ford, Richard G.	08/29/12	1.20	Additional work drafting/revising memo re: MSHA assessments in cases of non-payment.
		Ford, Richard G.	08/29/12	1.00	Conference call re: MSHA citations with Mr. McFarland and Mr. Cimino.
		Kapushion, Meredith A.	08/29/12	4.20	Additional telephone conference(s) with B. McFarland, M. Cimino, and G. Ford regarding potential issues in memo regarding MSHA enforcement of penalties.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/29/12	1.60	Working on issues regarding memorandum concerning MSHA enforcement authority.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/29/12	0.80	Legal research concerning issues regarding MSHA enforcement Authority.
		Charlson, Tami S.	08/30/12	0.40	Legal research concerning injunctions for failure to pay penalties.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/30/12	0.80	Multiple telephone conferences regarding research MSHA assessments.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/30/12	0.70	Preparing memorandum re: MSHA assessments.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	08/30/12	1.00	Meeting with Mr. Ford re: memorandum on MSHA claims.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	08/30/12	0.20	Reviewing Mr. Ford's memorandum on MSHA claims.
		Ford, Richard G.	08/30/12	5.00	Additional work researching and revising MSHA assessment memo for Mr. Cimino.
		Ford, Richard G.	08/30/12	0.70	Reviewing Ms. Kapushion's memo re: MSHA assessments and noting comments re: same.
		Ford, Richard G.	08/30/12	0.40	Conference call with Mr. Cimino, Mr. McFarland and Ms. Kapushion re: reproctions of failure to pay MSHA Assessments.
		Kapushion, Meredith A.	08/30/12	3.50	Legal research concerning memo.
		Kapushion, Meredith A.	08/30/12	3.00	Drafting combined memo.
		Kapushion, Meredith A.	08/30/12	0.50	Additional telephone conference(s) with B. McFarland regarding additions to memo and changes.
		Kapushion, Meredith A.	08/30/12	0.40	Telephone conference(s) with B. McFarland, M. Cimino, and G. Ford regarding memo.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/30/12	2.60	Working on issues regarding legal research of MSHA enforcement authority.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/30/12	2.10	Working on memo summarizing MSHA enforcement authority and remedies MSHA can pursue for non-payment of assessment.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/31/12	1.10	Revising Memorandum.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/31/12	0.40	Assisting with preparation of memorandum regarding assessments.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	08/31/12	0.30	Reviewing memorandum re: MSHA claims.
		Dobbs, Jr., William F.	08/31/12	0.20	E-mail Messrs. Cimino and McFarland re: memorandum re: MSHA claims.
		Ford, Richard G.	08/31/12	1.20	Researching MSHA recourse against officers of company for unpaid assessments; e.g. putting officer on "permit/block list."
		Ford, Richard G.	08/31/12	0.90	Reviewing and commenting on Mr. McFarland's Pine Ridge memo re: MSHA assessments.
		Ford, Richard G.	08/31/12	0.20	Reviewing conclusions re: Mr. McFarland's Pine Ridge memo.
		Kapushion, Meredith A.	08/31/12	1.40	Editing memo.
		Kapushion, Meredith A.	08/31/12	0.60	E-mail to B. McFarland regarding memo.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/31/12	3.60	Drafting and revising memo regarding MSHA enforcement authority.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/31/12	3.20	Working on issues regarding legal research on MSHA enforcement authority.
<b>MSHA Assessment Investigation and Research Total</b>				<b>70.90</b>	
<b>Pine Ridge Coal Company, LLC Total</b>				<b>115.50</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	101(c) Petition Fire Suppression Modification	McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/30/12	0.40	Working on initial factual investigation and issues regarding status and strategy.
<b>101(c) Petition Fire Suppression Modification Total</b>				<b>0.40</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	American Eagle Mine; WEVA 2012-996 and WEVA 2012-999	McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/13/12	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/14/12	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy; WEVA 2012-996.
<b>American Eagle Mine; WEVA 2012-996 and WEVA 2012-999 Total</b>				<b>0.60</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000215706 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2010-996	McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/21/12	1.00	Drafting and editing answer to petition and discovery request.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/21/12	0.50	Reviewing and analyzing file.
<b>Case No. 000215706 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2010-996 Total</b>				<b>1.50</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000227784 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2010-1599	McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/24/12	0.20	Working on issues regarding motion to consolidate WEVA 2011-1599.
<b>Case No. 000227784 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2010-1599 Total</b>				<b>0.20</b>	

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000237281 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2011-537	Colston, Leanna L.	07/19/12	0.20	Reviewing citations and rebuttal information for approval of settlement motion.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/19/12	0.10	Receiving settlement motion from Solicitor.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/19/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence regarding settlement conference.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/19/12	0.40	Working on issues regarding finalization of settlement in WEVA 2011-537.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/20/12	0.40	Correspondence to Solicitor regarding changes to motion.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/20/12	0.30	Additional work on reviewing settlement motion for approval.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/20/12	0.70	Working on issues regarding motion to approve settlement and finalization of settlement regarding WEVA 2011-537.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/26/12	0.20	Additional work on reviewing settlement motion for approval.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/26/12	0.20	Correspondence to Solicitor regarding changes to motion.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/26/12	0.50	Working on finalization of settlement in WEVA 2011-537.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/27/12	0.30	Working on finalization of settlement in WEVA 2011-537.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/31/12	0.10	Reviewing final settlement motion for accuracy.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/31/12	0.10	Reviewing final settlement motion submitted to Administrative Law Judge.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/07/12	0.10	Correspondence to clients regarding decision approving settlement.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/07/12	0.10	Reviewing decision approving settlement.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/07/12	0.10	Reviewing settlement motion for approval of decision.
<b>Case No. 000237281 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2011-537 Total</b>				<b>3.90</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000242947 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-891	Colston, Leanna L.	07/19/12	0.40	Reviewing citations and rebuttal information for approval of settlement.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/19/12	0.20	Reviewing correspondence regarding settlement conference.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/19/12	0.10	Reviewing settlement motion from Solicitor in Docket 2011-890.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/19/12	0.10	Reviewing settlement motion from Solicitor in Docket 2011-891.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/19/12	0.70	Working on issues regarding finalization of settlement in WEVA 2011-890 and WVEA 2011-891.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/20/12	0.80	Correspondence to Solicitor regarding changes to motion.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/20/12	0.30	Additional work on reviewing settlement motion for approval in Docket 2011-890.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/20/12	0.30	Additional work on reviewing settlement motion for approval in Docket 2011-891.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/20/12	0.90	Working on issues regarding motion to approve settlement and finalization of settlement regarding WEVA 2011-890 and WEVA 2011-891.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/26/12	0.20	Additional work on reviewing settlement motion for approval in Docket 2011-890.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/26/12	0.20	Additional work on reviewing settlement motion for approval in Docket 2011-891.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/26/12	0.20	Correspondence to Solicitor regarding changes to motion regarding Docket 2011-890.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/26/12	0.20	Correspondence to Solicitor regarding changes to motion regarding Docket 2011-891.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/26/12	0.80	Working on finalization of settlement in WEVA 2011-890 and WEVA 2011-891.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/27/12	0.60	Working on finalization of settlement in WEVA 2011-890 and WEVA 2011-891.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/31/12	0.10	Reviewing final settlement motion for accuracy.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/31/12	0.10	Reviewing final settlement motion submitted to Administrative Law Judge.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/20/12	0.10	Correspondence to client forwarding decision approving settlement.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/20/12	0.10	Reviewing decision approving settlement in WEVA 2011-890.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/20/12	0.20	Working on issues regarding finalization of settlement.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/21/12	0.40	Reviewing files to prepare for upcoming settlement conference with Solicitor.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/30/12	0.10	Correspondence to client forwarding decision approving settlement.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/30/12	0.10	Reviewing decision approving settlement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/30/12	0.20	Working on finalization of settlement.
				<b>7.40</b>	
<b>Case No. 000242947 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-891 Total</b>					
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000245651 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-1102	Colston, Leanna L.	07/19/12	0.20	Reviewing citations and rebuttal information for approval of settlement.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/19/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence regarding settlement conference.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/19/12	0.10	Reviewing settlement motion from Solicitor.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/20/12	0.40	Correspondence to Solicitor regarding changes to motion.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/20/12	0.30	Additional work on reviewing settlement motion for approval.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/26/12	0.20	Additional work on reviewing settlement motion for approval.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/26/12	0.20	Correspondence to Solicitor regarding changes to motion.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/26/12	0.50	Working on finalization of settlement in WEVA 2011-1102.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/31/12	0.10	Reviewing final settlement motion for accuracy.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/31/12	0.10	Reviewing final settlement motion submitted to Administrative Law Judge.
<b>Case No. 000245651 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-1102 Total</b>				<b>2.20</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000248498 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-1311	Colston, Leanna L.	07/19/12	0.20	Reviewing citations and rebuttal information for approval of settlement motion.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/19/12	0.10	Receiving settlement motion from Solicitor.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/19/12	0.10	Reviewing correspondence regarding settlement conference.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/19/12	0.40	Working on issues regarding finalization of settlement in WVEA 2011-1311.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/20/12	0.40	Correspondence to Solicitor regarding changes to motion for approval.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/20/12	0.30	Additional work on reviewing settlement motion for approval.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/20/12	0.70	Working on issues regarding motion to approve settlement and finalization of settlement regarding WEVA 2011-1311.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/26/12	0.20	E-mail traffic regarding settlement.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/26/12	0.20	Additional work on reviewing settlement motion for approval.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/26/12	0.20	Correspondence to Solicitor regarding changes to motion.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/26/12	0.50	Working on finalization of settlement in WEVA 2011-1311.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/27/12	0.30	Working on finalization of settlement in WEVA 2011-1311.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/31/12	0.10	Reviewing final settlement motion for accuracy.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/31/12	0.10	Reviewing final settlement motion submitted to Administrative Law Judge.
<b>Case No. 000248498 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-1311 Total</b>				<b>3.80</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000250991 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-1598	Colston, Leanna L.	08/21/12	0.40	Reviewing files to prepare for upcoming settlement conference with Solicitor.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/22/12	0.20	Working on issues regarding motion to consolidate; WEVA 2011-1599.
<b>Case No. 000250991 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-1598 Total</b>				<b>0.60</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000253895 (American Eagle Mine): WEVA 2011-1917 and WEVA 2011-1918	Cimino, Michael T.	08/15/12	2.00	Working on settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/16/12	0.20	Email traffic regarding settlement.
<b>Case No. 000253895 (American Eagle Mine): WEVA 2011-1917 and WEVA 2011-1918 Total</b>				<b>2.20</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000257054 (American Eagle Mine);	McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/20/12	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
	WEVA 2011-2036	McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/22/12	0.20	Reviewing and analyzing citations and working on issues regarding status and strategy; WEVA 2011-2036.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/22/12	0.20	Working on issues regarding motion to consolidate; WEVA 2011-360.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/24/12	0.20	Working on issues regarding motion to consolidate WEVA 2011-2037.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/30/12	0.10	Correspondence to client forwarding settlement motion for review.
<b>Case No. 000257054 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2011-2036 Total</b>				<b>1.00</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000259753 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2011-2207 and WEVA 2011-2208	Colston, Leanna L.	07/11/12	0.10	Forwarding order of assignment and prehearing order to client.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/11/12	0.10	Reviewing order of assignment and prehearing order.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/30/12	0.20	Correspondence to Mr. Boggs regarding WEVA 2011-2208.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/30/12	0.10	Working on settlement regarding WEVA 2011-2208.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/01/12	0.10	Review of correspondence from Mr. Boggs re: settlement.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/01/12	0.20	Updating settlement chart to prepare for conference with Administrative Law Judge.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/01/12	0.10	Reviewing offer from Solicitor.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/02/12	0.20	Working on issues regarding status and strategy; WEVA 2011-2208.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/06/12	0.20	Working on issues regarding SS.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/07/12	0.30	Settlement negotiations.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/07/12	0.30	Working on issues regard status and strategy.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/09/12	0.10	Review of email from Mr. Grubbs re: settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/10/12	0.20	Email traffic with Secretary of Labor.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/10/12	0.20	Updating settlement chart.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/10/12	0.10	Reviewing settlement offer from Solicitor.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/14/12	0.40	Working on settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/16/12	0.40	Working on settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/17/12	0.30	Email traffic regarding settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/21/12	0.40	Working on settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/21/12	0.10	Review of correspondence from Mr. Grubbs.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/23/12	0.20	Working on settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/24/12	0.30	Email traffic with Judge Steele and Secretary of Labor regarding trial date and status of settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/29/12	1.00	Preparing for and attending conference call with Judge Steele.
<b>Case No. 000259753 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2011-2207 and WEVA 2011-2208 Total</b>				<b>5.60</b>	

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000262590 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-2412	McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/02/12	0.10	Working on issues regarding status and strategy; WEVA 2011-2412.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/20/12	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
<b>Case No. 000262590 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2011-2412 Total</b>				<b>0.40</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000265768 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2012-17 and WEVA 2012-19	McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/02/12	0.10	Working on issues regarding status and strategy; WEVA 2012-19.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/20/12	0.90	Reviewing and analyzing citations.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/22/12	0.60	Reviewing and analyzing citations and working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/23/12	0.60	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
<b>Case No. 000265768 (American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2012-17 and WEVA 2012-19</b>				<b>2.20</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000268443 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-124	McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/20/12	0.30	Working on issues regarding status and strategy.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/21/12	0.40	Reviewing files to prepare for upcoming settlement conference with Solicitor.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/22/12	0.20	Reviewing and analyzing citations and working on issues regarding status and strategy; WEVA 2011-123..
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/22/12	0.20	Working on issues regarding motion to consolidate; WEVA 2012-124,
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/24/12	0.20	Working on issues regarding motion to consolidate WEVA 2012-124.
<b>Case No. 000268443 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-124 Total</b>				<b>1.30</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000274148 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-655	Cimino, Michael T.	07/23/12	0.20	Reviewing correspondence from E. Epstein.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/24/12	0.20	Telephone conference(s) with E. Epstein regarding settlement negotiation.
<b>Case No. 000274148 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-655 Total</b>				<b>0.40</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000284555 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-999	Colston, Leanna L.	08/20/12	0.40	Preparing Answer to Petition for Assessment.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/20/12	0.30	Preparing discovery requests.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/20/12	0.20	Reviewing Petition for Assessment in Docket 2012-999.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/20/12	0.10	Preparing notice of deposition.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/21/12	1.00	Drafting and editing answer to petition and discovery request.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/21/12	0.50	Reviewing and analyzing file.
<b>Case No. 000284555 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-999 Total</b>				<b>2.50</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000285360 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-1102	McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/19/12	0.40	Working on issues regarding finalization of settlement in WVEA 2011-1102.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/20/12	0.70	Working on issues regarding motion to approve settlement and finalization of settlement regarding WEVA 2011-1102.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	07/27/12	0.30	Working on finalization of settlement in WEVA 2011-1102.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/10/12	0.20	Reviewing discovery requests from Solicitor.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/10/12	0.20	Working on settlement negotiations.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/14/12	0.30	Working on issues regarding WEVA 2012-1101.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/20/12	0.40	Reviewing file materials for information to prepare position statement.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/20/12	0.20	Reviewing correspondence from Solicitor regarding position statement.
		McFarland, Benjamin M.	08/20/12	0.50	Working on issues regarding discovery.
<b>Case No. 000285360 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-1102 Total</b>				<b>3.20</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 000291125 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-1453	Colston, Leanna L.	08/20/12	0.70	Preparing Answer to Petition for Assessment.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/20/12	0.40	Preparing discovery requests.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/20/12	0.20	Preparing notice of deposition.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/20/12	0.20	Reviewing Petition for Assessment in Docket 2012-1453.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/21/12	0.50	Preparing Answer.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/21/12	0.10	Correspondence to Ms. Boyd.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/21/12	0.10	Preparing Discovery Requests.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/21/12	0.10	Preparing Notice of Deposition.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/21/12	0.10	Review of Citations.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/21/12	0.10	Review of Petition.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/30/12	0.70	Preparing summary of citations and rebuttal information.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/30/12	0.30	Additional work on reviewing citations and rebuttal information.
<b>Case No. 000291125 (American Eagle Mine); WEVA 2012-1453 Total</b>				<b>3.50</b>	
Speed Mining, LLC	Case No. 175956 ( American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2009-871 & 2009-872	Cimino, Michael T.	07/16/12	0.50	Working on settlement.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/17/12	0.50	Updating settlement chart.
		Colston, Leanna L.	07/17/12	0.20	Reviewing settlement offer received from Solicitor.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/19/12	0.20	E-mail traffic with Ms. Mucklow re: settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	07/19/12	0.10	Reviewing settlement offer.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/10/12	0.10	Review of Order.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/14/12	0.70	Working on settlement.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/14/12	0.30	Preparing settlement chart of offers.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/14/12	0.10	Receiving counter offer from Solicitor.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/15/12	0.50	Working on settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/15/12	0.20	Correspondence to Mr. Boggs regarding Order.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/15/12	0.10	Review of Order from Judge Weisberger.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/17/12	0.30	Working on settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/17/12	0.20	Email traffic regarding conference call with Administrative Law Judge re: status.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/21/12	1.00	Working on settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/22/12	0.30	Email traffic with Secretary of Labor.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/22/12	0.20	Email traffic with Mr. Boggs re: settlement.

**Time Detail By Project**

<b>Client Name</b>	<b>Matter Name</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/24/12	0.80	Attending conference call with Judge Weisberger re: settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/24/12	0.10	Email traffic with Secretary of Labor.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/27/12	1.20	Working on settlement.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/27/12	0.10	Reviewing latest settlement offer from Solicitor.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/27/12	0.10	Updating settlement chart with offers.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/29/12	1.20	Working on settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/30/12	1.10	Working on settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/30/12	0.50	Telephone conference(s) with Administrative Law Judge re: settlement.
		Cimino, Michael T.	08/30/12	0.40	Email traffic with Secretary of Labor and client.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/30/12	0.10	Reviewing latest offer from Solicitor.
		Colston, Leanna L.	08/30/12	0.10	Updating settlement chart with reduction amounts.
<b>Case No. 175956 ( American Eagle Mine) WEVA 2009-871 &amp; 2009-872 Total</b>				<b>11.20</b>	
<b>Speed Mining, LLC Total</b>				<b>54.10</b>	
<b>SAFETY AND HEALTH TOTAL</b>				<b>360.80</b>	
<b>WORKERS COMPENSATION</b>					
Patriot Coal Corporation	Refunds	Huffman, Timothy E.	08/03/12	2.00	Reviewing OIC proposed stipulations.
		Bostic, Rebecca L.	08/06/12	1.00	Reviewing proposed finding of fact.
		Huffman, Timothy E.	08/06/12	1.00	Telephone conference with OIC counsel regarding proposed stipulations.
		Huffman, Timothy E.	08/09/12	1.50	Preparing for final hearing.
		Huffman, Timothy E.	08/10/12	1.00	Representing employer at final hearing.
		Huffman, Timothy E.	08/15/12	1.00	Preparing for status conference.
<b>Refunds Total</b>				<b>7.50</b>	
Patriot Coal Corporation	Senate Bill Implementation	Huffman, Timothy E.	07/30/12	0.33	Meeting with employer representatives regarding possible amendments to Rule 4.
		Huffman, Timothy E.	08/22/12	0.25	Meeting with OIC Commission regarding attending fee rule.
<b>Senate Bill Implementation Total</b>				<b>0.58</b>	
<b>Patriot Coal Corporation Total</b>				<b>8.08</b>	
<b>WORKERS COMPENSATION TOTAL</b>				<b>8.08</b>	
<b>TOTAL</b>				<b>618.28</b>	