

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK**

**In re:**

**PATRIOT COAL CORPORATION, et al.,**

**Debtors.**

**Chapter 11**

**Case No. 12-12900 (SCC)**

**(Jointly Administered)**

**MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF STEPTOE & JOHNSON PLLC FOR  
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AND DISBURSEMENTS FOR THE PERIOD OF  
AUGUST 1, 2012 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2012**

<b>NAME OF APPLICANT:</b>	<b><u>Step toe &amp; Johnson PLLC</u></b>
<b>ROLE IN THE CASE:</b>	Counsel to the Debtors
<b>TIME PERIOD:</b>	August 1, 2012 through and including August 31, 2012
<b>CURRENT APPLICATION:</b>	Total Fees Requested: \$42,294.90 Total Expenses Requested: \$2,441.35
<b>PRIOR APPLICATION:</b>	None

1. In accordance with the *Order To Establish Procedures for Interim Monthly Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals* [ECF No. 262] (the “**Interim Compensation Order**”), Steptoe & Johnson PLLC (“**Steptoe & Johnson**”), counsel to the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (collectively, the “**Debtors**”), hereby submits its Monthly Statement for Professional Services and Disbursements (the “**Fee Statement**”) for the period of August 1, 2012 through and including August 31, 2012 (the “**Fee Statement Period**”).

2. Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Steptoe & Johnson seeks payment of \$44,736.25, representing Steptoe & Johnson’s fees for services rendered and actual and necessary expenses incurred.

3. Attached hereto as “Exhibit A” is a listing of Steptoe & Johnson’s professionals and paraprofessionals (collectively, the “**Steptoe & Johnson Professionals**”), including the hourly rate for each Steptoe & Johnson Professional who rendered services to the Debtors in connection with these chapter 11 cases during the Fee Statement Period and the title, aggregate hours worked and the amount of fees billed by each Steptoe & Johnson Professional.

4. Attached hereto as “Exhibit B” is a schedule specifying the categories of actual and necessary expenses for which Steptoe & Johnson is seeking reimbursement and the total amount for each such expense category.

5. Attached hereto as “Exhibit C” is a summary of the number of hours and amounts billed by Steptoe & Johnson during the Fee Statement Period, organized by matter categories.

Such services included:

- General labor and employment advice;
- General tax advice;
- Administrative litigation in front of the Mine Safety and Health Administration;
- Employment litigation;
- Federal administrative litigation in front of the National Labor Relations Board and the Equal Employment Opportunity Commission;
- State administrative litigation in front of the West Virginia State Human Rights Commission.

6. Attached as “Exhibit D” are the time records of Steptoe & Johnson, which provide a daily summary of the time spent by each Steptoe & Johnson Professional during the Fee Statement Period by matter category.

**NOTICE**

7. Consistent with the procedures described in the Interim Compensation Order, the Debtors will serve this Fee Statement, by hand or overnight delivery, on (i) the Debtors, Patriot Coal Corporation, 12312 Olive Boulevard, Suite 400, St. Louis, Missouri 63141, Attn.: Jacquelyn A. Jones, (ii) the Office of the United States Trustee for the Southern District of New York, 33 Whitehall Street, 21<sup>st</sup> Floor, New York, New York 10004, Attn.: Elisabetta G. Gasparini and Paul K. Schwartzberg, (iii) attorneys for the administrative agent for the Debtors' postpetition lenders, (a) Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP, 767 Fifth Avenue, New York, New York 10153, Attn.: Marcia Goldstein and Joseph Smolinsky, and (b) Willkie Farr & Gallagher LLP, 787 Seventh Avenue, New York, New York 10019, Attn.: Margot B. Schonholtz and Ana Alfonso, and (iv) proposed counsel to the official committee of unsecured creditors, Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP, 1177 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10036, Attn.: Adam C. Rogoff, Esq. and Gregory G. Plotko, Esq..

8. WHEREFORE, the Debtors respectfully request that the Court grant the relief requested herein and such other and further relief as is just and proper.

Dated this 21st day of September, 2012.

By: /s/ **Brian M. Resnick**  
Marshall S. Huebner  
Damian S. Schaible  
Brian M. Resnick  
Michelle M. McGreal

DAVIS POLK & WARDWELL LLP  
450 Lexington Avenue  
New York, New York 10017  
Telephone: (212) 450-4000  
Facsimile: (212) 607-7983

C. David Morrison

STEPTOE & JOHNSON PLLC  
400 White Oaks Boulevard  
Bridgeport, WV 26330-4500  
Telephone: (304) 933-8113  
Facsimile: (304) 933-8776

*Counsel to the Debtors and  
Debtors in Possession*

# **EXHIBIT A**

## **Professionals and Rates**

**I.A. Members / Of Counsel**

<b>Name of Member / Of Counsel</b>	<b>Title</b>	<b>Hourly Rate</b>	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>Total Fees</b>
C. David Morrison	Member – Labor	\$235.00	4.8	\$1,128.00
David E. Dick	Member – Labor	\$235.00	3.2	\$752.00
Jeffrey K. Phillips	Member – Labor	\$220.00	75.5	\$16,610.00
L. Frederick Williams, Jr.	Member – Litigation	\$235.00	1.0	\$235.00
Michael D. Mullins	Member - Litigation	\$205.00	.9	\$184.50
W. Henry Lawrence	Member – Litigation	\$235.00	.2	\$47.00
<b>TOTAL MEMBERS and OF COUNSEL:</b>			<b>85.6</b>	<b>\$18,956.50</b>

**II.A. Associates**

<b>Name of Associate</b>	<b>Department</b>	<b>Hourly Rate</b>	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>Total Fees</b>
Jonathan R. Ellis	Labor	\$160.00	107.7	\$17,232.00
John "JB" B. McCusky	Labor	\$143.00	41.5	\$5,934.50
W. James O'Brien	Litigation	\$185.00	.3	\$55.50
<b>TOTAL ASSOCIATES:</b>			<b>149.5</b>	<b>\$23,222.00</b>

**III.A. Paraprofessionals**

<b>Name of Paraprofessional</b>	<b>Department</b>	<b>Hourly Rate</b>	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>Total Fees</b>
Patricia A. Bullock	Litigtaion Paralegal	\$97.00	1.2	\$116.40
<b>TOTAL PARAPROFESSIONALS:</b>			<b>1.2</b>	<b>\$116.40</b>

# **EXHIBIT B**

## **Expenses**

ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES INCURRED BY  
STEP TOE & JOHNSON PLLC ON BEHALF OF THE DEBTORS

<b>CATEGORY of EXPENSES</b>	<b>AMOUNTS</b>
Computer research	63.64
Duplication	49.10
Postage, courier and freight	54.95
Outside document retrieval	1,264.80
Travel	696.60
Office charges	123.81
Meals	188.45
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>2,441.35</b>

# **EXHIBIT C**

## **Summary of Project Code**

SUMMARY OF HOURS AND AMOUNTS BILLED  
BY STEPTOE & JOHNSON PLLC

DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
Labor Matters	3.0	705.00
Bishop v. Client, <i>et al.</i>	.6	123.00
Cooke v. Mine Safety Appliances, <i>et al.</i>	.2	41.00
Southern Land Co., <i>et al.</i> v. McClure Logging v. Hobet Mining	.3	61.50
Sales & Severance Tax Audit	1.0	235.00
Hall v. Remington, LLC	.4	94.00
Lambert, <i>et al.</i> v. MSA, <i>et al.</i> and EACC, <i>et al.</i>	.3	61.50
Apogee Coal Co. / Buckner NLRB Charge	4.6	1081.00
MSHA – General	1.0	160.00
Black Oak Mine (MSHA Case #166218 & 169086)	.1	16.00
Harris No. 1 (MSHA Case #166203)	.2	32.00
Harris No. 1 (MSHA Case #172226)	.2	32.00
Winchester (MSHA Case #168620)	.2	32.00
Black Oak (MSHA Case #172201)	3.5	560.00
Remington's Deskins Mine (MSHA Case #174414)	1.1	176.00
Harris No. 1 (MSHA Case #195547)	1.4	224.00
Highland Mining (MSHA Case #187706)	59.6	13,112.00
Defense of 107(A) and 104(B) Orders Issued at Harris No. 1	.3	48.00
Winchester Mine (MSHA Case #191184)	2.4	365.30
UMWA Local 1503 v. Eastern Associated Coal	.8	128.00
Rivers Edge Mining (MSHA Case #201969)	.2	32.00
Rivers Edge Mining (MSHA Case #199003)	.4	64.00
Harris No. 1 (MSHA Case #240769)	.3	48.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #228532-01)	2.8	468.40
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #237915)	.8	176.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #230242)	.2	44.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #240883)	.1	22.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #234779)	7.8	715.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #231678)	.8	176.00
Winchester (MSHA Case #241281)	1.6	245.80
Winchester (MSHA Case #243940)	.8	124.60
Winchester (MSHA Case #232171)	4.2	648.20

DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
Winchester (MSHA Case #249360)	.5	71.50
Winchester (MSHA Case #238402)	5.2	786.10
Winchester (MSHA Case #225862)	1.7	256.70
Harris No. 1 (MSHA Case #223054)	.2	32.00
Rivers Edge Mine (MSHA Case #256838)	.3	48.00
Gateway Eagle (MSHA Case #257616)	.2	32.00
Blue Creek No. 2 (MSHA Case #261206)	1.8	281.20
Black Oak (MSHA Case #257624)	3.2	512.00
Winchester (MSHA Case #258124)	1.2	192.00
Winchester (MSHA Case #263742)	1.3	208.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #254608)	4.8	1056.00
Winchester (MSHA Case #266793)	.8	116.10
Gateway Eagle (MSHA Case #266254)	.4	64.00
Black Oak (MSHA Case #251458)	2.5	400.00
Black Oak (MSHA Case #273637)	3.5	595.00
Blue Creek No. 2 (MSHA Case #274408)	4.9	722.80
Black Oak (MSHA Case #248970)	1.9	304.00
Harris No. 1 (MSHA Case #273620)	6.2	1021.60
Black Oak (MSHA Case #270870)	6.4	1036.70
Harris No. 1 (MSHA Case #251443)	.2	34.00
Harris No. 1 (MSHA Case #246203)	1.3	208.00
Winchester (MSHA Case #275179)	8.6	1289.30
Winchester (MSHA Case #272361)	.1	16.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #266371)	.2	44.00
Freedom Mine (MSHA Case #256455)	.1	22.00
Rocklick Prep Plant (MSHA Case #254494)	1.8	288.00
Black Oak (MSHA Case #276491)	.5	80.00
Campbell's Creek No. 7 (MSHA Case #274403)	2.6	382.00
Harris Prep Plant (MSHA Case #254490)	.8	128.00
Winchester (MSHA Case #278090)	.6	96.00
Pruitt Discrimination Case No. 2	.5	44.00
Black Oak (MSHA Case #279362)	1.0	160.00
Winchester (MSHA Case #280731)	1.1	157.30
Black Oak (MSHA Case #282102)	3.0	480.00

<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>AMOUNT</b>
Winchester (MSHA Case #283385)	.4	64.00
Black Oak (MSHA Case #260216)	3.3	528.00
Black Oak (MSHA Case #266265)	3.4	544.00
Black Oak (MSHA Case #285374)	1.3	197.80
American Eagle (MSHA Case #286172)	12.8	1937.50
Winchester (MSHA Case #286437)	.6	96.00
American Eagle (MSHA Case #288468)	16.0	2560.00
Freedom (MSHA Case #279236)	.1	22.00
Sugar Maple (MSHA Case #291131)	1.6	212.80
Sugar Maple (MSHA Case #285372)	4.6	661.20
Campbell's Creek No. 10 (MSHA Case #291127)	1.0	143.00
Sugar Maple (MSHA Case #288473)	1.0	143.00
American Eagle (MSHA Case #284555)	1.8	288.00
Winchester (MSHA Case #292179)	7.5	1008.00
Highland 9 Mine (MSHA Case #282970)	.3	66.00
Sugar Maple Mine 105(c) Investigation	1.0	160.00
Dodge Hill Immediate Notification	5.4	1188.00
Gateway Eagle (MSHA Case #291126)	.5	80.00
Farley Eagle Mine (MSHA Case #291118)	.5	80.00
Black Oak (MSHA Case #291132)	2.9	464.00
Campbell's Creek No. 7 (MSHA Case #294266)	1.3	208.00
American Eagle (MSHA Case #293996)	3.4	544.00
<b>TOTAL HOURS and COMPENSATION REQUESTED:</b>	<b>241.3</b>	<b>\$42,410.90</b>

# **EXHIBIT D**

## **Time Records**

Pg 16 of 36  
**TIME DETAIL REPORT**

<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Time-keeper</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
<b>LABOR MATTERS</b>			
08/01/12	DED	.20	Review of med cert for Colin Milam (intermittent knee pain to last 3-6 months with 2 days per week off); return call to Judy Bailey regarding same (left message)
08/09/12	CDM	1.40	Telephone conference with Eric Waller re: possible issue involving employee with kidney stones (.30); Draft memo to the file re: employee with kidney stone issue (.20); Review e-mail from Mark George re: employee with recurrent absenteeism (.10); Review file on employee at issue(.30); Draft e-mail to Mark George containing proposed letter to employee (.50)
08/13/12	CDM	.30	Telephone conference with Eric Waller re: employee on chronic and excessive program who claimed to have FMLA absence
08/16/12	CDM	.20	Confer with Eric Waller re: deferral of the NLRB to arbitration
08/17/12	CDM	.20	Telephone conference with Eric Waller regarding FMLA coverage
08/21/12	CDM	.30	Review e-mail from Colin Milam and respond to it re: introduction to make when doing an investigatory interview
08/29/12	CDM	.30	Review materials from Mark George re: Jackie Combs
08/30/12	CDM	.10	Draft e-mail to Mark George re: whether employee at issue is off on workers' compensation status
TOTAL HOURS:		3.00	
<b>BISHOP, KERRLIE E. &amp; ALFREDA V. CLIENT, ET AL.</b>			
08/03/12	WHL	.20	Call from and email to Frank Simmerman
08/09/12	MDM	.10	Receive and review notice of hearing
08/31/12	WJO	.30	Review motion to stay case pending Patriot's bankruptcy proceedings (.10); Respond to Jeremy Shook's email requesting list of remaining items for completion of case; review file for same (.20)
TOTAL HOURS:		0.60	
<b>COOKE, DANNY &amp; DARLENE V. MINE SAFETY APPLIANCES, ET AL.</b>			
08/06/12	MDM	.20	Receive and review final dismissal order (.10); Letter to client explaining dismissal order and completion of defense (.10)
TOTAL HOURS:		0.20	

Pg 17 of 36  
**TIME DETAIL REPORT**

<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Time-keeper</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
<b>SOUTHERN LAND CO., ET AL. V. MCCLURE LOGGING V. HOBET MINING</b>			
08/05/12	MDM	.10	Correspondence from co-defendant regarding motion to stay pending resolution of bankruptcy
08/23/12	MDM	.20	Call from counsel for Cabet regarding Cabet's potential to server out the claims against it from the bankruptcy protections
TOTAL HOURS:		0.30	
<b>SALES &amp; SEVERANCE TAX AUDIT</b>			
08/01/12	LFW	.50	Telephone conference with the State Tax Department regarding audit issues;
08/02/12	LFW	.50	Preparation for and participation in conference call with Office of Tax Appeals regarding status of case (.25); Telephone conference with attorney for the State Tax Department regarding resolution of certain issues (.25)
TOTAL HOURS:		1.00	
<b>HALL, RONNIE V. REMINGTON, LLC</b>			
08/08/12	CDM	.40	Telephone conference with James Deavers re: a copy of the settlement agreement (.10); draft e-mail to Elizabeth Power re: request of James Deavers (.10); draft e-mail to James Deavers after locating the agreement (.20)
TOTAL HOURS:		0.40	
<b>LAMBERT, JILL, ET AL. V. MSA, ET AL. &amp; EACC, ET AL.</b>			
08/05/12	MDM	.10	Receive and review discovery from co-defendant to MSA
08/07/12	MDM	.10	Call from co-defendant regarding issues related to bankruptcy filing
08/27/12	MDM	.10	Receive and briefly review discovery responses from plaintiff to co-defendant
TOTAL HOURS:		.30	
<b>APOGEE COAL CO. / BUCKNER NLRB CHARGE</b>			
08/22/12	CDM	.50	Telephone conference with Eric Waller re: this matter
08/23/12	CDM	1.10	Review materials supplied by Eric Waller on the unfair labor practice and telephone conference with AED (1.0); draft e-mail to Eric Waller re: unfair labor practice (.10)
08/23/12	DED	1.40	Teleconference with David Morrison regarding handling of ULP charge response; review documents forwarded from Dave, including charge particulars and District agreement; call to NLRB agent Buchholz to advise of agreement

**TIME DETAIL REPORT**

<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Time-keeper</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
			entered by locals and district that explain what happened; email agreement to Buchholz for her consideration in hopes to short cut response to charges; email from and to Buchholz regarding missing document page
08/27/12	DED	1.40	Email from NLRB seeking copy of arbitration agreement referenced in Hobert agreement regarding panel; email to Judy Smith to get document; review Dyke arbitration agreement and email to J. Buchholz at NLRB with comments; call from Judy Smith re: the ULPs; advise regarding FMLA rights for employee; call from Eric Waller to discuss status of ULP charge response; mail from and to Judy; email to J. Buchholz at NLRB inquiring as to moving the deadline to respond to the ULPs
08/28/12	DED	.20	Email from NLRBs Buchholz regarding timing regarding response to ULP charges; email to Eric Waller regarding same
TOTAL HOURS:		4.60	
<b>MSHA - GENERAL</b>			
08/15/12	JBM	2.50	Attend settlement conference on various black oak dockets
08/16/12	JBM	4.00	Attend parts of settlement conference on various black oak dockets
08/22/12	JRE	.80	Review Patriot Coal's spreadsheet of matters listed as active for Steptoe & Johnson; draft update to client regarding discrepancies
08/23/12	JRE	.20	Emails with Sandy Martin re: updating Patriot's spreadsheet of active cases
TOTAL HOURS:		7.50	
<b>BLACK OAK MINE - MSHA CASES #000166218 &amp; #000169086 (Eastern Associated Coal LLC)</b>			
08/06/12	JRE	.10	Receive and review order setting hearing on WEVA 2009-230 (split with WEVA 2009-594 and 595)
TOTAL HOURS:		.10	
<b>HARRIS NO. 1 - MSHA CASE #000166203 WEVA 2009-222 - 228 (Eastern Associated Coal LLC)</b>			
08/14/12	JRE	.20	Emails with Noah AnStraus re: failure of Judge Bulluck to enter orders on WEVA 2009-223 through 228; re-filing of proposed orders
TOTAL HOURS:		.20	

Pg 19 of 36  
TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
<b>HARRIS NO. 1 - MSHA CASE #000172226 WEVA 2009-729 (Eastern Associated Coal LLC)</b>			
08/09/12	JRE	.20	Emails with Lucy Chiu re: whether final order was entered in corresponding case WEVA 2009-584
TOTAL HOURS:		.20	
<b>WINCHESTER - MSHA CASE #000168620 WEVA 2009-508/509 (Eastern Associated Coal LLC)</b>			
08/06/12	JRE	.20	Email to Robert Hill re: rebuttals
TOTAL HOURS:		.20	
<b>BLACK OAK - MSHA CASE #000172201 WEVA 2009-594 &amp; 595 (Eastern Associated Coal LLC)</b>			
08/03/12	JRE	.50	Prepare for meeting with J.J. Meadows to discuss citations contained in WEVA 2009-594 and 595
08/06/12	JRE	.30	Emails with Jessica Allen re: settlement negotiations (.20); receive and review order setting hearing on WEVA 2009-594 and 595 (split with WEVA 2009-230) (.10)
08/07/12	JRE	1.60	Meeting with J.J. Meadows and Sam Morton to discuss citations (split among multiple matters)
08/08/12	JRE	.90	Draft settlement proposal to Jessica Allen
08/20/12	JRE	.20	Draft email to J.J. Meadows re: hearing date on WEVA 2009-230, 594, and 595
TOTAL HOURS:		3.50	
<b>REMINGTON'S DESKINS MINE - MSHA #000174414 WEVA #2009-820 (Patriot Coal)</b>			
08/09/12	JRE	.20	Receive and review order from Judge Weisberger requiring status conference call; email to Jesse Levine (Judge Weisberger's law clerk) re: settlement of WEVA 2009-820
08/10/12	JRE	.40	Emails and calls with law clerk Dhurba Mukherjee re: settlement status on WEVA 2009-820 (.20); emails to Nadia Hafeez re: language for settlement documents (.20)
08/13/12	JRE	.20	Calls and emails with Nadia Hafeez re: settlement documents
08/23/12	JRE	.30	Review proposed motion to approve settlement and proposed order approving settlement
TOTAL HOURS:		1.10	
<b>HARRIS #1 MINE - MSHA #000195547 / WEVA 2010-11 &amp; 2010-12 (Patriot Coal)</b>			
08/01/12	JRE	.10	Email to Jason Riley (Judge Rae's law clerk) re: status update on WEVA 2010-11
08/02/12	JRE	.20	Emails with Anh LyJordan on WEVA 2010-11 re: settlement negotiations

Pg 20 of 36  
**TIME DETAIL REPORT**

<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Time-keeper</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
08/03/12	JRE	.20	Emails with Ahn LyJordan re: settlement negotiations on WEVA 2010-11
08/06/12	JRE	.70	Draft settlement proposal to Anh LyJordan on WEVA 2010-11
08/31/12	JRE	.20	Emails with Anh LyJordan re: settlement negotiations on WEVA 2010-11
<b>TOTAL HOURS:</b>		<b>1.40</b>	
<hr/>			
<b>HIGHLAND MINING - KENT 2009-1241 - MSHA 187706 (Patriot Coal)</b>			
08/06/12	JKP	.60	Email from solicitor E. Friary re: settlement negotiations; draft settlement proposal
08/07/12	JKP	2.00	Draft settlement proposal; work on settlement negotiations
08/08/12	JKP	5.70	Prepare for trial; teleconference with Randy Duncan re: settlement, trial and witnesses; emails from and to solicitor E. Friary re: settlement proposals and trial
08/09/12	JKP	4.40	Teleconferences with Randy Duncan re: trial and settlement; email to solicitors re: settlement; prepare for trial; teleconference with atty. E. Waller re: trial and settlement prospects; draft email to atty. E. Waller re: trial and settlement
08/10/12	JKP	6.30	Multiple teleconferences with Randy Duncan re: trial witnesses and settlement proposals; work on settlement negotiations; emails from and to solicitor E. Friary re: settlement; prepare for trial; emails from and to atty. E. Waller re: status of case; teleconferences with solicitors Alisha Wyatt and Elizabeth Friary re: settlement proposals
08/11/12	JKP	.60	Work on revised witness list; draft email to Randy Duncan re: witness interviews
08/12/12	JKP	2.40	Prepare for trial
08/13/12	JKP	15.30	Travel to Henderson, Kentucky; meet with witnesses; prepare for trial
08/14/12	JKP	9.50	Prepare for and attend trial
08/15/12	JKP	10.00	Prepare for and attend trial; travel from Henderson, Kentucky to Lexington, Kentucky
08/16/12	JKP	1.40	Work on settlement negotiations for four citations that were not tried; draft email to atty. E. Waller and R. Duncan re: settlement/second trial strategy

**TIME DETAIL REPORT**

<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Time-keeper</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
08/17/12	JKP	1.30	Work on settlement negotiations concerning remaining citations; teleconferences with Randy Duncan re: case strategy; teleconference with solicitor E. Friary re: settlement; emails from and to solicitor E. Friary re: settlement
08/28/12	JKP	.10	Letter from solicitor E. Friary with assessed violation history report (Exhibit 42)
TOTAL HOURS:		59.60	

**DEFENSE OF 107(A) & 104(B) ORDERS ISSUED AT HARRIS #1 MINE (Patriot Coal)**

08/21/12	JRE	.20	Review proposed motion to approve settlement and proposed order approving settlement (split with WEVA 2010-1209)
08/23/12	JRE	.10	Email from Fiona Harewood re: filing of settlement documents
TOTAL HOURS:		.30	

**WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2009-1744 - MSHA Case #191184 (Patriot Coal)**

08/01/12	JBM	.90	Review and analyze file to update and revise settlement proposal
08/15/12	JBM	.20	Working on settlement proposal
08/30/12	JRE	1.10	Draft settlement proposal to Alena Amunson
08/31/12	JRE	.20	Emails with Alena Amunson re: settlement negotiations
TOTAL HOURS:		2.40	

**UMWA LOCAL 1503 V. EASTERN ASSOCIATED COAL****DEFENSE OF 111 COMPLAINT AGAINST EACC'S HARRIS #1 MINE (Patriot Coal)**

08/02/12	JRE	.10	Email from Judy Rivlin re: status of check for Jerry Taylor
08/06/12	JRE	.20	Emails with Judith Rivlin re: settlement issues
08/09/12	JRE	.20	Email to Colin Milam re: settlement check
08/20/12	JRE	.10	Email from Colin Milam re: settlement check
08/21/12	JRE	.20	Email from Judy Rivlin re: miners affected by settlement; draft email to Colin Milam re: same
TOTAL HOURS:		.80	

**RIVERS EDGE MINING - WEVA 2010-287 -MSHA 000201969 (Patriot Coal)**

08/24/12	JRE	.20	Review proposed settlement documents
TOTAL HOURS:		.20	

Pg 22 of 36  
**TIME DETAIL REPORT**

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
<b>RIVERS EDGE MINING - WEVA 2010-147 -MSHA 000199003 (Patriot Coal)</b>			
08/13/12	JRE	.20	Emails with Judge Barbour's law clerk re: settlement documents
08/24/12	JRE	.20	Review proposed settlement documents
TOTAL HOURS:		.40	
<b>HARRIS NO. 1 MINE - WEVA 2011-617/618 - MSHA 240769 (Patriot Coal)</b>			
08/21/12	JRE	.30	Receive and review proposed order approving settlement on WEVA 2011-618
TOTAL HOURS:		.30	
<b>HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2010-1491 - MSHA #228532-01 (Highland Mining)</b>			
08/01/12	JKP	.10	Email from ALJ William Moran re: missing trial exhibits
08/01/12	PAB	1.20	Extensive search of multiple voluminous files in attempt to locate documents/exhibits requested by Judge.
08/09/12	JKP	.20	Research requirements for handling missing trial exhibit in KENT 2010-1492
08/16/12	JKP	.80	Review Secretary's post-hearing brief; supply additional information requested by Judge Moran
08/17/12	JKP	.50	Attend ALJ teleconference re: remaining trial issues and missing exhibits; draft email to ALJ Moran re: handling of issue concerning exhibits
TOTAL HOURS:		2.80	
<b>HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2011-296/297 - MSHA #237915 (Highland Mining)</b>			
08/16/12	JKP	.80	Review secretary's post-hearing memo; draft email to Judge Moran outlining citations settled and citations awaiting ruling
TOTAL HOURS:		.80	
<b>FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2010-1617 - MSHA #230242 (Ohio County Coal)</b>			
08/19/12	JKP	.20	Prepare for ALJ teleconference
TOTAL HOURS:		.20	
<b>HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2011-410 - MSHA #240883 (Highland Mining)</b>			
08/16/12	JKP	.10	Email from solicitor R. Levinson with settlement documents
TOTAL HOURS:		.10	
<b>HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2011-97 - MSHA #234779 (Highland Mining)</b>			
08/09/12	JKP	.50	Draft email to solicitors Brian Mauk and Rachel Levinson re: strategy for addressing missing exhibit; teleconference with solicitors B. Mauk and R. Levinson re: objection to recreated exhibit; email to Judge Moran re: status of

## TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
			exhibits agreement
08/14/12	JBM	2.60	Reviewing case file and trial transcript
08/16/12	JKP	.80	Review the Petitioner's post-trial memo; collect additional information requested by Judge Moran for ruling on citations; email from solicitor R. Levinson with partial settlement documents
08/16/12	JBM	2.40	Drafting motion to allow defendant to recreate trial exhibit
08/17/12	JBM	.60	Researching case law regarding lost exhibits and recreating them for post trial use
08/17/12	JBM	.90	Reviewing and revising motion to allow respondent to recreate trial exhibit
TOTAL HOURS:		7.80	
<b>HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2010-1632 - MSHA #231678 (Highland Mining)</b>			
08/16/12	JKP	.80	Multiple emails from and to solicitor B. Mauk, solicitor R. Levinson and Judge W. Moran re: post-trial briefs, settled citations and remaining citations; prepare for ALJ teleconference; email from solicitor R. Levinson with partial settlement documents
TOTAL HOURS:		.80	
<b>WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2011-762 - MSHA #241281 (Remington LLC)</b>			
08/01/12	JBM	.50	Review and analyze file to update and revise settlement proposal
08/15/12	JBM	.10	Working on settlement proposal
08/31/12	JRE	1.00	Draft settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		1.60	
<b>WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2011-908 - MSHA #243940 (Remington LLC)</b>			
08/15/12	JBM	.20	Working on settlement proposal
08/21/12	JRE	.60	Draft settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		.80	
<b>WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2011-196 - MSHA #232171 (Remington LLC)</b>			
08/03/12	JRE	.40	Status conference call with Judge Moran and attorney Anthony Berry
08/15/12	JBM	1.10	Working on settlement proposal
08/26/12	JBM	.30	Finalizing settlement proposal
08/27/12	JRE	2.40	Draft settlement proposal; research on S&S pre-shift violations where the underlying

Pg 24 of 36  
**TIME DETAIL REPORT**

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
			conditions were cited as non-S&S
TOTAL HOURS:		4.20	
<hr/>			
<b>WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2011-1338 - MSHA #249360 (Remington LLC)</b>			
08/01/12	JBM	.40	Review and analyze file to update and revise settlement proposal
08/15/12	JBM	.10	Working on settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		.50	
<hr/>			
<b>WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2011-564 - MSHA #238402 (Remington LLC)</b>			
08/01/12	JBM	2.40	Review and analyze file to update and revise settlement proposal
08/03/12	JRE	.20	Email from attorney Anthony Berry re: hearing date
08/08/12	JRE	.20	Emails from and to attorney Anthony Berry re: settlement proposals
08/15/12	JBM	.30	Working on settlement proposal
08/31/12	JRE	2.10	Draft settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		5.20	
<hr/>			
<b>WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2010-1556 - MSHA #225862 (Remington LLC)</b>			
08/01/12	JBM	.80	Review and analyze file to update and revise settlement proposal
08/15/12	JBM	.10	Working on settlement proposal
08/27/12	JRE	.80	Draft settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		1.70	
<hr/>			
<b>HARRIS NO. 1 MINE - WEVA 2010-1209 - MSHA #223054 (Eastern Associated Coal)</b>			
08/21/12	JRE	.20	Review proposed motion to approve settlement and proposed order approving settlement (split with case on corresponding 104(b) orders)
TOTAL HOURS:		.20	
<hr/>			
<b>RIVERS EDGE MINE - WEVA 2011-2034 - MSHA #256838 (Rivers Edge Mining)</b>			
08/06/12	JRE	.30	Emails with Scott Hecker re: settlement negotiations; emails with Jason Riley re: status conference call with Judge Rae
TOTAL HOURS:		.30	
<hr/>			
<b>GATEWAY EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2011-2100 - MSHA #257616 (Eastern Associated Coal)</b>			
08/22/12	JRE	.20	Emails to and from attorney Bob Wilson re: status of settlement documents on WEVA 2011-2100
TOTAL HOURS:		.20	

Pg 25 of 36  
**TIME DETAIL REPORT**

<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Time-keeper</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
<b>BLUE CREEK NO. 2 MINE - WEVA 2011-2211 - MSHA #261206 (Midland Trail Energy)</b>			
08/02/12	JRE	.20	Work on settlement proposal
08/02/12	JBM	.20	Drafting settlement proposal 1
08/07/12	JRE	.20	Emails to and from Anh LyJordan re: discovery requests and settlement negotiations
08/16/12	JBM	.20	Review of written communication from Secretary and settlement proposal
08/21/12	JRE	.40	Work on settlement proposal
08/28/12	JRE	.60	Work on settlement proposal; draft email to Ahn LyJordan re: settlement proposal and staying discovery
TOTAL HOURS:		1.80	
<b>BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2011-2039 &amp; 2040 - MSHA #257624 (Eastern Associated Coal)</b>			
08/06/12	JRE	.20	Receive and review order approving settlement of WEVA 2011-2039; draft email to client outlining terms of settlement
08/06/12	JRE	.50	Prepare for meeting with J.J. Meadows to discuss citations contained in WEVA 2011-2040
08/08/12	JRE	.20	Draft discovery requests on WEVA 2011-2040
08/14/12	JRE	.50	Prepare for settlement conference on WEVA 2011-2040
08/15/12	JRE	1.80	Attend settlement conference on WEVA 2011-2040
TOTAL HOURS:		3.20	
<b>WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2011-2152 - MSHA #258124 (Remington LLC)</b>			
08/01/12	JRE	.20	Work on settlement proposal
08/14/12	JRE	.80	Work on settlement proposal
08/28/12	JRE	.20	Email to Eric Johnson re: settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		1.20	
<b>WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2011-2418 - MSHA #263742 (Remington LLC)</b>			
08/07/12	JRE	.20	Emails with Eric Johnson re: settlement negotiations
08/08/12	JRE	.20	Emails with Eric Johnson re: settlement negotiations
08/09/12	JRE	.70	Call with Eric Johnson re: settlement negotiations
08/13/12	JRE	.10	Email from Judge Simonton re: granting extension to engage in additional settlement negotiations

Pg 26 of 36  
**TIME DETAIL REPORT**

<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Time-keeper</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
08/21/12	JRE	.10	Email from Judge Simonton re: status of settlement negotiations
TOTAL HOURS:		1.30	
<hr/>			
<b>HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2011-1164/1165 - MSHA #254608 (Highland Mining)</b>			
08/01/12	JKP	1.30	Emails from Randy Duncan with belt examination records; work on pre-hearing submissions in KENT 2011-1164 and KENT 2011-1165
08/05/12	JKP	.10	Email from solicitor A. Wyatt with disclosure of witnesses
08/06/12	JKP	.80	Review belt books, safeguard and production reports; email from solicitor A. Wyatt with settlement demand in KENT 2011-1165; draft settlement proposal in KENT 2011-1165
08/17/12	JKP	.90	Letter from solicitor A. Wyatt with disclosure of witnesses; teleconference with Randy Duncan re: trial and settlement negotiations; work on settlement negotiations
08/28/12	JKP	1.70	Email from solicitor A. Wyatt with settlement demand; letter from Judge W. Moran with notice of hearing location; draft settlement proposal; draft email to atty. E. Waller and R. Duncan re: settlement negotiations
TOTAL HOURS:		4.80	
<hr/>			
<b>WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2012-26 MSHA 266793 (Remington, LLC)</b>			
08/28/12	JRE	.10	Email from Eric Johnson re: settlement negotiations and status conference call
08/30/12	JBM	.70	Reviewing the file and preparing settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		.80	
<hr/>			
<b>GATEWAY EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2012-24 &amp; 25 - MSHA #266254 (Eastern Associated Coal)</b>			
08/21/12	JRE	.10	Email from Noah AnStraus re: filing of settlement documents on both dockets
08/31/12	JRE	.30	Receive and review order approving settlement of WEVA 2012-24 and order approving settlement of WEVA 2012-25; draft email to client re: summarizing settlements
TOTAL HOURS:		.40	
<hr/>			
<b>BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2011-1601 - MSHA #251458 (Eastern Associated Coal LLC)</b>			
08/02/12	JRE	.10	Email to J.J. Meadows re: preparation for settlement conference
08/03/12	JRE	.60	Prepare for meeting with J.J. Meadows to discuss citations contained in WEVA 2011-1601

Pg 27 of 36  
TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
			(.40); draft discovery requests (.20)
08/14/12	JRE	.70	Prepare for settlement conference
08/15/12	JRE	1.10	Attend settlement conference
TOTAL HOURS:		2.50	
<b>BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2012-468 - MSHA #273637 (Eastern Associated Coal LLC)</b>			
08/06/12	JRE	.40	Prepare for meeting with J.J. Meadows to discuss citations contained in WEVA 2012-468
08/07/12	JRE	1.10	Meeting with J.J. Meadows and Sam Morton to discuss citations (split among multiple matters)
08/14/12	JRE	.60	Prepare for settlement conference
08/15/12	JRE	1.40	Attend settlement conference
TOTAL HOURS:		3.50	
<b>BLUE CREEK NO. 2 DEEP MINE - WEVA 2012-486 - MSHA #274408 (Midland Trail Energy)</b>			
08/03/12	JRE	.20	Emails from and to attorney Elaine Abdovies re: settlement negotiations
08/10/12	JBM	.20	Drafting settlement proposal
08/14/12	JBM	3.40	Review rebuttals and associated regulations; draft and revise settlement proposals
08/21/12	JRE	.60	Work on settlement proposal
08/28/12	JRE	.40	Draft settlement proposal; draft email to attorney Elaine Abdoveis re: settlement negotiations
08/30/12	JRE	.10	Email from Elaine Abdoveis re: settlement negotiations
TOTAL HOURS:		4.90	
<b>BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2011-1462 - MSHA #248970 (Eastern Associated Coal LLC)</b>			
08/03/12	JRE	.20	Draft discovery requests
08/14/12	JRE	.50	Prepare for settlement conference
08/16/12	JRE	1.20	Attend settlement conference
TOTAL HOURS:		1.90	
<b>HARRIS NO. 1 MINE - WEVA 2012-467 - MSHA #273620 (Eastern Associated Coal LLC)</b>			
08/03/12	JRE	.60	Prepare for meeting with client to discuss citations contained in WEVA 2012-467
08/03/12	JRE	.30	Draft discovery requests

**TIME DETAIL REPORT**

<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Time-keeper</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
08/07/12	JRE	.60	Meeting with client representatives to discuss citations (split among multiple matters)
08/10/12	JBM	1.20	Review rebuttal information and work on settlement proposal
08/13/12	JRE	.20	Calls and emails with Joe Gordon re: settlement conference
08/14/12	JRE	.50	Prepare for settlement conference
08/16/12	JRE	2.80	Discuss docket with J.J. Meadows; attend settlement conference
<b>TOTAL HOURS:</b>		<b>6.20</b>	

**BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2012-348 - MSHA #270870 (Eastern Associated Coal LLC)**

08/03/12	JRE	.20	Draft discovery requests
08/06/12	JRE	.60	Prepare for meeting with J.J. Meadows to discuss citations contained in WEVA 2012-348
08/07/12	JRE	1.20	Meeting with J.J. Meadows and Sam Morton to discuss citations (split among multiple matters)
08/09/12	JBM	1.90	Drafting and revising settlement proposal
08/13/12	JRE	.20	Call from Sam Morton re: settlement conference
08/14/12	JRE	.70	Prepare for settlement conference
08/15/12	JRE	1.60	Attend settlement conference
<b>TOTAL HOURS:</b>		<b>6.40</b>	

**HARRIS NO. 1 MINE - WEVA 2011-1651 - MSHA #251443 (Eastern Associated Coal LLC)**

08/08/12	JRE	.20	Draft discovery requests
<b>TOTAL HOURS:</b>		<b>.20</b>	

**HARRIS NO. 1 MINE - WEVA 2011-1045 - MSHA #246203 (Eastern Associated Coal LLC)**

08/08/12	JRE	.60	Draft new language for settlement motion in accordance with Judge Biro's order; emails with Noah AnStraus re: settlement language
08/09/12	JRE	.20	Emails with Noah AnStraus re: supplemental settlement order language for Judge Biro
08/20/12	JRE	.50	Review proposed supplemental language for the proposed settlement order in accordance with Judge Biro's order; emails with Noah AnStraus re: supplemental language
<b>TOTAL HOURS:</b>		<b>1.30</b>	

## TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
<b>WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2012-534 &amp; 533 - MSHA #275179 (Remington)</b>			
08/01/12	JRE	.60	Work on settlement proposals
08/02/12	JBM	1.60	Drafting settlement proposal
08/03/12	JRE	.20	Emails with attorney James McClammer re: settlement negotiations on WEVA 2012-534
08/06/12	JBM	2.60	Reviewing file and rebuttals and beginning settlement proposals on both dockets
08/15/12	JBM	.90	Working on settlement proposals in each docket
08/31/12	JRE	2.70	Draft settlement proposal on WEVA 2012-534 to James McClammer (1.80); draft settlement proposal on WEVA 2012-533 (.90)
TOTAL HOURS:		8.60	
<b>WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2012-466 - MSHA #272361 (Remington)</b>			
08/03/12	JRE	.10	Emails with James McClammer re: settlement negotiations
TOTAL HOURS:		.10	
<b>HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2012-25 - MSHA #266371 (Highland Mining)</b>			
08/22/12	JKP	.20	Email from CLR Troy Davis with settlement documents; letter from Judge R. Lesnick with order of assignment to Judge Janet Harner
TOTAL HOURS:		.20	
<b>FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2011-1213 - MSHA #256455 (Ohio County Coal)</b>			
08/06/12	JKP	.10	Email from Judge Alan Paez with pre-hearing order
TOTAL HOURS:		.10	
<b>ROCKLICK PREP PLANT - WEVA 2011-1845 - MSHA #254494 (Eastern Associated Coal)</b>			
08/03/12	JRE	.20	Draft discovery requests
08/06/12	JRE	.20	Prepare for meeting with J.J. Meadows to discuss citations contained in WEVA 2011-1845
08/07/12	JRE	.60	Meeting with J.J. Meadows and Sam Morton to discuss citations (split among multiple matters)
08/16/12	JRE	.80	Attend settlement conference
TOTAL HOURS:		1.80	
<b>BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2012-626 - MSHA #276491 (Eastern Associated Coal)</b>			
08/07/12	JRE	.30	Meeting with client representatives to discuss citations (split among multiple matters)

Pg 30 of 36  
TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
08/23/12	JRE	.20	Emails with Linda Hrovatic re: finalizing settlement
TOTAL HOURS:		.50	
<b>CAMPBELL'S CREEK #7 MINE - WEVA 2012-593 - MSHA #274403 (Midland Trail Energy)</b>			
08/01/12	JRE	.60	Work on settlement proposal
08/09/12	JBM	.70	Drafting settlement proposal
08/10/12	JBM	1.30	Drafting and revising settlement proposals
TOTAL HOURS:		2.60	
<b>HARRIS PREP PLANT - WEVA 2011-1844 - MSHA #254490 (Eastern Associated Coal)</b>			
08/03/12	JRE	.20	Draft discovery requests
08/16/12	JRE	.60	Attend settlement conference
TOTAL HOURS:		.80	
<b>WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2012-682/683 - MSHA #278090 (Remington)</b>			
08/23/12	JRE	.20	Email and call with Linda Hrovatic re: drafting settlement documents
08/27/12	JRE	.10	Email from Linda Hrovatic re: settlement documents on WEVA 2012-683
08/30/12	JRE	.30	Review proposed motion to approve settlement and proposed order approving settlement on WEVA 2012-683
TOTAL HOURS:		.60	
<b>PRUITT, THURMAN WAYNE / DISCRIMINATION CASE #2 (Patriot Coal)</b>			
08/07/12	JKP	.30	Teleconferences with Tanya McCullough and Cinda Croft re: closure letter from MSHA; emails from and to C. Croft re: closure letter
08/16/12	JKP	.20	Emails from and to Tanya McCullough (human resources manager) re: documents from MSHA
TOTAL HOURS:		.50	
<b>BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2012-758 - MSHA #279362 (Eastern Associated Coal)</b>			
08/06/12	JRE	.20	Emails with Linda Hrovatic re: settlement negotiations
08/06/12	JRE	.20	Prepare for meeting with client to discuss citations contained in WEVA 2012-758
08/07/12	JRE	.30	Meeting with client representatives to discuss citations (split among multiple matters)
08/23/12	JRE	.20	Emails with Linda Hrovatic re: finalizing settlement

Pg 31 of 36  
**TIME DETAIL REPORT**

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
08/27/12	JRE	.10	Email from Linda Hrovatic re: settlement negotiations
TOTAL HOURS:		1.00	

---

**WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2012-807 - MSHA #280731(Remington LLC)**

08/22/12	JBM	.30	Attend settlement conference (time split with other dockets discussed at settlement conference)
08/23/12	JBM	.80	Travel to and attendance at settlement conference in oak hill
TOTAL HOURS:		1.10	

---

**BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2012-896 - MSHA #282102 (Eastern Associated Coal)**

08/06/12	JRE	.50	Draft settlement counterproposal
08/06/12	JRE	.40	Prepare for meeting with client to discuss citations contained in WEVA 2012-896
08/07/12	JRE	.70	Meeting with client representatives to discuss citations (split among multiple matters)
08/07/12	JRE	.20	Emails with Linda Hrovatic re: settlement negotiations
08/08/12	JRE	.50	Emails and calls with Linda Hrovatic re: settlement negotiations
08/09/12	JRE	.30	Emails and calls with Linda Hrovatic re: settlement negotiations
08/23/12	JRE	.30	Review proposed motion to approve settlement and proposed order approving settlement
08/29/12	JRE	.10	Email from Kim Southern re: filing of settlement documents
TOTAL HOURS:		3.00	

---

**WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2012-997 - MSHA #283385 (Remington, LLC)**

08/21/12	JRE	.30	Receive and review proposed settlement documents
08/29/12	JRE	.10	Email from Kim Southern re: filing of settlement documents
TOTAL HOURS:		.40	

---

**BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2011-2219 - MSHA #260216 (Eastern Associated Coal)**

08/06/12	JRE	.40	Prepare for meeting with client to discuss citations contained in WEVA 2011-2219
08/07/12	JRE	.80	Meeting with client representatives to discuss citations (split among multiple

Pg 32 of 36  
TIME DETAIL REPORT

Work Date	Time-keeper	Hours	Narrative
			matters)
08/08/12	JRE	.20	Draft discovery requests
08/14/12	JRE	.50	Prepare for settlement conference
08/15/12	JRE	1.30	Attend settlement conference
08/21/12	JRE	.10	Emails with Judge Lewis's law clerk Steven Grubbs re: parties settlement of WEVA 2011-2219 and other dockets
TOTAL HOURS:		3.30	
<b>BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2012-22 - MSHA #266265 (Eastern Associated Coal)</b>			
08/06/12	JRE	.30	Prepare for meeting with client to discuss citations contained in WEVA 2012-22
08/07/12	JRE	1.10	Meeting with client representatives to discuss citations (split among multiple matters)
08/08/12	JRE	.20	Draft discovery requests
08/14/12	JRE	.70	Prepare for settlement conference
08/15/12	JRE	1.00	Attend settlement conference
08/21/12	JRE	.10	Email from Josh Shaw re: settlement of WEVA 2012-22
TOTAL HOURS:		3.40	
<b>BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2012-1130 - MSHA #285374 (Eastern Associated Coal)</b>			
08/06/12	JRE	.40	Prepare for meeting with client to discuss citations contained in WEVA 2012-1130
08/07/12	JRE	.30	Meeting with client representatives to discuss citations (split among multiple matters)
08/15/12	JBM	.60	Work on settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		1.30	
<b>AMERICAN EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2012-1131 - MSHA #286172 (Speed Mining)</b>			
08/02/12	JRE	.20	Emails with client re: meeting to discuss orders
08/02/12	JRE	.40	Prepare for meeting with client on citations contained in WEVA 2012-1131
08/08/12	JRE	1.40	Work on settlement proposal
08/08/12	JBM	2.20	Drafting settlement proposals and researching relevant case law

Pg 33 of 36  
**TIME DETAIL REPORT**

<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Time-keeper</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
08/09/12	JRE	2.10	Prepare for meeting with client relating to the orders contained in WEVA 2012-1131
08/09/12	JBM	4.30	Drafting settlement proposal and researching relevant case law regarding each order
08/10/12	JRE	2.20	Meet with client at Speed Mining LLC to discuss citations contained in WEVA 2012-1131 (time split with other cases discussed)
TOTAL HOURS:		12.80	

---

**WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2012-1141/1142 - MSHA #286437 (Remington LLC)**

08/24/12	JRE	.60	Draft settlement proposal on WEVA 2012-1141
TOTAL HOURS:		.60	

---

**AMERICAN EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2012-1286/1287 - MSHA #288468 (Speed Mining)**

08/02/12	JRE	.80	Receive and review petition and citations on WEVA 2012-1286 and work on settlement proposal
08/03/12	JRE	.50	Draft answer to the petition in WEVA 2012-1286
08/09/12	JRE	1.60	Prepare for meeting with client relating to the orders contained in WEVA 2012-1286 and 1287
08/10/12	JRE	2.50	Meet with client at Speed Mining LLC to discuss citations contained in WEVA 2012-1286 and 1287 (time split with other cases discussed)
08/20/12	JRE	.80	Prepare for settlement conference on WEVA 2012-1287
08/21/12	JRE	1.90	Draft settlement proposal on WEVA 2012-1286 (.90); prepare for settlement conference on WEVA 2012-1287 (1.0)
08/22/12	JRE	3.60	Prepare for settlement conference on WEVA 2012-1287
08/23/12	JRE	4.30	Attend settlement conference in Mt. Hope on WEVA 2012-1287 (split with other docket discussed at settlement conference) (4.10); emails with Fran Serafin re: settlement negotiations on WEVA 2012-1286; work on settlement proposal (.20)
TOTAL HOURS:		16.00	

---

**FREEDOM MINE - KENT 2012-665 - MSHA #279236 (Ohio County Coal)**

08/01/12	JKP	.10	Email from CLR Bob Gray re: settlement negotiations
TOTAL HOURS:		.10	

---

Pg 34 of 36  
**TIME DETAIL REPORT**

<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Time-keeper</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
<b>SUGAR MAPLE MINE - WEVA 2012-1370 - MSHA #291131 (Gateway Eagle Coal)</b>			
08/22/12	JBM	.60	Attend settlement conference (time split with other dockets discussed at settlement conference)
08/23/12	JBM	1.00	Travel to and attendance at settlement conference in Oak Hill
TOTAL HOURS:		1.60	
<b>SUGAR MAPLE MINE - WEVA 2012-1087 - MSHA #285372 (Gateway Eagle Coal)</b>			
08/13/12	JRE	.20	Emails with Linda Hrovatic re: settlement conference
08/22/12	JBM	.80	Review file and rebuttals to prepare for settlement conference
08/23/12	JBM	3.60	Attend settlement conference (time split with other dockets discussed at settlement conference)
TOTAL HOURS:		4.60	
<b>CAMPBELL'S CREEK NO. 10 MINE - WEVA 2012-1366 - MSHA #291127 (Gateway Eagle Coal)</b>			
08/22/12	JBM	.30	Review file and rebuttals to prepare for settlement conference
08/23/12	JBM	.70	Attend settlement conference (time split with other dockets discussed at settlement conference)
TOTAL HOURS:		1.00	
<b>SUGAR MAPLE MINE - WEVA 2012-1216 - MSHA #288473 (Gateway Eagle Coal)</b>			
08/22/12	JBM	.30	Review file and rebuttals to prepare for settlement conference
08/23/12	JBM	.70	Attend settlement conference (time split with other dockets discussed at settlement conference)
TOTAL HOURS:		1.00	
<b>AMERICAN EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2012-999 - MSHA #284555 (Speed Mining)</b>			
08/10/12	JRE	.90	Meet with client at Speed Mining LLC to discuss citations contained in WEVA 2012-999 (time split with other cases discussed)
08/21/12	JRE	.50	Draft answer to petition
08/28/12	JRE	.40	Call from Ben Chaykin re: counsel of record for Patriot in WEVA 2012-999; emails with Eric Waller re: assignment of WEVA 2012-999
TOTAL HOURS:		1.80	

Pg 35 of 36  
**TIME DETAIL REPORT**

<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Time-keeper</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
<b>WINCHESTER MINE - WEVA 2012-1473 - MSHA #292179 (Remington LLC)</b>			
08/22/12	JRE	.50	Draft answer to the petition
08/22/12	JRE	3.10	Review citations and rebuttals; prepare for settlement conference
08/22/12	JBM	1.20	Review file and rebuttals to prepare for settlement conference
08/23/12	JRE	2.70	Attend settlement conference in Mt. Hope on WEVA 2012-1473 (split with other docket discussed at settlement conference)
TOTAL HOURS:		7.50	
<b>HIGHLAND 9 MINE - KENT 2012-872 - MSHA #282970 (Highland Mining)</b>			
08/24/12	JKP	.30	Draft answer to petition; draft written discovery requests
TOTAL HOURS:		.30	
<b>SUGAR MAPLE MINE/105(c) INVESTIGATION/STEVE WHITE COMPLAINT (Gateway Eagle Mine)</b>			
08/16/12	JRE	.40	Call from Eric Waller re: 105(c) discrimination complaint filed; review 105(c) complaint
08/20/12	JRE	.60	Review photographs of accident scene and review preliminary investigation report
TOTAL HOURS:		1.00	
<b>DODGE HILL IMMEDIATE NOTIFICATION (Dodge Hill Mining)</b>			
08/22/12	JKP	1.00	Emails from and to client re: immediate notification violation; emails from and to atty. E. Waller re: events related to citation; teleconference with client re: outline of facts and circumstances giving rise to citation; multiple emails from David Short with records
08/24/12	JKP	2.30	Emails from and to client with continuous miner proximity device information; Legal research re: red zone; draft notices of immediate contest
08/26/12	JKP	.70	Draft notice of contest for citation #8508502
08/28/12	JKP	1.40	Work on notices of immediate contest for "hot line" citation and "roof control" citation; draft email to atty. E. Waller, B. Bosch, T. Watkins and D. Short re: strategy for prosecution of notices of contest; emails from and to atty. E. Waller and David Short re: notice of contest and conferencing of citations
TOTAL HOURS:		5.40	

Pg 36 of 36  
**TIME DETAIL REPORT**

<b>Work Date</b>	<b>Time-keeper</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Narrative</b>
<b>GATEWAY EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2012-1454 - MSHA #291126 (Gateway Eagle Coal)</b>			
08/27/12	JRE	.50	Draft answer to the petition
TOTAL HOURS:		.50	
<b>FARLEY EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2012-1452 - MSHA #291118 (Gateway Eagle Coal)</b>			
08/27/12	JRE	.50	Draft answer to the petition
TOTAL HOURS:		.50	
<b>BLACK OAK MINE - WEVA 2012-1455 - MSHA #291132 (Eastern Associated Coal)</b>			
08/27/12	JRE	.50	Draft answer to the petition
08/29/12	JRE	2.40	Receive and review inspector's notes for Linda Hrovatic; work on settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		2.90	
<b>CAMPBELL'S CREEK NO 7 MINE - WEVA 2012-1581 - MSHA #294266 (Midland Trail Energy)</b>			
08/29/12	JRE	.50	Draft answer to petition
08/30/12	JRE	.80	Receive and review inspector's notes from Linda Hrovatic
TOTAL HOURS:		1.30	
<b>AMERICAN EAGLE MINE - WEVA 2012-1579 - MSHA #293996 (Speed Mining)</b>			
08/29/12	JRE	.50	Draft answer to petition
08/30/12	JRE	2.90	Receive and review inspector's notes from Linda Hrovatic; work on settlement proposal
TOTAL HOURS:		3.40	